AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1030 CONGRESS
S99 S, 2367

To amend section 3013 of title 18, United States Code, to double the special
criminal assessment amounts for the purpose of enhancing revenues
for the Crime Victims Fund of the Office of Victims of Crime.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

AuGuUST 5, 1994

Mr. WorrForD introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on the Judiciary

A BILL

To amend section 3013 of title 18, United States Code,
to double the special criminal assessment amounts for
the purpose of enhancing revenues for the Crime Victims
Fund of the Office of Victims of Crime.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Crime Victims Fund
Enhancement Act of 1994”.

SEC. 2. SPECIAL CRIMINAL ASSESSMENTS.

Section 3013(a) of title 18, United States Code, is

0o N oo o b~ W N B

amended—



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

A~ e e N <
© O N O U A~ W N B O

2

(1) in paragraph (1)(A)—

(A) in clause (i) by striking “$5” and in-
serting “$10";

(B) in clause (ii) by striking ““$10”" and in-
serting “$20""; and

(C) in clause (iii) by striking “$25” and
inserting “‘$50";
(2) in paragraph (1)(B)—

(A) in clause (i) by striking “$25” and in-
serting “$50";

(B) in clause (ii) by striking ““$50” and in-
serting “$100”’; and

(C) in clause (iii) by striking “$125” and
inserting “$250’"; and
(3) in paragraph (2)—

(A) in subparagraph (A) by striking “$50”
and inserting ““$100""; and

(B) in subparagraph (B) by striking
“$200” and inserting “$400".

O

*S 2367 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-08-09T18:05:25-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




