AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

105TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 1 99

To amend the Higher Education Act of 1965 regarding income protection
allowances for certain students.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

SEPTEMBER 19, 1997
Ms. Corrans (for herself, Ms. Sxowg, Mr. HoLriNnGgs, and Mr. ROBB) intro-
duced the following bill; which was read twice and referred to the Com-
mittee on Labor and Human Resources

A BILL

To amend the Higher Education Act of 1965 regarding

mmcome protection allowances for certain students.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. INCOME PROTECTION ALLOWANCES.

(a) INCOME PROTECTION ALLOWANCE FOR DEPEND-

ENT STUDENTS.—Section 475(g2)(2)(D) of the Higher

Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 108700(2)(2)(D)) is
amended by striking “$1,750” and inserting “$4,200".

(b) INCOME PROTECTION ALLOWANCE FOR CERTAIN

© 00 N O U b~ W N PP

INDEPENDENT STUDENTS.—Section 476(b)(1)(A)(iv) of




2
the Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C.

1087pp(b)(1)(A)(iv)) is amended—
(1) i subclause (I), by striking “$3,000” and
inserting “$6,000";
(2) in subclause (IT), by striking “$3,000” and
inserting “$6,000”; and
(3) in subclause (III), by striking “$6,000” and
inserting “$9,000”.

(¢) CONSUMER PRICE INDEX.—Section 478(b) of the
Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1087rr) is
amended—

(1) in the first sentence, by striking “For each”
and inserting “(1) For each”; and
(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) For each academic year after academic year
1999-2000, the Secretary shall increase each of the dollar
amounts contained in section 475(2)(2)(D) and subclauses
(I), (IT), and (IIT) of section 476(b)(1)(A)(iv) by a per-
centage equal to the estimated percentage increase in the
Consumer Price Index (as determined by the Secretary)
between December 1998 and the December next preceding
the beginning of such academic year, and rounding the
result to the nearest $10.”.

O

*S 1199 IS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-08-07T15:04:13-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




