AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

105TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 26 1

[Report No. 105-72]

To provide for a biennial budget process and a biennial appropriations process
and to enhance oversight and the performance of the Federal Government.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

FEBRUARY 4, 1997

Mr. DomENICI (for himself, Mr. Forp, Ms. SNOwE, Mr. THoMPSON, Mr.
THOoMAS, Mr. RorH, Mr. MoyNiHAN, Mr. NickLes, Mr. McCaiN, Mr.
CONRAD, Mr. ABRAHAM, Mr. FrisT, Mr. Grams, Mr. LUGAR, Ms. CoOL-
LINS, Mr. BrREaUx, Mr. DEWINE, Mr. BUurNs, Mr. WARNER, Mr. RoB-
ERTS, Mr. Coars, Mr. Mack, Mr. KEMPTHORNE, Mr. D’AmaTo, Mr.
Exzi, Mr. HaGeL, Mr. RoB, Mr. SANTORUM, Mrs. HUTCHISON, Mr.
SMITH of Oregon, Mr. DascHLE, Mr. TORRICELLI, Mr. HUTCHINSON,
and Mr. ITaTcrr) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and
referred jointly pursuant to the order of August 4, 1977, to the Commit-
tees on the Budget and Governmental Affairs, with instructions that if
one Committee reports, the other Committee have 30 days to report or
be discharged

SEPTEMBER 4, 1997
Reported by Mr. THOMPSON, with amendment

SEPTEMBER 4, 1997
Referred to the Committee on the Budget for a period not to exceed 30 days

[Strike out all after the enacting clause and insert the part printed in italic]

A BILL

To provide for a biennial budget process and a biennial
appropriations process and to enhance oversight and the

performance of the Federal Government.



© 0O N o o b~ W N P

10
11
12
13

2

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE:
stthseetton {(b); the timetable with respeet to the coneres-

et Segsior
Febraary 15 . Coneresstonal Budeet Office submits repert
to Budeet Committees:
%ﬂﬂﬂﬁéﬂ-eek%aﬁer Committees submit vews and estinates to
AprH + Budeet Committees report eonenrrent resoh
Max 35 otreress eotipletes aetion on cottetrrent res-
Max 15 Bienntal appropriation bills may be eonsid-
ered H Hhe Hotses
Juane H He&%er&ppfepﬁ-aﬁeﬁe@emmﬁ-teefepeﬁ%}&%
June 30 Congress eompletes action on bienntal appro-
Arerst + oo Beﬁgre%eem-p-}e{ee%&et-wﬁeﬂfeeeﬁﬁhﬂr&eﬁ
Betober + Bietittt beots:
uéw i;w
“On or before: Aetion to be eompleted:
Febrrary 15 .. Beﬁgre%reﬂﬁ-}bﬂége%%ee%ﬁ%fepeﬁ

*S 261 RS



o A~ W N BB

© 00 N O

10
11
12
13
14
15

3
& leap year and durine which the term of a President {ex
eept a Prestdent who sueeeeds himself) beeins; the follow-

Fiest Monday 1 Apri ... Prestdent sabmits badeet recommendations:

AND IMPOUNDMENT CONTROL ACT OF 1974.

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O 0o b W N B+ O

4

ST Phe term b’ e e o of

*S 261 RS

t stridne “Aprit 15 of eneh yemr”
and inserting “May 15 of each odd-mram-
on October 1 of sueh year the first place
sirmine o Oetober 1 of saeh year
onr October 1 of sueh yearl the seeond



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N N NN N DN P PP PR R PP PP
A W N B O O 0 N O O b W N B O

B)
S st T b ik o e
 the btenntam—

(\1:|77

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

6
Hotse shall report to #s Hotse the conenrrent
ber 1 of that year and

() Seetion 30HeHD of sueh Aet (2 S

e Hsertre “for o btethn—

: « )
e —BHENNALE—

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E WO N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

-

e~

amended—

statement aeccompanying a eonference report; on &

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

8

ehRtt—;

eal year”; and
oress has completed aetion on o conenrrent res-

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN NDDN P PP PPk PR PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

9

tH The matter following paragraph (6} of see-
Hom 3036 of steh St 2 E500 634Hah s amen-
) 1 sabparagraphs () and (B} of para-

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD P PP PP PP PP
o A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

10
e
63631 15 amended by strikine “fiseal venr? and -
aended—
ennta ahd
e
streh et 2 Fos 6 - s sended—

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E WO N B O © 0 N O O A W N R O

11

foﬁf
Y

*S 261 RS

serting “for a btenniom’s

bienmitms

vear— ahd  tisertthe “revennes for a  fisedd
year; and

“for etther™



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

A
N B O

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

SEC: 4. PAY-AS-YOU-GO IN THE SENATE.
Sttbparaeraphs (55 (B); and {63 of seetion 20212y

*S 261 RS



13
tion o the budeet:

© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

=
o

11 SEC. 5. AMENDMENTS TO TITLE 31, UNITED STATES CODE.
12 b DERINITION —Section HHOT of tithe 3 h Paited
13 States Code; 15 amended by addine at the end thereof the
14 folowine new paragraph:

15 S0 hienniin’ hes the neanine obven to sueh
16 tertt H pataetaph HH of seetion 3 of the Coteres-
17 stonal Budeet and Impoundment Control Aet of
18 FOT4 2 s a2 e

20 CoNGRESS—

21 1 The matter preceding paragraph H  see-
22 ton Hbob of Hte 3 Fhotted Strtes Codes i
23 amended to read as folows:

24 Stak Onor before the fiest Monday in February of
25 eneh oddtbered vent fors H appheables as provided be

*S 261 RS



14

4 the bierttn beotntire on Oetober + of saeh enterdr

9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

)

HHH—

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O O B~ W N P

N N NN B R R R R R R R R e
W N P O © 0 N OO 00 W N B O

15
6} Seetion HO5E3) of title 35 United
FrHHH—
FrHH—

*S 261 RS



© O N O U A W N P

N NN N DN P B PR R PR PP R
A W N P O ©W 0© N O 00 M W NN B O

16
insertine “ench of the 2 most recently eom-
ing “with respeet to these fiseal years’; and
B Seetion 1HO5(aH19) of title 31 United
inserting Sench of the 2 most recently ecom-
ing “with respeet to these fiseal years’; and

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

17
b sk e bt v caeh e

HO5eHD of tithe 31 Hhited States Code; s amended
to whieh sueh budeet relates’™

*S 261 RS



© O N O U A W N P

R =
w N R O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

18
Y ostrikine “Before Jide 1ol each
2} Seetion 106(h) of title 315 United States

MATHES—

*S 261 RS

105 is submitted for & btennivm™ and



19
(B} by striking “the folowing fiseat venrl

and insertine Sench fisent yent of sueh periods
Code: is amended by strikine “Mareh 1 of ench
venrl shd insertine Swithin 6 weeks of the Presi-
of the Conovessional Budeet Aet of 1974)%
10 hbetstvrton—mection HAH of fide 33 Frited States
11 Eode: is amended by—
13 prierr theotimine on or alter Oetober 1 100837
14 ) strikine “May 162 and insertine “Mareh
15 312 and
16 (3} strikine Svenr before the vear in which the

© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

19 s
22 amended—
25 et beotie on Oetober B 1909 the™s and

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

N NN NN R P R R R R RR R e
5E W N B O © 0 N O O A W N B O

20
SEC: 6. TWO-YEAR APPROPRIATIONS; TITLE AND STYLE OF
APPROPRIATIONS ACTS:
“5 105. Title and style of appropriations Aets
stppotrt of the Governtent shalt be enacted for a ettt
SEC. 7. MULTIYEAR AUTHORIZATIONS.

*S 261 RS



1
2
3

21

4 %o eonsider—

5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19

20
21

tions for a pertod of less than 2 fiseal years; unless

shall not apply to—

22 the term anthorbation and revente b or resohttion does

23 ot mehide ant appropriations meastre or reconethation
24 btk

*S 261 RS



o A~ W N B

© 00 ~N O

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

22

“Seer 314 Anthorizations of appropriations:

SEC. 8. GAO ASSISTANCE WITH AUTHORIZATIONS AND
OVERSIGHT.

SEG: 9: APPROPRIATIONS FOR THE SECOND YEAR OF A BI-
ENNIUM-.

“3 1311, Appropriations for the second year of a bien-
num

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

N N DN DN DD DN P PP PPk PR PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

23
first fised vear of a btentam for purposes of paraeraph
{1); the rate of operations for a projeet or activity for the
first fiseal year of a bienntum shall take into aceount—

“B) any eancellation made {or a dis-

ton for a projeet or activity shall be avatlable for the pe-
“{b) An appropriation or fands made avatable; or an-

*S 261 RS



1

© 00O N O O b~ w DN

N N DN DN NDDN P PP PPk PR PR
o A W N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

24
“fe) This seetion shall not apply to & projeet or aeti-
¥y for a fiseal year Hf any other proviston of law {other

etess

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e e N < =
© N o o0 W N B O

19
20
21
22
23
24

25
SEC: 10. GOVERNMENT PLANS AND REPORTS ON BIENNIAL
BASIES:

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N P

N N NN B B R R R R R R R R
W N P O © 0 N o 00 W N B O

26
and
and msertine a semieolon; and
and

*S 261 RS



13 ) No hater than Muareh 334 of each evennumbered
19 Codes s wnended hv—

20 1 strikine “3999° and msertine <2000 and
21 2} inserting before the period 5 and begihning
22 seith fisertt vent 2002 o Federnd Goverttient per-
24 whder seetton HA6H

© 00O N O O B~ W N PP

I
N B O

*S 261 RS



28
3 1 1 stbseetton (H—

4 ) 1 paragraph {4 by strikine “and”
5 after the semieolon;

7 atte Hserte <5 ands and

8 6} by adding after paragraph (5} the fol-
9 fovtes

10 6} deserthe any statutes that hindered the
13 srochy or elibrte steh statntory ndranees ™ and
14 23 by adding at the end the followine:

15 o} Eaeh ageney perfortranee report shall thelude an
16 exeettive sttty on the thost fportatt perfortntee
22 went 2002 and oH stbseaqrent exeertive startes shad
24 fisend yenrss

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

29

of the appheable House =
) Bresernas Dars.

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

e I < =
©® N o 00 W N B O

19
20
21
22
23
24

30
“See 315 Consideration of two vear appropriations itk
badeet process based on that definition to a 2-year

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N B R R R R R R R R
P O © W N O O M W N B O

N N
w N

N DN
(G2 BENNN N

31

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Biennial Budgeting and
Appropriations Act”.
SEC. 2. REVISION OF TIMETABLE.

Section 300 of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974
(2 U.S.C. 631) 1is amended to read as follows:

“TIMETABLE
“SEC. 300. (a) IN GENERAL—FExcept as provided by

subsection (b), the timetable with respect to the congres-

*S 261 RS



1
2

N~ o o1 b~ W

32
sional budget process for any Congress (beginning with the
One Hundred Sixth Congress) is as follows:

“Iirst Session

“On or before: Action to be completed:
First Monday in February — President submits budget recommendations.
February 15 .....cccovvevenee. Congressional Budget Office submits report to

Budget Commattees.
Within 6 weeks after budg-  Committees submit views and estimates to

et submassion. Budget Commattees.

April 1 e, Budget Committees report concurrent resolu-
tion on the biennial budget.

May 15 oo Congress completes action on concurrent reso-
lution on the biennial budget.

May 15 .o Biennial appropriation bills may be consid-
ered in the House.

JUNe 10 oo, House Appropriations Committee reports last
biennial appropriation bill.

JUne 30 ..o, Congress completes action on biennial appro-
priation bills.

August 1 oo, House completes action on reconciliation legis-
lation.

October 1 .......cccoceveveneane. Biennium begins.

“Second Session

“On or before: Action to be completed:

February 15 .....c.coovevenee. Congressional Budget Office submits report to
Budget Commattees.

The last day of the session — Congress completes action on bills and resolu-
tions authorizing new budget authority for
the succeeding biennium.

“(b) SPECIAL RULE.—In the case of any first session
of Congress that begins in any year immediately following
a leap year and during which the term of a President (ex-

cept a President who succeeds himself) begins, the following

dates shall supersede those set forth in subsection (a):

“First Session

“On or before: Action to be completed:

First Monday in April ... President submits budget recommendations.

April 20 oo, Commattees submit views and estimates to
Budget Committees.

May 15 oo, Budget Committees report concurrent resolu-
tion on the biennial budget.

June 1 oo, Congress completes action on concurrent reso-

lution on the biennial budget.

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N N P B R R R R R R R
N B © © 0 N O O M W N B O

33

“First Session—Continued

JUlY 1 oo, Biennial appropriation bills may be consid-
ered in the House.
July 20 o House Appropriations Committee reports last

biennial appropriation bill.”.
SEC. 3. AMENDMENTS TO THE CONGRESSIONAL BUDGET
AND IMPOUNDMENT CONTROL ACT OF 1974.

(a) DECLARATION OF PURPOSE.—RSection 2(2) of the
Congressional Budget and Impoundment Control Act of
1974 (2 U.S.C. 621(2)) 1s amended by striking “each year”
and inserting “biennially”.

(b) DEFINITIONS.—

(1) Section 3(4) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 622(4)) is
amended by striking “‘fiscal year” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “biennium’”’.

(2) Section 3 of such Act (2 U.S.C. 622) 1is fur-
ther amended by adding at the end the following new
paragraph:

“(11) The term ‘Diennium’ means the period of
2 consecutive fiscal years beginning on October 1 of
any odd-numbered year.”.

(¢) BIENNIAL CONCURRENT RESOLUTION ON THE
BUDGET—

(1) Section 301(a) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 632(a))
18 amended—

(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1)
by—

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N N DN P B R R R R R R R e
W N P O © 0 N O 00 h W N B O

34

(1) striking “April 15 of each year”
and inserting “May 15 of each odd-num-
bered year’;

(11) striking “the fiscal year beginning
on October 1 of such year” the first place it
appears and inserting “the biennium begin-
ning on October 1 of such year”;

(111) striking “the fiscal year beginning
on October 1 of such year” the second place
it appears and inserting “each fiscal year
wm such period”; and

(i) striking “and planning levels for
each of the two ensuing fiscal years” and
mserting  “and the appropriate levels for
each of the 4 ensuing fiscal years”;

(B) wn paragraph (6), by striking “for the
fiscal year” and inserting ‘‘for each fiscal year
wm the biennium™; and

(C) in paragraph (7), by striking “for the
fiscal year” and inserting ‘‘for each fiscal year
wm the biennium’”.

(2) Section 301(b) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 632(b))

15 amended—

*S 261 RS



11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

35

(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by inserting ‘for a biennium’™ after “concurrent
resolution on the budget”; and

(B) wn paragraph (3), by striking “for such
fiscal year” and inserting “for either fiscal year
i such biennium”.

(3) Section 301(d) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 632(d))
1s amended by inserting “(or, if applicable, as pro-
vided by section 300(b))” after “United States Code”.

(4) Section 301(e) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 632(e))
18 amended—

(A) wn the first sentence by striking ‘fiscal
year” and inserting “biennium’’;

(B) by inserting between the second and
third sentences the following new sentence: “On
or before April 1 of each odd-numbered year (or,
if applicable, as provided by section 300(D)), the
Committee on the Budget of each House shall re-
port to its House the concurrent resolution on
the budget referred to in subsection (a) for the bi-
ennium beginning on October 1 of that year.”;
and

(C) in paragraph (6), by striking “five fis-

cal years beginning with such fiscal year” and

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e A <
o M W N B O

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

36

mserting  “six fiscal years beginning with the

first fiscal year of such biennium”.

(5) Section 301(f) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 632(f))
1s amended by striking “fiscal year” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “brennium”’.

(6) Section 301(g)(1) of such Act (2 U.RS.C.
632(g)(1)) 1s amended by striking “for a fiscal year”
and inserting “for a biennium”.

(7) The section heading of section 301 of such
Act 1s amended by striking “ANNUAL” and inserting
“BIENNIAL”.

(8) The item relating to section 301 in the table
of contents set forth in section 1(b) of such Act s
amended by striking “Annual” and inserting “Bien-
nial”.

(d) CoOMMITTEE ALLOCATIONS.—~Section 302 1s

amended—

(1) by striking subsection (a)(2) and inserting
the following:

“(2)(A) For the Senate, the joint explanatory
statement accompanying a conference report on a
concurrent resolution on the budget shall include an
estimated allocation of the appropriate levels of total
new budget authority, total outlays, and social secu-

rity outlays, based wpon the concurrent resolution as

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N DN NN DN NN DN P PP PP PP PP
a o W N P O © 00 N O O b W N B O

37
recommended in the conference report, to each com-
mattee of the Senate which has jurisdiction over bills
and resolutions providing budget authority.
“(B) For all committees except the Committee on
Appropriations, the allocation under subparagraph
(A) shall include the appropriate levels of budget au-

thority, outlays, and social security outlays for each

fiscal year in the bienniwm and the total of the bien-

niuwm and the 4 succeeding fiscal years.

“(C) For the Committee on Appropriations, the
allocation under subparagraph (A) shall include the
appropriate levels of budget authority, outlays, and
social security outlays for each fiscal year in the bien-
nium.”’;

(2) in subsection (f)(1)—

(A) by striking “for a fiscal year”;

(B) by striking ‘for such fiscal year”, both
places it appears; and

(C) by striking “effective during such fiscal
year”; and

(3) in subsection (f)(2)—

(A) by striking the first sentence and insert-
mg the following: “At any time after Congress
has completed action on a concurrent resolution

on the budget required to be reported under sec-

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N NN DN NDNDN P PP PP PP PP
aa A WO N P O ©W 00 N O O b W N B O

38
tion 301(a), it shall not be in order to consider
any bill, joint resolution, amendment, motion, or
conference report, that provides new budget au-

thority, outlays, new spending authority (as de-

fined in section 401(c)(2)), or social security out-

lays in excess of allocations made pursuant to
subsection (a) and (b).”; and

(B) by striking “Subparagraph (A)” and
mserting “The requirement of this paragraph to
comply with allocations made pursuant to sec-

ton 302(a)”.

(e) SECTION 303 POINT OF ORDER.—

tion

(1) The matter following paragraph (6) of sec-
303(a) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 634(a)) is amended

by striking ‘fiscal year” the first place it appears

and inserting “biennium”.

(2) Section 303(b) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 634(b))

1s amended—

*S 261 RS

(A) in subparagraphs (A) and (B) of para-
graph (1), by striking “the fiscal year” each
place it appears and inserting “biennium’;

(B) in the wmatter following paragraph
(1)(B), by striking “any calendar year” and in-
serting “any odd-numbered calendar year (or, if

applicable, as provided by section 300(b))”; and



1 (C) by—
2 (1) striking paragraph (2);
3 (11) striking “(1)”; and
4 (111) redesignating subparagraphs (A)
5 and (B) as paragraphs (1) and (2), respec-
6 twely, and indenting appropriately.
7 (f) PERMISSIBLE REVISIONS OF CONCURRENT RESO-
8 LUTIONS ON THE BUDGET.—Section 304(a) of such Act (2
9 U.S.C. 635) is amended—
10 (1) by striking “fiscal year” the first two places
11 it appears and inserting “biennium’;
12 (2) by striking “for such fiscal year”; and
13 (3) by inserting before the period “for such bien-
14 nium”’.
15 (9) PROCEDURES FOR CONSIDERATION OF BUDGET

16 RESOLUTIONS.—Section 305(a)(3) of such Act (2 U.S.C.
17 636(b)(3)) s amended by striking “fiscal year” and insert-
18 ing “biennium”.

19 (h) CoMPLETION OF HOUSE ACTION ON APPROPRIA-
20 7ION BILLS.—Section 307 of such Act (2 US.C. 638) s
21 amended—

22 (1) by striking “fiscal year” and inserting “bien-
23 nium’’; and

24 (2) by striking “that year” and inserting “each
25 odd-numbered year”.

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

40

(1) COMPLETION OF ACTION ON REQULAR APPROPRIA-

TION BILLS.—Section 309 of such Act (2 U.S.C. 640) 1is

amended—

(1) by wnserting “of any odd-numbered calendar
year” after “July”; and

(2) by striking “annual” and inserting “bien-
nial’’.

()) RECONCILIATION PROCESS.—Section 310(a) of

such Act (2 U.S.C. 641(a)) 1s amended—

(1) in the matter preceding paragraph (1), by
striking “any fiscal year” and inserting “any bien-
niuwm’’; and

(2) wn paragraph (1) by striking “such fiscal
year” each place 1t appears and inserting “any fiscal
year covered by such resolution’.

(k) SECTION 311 POINT OF ORDER.—

(1)(A) Section 311(a)(1) of such Act (2 U.S.C.
642(a)) 1s amended—

(1) by striking “for a fiscal year” and in-
serting “for a biennium’;

(11) by striking “such fiscal year” the first
place it appears and inserting “either fiscal year

wm such biennium’;

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

=
o

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

41

)

(1) by striking “during such fiscal year’
and inserting “during either fiscal year in such
biennium”’;

(iv) by striking “revenues for such fiscal
year” and inserting “revenues for a fiscal year”;
and

(v) by striking “budget for such fiscal year”

and inserting “budget for either fiscal year in

such biennium”.

(B) Section 311(a)(2)(A) of such Act is amend-
ed—

(1) by striking “for the first” and inserting
“for either”;

(ir) by striking “covering such fiscal year”
and inserting “‘covering the biennium’;

(i1r) by striking “the first fiscal year cov-
ered” and inserting “either fiscal year in the bi-
ennium covered”; and

(iv) by striking “the first fiscal year plus”
and inserting “the biennium plus”.

(2) Section 311(b) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 642(b))
1s amended by striking “such fiscal year” the second

place it appears and inserting “either fiscal year in

such biennium”.

*S 261 RS



42
(1) BiLLS PROVIDING NEW SPENDING AUTHORITY.—
Section 401(b)(2) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 651(b)(2)) 1is
amended by striking ‘for such fiscal year” the second place

it appears and inserting ‘for the biennium in which such

fiscal year occurs”.

(m) DATE OF ADJUSTING ALLOCATIONS.—Section
603(a) of such Act (2 U.S.C. 665b) is amended by inserting
after “April 157 the following “(or if section 300(b) applies
by June 15th)”.

SEC. 4. PAY-AS-YOU-GO IN THE SENATE.

Subparagraphs (A), (B), and (C) of section 202(b)(2)
of House Concurrent Resolution 67 (104th Congress) are
amended to read as follows:

“(A) The period of the biennium covered by
the most recently adopted concurrent resolution
on the budget.

“(B) The period of the first six fiscal years
covered by the most recently adopted concurrent
resolution on the budget.

“(C) The period of the four fiscal years fol-
lowing the first six fiscal years covered by the
most recently adopted concurrent resolution on

the budget.”.

*S 261 RS



1
2
3

43
SEC. 5. AMENDMENTS TO TITLE 31, UNITED STATES CODE.

(a) DEFINITION.—Section 1101 of title 31, Unated

States Code, is amended by adding at the end thereof the

4 following new paragraph:

5
6
5
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26

“(3) ‘Diennium’ has the meaning given to such
term in paragraph (11) of section 3 of the Congres-
stonal Budget and Impoundment Control Act of 1974
(2 US.C. 622(11)).”.

(b) BUDGET CONTENTS AND SUBMISSION TO THE CON-
GRESS.—

(1) The matter preceding paragraph (1) in sec-
tion 1105(a) of title 31, United States Code, s
amended to read as follows:

“(a) On or before the first Monday in February of each
odd-numbered year (or, if applicable, as provided by section
300(b) of the Congressional Budget Act of 1974), beginning
with the One Hundred Sixth Congress, the President shall
transmit to the Congress, the budget for the biennium begin-
ning on October 1 of such calendar year. The budget trans-
mitted under this subsection shall include a budget message
and summary and supporting information. The President
shall include in each budget the following:”.

(2) Section 1105(a)(5) of title 31, Unated States
Code, 1s amended by striking “the fiscal year for
which the budget 1s submatted and the 4 fiscal years
after that year” and inserting “each fiscal year in the

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N DN NN DN NN DN P PP PP PP PP
a o W N P O © 00 N O O b W N B O

44
bienniwwm for which the budget 1s submitted and in
the succeeding 4 years”.

(3) Section 1105(a)(6) of title 31, Unated States
Jode, 1is amended by striking “the fiscal year for
which the budget 1s submitted and the 4 fiscal years
after that year” and inserting “each fiscal year in the
Dienniwm for which the budget 1s submitted and in
the succeeding 4 years”.

(4) Section 1105(a)(9)(C) of title 31, Unated
States Code, is amended by striking “the fiscal year”
and inserting “each fiscal year in the biennium”.

(5) Section 1105(a)(12) of title 31, United States
Code, 1s amended—

(A) in subparagraph (A), by striking “the
fiscal year” and inserting ‘“‘each fiscal year in
the biennium’”; and

(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking “4 fis-
cal years after that year” and inserting “4 fiscal
years 1mmediately following the second fiscal
year in such biennium”.

(6) Section 1105(a)(13) of title 31, United States
Code, 1s amended by striking “the fiscal year” and
wmserting “each fiscal year in the biennium”.

(7) Section 1105(a)(14) of title 31, United States

Code, 1s amended by striking “that year” and insert-

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N NN NN R P R R R R R R R
5E W N B O © 0 N O U0 A W N LB O

45
g “‘each fiscal year in the biennium for which the
budget 1s submatted”.

(8) Section 1105(a)(16) of title 31, United States
Jode, 1s amended by striking “the fiscal year” and
wmserting “each fiscal year in the biennium”.

(9) Section 1105(a)(17) of title 31, United States
Code, 1s amended—

(A) by striking “the fiscal year following
the fiscal year” and inserting “‘each fiscal year
m the biennium following the biennium’;

(B) by striking “that following fiscal year”
and inserting “each such fiscal year”; and

(C) by striking “fiscal year before the fiscal
year” and inserting “biennium before the bien-
nium”.

(10) Section 1105(a)(18) of title 31, Unated
States Code, 1s amended—

(A) by striking “the prior fiscal year” and
mserting “each of the 2 most recently completed
fiscal years™;

(B) by striking ‘for that year” and insert-
g “with respect to those fiscal years”; and

(C) by striking “in that year” and insert-

g “in those fiscal years”.

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

N N N P B R R R R R R R
N B O © 0 N O U M W N L O

23

46
(11) Section 1105(a)(19) of title 31, Unated
States Code, 1s amended—

(A) by striking “the prior fiscal year” and
mserting “each of the 2 most recently completed
fiscal years™;

(B) by striking ‘for that year” and insert-
mg “with respect to those fiscal years”; and

(C) by striking “in that year” each place it
appears and inserting “in those fiscal years”.

(¢c) KSTIMATED EXPENDITURES OF LEGISLATIVE AND

JUDICIAL BRANCHES.—NSection 1105(b) of title 31, United
States Code, 1s amended by striking “each year” and insert-

mg “each even-numbered year”.

(d) RECOMMENDATIONS To MEET ESTIMATED DEFI-

CIENCIES.—Section 1105(c) of title 31, United States Code,

15 amended—

(1) by striking “fiscal year for” each place it ap-
pears and iserting “biennium for”;

(2) by inserting “or current biennium, as the
case may be,” after “current fiscal year”; and

(3) by striking “that year” and inserting “‘that
period”.

(¢)  CAPITAL  INVESTMENT — ANALYSIS.—Section

24 1105(e)(1) of title 31, United States Code, is amended by

*S 261 RS



47

1 striking “ensuing fiscal year” and inserting “biennium to

2 which such budget relates”.

3
4

© 00 N O

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(f)  SUPPLEMENTAL  BUDGET  FESTIMATES  AND
CHANGES.—
(1) Section 1106(a) of title 31, Unated States
Code, 1s amended—
(A) in the matter preceding paragraph (1),
by—

(1) striking “Before July 16 of each
year,” and inserting “Before February 15 of
each even numbered year,”; and

(11) striking ‘fiscal year” and insert-
mg “brennium’;

(B) in paragraph (1)—

(1) by striking “that fiscal year” and
mserting  “‘each fiscal year in such bien-
nium’”’; and

(1r) by striking the period at the end
and nserting “; and’’;

(C) in paragraph (2)—

(1) by striking “4 fiscal years following
the fiscal year” and inserting “4 fiscal
years following the biennium”™; and

(1r) by striking the semicolon at the
end and inserting a period; and

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e
)

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

48

(D) by striking paragraph (3).

(2) Section 1106(D) of title 31, Unated States
Code, is amended by—

(A) striking “the fiscal year” and inserting
“each fiscal year in the biennium’;

(B) striking “July 16 of each year” and in-
serting  “February 15 of each even-numbered
year”; and

(C) striking “July 16" and inserting “Feb-
ruary 15 of each even-numbered year.”.

(9) CURRENT PROGRAMS AND ACTIVITIES FESTI-

MATES.—

(1) Section 1109(a) of title 31, Unated States
Code, 1s amended—

(A) by striking “On or before the first Mon-
day after January 3 of each year (on or before
February 5 in 1986)” and inserting “At the
same time the budget required by section 1105 is
submitted for a biennium”; and

(B) by striking “the following fiscal year”
and inserting “each fiscal year of such period’.
(2) Section 1109(b) of title 31, Unated States

Code, 1s amended by striking “March 1 of each year”
and inserting “within 6 weeks of the President’s

budget submission for each odd-numbered year (or, if

*S 261 RS



4
5

6

7

8

9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24
25

49

applicable, as provided by section 300(b) of the Con-

gressional Budget Act of 1974).

(h) YEAR-AHEAD REQUESTS FOR AUTHORIZING LEG-
ISLATION.—Section 1110 of title 31, United States Code,
18 amended by—

(1) striking “fiscal year” and inserting “bien-

niwum (beginning on or after October 1, 1999)”;

(2) striking “May 167 and inserting “March

317; and

(3) striking “year before the year in which the
fiscal year begins” and inserting “calendar year pre-
ceding the calendar year in which the biennium be-
gins’’.

SEC. 6. TWO-YEAR APPROPRIATIONS; TITLE AND STYLE OF
APPROPRIATIONS ACTS.

Section 105 of title 1, Unated States Code, 1s amended
to read as follows:

“§ 105. Title and style of appropriations Acts

“(a) The style and title of all Acts making appropria-
tions for the support of the Government shall be as follows:
‘An Act making appropriations (here insert the object) for
each fiscal year in the biennium of fiscal years (here insert
the fiscal years of the biennium).’.

“(b) All Acts making regular appropriations for the

support of the Government shall be enacted for a biennium

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O O B~ W N PP

e
)

N N NN NN R B R R R R R R
g &5 W N B © © 0 N o o » w N

26

50
and shall specify the amount of appropriations provided
Jor each fiscal year in such period.

“(c) For purposes of this section, the term ‘biennium’
has the same meaning as in section 3(11) of the Congres-
stonal Budget and Impoundment Control Act of 1974 (2
URS.C. 622(11)).”.

SEC. 7. MULTIYEAR AUTHORIZATIONS.

(a) IN GENERAL—Title III of the Congressional
Budget Act of 1974 is amended by adding at the end the
Jollowing new section:

“AUTHORIZATIONS OF APPROPRIATIONS
“SEc. 314. (a) POINT OF ORDER.—It shall not be in

order in the House of Representatives or the Senate to con-
sider—

“(1) any bill, joint resolution, amendment, mo-
tion, or conference report that authorizes appropria-
tions for a period of less than 2 fiscal years, unless
the program, project, or activity for which the appro-
priations are authorized will require no further ap-
propriations and will be completed or terminated
after the appropriations have been expended; and

“(2) i any odd-numbered year, any authoriza-
tion or revenue bill or joint resolution until Congress
completes action on the biennial budget resolution, all
reqular biennial appropriations bills, and all rec-

onciliation bills.

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O 0o B~ W N P

10
11
12
13

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

ol

“(b) APPLICABILITY.—In the Senate, subsection (a)
shall not apply to—

“(1) any measure that is privileged for consider-
atvon pursuant to a rule or statute;

“(2) any matter considered in Executive Session;
or

“(3) an appropriations measure or reconciliation
bill.”.

(b) AMENDMENT TO TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table
of contents set forth in section 1(b) of the Congressional
Budget and Impoundment Control Act of 1974 is amended
by adding after the item relating to section 313 the follow-

mg new items:

“Sec. 314. Authorizations of appropriations.”.
SEC. 8. GOVERNMENT PLANS ON A BIENNIAL BASIS.
(a) STRATEGIC PLANS.—Section 306 of title 5, United
States Code, s amended—
(1) in subsection (a), by striking “September 30,
19977 and inserting “September 30, 2000”;
(2) wn subsection (b), by striking “at least every
three years” and inserting “at least every 4 years”;
(3) by striking “five years forward” and insert-
mg “six years forward”; and
(4) in subsection (c) by inserting a comma after

“section” and adding “including a strategic plan sub-

*S 261 RS



52

mitted by September 30, 1997 meeting the require-

ments of subsection (a)”.

(b) BUDGET CONTENTS AND SUBMISSION TO CON-
GRESS.—Paragraph 28 of section 1105(a) of title 31, Unat-
ed States Code, 1s amended—

(1) by striking “beginning with” and inserting

“for”; and

(2) by imserting “, and beginning with fiscal

© 00 N O 0o B~ W N PP

year 2000, a biennial Federal Government perform-
10 ance plan” after “plan’.
11 (¢) PERFORMANCE PLANS.—RSection 1115 of title 31,

12 Unated States Code, is amended—

13 (1) in subsection (a)—

14 (A) in the first sentence—

15 (1) by striking “section 1105(a)(29)”
16 and inserting “section 1105(a)(28)”; and

17 (1ir) by striking “an annual” and in-
18 serting “a biennial”’;

19 (B) i paragraph (1) by wnserting after
20 “program activity” the following: “for both years
21 1 and 2 of the biennial plan’;

22 (C) in paragraph (5) by striking “and”
23 after the semicolon,

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

A
N B O

13

53
(D) wn paragraph (6) by striking the period
and inserting a semicolon; and inserting “and”
after the inserted semicolon; and
(E) by adding after paragraph (6) the fol-
lowing:
“(7) cover a 2-year period beginning with the
first fiscal year of the next biennial budget cycle.”;
(2) in subsection (d) by striking “annual” and
mserting “biennial”’; and
(3) wn paragraph (6) of subsection (f) by striking
“annual” and inserting “biennial”.

(d) MANAGERIAL ACCOUNTABILITY AND FLEXIBIL-

11y.—RSection 9703 of title 31, United States Code, 1is

14 amended—

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(1) wn subsection (a)—

(A) in the first sentence by striking “an-
nual”’; and

(B) by striking “section 1105(a)(29)” and
mserting “section 1105(a)(28)7;
(2) in subsection (e)—

(A) in the first sentence by striking “one
or” before “years”;

(B) in the second sentence by striking “a
subsequent year” and inserting “for a subsequent

2-year period”; and

*S 261 RS



54
(C) in the third sentence by striking “three”
and inmserting “four”.

(¢) PiLor PROJECTS FOR PERFORMANCE BUDGET-

4 ING.—Section 1119 of title 31, United States Code, is

5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

21
22

amended—

(1) wn paragraph (1) of subsection (d), by strik-
mg “annual” and inserting “biennial”’; and

(2) i subsection (e), by striking “annual” and
mserting “biennial’’.

(f) STRATEGIC PLANS.—Section 2802 of title 39, Unat-

ed States Code, 1s amended—

(1) in subsection (a), by striking “September 30,
19977 and nserting “September 30, 20007

(2) in subsection (b), by striking “at least every
three years” and inserting “at least every 4 years”;

(3) by striking ‘five years forward” and insert-
g “six years forward”; and

(4) in subsection (c), by inserting a comma after
“section” and inserting “including a strategic plan
submitted by September 30, 1997 meeting the require-
ments of subsection (a)”.

(9) PERFORMANCE PLANS.—Section 2803 of title 39,

23 Unated States Code, is amended in subsection (a) by strik-

({924

24 ing “an annual” and inserting “a”’.

*S 261 RS



25

(h) ComMITTEE VIEWS OF PLANS AND REPORTS.—
Section 301(d) of the Congressional Budget Act (2 U.S.C.
632(d)) is amended by adding at the end “Each committee
of the Senate or the House of Representatives shall review
the strategic plans, performance plans, and performance re-
ports, required under section 306 of title 5, United States
Code, and sections 1115 and 1116 of title 31, United States
Code, of all agencies under the jurisdiction of the committee.
Each committee may provide its views on such plans or

reports to the Committee on the Budget of the applicable

House.”.
(i) EFFECTIVE DATE.—

(1) IN GENERAL—The amendments made by
this section shall take effect on March 31, 1998.

(2) AGENCY ACTIONS.—Effective on and after the
date of enactment of this Act, each agency shall take
such actions as necessary to prepare and submit any
plan or report in accordance with the amendments
made by this Act.

SEC. 9. TWO-YEAR APPROPRIATIONS BILLS.

(a) IN GENERAL—Title III of the Congressional
Budget Act of 1974 (2 U.S.C. 631 et seq.) is amended by
adding at the end the following:

“CONSIDERATION OF TWO-YEAR APPROPRIATIONS BILLS

“SEc. 315. It shall not be in order in the House of

Representatives or the Senate in any odd-numbered year

*S 261 RS



© 00O N O 0o B~ W N PP

e <
w N BB O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

26

to consider any reqular bill providing new budget authority
or a limitation on obligations under the jurisdiction of any
of the subcommattees of the Commattees on Appropriations
Jor only the first fiscal year of a biennium, unless the pro-
gram, project, or activity for which the new budget author-
ity or obligation limitation 1s provided will require no ad-
ditronal authority beyond 1 year and unll be completed or
terminated after the amount provided has been expended.”.

(b) AMENDMENT 7O TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table
of contents set forth in section 1(b) of the Congressional
Budget and Impoundment Control Act of 1974 is amended
by adding after the item relating to section 313 the follow-

mg new items:

“Sec. 315. Consideration of two year appropriations bills.”.
SEC. 10. REPORT ON TWO YEAR FISCAL PERIOD.

Not later than 180 days after the date of enactment
of this Act, the Director of OMB shall—

(1) determine the wvmpact and feasibility of
changing the definition of a fiscal year and the budg-
et process based on that definition to a 2-year fiscal
period with a 2-year budget process based on the 2-
year period; and

(2) report the findings of the study to the Com-
mittees on the Budget of the House of Representatives
and the Senate.

*S 261 RS



© 00 N O U b~ W N PP

I
)

Y|
SEC. 11. EFFECTIVE DATE.

(a) IN GENERAL—Except as provided in sections 8
and 10 and subsection (b), this Act and the amendments
made by this Act shall take effect on January 1, 1999, and
shall apply to budget resolutions and appropriations for the
bienniwm beginning with fiscal year 2000.

(b) AUTHORIZATIONS FOR THE BIENNIUM.—For pur-
poses of authorizations for the biennium beginning with fis-
cal year 2000, the provisions of this Act and the amend-
ments made by this Act relating to 2-year authorizations

shall take effect January 1, 1998.
O

*S 261 RS



		Superintendent of Documents
	2013-08-07T14:52:03-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




