AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1091H CONGRESS
L HLR. 1569

To amend the Public Health Service Act with respect to the National
Foundation for the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

APRIL 12, 2005

Mr. LINDER (for himself, Mr. KINGSTON, and Mr. WAXMAN) introduced the
following bill; which was referred to the Committee on Energy and Commerce

A BILL

To amend the Public Health Service Act with respect to
the National Foundation for the Centers for Disease

Control and Prevention.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. NATIONAL FOUNDATION FOR CENTERS FOR
4 DISEASE CONTROL AND PREVENTION; AC-
5 CEPTANCE OF VOLUNTARY SERVICES; FED-
6 ERAL FUNDING.

7 (a) AUTHORITY FOR ACCEPTANCE OF VOLUNTARY
8 SERVICES; STRIKING OF Two-YEAR LiMmiT PER INDI-
9 vibuAL.—Section 399G(h)(2)(A) of the Public Health

10 Service Act (42 U.S.C. 280e—11(h)(2)(A)) is amended by



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\ I N e e e e e T e e
S OV o0 N O B R~ WD = O

2

striking the second sentence and inserting the following:
“In the case of an individual, such Director may accept
the services provided under the preceding sentence by the
individual until such time as the private funding for such
individual ends.”.

(b) FEDERAL FUNDING.—Section 399G(i) of the
Public Health Service Act (42 U.S.C. 280e-11(1)) 1is
amended—

(1) in paragraph (2)—
(A) 1n subparagraph (A), by striking
“$500,000” and inserting “$2,000,000”’; and
(B) in subparagraph (B), by striking
“$500,000” and inserting “$2,000,000,”; and
(2) by adding at the end the following para-
oraph:
“(4) SUPPORT SERVICES.—The Director of the

Centers for Disease Control and Prevention may

provide facilities, utilities and support services to the

Foundation if it is determined by the Director to be

advantageous to the programs of such Centers.”.

O

*HR 1569 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2014-05-16T11:59:38-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




