AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION
GPO

11

1091H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 40 9

To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act Amendments of 1996 to modify
the grant program to improve sanitation in rural and Native villages
in the State of Alaska.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES
JULy 14, 2005

Ms. MURKOWSKI introduced the following bill; which was read twice and
referred to the Committee on Environment and Public Works

A BILL

To amend the Safe Drinking Water Act Amendments of
1996 to modify the grant program to improve sanitation

in rural and Native villages in the State of Alaska.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. GRANTS TO ALASKA TO IMPROVE SANITATION

IN RURAL AND NATIVE VILLAGES.

Section 303 of the Safe Drinking Water Act Amend-
ments of 1996 (33 U.S.C. 1263a) is amended—

(1) in subsection (b), by striking “50 percent’”

and inserting “75 percent’”’; and

O o0 9 N U B W

(2) in subsection (e)—



A~ WL P

oS 1409 IS

2
(A) by striking “$40,000,000” and insert-
ing “$45,000,000”; and
(B) by striking “2005”7 and inserting
“20107.



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-11T23:00:24-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




