AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

Calendar No. 314

1091 CONGRESS
1ST SESSION S’ 1 78

[Report No. 109-196]

To reauthorize the Upper Colorado and San Juan River Basin endangered
fish recovery implementation programs.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

JuLy 29, 2005
Mr. ALLARD (for himself, Mr. BENNETT, Mr. HATCH, Mr. SALAZAR, and Mr.
BINGAMAN) introduced the following bill; which was read twice and re-
ferred to the Committee on Energy and Natural Resources

DECEMBER 8, 2005
Reported under authority of the order of the Senate of November 18, 2005,
by Mr. DoMENICI, without amendment

A BILL

To reauthorize the Upper Colorado and San Juan River

Basin endangered fish recovery implementation programs.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,



O o0 9 N U kA W N =

[\ TR N© T N T NG T NG I NS I NS R S e e T e e e T e T
A N A WD = O 0O 00NN B W NN~ O

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.
This Act may be cited as the “Upper Colorado and
San Juan River Basin Endangered FKish Recovery Pro-
erams Reauthorization Act of 2005,
SEC. 2. UPPER COLORADO AND SAN JUAN RIVER BASIN EN-
DANGERED FISH RECOVERY IMPLEMENTA-
TION PROGRAMS.
Section 3 of Public Law 106-392 (114 Stat. 1602;
116 Stat. 3113) 1s amended—
(1) in subsection (a)—
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking
“$46,000,000” and inserting “$61,000,000"’;
(B) in paragraph (2), by striking “2008”
and inserting “2010”; and
(C) in paragraph (3), by striking “2008”
and inserting “2010";
(2) in subsection (b)—
(A) by striking “$100,000,000” and in-
serting “$126,000,000"’;
(B) in paragraph (1)—
(1) by striking $82,000,000” and in-
serting “$108,000,000”’; and
(ii) by striking “2008” and inserting
“20107; and
(C) in paragraph (2), by striking “2008”
and inserting “2010”; and

*S 1578 RS



AN W B~ W

3
(3) 1 subsection (¢)(4)—

(A) in the first sentence, by inserting “and
the Elkhead Reservoir enlargement’” after
“Wolford Mountain Reservoir”’; and

(B) in the second sentence, by striking

“$20,000,000” and inserting “$31,000,000”.

*S 1578 RS



Calendar No. 314

10910 CONGRESS
1ST SESSION mo ~ mqm

[Report No. 109-196]

A BILL

To reauthorize the Upper Colorado and an
River Basin endangered fish recovery implemen-
tation programs.

DECEMBER 8, 2005

Reported without amendment



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-11T18:54:38-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




