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continue being subject to tariffs ranging from 
35 percent to 60 percent. This puts our farm-
ers and ranchers at a significant competitive 
disadvantage with our international competi-
tors in these growing markets. It would be 
foolish to turn our backs on an agreement that 
removes these sort of punitive barriers to our 
products. If we pass DR–CAFTA, we will open 
the doors to six countries where the potential 
U.S. gain for all agricultural exports is ex-
pected to reach $1.5 billion. Put another way, 
this would mean a near doubling of the U.S. 
agricultural sales to the region when com-
pared to 2003 levels. 

It is for this reason that DR–CAFTA enjoys 
the strong support of the American Farm Bu-
reau Federation, the American Soybean Asso-
ciation, the National Corn Growers Associa-
tion, the National Pork Producers Council, the 
National Cattlemen’s Beef Association, the 
USA Rice Federation, the National Association 
of Wheat Growers and the National Milk Pro-
ducers Federation, just to name a few. To bor-
row from Farm Bureau, a vote for DR–CAFTA 
is a vote for agriculture. 

There are many critics who erroneously be-
lieve that by ratifying DR–CAFTA, the United 
States is relinquishing our national sovereignty 
and opening our borders to floods of immi-
grants. On the contrary, nothing in the DR– 
CAFTA will preempt the Constitution, current 
U.S. laws and our sovereignty. Should a con-
tradiction arise between the terms of DR– 
CAFTA and U.S. law, the U.S. will maintain its 
right to change domestic laws as it sees fit. 

Moreover, enactment of DR–CAFTA will 
have no effect on current immigration laws. 
Congress will maintain its role in crafting U.S. 
immigration policy. And in fact, DR–CAFTA 
will help reduce illegal immigration. As the 
economic opportunities that accompany free 
market reforms take a stronger hold in Central 
America, residents of these nations will have 
a stake in their future and a strong fiscal in-
centive to remain in their native country. 

DR–CAFTA is in our national security inter-
ests. Our foreign policy must promote stability 
and prosperity in Central America. As we saw 
in the 1980’s, instability can give nations who 
do not share our interests an opportunity to 
expand their influence in our hemisphere. To 
promote stability, we should reward democ-
racies that respect human rights and encour-
age free market economic principles. DR– 
CAFTA is consistent with this goal. As these 
evolving democracies continue to grow, we 
will see their economic viability strengthened, 
thereby creating jobs and reducing poverty. 

Some have expressed concern that DR– 
CAFTA will weaken labor laws, leaving work-
ers in this region without basic protections. 
This is simply not true. The International Labor 
Organization (ILO) has reviewed the labor 
laws and practices of the six DR–CAFTA 
countries and found them largely in compli-
ance with the ILO’s eight core conventions. 
With the exception of El Salvador—which has 
ratified six—every other nation covered by 
DR–CAFTA has enacted the eight core con-
ventions. In fact, if you look at the labor provi-
sions of other recently enacted free trade 
agreements, such as the Jordan and Morocco 
agreements, you will find that the DR–CAFTA 
labor provisions are more stringent and ensure 
greater protections for workers. 

Over 95 percent of the world’s consumers 
live outside our borders, and it is in our best 

interests to pursue a policy that opens these 
markets to American products. If we fail, we 
forfeit these markets—both from an economic 
and national security standpoint—to our inter-
national competitors in Asia and Europe. 

DR–CAFTA will level the playing field for 
American farmers and manufacturers and help 
address an important national security goal. 
This is a win-win situation. I urge my col-
leagues to join me in supporting this vital 
agreement. 
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Mr. ROGERS of Alabama. Mr. Speaker, 
Sergeant Christopher J. Taylor, 22, of Opelika, 
Alabama, died on July 24, 2005, in Iraq. Ser-
geant Taylor was assigned to B Battery, 1st 
Battalion, 41st Field Artillery Regiment, 3rd In-
fantry Division, at Fort Stewart, Georgia, and 
according to initial reports died when he was 
struck by indirect fire on a Coalition forces 
base. His survivors include his wife Janina, his 
son Xavier; and his daughter Aaliyah. 

Christopher Taylor was proud to serve his 
country, Mr. Speaker. He was a graduate of 
Opelika High School and was known in the 
community as a loving friend and father. Like 
every soldier, he dutifully left behind his young 
family and loved ones to serve our country 
overseas. 

Words cannot express the sense of sadness 
we have for his family, and for the gratitude 
our country feels for his service. Sergeant 
Taylor died serving not just the United States, 
but the entire cause of liberty, on a noble mis-
sion to help spread the cause of freedom in 
Iraq and liberate an oppressed people from ty-
rannical rule. He was a true American. 

We will forever hold him closely in our 
hearts, and remember his sacrifice and that of 
his family as a remembrance of his bravery 
and willingness to serve. Thank you, Mr. 
Speaker, for the House’s remembrance on this 
mournful day. 
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Mr. UDALL of New Mexico. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today in support of the energy bill con-
ference report, but I do so with very strong 
reservations. Although I believe we missed 
many opportunities to make this energy bill 
truly comprehensive, I also believe that the 
conference report is an improvement over the 
House-passed energy bill. 

It is a sad indictment of the way the Majority 
is running this Congress that it has taken us 
5 years to pass an energy bill and the final 
product falls far short of what I believe the 
American public wants. I will vote for this con-
ference report, but this bill lacks boldness and 
vision. There is more we can and must do to 

reduce our dependence on foreign oil, lower 
skyrocketing gas prices, protect our environ-
ment, and steer our country in a more for-
ward-thinking direction on energy policy. I am 
pleased, however, that the bill makes strides 
in encouraging alternative energy research 
and production. Specifically, $3.2 billion is in-
cluded for renewable energy production incen-
tives and $1.3 billion is allotted for energy effi-
ciency and conservation. 

I was disappointed to see that a Renewable 
Portfolio Standard, RPS, was not included in 
the bill. The Senate-passed bill included an 
RPS that would have required utilities to gen-
erate 10 percent of their electricity from re-
newable energy sources such as wind, solar, 
biomass, and geothermal, by the year 2020. 
Studies conducted by the Energy Information 
Administration illustrate that a federal RPS 
could save consumers $19 billion. Moreover, 
20 States have already enacted RPS require-
ment, many of which go beyond the Senate- 
passed provision. A federal RPS would have 
established a nationwide market-based trading 
system to ensure that renewables are devel-
oped at the lowest possible price. I strongly 
supported this provision, and over 70 of my 
colleagues signed onto a letter with me to 
conferees urging them to keep the RPS in the 
bill. The Senate conferees voted in a bipar-
tisan manner to keep the RPS in the bill, but 
the House conferees stripped the provision. I 
hope that my colleagues will work with me in 
the future to support H.R. 983, a bill with bi-
partisan support that I introduced to create a 
federal RPS of 20 percent by 2027. The time 
for a federal RPS has come. 

We also missed an opportunity to address 
the serious problem of global warming. I be-
lieve that the amendment Senator BINGAMAN 
offered, and that passed, expressing the 
sense of the Senate that mandatory action on 
climate change should be enacted was an im-
portant step towards congressional action to 
reduce greenhouse gas emissions. While I am 
disappointed that we could not do more, and 
that this sense of the Senate amendment was 
stripped from the conference report, I am 
pleased that the conference report includes a 
provision to establish a new cabinet-level advi-
sory committee, charged with developing a na-
tional policy to address climate change and to 
promote technologies to reduce greenhouse 
gas emissions. In addition, the provision al-
lows the Energy Department to authorize dem-
onstration projects designed to test tech-
nologies that limit harmful emissions. The 
long-term solution to solving the global warm-
ing problem lies in the creation of new tech-
nologies and the Federal Government has a 
key role to play in promoting technological in-
novations. I believe we should have done 
more, something along the lines of the rec-
ommendations made recently by the National 
Commission on Energy Policy, but it is critical 
that we do something, and this climate change 
provision is the least we can do to begin the 
process of slowing global warming. 

I am very pleased that a provision included 
in the House-passed bill, giving $30 million to 
uranium mining companies, was stripped from 
the bill. If enacted, this provision would have 
posed a grave threat to the water resources of 
two Navajo communities in northwestern New 
Mexico where four uranium in-situ leach mines 
have been granted conditional licenses by the 
Nuclear Regulatory Commission. The pro-
posed ISL mining—which could still happen 
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even without the $30 million subsidy—would 
leach uranium from an aquifer that provides 
high-quality groundwater to municipal wells in 
and near these communities—an aquifer that 
is the sole source of drinking water for an esti-
mated 15,000 Navajos. I thank the conferees 
for heeding the wishes of over 200 members 
of the House—as well as the Navajo Nation 
Council—to strip this provision from the bill. 

The liability waiver for oil companies who 
used methyl tertiary-butyl ether, MTBE, which 
has contaminated 1,861 water systems serv-
ing 45 million Americans in 29 States, includ-
ing New Mexico, was also changed in the final 
bill. I strongly opposed that provision, which 
would have placed the coffers of oil compa-
nies ahead of Americans whose lives have 
been adversely affected by this negligence. 

Finally, one of my great concerns with the 
House-passed bill was a provision allowing 
drilling in the Arctic National Wildlife Refuge 
(ANWR). I am glad this provision was stripped 
in conference, and I will continue to oppose 
efforts by the oil industry to drill in ANWR. I 
have witnessed first-hand the tremendously di-
verse wildlife that will be hurt if drilling occurs 
in the area. The small benefits are simply not 
worth the cost. 

I would like to commend my home State 
Senators—DOMENICI and BINGAMAN—who 
worked together in a very bipartisan manner to 
write this bill. I know it was a difficult task. I 
look forward to working with them and with 
their counterparts here in the House, to con-
tinue work on energy policy issues such as 
global warming, fuel efficiency standards, and 
further reducing our energy dependence. 
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Mr. TIAHRT. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in 
strong support of the Conference Report on 
H.R. 6. This comprehensive energy plan will 
help America become more energy self-suffi-
cient, create hundreds of thousands of new 
jobs and spur innovation for accessing new 
energy sources. 

Nearly every sector of our economy is af-
fected by high energy prices. Manufacturing 
facilities, the transportation industry and agri-
cultural businesses all depend on affordable 
and reliable supplies of electricity, fuel and fer-
tilizers to thrive in today’s international econ-
omy. 

All Americans, directly and indirectly, pay for 
the price of products or services that depend 
on various forms of energy. No one is immune 
from rising energy costs, and I am pleased the 
House has taken the lead in passing this long- 
term energy plan to help address energy reli-
ability, supply and prices. 

The Conference Report provides tax incen-
tives within five main categories to improve 
energy production, transportation and effi-
ciency. This balanced approach helps ensure 
we are taking care of current energy needs 
while also planning for future demand. 

If America wants an internationally competi-
tive economy that can fully contend with 
emerging economic superpowers of the 21st 

century, we must take actions now to reduce 
barriers to competitiveness. Having a secure 
and reliable source of energy is vital to keep-
ing and creating high-quality, high-paying jobs 
in America. The provisions contained in this 
energy conference agreement are reliable op-
tions the private sector can use to make us 
more competitive. 

Other countries have been more pro-active 
than we have in preparing for future energy 
needs. Brazil is projected to be completely en-
ergy self-sufficient within a few years. What 
once was considered an illusory dream may 
now become reality because Brazil recognized 
a problem and committed to a long-term solu-
tion. It may have taken them years to develop 
renewable energy sources, but Brazil is now a 
leader in ethanol production. As a result, its 
economy has been able to curb costs associ-
ated with higher crude oil prices. 

H.R. 6 provides a renewable fuel standard 
that requires 7.5 billion gallons to be used an-
nually by 2012. This provision will help in-
crease our ethanol and biodiesel production at 
a time when alternatives to foreign oil are 
greatly needed. By ramping up the production 
of alternative fuel sources, we are going to 
take positive steps toward more secure and 
reliable means of meeting our energy de-
mands into the 21st century. 

Kansas’ agriculture economy will also reap 
the benefits of increased uses for crops. We 
are learning more and more that today’s farm-
ers not only put food on our tables but they 
also play an important role in reducing emis-
sions and helping us become less dependent 
on Middle East oil for our fuel needs. By ex-
panding markets for agriculture commodities, 
producers and rural communities will see new 
sources of revenue. 

Another conservation provision in the en-
ergy bill is the 4-week extension of Daylight 
Savings Time. By simply extending Daylight 
Savings Time 3 weeks in the spring and 1 
week in the fall, we will reduce energy con-
sumption equal to about 100,000 barrels of oil 
per day for four weeks. This energy saving 
time provision will also contribute to lower 
crime and fewer traffic fatalities. 

As we look toward the future, we also need 
to be realistic about current energy demands. 
That is why the energy bill helps oil and gas 
producers increase domestic production, ex-
pand distribution capabilities and increase re-
fining capacity. H.R. 6 provides $2.6 billion in 
tax incentives to accomplish these goals. Cur-
rently, small refiners are eligible for percent-
age depletion deductions if their refinery runs 
do not exceed 50,000 barrels on any day of 
the year. The energy bill increases that barrel 
limit to 75,000 barrels, which will encourage 
greater production by America’s smaller refin-
ers. 

The energy Conference agreement contains 
just over $3 billion in tax incentives that will 
bolster our electricity infrastructure. Measures 
such as reducing the depreciation period for 
assets used in the transmission and distribu-
tion of electricity from 20 years to 15 years will 
encourage more upgrades to the system. And 
tax credits, such as the one for new nuclear 
power facilities, will help investors and utilities 
take risks needed to create clean, reliable 
sources of electricity. 

Three separate tax credits were established 
for investments in clean coal facilities that 
produce electricity, and power plants will be 
able to amortize the cost of air pollution con-

trol facilities over 84 months. These incentives 
help energy producers meet stringent air qual-
ity standards. By rewarding power plants that 
accelerate implementation of pollution con-
trols, we are helping create a cleaner environ-
ment. 

Kansas is known for many wonderful things; 
one trait not so popular is our abundant 
source of wind. But as we find better ways to 
harness this natural Kansas resource, Kansas’ 
abundant supply of wind may prove invalu-
able. The energy bill contains numerous tax 
incentives aimed at helping expand alternative 
sources of energy such as wind. Many Kansas 
landowners have also expressed strong sup-
port for expanded use of wind energy. Small 
wind farms can provide increases in the local 
tax base while creating additional revenue for 
the landowners. 

Hydrogen fuel cell technology continues to 
improve, and I am pleased the final energy bill 
included many options for integration of this 
emerging technology into the marketplace. I 
am hopeful we will see more and more public 
marketplace uses for hydrogen fuel cells. The 
fuel cell provisions in H.R. 6 help take us in 
that direction. 

This is a good plan that House Republicans 
and the Bush Administration have been work-
ing on non-stop for more than 4 years. I am 
very pleased we are finally successful in send-
ing a national energy plan to the President’s 
desk. 
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CONFERENCE REPORT ON H.R. 6, 
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OF CALIFORNIA 
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Mr. FARR. Mr. Speaker, I rise in strong op-
position to the Conference Report to H.R. 6, 
the so-called comprehensive energy bill before 
us today. I urge my colleagues to vote against 
this legislation, which represents bad energy 
policy, bad environmental policy, bad fiscal 
policy, and bad nonproliferation policy. 

H.R. 6 does nothing to address the issue of 
America’s continuing dependency on imported 
oil. It does nothing to require more fuel effi-
cient vehicles. It does nothing to reduce pump 
prices now or in the future, but it does shower 
wealthy oil and natural gas companies with 
unneeded tax breaks, royalty-free drilling on 
public lands, and exemptions from environ-
mental laws. 

We can and must do better if we are to seri-
ously address the energy needs of our Nation. 
We should strike a sound policy balance by 
pursuing improvements in fuel technology and 
energy efficiency, maintaining a clean environ-
ment, and preserving our wilderness areas 
and public lands. 

Frankly, this bill is an embarrassment—after 
six years of discussion and negotiation, the 
best we have to offer is a bill that in effect pre-
serves the status quo? Instead of providing 
forward-looking policy ideas for a sound en-
ergy future, H.R. 6 is content to drive us into 
the future by looking through the rearview mir-
ror with its heavily weighted dependence on 
fossil fuels. 

Mr. Speaker, the majority of subsidies in 
H.R. 6 go to the oil, gas, coal and nuclear in-
dustries, leading to more pollution, more oil 
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