S10490

Whereas a supportive environment, empa-
thy, and understanding are considered crit-
ical factors in the healing process of a family
that is coping with and recovering from the
loss of a loved one;

Whereas the mission of The Compassionate
Friends is to assist families working towards
the positive resolution of grief following the
death of a child of any age and to provide in-
formation to help others be supportive; and

Whereas the work of local chapters of The
Compassionate Friends provides a caring en-
vironment in which bereaved parents, grand-
parents, and siblings can work through their
grief with the help of others: Now, therefore,
be it

Resolved, That the Senate—

(1) designates the second Sunday in Decem-
ber 2006, as ‘‘National Children’s Memorial
Day’” in conjunction with The Compas-
sionate Friends Worldwide Candle Lighting;

(2) supports the efforts of The Compas-
sionate Friends to assist and comfort fami-
lies grieving the loss of a child; and

(3) calls upon the people of the United
States to observe National Children’s Memo-
rial Day with appropriate ceremonies and ac-
tivities in remembrance of the many infants,
children, teenagers, and young adults of fam-
ilies in the United States who have died.

———

AMENDMENTS SUBMITTED AND
PROPOSED

SA 5092. Mr. FRIST submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed by him to the
bill S. 403, to amend title 18, United States
Code, to prohibit taking minors across State
lines in circumvention of laws requiring the
involvement of parents in abortion decisions;
which was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 5093. Mr. FRIST submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed to amendment
SA 5092 submitted by Mr. FRIST and intended
to be proposed to the bill S. 403, supra; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 5094. Mr. FRIST submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed to amendment
SA 5090 proposed by Mr. BENNETT (for Mr.
FRIST) to the bill S. 403, supra; which was or-
dered to lie on the table.

SA 5095. Mr. ROCKEFELLER (for himself,
Mrs. CLINTON, Mr. WYDEN, Ms. MIKULSKI, Mr.
FEINGOLD, Mr. LEVIN, and Mrs. FEINSTEIN)
proposed an amendment to the bill S. 3930, to
authorize trial by military commission for
violations of the law of war, and for other
purposes.

SA 5096. Mrs. FEINSTEIN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 403, to amend title 18, United
States Code, to prohibit taking minors
across State lines in circumvention of laws
requiring the involvement of parents in abor-
tion decisions; which was ordered to lie on
the table.

SA 5097. Mrs. FEINSTEIN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to
lie on the table.

SA 5098. Mrs. FEINSTEIN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to
lie on the table.

SA 5099. Mrs. FEINSTEIN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to
lie on the table.

SA 5100. Mrs. FEINSTEIN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by her
to the bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to
lie on the table.

SA 5101. Mrs. BOXER submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed by her to the
bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to lie on
the table.

SA 5102. Mrs. BOXER submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed by her to the

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE

bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to lie on
the table.

SA 5103. Mrs. BOXER submitted an amend-
ment intended to be proposed by her to the
bill S. 403, supra; which was ordered to lie on
the table.

SA 5104. Mr. BYRD (for himself, Mr.
OBAMA, Mrs. CLINTON, and Mr. LEVIN) pro-
posed an amendment to the bill S. 3930, to
authorize trial by military commission for
violations of the law of war, and for other
purposes.

SA 5105. Mr. BINGAMAN submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by him
to the bill H.R. 6061, to establish operational
control over the international land and mar-
itime borders of the United States; which
was ordered to lie on the table.

SA 5106. Mr. KENNEDY submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by him
to the bill H.R. 6061, supra; which was or-
dered to lie on the table.

——
TEXT OF AMENDMENTS

SA 5092. Mr. FRIST submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed by
him to the bill S. 403, to amend title 18,
United States Code, to prohibit taking
minors across State lines in cir-
cumvention of laws requiring the in-
volvement of parents in abortion deci-
sions; which was ordered to lie on the
table; as follows:

On page 12, line 2, strike ‘45 days’ and in-
sert ‘47 days’’.

SA 5093. Mr. FRIST submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 5092 submitted by Mr.
Frist and intended to be proposed to
the bill S. 403, to amend title 18, United
States Code, to prohibit taking minors
across State lines in circumvention of
laws requiring the involvement of par-
ents in abortion decisions; which was
ordered to lie on the table; as follows:

Strike ‘47 days’’ and insert ‘46 days’’.

SA 5094. Mr. FRIST submitted an
amendment intended to be proposed to
amendment SA 5090 proposed by Mr.
BENNETT (for Mr. FRIST) to the bill S.
403, to amend title 18, United States
Code, to prohibit taking minors across
State lines in circumvention of laws re-
quiring the involvement of parents in
abortion decisions; which was ordered
to lie on the table; as follows:

Strike ‘46 days’’ and insert ‘43 days’’.

SA 5095. Mr. ROCKEFELLER (for
himself, Mrs. CLINTON, Mr. WYDEN, Ms.
MIKULSKI, Mr. FEINGOLD, Mr. LEVIN,
and Mrs. FEINSTEIN) proposed an
amendment to the bill S. 3930, to au-
thorize trial by military commission
for violations of the law of war, and for
other purposes; as follows:

At the end, add the following:

SEC. 11. OVERSIGHT OF CENTRAL INTELLIGENCE
AGENCY PROGRAMS.

(a) DIRECTOR OF CENTRAL INTELLIGENCE
AGENCY REPORTS ON DETENTION AND INTERRO-
GATION PROGRAM.—

(1) QUARTERLY REPORTS REQUIRED.—Not
later than three months after the date of the
enactment of this Act, and every three
months thereafter, the Director of the Cen-
tral Intelligence Agency shall submit to the
congressional intelligence committees a re-
port on the detention and interrogation pro-

September 28, 2006

gram of the Central Intelligence Agency dur-
ing the preceding three months.

(2) ELEMENTS.—In addition to any other
matter necessary to keep the congressional
intelligence committees fully and currently
informed about the detention and interroga-
tion program of the Central Intelligence
Agency, each report under paragraph (1)
shall include (but not be limited to), for the
period covered by such report, the following:

(A) A description of any detention facility
operated or used by the Central Intelligence
Agency.

(B) A description of the detainee popu-
lation, including—

(i) the name of each detainee;

(ii) where each detainee was apprehended;

(iii) the suspected activities on the basis of
which each detainee is being held; and

(iv) where each detainee is being held.

(C) A description of each interrogation
technique authorized for use and guidelines
on the use of each such technique.

(D) A description of each legal opinion of
the Department of Justice and the General
Counsel of the Central Intelligence Agency
that is applicable to the detention and inter-
rogation program.

(E) The actual use of interrogation tech-
niques.

(F) A description of the intelligence ob-
tained as a result of the interrogation tech-
niques utilized.

(G) Any violation of law or abuse under the
detention and interrogation program by Cen-
tral Intelligence Agency personnel, other
United States Government personnel or con-
tractors, or anyone else associated with the
program.

(H) An assessment of the effectiveness of
the detention and interrogation program.

(I) An appendix containing all guidelines
and legal opinions applicable to the deten-
tion and interrogation program, if not in-
cluded in a previous report under this sub-
section.

(b) DIRECTOR OF CENTRAL INTELLIGENCE
AGENCY REPORTS ON DISPOSITION OF DETAIN-
EES.—

(1) QUARTERLY REPORTS REQUIRED.—Not
later than three months after the date of the
enactment of this Act, and every three
months thereafter, the Director of the Cen-
tral Intelligence Agency shall submit to the
congressional intelligence committees a re-
port on the detainees who, during the pre-
ceding three months, were transferred out of
the detention program of the Central Intel-
ligence Agency.

(2) ELEMENTS.—In addition to any other
matter necessary to keep the congressional
intelligence committees fully and currently
informed about transfers out of the deten-
tion program of the Central Intelligence
Agency, each report under paragraph (1)
shall include (but not be limited to), for the
period covered by such report, the following:

(A) For each detainee who was transferred
to the custody of the Department of Defense
for prosecution before a military commis-
sion, the name of the detainee and a descrip-
tion of the activities that may be the subject
of the prosecution.

(B) For each detainee who was transferred
to the custody of the Department of Defense
for any other purpose, the name of the de-
tainee and the purpose of the transfer.

(C) For each detainee who was transferred
to the custody of the Attorney General for
prosecution in a United States district court,
the name of the detainee and a description of
the activities that may be the subject of the
prosecution.

(D) For each detainee who was rendered or
otherwise transferred to the custody of an-
other nation—



		Superintendent of Documents
	2019-05-06T13:17:25-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




