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released by the State Department yes-
terday indicate that terrorist attacks 
increased by 25 percent last year, and 
more than 40 percent more people were 
killed. In these most dangerous times, 
this tells us we can’t afford to take our 
focus off the global war on terror. Still, 
exactly 4 years after the President pro-
claimed mission accomplished aboard 
the USS Abraham Lincoln, his failed 
Iraq policy persists in overextending 
our armed forces and in refusing to 
compel Iraq to take responsibility for 
their own security and future. 

Today, when the President vetoes 
withdrawal provisions supported by a 
majority of Americans, he places an-
other’s obstacle in the way of what 
should be our priority mission, winning 
the global war on terror. We know the 
administration’s stay-the-course policy 
in Iraq is a failure. We know it has 
taken our eye off the war on terror. 

Now we have the numbers to back up 
that statement and the proof we need 
to stop the President from 
compounding this Nation’s single 
greatest foreign policy mistakes. I en-
courage my colleagues to consider the 
hard and irrefutable evidence by the 
State Department, thereby advancing 
our withdrawal from Iraq. 

f 

OUR TROOPS NEED FULL FUNDING 
(Mr. STEARNS asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. STEARNS. Mr. Speaker, my col-
leagues, the Senate gave overwhelming 
unanimous consent for General 
Petraeus to implement his strategy in 
Iraq. We all agree, on both sides of the 
aisle, he is the best we have. In fact, he 
has written a manual dealing with ter-
rorists. 

So why do the Democrats want to 
withdraw funds to support him starting 
the first of July? Even as we speak, the 
troops have to reallocate funds and 
prioritize their missions, because they 
don’t have the full funding. In fact, 
they will run out of money shortly. So 
why do the Democrats not allow Gen-
eral Petraeus to do his job? General 
Petraeus intends to report back in Sep-
tember with a complete report on how 
we are doing. That is a very short 
amount of time, in fact, 5 months 
away. 

He deserves a chance, and he deserves 
full funding for this Congress through 
the fiscal year 2007. So I urge Congress, 
after the President vetoes this bill, to 
come back and give a clean bill so that 
the President can get full funding for 
our troops, at least through fiscal year 
2007. 

f 

THE PRESIDENT’S PLAN DOESN’T 
WORK, SIGN THE BILL 

(Ms. JACKSON-LEE of Texas asked 
and was given permission to address 
the House for 1 minute and to revise 
and extend her remarks.) 

Ms. JACKSON-LEE of Texas. Mr. 
Speaker, that’s the value of this great 

country, it is that the will of the peo-
ple can be heard by those of us who 
represent them. The will of the people 
always will be to bring our soldiers 
home. 

It’s interesting that our colleagues 
are talking about funding that doesn’t 
exist when they know full well that 
there is funding until July of 2007 mini-
mally. But, really, the message of the 
Democrats, the legislation of the 
Democrats, is not to micromanage, it 
is a bill that this President, who de-
clared victory 4 years ago on an air-
craft, should sign, because it leaves the 
logistics of the war to the generals, but 
it indicates that the people have spo-
ken, it’s time to bring our troops 
home. 

Does this body recognize that the 
Maliki government has begun to purge 
generals trained by this United States 
military, who have shown themselves 
to be balanced and fair, who have 
shown them themselves to fight 
against insurgents. The Maliki govern-
ment is a complete collapse, it is a fail-
ure. 

It is time now to reorder the govern-
ment to allow allies that are in the 
surrounding areas to work. It is impor-
tant for Secretary Rice to be in Iran, 
to talk to those in Iran and to make 
sure that we have a plan that works. 
The President’s plan doesn’t work. 
Sign the bill. 

f 

b 1800 

HONORING JACK VALENTI 

(Mr. TOWNS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. TOWNS. Mr. Speaker, I rise this 
evening to say farewell to a great 
friend and a great American, Jack Va-
lenti, who passed away last Thursday. 

When Jack spoke, people listened. 
His soaring eloquence and remarkable 
intellect made this town a better place 
and all of us better legislators. How 
lucky we were to know him and to 
have him as a resource and a friend. 

Jack served in President Lyndon 
Johnson’s administration, and made 
his name and reputation early. Jack 
quickly became known as a hard work-
er, making friends with both Demo-
crats and Republicans alike. When 
Jack resigned his White House position 
and became president of the Motion 
Picture Association of America, his 
star really began to shine. 

We are going to miss Jack Valenti, a 
person that had the ability to bring 
people together, a person that had the 
ability to let people understand that 
we all need each other. 

Jack, we are going to miss you, but I 
am certain you will be screening pic-
tures in heaven. 

f 

SPECIAL ORDERS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr. 
PATRICK J. MURPHY of Pennsylvania). 

Under the Speaker’s announced policy 
of January 18, 2007, and under a pre-
vious order of the House, the following 
Members will be recognized for 5 min-
utes each. 

f 

LISA BEAULIEU—TEXAS POLICE 
OFFICER 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under a 
previous order of the House, the gen-
tleman from Texas (Mr. POE) is recog-
nized for 5 minutes. 

Mr. POE. Mr. Speaker, peace officers 
are the last strand of wire in the fence 
between the law and the lawless. They 
do society’s dirty work for us. They are 
a cut above the rest of us because of 
who they are and what they do. 

For Lisa Beaulieu, becoming a police 
officer was her life’s ambition. She 
wanted to protect and serve the citi-
zens of the community that she loved. 
Lisa worked hard at becoming a peace 
officer, and it didn’t come easy for her. 
To gain experience, she worked as a 
jailer in Dayton, Texas while putting 
herself through the police academy at 
Lamar Institute of Technology. And 
when she graduated, Lisa got a job as a 
dispatcher at the Beaumont Police De-
partment. To gain more experience as a 
law enforcement officer, Lisa became 
an unpaid part-time reserve officer 
with the Kountze Police Department in 
Texas. After years of determination, 
Lisa was hired by the Beaumont Police 
Department as a patrol officer in 2001. 

For 6 years, Officer Lisa Beaulieu 
was, as many officers are, the first line 
of defense between the good and the 
evil of our community. She was dedi-
cated to her job, and she took it seri-
ously. Friends of Lisa stated that, 
when off duty, she was a girly girl. She 
loved the color pink, she always had 
manicured nails and pedicured toes, 
and had a closet full of shoes. Lisa had 
a smile that could light up a room and 
a great sense of humor, often telling 
men that would hit on her that she was 
just a driver’s education instructor. 
She was dedicated to the family she 
had and her friends, and she cherished 
the moments she spent with them. She 
was also an avid animal lover, housing 
two dogs that she adopted from the 
animal shelter. 

During the devastation of Hurricane 
Rita, Lisa took care of the citizens of 
Beaumont and her law enforcement 
family. She worked long, tireless 12- 
hour days, patrolling the hurricane’s 
aftermath and caring for the residents 
of Beaumont. For her fellow officers, 
she turned her own garage into a 
makeshift shelter, offering them a 
place to come and get some rest before 
heading back into the disaster zone. 

Friends stated that when she put on 
her uniform, however, she was all busi-
ness. She was fearless and Texas tough, 
invincible when she wore the badge of a 
peace officer. Known as the type of offi-
cer who would set an example for oth-
ers, Lisa’s police file was filled with 
commendations from Chief Tom Sco-
field. 
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Around 1 a.m. Friday morning, April 

27, the seasoned Officer Beaulieu re-
sponded to the scene of a motorcycle 
accident on the Eastex Freeway in 
Beaumont. She began directing traffic 
around the accident, allowing motor-
ists to pass. While controlling the acci-
dent scene and out of the darkness of 
the night, a car driven by 24-year-old 
Willie McCray slammed into Officer 
Beaulieu, knocking her over the guard 
rail and onto the road below, killing 
her. She became the first female police 
officer in Southeast Texas killed in the 
line of duty. 

Mr. Speaker, this is a photograph of 
Lisa Beaulieu. The Beaumont Texas 
community was stunned by the loss of 
this veteran peace officer. Some news 
reports, however, have tried to portray 
the person who ran over Lisa as the 
victim instead of her. McCray was not 
the victim, he was the offender. 
McCray’s driver’s license was sus-
pended and he had no liability insur-
ance. He had been arrested eight times 
for minor crimes. And the worst part, 
McCray was allegedly drunk and be-
lieved to be high on marijuana when he 
was blasting down the road. McCray 
has been charged with the intoxicated 
manslaughter in the death of this 
peace officer of Texas. He robbed the 
Beaumont community and Officer 
Beaulieu’s family of a dedicated law of-
ficer. 

Yesterday, I had the honor to attend 
her funeral, where over 1,000 citizens, 
law enforcement officers, firefighters, 
emergency personnel throughout 
Southeast Texas were all in attendance 
showing their support for their fallen 
comrade. The peace officers present 
wore a black ribbon of sorrow across 
their badges as they paid a last fare-
well to Lisa Beaulieu. 

Mr. Speaker, Officer Beaulieu exem-
plified what it meant to be a peace offi-
cer. She was a protector of the inno-
cent, the community, and her fellow 
peace officers. Officer Beaulieu wore 
the badge with pride, honor, and cour-
age. The people and peace officers of 
Texas are saddened by the loss of one 
of their dedicated servants. 

As a former Texas judge, I have 
known a lot of peace officers in my 
day, and some of them were superior 
peace officers. Lisa was one of those su-
perior officers. Officers like Lisa 
Beaulieu serve us well and are on duty 
in the middle of the night so that the 
rest of us can sleep with safety and se-
curity. 

And that’s just the way it is. 
f 

HONORING JACK VALENTI 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under a 
previous order of the House, the gen-
tleman from Michigan (Mr. CONYERS) is 
recognized for 5 minutes. 

Mr. CONYERS. Members of the 
House, I rise today to express my grati-
tude for having known and worked 
with Jack Valenti, who passed away 
last week after a lifetime that included 
serving as a pilot in the United States 

Army Air Corps, flying 51 combat mis-
sions as the pilot commander of a B–25 
attack bomber, a man who was a senior 
aide in the Lyndon Baines Johnson 
White House, serving as the first spe-
cial assistant to President Lyndon 
Johnson, and as president of the Mo-
tion Pictures Association of America. 

In 2004, Mr. Valenti reflected on his 
extraordinary career when he said, 
‘‘I’m the luckiest guy in the world, be-
cause I spent my entire public working 
career in two of life’s classic fascina-
tions, politics and Hollywood. You 
can’t beat that,’’ he said. 

Nothing about Jack Valenti was av-
erage. He started his adult life as an 
Army B–25 pilot in World War II, flying 
many combat missions over Italy. He 
returned from the war with numerous 
decorations, including the Distin-
guished Flying Cross and the Air Medal 
with four clusters representing addi-
tional awards. 

After the war, while working full 
time, Jack Valenti earned a Bachelor 
of Arts from the University of Houston, 
and then went on to Boston where he 
earned a Master of Business Adminis-
tration from Harvard University. 

Known as one of the most influential 
lobbyists in Washington, he headed the 
Motion Picture Association for 38 
years. During that time, I had the op-
portunity to work with him on a num-
ber of projects, including the Digital 
Millennium Copyright Act, which en-
sured protection for intellectual prop-
erty in order to allow the rollout of 
digital technology. Mr. Valenti is also 
well known for creating the film rating 
system which assigned for the first 
time a rating to films. In other words, 
he created a system that would let 
them voluntarily categorize their films 
rather than requiring that we do it by 
legislation. 

His political career was by no means 
mundane, either. Before he went to the 
Motion Picture Association, he served 
as the first special assistant to Presi-
dent Johnson, and was in the motor-
cade on November 22, 1963 when Presi-
dent Kennedy was assassinated in Dal-
las. He then boarded Air Force One 
with President Johnson and was there 
for the famous picture of President 
Johnson being sworn in, and he became 
President Johnson’s special assistant. 

After a lifetime of achievement, 
while most people would be more than 
ready to retire, Jack Valenti turned 
his energy toward a cause he had been 
concerned about for many years, and 
began leading in the fight against HIV 
and AIDS. He became president of the 
nonprofit Friends of the Global Fight, 
whose main goal is to support the glob-
al fund to fight AIDS, tuberculosis, and 
malaria. Thankfully, we will all be able 
to read about Jack’s enormous accom-
plishments and fascinating life, be-
cause he just finished his memoir be-
fore passing, which is entitled, ‘‘This 
Time, This Place: My Life in War, the 
White House and Hollywood.’’ It will 
soon be published. 

While most people with this amount 
of influence may be too busy for many, 

Jack Valenti defied this stereotype by 
continuing to be both a mentor and 
friend to almost everyone with whom 
he came in contact. He kept his prom-
ises, promptly returned phone calls, 
and is described as generous, loyal, and 
honest by those who knew him. It is an 
understatement to that say Jack Va-
lenti will be sorely missed. 

f 

FORMER U.S. BORDER PATROL 
AGENTS RAMOS AND COMPEAN 
The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under a 

previous order of the House, the gen-
tleman from North Carolina (Mr. 
JONES) is recognized for 5 minutes. 

Mr. JONES of North Carolina. Mr. 
Speaker, today is the 105th day since a 
great injustice took place in this coun-
try. On January 17 of 2007, two U.S. 
Border agents entered Federal prison 
to began serving 11-year and 12-year 
sentences respectively. Agents 
Compean and Ramos were convicted 
last spring for shooting a Mexican drug 
smuggler who brought 743 pounds of 
marijuana across our borders into 
Texas. 

These agents never should have been 
prosecuted; yet, the U.S. Attorney’s Of-
fice prosecuted the agents and granted 
immunity to the drug smuggler. The il-
legal drug smuggler, who received full 
medical care in El Paso, Texas, was 
permitted to return to Mexico and is 
suing the Border Patrol for $5 million 
for violating his civil rights. Mr. 
Speaker, that is a joke. He is not an 
American citizen, he is a criminal. 

The same U.S. Attorney’s Office in 
Western Texas also prosecuted another 
law enforcement officer, Deputy Sher-
iff Gilmer Hernandez, who was doing 
his job to protect the American people. 

b 1815 
This makes no sense. Mr. Speaker, 

citizens across this country, and many 
of us in Congress want to know why 
does a Federal prosecutor in Western 
Texas choose to go after law enforce-
ment officers while protecting illegal 
aliens who commit crimes? 

The American people have not for-
gotten Agents Ramos and Compean, 
who should have been commended in-
stead of indicted. I am encouraging 
citizens across this Nation to continue 
calling the White House and ask the 
President to use his authority to im-
mediately pardon these two heroes. 

Many of us in Congress are concerned 
about the Federal prosecutor in this 
case and the justification for the crimi-
nal charges brought against these 
agents. 

Mr. Speaker, Senate Judiciary Chair-
man PATRICK LEAHY has already ap-
proved Senator DIANE FEINSTEIN’S re-
quest for an investigation of this case. 
And in recent testimony before the 
Senate Judiciary Committee, Attorney 
General Gonzalez promised to fully co-
operate with an oversight hearing on 
the agents’ case. 

I want to thank Mr. Greg Barnes on 
the staff of the House Judiciary Com-
mittee for taking time last week, at 
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