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evening, a three-page bill asking that 
we appropriate $700 billion and give it 
to Henry ‘‘Hank’’ Paulson and let him 
spend it however he deemed fit. 
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Unfortunately, Congress didn’t really 

improve too much on that original 
draft. Congress got stampeded. I didn’t. 
I voted against it. And for one glorious 
moment, one night, one day, we 
stunned the world by stopping that bill 
here in the House and saying there are 
not enough protections for American 
taxpayers in this bill. There’s no guar-
antee we’ll get paid back. There’s no 
real restraint on how Henry ‘‘Hank’’ 
Paulson of Wall Street is going to 
spend the money. We fear it will go to 
bonuses, it will go to waste, it will go 
to his buddies on Wall Street and he’ll 
use it to penalize his enemies on Wall 
Street. And that’s exactly what hap-
pened. 

And here we are now, at least $350 
billion later of that $700 billion. It’s es-
timated, by one group that does weekly 
estimates, we’ve lost about a third of 
the money. The American taxpayers 
are being told they’ll have to pay that 
back over the next 30 years. 

In the meantime, many of these com-
panies and these lords are rewarding 
themselves with bonuses. We’re told, 
well, these are certifiably smart peo-
ple. I mean, how can these firms con-
tinue to exist without them? 

Well, the firms like AIG don’t exist 
anymore except for the largesse from 
the American taxpayer. They bank-
rupted their companies. How could 
anybody think they deserve a perform-
ance bonus or a retention bonus of any 
sort? What they need is a bonus push 
out the door. And that should have 
happened a long time ago. And I’ve got 
to say the Obama administration is 
trying. A big hole was dug here. They 
are trying to make some sense out of 
what Bush and Paulson did. 

But I am not impressed by our Treas-
ury Secretary, Mr. Geithner, and I 
think that President Obama should 
rethink whether or not he is the man 
for the job at this time. When did Sec-
retary Geithner know about these bo-
nuses that were coming due at AIG? He 
was head of the New York Fed. He was 
very involved in bailing out AIG 
through the Federal Reserve last fall. 
Did he just find out or has he known? 
And did he neglect to tell the Presi-
dent, did he neglect to tell the Con-
gress that these bonuses were pending? 
I don’t know for sure. But we need to 
have that question answered. 

Geithner was hired because he said, 
well, Wall Street’s comfortable with 
him. I’ll tell you what. I’d like a Sec-
retary of the Treasury who Wall Street 
doesn’t like because that person is pro-
tecting Main Street Americans and the 
taxpayers of this country instead of 
coddling these fat, overpaid people on 
Wall Street who have bankrupted their 
own companies and are trying to bank-
rupt America and have caused nation-
ally and worldwide an economic col-
lapse. These certifiably smart people. 

So today we began to correct the 
mistakes that were made here last fall 
under pressure from Bush and Paulson. 
But people need to be brought to ac-
count. We need to hire the 1,100 agents 
that the FBI has been asking for for 4 
years to fill out their financial fraud 
and crimes unit. We need to hire those 
1,100 people and maybe give some of 
these people who today are getting bo-
nuses Federal hospitality in the future, 
a little uniform and a nice warm place 
to sit behind bars. 

We need those investigators. We need 
that budget. We need to thoroughly re-
view everything that’s gone on. And we 
really need to question the leadership 
of Secretary Geithner in these matters. 
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ANNOUNCEMENT BY THE SPEAKER 
PRO TEMPORE 

THE SPEAKER pro tempore. Persons 
in the gallery are reminded to refrain 
from audible manifestations of ap-
proval or disapproval of the pro-
ceedings of the House. 
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THE AIG BONUS BILL IS A 
LEGISLATIVE COVERUP 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under a 
previous order of the House, the gen-
tleman from Georgia (Mr. BROUN) is 
recognized for 5 minutes. 

Mr. BROUN of Georgia. Mr. Speaker, 
today leaders in this Congress have 
hastily pushed through a bill with the 
direct intent of correcting a mistake, a 
mistake that could have been pre-
vented in the first place. Let me repeat 
that. A mistake that could have been 
prevented in the first place. 

We’ve all seen the devastation that 
occurs following congressional knee- 
jerk reactions, and I am afraid that to-
day’s AIG bonus bill will not be an ex-
ception to that rule. 

I have serious constitutional con-
cerns about our government’s tar-
geting such a narrow group of citizens 
with a retroactive tax hike. Regulating 
the pay of thousands of private citizens 
because of a mistake made by the lead-
ership of this Congress starts us down a 
slippery constitutional slope. And what 
are our constitutional leaders planning 
to do with the taxes that they collect 
from this bill? It will probably all go 
back to AIG in their next bailout pay-
ment. 

My mama always taught me that two 
wrongs do not make a right, and this 
bill is no more than a legislative cover-
up by the leadership of this Congress. 
It’s time for this body to instead ad-
dress the problem that got us here in 
the first place: the lack of trans-
parency. Lack of transparency is the 
true perpetrator in this high crime 
against the taxpayers. Ultimately, the 
taxpayers are not only the defendant in 
this case, but also the jury. And I think 
the taxpayers must serve congressional 
leaders with a clear verdict. 

It’s congressional leadership who re-
linquished their promises for a more 
transparent government and instead 

steamrolled the ‘‘nonstimulus’’ stim-
ulus bill down our throats, bypassing 
the regular committee process and re-
fusing input from the minority party. 

Why are my colleagues on the other 
side acting surprised to find that a pro-
vision was ripped out of this bill that 
would have prevented these bonuses in 
the first place? In fact, that was even 
introduced by a Democratic U.S. Sen-
ator. They finally made the 1,000-page 
bill public in the middle of the night 
and then steamrolled it through Con-
gress only a few hours later, all with-
out adequate public or congressional 
scrutiny. This is absolutely out-
rageous. The American people deserve 
better and must demand better. 

They say that making legislation is 
like making sausage; you don’t want to 
see it. But I beg to differ because these 
are trillion-dollar hot dogs that are 
being slammed and shoved down the 
throats of the taxpayers, and the tax-
payers have to swallow it. It’s time for 
congressional leaders to let taxpayers 
into the sausage factory. It’s time for 
taxpayers to see what goes on here in 
Congress and goes into the sausage, 
and what’s left out. Then and only then 
will we avoid coming back to fix mis-
takes that shouldn’t have been made in 
the first place. 

We have seen bill after bill shoved 
down the taxpayers’ throats. It’s a 
steamroll of socialism that’s being 
shoved down our throats. It’s going to 
strangle the American economy, and 
it’s going to choke the American tax-
payers. 

Taxpayers deserve better. Taxpayers 
have to demand better. Taxpayers are 
not being treated fairly. We’ve seen bill 
after bill that’s going to hurt the econ-
omy. It’s going to cost jobs. It’s going 
to create a longer and a deeper reces-
sion, maybe even a depression. We have 
seen people on the other side blame 
President Bush and they show right-
eous indignation, and it’s totally mis-
placed because in this last Congress, 
110th, now in the 111th, and with this 
administration, we have seen bill after 
bill that’s going to hurt the economy, 
that’s going to hurt the American tax-
payer, that’s going to cost jobs. It 
spends too much, it taxes too much, it 
borrows too much, and it’s going to 
kill our economy. 

We have got to demand more and bet-
ter from this leadership and this Con-
gress. The steamroll of socialism is 
being driven by NANCY PELOSI and 
HARRY REID and this administration, 
and it must stop because it’s going to 
destroy America economically. 

f 

COMMUNICATION FROM FIELD 
REPRESENTATIVE, THE HONOR-
ABLE WALLY HERGER, MEMBER 
OF CONGRESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore laid be-
fore the House the following commu-
nication from David Meurer, Field Rep-
resentative, the Honorable WALLY 
HERGER, Member of Congress: 
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