
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATES7750 September 29, 2010 
This year’s Hall of Fame class rep-

resents the best of our State, and I am 
proud to see them receive this signifi-
cant achievement. Not only do they ex-
emplify excellence in their chosen 
field, they also represent the highest 
standards of ethics and community 
service. I thank them for their con-
tributions, along with the contribu-
tions of all business leaders in our 
great State.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO BILLY AND DIANN 
SIMMONS 

∑ Mrs. LINCOLN. Mr. President, today 
I honor Billy and Diann Simmons from 
my home State of Arkansas for their 
exemplary efforts to support foster 
children in our State. I am proud to 
recognize them as my choice for this 
year’s ‘‘Angel in Adoption’’ for Arkan-
sas. They join adoption advocates from 
across the Nation who have received 
this prestigious recognition. 

The Angels in Adoption program, 
sponsored by the Congressional Coali-
tion on Adoption Institute, provides 
Members of Congress the opportunity 
to honor those who have made an ex-
traordinary contribution on behalf of 
children in need of homes. 

The Simmons are certainly worthy of 
this recognition. Diann Simmons be-
came a therapeutic foster parent in 
1997 and persuaded her soon-to-be 
spouse to join her in this noble endeav-
or prior to their marriage in 1998. The 
Simmons’ have now been therapeutic 
foster parents for 13 years and have sig-
nificant experience fostering children 
with difficult behaviors. 

Despite their experiences with chil-
dren with challenging emotional and 
behavioral difficulties, they love chil-
dren and maintain a sense of strong 
family values. These values have re-
sulted in the adoption of seven chil-
dren, including two sibling groups of 
two. Their most recent adoption was fi-
nalized this year. 

Because of their experience, flexi-
bility, strong family values and their 
belief in the potential for every child, 
they have been successful in changing 
the lives of numerous children. Accord-
ing to those who know them best, the 
Simmons have developed a strong bond 
with every child placed in their home. 
In fact, four of their adopted children 
were in their home as foster children 
prior to adoption. 

Affectionately called ‘‘Mama Diann’’ 
and ‘‘Daddy Billy,’’ the Simmons’ com-
mitment, genuine concern and caring 
for their foster children has endeared 
them to many of these children’s birth 
families, including families of their 
own adopted children. 

I commend both Diann and Billy for 
their dedication and perseverance help-
ing children in need. They represent 
the best of Arkansas, and I commend 
them for their work on behalf of Ar-
kansas’s children.∑ 

TRIBUTE TO PHIL E. MATTHEWS 

∑ Mrs. LINCOLN. Mr. President, today 
I recognize Phil E. Matthews for his 
dedicated years of service at the Ar-
kansas Hospital Association. His ef-
forts on behalf of our State’s hospitals 
are to be commended, and I thank him 
for his efforts to maintain high-quality 
hospital care for the citizens of Arkan-
sas. 

Phil has been a part of the Arkansas 
Hospital Association, known as AHA, 
since 1969 and was named president in 
2005. During his tenure, he has worked 
hard to cultivate constructive relation-
ships with State and Federal legisla-
tors in order to achieve great results 
for Arkansas. He has reinforced the 
AHA as a trusted partner for Arkansas 
hospitals and other health care pro-
viders and entities from all across the 
State. 

In recent years, the AHA has helped 
to pass laws on the State level that 
will enhance the health of and health 
care services for Arkansans, including 
for the development of a statewide 
trauma care system, expansion of 
health insurance coverage for more 
than 6,000 additional children through 
ARKids, and public health initiatives 
that will increase seatbelt usage and 
decrease tobacco use in the State. 

On the Federal level, it has been my 
pleasure to work closely with Phil and 
the AHA to develop and pass policies to 
expand health insurance coverage to 
more than 400,000 Arkansans, grow the 
health care workforce in Arkansas, 
modernize health care delivery and the 
use of health information technologies, 
and preserve the viability and valuable 
role of Arkansas’s community hos-
pitals. Together, we have fought back 
on policies that might have had a nega-
tive impact or unintended consequence 
for Arkansas hospitals, providers, and 
patients, and we have worked to ad-
vance policies that are best for our 
great State. 

I am extremely proud of Phil’s and 
the AHA’s efforts to help Arkansas hos-
pitals provide quality care to their pa-
tients, provide charity care for those in 
need, serve refugees of gulf coast hurri-
canes and other natural disasters, and 
play an active role in improving health 
care coverage and quality in Arkansas. 
I wish Phil all the very best in his re-
tirement, and to Bo Ryall, who will 
serve as his successor as president of 
the AHA.∑ 

f 

ARKANSAS’S TRAUMA CENTERS 

∑ Mrs. LINCOLN. Mr. President, 
today I recognize Arkansas’s newly es-
tablished trauma system, and I com-
mend three facilities in the State for 
garnering the highest designations of 
trauma care. 

The University of Arkansas for Med-
ical Sciences in Little Rock and the 
Regional Medical Center in Memphis 
were selected to provide the highest 
level of trauma care under the system, 
which is aimed at getting patients spe-

cialized care in emergency situations. 
Jefferson Regional Medical Center in 
Pine Bluff was designated a Level 2 
center, which can provide comprehen-
sive clinical care. 

The new system will connect hos-
pitals, ambulance services and other 
emergency responders to act as a state-
wide triage, transporting trauma pa-
tients as quickly as possible to the fa-
cility best able to treat their specific 
injuries. Furthermore, it will help ele-
vate Arkansas’s status nationwide in 
terms of large-scale emergency man-
agement and disaster preparedness ca-
pabilities. 

Eighty-six hospitals in Arkansas 
could eventually become a part of the 
new trauma system. Of those, 73 have 
already begun the process by filing let-
ters of intent to request designation as 
one of the four levels of centers. 

I commend all of Arkansas’s health 
care providers for their dedicated ef-
forts to save lives and keep Arkansans 
safe, healthy and strong. With this new 
trauma system, Arkansas has achieved 
a new level of high quality care, and I 
am pleased to see our State attain this 
significant designation.∑ 

f 

IRON COUNTY COURTHOUSE 

∑ Mrs. MCCASKILL. Mr. President, I ask 
the Senate to join me in honoring the 
150th anniversary of the completion 
and opening of the Iron County Court-
house in Ironton, MO. 

Chosen as the county seat in 1857, 
Ironton is home to the only courthouse 
in Iron County. Ironton businessmen 
David Carson and Hiram Tong donated 
town lots to the county, which covered 
more than $10,000 of the $14,000 cost of 
the courthouse. 

Architect Henry H. Wright received 
$25 for his proposed design of the build-
ing. George S. Evans and William F. 
Mitchell earned the building contract 
and used locally made red brick and 
white limestone from a nearby quarry. 
The original building measured 50 by 65 
feet, with 6 rooms on the first floor and 
the courtroom on the second floor. The 
community laid the cornerstone on 
July 4, 1858, and officially opened the 
courthouse in October 1860. 

The courthouse today serves as the 
home of several county offices and is a 
national registered historic site that 
still bears damage from the Civil War 
and the Battle of Pilot Knob in Sep-
tember 1864. 

As the birthplace of Missouri’s 4–H 
Program and a symbol of the commit-
ment of the residents of Iron County to 
justice and service to the community, 
the Iron County Courthouse deserves 
commemoration on this important day 
in its history. 

I ask that the Senate join me in rec-
ognizing the 150th anniversary of the 
Iron County Courthouse.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO SHANNON MCDANIEL 

∑ Mrs. MURRAY. Mr. President, today 
I wish to congratulate a hard-working 
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