AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

1121H CONGRESS
naeE H, R, 3021

To amend title 49, United States Code, to modify cost-sharing requirements
under certain public transportation grant programs, and for other purposes.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

SEPTEMBER 22, 2011
Mr. CARSON of Indiana (for himself, Ms. BORDALLO, and Ms. LEE of Cali-
fornia) introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee
on Transportation and Infrastructure

A BILL

To amend title 49, United States Code, to modify cost-
sharing requirements under certain public transportation
erant programs, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Community Transit

(O B Y N )

Promotion Act of 20117,



2
1 SEC. 2. COST-SHARING REQUIREMENTS UNDER CERTAIN

PUBLIC TRANSPORTATION GRANT PRO-
GRAMS.

(a) JOB ACCESS AND REVERSE COMMUTE FORMULA

2

3

4

5 GRANTS.—Section 5316(h) of title 49, United States
6 Code, is amended—

7 (1) in paragraph (2) by striking “50 percent”
8 and inserting “80 percent’”’; and

9

(2) in paragraph (3) by striking subparagraph

10 (A) and inserting the following:

11 “(A) may be provided from an undistrib-
12 uted cash surplus, a replacement or deprecia-
13 tion cash fund or reserve, fare box revenues, a
14 service agreement with a transit provider, a
15 service agreement with a State or local social
16 service agency or a private social service organi-
17 zation, or new capital; and”.

18 (b) NEW FREEDOM PROGRAM.—Section 5317(g) of

19 such title is amended—

20 (1) in paragraph (2) by striking “50 percent”
21 and inserting “80 percent’’; and

22 (2) In paragraph (3) by striking subparagraph
23 (A) and inserting the following:

24 “(A) may be provided from an undistrib-
25 uted cash surplus, a replacement or deprecia-
26 tion cash fund or reserve, fare box revenues, a

*HR 3021 IH



A~ WL P

3

service agreement with a transit provider, a
service agreement with a State or local social
service agency or a private social service organi-
zation, or new capital; and”.

O

*HR 3021 IH



		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-08T00:21:52-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




