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holidays. She also assists with giving benefit 
programs to people in the community whose 
homes have been destroyed by fire. Willie 
Steen is the mother of three: Tony, Erik and 
Michael. 

f 

FULL-YEAR CONTINUING 
APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2011 

SPEECH OF 

HON. JAMES P. McGOVERN 
OF MASSACHUSETTS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 15, 2011 

The House in Committee of the Whole 
House on the State of the Union had under 
consideration the bill (H.R. 1) making appro-
priations for the Department of Defense and 
the other departments and agencies of the 
Government for the fiscal year ending Sep-
tember 30, 2011, and for other purposes: 

Mr. MCGOVERN. Mr. Chair, I wish to ex-
press my strong support for the Sustainable 
Communities Initiative and oppose any cuts to 
this important economic development program 
in H.R. 1. 

The Sustainable Communities Initiative illus-
trates a successful partnership among govern-
ment agencies to invest in our local econo-
mies. At a time when there’s so much talk of 
making government work better, this initiative 
is a shining example of cutting red tape and 
fostering collaboration among similar commu-
nity interests. 

Through this initiative, the Departments of 
Transportation, Housing and Urban Develop-
ment and the Environmental Protection Agen-
cy award competitive grants to communities 
for innovative projects that connect the cre-
ation of good jobs, sustainable housing and 
efficient modes of transportation. 

In just the short time that this initiative has 
been in existence, it has awarded numerous 
competitive grants to communities across the 
country. 

In 2010, a total of 630 communities re-
quested $1.2 billion in finding and HUD award-
ed 61 grants worth $69 million. Clearly, com-
munities see the great potential benefits for 
the projects funded by this unique initiative. 

Although my hometown of Worcester, Mas-
sachusetts was not a grantee in the last round 
of awards, it earned the designation of ‘‘pre-
ferred sustainability status.’’ Eliminating fund-
ing for the Sustainable Communities Initiative 
would prevent Worcester and dozens of com-
munities across the country from having the 
opportunity to receive grants to meet their 
multiple economic, environmental and commu-
nity needs. 

Furthermore, language in H.R. 1 to rescind 
unobligated funds would threaten projects in 
communities that were recently awarded 
grants. 

Mr. Chair, cutting funding for the Sustain-
able Communities Initiative would be harmful 
to job creation efforts and would take away a 
vital tool to help communities transition to a 
21st century economy. 

I urge my colleagues to support the Sustain-
able Communities Initiative and oppose any 
cuts to this program. 

FULL-YEAR CONTINUING 
APPROPRIATIONS ACT, 2011 

SPEECH OF 

HON. DORIS O. MATSUI 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 15, 2011 

The House in Committee of the Whole 
House on the State of the Union had under 
consideration the bill (H.R. 1) making appro-
priations for the Department of Defense and 
the other departments and agencies of the 
Government for the fiscal year ending Sep-
tember 30, 2011, and for other purposes: 

Ms. MATSUI. Mr. Chair, I rise today in op-
position to the C.R. put forward by my Repub-
lican colleagues, and specifically to the 
defunding of Title X family planning programs 
authorized under the Public Health Service 
Act. 

Begun in 1970 by President Nixon, Title X 
funding provides for voluntary family planning 
projects, and is essential to protecting wom-
en’s health services. Currently, Title X is our 
Nation’s only program dedicated to providing 
low-income Americans with family planning 
and reproductive health services. 

My colleagues on the other side of the aisle 
are attempting to misconstrue Title X as fed-
eral subsidizing of abortion. However, Title X 
does not provide for abortion services. But it 
does cover essential health care for millions of 
families and women. From birth control to can-
cer screenings, approximately five million 
Americans rely upon Title X programs every 
year. 

We simply cannot afford to cut lifesaving 
and preventive care services for those who 
would not otherwise have access to such 
care, especially in our current economic cli-
mate. 

I urge my colleagues to vote against the 
defunding of these vital health programs con-
tained in Title X by voting against the C.R. 

f 

HONORING FLORA BUSH STIGLER 

HON. BENNIE G. THOMPSON 
OF MISSISSIPPI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 17, 2011 

Mr. THOMPSON of Mississippi. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise today to honor the long and distin-
guished life of Mrs. Flora Bush Stigler. Born 
June 28, 1935, in Carroll County, Mississippi 
she was the 9th of 10 children born to the late 
Charlie and Susie Bush. She attended-Ware 
school in Carroll County and Knox High 
School in Winona, MS. Upon completing her 
studies she received a music scholarship in 
choir from Rust College in Holly Springs, Mis-
sissippi. While at Rust College, she majored in 
education, with a concentration in history. She 
also did further studies at Mississippi State 
University. She taught one year in 
Pelahatchie, MS and twenty-nine years at J. 
Z. George High School. She retired in 1986. 
While at J. Z. George, she taught 7th grade 
history and later taught 11 grade history. Of 
course, she was known for her no-nonsense 
atmosphere in the classroom. She carefully 
cultivated her students’ natural abilities while 
demanding and commanding discipline. She 
ensured and assured each child that edu-

cation is and would be the key to success. 
She retired from education after 30 years of 
service. 

As a member of Helm Chapel Church, she 
serves diligently as Director of Christian Edu-
cation and Music Director for both the adult 
and the youth choir. She also served many 
years as director of Prater Day Care Center of 
Helm Chapel CME Church, the first day care 
center in our area. 

In April 2008, she received her Golden De-
gree from Rust College. She is politically ac-
tive, serving as County Coordinator for Con-
gressman BENNIE G. THOMPSON, and treasurer 
of the Carroll County Voters’ League. Cur-
rently at age 75, she is still working with peo-
ple in the community by way of managing a 
state program known as ‘‘Meals on Wheels’’ 
for seven counties, (Attala, Carroll, Grenada, 
Holmes, Leflore, Montgomery and Yalobusha) 
through North Central Planning and Develop-
ment District. 

She is the mother of three daughters, a 
grandmother of 6, a great grandmother of 7 
and a person who never meets a stranger. 
Today, as in past years, she is known for her 
community service. She is an ‘‘active’’ and 
vocal member of the PTO at J. Z. George 
High School. 
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RECOGNIZING H. DOUGLAS 
CHAFFIN AS THE MICHIGAN 
BANKERS ASSOCIATION 2011 
BANKER OF THE YEAR 

HON. JOHN D. DINGELL 
OF MICHIGAN 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 17, 2011 

Mr. DINGELL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize H. Douglas Chaffin’s being named 
the Michigan Bankers Association (MBA) 2011 
Banker of the Year. Doug serves as the Presi-
dent and CEO of Monroe Bank and Trust 
(MBT), a locally owned and operated commu-
nity bank headquartered in Monroe, Michigan. 
He has been with Monroe Bank and Trust 
since 2001 and assumed the role of CEO in 
2004. 

Doug has guided Monroe Bank and Trust 
with a steady hand through the turmoil of the 
current recession. In a time of great uncer-
tainty and anxiety, he has led the bank with 
dignity and grace. Due to his keen instincts, 
high character and responsible management, 
Monroe Bank and Trust not only has weath-
ered the financial maelstrom but, unlike its na-
tional counterparts, continued without interrup-
tion to lend to a community in dire need. 
Doug’s vast knowledge of the financial indus-
try and sage counsel have helped inform me 
for years, and his expert testimony to the 
House Subcommittee on Oversight and Inves-
tigations of the Committee on Financial Serv-
ices in November 2009 helped bring a com-
munity bank’s valuable perspective to the fi-
nancial regulatory reform debate. 

Doug’s role in the community extends far 
beyond the walls of his bank. He is a commu-
nity leader in every sense. Doug has served 
as the past chairman of the Michigan Bankers 
Association. He also serves on the board of 
directors for the Monroe County Industrial De-
velopment Corporation, City of Monroe Down-
town Development Authority, The Foundation 
at Monroe County Community College, and 
Mercy Memorial Hospital System. 
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Mr. Speaker, Doug Chaffin has served his 

bank and his community with distinction and 
honor. I ask that my colleagues join me in 
congratulating him on this well deserved rec-
ognition. 

f 

RECOGNIZING ‘‘AMERICAN HEART 
MONTH’’ 

HON. DANNY K. DAVIS 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 17, 2011 

Mr. DAVIS of Illinois. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to bring awareness of the increase in 
cardiovascular diseases in the United States. 
Since 1963, to urge Americans to join the bat-
tle against these diseases, Congress has re-
quested that the President issue an annual 
proclamation designating February as ‘‘Amer-
ican Heart Month.’’ Throughout this month, 
volunteers, educators, health professionals, 
community leaders and others will devote time 
to increase awareness about the number one 
killer of Americans: Cardiovascular disease. 
Since 1900 cardiovascular disease has ac-
counted for more deaths than any other major 
cause of death in the U.S., 1 out of every 3. 
Every 25 seconds someone has a coronary 
event and every 40 seconds someone has a 
stroke. According to the American Heart Asso-
ciation Heart Disease and Stroke Statistics 
2010 Update, the estimated direct and indirect 
costs of CVD for 2010 totaled $503.2 billion. 

Heart disease impacts all ethnic groups, 
men and women, young and old. Strokes 
occur more often in women and twice as often 
in African Americans. Just reported this month 
at the American Stroke Association con-
ference were statistics showing a 51% in-
crease in strokes in 15–34 year old men and 
a 17% increase in 15–34 year old women. 
The average age of a person having a first 
heart attack is 64.5 for men and 70.3 for 
women. As overweight and obesity—believed 
to be the major reasons for these alarming 
statistics—become more prevalent in our soci-
ety, the risk of CVD and stroke begins to 
occur at younger ages. 

There are 9 modifiable risk factors for heart 
disease, 5 of which are related to diet. These 
include hypertension, abnormal blood lipids, 
abdominal obesity, diabetes, decreased intake 
of fruits and vegetables and overconsumption 
of alcoholic beverages. All of these risk factors 
could be controlled with healthy eating habits 
and an active lifestyle. 

I am pleased to have the headquarters for 
the American Dietetic Association (ADA) in my 
Congressional District. The ADA is the fore-
most authority in providing nutrition counseling 
throughout the country. In fact, the more than 
71,000 registered dietitians and nutrition pro-
fessionals who are members support the ‘eat 
right’ campaign targeted toward all Ameri-
cans—young and old. The work that they are 
doing is making a difference in the fight 
against heart disease and stroke and is im-
proving the health of our citizens. 

Having Medical Nutrition Therapy (MNT) 
covered by Medicare for beneficiaries diag-
nosed with hypertension and abnormal blood 
lipids must happen if we are to have any im-
pact at conquering CVD and its associated 
deaths. Medical Nutrition Therapy provided by 
a registered dietitian has been shown to effec-

tively aid in normalizing blood pressure, blood 
sugar and serum cholesterol levels, while also 
promoting any necessary weight loss. The life-
style changes needed to provide the improve-
ments in these risk factors cannot be made by 
most Americans without the vital assistance of 
the registered dietitian. By helping people 
eliminate or improve these risk factors, Medi-
care will avoid paying for the expensive treat-
ments, procedures and hospitalizations that 
occur due to a cardiovascular event, thus cre-
ating a shift from health ‘‘care’’ to health ‘‘pre-
vention’’. 

I commend the American Heart Association 
and the National Heart, Lung and Blood Insti-
tute (NHLBI) for their numerous programs and 
educational materials made available to the 
public to help them adapt a healthier lifestyle. 
Many employers and churches are partici-
pating in programs which encourage them to 
create a culture of physical activity and 
healthy eating to live longer, heart-healthy 
lives through walking. The NHLBI program 
‘‘Healthy Hearts, Healthy Homes’’, presents 
important information about a specific risk fac-
tor for heart disease, high blood pressure, in 
a user-friendly and clear manner for Latinos. 
Several Point-of-Purchase food labeling pro-
grams are being used by various grocery 
stores to help their customers make the 
healthiest choices. 

The 2020 Impact Goal of the American 
Heart Association states: By 2020, to improve 
the cardiovascular health of all Americans by 
20% while reducing death from cardiovascular 
diseases and stroke by 20%. It will take all of 
us working together, encouraging our friends, 
families and co-workers, to live a healthier life-
style in order to make this become a reality. 
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HONORING VONNIE WARE 

HON. BENNIE G. THOMPSON 
OF MISSISSIPPI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 17, 2011 

Mr. THOMPSON of Mississippi. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise today to honor a remarkable public 
servant Mr. Vonnie Ware. Mr. Ware owns and 
operates his own cook syrup farm and has 
raised cattle for the past twenty years. His 
parents W.H. and Lovie Dier-Ware had nine 
children. His father was a Blacksmith who 
owned his own land. 

His wife’s father, Samuel Mallet, owned and 
operated his own farm in the Thomastown 
community where they could hear the bells 
ringing on the plantation two miles away. His 
father shoed horses for twenty-five cents (.25) 
a head. The children that lived on the planta-
tion never went to school until it rained. He 
says, ‘‘That’s why I say we are just one step 
from the plantation, because I still meet the 
same men today who can’t read or write.’’ 

Out of all the injustice they endured, 
Vonnie’s parents never taught them to hate 
anyone because of his skin color. His grand-
parents were Will and Lizer Griffin-Dier. He 
considered his grandfather his greatest hero 
and stayed with him when he was a small 
boy. 

Vonnie’s grandfather was a Deacon in his 
church and owned and operated his own farm. 
He was also a syrup cooker. His grandfather 
wasn’t allowed any kind of benefits because 
he owned his own land. Vonnie followed in his 
grandfather’s footsteps. 

His Aunt Frances Dier taught school 40 
years in Leake County. She walked for miles 
to school since she could not ride the bus be-
cause she was black. One day, the bus 
passed and splashed mud on her; she 
stepped in the ditch and prayed that one day 
her people would be able to ride the bus like 
the white people. 

Today, Vonnie Ware is a past TAC 
(Thomastown Attendance Center) Booster 
club President of four years. He was also a 
trustee at Leake Memorial Hospital for two 
years. He is an active member of the Leake 
County Voters League. 

Vonnie Ware speaks from his heart when 
he says: ‘‘We are thankful for the old freedom 
fighters that humbled themselves and denied 
themselves of speaking like they were men or 
women. They knew what the blacks knew. It 
was difficult to see ‘‘white only’’ signs up ev-
erywhere you go. This hurts my soul to write 
anymore about it In order for a young man to 
succeed, he must do these three things: Be-
lieve in God, vote, and know how to spend his 
money. We have come a long way BUT we 
still have a long way to go. We must press 
on.’’ 

f 

FULL-YEAR CONTINUING 
APPROPRIATION ACT, 2011 

SPEECH OF 

HON. BRAD SHERMAN 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, February 15, 2011 

The House in Committee of the Whole 
House on the State of the Union had under 
consideration the bill (H.R. 1) making appro-
priations for the Department of Defense and 
the other departments and agencies of the 
Government for the fiscal year ending Sep-
tember 30, 2011, and for other purposes: 

Mr. SHERMAN. Mr. Chair, Congressman 
FRANK and Congressman HOLT offered 
amendments reducing funding for the Internal 
Revenue Service, and increasing funding for 
the SEC and the Consumer Financial Protec-
tion Bureau, respectively. 

I do not support a reduction in the budget of 
the Internal Revenue Service, nor do I support 
the rather modest cut to the General Services 
Administration included in the Frank Amend-
ment 

I believe that if the House adopts the Frank 
and Holt Amendments that the Senate will 
provide the funds to the Securities and Ex-
change Commission and the Consumer Finan-
cial Protection Bureau indicated in those 
amendments, and will also restore the funds 
to the IRS and the GSA. Accordingly, I did not 
vote for these amendments as if they were the 
last word that Congress would utter regarding 
the funding of the SEC, the Consumer Finan-
cial Protection Bureau, the IRS, and the GSA. 
Rather, I believe that in the Senate, and in the 
Conference committee, the support registered 
for the Frank and Holt Amendments will bol-
ster the claim of those trying to provide ade-
quate funding for the SEC and the Consumer 
Financial Protection Bureau, but will not un-
dercut those of us seeking adequate funding 
for the IRS and GSA. 

My support for IRS funding does not mean 
that I do not think that there needs to be sig-
nificant reform of the IRS, its operations, and 
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