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a difference in the students’ lives and 
inspire them to continue in STEM ca-
reers or postsecondary education. 

In fact, research shows that 99 per-
cent of students who participate in 
FIRST Robotics graduate high school 
and almost 90 percent go on the col-
lege. And once in college, these stu-
dents are nearly seven times more like-
ly to major in engineering and twice as 
likely to major in computer science. 
They are also significantly more likely 
to attain a postgraduate degree. The 
data speaks for itself: investments in 
these sorts of programs matter and 
make a difference. 

I urge colleagues to join me in sup-
porting this important legislation that 
will inspire our students to become sci-
entists, engineers, computer program-
mers and mathematicians. Our coun-
try’s economic future depends on it. 

I yield the floor. 
The ACTING PRESIDENT pro tem-

pore. The Senator from Kansas. 
Mr. ROBERTS. Madam President, I 

am going to speak for approximately 4 
minutes during morning business. I had 
originally intended on 15, but I am 
going to do that tomorrow on another 
subject. If I could be recognized for 4 
minutes, that is my intention. 

The ACTING PRESIDENT pro tem-
pore. Without objection, it is so or-
dered. 

Mr. ROBERTS. I thank the Chair. 
f 

WICHITA STATE UNIVERSITY 
SHOCKERS 

Mr. ROBERTS. Madam President, I 
know it is pretty serious business talk-
ing about a government shutdown and 
things of this nature that affect all 
Americans. I certainly hope we can 
reach some accommodation. I wish to 
do a little bragging on behalf of my 
home State. 

We are pretty proud of our basketball 
heritage in Kansas, but I note that we 
have not received national recognition 
to the extent I think we should in re-
gards to the recent accomplishment I 
wish to highlight. 

I rise to congratulate the Wichita 
State University Shockers. The Shock-
ers won the 2011 Men’s National Invita-
tion Tournament in the Big Apple, the 
championship in New York City. In 
claiming the championship trophy, 
Wichita State set the school record 
with 29 victories in the season. Wichita 
State advanced to the NIT champion-
ship with four straight wins in the 
tournament. They beat the University 
of Nebraska in the first round, Virginia 
Tech in the second round, the College 
of Charleston in the quarter finals, 
Washington State University in the 
semifinal, and, finally, the University 
of Alabama in the championship game. 
All of these schools have good basket-
ball teams, and Wichita State came out 
on top. 

Graham Hatch was named the NIT’s 
most outstanding player and a member 
of the All-Tournament Team, while 
Garret Stutz was named to the All- 
Tournament Team as well. 

Wichita State and head coach Gregg 
Marshall were not only successful on 
the court but in the classroom as well. 
Earlier this year, Coach Hatch and 
Garrett Stutz were named to the 2011 
Missouri Valley Conference Scholar 
Athlete first and honorable mention 
teams, respectively. I congratulate the 
Wichita State University Shockers, 
their head coach Gregg Marshall, the 
athletic director Eric Sexton, a good 
friend of mine, and Wichita State Uni-
versity president Don Beggs. Don, you 
are back again, and you certainly did 
us proud. 

Specifically, I congratulate each 
member of the team for an exemplary 
season: Gabe Blair, Derek Brown, J.T. 
Durley, Aaron Ellis, Jerome Hamilton, 
Graham Hatch, Trey Jones, David 
Kyles, Toure Murry, Ehimen Orukpe, 
Joe Ragland, Tyler Richardson, Ben 
Smith, Garrett Stutz, Randall 
Vautravers, Josh Walker, and Demitric 
Williams. 

If I mispronounced any name, I am 
terribly sorry. They did not do any-
thing wrong with the tournament in 
terms of winning the NIT. Congratula-
tions to all Shockers basketball fans. 
The coach has made the decision to 
stay at Wichita State. Good news for 
Kansas. Good news for Wichita State, 
an exemplary action on the part of the 
coach after a very successful team ef-
fort and winning the NIT and then 
staying at Wichita State University. 
Good news for Kansas, good news for 
Wichita State, and good news all the 
way around. 

By the way, we will not shut down 
the team. They are going to keep on 
fighting. 

I think the signal there was not four 
quarters and let’s go play hard, but the 
4 minutes are up. 

I yield the floor, and I suggest the ab-
sence of a quorum. 

The ACTING PRESIDENT pro tem-
pore. The clerk will call the roll. 

The bill clerk proceeded to call the 
roll. 

Mr. BARRASSO. I ask unanimous 
consent that the order for the quorum 
call be rescinded. 

The ACTING PRESIDENT pro tem-
pore. Without objection, it is so or-
dered. 

f 

A SECOND OPINION 

Mr. BARRASSO. Madam President, I 
come to the floor today as a doctor 
who has practiced medicine in Wyo-
ming for about 25 years. During that 
time I was medical director of some-
thing called Wyoming Health Fairs 
where we provide employees low-cost 
blood screening for early detection and 
early treatment of medical problems. 
We know one of the things that was at-
tempted to be solved with the discus-
sion on health care was to have people 
involved in their own health care deci-
sions and early detection, as well as 
prevention of disease. 

I attended a health fair last weekend 
in Worland, Washakie County, WY, 

where I had a chance to meet with a 
number of folks, including people from 
small businesses. First, I wish to con-
gratulate this body, and specifically 
Senator JOHANNS from Nebraska, for 
the repeal of the 1099 form regulations 
which significantly burden small busi-
nesses all around the country. 

I also come to the floor as someone 
who has practiced medicine and has 
been watching the health care law 
closely. It is one that I believe is bad 
for patients, bad for providers and 
nurses and doctors who take care of 
the patients, and bad for the American 
taxpayers because I think this is going 
to add significantly to our growing 
debt problem. These are things that 
need to be addressed. 

One part of the health care law, the 
2,700-page law that was passed, dealt 
with something called accountable 
care organizations. Those are intended 
to help people coordinate care and have 
that coordinated care increase people’s 
health by early detection of problems 
and to help minimize problems but also 
attempt to save money. 

The six pages of the health care law 
that dealt with accountable care orga-
nizations has resulted in the release of 
regulations on March 31, 429 pages of 
regulations which have a significant 
impact on restructuring the way medi-
cine is practiced. 

As I look at this in terms of our 
growing debt, my concern is that the 
administration is bragging that the 
regulations save Medicare money, 
about $960 million total, best care sce-
nario, over a 3-year period. So savings 
of less than $1 billion, a restructuring 
of the way medicine is being practiced, 
a savings of less than $1 billion, at a 
time when Medicare will be spending 
over those 3 years over $1.5 trillion, a 
savings of less than $1 billion on an ex-
penditure of over $1.5 trillion. 

The other aspect that was so inter-
esting in watching this administration 
is they have come out with a state-
ment about regulations. 

The small businesspeople I talked to 
in Worland last weekend at the health 
fair told me that increased government 
regulations add to the cost of doing 
business and make it harder for them 
to hire more people. Specifically, it is 
related to increased costs. 

It was interesting to see the adminis-
tration saying that an increase in labor 
demand due to regulations may have a 
stimulative effect that results in a net 
increase in overall employment. The 
administration apparently believes if 
we increase the rules and regulations 
on businesses, it will make it better for 
them, when they will tell us univer-
sally that it will make it worse. 

Additionally, last Friday night the 
Department of Health and Human 
Services released their new next round 
of ObamaCare waivers. We have talked 
about those in the past on this floor as 
part of a doctor’s second opinion. If 
this health care law is so good, why do 
millions and millions of Americans 
say: We can’t live under this, and the 
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