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to their families and loved ones. He is a highly 
decorated veteran. His awards include the 
World War II Victory Ribbon, Army Good Con-
duct Medal, EAME Theater Ribbon and Two 
Bronze Service Stars, Purple Heart, One 
Bronze Oak Leaf Cluster, and a Distinguished 
Unit Badge. He was also nominated for the 
Distinguished Service Cross, the second high-
est military honor that can be awarded to a 
member of the United States Army for ex-
treme gallantry and risk of life in actual com-
bat with an armed enemy force. 

Mr. Speaker, I am honored to have had the 
opportunity to recognize Mr. Meza’s accom-
plishments and faithful service to our country. 
His hard work and valor have truly impacted 
many lives and our community. Thank you. 
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APPLAUDING THE FORTUNE 
SOCIETY 
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OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, February 1, 2012 

Mr. RANGEL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize the Fortune Society on their contin-
ued success. I recently had the honor to sup-
port the Fortune Society’s partnership with 
City University of New York’s John Jay Col-
lege of Criminal Justice in their effort to pro-
vide technical assistance and training to other 
reentry services organizations. Thanks to their 
hard work, countless more inmates will transi-
tion back into my community with the prospect 
of a better life. 

Under the excellent leadership and vision of 
Chairperson Ms. Betty P. Rauch, the Fortune 
Society is doing far more than providing those 
who have dealt with the harsh realities of in-
carceration. Their advocacy inspires them and 
gives them the means to live a positive life in 
which they can become valuable and contrib-
uting members of our society. Furthermore, I 
would also like to congratulate the Fortune So-
ciety on the numerous grants they were re-
cently awarded. 

For over 40 years the fortune society has 
been working with people with criminal 
records. Today they serve approximately 
3,000 men and women annually at three pri-
mary New York City-area locations including 
West Harlem in my Manhattan Congressional 
District. Thanks to their dedicated and experi-
enced staff of professionals, the Fortune Soci-
ety is able to successfully offer: Alternatives to 
Incarceration (ATI), drop-in services, employ-
ment services, education, family services, 
health services, housing services, substance 
abuse treatment, transitional services such as 
the Rikers Island Discharge Enhancement 
(R.I.D.E.) program, recreation, and lifetime 
aftercare. 

I look forward to seeing all that the Fortune 
Society accomplishes in the coming year. I will 
continue to serve them proudly and support 
them in their great cause. 

OUR UNCONSCIONABLE NATIONAL 
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Mr. COFFMAN of Colorado. Mr. Speaker, 
on January 26, 1995, when the last attempt at 
a balanced budget amendment passed the 
House by a bipartisan vote of 300–132, the 
national debt was $4,801,405,175,294.28. 

Today, it is $15,356,140,493,616.06. We’ve 
added $10,554,735,318,321.78 to our debt in 
16 years. This is $10 trillion in debt our nation, 
our economy, and our children could have 
avoided with a balanced budget amendment. 
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Mr. HANNA. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to ac-
knowledge and honor a very special veteran 
for his service to our nation during World War 
II. 

Mr. John S. Czyscon was a member of the 
United States Army and served in the Pacific 
Theater. Mr. Czyscon was in harm’s way nu-
merous times and involved in serious combat. 
His heroism and bravery were recognized 
through his awards: the Bronze Star Medal, 
Combat Infantryman Badge, and the Asiatic- 
Pacific Campaign Medal with three bronze 
battle stars and arrowhead attachments. 

Mr. Czyscon served as a Technician Fifth 
Grade, with the Second Battalion 188th Glider 
Infantry during his service to the Army. He 
joined the Army in 1943 and was honorably 
discharged in 1946 after providing honest and 
faithful service to this country. 

Mr. Czyscon will turn 92 this spring and he 
lives in New York Mills, New York. It is a privi-
lege and an honor to have veterans like Mr. 
Czyscon residing in the 24th Congressional 
District. His service to our country should al-
ways be a great source of pride. To serve 
one’s nation is among the most noble and 
selfless acts available to man, particularly dur-
ing times of war. Thank you, Mr. Czyscon. I 
ask my colleagues to join me today in hon-
oring Technician Fifth Grade John S. Czyscon, 
United States Army, for his service and sac-
rifice during World War II on behalf of the 
United States of America. 
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Ms. SCHAKOWSKY. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to remember a lifelong educator and po-
litical activist. Chris Turney passed away in 
December at the age of 60. Chris dedicated 
her life to the education of children. Chris was 
a music teacher for 34 years, and spent the 

last 20 years of her career teaching at Lincoln 
Junior High School in Skokie, Illinois. Ms. Tur-
ney, as she was known by her students, 
shared her passion and love for music with 
many students over the years. She played a 
variety of musical instruments including the 
piano, flute, piccolo and guitar. She frequently 
used these instruments in her classroom. Most 
importantly, Ms. Turney inspired hundreds of 
children to follow their dreams. Ms. Turney en-
couraged all her students to believe in them-
selves and their own unique skills and abilities 
as they moved through life. 

Outside of the classroom, Chris was a polit-
ical activist fighting for a better education sys-
tem. Chris was a lifelong Democrat and very 
active in the National Education Association 
(NEA). She was president of the Skokie-Mor-
ton Grove Education Association, was the Re-
gion 36 Chair of the Illinois Education Associa-
tion, and eventually became an NEA State Di-
rector. As a State Director, Chris was fre-
quently on Capitol Hill meeting with members 
of Congress. Some of Chris’s favorite mo-
ments in her life were shaking hands with 
President Clinton and then Senator Barack 
Obama. After retiring from her teaching ca-
reer, Chris continued to be politically active. 
She served as the President of the DuPage 
Chapter of the Illinois Retired Teachers Asso-
ciation, a position she held until her death. 
She was an advocate for public education and 
for better schools for our children. 

Chris will be missed dearly by her former 
students, colleagues, friends and family. She 
is survived by her life partner of 30 years, 
James C. Keating, her sisters Judy Goldsmith 
and Linda Turney, and three nephews. She 
encouraged all three of her nephews to follow 
their dreams which they have done. Her oldest 
nephew Rob Goldsmith is currently an edu-
cation and labor staffer for Congressman 
BRUCE BRALEY. Jeff Goldsmith is a very suc-
cessful musician who has written and re-
corded numerous songs and albums. Mark 
Goldsmith, the youngest nephew, is currently 
an engineering student and baseball player at 
the Colorado School of Mines. Her memory 
and influence lives on through them. 

Chris’s memory will live on through the peo-
ple whom she inspired for years to come. She 
was an agent of change to many. If you knew 
Chris well, she changed your life. Her uplifting, 
energetic, and positive attitude will be missed 
and she will not be forgotten. 
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HON. LAMAR SMITH 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, February 1, 2012 

Mr. SMITH of Texas. Mr. Speaker, billion-
aire Warren Buffett’s longtime secretary has 
become a symbol in the current Administra-
tion’s fight over the tax code and economic 
fairness. While she was the President’s chief 
stage prop in a show of the alleged unfairness 
of our tax system, this is hardly the truth. 

The national media have painted this as a 
case of the little person paying a higher tax 
rate than her billionaire boss. Thankfully, 
Forbes and a few media outlets have re-
searched the facts. By reviewing the Internal 
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