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HONORING UNITED MANAGEMENT 

& DEVELOPMENT ASSOCIATES, 
INC. 

HON. BENNIE G. THOMPSON 
OF MISSISSIPPI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2012 

Mr. THOMPSON of Mississippi. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise to recognize a remarkable small fam-
ily owned business, United Management & 
Development Associates, Inc. It is a real es-
tate development and property management 
firm. The company’s portfolio consists of prop-
erties that are financed by the United States 
Department of Agriculture—Rural Develop-
ment, Housing and Urban Development, and 
properties that receive low income housing tax 
credits. They provide their residential clients 
with a multitude of services like budget coun-
seling, GED preparation through a partnership 
with Coahoma Community College, life skills, 
health and wellness activities, and home own-
ership preparation. 

Jeffrey Gooden is the president. He was 
educated in the Clarksdale Public School Sys-
tem. He received a Bachelors of Business Ad-
ministration Degree majoring in Banking and 
Finance and Managerial Finance from the Uni-
versity of Mississippi in 1992. He is a licensed 
real estate broker in Mississippi, Tennessee, 
and Arkansas. He holds several real estate 
designations including the following: Certified 
Manager, Certified Property Manager, Certified 
Commercial Investment Member, National As-
sociation of Realtors, National Association of 
Realtors Green Resource Council, and Grad-
uate of Realtor’s Institute. 

Jeffrey is a second generation real estate 
professional. His father, the late Bennie Stone 
Gooden, was a developer and manager of af-
fordable housing properties, who started 
United Management & Development in the 
1980’s. His father’s vision was to improve the 
quality of life in the Mississippi Delta. After his 
father’s death, Jeffrey and his family continues 
the Gooden family’s legacy. 

Jeffrey works with his sister, Marian Gooden 
Miller, and his brother, James Norvell Gooden. 
The three of them have expanded the com-
pany’s services and vision. Norvell is both a li-
censed real estate and insurance agent in 
Mississippi, Tennessee and Arkansas. Marian 
is a licensed real estate agent. United Man-
agement & Development Associates, Inc. pro-
vide full real estate brokerage services and in-
surance products. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask my colleagues to join me 
in recognizing United Management & Develop-
ment Associates, Inc. for providing decent and 
affordable housings for the Mississippi Delta. 
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TRIBUTE TO DR. WELTON I. 
TAYLOR 

HON. BOBBY L. RUSH 
OF ILLINOIS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2012 

Mr. RUSH. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to pay 
tribute to Welton I. Taylor, Ph.D. A distin-
guished scientist, WWII liaison pilot, and civil 
rights advocate, Dr. Taylor died in Chicago on 
November 1, 2012, just 11 days shy of his 
93rd birthday. Born November 12, 1919, in 

Birmingham, Alabama, to Frederick Enslen 
Taylor and Cora Lee Brewer, Taylor was still 
an infant when his family fled to Chicago as a 
result of an ultimatum his mother received 
from the Ku Klux Klan. Throughout Dr. Tay-
lor’s life, the story of his family’s trauma fueled 
his desire to succeed in every endeavor and 
to fight racism wherever he found it. 

Graduating from DuSable High School as 
class Valedictorian in 1937, Dr. Taylor at-
tended the University of Illinois at Urbana- 
Champaign thanks to scholarships from the 
Kappa Alpha Psi fraternity. In his senior year 
he became the first black cadet in the Univer-
sity of Illinois’ Advanced ROTC Field Artillery 
Unit. He graduated in 1941 with an A.B. in 
Bacteriology and a commission as a Second 
Lieutenant in the Field Artillery. Only 28 days 
after following orders to report for active duty 
at Fort Sill, Oklahoma, Taylor became the first 
black field artillery officer in the history of the 
post. 

Taylor had always dreamt of becoming a 
pilot, however, and when a flight instructor at 
the Lawton, Oklahoma airfield offered to teach 
him, he jumped at the chance. Taylor took les-
sons during his off-duty hours and was re-
warded when the Army subsequently sent him 
to the Second Army Air Force’s Pittsburg, 
Kansas flight school to become a Field Artil-
lery liaison pilot. Taylor was eventually de-
ployed to the South Pacific with the all-black 
596th Field Artillery Battalion, 93rd Infantry Di-
vision and flew liaison and reconnaissance 
missions in the South Pacific until the end of 
World War II. 

During his 51⁄2 years of service, Taylor bold-
ly challenged institutional racism in the Army 
at every turn—most notably protesting the 
Army’s discriminatory practices regarding the 
admission of black officers to the officers’ 
clubs. Taylor suffered numerous racial affronts 
during active duty, but still joined the Illinois 
National Guard Reserves at the end of the 
war, rising to the rank of Major before resign-
ing his commission in 1952. 

Upon his return stateside, Taylor married his 
longtime girlfriend, Jayne Kemp Taylor, a 
graduate of Howard University. The couple en-
tered the University of Illinois at Urbana- 
Champaign shortly thereafter to pursue their 
graduate degrees where Taylor earned his 
M.S. and Ph.D. in Bacteriology on the G.I. Bill. 
While on campus, the couple teamed with 
white veterans and their wives to force the in-
tegration of local restaurants, movie theaters, 
and swimming pools. Champaign-Urbana was 
changed forever by their efforts, and when the 
Taylors returned to Chicago after graduation, 
they continued their civil rights activism. They 
became one of the first black families to inte-
grate the Chatham neighborhood on Chicago’s 
South Side and Dr. Taylor played an active 
role in civic life. He served as President of the 
Chatham Avalon Park Community Council, 
founded the Episcopal Society for Cultural and 
Racial Unity, and received the Brotherhood 
Award of the National Conference of Chris-
tians and Jews. 

As a scientist, Dr. Taylor had a remarkable 
career spanning close to fifty years. He taught 
microbiology at the medical schools of both 
the University of Illinois and Northwestern Uni-
versity, did ground-breaking research on bac-
teriological contamination in the nation’s food 
supply, helped France and Britain eradicate 
Salmonella in their imported foods, became 
microbiologist-in-chief at Chicago’s Children’s 

Memorial Hospital, and served as consulting 
microbiologist to Resurrection Hospital and 
eleven other hospitals in the Chicago area. He 
earned four patents, published forty articles in 
scientific journals (becoming the first black edi-
tor of several of them), and developed a prod-
uct adopted by the Food & Drug Administra-
tion, which is still used today by microbiology 
laboratories the world over to certify foods Sal-
monella-free. In 1985, the Centers for Disease 
Control in Atlanta named a bacterium 
Enterobacter taylorae in honor of Dr. Taylor 
and a British colleague. 

Following the death of his wife, Jayne, in 
2005, Dr. Taylor joined the Chicago ‘‘DODO’’ 
Chapter of the Tuskegee Airmen, Inc. to once 
again pursue his lifelong passion: flying. Al-
ways one of the organization’s most vocal and 
articulate supporters, Taylor helped fellow pi-
lots introduce inner-city children to the joys 
and challenges of flight. He lectured exten-
sively to corporate, civic, and academic 
groups across the Midwest and spoke pas-
sionately about the triumphs and frustrations 
faced by the Tuskegee Airmen and other 
black servicemen during World War II. Taylor 
received the Congressional Gold Medal with 
the Tuskegee Airmen in Washington, DC in 
2006. 

Fully committed to educating succeeding 
generations, Dr. Taylor published his long- 
awaited memoir and history, Two Steps from 
Glory, in July of 2012. He proudly unveiled it 
at the huge air show in Oshkosh, Wisconsin 
(EAA Airventure), just days before being diag-
nosed with the cancer that took his life. 

Dr. Taylor is survived by his daughters, 
Karyn and Shelley, by his nephew, Herbert 
Wallace, and his niece, Frances Austin. 

On behalf of my wife Carolyn and the con-
stituents of Illinois’ First Congressional District, 
I extend my condolences to Dr. Taylor’s family 
and I want for them to know that they are in 
our thoughts and prayers. 
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HONORING DENNIS BERMAN 

HON. HEATH SHULER 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, November 15, 2012 

Mr. SHULER. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor several of the volunteers who have 
served in my district office over the past six 
years while I have been in office. A Member 
of Congress’ most important responsibility is to 
provide excellent constituent services and 
these volunteers have assisted my staff in pro-
viding the exceptional assistance so many 
have come to expect in our District. I take 
great pride in the work that each one has 
done on my behalf and on behalf of everyone 
in the 11th Congressional District of North 
Carolina. 

These volunteers have always treated our 
constituents with the utmost respect and al-
ways made sure their needs were met in a 
timely fashion. I owe a debt of gratitude to 
each one of them for the support and friend-
ship which they have shown me while I have 
served in Congress. 

Dennis Berman played a valuable role as a 
volunteer during my first two terms in office. 
Dennis offered a calm and reassuring voice to 
constituents as they would call our District of-
fice with concerns and needs. His ability to 
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