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who run Washington to work with us to 
cut spending in a responsible way. 

Republicans keep fighting for smart-
er spending cuts and, most of all, for an 
economy in which young people are af-
forded the opportunities they deserve. 

f 

SEQUESTRATION CUTS ARE 
TAKING EFFECT 

(Mr. KILDEE asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. KILDEE. Mr. Speaker, it’s now 
March 5, and sequestration cuts are 
starting to take effect. Instead of 
working together to find a compromise 
that would avoid these automatic 
spending cuts, House Republicans stood 
by and watched the March 1 deadline 
come and go. 

Now, $85 billion in deep, indiscrimi-
nate cuts that will eliminate 31,000 
Michigan jobs are upon us. These cuts 
will harm Michigan families and slash 
programs that my constituents rely on 
every day. And many of the most dire 
consequences of the sequester won’t be 
felt immediately. The truth is, due to 
Republican inaction, the wheels are 
now in motion, and we are on a course 
that has real negative impacts on mil-
lions of Americans. 

Congress should be working to find a 
bipartisan solution to avoid these in-
discriminate cuts. Democrats put forth 
a plan to stop the sequester. I know, I 
cosponsored it. House Republicans 
would not even let it come to the floor 
for a vote. 

Mr. Speaker, we need to work on an 
approach that will fix sequestration 
while reducing the deficit responsibly. 
I stand ready to act. So do my Demo-
cratic colleagues. Let’s get to work. 

f 
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CHEN GUANGCHENG 

(Mr. PITTS asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. PITTS. Mr. Speaker, today, Cap-
itol Hill is hosting a great Chinese de-
fender of human rights, blind lawyer 
Chen Guangcheng. A few moments ago, 
I had the honor of again meeting with 
Chen as he continues to advocate for 
the freedom of the Chinese people. His 
amazing story of escape from house ar-
rest is a great encouragement for all in 
China suffering under political persecu-
tion. The authorities could not silence 
him as he sought justice for victims of 
forced abortions and environmental 
abuse. 

The story of China’s rise is not about 
the success of an autocratic govern-
ment. It is instead the story of a people 
whose ingenuity and vigor have finally 
been unleashed after decades of repres-
sion. China has developed not because 
of smart planning, but because the peo-
ple have used a relatively small 
amount of economic freedom to trans-
form their nation. Given more freedom, 

I believe there’s no limit to how China 
will grow and how her people will im-
pact the world. We must support Chen 
and other human rights defenders as 
they seek justice for their people. 

f 

GUN VIOLENCE 

(Mr. RICHMOND asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. RICHMOND. Mr. Speaker, as a 
resident of Louisiana, the sportsman’s 
paradise, I’m a strong supporter of the 
Second Amendment. However, I do not 
subscribe to the belief that Congress 
has no role in responding to the gun vi-
olence epidemic plaguing communities 
like New Orleans, Chicago, and Detroit. 

According to the FBI, 1,464 people 
were killed by a firearm in New Orle-
ans between 2008 and 2011. That’s 1,464 
families who will never see their loved 
ones again. We can’t afford to do noth-
ing. We can no longer be the do-noth-
ing Congress. We have a moral obliga-
tion to reduce the broad epidemic of 
gun violence in this country. 

So I urge my colleagues in Congress 
to join with me in standing with the 
victims and families of gun violence to 
approve legislation that invests in our 
mental health system, institute more 
rigorous background checks, and place 
a ban on assault rifles and high-capac-
ity magazines. Even incremental 
progress means fewer heart-broken 
families. I don’t want to see another 
child fall victim to our selfish efforts 
to preserve what obviously needs to 
change. I would remind my colleagues 
that the life we save may be our own. 

f 

SPENDING PROBLEM IN THIS 
COUNTRY 

(Mr. HARRIS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. HARRIS. Mr. Speaker, in Janu-
ary, the President asked hardworking 
taxpayers to contribute 2 percent more 
of their hard-earned paychecks to the 
Federal Government in the form of a 
payroll tax increase. They had to cut 
their household budgets by 2 percent. 
The President’s sequester that went 
into effect last Friday called for a less- 
than-2-percent decrease in government 
spending, but the President now thinks 
that 2 percent is too much to cut from 
each Federal dollar. We all know the 
President’s sequester is probably not 
the right way to control spending be-
cause it cuts programs across the board 
without any prioritization. But we all 
know this country has a spending prob-
lem, and we need to get it under con-
trol. 

I can’t help but think if the Amer-
ican people had to just cut 2 percent 
from their budgets, why can’t the Fed-
eral Government? If hardworking tax-
payers had to figure out how to man-
age with 2 percent less, can’t the Fed-
eral Government figure out how to 

spend two less pennies out of every 
Federal dollar? 

f 

SEQUESTRATION IN NEW 
HAMPSHIRE 

(Ms. KUSTER asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. KUSTER. Mr. Speaker, because 
the Congress refuses to compromise, 
across-the-board spending cuts known 
as the sequester—and uncertainty 
around the Federal economy and the 
budget—are casting a cloud over our 
entire economy. In New Hampshire, we 
are already seeing the impacts of these 
cuts. 

Right now, there’s a Federal prison 
in Berlin, New Hampshire, with over 
100 open jobs, but funding fights in 
Washington are preventing Granite 
Staters from filling them. 

There’s a Salem company, Micro-Pre-
cision Technologies, that wants to hire 
more workers; but sequestration is cre-
ating uncertainty and standing in the 
way. 

There are technicians in New Hamp-
shire’s National Guard who want to do 
their jobs, but deep cuts to defense 
means they’re facing the possibility of 
furloughs. 

These are all examples of businesses 
that will have to delay hiring and peo-
ple who will lose their jobs simply be-
cause Democrats and Republicans will 
not compromise. This is not what re-
sponsible governing looks like. We owe 
it to New Hampshire families to work 
across the aisle, responsibly reduce the 
deficit, and stop these mindless cuts. 

f 

CRYING WOLF 

(Ms. NORTON asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. NORTON. Mr. Speaker, Repub-
licans cry that the President and 
Democrats are crying wolf about se-
quester cuts and furloughs. But, the 
wolf is already biting. In my hand is a 
furlough notice from the U.S. Attorney 
for the District of Columbia. In D.C., 
the U.S. Attorney still handles major 
local crimes for this big city as well as 
some of the most important Federal 
matters, including terrorism suspects. 

The U.S. Attorney’s notice says there 
will be up to 14 days—that’s 2 weeks— 
of furlough days for Assistant U.S. At-
torneys and other personnel. On fur-
lough days, the notice says, Assistant 
U.S. Attorneys and other staff are not 
permitted to even come to the office to 
volunteer. 

Mr. Speaker, the problem with mak-
ing sequester a budget rather than a 
prod, as intended, is not the 2 percent 
sequester cut. It’s the compression up-
front in a short period of time. The 
American people who depend on U.S. 
Attorneys deserve better than a delib-
erate and avoidable public safety fur-
lough. 

VerDate Mar 15 2010 07:19 Oct 03, 2013 Jkt 029060 PO 00000 Frm 00005 Fmt 7634 Sfmt 0634 E:\RECORD13\RECFILES\MAR2013\H05MR3.REC H05MR3bj
ne

al
 o

n 
D

S
K

5S
P

T
V

N
1P

R
O

D
 w

ith
 C

O
N

G
-R

E
C

-O
N

LI
N

E


		Superintendent of Documents
	2017-08-25T09:35:40-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




