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Prime Minister Yulia Tymoshenko unneces-
sarily detracts from Ukraine’s otherwise 
strong relationship with Europe, the United 
States, and the community of democracies. 

f 

SENATE RESOLUTION 166—COM-
MEMORATING THE 50TH ANNI-
VERSARY OF THE FOUNDING OF 
THE ORGANIZATION OF AFRICAN 
UNITY (OAU) AND COMMENDING 
ITS SUCCESSOR, THE AFRICAN 
UNION 

Mr. COONS (for himself and Mr. 
FLAKE) submitted the following resolu-
tion; which was referred to the Com-
mittee on Foreign Relations: 

S. RES. 166 

Whereas, on May 25, 1963, 32 newly inde-
pendent African countries signed the Charter 
of the Organization of African Unity (OAU) 
to promote unity, solidarity, and political 
and economic cooperation among them-
selves, and to defend member states’ sov-
ereignty, territorial integrity, and independ-
ence; 

Whereas upon its inception, the OAU em-
braced the principles of the Universal Dec-
laration of Human Rights, including freedom 
of association, free expression, and political 
participation; 

Whereas such efforts to encourage African 
unity, advance human rights, and promote 
economic development on the continent were 
undermined by regional conflicts, military 
coups, and civil wars, as well as large foreign 
debts, increasing trade imbalances, food in-
security, and weak institutions; 

Whereas a decision declaring the establish-
ment of the African Union (AU) as a suc-
cessor organization to the OAU to promote 
democratic principles and institutions, en-
courage economic growth, and develop new 
tools for the collective promotion of regional 
stability was adopted in Sirte, Libya, on 
March 1, 2001, and March 2, 2001; 

Whereas the vision of the African Union is 
that of ‘‘an integrated, prosperous and peace-
ful Africa, driven by its own citizens and rep-
resenting a dynamic force in the global 
arena’’; 

Whereas the African Union expresses com-
mitment to the essential values of trans-
parency and accountability and promotes 
democratic processes across the continent of 
Africa; 

Whereas the African Union departed from 
the OAU’s abiding doctrine of noninterven-
tion in the internal affairs of member states 
in favor of a new policy establishing the 
right of the AU to intervene in a member 
state under grave circumstances, including 
with respect to war crimes, genocide, and 
crimes against humanity; 

Whereas the African Union continues to 
build more robust African regional institu-
tions in order to address the myriad chal-
lenges facing the continent, and has estab-
lished an African peace and security archi-
tecture, the New Partnership for Africa’s De-
velopment, a strategic framework for re-
gional socioeconomic development, the Com-
prehensive Africa Agriculture Development 
Program, and the African Peer Review Mech-
anism, which seeks to help advance good 
governance, among other institutions; 

Whereas the African Union has contributed 
to regional peace and security by mobilizing 
peacekeeping or intervention forces to pro-
tect civilians or support political mediation 
missions and peace-building processes in Bu-
rundi, Comoros, Sudan, Somalia, and Mali; 

Whereas efforts to end conflicts on the con-
tinent of Africa, which continue to desta-
bilize states, undermine democracy, stifle 

economic growth and investment, and rob 
young Africans of the opportunity for an 
education and a better life, are a key United 
States objective; 

Whereas it is critical to the interests of 
the United States that the African Union be 
capable of effectively addressing current 
conflicts and preventing future ones, advanc-
ing economic growth and broad-based and 
sustainable economic development, and con-
solidating democracy and good governance; 

Whereas the United States Government 
demonstrated its strong commitment to 
working closely with the AU by establishing 
a Mission to the African Union in 2006; 

Whereas, on August 3, 2010, the United 
States and the African Union signed a 
$5,800,000 multi-year assistance agreement to 
achieve common policy objectives; 

Whereas, on June 14, 2012, President 
Barack Obama announced a United States 
Strategy Toward Sub-Saharan Africa, which 
calls on the United States to deepen its part-
nership with African countries and regional 
organizations by supporting efforts to ad-
vance accountable, democratic governance 
and adherence to human rights norms and 
the rule of law, particularly by supporting 
the African Union African Charter on De-
mocracy, Elections, and Governance and 
other multilateral standards; 

Whereas key goals also supported by the 
African Union include fostering peace and 
security, spurring economic growth, trade, 
and investment, and promoting opportunity 
and development; 

Whereas, on February 1, 2013, a Memo-
randum of Understanding was signed be-
tween the United States and the African 
Union to cement cooperation on peace and 
security, democracy and governance, eco-
nomic growth, trade, and investment, and 
promotion of opportunity and development; 

Whereas the African Union serves as a pre-
eminent dialogue and policy-making forum 
for leaders in Africa seeking to advance a 
wide range of regional political, security, so-
cial, and economic objectives, including sub- 
regional integration, and is a key interloc-
utor for and representative of the people of 
Africa in international political and policy 
forums, including the United Nations; and 

Whereas close relations between the 
United States and the African Union mutu-
ally benefit the people of the United States 
and Africa and the political, security, eco-
nomic, and cultural relations that link 
them: Now, therefore, be it 

Resolved, That the Senate— 
(1) extends warm congratulations to the 

former member states of the Organization of 
African Unity on the 50th year anniversary 
of its founding, in particular its original 32 
member states; 

(2) commends member states of the African 
Union for their strong and determined joint 
efforts to promote democratic societies, sus-
tainable development, and sound economic 
practices, and peace, security, and stability 
on the continent; 

(3) urges the President to continue to 
strongly support efforts to advance and 
strengthen United States-African Union co-
operation, including through United States 
programs to help build the capacities of the 
African Union; 

(4) encourages the President to expedite 
and expand United States efforts to achieve 
the goals and objectives of his United States 
Strategy Toward Sub-Saharan Africa; and 

(5) emphasizes the rule of law, good govern-
ance, respect for human rights, open mar-
kets, and broad-based and sustainable eco-
nomic growth and development as key pil-
lars for long-term stability and security in 
Africa and United States engagement with 
the continent. 

SENATE RESOLUTION 167—RE-
AFFIRMING THE STRONG SUP-
PORT OF THE UNITED STATES 
FOR THE PEACEFUL RESOLU-
TION OF TERRITORIAL, SOV-
EREIGNTY, AND JURISDICTIONAL 
DISPUTES IN THE ASIA-PACIFIC 
MARITIME DOMAINS 
Mr. MENENDEZ (for himself, Mr. 

RUBIO, and Mr. CARDIN) submitted the 
following resolution; which was re-
ferred to the Committee on Foreign 
Relations: 

S. RES. 167 

Whereas the maritime domain of the Asia- 
Pacific region includes critical sea lines of 
communication and commerce between the 
Pacific and Indian oceans; 

Whereas the United States has a national 
interest in freedom of navigation and over-
flight in the Asia-Pacific maritime domains, 
as provided for by universally recognized 
principles of international law; 

Whereas the United States has a national 
interest in the maintenance of peace and sta-
bility, open access by all to maritime do-
mains, respect for universally recognized 
principles of international law, prosperity 
and economic growth, and unimpeded lawful 
commerce; 

Whereas the United States has a clear in-
terest in encouraging and supporting the na-
tions of the region to work collaboratively 
and diplomatically to resolve disputes with-
out coercion, without intimidation, without 
threats, and without the use of force; 

Whereas the South China Sea contains 
great natural resources, and their steward-
ship and responsible use offers immense po-
tential benefit for generations to come; 

Whereas, in recent years, there have been 
numerous dangerous and destabilizing inci-
dents in this region, including Chinese ves-
sels cutting the seismic survey cables of a 
Vietnamese oil exploration ship in May 2011; 
Chinese vessels barricading the entrance to 
the Scarborough Reef lagoon in April 2012; 
China issuing an official map that newly de-
fines the contested ‘‘nine-dash line’’ as Chi-
na’s national border; and, since May 8, 2013, 
Chinese naval and marine surveillance ships 
maintaining a regular presence in waters 
around the Second Thomas Shoal, located 
approximately 105 nautical miles northwest 
of the Philippine island of Palawan; 

Whereas the Association of Southeast 
Asian Nations (ASEAN) has promoted multi-
lateral talks on disputed areas without set-
tling the issue of sovereignty, and in 2002 
joined with China in signing a Declaration 
on the Conduct of Parties in the South China 
Sea that committed all parties to those ter-
ritorial disputes to ‘‘reaffirm their respect 
for and commitment to the freedom of navi-
gation in and over flight above the South 
China Sea as provided for by the universally 
recognized principles of international law’’ 
and to ‘‘resolve their territorial and jurisdic-
tional disputes by peaceful means, without 
resorting to the threat or use of force’’; 

Whereas Japan and Taiwan reached an 
agreement on April 10, 2013, to jointly share 
and administer the fishing resources in their 
overlapping claimed exclusive economic 
zones in the East China Sea, an important 
breakthrough after 17 years of negotiations 
and a model for other such agreements; 

Whereas other incidences of the joint ad-
ministrations of resources in disputed waters 
in the South China Sea have de-escalated 
tensions and promoted economic develop-
ment, such as Malaysia and Brunei’s 2009 
agreement to partner on exploring offshore 
Brunei waters, with drilling in offshore oil 
and gas fields off Brunei beginning in 2011; 
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