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Our community is proud of this team earn-

ing the state’s highest collective achievement. 
Their success this season is a tribute to their 
high level of commitment, one that I am sure 
they will continue to display in all aspects of 
their lives. 

Go Eagles! 
f 

IN HONOR OF THE 2013 LITERACY 
COUNCIL OF NORTHERN VIR-
GINIA AWARD RECIPIENTS 

HON. GERALD E. CONNOLLY 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, June 27, 2013 

Mr. CONNOLLY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to congratulate the recipients of the 2013 Lit-
erary Council of Northern Virginia Community 
Partner Awards and Volunteer of the Year 
Awards. Founded in 1962, the Literary Council 
of Northern Virginia (LCNV) is a non-profit 
educational organization that recruits and 
trains volunteers to teach adults who need 
help reading, writing, speaking, and under-
standing the English language. 

The mission of LCNV is to empower adults 
by providing a wide range of programs that 
teach the basic literacy skills needed in order 
to become self-sufficient and full participants 
in society. These programs include Basic 
Adult Literacy Tutoring, which works with 
adults who speak and understand English but 
are beginning readers and writers, and ESOL 
tutoring programs that teach reading, writing, 
listening comprehension, and speaking to 
those in our community for whom English is 
not their native language. In addition, LCNV 
offers two classroom programs: The ESOL 
Learning Center program, which serves low-in-
come immigrant adults and teaches life skills 
important in the work place and community, 
and Family Learning Programs, which teach 
English proficiency to parents while their chil-
dren participate in separate literacy-related ac-
tivities. 

Over the course of the last 50 years, thou-
sands of people and families have been 
helped through LCNV programs. This would 
not have been possible without the dedication 
and commitment of the many volunteers and 
community partners. It is my great honor to 
recognize the following recipients of the 2013 
Literacy Council of Northern Virginia Awards: 

Recipients of the Community Partners 
Awards: Acumen Solutions, City of Alexandria, 
and the Meyer Foundation. 

Recipients of the Volunteer of the Year 
Awards: Susan Kral, Anne Spear, Audrey 
Lipps, and Mark Troppe. 

This year, LCNV learners were invited to 
submit writings around the theme for this 
year’s Annual Recognition Event: ‘‘New Begin-
nings.’’ Learners worked with tutors, teachers, 
and classmates to formulate ideas, construct 
drafts, edit, and polish their writing in order to 
create final products that were published in 
LCNV’s annual report. I commend each of the 
learners who submitted a writing and con-
gratulate them on the incredible progress that 
they have made. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask that my colleagues join 
me in recognizing the contributions of the Lit-
eracy Council of Northern Virginia and in con-
gratulating each of the 2013 Award Recipi-
ents. Their dedication, hard work, and commit-

ment improves the quality of life for the stu-
dents, as well as the community, by providing 
program participants with the life skills that are 
necessary to become active and productive 
members of society. 
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RECOGNIZING THE RECIPIENTS OF 
THE 2013 TOWN OF DUMFRIES 
VOLUNTEER AWARDS 

HON. GERALD E. CONNOLLY 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, June 27, 2013 

Mr. CONNOLLY. Mr. Speaker, I rise to rec-
ognize the recipients of the 2013 Town of 
Dumfries Volunteer Awards. 

The Town of Dumfries was chartered on 
May 11, 1749, by the Virginia General Assem-
bly, eventually becoming Virginia’s oldest con-
tinuously chartered town. The Town covers a 
land area of 1.6 square miles in eastern 
Prince William County, and it is located 31 
miles southwest of Washington, D.C. Dumfries 
served as a busy tobacco port for the Virginia 
Colony during the 17th and 18th centuries 
until the onset of the American Revolution. 
Today, more than 4,900 residents call the 
Town of Dumfries home. Several of these resi-
dents have volunteered their time and energy 
over the past year to help the town govern-
ment organize a wide variety of activities and 
events, and the work of these volunteers de-
serves recognition. 

It is my honor to submit the names of the 
2013 Town of Dumfries Volunteer Awards 
honorees: 

Volunteer of the Year Award: Sonia Hoehn. 
Spirit of Community Service Award: Melonie 

Bennett. 
Partner in Community Service Award: Pillar 

Church. 
Community Hero Award: Dumfries-Triangle 

Rescue Squad. 
Friend to the Community Award: Quantico 

Marine Corps Band. 
UnSung Hero Award: William O’Kelly Rus-

sell. 
Further, it is my honor to submit the names 

of the volunteers for the Town of Dumfries: 
Joann Baron, Richard Bell, Jill Borak, Ericka 

Bridges, Nigel A. Clay, Lakesha Clements, 
Danny Cosner, Gina Critchley, Matt Critchley, 
Derek Ester, Carmella Foreman, Michael 
Futrell, Ana Garcia, Colby Garman of Pillar 
Church, Gunnery Sergeant Kevin A. Glave of 
the Quantico Marine Corps Band, Dr. Amy 
Goodwine, Becky Guy, Bill Hoehn, Teriyaki 
Jefferson, Jen Jones, Persephone Jones of 
Brownie Troop 5894, Uriah Kiser, Marc 
Lamelin, Sandra Lamelin, Carrie M. Lee, Mer-
edith Lopez, Lisa Manion, Michael McDonald, 
Tishami Clay McDonald, Ed McGlothlin, Mike, 
Selonia Miles, Lisa Miller of Cub Scout Pack 
176, Shawn Miller of Cub Scout Pack 176, 
Amir Nehemiah Neville-Majeed, William 
Noaker, Mr. Pack, Nicole Pack, Kristina 
Padberg, Mary Padberg, Thomasina Perkins- 
Washington, Paul Peterson, Bruce Potter, Po-
tomac Senior High School NJROTC, Bob 
Price, Chase Rivers of DMV Dynasty, Pequitte 
Schwerin, Mike Sheperd, Pete Singh, Sue 
Stalder, Kayla Straub, Terry Swirchak, Liletta 
Thompson, Eileen Thrall, Danya Tolpolcai, 
John Tolpolcai, Penny Toney, Sharon Turner, 
Glenn Vickers, James Vincent, Gary West, 

Kenya Whitener, Raymond Williams Sr., Ron-
ald Wilson. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask that my colleagues join 
me in thanking the volunteers for the Town of 
Dumfries and in congratulating our award re-
cipients. These volunteers appreciate the 
value of community action and work tirelessly 
to support the long-standing civic mission of 
the Town of Dumfries. 
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RECOGNIZING THE EDEN PRAIRIE 
BOYS GOLF TEAM ON STATE 
TITLE 

HON. ERIK PAULSEN 
OF MINNESOTA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, June 27, 2013 

Mr. PAULSEN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize and congratulate the Eden Prairie 
Boys golf team for winning the 2013 Boys 
Minnesota State High School Golf Champion-
ship. Their efforts were nothing short of excel-
lent and their victory was earned through hard 
work and commitment. 

The boys team worked hard to improve their 
skills throughout the season. The winning 10- 
foot putt was sunk by junior Zach Peters, al-
lowing the Eagles to win over the defending 
state champion by a single point, truly marking 
the Eden Prairie team as worthy champions. 
Together, this team has exemplified persever-
ance and dedication. 

I would also like to commend the coaches 
for leading this Eagles squad to the state title. 
This is the first time the Eagles have secured 
the state title since their initial championship in 
1999, and Head Coach Ty Armstrong has 
promised the team that they can throw him 
into a pond to celebrate. 

It is a noteworthy achievement to win a 
state championship title, and the team mem-
bers and coaches of the Eden Prairie boy’s 
golf team should be proud. They set a great 
example to fellow students and athletes. Con-
gratulations to these student athletes, their 
parents, and the coaches. Go Eagles! 

f 

SUPPORT EUROPE/EURASIA EN-
ERGY SECURITY AND HELP 
STRENGTHEN OUR STRATEGIC 
ALLIANCES—THE SOUTHERN GAS 
CORRIDOR RESOLUTION 

HON. MICHAEL R. TURNER 
OF OHIO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, June 27, 2013 

Mr. TURNER. Mr. Speaker, as Chairman of 
the U.S. Delegation to the North Atlantic Trea-
ty Organization Parliamentary Assembly, I am 
introducing a bipartisan resolution expressing 
the sense of the House of Representatives 
that it is in our national interest to support and 
enhance Europe’s energy security through 
opening of the Southern Gas Corridor. 

Many of our allies in Europe are heavily de-
pendent on natural gas supplies from one 
country or from unstable regions. For exam-
ple, several European countries have experi-
enced natural gas supply disruptions from 
Russia, the largest supplier of natural gas to 
Europe, over various disputes. In addition, 
Turkey relies on Iran for 20 percent of its nat-
ural gas imports. And earlier this year, Islamist 
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militants attacked a natural gas facility in Alge-
ria, which is the third largest exporter of nat-
ural gas to Europe. 

The Caspian Sea region holds significant 
energy resources and proven natural gas re-
serves. In particular, the Shah Deniz field in 
Azerbaijan is one of the world’s largest gas 
fields, with over 30 trillion cubic feet of recov-
erable gas. The Southern Gas Corridor will 
help our European allies diversify their energy 
resources by providing an alternative and reli-
able source of natural gas. This will bolster 
their energy security and help improve geo-
political stability in the region. Specifically, the 
pipeline will route natural gas from Azerbaijan 
through Georgia and Turkey to Europe. 

Current and past administrations have ex-
pressed support for the Southern Gas Cor-
ridor. At the U.S.-Azerbaijan Convention in 
late May 2013, U.S. Ambassador to Azer-
baijan Richard Morningstar stated: 

‘‘. . . Azerbaijan’s importance to European 
energy security will remain strong, helping 
to guarantee that our European partners are 
not overly reliant on any suppliers. Azer-
baijan is now in the final stages of estab-
lishing a southern corridor for natural gas. 

‘‘. . . our overriding interest is that Azer-
baijani gas reaches vulnerable markets in 
Europe . . . ’’ 

Additionally, a December 2012 report by 
Senator Richard Lugar’s Foreign Relations 
Committee staff entitled ‘‘Energy and Security 
from the Caspian to Europe’’ states: 

‘‘. . . the Southern Corridor would advance 
several U.S. and NATO foreign policy objec-
tives: it would further isolate Iran, assist in 
cultivating partners in the Caucasus and 
Central Asia and bolster their sovereign 
independence, and perhaps most impor-
tantly, curtail Russia’s energy leverage over 
European NATO allies.’’ 

Mr. Speaker, the Southern Gas Corridor will 
contribute to regional energy security for our 
allies in Europe and Eurasia, and help to 
strenghten our strategic partnership. 

I urge all my colleagues to support this im-
portant resolution. 
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RECOGNIZING CAPTAIN JOHN 
MCLAIN FOR HIS SERVICE WITH 
THE UNITED STATES NAVY 

HON. GERALD E. CONNOLLY 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, June 27, 2013 

Mr. CONNOLLY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to thank and commend Captain John McLain 
of Woodbridge, Virginia, on the occasion of his 
retirement after 25 years of honorable service 
with the United States Navy. 

Captain McLain graduated from Florida 
State University with a Bachelors Degree in 
International Relations and English in 1987. 
He attended Aviation Officer Candidate School 
and was commissioned an Ensign in March 
1988. 

Designated a Naval Aviator in June 1989, 
Captain McLain was assigned to the Heli-
copter Anti-Submarine Squadron (Light) Forty- 
Three (HSL–43), where he deployed twice to 
the Persian Gulf, participating in Operation 
Desert Shield with the USS Chancellorsville 
(CG 63) and as Detachment Maintenance Offi-
cer with the USS Paul F. Foster (DD 964). 

In April 1993, Captain McLain was assigned 
to Air Test and Evaluation Squadron One 
(VX–1) in Patuxent River, Maryland, where he 
served as Operational Test Director for all 
SH–60B programs. 

In April 1996, he reported to USS Boxer 
(LHD 4), in San Diego, as the Assistant Air 
Officer, deploying again to the Arabian Gulf 
and Red Sea with the 15th MEU (SOC). 

Following refresher training in the SH–60B, 
Captain McLain reported to the ‘‘Easy Riders’’ 
of HSL–37 in NAS Barber’s Point, Hawaii. He 
served as Officer in Charge of the LAMPS de-
tachment aboard the USS Port Royal (CG 72) 
with the USS John C. Stennis Battle Group 
and as the squadron Maintenance Officer. 

Captain McLain reported to the Naval War 
College in Newport, Rhode Island, where he 
graduated with honors from the College of 
Naval Command and Staff with a Master’s de-
gree in National Security Affairs. Following 
graduation, he was selected as an Associate 
Fellow with the Chief of Naval Operations’ 
Strategic Studies Group (CNO SSG) during 
SSG XXII. 

After SSG, Captain McLain was assigned to 
the Joint Staff in Washington, D.C. where he 
worked in the Directorate for Intelligence, Dep-
uty Directorate for Intelligence Capabilities and 
Requirements (J2P). 

He was selected for command in August 
2005 and reported to NAS Whiting Field, Flor-
ida, where he served as Executive Officer of 
Helicopter Training Squadron Eighteen (HT– 
18) and as the first Commanding Officer of 
Helicopter Training Squadron Twenty-Eight 
(HT–28). 

Captain McLain reported to the Center for 
Naval Analyses (CNA) as a Federal Executive 
Fellow in August 2008. After completing his 
fellowship, he reported to the Strategy Branch, 
Strategy and Policy Division, Office of the 
Deputy Chief of Naval Operations for Oper-
ations, Plans and Strategy (OPNAV N513) 
where he completed his 25 years of service in 
the United States Navy. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask that my colleagues rise 
to join me in recognizing and thanking John 
McLain for his committed and selfless service 
to his colleagues and our country. We are for-
tunate to have among us veterans with Cap-
tain McLain’s sense of duty and continued 
commitment to our national security. We wish 
Captain McLain, his wife, June, and their two 
sons, Jack and Finn, well during this next 
chapter of their lives. 
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IN RECOGNITION OF A LANDMARK 
COURT RULING RECOGNIZING 
CONGRESSIONAL AUTHORITY TO 
GRANT CITIZENSHIP TO PER-
SONS BORN IN U.S. TERRITORIES 

HON. ENI F.H. FALEOMAVAEGA 
OF AMERICAN SAMOA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, June 27, 2013 

Mr. FALEOMAVAEGA. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
in recognition of a landmark decision handed 
down yesterday by the District Court for the 
District of Columbia in Tuaua v. United States. 
The decision reaffirms the plenary authority of 
Congress to grant citizenship to people born in 
the U.S. territories. The plaintiffs in the lawsuit 
are five non-citizen U.S. nationals born in 

American Samoa and the Samoan Federation 
of America, a nonprofit organization serving 
the Samoan community in Los Angeles. The 
defendants are the United States, the State 
Department, the Secretary of State, and the 
Assistant Secretary of State for Consular Af-
fairs. The plaintiffs brought the lawsuit seeking 
a declaratory judgment that would assert that 
the Fourteenth Amendment’s Citizenship 
Clause extends to American Samoa. I sub-
mitted an amicus curiae brief in support of the 
defendants. The Court granted the defendants’ 
motion to dismiss on June 26, 2013 after find-
ing that the plaintiffs failed to state a claim. 

Mr. Speaker, the plaintiffs in the Citizenship 
lawsuit sought to reverse years of legal prece-
dent and usurp Congressional authority to be-
stow citizenship to people living in the U.S. 
territories. The Court correctly found the plain-
tiffs’ arguments unpersuasive and held, ‘‘To 
date, Congress has not seen fit to bestow 
birthright citizenship upon American Samoa, 
and in accordance with the law, this Court 
must and will respect that choice.’’ When the 
people of American Samoa vote in favor of 
citizenship, I will work with Congress to ensure 
that the people of American Samoa become 
U.S. citizens. However, the people of Amer-
ican Samoa have yet to vote on whether they 
want to become U.S. citizens. 

Mr. Speaker, in the early 20th century the 
Supreme Court in a series of cases known as 
the Insular Cases, firmly established the ex-
tent to which the Constitution applies to the 
territories. In these cases the Court defined 
‘‘incorporated’’ territories as territories that are 
expressly made part of the United States by 
an act of Congress and ‘‘unincorporated terri-
tories’’ as territories that had not yet become 
part of the United States and were not on a 
path toward statehood. The Insular Cases es-
tablished that only ‘‘fundamental’’ constitu-
tional rights are extended to persons born in 
unincorporated territories. 

The plaintiffs argued that citizenship is a 
‘‘fundamental’’ right that applied to unincor-
porated territories. Recent federal court cases 
have not supported this argument. Similarly, 
Judge Richard Leon in his opinion in Tuaua v. 
U.S. correctly reasoned that the Insular Cases 
suggested that citizenship was not a ‘‘funda-
mental right’’ that applied to unincorporated 
territories. Judge Leon found the plaintiffs’ evi-
dence too speculative in the face of contrary 
overwhelming legal precedent and constitu-
tional authority. The plaintiffs were unable to 
provide a single federal court case that has 
recognized birthright citizenship as a guar-
antee in unincorporated territories. 

Mr. Speaker, I would like to thank Michael 
Williams, Thea Cohen and Michael Fragoso 
and their law firm of Kirkland & Ellis, LLP for 
their generous support in working collabo-
ratively with my office in support of the people 
of American Samoa. 

In conclusion Mr. Speaker, I thank the Court 
for its well reasoned opinion in Tuaua v. U.S. 
and for reaffirming the authority of Congress 
to grant citizenship to the people of American 
Samoa. This decision will allow the people of 
American Samoa to decide whether they want 
to become citizens. Once the people make a 
decision I can work with my colleagues in 
Congress to grant citizenship to the people of 
American Samoa. 
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