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stood as the beacon for the importance of pro-
tecting the ability to freely exercise religious 
beliefs without fear of intimidation, reprisal, or 
harm. 

It is impossible to defend religious freedom 
for the civilian and yet deny it to the soldier. 
The full expression and practice of faith in the 
military has strong roots. General Washington 
oversaw the formation of a military chaplaincy 
in 1775 to support and sustain his men in their 
religious beliefs. President Franklin D. Roo-
sevelt composed the forward to a military edi-
tion of the New Testament, in which he wrote, 
‘‘Throughout the centuries men of many faiths 
and diverse origins have found in the Sacred 
Book words of wisdom, counsel and inspira-
tion. It is a fountain of strength and now, as 
always, an aid in attaining the highest aspira-
tions of the human soul.’’ 

Faith permeates every aspect of a person’s 
life; it cannot be confined to a belief that is 
maintained only within one’s head, home, or 
place of worship. It is essential that our mili-
tary policies and leadership respect the fact 
that a person’s faith also informs the way in 
which they serve. Anything less is a disservice 
to their brave and noble sacrifice. It is for this 
reason that Congress enacted conscience pro-
tections in last year’s National Defense Au-
thorization Act. However, these protections 
have fallen on deaf ears. President Obama 
called these protections ill-advised and unnec-
essary. Over eleven months have passed 
since these protections were signed into law, 
and the Department of Defense has yet to im-
plement policies to enforce the conscience 
protections. 

Furthermore, I fear there is a growing lack 
of understanding for the importance of pre-
serving the integrity of the chaplaincy. A chap-
lain’s purpose is first and foremost to facilitate 
the free exercise rights of servicemembers 
and their families. They serve as an essential 
pillar of support, especially for those who are 
not able to freely access religious services 
and support in the way they could as civilians. 
Chaplains are more than counselors, honor-
ably and indiscriminately serving all 
servicemembers. 

The members of our Armed Forces do not 
leave their faith at home when they commit to 
serve our country, and I remain committed to 
ensuring they are never required to do so. 
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Mr. BURGESS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor an inspiring national health care asso-
ciation leader, Mr. Scott Hunt. During the last 
25 years, Mr. Scott has served as the Execu-
tive Director and CEO of the world’s oldest, 
largest, and most active organization devoted 
to research on hormones and the clinical prac-
tice of endocrinology, The Endocrine Society. 

During his tenure, Mr. Hunt engineered the 
organization to become one of Washington 
Business Journal’s top 50 associations. The 
American Medical Association has recognized 
and honored Mr. Hunt with the Medical Execu-
tive Meritorious Achievement Award. The 
award is given to a medical association execu-

tive who has demonstrated exceptional service 
and has contributed to the goals and ideals of 
the medical profession. 

During the last three decades Mr. Hunt has 
helped to grow The Society from 6,000 mem-
bers to more than 16,500 members. The orga-
nization represents the majority of 
endocrinologists, both clinicians and research-
ers, throughout my home State of Texas, and 
in more than 100 countries around the world. 

As you know, endocrinologists play a very 
important role in the health of our nation. 
Endocrinologists are on the front lines of re-
search, diagnosis, and treatment in areas 
such as rare cancers, diabetes, obesity, thy-
roid, osteoporosis, women’s health, and other 
endocrine related disorders. 

As a physician and a U.S. Congressman, I 
have worked closely with The Endocrine Soci-
ety on public policies to strengthen our na-
tion’s health. I once again applaud Scott Hunt 
for growing and advancing both the associa-
tion and the field of endocrinology. I wish him 
well in retirement and thank him for his con-
tributions to the medical profession. 
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Mr. RICHMOND. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to honor the life of a special man, Rev. Theo-
dore Judson ‘‘T.J.’’ Jemison, a long-time com-
munity leader and civil rights icon. Rev. 
Jemison dedicated his life to making the world 
a better place and, although we are saddened 
by his passing, the legacy that he leaves be-
hind stands as a testament to his incredible 
life. 

Born in Selma, Alabama, Rev. Jemison be-
came pastor of Mount Zion First Baptist 
Church in Baton Rouge, Louisiana in 1949. He 
would remain there for the next 54 years. 
From early in his time as pastor, he was on 
the forefront of the civil rights movement. In 
1953, Rev. Jemison helped organize and lead 
a boycott of the segregated buses in Baton 
Rouge. That action served as a blueprint for 
Rev. Martin Luther King, Jr. when he led the 
boycott of buses in Montgomery two years 
later. 

While the Montgomery bus boycott was an 
important chapter in American history, Rev. 
Jemison’s role in the civil rights movement in 
Baton Rouge didn’t end there. He also played 
an important part in a wide range of other vic-
tories for equal rights, including getting black 
Baton Rouge residents hired at department 
stores, black deputies hired at the Sheriff’s Of-
fice, and even helping bring down the barrier 
to black college football players playing on for-
merly all-white teams. He would continue his 
tireless advocacy for equality for the rest of his 
life. 

Rev. Jemison’s dedication to righting 
wrongs in society was matched by his devo-
tion to healing and helping his community. 
Those twin passions drove him to make life 
better for people everywhere. The work that 
Rev. Jemison did made the world a better 
place. Without the opportunities created 
through the effort of men and women like him, 

I would not be here today. So, if I can see any 
further, it is only because I stand on the shoul-
ders of giants like Rev. T.J. Jemison. 

I want to join his family, congregation, and 
the state of Louisiana in honoring the life and 
legacy of a special man. 
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Mr. MILLER of Florida. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
to recognize Dale O. Knee, PhD, upon his re-
tirement as CEO of Covenant Hospice for his 
dedicated service not only to the Northwest 
Florida community, but also to this great Na-
tion. For over forty-five years, Dale served his 
country and local community in various capac-
ities that share at least one common thread— 
his passion for helping his fellow man. A re-
tired Navy Commander, business and commu-
nity leader, and loving husband and father to 
three, Dale has much to be proud of, and I am 
privileged to honor his lifetime of achieve-
ments. 

Dale Knee began his career in service to 
this great Nation when he answered the call 
during the Vietnam War and served with honor 
and distinction. His service in the United 
States Navy spanned twenty years, and in-
cluded service as a helicopter search and res-
cue corpsman during the Vietnam War, a 
Naval Intelligence Officer/NIS Special Agent, 
and a Medical Service Corps Officer. Before 
retiring as a Navy Commander, Dale served 
as Director of Health Affairs for the Secretary 
of the Navy, Medical Counter-Intelligence Ad-
visor to the Joint Chiefs of Staff and Defense 
Intelligence Agency, and Administrator of the 
White House Medical Services under the 
Reagan Administration. 

A leader in the health care community and 
former hospital executive and owner of a 
health care consulting and development com-
pany, Consulta Network LLC, Dale has served 
as President and CEO of Covenant Hospice 
since 1993. Under his leadership, Covenant 
has grown to be one of the premier hospice 
facilities in the country, and I know firsthand 
how Dale’s leadership at Covenant has 
touched the lives of countless patients and 
helped their families during the most difficult 
times. In addition to his leadership at Cov-
enant, Dale is the chief executive for Alz-
heimer’s Family Services, Inc., CEO of the 
Covenant Foundation, and co-founder of the 
Studer Covenant Alliance, LLC. Dale also 
serves as the National Director for the Board 
of Directors of the National Hospice and Pal-
liative Care Organization (NHPCO), is a mem-
ber of the Board for Florida Hospices and Pal-
liative Care Association, the Alabama Hospice 
Organization, the National Hospice Work 
Group, and the national post-acute care think 
tank, Innovations Group. He also serves on 
the Board for Catholic Charities of Northwest 
Florida and is an Optimist and Rotarian. 

Dale completed his graduate studies at The 
George Washington University and has 
earned a doctoral degree in Health Care Ad-
ministration. Dale has taught at the university 
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