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served the Social Security Agency in 
Whiteville, North Carolina, for forty years. Mrs. 
Featherson’s service began in 1974, when she 
was hired for a part-time administrative posi-
tion. Consistent hard work and dedication 
earned her the position of District Manager, 
and she has worked every day to provide 
peace of mind to North Carolinians as they 
prepare to retire. She has committed herself to 
bettering her community, and I ask you to Mrs. 
Featherson’s enduring commitment to her 
community makes her an exemplary public 
servant, and her accomplishments will con-
tinue to benefit North Carolina for many years 
to come. As her time as District Manager 
comes to a close, let us honor Mrs. Barbara 
Featherson’s long and honorable career and 
pray that she may receive God’s richest bless-
ings. 
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BLACK HISTORY MONTH 2014 
FLOOR SPEECH 

HON. WM. LACY CLAY 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. CLAY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today in cele-
bration of the unique history, terrible sacrifices, 
and remarkable contributions that African 
Americans have made to build our great na-
tion. 

Black History Month calls out to all Ameri-
cans to join together as we advance the unfin-
ished march towards greater diversity and full 
equality for all. 

151 years ago, the Emancipation Proclama-
tion, an executive order issued by President 
Abraham Lincoln, freed the slaves in all states 
that were in rebellion against the Union, and 
established a broad legal framework for the fu-
ture. 

And just like present day executive orders 
issued by this administration . . . President 
Lincoln’s action set off a fire storm of criticism 
from those who hated him, and thought he 
had acted beyond his constitutional powers. 

But President Lincoln was not deterred by 
the vicious and vile uproar from his political 
opponents. Like all great leaders at pivotal 
moments in our Nation’s history, President 
Lincoln ignored the politics of the moment and 
followed the moral compass of history. 

He chose the path of courage, he chose the 
path not taken, in order to advance the cause 
of freedom. 

51 years ago, hundreds of thousands of 
Americans, both black and white, joined to-
gether for the historic March on Washington. 
As Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr. stood in the 
shadow of the Great Emancipator, he declared 
in his famous ‘‘I Have a Dream’’ speech—‘‘We 
have come to this hallowed spot to remind 
America of the fierce urgency of now.’’ 

Tonight, we should hear those words again. 
Absorb them. Live them. 

As we look back on the accomplishments of 
the past, let us remember that the fierce ur-
gency of now still calls us to act boldly . . . 
with courage. 

Equality is not to be put on hold. And the 
hopes of millions who have been left out of 
the American dream, must not be delayed or 
denied. 

46 years ago, my father, former Congress-
man Bill Clay, was elected as the first African- 
American U.S. Representative from Missouri. 

He used his experience as a civil rights ac-
tivist who had been wrongly incarcerated for 
fighting for his beliefs—to provide a strong 
voice for his constituents for more than three 
decades, and he was one of the original 13 
cofounders of the Congressional Black Cau-
cus. 

One of the St. Louis’s first legendary black 
entrepreneurs, Miss Annie Malone, the daugh-
ter of escaped slaves, inspired people around 
the world as she became a black beauty prod-
uct millionaire. She was a noted inventor, edu-
cator and businesswoman. And she became 
one of America’s first prominent black philan-
thropists. 

As we praise the achievements of these 
great American heroes, we are reminded of 
the obligation to honor all of the brave souls 
who have come before us . . . and to rededi-
cate ourselves to bring honor to their memo-
ries by the quality and conduct of our own 
lives. We learn from and continue to be in-
spired by our compelling history. 

But the past does not limit us. It compels us 
to continue the long journey towards a most 
just, more equal society. 

That is a Black History Month lesson that 
everyone across the great country, and in this 
historic Chamber, should embrace. 
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PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. ADAM SMITH 
OF WASHINGTON 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. SMITH of Washington. Mr. Speaker, on 
Tuesday, February 25, 2014, I missed one 
vote in a series of recorded votes. I would 
have voted ‘‘yes’’ on rollcall vote No. 64 (on 
the motion to suspend the rules and pass H.R. 
1123, as amended). 
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HONORING GOOD360 

HON. JAMES P. MORAN 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. MORAN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor and recognize the organization 
Good360. Companies like Good360 support 
philanthropy in a variety of ways—cash grants, 
marketing consultations, and employee vol-
unteerism, just to name a few. 

More than ever before, companies are using 
their core resources to support community- 
based partners. Driven by the desire to maxi-
mize giving while minimizing waste, the major-
ity of growth in the nonprofit sector has come 
from the donation of household items that di-
rectly impact the needs of American families. 

For-profit America plays an important role in 
addressing poverty, literacy and education, 
homelessness and many other social issues 
facing our country. The millions of nonprofit or-
ganizations across America rely on the dona-
tions of critically needed goods to continue the 
programs that are essential to helping those 
with uncertain futures get back on their feet. 
These programs are integral to strengthening 
our communities. 

Giving is not just restricted to consumer sta-
ples. Consumer discretionary companies and 

information technology companies also make 
sizable proportions of their contributions in the 
form of non-cash donations. Their corporate 
sustainability efforts maximize giving to Amer-
ican families and minimize the amount of un-
used or reusable goods going to landfills. 

With more than one in six Americans living 
in poverty and nonprofits struggling to main-
tain programs following significant federal and 
state budget cuts, the American business 
community plays a critical role in supporting 
the nonprofit programs needed to ensure that 
people and families in need overcome the 
challenges they face and are better able to 
pursue the American Dream. 

This month, let us look to a time when more 
businesses give back by donating goods to 
support people in need, to strengthen the 
communities in which they do business, and to 
reduce the amount of products that go into our 
landfills. 

I call upon all American companies and 
nonprofit organizations—small and large—to 
participate in activities that provide donated 
goods that are essential to strengthening com-
munities across our nation. 

Mr. Speaker, I am pleased to recognize 
Good360’s contributions to the betterment of 
our community and the American people, and 
I ask that my colleagues join me in thanking 
them for their continued service. 
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RAISE THE MINIMUM WAGE 

HON. ALBIO SIRES 
OF NEW JERSEY 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. SIRES. Mr. Speaker, raising the min-
imum wage is a critical step in closing the op-
portunity gap and building an economy that 
works for everyone. Yesterday, I joined my 
Democratic colleagues in filing a discharge pe-
tition for an immediate vote on H.R. 1010 to 
raise the minimum wage to $10.10, generating 
economic activity, creating jobs, and growing 
the middle class. 

By raising the minimum wage to $10.10 an 
hour, we can restore fairness for working men 
and women across the country. Specifically it 
would raise wages for nearly 25 million peo-
ple; increase pay and compensation by $35 
billion for hardworking American families; and 
lift between 1 and 4.5 million Americans out of 
poverty. 

Americans deserve an economy where a 
hard days’ work earns a decent day’s pay. No 
hard working American should be forced to 
raise their family in poverty, but the low min-
imum wage currently allows for just that. An 
increase in the minimum wage is not only the 
moral thing to do, but it would also provide a 
much-needed boost to our economy. Simply 
put, when one earns more, one tends to 
spend more. More and more private busi-
nesses are voluntarily raising the minimum 
wage of their workers because they see the 
long-term economic benefits. 

It is my hope that Congress takes imme-
diate and swift action in raising the minimum 
wage to $10.10 an hour. 
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