
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — Extensions of Remarks E269 February 27, 2014 
healthcare and education serving more than 
30,000 Central Floridians. Jenna’s background 
is in social work and teen pregnancy preven-
tion. She previously served in Child Protective 
Services and as PPGO’s Director of Edu-
cation. 

Jenna’s accomplishments as President and 
CEO include implementing paperless medical 
records, expanding access to care for Med-
icaid and safety net populations, and adding 
new clinical services. She has expanded ac-
cess to PPGO evidence-based teen preg-
nancy prevention programs throughout Central 
Florida. PPGO’s education programs have 
been credited for contributing to a 35% reduc-
tion in teen pregnancies in Orange County. 

Jenna attended the University of Florida 
where she received a Bachelor’s degree in 
Political Science. She holds a Master’s De-
gree in Political Science from the University of 
Central Florida (UCF), where she is also pur-
suing her Ph.D. in Public Affairs, Governance, 
and Policy Research. Jenna’s dissertation re-
search focuses on the impact of state policies 
restricting adolescents’ access to reproductive 
health services on teen pregnancy outcomes. 

A New York native, Jenna was raised on 
Long Island, and moved to Central Florida in 
2001. Her husband Andrew is a Titusville na-
tive and UCF graduate. He founded a gaming 
and simulation company, GameSim, in 2007. 
They have a 4-year-old son, and live in Winter 
Park, where they attend First Congregational 
Church. 

In addition to her work for Planned Parent-
hood, Jenna serves on the Orange County 
Healthy Start Board of Directors, the Equality 
Florida Political Action Committee Board, and 
the Board of the First Congregational Church 
Preschool & Kindergarten. 

I am happy to honor Jenna Tosh, during 
Women’s History Month, for her service to the 
Central Florida community. 
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TEMPORARY DEBT LIMIT 
EXTENSION ACT, S. 540 

HON. BETTY McCOLLUM 
OF MINNESOTA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Ms. MCCOLLUM. Mr. Speaker, I rise in 
strong support of this legislation, which sus-
pends the current statutory limit on federal 
borrowing until March 15th, 2015. This crucial 
legislation effectively increases the debt limit 
by $1.2 trillion, ending the Republican manu-
factured crises, and includes $2.2 trillion in 
deficit reduction according to the non-partisan 
Congressional Budget Office, without cutting 
Social Security, Medicare, or Medicaid. I want 
to commend House Republican leadership for 
bringing this legislation to the floor for a vote, 
which represents a dramatic shift since the 
disastrous debt ceiling brinkmanship we saw 
in the summer of 2011. 

The 2011 debt limit ‘‘crisis’’ was a political 
choice—a dangerous and irresponsible polit-
ical stunt—manufactured by Tea Party Repub-
licans in Congress to prevent President 
Obama and Congress from focusing on top 
priorities like job creation and strengthening 
the economy. As we now know, these reck-
less actions had real consequences for our 
economy and global financial markets. Studies 
by the non-partisan Government Accountability 

Office (GAO) and the Bipartisan Policy Center 
found that delays in raising the debt limit in 
2011 cost taxpayers approximately $19 billion 
over ten years in higher government borrowing 
costs. Consumer confidence plummeted, suf-
fering the largest monthly decline (59.2 to 
44.5) during the month of August that year, 
which was the most since the 2008 financial 
crisis. In addition, a Bloomberg survey of 
economists found that the debt limit brinkman-
ship ‘‘almost derailed the recovery.’’ Lastly, a 
recent survey of the world’s top economists by 
the University of Chicago’s Booth School of 
Business found that 84 percent agreed that 
failure to raise the debt limit in a timely man-
ner creates unneeded uncertainty and could 
significantly damage our financial markets. Al-
though I am pleased that House Leadership 
has chosen not to repeat the same mistakes 
from 2011, it is worrying to see that the major-
ity of House Republicans still oppose raising 
the debt limit, considering the economic dam-
age they caused three years ago. 

The legislation before us today is supported 
by a broad array of business leaders, includ-
ing the Chamber of Commerce, the Business 
Roundtable, and American Bankers Associa-
tion. Lastly, Federal Reserve Chairwoman 
Janet Yellen recently testified that failing to 
raise the debt limit would be ‘‘catastrophic’’ for 
the global economy. As our country continues 
to recover from the worst financial crisis since 
the Great Depression, it is Congress’ duty to 
avoid any unnecessary brinkmanship that risks 
plunging our economy back into a recession. 

I urge my colleagues to vote in favor of the 
Temporary Debt Limit Extension Act. 
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COMMENDING CHINA FOR CALLING 
UPON JAPAN TO ‘‘FACE UP TO 
HISTORY’’ REGARDING ‘‘COM-
FORT WOMEN’’ ISSUE 

HON. ENI F.H. FALEOMAVAEGA 
OF AMERICAN SAMOA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. FALEOMAVAEGA. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to commend China for calling upon 
Japan to ‘‘face up to history’’ for forcing 
women and girls, many from countries includ-
ing China, the Republic of Korea, Southeast 
Asia, and Pacific Islands, to sexually serve 
Japanese soldiers during World War II. 

For too long Japan’s government has tried 
to downplay and deny the crimes of its Impe-
rial military. Such defiance goes against 
human conscience. How Japan chooses to 
face its past will determine how it goes into 
the future. Its history must not be forgotten 
and must not be denied and distorted. 

I stand with China in urging the Japanese 
government to acknowledge its history and 
apologize for it with concrete actions that will 
win the trust of its Asian neighbors and the 
international community. I also commend the 
Chinese Foreign Ministry for denouncing Ja-
pan’s enslavement of these women and young 
girls during World War II as ‘‘a serious crime 
against humanity.’’ 

I am appreciative of the work of Congress-
man MIKE HONDA and former Congressman 
Lane Evans for introducing bills calling upon 
Japan to apologize. As Chairman of the U.S. 
House of Representatives Foreign Affairs Sub-
committee on Asia, the Pacific and the Global 

Environment, the first hearing I ever held was 
about this issue. The hearing, held on Feb-
ruary 15, 2007, was the first time a hearing on 
this issue had ever been held in the history of 
the U.S. Congress, and I will always be grate-
ful for the three women who testified. 

Three survivors—Ms. Yong Soo Lee, Ms. 
Jan Ruff O’Herne and Ms. Koon Ja Kim— 
bravely testified before the Subcommittee and, 
consequently, their first-hand accounts of their 
suffering will stand forevermore on the official 
record of the Subcommittee as a witness 
against the abhorrent actions of the Japanese 
Imperial Armed Forces. After hearing the testi-
mony of these three women, I have never 
been the same. I will never rest until justice is 
served. 

And so, I commend my close colleague, 
Congressman MIKE HONDA, a Japanese-Amer-
ican, who also personally testified at the hear-
ing about H. Res. 121, a resolution he intro-
duced calling upon Japan to acknowledge, 
apologize and accept historical responsibility 
for its Imperial Armed Forces’ coercion of 
young women into sexual slavery. H. Res. 
121, which I co-sponsored, subsequently 
passed the House on July 30, 2007. I believe 
it passed because of the three survivors who 
testified as witnesses. 

Regrettably, Japan is again about the busi-
ness of trying to whitewash its crimes. But, it 
is my sincere hope that the international com-
munity will hold Japan accountable and insist 
on a formal apology. In this cause, all peaceful 
nations should hold together and this is why, 
once more, I publicly commend China for urg-
ing Japan to ‘‘face up to its history.’’ 
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IN RECOGNITION OF ANTHONY J. 
ZIDICH 

HON. JACKIE SPEIER 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Ms. SPEIER. Mr. Speaker, I rise to honor 
Anthony J. Zidich for his 42 years of remark-
able and professional service as the City 
Treasurer of Daly City. Tony is setting a 
record as the longest-serving elected official in 
the city’s history. His perseverance, open-door 
policy and love of people, politics and baseball 
have made him a beloved institution in Daly 
City. 

Tony was appointed City Treasurer of Daly 
City in December 1971 to fill the unexpired 
term of Joseph Lewkowitz and he assumed of-
fice the following January. He was then elect-
ed eleven consecutive times. Before that, he 
served on the Daly City Recreation Commis-
sion for two years. Under Tony’s leadership, 
the Daly City treasury has been well safe- 
guarded. In recent years, it was fashionable 
for some public treasurers to imagine them-
selves as miniature versions of Wall Street 
bankers. And many of these agencies suffered 
greatly during the Great Recession. Daly City 
stood up well because Tony had prudently 
managed the city’s funds and decided to leave 
Wall Street banking to self-declared geniuses 
who, as history has since proven, were not as 
smart as Tony Zidich. The real genius of Tony 
Zidich is quite simple: He gets the job done in 
good times and bad, through thick and thin, 
and with complete integrity. 

Tony was a founding member of the board 
of directors of the supporters of the Doelger 
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Senior Center and continues to be its treas-
urer. During Tony’s stewardship, Doelger has 
been a major institution in the city, offering 
senior programming, space for community 
events and classes of various types. A good 
treasurer is essential for any long-time com-
munity program and Doelger and its seniors 
can count on Tony to ensure that the money 
raised by this volunteer organization is always 
safe and available to support its programs. 

Tony’s public service is not limited to Daly 
City, however. He has also served on numer-
ous boards, committees and clubs, including 
the board of Bay Meadows and Los Alamitos 
race tracks, the San Mateo County Treas-
urer’s Advisory Board, the Daly City Police 
Athletic League and the Daly City Credit 
Union. There is a theme in Tony’s service: 
Building fiscal and human resources to sup-
port the future. 

In addition to his long and outstanding pub-
lic service, Tony is a well-known realtor in 
Daly City. That job has earned him the trust of 
residents who refer to him as the ‘‘go to guy.’’ 
He can tell residents the history of nearly 
every block of Daly City. His stories about 
Daly City are always entertaining and offer tre-
mendous insights into the evolution of this re-
markable community. In his office, Tony 
proudly displays his collection of memorabilia 
and toys and will engage anyone in a con-
versation about city politics, city history or 
baseball. 

Tony grew up in San Francisco’s Potrero 
Hill neighborhood. He attended Sacred Heart 
Cathedral Prep where his passion for baseball 
thrived. Known as ‘‘Babe’’ for his skills on the 
field, he was later inducted into the school’s 
Sports Hall of Fame. 

Tony joined the U.S. Army and was sta-
tioned in San Francisco during the Korean 
War. He met the love of his life at a dance at 
the Presidio. Carole Williams and Tony mar-
ried in 1956 and raised their beautiful and in-
telligent daughter Debra in Daly City. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask the House of Represent-
atives to rise with me to honor Anthony Zidich, 
an extraordinary public servant, businessman 
and humanitarian whose energy, enthusiasm 
and expertise have enriched the lives of all 
Daly City residents. He will be greatly missed 
at City Hall, but if anyone comes to Daly City 
and wants to play ball, they’d better go see 
Tony first. He knows all of the players in the 
city, and he will freely offer game-changing 
advice to all who seek to build a better future 
for his beloved community of Daly City. 
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HONORING THE LIFE OF JASON 
BLANKENSHIP 

HON. MICHELLE LUJAN GRISHAM 
OF NEW MEXICO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Ms. MICHELLE LUJAN GRISHAM of New 
Mexico. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to honor the 
memory of Jason Blankenship, a constituent 
who was tragically taken from us last fall. 

A Texan by birth, Jason made Albuquerque 
his home. For over ten years, Jason gave 
back to the community as a staff member at 
the University of New Mexico, including sev-
eral years in Human Resources and scientific 
research. 

A Ph.D. by education, Jason most recently 
put his talents to work at UNM’s Center on Al-

coholism, Substance Abuse and Addictions, 
where he served as research scientist and 
member of a team advancing the field of study 
of fetal alcohol spectrum disorders. This was 
more than just a job to Jason. He was pas-
sionate about his research and truly believed 
in its ability to improve the lives of those suf-
fering from these diseases. 

Even though he was engaged in such im-
portant work at UNM, Jason always found 
time to give back to the Albuquerque commu-
nity, most notably through the Make-a-Wish 
Foundation where he took great pride in being 
a ‘‘wish granter’’ to children with tragic ill-
nesses. 

He was loved by all for his wonderful per-
sonality, his thoughtfulness, his dedication, 
self-discipline and loyalty. Colleagues and fel-
low researchers remember Jason as kind, 
generous and highly skilled. Jason truly be-
lieved that the results of his research could 
positively impact the world around him. At just 
43 years old, Jason was taken from us far too 
soon. 

Mr. Speaker, may the life of Dr. Jason 
Blankenship serve as an inspiration to us all 
as we work to improve not just ourselves but 
the community around us. 
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BATTLING FOR BOBBY—MORE-
HEAD WRESTLES ITS WAY TO A 
STATE CROWN 

HON. HOWARD COBLE 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. COBLE. Mr. Speaker, in sports, when a 
team is motivated by some outside cause, it 
can be difficult to defeat. When that team is 
determined to reach its goal because of a 
stricken leader, it can be unstoppable. 

That is exactly how to describe the wrestling 
team at Morehead High School in Rockingham 
County, North Carolina. I am proud to say that 
the Morehead Panthers, who call the Sixth 
District of North Carolina home, recently won 
the 3A State Dual Team Wrestling Champion-
ship. 

The Panthers had a theme all season: ‘‘Bat-
tling for Bobby.’’ The aforementioned Bobby is 
Bobby Stewart, the former wrestling coach 
and Morehead’s current athletic trainer who 
was diagnosed with leukemia. Prior to the 
championship bout, the team unveiled warm- 
up shirts that read ‘‘Battling for Bobby’’ on the 
front and ‘‘Taking Down Cancer’’ on the back. 

The shirts worked because on February 8, 
2014, Morehead defeated Fred T. Foard High 
School 33–28 to capture the state wrestling 
championship in the 3A Class. Bobby Stew-
art’s illness focused the team all season as 
the Panthers compiled a 38–1 season on their 
way to a state crown. Morehead senior wres-
tler Payton Mills, who was named the cham-
pionship’s Most Outstanding Wrestler and won 
the opening match, gives much of the credit to 
Coach Stewart. ‘‘If it weren’t for Bobby,’’ Mills 
told the Reidsville Review, ‘‘I wouldn’t cur-
rently be wrestling at all, let alone winning 
Most Outstanding Wrestler of the state duals. 
Mainly, I wanted to do everything I could to 
help my team win a state championship for 
Bobby because he’s been such a huge influ-
ence on how I live my life today.’’ 

First-year Head Coach Daniel Bradford also 
told the Rockingham County newspaper that 

the Panthers seemed to be a team of destiny. 
‘‘This is what we work toward all season,’’ 
Bradford said, ‘‘and it’s great to see all of that 
work pay off like this. I knew coming into this 
season that we had a very strong lineup, with 
a lot of great wrestlers. But it was more than 
that. It was a lot of great men. From the very 
first tournament of the year, I knew we were 
going to be tough and the only goal for us was 
to have a chance to win this title.’’ 

Coach Bradford will be the first to tell you 
that it took the entire team to win the state 
championship. Members of the squad included 
Alex Bailey, Gideon Biggs, George Blackstock, 
Willis Booth, Tyler Bruins, Ben Bullins, Will 
Dabbs, Tyler Dabbs, Zane Hairston, Tylon 
Hodges, Steven Holland, Mike Jones, Jordan 
Jones, Dylan Jones, Jadakiss Jumper, Henrik 
Kummert, Payton Mills, Marqe Mills, Tyshawn 
Olverson, John Phillips, William Pryor, Cam-
eron Sanders, Christian Santos, Jordan 
Servie, Wesley Strader, Dylan Willey, Tim 
Woods, and Alex Villa. 

Aiding Coach Bradford in guiding the Pan-
thers to the top included assistant coaches 
Marty White, Terry Mason, Chris Higgs, Chris 
Johnson, David Barker, and Robbie Horton. 
Team doctors Kevin Howard and John Dabbs, 
along with team trainers Bobby Stewart and 
Darrell Carter, made sure the Panthers over-
came any injuries or illnesses on the path to 
glory. 

The Morehead Wrestlerettes made sure the 
Panthers heard the crowd cheering them on to 
victory. The Wrestlerettes included Hope 
Booth, Anne Fitts, Rachel Gallardo, Destiny 
Smith, and Hannah Thompson, along with 
their sponsors Donna Gallardo and Shiela 
Thompson, and Booster Club president Carl 
Booth. 

On behalf of the citizens of the Sixth District 
of North Carolina, we congratulate Principal Al 
Royster, Jr., Athletic Director Jason Tuggle, 
and the faculty, staff, and students of More-
head High School for winning the 3A State 
Dual Team Wrestling Championship. The Pan-
thers said they were ‘‘Battling for Bobby’’ and 
they lived up to that motto all the way to the 
top. 
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HONORING THE LIFE AND LEGACY 
OF DR. GWENDOLYN LOUISE 
MCCORD HANKERSON 

HON. ALCEE L. HASTINGS 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, February 27, 2014 

Mr. HASTINGS of Florida. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to honor the life and legacy of Dr. 
Gwendolyn Louise McCord Hankerson, who 
sadly passed away on February 13, 2014. 

Born in White Springs, Florida to the late 
William Quinton McCord and the late Allie 
Mae King McCord, Gwen dedicated her life to 
giving back to her community. A graduate of 
Dillard High School’s Class of 1949, she went 
on to receive a Bachelor’s Degree in Edu-
cation from North Carolina Central University 
in Durham, North Carolina in 1953. 

Gwen taught third grade at Carver Ranches 
Elementary School and later became the first 
principal of Dillard High Community School. In 
addition, she worked at numerous schools 
throughout the county, such as Lauderdale 
Manors, Nova Blanche Forman, and Norfolk 
Elementary. 
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