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SpotXchange is a digital video advertising 

technology company connecting thousands of 
publishers with trusted demand sources. Each 
month SpotXchange video inventory reaches 
over 200 million visitors in more than 80 coun-
tries. Their advanced transparency and un-
matched customer service around the world is 
a testament to their success. SpotXchange 
hired 48 engineers and is poised to expand 
rapidly this year. 

I extend my deepest congratulations to 
SpotXchange for receiving the Business Rec-
ognition Award from the Jefferson County 
Economic Development Corporation. I thank 
you for your commitment to outstanding cus-
tomer service, high standards and quality 
products. 
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RECOGNIZING THE MANIGAULT- 
HURLEY FAMILY’S SERVICE TO 
THE COMMUNITY 

HON. JOE WILSON 
OF SOUTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, April 2, 2014 

Mr. WILSON of South Carolina. Mr. Speak-
er, it is appropriate to recognize the Manigault- 
Hurley Family for their dedicated service to the 
Midlands community. After 90 years of dedi-
cated service to generations of South Caro-
linians, the oldest family-owned funeral home 
in the Columbia area, closed its doors earlier 
last month. 

Founded in 1923, by William Manigault, the 
Manigault-Hurley Funeral Home was a family 
business in every sense of the word. After Wil-
liam’s passing his wife, Annie Rivers 
Manigault continued to operate the funeral 
home until 1954. Anna May Manigault-Hurley, 
daughter of William and Annie, took over the 
business becoming the first female licensed 
embalmer in the state. She managed the suc-
cessful business for 50 years. Anna’s son and 
current owner Anthony ( Tony) M. Hurley grew 
up helping with the family business which he 
operated with the help of his wife, Alice 
Wyche Hurley, and their three children, Brian, 
Kelly, and Michelle. 

According to The State Newspaper’s March 
15th article ‘Nothing is Forever,’ ‘‘Manigault’s 
was one of four black undertaking establish-
ments operating in Columbia during the late 
1920’s according to the Roberts photo book, 
‘A True Likeness.’ His shot of the storefront, in 
the 700 block of Main, shows a street lined 
with black Cadillacs. 

Manigault expanded into caskets. During the 
Depression, his Congaree Casket Co. report-
edly employed more black people than any 
other black-owned business in South Caro-
lina.’’ 

Nate Abraham, Jr., in Carolina Panorama 
on March 20 reported ‘‘We have served four 
generations of the Columbia community,’’ said 
Mrs. [Alice] Hurley. ‘‘And we are happy with 
that. We will certainly miss being a part of the 
business community, but like everything else, 
life goes in stages. We are just now moving 
into another stage.’’ 

With its closing, the Manigault-Hurley Fu-
neral Home leaves behind a legacy of a family 
business dedicated to professionalism and 
compassionate service. The Wilson and John-
son families know firsthand of the Hurley Fam-
ily’s thoughtfulness in times of grief. They 

were instrumental in providing world-class ar-
rangements. South Carolinians will offer the 
Manigault-Hurley family best wishes for suc-
cess in future endeavors. May their lives be 
filled with health and happiness knowing they 
have made a lasting difference for so many 
families. 
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RECOGNIZING SUSAN FINN BRITA 

HON. ELEANOR HOLMES NORTON 
OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, April 2, 2014 

Ms. NORTON. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
ask my colleagues to join me in recognizing 
Susan Finn Brita for her more than 29 years 
of dedicated public service, in both the legisla-
tive and executive branches. Susan was my 
closest committee advisor when I came to the 
House in 1991 and remained invaluable coun-
sel until she became General Services Admin-
istration (GSA) Deputy Administrator in 2010. 

Susan began her career in public service as 
Chief of Staff to then GSA Administrator Ter-
ence Golden in 1985, after earning her Mas-
ter’s degree in Public Administration from 
George Washington University. In 1992, 
Susan was recruited to become Staff Director 
for the House Transportation and Infrastruc-
ture Committee, Subcommittee on Economic 
Development, Public Buildings, and Emer-
gency Management, a position she held for 15 
years. In 2010, Susan was recruited by the 
Obama administration to become GSA Deputy 
Administrator. 

During her 29 years of federal service, Ms. 
Brita has mastered all phases of federal prop-
erty management, including asset acquisition 
through construction, leasing, purchase, and 
long-term financing, repair and alterations, and 
surplus property disposal. She also has played 
a key role in the implementation of federal en-
ergy policy in federal buildings, including 
courthouses, as well as in the implementation 
of policies directed at building sustainability. 
Ms. Brita was heavily involved in evaluating 
and making recommendations to improve 
GSA’s nationwide leasing program, reforming 
the GSA Courthouse Construction Program, 
and giving GSA the authority to redevelop and 
sell underutilized federal property. In addition 
she played pivotal roles in many projects 
under the jurisdiction of GSA, including the re-
development of the Old Post Office Building, 
the Ronald Reagan International Trade Cen-
ter, the Hotel Monaco, the Southeast Federal 
Center, and the West Campus of St. Eliza-
beths. 

On March 31, 2014, Susan Brita retired 
from the GSA. Susan’s advice and counsel 
have been indispensable to me, to the Trans-
portation and Infrastructure Committee, and 
the Congress in helping to make GSA a true 
partner with the private sector to construct and 
redevelop property across the nation, while 
containing cost to federal taxpayers. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask my colleagues to join me 
in recognizing Susan Finn Brita for a life of 
committed service to the people of the United 
States and the federal government, and in 
congratulating her on her extraordinary 
achievements as she retires from the adminis-
tration and federal service. 

TRIBUTE TO CLARKSON UNIVER-
SITY DIVISION I WOMEN’S ICE 
HOCKEY NATIONAL CHAMPIONS 

HON. WILLIAM L. OWENS 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, April 2, 2014 

Mr. OWENS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize the Clarkson University women’s ice 
hockey team for winning the 2014 Women’s 
‘‘Frozen Four’’ NCAA Division I National 
Championship. 

The Clarkson University women’s ice hock-
ey team also led the nation with the fewest 
goals allowed per game (1.12) and a top- 
ranked penalty kill of 92.5 percent. Their ef-
forts earned them an impressive 31–5–5 
record and the first NCAA Division I national 
championship in the history of Clarkson Uni-
versity athletics. 

Numerous players on Clarkson’s champion-
ship team were recognized for their individual 
achievements. Three players, forward Jamie 
Lee Rattray, defenseman Renata Fast, and 
goalie Erica Howe were named to the 2014 
NCAA Frozen Four All-Tournament Team, 
with Rattray also recognized as the tour-
nament’s Most Valuable Player. 

Several days before the championship, Ms. 
Rattray was recognized with the prestigious 
Patty Kazmaier Award presented annually to 
the top player in NCAA Division I women’s ice 
hockey. According to the USA Hockey Foun-
dation, selection criteria for this award include 
outstanding individual and team skills, sports-
manship, performance in the clutch, personal 
character, competitiveness, and a love of 
hockey. Consideration is also given to aca-
demic achievement and civic involvement. 

Clarkson players also led the nation in sev-
eral categories this year. Ms. Rattray finished 
the season leading in total points with 66 and 
in power-play goals with 10. Erin Ambrose led 
among defensemen with 50 points, 14 goals, 
and 36 assists. Clarkson goalie Erica Howe 
compiled the lowest goals against average, 
1.10, and the most shutouts with 14. 

This championship is an historic achieve-
ment for Clarkson University’s women’s ice 
hockey team. While I was unfortunately unable 
to attend the championship game, the team’s 
success serves as an enduring example of 
what can be achieved through great teamwork 
and a shared commitment to excellence. 
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OZ SNOWBOARDS 

HON. ED PERLMUTTER 
OF COLORADO 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, April 2, 2014 

Mr. PERLMUTTER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and applaud Oz 
Snowboards for being honored with the Busi-
ness Recognition Award given by the Jeffer-
son County Economic Development Corpora-
tion. 

The Business Recognition Award is given to 
a Jefferson County company which shows 
growth in employment, sales and capital in-
vestment in the last year. 

Oz Snowboards manufacturer integrated 
aerospace design concepts into its construc-
tion by replacing heavy fiberglass with high 
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