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CONGRATULATING MRS. JILL 

ROTH 

HON. JAMES P. MORAN 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 29, 2014 

Mr. MORAN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
congratulate Mrs. Jill Roth for winning The 
Independent Insurance Agents & Brokers As-
sociation of America’s ‘‘Young Agent of the 
Year’’ award. Mrs. Roth and her family reside 
in McLean Virginia, within Virginia’s 8th Con-
gressional District. Jill serves as the Executive 
Vice President in the Ahart Frinzi & Smith Al-
exandria, Virginia office. In that role, Jill has 
worked tirelessly to serve our areas insurance 
needs. 

In granting the award, the Association rec-
ognized Mrs. Roth’s hard work, her passion, 
and her dedication to civic involvement. The 
annual award is given to only one outstanding 
agent per year. 

Mr. Speaker, I offer my hearty congratula-
tions to Jill Roth and her coworkers at Ahart, 
Frinzi & Smith for this achievement. I wish her 
the best of luck in all of her future endeavors, 
and I’m proud to serve as her representative. 
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RECOGNIZING ROBERT SOSA 

HON. HENRY CUELLAR 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 29, 2014 

Mr. CUELLAR. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize the retiring, Director of Foundation, 
Corporate, and Government Relation at Uni-
versity of the Incarnate Word, Robert Sosa. 
He has been Director of Foundation, Cor-
porate, and Government Relations at OIW 
since 1992 and is ending his tenure after 
twenty two years. His tireless efforts have im-
proved the community and served to better 
the development and progress for UIW. 

Robert Sosa was born in San Antonio, 
Texas. Sosa became the first person in his 
family to graduate from college, earning a 
Bachelor’s and Master’s degree in English 
from St. Mary’s University. Prior to becoming 
the Director of Foundation, Corporate, and 
Government Relations he taught high school 
English for 7 years. Following his career as a 
teacher he worked at various marketing and 
advertising agencies before launching his own 
marketing and advertising company in the 
1970s. In 1992 Sosa sold his business and re-
turned to education when the president of the 
University of the Incarnate Word asked him to 
launch the university’s grants operation. Dur-
ing his tenure at UIW Sosa has been respon-
sible for attracting and managing the philan-
thropic interests of corporations, foundations, 
and the government. As Director, Sosa has 
dedicated his life to helping the university and 
community develop projects that serve low in-
come residents and first-generation college 
students. Under his direction the Department 
of Foundation, Corporate, and Government 
Relations at UIW has raised $100 million dol-
lars for scholarships, research, academic pro-
grams, construction, and healthcare services. 

Outside of his work as director Sosa has fo-
cused much of his time to teaching and com-
munity service. He taught English, Sociology, 

and Marketing at San Antonio College, UIW, 
and St. Phillips College. He has been a mem-
ber of the San Antonio Hispanic Chamber of 
Commerce, the Las Casas Foundation and 
Workforce Solutions Alamo. In addition, he 
has served as chairman of the board of the 
Guadalupe Cultural Arts center and has been 
a committee member of Leadership in San 
Antonio. 

Mr. Speaker, I am honored to recognize Mr. 
Robert Sosa, retiring Director of Foundation, 
Corporate, and Government Relation at Uni-
versity of the Incarnate Word. His years of 
dedication and commitment to our community 
have truly impacted the quality of lives for the 
people of the city. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO MARY ‘‘JOSIE’’ CUDA 

HON. SHELLEY MOORE CAPITO 
OF WEST VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Tuesday, April 29, 2014 

Mrs. CAPITO. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
recognize Mary ‘‘Josie’’ Cuda for her three 
decades of service in community and housing 
development, from Bolivia to Elkins, West Vir-
ginia. 

Josie started her career serving others thirty 
years ago as a community organizer in Bo-
livia, followed by jobs as a flood relief worker 
and a position in human services. She spent 
seventeen years with the Randolph County 
Housing Authority and her final fourteen years 
as the agency’s Executive Director. During 
Josie’s time with the Randolph County Hous-
ing Authority, she developed a reputation as 
an innovative leader, using creativity and 
imagination to maximize her agency’s foot-
print, serving moderate to low income hard-
working West Virginians. She used funds from 
the West Virginia Housing Development Fund, 
the HOME Investment Partnerships Program, 
and money from the Federal Home Loan Bank 
to develop over one hundred homes and thirty 
apartment units during her tenure as Execu-
tive Director of the Randolph County Housing 
Authority. In addition, independent non-profit 
partners Woodlands Development Group and 
the Home Ownership Center were both started 
during Josie’s tenure, in order to make safe, 
decent, affordable housing more accessible. 

Since leaving the Randolph County Housing 
Authority, Josie’s attention has remained fo-
cused on community and housing develop-
ment. She has worked with CommunityWorks 
and the West Virginia Community Develop-
ment Hub to bring Achieving Excellence in 
Community Development to West Virginia, a 
program which helps provide training to non- 
profit organizations working to improve their 
communities. So far, ten housing organiza-
tions and sixteen community groups have uti-
lized this program in West Virginia. 

On May 1, 2014, Mary ‘‘Josie’’ Cuda will be 
inducted into the Affordable Housing Hall of 
Fame by Habitat for Humanity of West Vir-
ginia. Mrs. Cuda is truly deserving of such an 
honor, as countless West Virginians have her 
to thank for a better quality of life, better hous-
ing, and better communities. 

Josie is married to Frank Cuda, a family 
nurse practitioner. Together they have twin 
sons and three grandchildren, with a fourth on 
the way! 

Mr. Speaker, Randolph County, as well as 
the State of West Virginia, owe Mary ‘‘Josie’’ 

Cuda a debt of gratitude for her many years 
of devoted community service. I am proud to 
call her a friend and fellow West Virginian. 
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IN RECOGNITION OF LI MOON 

HON. JACKIE SPEIER 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Tuesday, April 29, 2014 

Ms. SPEIER. Mr. Speaker, I rise to honor Li 
Moon, an outstanding educator with the 
Hillsborough City School District for 22 years, 
who has changed the lives of hundreds of chil-
dren, including my own daughter. Mrs. Moon 
is being honored with the Community Care 
Award from the Associated Parents Group. 

Mrs. Moon is a Resource Specialist and the 
Data Advisor at North Elementary School. She 
served as Teacher-in-Charge for twelve years. 
I can say without fear of contradiction that she 
is one of the most effective, empathetic and 
innovative educators I have known. She be-
lieves that all children can succeed and will 
not stop until she finds what will make a stu-
dent succeed. Her patience and compassion 
are inexhaustible. 

Li Moon, a native of New York City, was a 
University Scholar at New York University. 
She received her BA in English in 1971, grad-
uating cum laude and earning a membership 
in the Phi Beta Kappa Society. While teaching 
at Rivendell School, a small alternative school 
in San Francisco, she attended San Francisco 
State University, graduating in 1991 with her 
Multiple Subject Teaching Credential, MA in 
Special Education and Educational Therapist 
Certificate. The following year she started her 
teaching career at North School as a Re-
source Specialist, simultaneously continuing 
her private practice as an Educational Thera-
pist for several years. She has also taught 
several courses and led numerous workshops 
in the Special Education Department at San 
Francisco State University and has been a 
Guest Lecturer at UC Berkeley Extension. 

Mrs. Moon has a long and impressive list of 
training and credentials, including a Behavior 
Intervention Case Manager Certificate (BICM), 
Autism Authorization Training and English 
Language Development (ELD) and Specially 
Designed Academic Instruction in English 
(SDAIE) Certification. Her professional devel-
opment includes training through Intel Math, 
the Columbia Math Camp, summer institutes 
at the Harvard Graduate School of Education 
(including Data Wise), IEP Skills Facilitation, 
TEACCH, Schools Attuned Profile Advisor 
training, Lindamood-Bell Phonological Se-
quencing Training, Project Read Phonology 
and Junior Great Books Discussion Leader 
Training. She received her Board Certification 
in Educational Therapy in 2001, is a former 
editor of The Educational Therapist and is cur-
rently the Chair of the San Francisco Associa-
tion of Educational Therapists Study Group. 

As you can surmise from this list, Mrs. 
Moon is always working on improving and ex-
panding her skills so that she can use them to 
make her students thrive and succeed. 

Her talents have not gone unnoticed in our 
community. Mrs. Moon deservedly received 
the school district’s TONY and Teacher Lead-
ership awards in 2001. 

Mrs. Moon and her husband of 40 years, 
Jason Stillwater, live in San Francisco. They 
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