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Care Association, NJPCA, after many 
years of remarkable service to the Gar-
den State. 

Kathy has admirably acted as the 
President and CEO of NJPCA, a non- 
profit organization that represents 
New Jersey’s Federally-Qualified 
Health Centers, FQHC. Under her lead-
ership, New Jersey’s FQHC’s have 
grown in both size and capability while 
modeling high standards of care for all 
ages and income levels. She represents 
the best of what NJPCA has accom-
plished in addressing the primary care 
needs of our friends and neighbors, and 
we owe her a debt of gratitude. 

While New Jersey is home to 20 com-
munity health centers operating 121 
sites throughout the State, this robust 
network would not be possible without 
Kathy’s tremendous contributions. 
Under her leadership, FQHCs in New 
Jersey have come to represent quality, 
comprehensive, and most importantly, 
accessible care for more than 495,000 
patients. 

In addition to these and many more 
accomplishments during her tenure at 
the NJPCA, Kathy has also honorably 
served under two New Jersey Gov-
ernors within the State’s Department 
of Health and Senior Services. 
Throughout her career, Kathy has dem-
onstrated an innate ability to get the 
job done without losing sight of the 
need to ensure the well-being of all. 
Whether working to develop new phar-
maceutical funding initiatives, direct-
ing the New Jersey WIC Program, or 
helping to implement Title XX fund-
ing, her dedication and commitment 
has earned her the respect and admira-
tion of her peers and colleagues. 

In 2012, I was honored to recognize 
Kathy’s efforts with the Evangelina 
Menendez Trailblazer Award, an honor 
bestowed upon the strong women of 
New Jersey who distinguish themselves 
in our communities each and every 
day. I am not alone in recognizing and 
honoring Kathy for the work she had 
done, as she has received commenda-
tions from the National Association of 
Community Health Centers, the NJ Biz 
Power 50 in Health Care, and NJ Cit-
izen Action, among others. 

While the Affordable Care Act 
brought the importance of access to 
high quality, accessible and affordable 
care to the forefront of the national 
conversation, it was an issue Kathy 
had already been working on for years. 
Her insight and counsel during the de-
bate on health reform, as well as her 
constant vigilance on the law’s imple-
mentation, has proven invaluable to 
me and of immeasurable benefit to 
FQHCs and their patients, not only in 
New Jersey but throughout the coun-
try. With our health care system evolv-
ing to focus on wellness, prevention 
and access to primary care, Kathy’s 
work building New Jersey’s network of 
community health centers into a na-
tionally-recognized model ensures com-
munities in New Jersey will flourish 
well into the future. 

I congratulate Kathy on her retire-
ment and would like to once again rec-

ognize, commend and applaud her leg-
acy of extraordinary dedication to the 
New Jersey Primary Care Association 
and her unwavering service to the peo-
ple of New Jersey.∑ 

f 

RECOGNIZING LA PLAZA 
∑ Mr. RISCH. Madam President, mil-
lions of American businesses have 
found their start in the living rooms, 
backyards, and garages of aspiring en-
trepreneurs. Harnessing individual cre-
ativity and work ethic, a talent can 
grow into a lasting enterprise. I wish 
to honor La Plaza, a restaurant from 
my home State of Idaho, whose hard 
work and dedication to quality has 
seen growth and prosperity while en-
hancing the local community. 

Founded in 2003, La Plaza offers 
unique and traditional Mexican fare, 
including an assortment of moles made 
with chocolate and dried peppers, to 
diners and visitors in southern Idaho. 
Guadalupe ‘‘Lupe’’ Loza and her hus-
band, Chon, originally from Aguas-
calientes, Mexico, never planned to 
own a restaurant until their infant son 
required long-term hospitalization and 
they needed to fund his medical bills. 
As a self-taught chef, Lupe Loza start-
ed making tamales and empanadas in 
her kitchen and selling the food di-
rectly to local dairy workers and ob-
servers on local soccer fields. As her 
fans multiplied, and driven by the phi-
losophy that ‘‘farmers can dig the dirt 
and plant the seeds, but they can’t 
make the plants grow,’’ Lupe Loza 
took a leap of faith and opened the res-
taurant in a converted two-car garage, 
where customers sat at folding tables 
and ate off paper plates. 

Today, La Plaza operates out of a 
1,992 square foot space on Buhl’s Main 
Street, located on the old Oregon Trail 
in the western half of Twin Falls Coun-
ty. The Lozas are dedicated to creating 
and serving authentic Mexican cuisine 
and making costumers feel like they 
are eating at home with family. It is 
not surprising that after 11 years, La 
Plaza has received overwhelming 
praise from its diners and the larger 
community. The from-scratch food and 
‘‘grandmother’s house’’ feel have made 
La Plaza a local staple and traveler’s 
destination. The small, yet diverse 
menu is updated frequently, accommo-
dating customer feedback, requests, 
and favorites. From carne asada tacos 
to bacon-wrapped cheesy jalapeno 
bites, customers drive many miles out 
of their way to sample La Plaza’s au-
thentic Mexican cuisine. The res-
taurant has also expanded to cater at 
local venues, including the annual 
Cinco de Mayo celebration for the 
Latinos Unidos at the College of South-
ern Idaho. The Lozas dedication to ex-
cellence has earned La Plaza a five-star 
rating on Yelp, the second-highest 
rated restaurant in Buhl on Trip Advi-
sor, and a 90 percent customer satisfac-
tion rate on Urban Spoon. 

Over the past 11 years, La Plaza has 
doubled in size, and the homemade ran-

chero fajitas are now served on china 
plates instead of paper plates. I hope 
La Plaza’s story will inspire others 
around the country to chase the Amer-
ican Dream. I congratulate the Loza 
family and the entire La Plaza team on 
their success, continued growth, and 
exemplary reputation for quality. La 
Plaza represents the best aspects of 
American entrepreneurship and is a 
credit to both Idaho and the Nation.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO CARTER ADAMS 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Carter Adams, a 2014 sum-
mer intern in my Washington, DC of-
fice, for all of the hard work he has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

Carter is a junior at the University of 
Central Florida, currently majoring in 
political science. He is a dedicated and 
diligent worker who has been devoted 
to getting the most out of his intern-
ship experience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Carter for 
all the fine work he has done and wish 
him continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO MADELINE AHERN 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Madeline Ahern, a 2014 
spring intern in my Washington, DC, 
office for all of the hard work she has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

Madeline is currently a rising senior 
at the Madeira School in McLean, VA. 
She is a dedicated and diligent worker 
who has been devoted to getting the 
most out of her internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Madeline for all the fine 
work she has done and wish her contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO NATALIE BARRERO 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Natalie Barrero, a 2013 fall 
intern in my Washington, DC, office for 
all of the hard work she has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Natalie is a graduate of the Catholic 
University of America, having majored 
in international business. She is a dedi-
cated and diligent worker who has been 
devoted to getting the most out of her 
internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Natalie for all the fine 
work she has done and wish her contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO MOISES BENHABIB 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Moises Benhabib, a 2014 
spring intern in my Washington, DC, 
office for all of the hard work he has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

VerDate Sep 11 2014 06:12 Dec 13, 2014 Jkt 049060 PO 00000 Frm 00042 Fmt 4624 Sfmt 0634 E:\CR\FM\G11DE6.054 S11DEPT3rf
re

de
ric

k 
on

 D
S

K
6S

P
T

V
N

1P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 S
E

N
A

T
E



CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE S6691 December 11, 2014 
Moises is a graduate of the Univer-

sity of Tampa where he majored in gov-
ernment and world affairs. He is a dedi-
cated and diligent worker who has been 
devoted to getting the most out of his 
internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Moises for all the fine 
work he has done and wish him contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO BARR BENYAMIN 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Barr Benyamin, a 2014 
spring intern in my Washington, DC, 
office for all of the hard work he has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

Barr is a graduate of the University 
of Southern California in Los Angeles, 
CA, having majored in political science 
and business administration. He is a 
dedicated and diligent worker who has 
been devoted to getting the most out of 
his internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Barr for all the fine work 
he has done and wish him continued 
success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO MAT BOWERS 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Mat Bowers, a 2014 summer 
intern in my Washington, DC office, for 
all of the hard work he has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Mat is a senior at Cornell University, 
currently majoring in biology with a 
concentration in animal physiology. He 
is a dedicated and diligent worker who 
has been devoted to getting the most 
out of his internship experience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Mat for all 
the fine work he has done and wish him 
continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO KATIE BULLEK 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Katie Bullek, a 2014 spring 
intern in my Washington, DC office, for 
all of the hard work she has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Katie is a rising senior at the College 
the Holy Cross in Worcester, MA. Cur-
rently, Katie is majoring in economics 
and political science. She is a dedi-
cated and diligent worker who has been 
devoted to getting the most out of her 
internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Katie for all the fine 
work she has done and wish her contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO JOHN BURKE 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize John Burke, a 2014 spring 
intern in my Washington, DC, office for 
all of the hard work he has done for 

me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

John is a graduate of the George 
Washington University where he ma-
jored in international affairs. He is a 
dedicated and diligent worker who has 
been devoted to getting the most out of 
his internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to him for all the fine work 
he has done and wish him continued 
success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO ALYSON CUERVO 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Alyson Cuervo, a 2013 fall 
intern in my Washington, DC, office for 
all of the hard work she has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Alyson is a rising junior at the 
George Washington University in 
Washington, DC. Currently, Alyson is 
majoring in international affairs. She 
is a dedicated and diligent worker who 
has been devoted to getting the most 
out of her internship experience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Alyson for all the fine 
work she has done and wish her contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO JOEL DENNIS 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Joel Dennis, a 2014 summer 
intern in my Washington, DC office, for 
all of the hard work he has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Joel is a graduate of the University 
of North Carolina at Chapel Hill, hav-
ing majored in history and political 
science. He is a dedicated and diligent 
worker who has been devoted to get-
ting the most out of his internship ex-
perience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Joel for all 
the fine work he has done and wish him 
continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO RACHEL EILERS 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Rachel Eilers, a 2014 sum-
mer intern in my Washington, DC of-
fice, for all of the hard work she has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

Rachel is a student at Auburn Uni-
versity, currently majoring in political 
science and communication. She is a 
dedicated and diligent worker who has 
been devoted to getting the most out of 
her internship experience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Rachel for 
all the fine work she has done and wish 
her continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO ABBIE FREY 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Abbie Frey, a 2014 summer 

intern in my Washington, DC office, for 
all of the hard work she has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Abbie is a junior at Cornell Univer-
sity, currently majoring in industrial 
and labor relations. She is a dedicated 
and diligent worker who has been de-
voted to getting the most out of her in-
ternship experience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Abbie for 
all the fine work she has done and wish 
her continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO AMELIA GARCIA 
∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Amelia Garcia, a 2014 sum-
mer intern in my Washington, DC of-
fice, for all of the hard work she has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

Amelia is a sophomore at the Univer-
sity of Virginia, currently majoring in 
commerce. She is a dedicated and dili-
gent worker who has been devoted to 
getting the most out of her internship 
experience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Amelia for 
all the fine work she has done and wish 
her continued success in the years to 
come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO EMERSON GEORGE 
∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Emerson George, a 2014 
summer intern in my Washington, DC 
office, for all of the hard work he has 
done for me, my staff, and the people of 
the State of Florida. 

Emerson is a senior at the University 
of Mississippi, currently majoring in 
political science and business. He is a 
dedicated and diligent worker who has 
been devoted to getting the most out of 
his internship experience. 

I would like to extend my sincere 
thanks and appreciation to Emerson 
for all the fine work he has done and 
wish him continued success in the 
years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO CORINNE HUSTON 
∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Corinne Huston, a 2013 fall 
intern in my Washington, DC office, for 
all of the hard work she has done for 
me, my staff, and the people of the 
State of Florida. 

Corinne is a graduate of the Univer-
sity of South Florida in political 
science. She is a dedicated and diligent 
worker who has been devoted to get-
ting the most out of her internship ex-
perience. 

I extend my sincere thanks and ap-
preciation to Corinne for all the fine 
work she has done and wish her contin-
ued success in the years to come.∑ 

f 

TRIBUTE TO HELENA JOO 

∑ Mr. RUBIO. Madam President, today 
I recognize Helena Joo, a 2014 summer 
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