AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 398

To extend, improve, and consolidate energy research and development
programs, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

May 20, 2015
Mr. ALEXANDER (for himself, Mr. CooNs, Ms. MURKOWSKI, Ms. CANTWELL,
Mr. GARDNER, Mrs. FEINSTEIN, and Mr. HEINRICH) introduced the fol-
lowing bill; which was read twice and referred to the Committee on En-
ergy and Natural Resources

A BILL

To extend, improve, and consolidate energy research and

development programs, and for other purposes.

[E—

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TrrLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Energy Title of America COMPETES Reauthorization
Act of 20157,

(b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—The table of contents of

0 N N B~ W

this Act 1s as follows:
Sec. 1. Short title; table of contents.

TITLE I—ENERGY TITLE OF AMERICA COMPETES PROGRAMS



O o0 9 N U B WD =

[\ I O R e e e e T e e e e T
—_ O O o0 N O W BN W N = O

22

See. 101. Basie research.
See. 102. Advanced Research Projects Agency-Energy.

TITLE II—ELIMINATION AND CONSOLIDATION OF PROGRAMS

See. 201. Elimination of program authorities.
See. 202. Repeal of authorizations.
See. 203. Consolidation of duplicative program authorities.

TITLE I—ENERGY TITLE OF
AMERICA COMPETES PRO-
GRAMS

SEC. 101. BASIC RESEARCH.

Section 971(b) of the Energy Policy Act of 2005 (42

U.S.C. 16311(b)) is amended—

(1) in paragraph (6), by striking “and” at the
end;

(2) in paragraph (7), by striking the period at
the end and inserting a semicolon; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

“(8) $5,271,000,000 for fiscal year 2016;

“(9) $5,485,000,000 for fiscal year 2017;

“(10) $5,704,000,000 for fiscal year 2018;

“(11) $5,932,000,000 for fiscal year 2019; and

“(12) $6,178,000,000 for fiscal year 2020.”.

SEC. 102. ADVANCED RESEARCH PROJECTS AGENCY-EN-
ERGY.

Section 5012 of the America COMPETES Act (42

U.S.C. 16538) is amended—

(1) in subsection (a)(3), by striking “subsection
(n)(1)” and inserting ‘“‘subsection (0)(1)";

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O W B~ WD == ©

3
(2) 1In subsection (i), by striking paragraph (1)
and inserting the following:
“(1) IN GENERAL.—To the maximum extent
practicable, the Director shall ensure that—

“(A) the activities of ARPA-E are coordi-
nated with, and do not duplicate the efforts of],
programs and laboratories within the Depart-
ment and other relevant research agencies; and

“(B) ARPA-E does not provide funding
for a project unless the prospective grantee
demonstrates sufficient attempts to secure pri-
vate financing or indicates that the project is
not independently commercially viable.”;

(3) by redesignating subsection (n) as sub-

section (0);

(4) by inserting after subsection (m) the fol-
lowing:

“(n) PROTECTION OF INFORMATION.—The following
types of information collected by the ARPA-E from recipi-
ents of financial assistance awards shall be considered
privileged and confidential and not subject to disclosure
under section 552 of title 5, United States Code:

“(1) Plans for commercialization of technologies

developed under the award, including business plans,

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\ T NG T NG I N I e N e N o T e T e T e SO = S = S =Y
W D= O O 0 N N B WD = O

4

technology-to-market plans, market studies, and cost
and performance models.

“(2) Investments provided to an awardee from
third parties (such as venture capital firms, hedge
funds, and private equity firms), including amounts
and the percentage of ownership of the awardee pro-
vided in return for the investments.

“(3) Additional financial support that the
awardee—

“(A) plans to or has invested into the tech-
nology developed under the award; or
“(B) is seeking from third parties.

“(4) Revenue from the licensing or sale of new
products or services resulting from research con-
ducted under the award.”; and

(5) 1n subsection (0) (as redesignated by para-
oraph (3))—

(A) in paragraph (2)—

(1) in the matter preceding subpara-
oraph (A), by striking “paragraphs (4)
and (5)” and inserting “paragraph (4)”;

(11) in subparagraph (D), by striking

“and” at the end;

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

I S T
B~ W NN = O

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

B)

(111) in subparagraph (E), by striking
the period at the end and inserting a semi-
colon; and

(iv) by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:

“(F) $291,200,000 for fiscal year 2016;
“(G) $303,600,000 for fiscal year 2017,
“(H) $314,700,000 for fiscal year 2018;
“(I) $327,300,000 for fiscal year 2019;
and
“(J) $340,600,000 for fiscal year 2020 .”;
and
(B) in paragraph (4)(B), by striking
“(e)(2)(D)” and inserting “(¢)(2)(C)".
TITLE II—ELIMINATION AND
CONSOLIDATION OF PROGRAMS

SEC. 201. ELIMINATION OF PROGRAM AUTHORITIES.

(a) NUCLEAR SCIENCE TALENT EXPANSION PRro-
GRAM FOR INSTITUTIONS OF HIGHER EDUCATION.—Sec-
tion 5004 of the America COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C.
16532) is repealed.

(b) HYDROCARBON SYSTEMS SCIENCE TALENT EX-
>ANSION PROGRAM FOR INSTITUTIONS OF HIGHER EDU-

CATION.—

*S 1398 IS



6

1 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 5005(e) of the
2 America COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16533(e)) is
3 repealed.

4 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

5 (A) Section 5005(f) of the America COM-

6 PETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16533(f)) i1s amend-

7 ed—

8 (1) by striking paragraph (2);

9 (ii) by striking the subsection designa-
10 tion and heading and all that follows
11 through “There are’” in paragraph (1) and
12 iserting the following:

13 “(f) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There
14 are”’; and

15 (iii) by redesignating subparagraphs
16 (A) through (C) as paragraphs (1) through
17 (3), respectively, and indenting appro-
18 priately.

19 (B) Section 5005 of the America COM-
20 PETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16533) is amended by
21 redesignating subsection (f) as subsection (e).
22 (¢) DISCOVERY SCIENCE AND ENGINEERING INNOVA-

23 TION INSTITUTES.—Section 5008 of the America COM-

24 PETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16535) is repealed.

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

[\© TN NG T N T NG N NG I NS B N e e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) B ~S O T NO I e

7

(d) ELIMINATION OF DUPLICATIVE AUTHORITY FOR

EDUCATION PROGRAMS.—Sections 3181 and 3185 of the

Department of Energy Science Education Enhancement
Act (42 U.S.C. 73811, 42 U.S.C. 7381n) are repealed.

(e) MENTORING PROGRAM.—Section 3195 of the De-
partment of Energy Science Education Enhancement Act
(42 U.S.C. 7381r) is repealed.

SEC. 202. REPEAL OF AUTHORIZATIONS.

(a) DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY EARLY CAREER

AWARDS FOR SCIENCE, ENGINEERING, AND MATIIE-

MATICS RESEARCHERS.—Section 5006 of the America

COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16534) is amended by strik-
ing subsection (h).

(b) DISTINGUISHED SCIENTIST PROGRAM.—Section
5011 of the America COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16537)
1s amended by striking subsection (j).

(¢) PROTECTING AMERICA’S COMPETITIVE EDGE
(PACE) GRADUATE FELLOWSHIP PROGRAM.—Section
5009 of the America COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16536)
is amended by striking subsection (f).

SEC. 203. CONSOLIDATION OF DUPLICATIVE PROGRAM AU-
THORITIES.

(a) UNIVERSITY NUCLEAR SCIENCE AND ENGINEER-
ING SUPPORT.—Section 954 of the Energy Policy Act of
2005 (42 U.S.C. 16274) is amended—

*S 1398 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

8

(1) in subsection (a), by inserting ‘“nuclear

chemistry,” after “nuclear engineering,”; and

(2) in subsection (b)—

(A) by redesignating paragraphs (3)
through (5) as paragraphs (4) through (6), re-
spectively; and

(B) by inserting after paragraph (2) the
following:

“(3) award grants, not to exceed 5 years in du-

ration, to institutions of higher education with exist-
ing academic degree programs in nuclear sciences

and related fields—

“(A) to increase the number of graduates
in nuclear science and related fields;

“(B) to enhance the teaching and research
of advanced nuclear technologies;

“(C) to undertake collaboration with indus-
try and National Laboratories; and

“(D) to bolster or sustain nuclear infra-
structure and research facilities of institutions
of higher education, such as research and train-

ing reactors and laboratories;”.

(b) CONSOLIDATION OF DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY

EARLY CAREER AWARDS FOR SCIENCE, ENGINEERING,

*S 1398 IS



9

1 AND MATHEMATICS RESEARCHERS PROGRAM AND Dis-

2 TINGUISHED SCIENTIST PROGRAM.—

3

O o0 9 N W B~

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

(1) FunpING.—Section 971(¢) of the Energy
Policy Act of 2005 (42 U.S.C. 16311(¢)) is amended
by adding at the end the following:

“(8) For the Department of Energy early ca-
reer awards for science, engineering, and mathe-
matics researchers program under section 5006 of
the America COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16534)
and the distinguished scientist program under sec-
tion 5011 of that Act (42 U.S.C. 16537),
$150,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2016 through
2020, of which not more than 65 percent of the
amount made available for a fiscal year under this
paragraph may be used to carry out section 5006 or
5011 of that Act.”.

(2) DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY EARLY CAREER
AWARDS FOR SCIENCE, ENGINEERING, AND MATIIE-
MATICS RESEARCIERS.—Section 5006 of the Amer-
ica COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16534) 1s amend-
ed—

(A) 1 subsection (b)(1)—
(1) in the matter preceding subpara-

oraph (A)—

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e D e e T S
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O B BN~ WD = O

10

(I) by inserting ‘“‘average” before
“amount’’; and

(IT) by inserting “‘for each year”
before “shall”’;

(i1) in subparagraph (A), by striking

“$80,000” and inserting “$190,000”; and

(111) in subparagraph (B), by striking

“$125,000” and inserting “$490,000";

(B) 1n subsection (¢)(1)(C)—

(1) in clause (1)—

(I) by striking ‘“assistant pro-
fessor or equivalent title” and insert-
ing “‘untenured assistant or associate
professor’’; and

(IT) by inserting “or” after the
semicolon at the end;

(i1) by striking clause (ii); and
(iii) by redesignating clause (iii) as

clause (11);

(C) in subsection (d), by striking “on a
competitive, merit-reviewed basis’” and inserting
“through a competitive process using merit-
based peer review.”’;

(D) in subsection (e)—

*S 1398 IS



11

1 (i) by striking “(e)” and all that fol-
2 lows through “To be eligible” and inserting
3 the following:

4 “(e) SELECTION PROCESS AND CRITERIA.—To be eli-
5 eible”; and

6 (i1) by striking paragraph (2); and

7 (E) in subsection (f)(1), by striking “non-
8 profit, nondegree-granting research organiza-
9 tions”” and inserting “‘National Laboratories”.

[a—
S

(¢) SCIENCE EDUCATION PROGRAMS.—Section 3164

[—
[—

of the Department of Energy Science Education Enhance-

12 ment Act (42 U.S.C. 7381a) is amended—

13 (1) 1 subsection (b)—

14 (A) by striking paragraphs (1) and (2) and
15 inserting the following:

16 “(1) IN GENERAL.—The Director of the Office
17 of Science (referred to in this subsection as the “Di-
18 rector’’) shall provide for appropriate coordination of
19 science, technology, engineering, and mathematics
20 education programs across all functions of the De-
21 partment.

22 “(2) ADMINISTRATION.—In carrying out para-
23 oraph (1), the Director shall—

24 “(A) consult with—

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG I NG I N0 B S e e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N e = NN - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O T NO S e

12

“(1) the Assistant Secretary of Energy
with responsibility for energy efficiency
and renewable energy programs; and

“(i1) the Deputy Administrator for
Defense Programs of the National Nuclear
Security Administration; and
“(B) seek to increase the participation and

advancement of women and underrepresented
minorities at every level of science, technology,
engineering, and mathematics education.”; and

(B) in paragraph (3)—

(i) in subparagraph (D), by striking
“and” at the end;

(i1) by redesignating subparagraph
(E) as subparagraph (F); and

(1) by inserting after subparagraph
(D) the following:

“(E) represent the Department as the
principal interagency liaison for all coordination
activities under the President for science, tech-
nology, engineering, and mathematics education
programs; and’’; and
(2) in subsection (d)—

(A) by striking “The Secretary” and in-

serting the following:

*S 1398 IS



O o0 N N W BB W =

e e . T e S =
whnm A W D = O

16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

13
“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary”; and

(B) by adding at the end the following:

“(2) REPORT.—Not later than 180 days after
the date of enactment of this subparagraph, the Di-
rector shall submit a report desceribing the impact of
the activities assisted with the Fund established
under paragraph (1) to—

“(A) the Committee on Science, Space,
and Technology of the House of Representa-
tives; and

“(B) the Committee on Energy and Nat-
ural Resources of the Senate.”.

(d) PROTECTING AMERICA’S COMPETITIVE EDGE
(PACE) GRADUATE FELLOWSHIP PROGRAM.—Section
5009 of the America COMPETES Act (42 U.S.C. 16536)

1s amended—

(1) in subsection (¢)

(A) in paragraph (1) by striking “, involv-
ing”’ and all that follows through “Secretary’;
and

(B) in paragraph (2), by striking subpara-
oraph (B) and inserting the following:

“(B) to demonstrate excellent academic

performance and understanding of scientific or

technical subjects; and”;

*S 1398 IS



AN W B~ W

14
(2) in subsection (d)(1)(B)(i), by inserting “full
or partial” before ‘“‘graduate tuition’; and
(3) in subsection (e), in the matter preceding
paragraph (1), by striking “Director of Science, En-
eineering, and Mathematics Education” and insert-
ing “Director of the Office of Science.”

O

*S 1398 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-06T05:43:55-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




