AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

1141H CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 8 3

To improve the efficiency and reliability of rail transportation by reforming
the Surface Transportation Board, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

Marco 24, 2015
Ms. BALDWIN introduced the following bill; which was read twice and referred
to the Committee on Commerce, Science, and Transportation

A BILL

To 1mprove the efficiency and reliability of rail transportation
by reforming the Surface Transportation Board, and for

other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
2 twes of the Unated States of America in Congress assembled,
3 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

4 This Act may be cited as the “Rail Shipper Fairness
5 Act of 20157,

6 SEC. 2. IMPROVING RAIL SERVICE.

7 (a) COMMON CARRIER OBLIGATIONS.—Section
8 11101(a) of title 49, United States Code, is amended by
9 inserting “‘, as necessary for the efficient and reliable



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

[\O T \© R (O R S i e e e e e e e T
DN = O 00N N R WD = O

23
24

2
transportation based on the shipper’s reasonable service
requirements,” after “the transportation or service”.

(b)  EMERGENCY  SERVICE ORDERS.—Section
11123(b) of such title is amended by adding at the end
the following:

“(4) The Board may issue emergency service orders
that cover shipments moving under contract if such ship-
ments are part of a regional service order issued in accord-
ance with this section.”.

(¢) REPORTS.—Section 11145(a) of such title 1s
amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “and” at the
end;

(2) by redesignating paragraph (2) as para-
eraph (3); and

(3) by inserting after paragraph (1) the fol-
lowing:

“(2) reports, service plans, or other documents
that cover shipments moving under contract if such
shipments are part of a general report, service plan,
or other document that generally covers the geo-

oraphic area or commodity; and”.

(d) EQUITABLE RELIEF; DAMAGES.—Section 11704

of such title i1s amended—

*S 853 IS



O o0 9 AN U B~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

3

“or subjected

(1) in subsection (a), by inserting
to inadequate or deficient service” after “injured’’;

(2) by amending subsection (b) to read as fol-
lows:

“(b) A rail carrier providing transportation subject
to the jurisdiction of the Board under this part is liable—

“(1) for damages sustained by a person as a re-
sult of an act or omission of that carrier in violation
of this part;

“(2) to a person for amounts charged to that
person that exceed the applicable rate for the trans-
portation; and

“(3) to a person for damages or equitable relief
as a result of inadequate or deficient service in viola-
tion of this part.”’; and

(3) 1n subsection (¢), by adding at the end the
following:

“(3) The Board may order a rail carrier to pay dam-
ages or to provide equitable relief, as appropriate, to a
person subjected to inadequate or deficient service as a
result of a violation of this part by that carrier.”.

(e) FINEs.—Section 11901 of such title is amend-

ed—
(1) in subsection (a), by striking “$5,000” and

inserting “$25,000";

*S 853 IS



4

1 (2) in subsection (c¢), by striking “$5,000” and
2 inserting “$25,000”’; and

3 (3) in subsection (e), by striking “$100” each
4 place such term appears and inserting “$1,000”.

5 SEC. 3. IMPROVING RAIL COMPETITION.

6 (a) RAIL TRANSPORTATION PoLICY.—Section 10101
7 of title 49, United States Code, is amended

8 (1) by redesignating paragraphs (14) and (15)
9 as paragraphs (15) and (16), respectively; and

10 (2) by inserting after paragraph (13) the fol-
11 lowing:

12 “(14) to provide for and promote the protection
13 of the shipping publie;”.

14 (b) RATES.—Section 10705 of such title 1s amended
15 by adding at the end the following:

16 “(d) Shippers may obtain rates to or from any inter-
17 change points of 2 or more rail carriers.”.

[S—
o0

(¢) MARKET DOMINANCE.—Section 10707(b) of such
19 title is amended by inserting “A rail carrier could have
20 market dominance even in circumstances in which a ship-

21 per is served by 2 carriers.”” after “‘the rate applies.”.

22 (d) TERMINAL KFACILITIES.—Section 11102(¢) of

23 such title is amended to read as follows:

24 “(e)(1) Except as provided in paragraph (2), the

25 Board shall require a Class 1 rail carrier to enter into

*S 853 IS



S O 0 N N B W

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
(US I S =N R e R N R ) S ) R T

5}
a competitive switching agreement if a shipper or receiver,
or a group of shippers or receivers, files a petition with
the Board that demonstrates, to the satisfaction of the
Board, that—

“(A) the facilities of the shipper or receiver for
whom such switching is sought are served by rail
only by a single, Class I rail carrier; and

“(B) subject to paragraph (4), there is, or can
be a working interchange between—

“(1) the Class I rail carrier serving the
shipper or receiver for whom such switching is
sought; and

“(11) another rail carrier within a reason-
able distance of the facilities of such shipper or
receiver,

“(2) Competitive switching may mnot be imposed
under this subsection if—

“(A) either rail carrier between which such
switching is to be established demonstrates that the
proposed switching is not feasible or is unsafe; or

“(B) the presence of reciprocal switching will
unduly restrict the ability of a rail carrier to serve

its own shippers.

*S 853 IS



16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

6
“(3) The requirement set forth in paragraph (1)(B)
is satisfied if each facility of the shipper or receiver for
which competitive switching is sought 15—
“(A) within the boundaries of a terminal of the
Class I rail carrier; or
“(B) within a 100-mile radius of an interchange
between the Class I rail carrier and another carrier
at which rail cars are regularly switched.”.

SEC. 4. IMPROVING REASONABLE RATE STANDARDS.

(a) STAND-ALONE COST CASES.—Section 10702 of
title 49, United States Code, is amended—
(1) by inserting “(a)” before “A rail carrier’;
and
(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(b)(1) The Board shall prohibit a rail carrier pro-
viding transportation subject to the jurisdiction of the
Board under this part to charge the challenged rate for
providing such transportation to rail customers while a
maximum reasonable rate case brought by such rail cus-
tomers is pending before the Board.

“(2) A rail customer may file a maximum reasonable
rate case with the Board after the date that is 2 years

before the date on which a common carrier shipment rate

18 anticipated to begin.

*S 853 IS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I O T O I N0 R S e e e e e Y e T e T
W = O O 0N N R, WD = O

7

“(3) The Board may not use cross-subsidy tests in
deciding stand-alone cost cases.

“(4) The Board shall use market-based revenue divi-
sions methodology in deciding stand-alone cost cases.

“(5) In a stand-alone cost case, if the Board deter-
mines that the rail carrier is revenue adequate, the rail
carrier shall have the burden of proof to demonstrate that
the railroad carrier is charging a reasonable rate.”.

(b) MARKET DOMINANCE.—Section 10707 of such
title, as amended by section 3(c¢), is further amended—

(1) in subsection (d)(1)(B), by adding at the
end the following “A shipper may introduce move-
ment-specific Uniform Rail Costing System cost cal-
culations.”; and

(2) by adding at the end the following:

“(e) In making a determination under this section,
the Board may not utilize a qualitative analysis in which
the Board attempts to identify any feasible transportation
alternatives that could be used by the shipper.”.

SEC. 5. REVENUE ADEQUACY.

(a) ELIMINATION OF REVENUE ADEQUACY TEST.—

Section 10704(a) of title 49, United States Code, is

amended by striking paragraph (3).

*S 853 IS



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 0O N O B BN WD = O

8

(b) RAILROAD COST OF CAPITAL.—Section 10704(a)

of such title, as amended by subsection (a), is further
amended by adding at the end the following:

“(3) In calculating a rail carrier’s cost of capital, the
Board shall multiply the value of the capital by the sum
of—

“(A) the current annual yield on a 10-year

United States Treasury Bond; and

“(B) a prospective market risk premium, which
shall not exceed 5 percent per year.”.

SEC. 6. SURFACE TRANSPORTATION BOARD STRUCTURAL

CHANGES.
Chapter 7 of title 49, United States Code, is amend-
ed—
(1) 1 section 701(b)—
(A) in paragraph (1)—
(1) by striking “3 members” and in-
serting “5 members”’; and
(i1) by striking “2 members” and in-
serting ‘3 members”’; and
(B) in paragraph (2)—
(i) by striking “time, at least 2 mem-
bers” and inserting the following: “‘time—
“(A) at least 2 members”’; and

*S 853 IS



O o0 N N B W

N N e T e T
whn A~ W D = O

9
(i) by striking ‘‘regulation, and at
least one member” and inserting the fol-
lowing: “‘regulation;
“(B) at least 2 members shall have a back-
oround in shipping or consumer advocacy; and
“(C) at least 1 member”’; and
(2) 1n section 703, by amending subsection (b)
to read as follows:

“(b) MEETINGS.

“(1) REGULAR MEETINGS.—The Board shall

meet regularly.

“(2) OPEN MEETINGS.—The Board shall be
deemed to be an agency of the United States Gov-
ernment and subject to the provisions set forth in

section HH2b of title 5.”.
O

*S 853 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2016-10-13T13:54:26-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




