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on the same subject for a period of no more 
than fourteen calendar days may be closed to 
the public on a motion made and seconded to 
go into closed session to discuss only wheth-
er the matters enumerated in clauses (1) 
through (6) would require the meeting to be 
closed, followed immediately by a record 
vote in open session by a majority of the 
members of the committee or subcommittee 
when it is determined that the matters to be 
discussed or the testimony to be taken at 
such meeting or meetings— 

(1) will disclose matters necessary to be 
kept secret in the interests of national de-
fense or the confidential conduct of the for-
eign relations of the United States; 

(2) will relate solely to matters of com-
mittee staff personnel or internal staff man-
agement or procedure; 

(3) will tend to charge an individual with 
crime or misconduct, to disgrace or injure 
the professional standing of an individual, or 
otherwise to expose an individual to public 
contempt or obloquy, or will represent a 
clearly unwarranted invasion of the privacy 
of an individual; 

(4) will disclose the identity of any in-
former or law enforcement agent or will dis-
close any information relating to the inves-
tigation or prosecution of a criminal offense 
that is required to be kept secret in the in-
terests of effective law enforcement; 

(5) will disclose information relating to the 
trade secrets of financial or commercial in-
formation pertaining specifically to a given 
person if— 

(A) an Act of Congress requires the infor-
mation to be kept confidential by Govern-
ment officers and employees; or 

(B) the information has been obtained by 
the Government on a confidential basis, 
other than through an application by such 
person for a specific Government financial or 
other benefit, and is required to be kept se-
cret in order to prevent undue injury to the 
competitive position of such person; or 

(6) may divulge matters required to be 
kept confidential under other provisions of 
law or Government regulations. 

(c) Whenever any hearing conducted by 
any such committee or subcommittee is 
open to the public, that hearing may be 
broadcast by radio or television, or both, 
under such rules as the committee or sub-
committee may adopt. 

(d) Whenever disorder arises during a com-
mittee meeting that is open to the public, or 
any demonstration of approval or dis-
approval is indulged in by any person in at-
tendance at any such meeting, it shall be the 
duty of the Chair to enforce order on his own 
initiative and without any point of order 
being made by a Senator. When the Chair 
finds it necessary to maintain order, he shall 
have the power to clear the room, and the 
committee may act in closed session for so 
long as there is doubt of the assurance of 
order. 

(e) Each committee shall prepare and keep 
a complete transcript or electronic recording 
adequate to fully record the proceeding of 
each meeting or conference whether or not 
such meeting or any part thereof is closed 
under this paragraph, unless a majority of 
its members vote to forgo such a record. 

* * * 

f 

COMMITTEE ON THE JUDICIARY 

RULES OF PROCEDURE 

Mr. GRASSLEY. Mr. President, the 
Committee on the Judiciary has adopt-
ed rules governing its procedures for 
the 114th Congress. Pursuant to rule 

XXVI, paragraph 2, of the Standing 
Rules of the Senate, I ask unanimous 
consent that a copy of the committee 
rules be printed in the RECORD. 

There being no objection, the mate-
rial was ordered to be printed in the 
RECORD, as follows: 
RULES OF PROCEDURE OF THE UNITED 

STATES SENATE COMMITTEE ON THE 
JUDICIARY—114TH CONGRESS 

I. MEETINGS OF THE COMMITTEE 
1. Meetings of the Committee may be 

called by the Chairman as he may deem nec-
essary on three days’ notice of the date, 
time, place and subject matter of the meet-
ing, or in the alternative with the consent of 
the Ranking Minority Member, or pursuant 
to the provision of the Standing Rules of the 
Senate, as amended. 

2. Unless a different date and time are set 
by the Chairman pursuant to (1) of this sec-
tion, Committee meetings shall be held be-
ginning at 10:00 a.m. on Thursdays the Sen-
ate is in session, which shall be the regular 
meeting day for the transaction of business. 

3. At the request of any member, or by ac-
tion of the Chairman, a bill, matter, or nom-
ination on the agenda of the Committee may 
be held over until the next meeting of the 
Committee or for one week, whichever oc-
curs later. 

II. HEARINGS OF THE COMMITTEE 
1. The Committee shall provide a public 

announcement of the date, time, place and 
subject matter of any hearing to be con-
ducted by the Committee or any Sub-
committee at least seven calendar days prior 
to the commencement of that hearing, un-
less the Chairman with the consent of the 
Ranking Minority Member determines that 
good cause exists to begin such hearing at an 
earlier date. Witnesses shall provide a writ-
ten statement of their testimony and cur-
riculum vitae to the Committee at least 24 
hours preceding the hearings in as many cop-
ies as the Chairman of the Committee or 
Subcommittee prescribes. 

2. In the event 14 calendar days’ notice of 
a hearing has been made, witnesses appear-
ing before the Committee, including any wit-
ness representing a Government agency, 
must file with the Committee at least 48 
hours preceding appearance written state-
ments of their testimony and curriculum 
vitae in as many copies as the Chairman of 
the Committee or Subcommittee prescribes. 

3. In the event a witness fails timely to file 
the written statement in accordance with 
this rule, the Chairman may permit the wit-
ness to testify, or deny the witness the privi-
lege of testifying before the Committee, or 
permit the witness to testify in response to 
questions from Senators without the benefit 
of giving an opening statement. 

III. QUORUMS 
1. Seven Members of the Committee, actu-

ally present, shall constitute a quorum for 
the purpose of discussing business. Nine 
Members of the Committee, including at 
least two Members of the minority, shall 
constitute a quorum for the purpose of 
transacting business. No bill, matter, or 
nomination shall be ordered reported from 
the Committee, however, unless a majority 
of the Committee is actually present at the 
time such action is taken and a majority of 
those present support the action taken. 

2. For the purpose of taking down sworn 
testimony, a quorum of the Committee and 
each Subcommittee thereof, now or here-
after appointed, shall consist of one Senator. 

IV. BRINGING A MATTER TO A VOTE 
The Chairman shall entertain a non-debat-

able motion to bring a matter before the 
Committee to a vote. If there is objection to 

bring the matter to a vote without further 
debate, a roll call vote of the Committee 
shall be taken, and debate shall be termi-
nated if the motion to bring the matter to a 
vote without further debate passes with elev-
en votes in the affirmative, one of which 
must be cast by the minority. 

V. AMENDMENTS 
1. Provided at least seven calendars days’ 

notice of the agenda is given, and the text of 
the proposed bill or resolution has been made 
available at least seven calendar days in ad-
vance, it shall not be in order for the Com-
mittee to consider any amendment in the 
first degree proposed to any measure under 
consideration by the Committee unless such 
amendment has been delivered to the office 
of the Committee and circulated via e-mail 
to each of the offices by at least 5:00 p.m. the 
day prior to the scheduled start of the meet-
ing. 

2. It shall be in order, without prior notice, 
for a Member to offer a motion to strike a 
single section of any bill, resolution, or 
amendment under consideration. 

3. The time limit imposed on the filing of 
amendments shall apply to no more than 
three bills identified by the Chairman and 
included on the Committee’s legislative 
agenda. 

4. This section of the rule may be waived 
by agreement of the Chairman and the Rank-
ing Minority Member. 

VI. PROXY VOTING 
When a recorded vote is taken in the Com-

mittee on any bill, resolution, amendment, 
or any other question, a quorum being 
present, Members who are unable to attend 
the meeting may submit votes by proxy, in 
writing or by telephone, or through personal 
instructions. A proxy must be specific with 
respect to the matters it addresses. 

VII. SUBCOMMITTEES 
1. Any Member of the Committee may sit 

with any Subcommittee during its hearings 
or any other meeting, but shall not have the 
authority to vote on any matter before the 
Subcommittee unless a Member of such Sub-
committee. 

2. Subcommittees shall be considered de 
novo whenever there is a change in the Sub-
committee chairmanship and seniority on 
the particular Subcommittee shall not nec-
essarily apply. 

3. Except for matters retained at the full 
Committee, matters shall be referred to the 
appropriate Subcommittee or Subcommit-
tees by the Chairman, except as agreed by a 
majority vote of the Committee or by the 
agreement of the Chairman and the Ranking 
Minority Member. 

4. Provided all members of the Sub-
committee consent, a bill or other matter 
may be polled out of the Subcommittee. In 
order to be polled out of a Subcommittee, a 
majority of the members of the Sub-
committee who vote must vote in favor of re-
porting the bill or matter to the Committee. 

VIII. ATTENDANCE RULES 
1. Official attendance at all Committee 

business meetings of the Committee shall be 
kept by the Committee Clerk. Official at-
tendance at all Subcommittee business 
meetings shall be kept by the Subcommittee 
Clerk. 

2. Official attendance at all hearings shall 
be kept, provided that Senators are notified 
by the Committee Chairman and Ranking 
Minority Member, in the case of Committee 
hearings, and by the Subcommittee Chair-
man and Ranking Minority Member, in the 
case of Subcommittee Hearings, 48 hours in 
advance of the hearing that attendance will 
be taken; otherwise, no attendance will be 
taken. Attendance at all hearings is encour-
aged. 
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COMMITTEE ON HOMELAND SECU-

RITY AND GOVERNMENTAL AF-
FAIRS 

RULES OF PROCEDURE 
Mr. JOHNSON. Mr. President, rule 

XXVI, paragraph 2, of the Standing 
Rules of the Senate requires each com-
mittee to adopt rules to govern the 
procedure of the committee and to pub-
lish those rules in the CONGRESSIONAL 
RECORD not later than March 1 of the 
first year of each Congress. Today, the 
Committee on Homeland Security and 
Governmental Affairs adopted Com-
mittee Rules of Procedure. 

Consistent with Standing Rule XXVI, 
I ask unanimous consent to have a 
copy of the Rules of Procedure of the 
Committee on Homeland Security and 
Governmental Affairs printed in the 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD. 

There being no objection, the mate-
rial was ordered to be printed in the 
RECORD, as follows: 
RULES OF PROCEDURE OF THE COM-

MITTEE ON HOMELAND SECURITY AND 
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS 
PURSUANT TO RULE XXVI, SEC. 2, STANDING 

RULES OF THE SENATE 
RULE 1. MEETINGS AND MEETING PROCEDURES 

OTHER THAN HEARINGS 
A. Meeting dates. The Committee shall 

hold its regular meetings on the first 
Wednesday of each month, when the Con-
gress is in session, or at such other times as 
the Chairman shall determine. Additional 
meetings may be called by the Chairman as 
he/she deems necessary to expedite Com-
mittee business. (Rule XXVI, Sec. 3, Stand-
ing Rules of the Senate.) 

B. Calling special Committee meetings. If 
at least three Members of the Committee de-
sire the Chairman to call a special meeting, 
they may file in the offices of the Committee 
a written request therefor, addressed to the 
Chairman. Immediately thereafter, the clerk 
of the Committee shall notify the Chairman 
of such request. If, within 3 calendar days 
after the filing of such request, the Chair-
man fails to call the requested special meet-
ing, which is to be held within 7 calendar 
days after the filing of such request, a major-
ity of the Committee Members may file in 
the offices of the Committee their written 
notice that a special Committee meeting 
will be held, specifying the date and hour 
thereof, and the Committee shall meet on 
that date and hour. Immediately upon the 
filing of such notice, the Committee chief 
clerk shall notify all Committee Members 
that such special meeting will be held and 
inform them of its date and hour. (Rule 
XXVI, Sec. 3, Standing Rules of the Senate.) 

C. Meeting notices and agenda. Written no-
tices of Committee meetings, accompanied 
by an agenda, enumerating the items of busi-
ness to be considered, shall be sent to all 
Committee Members at least 5 days in ad-
vance of such meetings, excluding Satur-
days, Sundays, and legal holidays in which 
the Senate is not in session. The written no-
tices required by this Rule may be provided 
by electronic mail. In the event that unfore-
seen requirements or Committee business 
prevent a 5-day notice of either the meeting 
or agenda, the Committee staff shall commu-
nicate such notice and agenda, or any revi-
sions to the agenda, as soon as practicable 
by telephone or otherwise to Members or ap-
propriate staff assistants in their offices. 

D. Open business meetings. Meetings for 
the transaction of Committee or Sub-

committee business shall be conducted in 
open session, except that a meeting or series 
of meetings on the same subject for a period 
of no more than 14 calendar days may be 
closed to the public on a motion made and 
seconded to go into closed session to discuss 
only whether the matters enumerated in 
clauses (1) through (6) below would require 
the meeting to be closed, followed imme-
diately by a record vote in open session by a 
majority of the Committee or Subcommittee 
Members when it is determined that the 
matters to be discussed or the testimony to 
be taken at such meeting or meetings— 

(1) will disclose matters necessary to be 
kept secret in the interests of national de-
fense or the confidential conduct of foreign 
relations of the United States; 

(2) will relate solely to matters of Com-
mittee or Subcommittee staff personnel or 
internal staff management or procedure; 

(3) will tend to charge an individual with 
crime or misconduct, to disgrace or injure 
the professional standing of an individual, or 
otherwise expose an individual to public con-
tempt or obloquy or will represent a clearly 
unwarranted invasion of the privacy of an in-
dividual; 

(4) will disclose the identity of an informer 
or law enforcement agent or will disclose 
any information relating to the investiga-
tion or prosecution of a criminal offense that 
is required to be kept secret in the interests 
of effective law enforcement; 

(5) will disclose information relating to the 
trade secrets of financial or commercial in-
formation pertaining specifically to a given 
person if— 

(A) an Act of Congress requires the infor-
mation to be kept confidential by Govern-
ment officers and employees; or 

(B) the information has been obtained by 
the Government on a confidential basis, 
other than through an application by such 
person for a specific Government financial or 
other benefit, and is required to be kept se-
cret in order to prevent undue injury to the 
competitive position of such person; or 

(6) may divulge matters required to be 
kept confidential under other provisions of 
law or Government regulations. (Rule XXVI, 
Sec. 5(b), Standing Rules of the Senate.) Not-
withstanding the foregoing, whenever dis-
order arises during a Committee or Sub-
committee meeting that is open to the pub-
lic, or any demonstration of approval or dis-
approval is indulged in by any person in at-
tendance at any such meeting, it shall be the 
duty of the Chairman to enforce order on his 
or her own initiative and without any point 
of order being made by a Member of the 
Committee or Subcommittee; provided, fur-
ther, that when the Chairman finds it nec-
essary to maintain order, he/she shall have 
the power to clear the room, and the Com-
mittee or Subcommittee may act in closed 
session for so long as there is doubt of the as-
surance of order. (Rule XXVI, Sec. 5(d), 
Standing Rules of the Senate.) 

E. Prior notice of first degree amendments. 
It shall not be in order for the Committee, or 
a Subcommittee thereof, to consider any 
amendment in the first degree proposed to 
any measure under consideration by the 
Committee or Subcommittee unless a writ-
ten copy of such amendment has been deliv-
ered to each Member of the Committee or 
Subcommittee, as the case may be, and to 
the office of the Committee or Sub-
committee, by no later than 5:00 p.m. two 
days before the meeting of the Committee or 
Subcommittee at which the amendment is to 
be proposed. The written copy of amend-
ments in the first degree required by this 
Rule may be provided by electronic mail. 
This subsection may be waived by a majority 
of the Members present, or by consent of the 
Chairman and Ranking Minority Member of 

the Committee or Subcommittee. This sub-
section shall apply only when at least 72 
hours written notice of a session to mark-up 
a measure is provided to the Committee or 
Subcommittee. 

F. Meeting transcript. The Committee or 
Subcommittee shall prepare and keep a com-
plete transcript or electronic recording ade-
quate to fully record the proceeding of each 
meeting whether or not such meeting or any 
part thereof is closed to the public, unless a 
majority of the Committee or Subcommittee 
Members vote to forgo such a record. (Rule 
XXVI, Sec. 5(e), Standing Rules of the Sen-
ate.) 

RULE 2. QUORUMS 
A. Reporting measures and matters. A ma-

jority of the Members of the Committee 
shall constitute a quorum for reporting to 
the Senate any measures, matters or rec-
ommendations. (Rule XXVI, Sec. 7(a)(1), 
Standing Rules of the Senate.) 

B. Transaction of routine business. One- 
third of the membership of the Committee 
shall constitute a quorum for the trans-
action of routine business, provided that one 
Member of the Minority is present. For the 
purpose of this paragraph, the term ‘‘routine 
business’’ includes the convening of a meet-
ing and the consideration of any business of 
the Committee other than reporting to the 
Senate any measures, matters or rec-
ommendations. (Rule XXVI, Sec. 7(a)(1), 
Standing Rules of the Senate.) 

C. Taking testimony. One Member of the 
Committee shall constitute a quorum for 
taking sworn or unsworn testimony. (Rule 
XXVI, Sec. 7(a)(2) and 7(c)(2), Standing Rules 
of the Senate.) 

D. Subcommittee quorums. Subject to the 
provisions of sections 7(a)(1) and (2) of Rule 
XXVI of the Standing Rules of the Senate, 
the Subcommittees of this Committee are 
authorized to establish their own quorums 
for the transaction of business and the tak-
ing of sworn testimony. 

E. Proxies prohibited in establishment of 
quorum. Proxies shall not be considered for 
the establishment of a quorum. 

RULE 3. VOTING 
A. Quorum required. Subject to the provi-

sions of subsection (E), no vote may be taken 
by the Committee, or any Subcommittee 
thereof, on any measure or matter unless a 
quorum, as prescribed in the preceding sec-
tion, is actually present. 

B. Reporting measures and matters. No 
measure, matter or recommendation shall be 
reported from the Committee unless a ma-
jority of the Committee Members are actu-
ally present, and the vote of the Committee 
to report a measure or matter shall require 
the concurrence of a majority of those Mem-
bers who are actually present at the time the 
vote is taken. (Rule XXVI, Sec. 7(a)(1) and 
(3), Standing Rules of the Senate.) 

C. Proxy voting. Proxy voting shall be al-
lowed on all measures and matters before the 
Committee, or any Subcommittee thereof, 
except that, when the Committee, or any 
Subcommittee thereof, is voting to report a 
measure or matter, proxy votes shall be al-
lowed solely for the purposes of recording a 
Member’s position on the pending question. 
Proxy voting shall be allowed only if the ab-
sent Committee or Subcommittee Member 
has been informed of the matter on which he 
or she is being recorded and has affirma-
tively requested that he or she be so re-
corded. All proxies shall be filed with the 
chief clerk of the Committee or Sub-
committee thereof, as the case may be. All 
proxies shall be in writing and shall contain 
sufficient reference to the pending matter as 
is necessary to identify it and to inform the 
Committee or Subcommittee as to how the 
Member establishes his or her vote to be re-
corded thereon. (Rule XXVI, Sec. 7(a)(3) and 
7(c)(1), Standing Rules of the Senate.) 
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