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During his 36-year tenure as head 

coach, Smith led the Tar Heels to 879 
wins and 13 ACC tournament cham-
pionships. His teams reached the Final 
Four 11 times and won two national ti-
tles. He also coached the U.S. men’s 
basketball team to an Olympic Gold 
Medal in 1976. 

But Smith was more than just a col-
lege basketball icon. He was a deeply 
religious man who placed a strong em-
phasis on education. More than 96 per-
cent of his players received their de-
grees. An unwavering supporter of civil 
rights, he recruited the first Black 
scholarship athlete at UNC. 

While he never sought accolades for 
his actions, he received the Presi-
dential Medal of Freedom, which is the 
Nation’s highest civilian honor, in 2013. 

Coach Smith was a remarkable man, 
and North Carolina was lucky to call 
him one of our own. 
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VETERANS HEALTH CARE 
IMPROVEMENT ACT 

(Ms. BROWNLEY of California asked 
and was given permission to address 
the House for 1 minute.) 

Ms. BROWNLEY of California. Mr. 
Speaker, I am so honored to serve a 
second term as ranking member of the 
House Veterans’ Affairs Subcommittee 
on Health. I look forward to working 
with my colleagues on both sides of the 
aisle to help Ventura County’s vet-
erans and veterans across America ac-
cess VA health care and benefits and to 
break down bureaucratic barriers to 
care at the VA. 

There is no commitment I take more 
seriously than to the men and women 
who have served our country. That is 
why I introduced the Veterans Health 
Care Improvement Act as my first bill 
in the 114th Congress. My bill would 
help guarantee adequate resources for 
veterans health care benefits by requir-
ing the GAO to continue verifying the 
accuracy and adequacy of the VA’s 
budget for medical care. 

I urge my colleagues to cosponsor 
this legislation with me. 

f 

REMEMBERING PRESIDENT 
LINCOLN 

(Mr. HULTGREN asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. HULTGREN. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today on the birthday of a man whose 
name is synonymous with my home 
State of Illinois, the Land of Lincoln. 
It is the time of year when we remem-
ber the great deeds of our Presidents 
and their important actions in times of 
crisis. 

President Lincoln knew crisis. Gen-
erations note his firm resolve in the 
face of a ‘‘House divided against 
itself’’; his faithfulness in serving a 
country when half of it was bent and 
betting on his failure; and his growing 
faith in the ‘‘gracious hand which pre-
served us in peace and multiplied and 
enriched and strengthened us.’’ 

Our Nation was on the verge of col-
lapse, but he never wavered, he never 
tired, he never backed down from the 
challenge. He challenges us to rise to 
the ‘‘great tasks’’ before us and meet 
them head on. 
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GOP DHS TANTRUM 

(Mr. YARMUTH asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. YARMUTH. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to call on my Republican col-
leagues to not let their immigration 
reform politics weaken border security, 
paralyze our ports, and shut down the 
Department of Homeland Security cre-
ated in the wake of 9/11. 

If we do not pass a clean funding bill, 
more than 20 percent of FEMA per-
sonnel will be furloughed, crippling our 
ability to respond to disasters; man-
agement and support of our entire 
homeland security infrastructure 
would shut down; and essential per-
sonnel would be forced to work without 
pay. 

That is 40,000 Border Patrol agents 
and Customs officers risking their lives 
for free because of a political stunt. 
That is 50,000 TSA screeners who guard 
our nationwide travel, keeping the 
USA safe, yet going without pay be-
cause the Republican leadership is put-
ting politics ahead of security. And it 
is more than 40,000 Active Duty Coast 
Guard officers standing guard on our 
shores, proudly serving a country 
whose political leaders don’t seem to 
care if they get paid for their sacrifice. 

Mr. Speaker, the stakes are too high. 
The risk is too real. Republicans need 
to stop their anti-immigrant tantrum 
and end this dangerous game. Pass a 
clean DHS funding bill today to protect 
our great Nation. 
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A ‘‘NO’’ VOTE ON PRESIDENT’S 
AUTHORIZATION REQUEST 

(Mr. MCCLINTOCK asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. MCCLINTOCK. Mr. Speaker, 
when we send our soldiers into harm’s 
way, we have a solemn obligation to 
back them with the full might and re-
sources that our country can muster 
and to give them the widest possible 
latitude for action. MacArthur was 
right: 

In war, there is no substitute for victory. 

The President proposes something 
very different: war by half measure; 
war on the cheap; war with dangerous 
restrictions on our troops; war with no 
clear objective other than to pull out 
in 3 years. 

I will not vote for the authorization 
that the President has requested. 
Given his obvious irresolution, I think 
the best immediate course for the 
United States is to assure that the re-
gional powers currently engaged 
against the Islamic State have the ma-
terial support they require. 

DHS SPENDING BILL 

(Mr. SARBANES asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. SARBANES. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to urge the Republican leader-
ship to bring a clean funding bill for 
the Department of Homeland Security 
to this floor. 

The Department of Homeland Secu-
rity provides vital programs and serv-
ices that ensure the American public’s 
safety. This Congress must also ensure 
that DHS has adequate funding to con-
tinue its important and effective work 
protecting our borders, our ports, our 
aviation systems, and all of our com-
munities across the country. Without 
funding, DHS will be forced to shut 
down critical counterterrorism and 
natural disaster programs that safe-
guard millions of Americans. 

It is the height of irresponsibility for 
Republicans to hold DHS funding hos-
tage for the sole purpose—and the dan-
gerous purpose—of partisan politics. 
Instead of putting forth a clean DHS 
funding bill, Republicans put forward 
legislation that is littered with unre-
lated policy riders. 

We all agree that withholding fund-
ing for DHS is bad for our Nation’s 
safety and security, so let’s pass a 
clean DHS funding bill and debate 
these separate issues on their own mer-
its. It is time for the House to pass a 
clean DHS funding proposal and stop 
playing games with the safety and the 
security of the American people. 

f 
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HONORING THE SERVICE OF 
CORPORAL C.G. BOLDEN 

(Mr. HILL asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. HILL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
in honor of U.S. Army Corporal C.G. 
Bolden, a Clinton, Arkansas, native 
and veteran of the Korean conflict. 

In January 1951, Corporal Bolden was 
taken prisoner of war in Korea; and at 
that time, his wife, Geraldean, and 3- 
year-old son, Larry, were notified that 
he was missing in action. Tragically, 
that same year, Corporal Bolden died 
of malnutrition under horrific condi-
tions in a North Korean POW camp. 

In 1993, his remains were among 
those returned to the United States, 
and through innovative DNA testing, 
scientists at the Joint POW/MIA Ac-
counting Command identified Corporal 
Bolden’s remains and determined his 
cause of death. 

On February 21, after decades of un-
answered questions, Corporal Bolden 
will be laid to rest in his hometown of 
Clinton, Arkansas, and I am honored to 
join his family to remember him and 
welcome him home. 

Corporal Bolden gave the ultimate 
sacrifice for his country, and his life is 
an example for all Americans and all 
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