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FREDERICA WILSON of Florida for being 
a champion on this issue. 

f 

CONGRATULATIONS TO THE DUKE 
UNIVERSITY BASKETBALL TEAM 
(Mr. BUTTERFIELD asked and was 

given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. BUTTERFIELD. Madam Speak-
er, I rise to congratulate Duke Univer-
sity and its Division I men’s basketball 
team on winning the 2015 national 
championship. Duke’s win against the 
University of Wisconsin at Madison 
marks their fifth national champion-
ship victory. 

At the team’s helm is the winningest 
coach in Division I men’s basketball 
history, legendary coach Mike 
Krzyzewski. We refer to him as Coach 
K. This year’s team, led by senior 
Quinn Cook, continued the tradition of 
excellence in my district in Durham, 
North Carolina, by earning the 88th 
schoolwide NCAA tournament victory. 
Even more impressive, Madam Speak-
er, is the fact that the Duke University 
Blue Devils had five All-ACC Academic 
players, which is the most in the 
school’s history. 

Today I introduced a resolution, 
along with my colleagues, to recognize 
the team for its extraordinary achieve-
ment. I urge quick consideration of my 
resolution and encourage my col-
leagues to support it. 

Madam Speaker, I ask all of my col-
leagues to join me in congratulating 
the Duke University Blue Devils on 
their historic tournament win. 

f 

ONE-YEAR ANNIVERSARY OF THE 
BOKO HARAM KIDNAPPING OF 
NIGERIAN SCHOOLGIRLS 
(Ms. MAXINE WATERS of California 

asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute.) 

Ms. MAXINE WATERS of California. 
Madam Speaker, a year and a day ago 
today, 276 innocent Nigerian school-
girls were tragically taken away from 
their boarding school and their family. 

One year later, more than 200 of 
these girls are still missing, and Boko 
Haram continues to prey on the Nige-
rian people. The kidnapping of these 
schoolgirls is just one example of the 
appalling acts of terror committed by 
this group, who, according to the 
Human Rights Watch, have killed more 
than 2,000 people and forced 800,000 
children to be displaced from their 
homes. 

We simply must do more to combat 
their efforts. 

I commend President Obama for pub-
licly expressing his willingness to as-
sist Nigeria in its efforts to dismantle 
this group. 

Additionally, I encourage the incom-
ing President of Nigeria, President 
Buhari, to remain committed to his 
pledge to implement an aggressive ef-
fort to combat Boko Haram and to pro-
tect his citizens. 

I hope, with the anniversary of these 
attacks upon us, we are all regalva-

nized to do what we can to bring back 
our girls and protect our other inno-
cent citizens from any future attacks. 

I thank Congresswoman FREDERICA 
WILSON for her leadership on this issue. 

f 

BOKO HARAM IS A CRIMINAL 
ORGANIZATION 

(Ms. MOORE asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Ms. MOORE. Madam Speaker, it is 
very heartbreaking to think that it has 
been a whole year since our girls, 276 
girls, were kidnapped by Boko Haram 
in Nigeria. I think the importance of 
memorializing this is to talk about the 
nature of terror and its cruelty, to 
take these children, these babies, away 
in the name of religion. 

It is extremely important for us to 
galvanize all around the world and to 
focus on the main thing. The main 
thing is these are criminal organiza-
tions. These are not religiously moti-
vated people. These are people who will 
maim, cripple, and kill anyone for 
their political objectives. 

I want to thank FREDERICA WILSON 
for her leadership in bringing us all to-
gether today, and Mrs. MALONEY from 
New York, and I pray that our resolve 
will be reignited today. 

f 

PAYCHECK FAIRNESS ACT 

(Mr. DESAULNIER asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. DESAULNIER. Madam Speaker, I 
rise today in support of the Paycheck 
Fairness Act. According to the U.S. 
Census Bureau, in 2013, women who 
worked full time earned, on average, 
only 78 cents for every dollar a man 
earned. The figures are even worse for 
women of color. African American 
women earned only approximately 64 
cents and Latinas only 56 cents for 
each dollar earned by a White male. 
This is absolutely and unequivocally 
unacceptable in the United States of 
America. The average woman would 
have lost $420,000 throughout her work-
ing lifetime as a result of this pay gap. 

In my district, women make up 51 
percent of the population, yet there is 
still a 76.4 percent wage gap in their 
annual median earnings. That is why I 
am a sponsor of the Paycheck Fairness 
Act, which would work to close the 
gender wage gap by requiring employ-
ers to demonstrate that wage differen-
tials are based on factors other than 
sex, and strengthening penalties for 
equal pay violations. 

Families increasingly rely on wom-
en’s wages to make ends meet. Equal 
pay is not simply a women’s issue; it is 
a family issue. 

f 

SMALL BUSINESS TAX 

(Mr. CURBELO of Florida asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute.) 

Mr. CURBELO of Florida. Madam 
Speaker, small businesses are vital to 
the strength and dynamism of the 
American economy, generating 63 per-
cent of new private sector jobs over the 
past two decades. But it’s not just 
about the entrepreneurs. It is also 
about helping workers that depend on 
small businesses for their paycheck, 
whether it be young people paying 
down their college loans, immigrants 
hoping to provide a better life for their 
loved ones, or moms and dads looking 
for a little more income while the kids 
are at school. Small businesses not 
only strengthen Main Street, they play 
a vital role in keeping our neighbors 
prosperous. 

One of the many challenges that 
small businesses face is a cumbersome 
and overbearing Tax Code. Most small 
businesses file their taxes as S corpora-
tions or sole proprietorships, both of 
which are taxed at individual rates. 

Congress needs to get serious about 
reforming and simplifying the Tax 
Code. Creating a broader, flatter tax 
base will allow for lower rates for both 
individuals and businesses. I look for-
ward to working with my colleagues to 
find ways to reform our Tax Code so 
small businesses and their workers can 
thrive. 

f 

HONORING ABRAHAM LINCOLN 

(Mr. CROWLEY asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. CROWLEY. Madam Speaker, I 
was tempted to rise when my friend 
Mr. MCCARTHY from California was 
speaking of the great, late President 
Abraham Lincoln and his legacy—real-
ly, a dichotomy of a man, a very com-
plicated individual. We know of his 
great achievements, of ending slavery, 
of maintaining our Union—great 
achievements—and very difficult 
achievements for him as well, passing 
the 13th Amendment. 

We think of how dysfunctional, 
maybe, Congress is today and the lack 
of cooperation. Under the conditions 
that then-President Lincoln was oper-
ating, it is a marvel that he was able to 
pass such incredible legislation with 
such ramifications, and positively. 

But I think one of the great things 
about Lincoln that oft times goes un-
noticed is one of the legacies that was 
unintended by himself directly: he dies. 
He is shot on the 14th of April 1865. He 
dies on the 15th of April 1865. 

One of the greatest things about 
Abraham Lincoln is, on the 16th of 
April, the Sun rose again on the Repub-
lic of the United States, a better na-
tion for his having lived, but continued 
despite his absence. How wonderful a 
legacy is that, that this Republic, 
greater than any man or woman, lives 
on, a better place for him having lived. 

May God rest the soul of Abraham 
Lincoln. 
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