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Rushing this process is an easy tactic 

to try to silence a reasonable opposi-
tion, but, based on our country’s his-
tory of making trade deals that drive 
up our trade deficit and outsource mil-
lions of U.S. jobs, the American people 
should be alarmed. I and many others 
are sounding that alarm. 

Japan is one of the most significant 
partners in this agreement, and it is 
the world’s second largest currency 
manipulator and is one of the leading 
protectionist markets in the Pacific. 
They have much to gain from a weak 
trade agreement. 

Japan is the world’s third largest 
automobile market, but 96 percent of 
that market belongs only to Japanese 
automobiles. Since 2000, we have been 
able to sell 183,000 cars there, but guess 
how many they sold here—16.3 million. 
That is 89,000 to 1. 

There is something wrong with try-
ing to work a deal that rewards a coun-
try whose markets are closed. We need 
a new trade model that creates jobs in 
America again and that does not re-
ward currency manipulators and pro-
tectionist markets. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO DONALD S. POWERS 

(Mr. ROKITA asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. ROKITA. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to honor a significant Hoosier, 
Mr. Donald S. Powers, who passed away 
on April 21, 2015. 

I would like to express my gratitude 
for his community service and eco-
nomic development efforts in my 
hometown of Munster, Indiana. Most 
importantly to me, he was a friend and 
a mentor who was always ready to pro-
vide some guidance. More than that, 
those who claim northwest Indiana as 
their home can also rightfully claim 
the same kind of relationship with Don 
Powers. 

Mr. Powers proudly fought for our 
Nation during World War II as a Navy 
fighter pilot and then again in the Ko-
rean war. He was a graduate of Indi-
ana’s beloved Purdue University where 
he spent several years as president of 
the board of trustees. 

Mr. Powers went on to develop much 
of Munster’s residential neighborhoods; 
and, in 1973, Mr. Powers took part in 
the creation of Community Hospital, 
which was voted as one of America’s 50 
best hospitals 7 years in a row. In 1989, 
he developed the Center for the Visual 
and Performing Arts, home to the 
Northwest Indiana Symphony Orches-
tra and South Shore Arts. 

His efforts in developing Munster led 
to nationwide accolades for the com-
munity, even having the town make 
Forbes Magazine’s 25 top suburbs for 
retirement. Mr. Powers was highly re-
garded in the community and through-
out Indiana for his philanthropic and 
business endeavors. 

Indiana and, indeed, the Nation, Mr. 
Speaker, lost one of its best leaders 

this week, but his legacy will certainly 
endure in the many lives he positively 
affected. 

f 

ENLIST ACT 

(Mr. DENHAM asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. DENHAM. Mr. Speaker, this 
afternoon, I, once again, introduced the 
ENLIST Act. 

The ENLIST Act would give young 
adults who came here through no fault 
of their own, who have graduated from 
our high schools, who can pass a back-
ground check, who can speak English, 
and whom the military is asking for to 
protect and defend the Nation that 
they know and love the opportunity to 
actually sign up for the military, to 
wear the cloth of our Nation, and put 
their lives on the line. 

At the end of an honorable term, 
they would be eligible for permanent 
residence in the United States of Amer-
ica. 

This is an act of patriotism. This is 
an opportunity to create a greater na-
tional defense and an opportunity for 
those kids who know of no other coun-
try to call home to actually pledge al-
legiance and be patriots of this great 
Nation. 

f 

FAST TRACK AND MARRIAGE 
EQUALITY 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under 
the Speaker’s announced policy of Jan-
uary 6, 2015, the gentlewoman from 
New Jersey (Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN) is 
recognized for 60 minutes as the des-
ignee of the minority leader. 

GENERAL LEAVE 

Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN. Mr. 
Speaker, I ask unanimous consent that 
all Members have 5 legislative days to 
revise and extend their remarks and to 
include extraneous material on the 
subject of my Special Order. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is there 
objection to the request of the gentle-
woman from New Jersey? 

There was no objection. 
Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN. Mr. 

Speaker, in just a few months in Wash-
ington, I have learned that there is al-
ways something going on, and this 
week is no exception to that rule. In 
the coming days, two very important 
actions may change life for many of 
my constituents and Americans across 
the country. 

Last week, the chairman of the Ways 
and Means Committee, Mr. RYAN, in-
troduced the Bipartisan Congressional 
Trade Priorities and Accountability 
Act of 2015, legislation that would 
allow the President to negotiate and to 
sign trade agreements with limited 
congressional oversight. The Com-
mittee on Ways and Means has re-
ported that legislation out, and I imag-
ine we will be considering it on the 
floor in short order. 

Next week, the U.S. Supreme Court 
will hear arguments in Obergefell v. 
Hodges, which is a case that has the 
potential to decide once and for all 
whether every American, regardless of 
sexual orientation, should have the 
right to marry and should have access 
to all of the legal rights and benefits 
we afford married couples. 

Mr. Speaker, my colleagues and I 
plan to address both of these important 
issues on the floor of the people’s 
House this afternoon. I want to start 
by talking about the legislation that 
was reported out by the Ways and 
Means Committee this week. 

If Congress authorizes TPA’s fast- 
track authority, this President and 
every President elected after him will 
have the unprecedented authority to 
negotiate and sign sweeping trade 
agreements with little opportunity for 
Congress to intercede on behalf of the 
many Americans those deals inevitably 
impact. 

In the past, those agreements haven’t 
turned out great for American workers 
here at home, which is all the more im-
portant reason that Congress should be 
able to retain the ability to fight for 
what is in the best interests of our con-
stituents. After 6 years of secretive ne-
gotiations for the Trans-Pacific Part-
nership agreement, we haven’t been 
given much motivation to release any 
of this oversight. 

Offering fast-track authority for the 
TPP means that we press fast-forward 
on policies that put American families’ 
health at risk on policies that are chal-
lenging our chemical safeguards, on 
policies allowing unregulated and po-
tentially contaminated food products 
into the United States. 

We lose our chance to question poli-
cies that would allow foreign corpora-
tions to skirt our courts and demand 
taxpayer compensation when they feel 
they have been violated by U.S. laws. 

Our constituents are relying on us to 
stand up for their interests on TPP and 
on every future trade agreement to 
come down the line. We cannot pass 
the buck on this, and I know that our 
first speaker today agrees with me. 

I want to talk a little bit about the 
State of New Jersey because the State 
of New Jersey has seen what can hap-
pen when trade deals go bad: factories 
close, employees are laid off, and cities 
that have previously made things that 
have been bought by consumers around 
the world are suddenly faced with 
stunted economies and surges in unem-
ployment. 

My capital district—‘‘Trenton 
makes, the World Takes’’—is an illus-
tration of what was a great economy in 
that locale. That is why it is so impor-
tant that this body ensures we only 
sign these agreements when we are 
sure they will help, not hurt, working 
families. 

I yield now to another Member who 
is deeply familiar with the issues in 
New Jersey, my friend and my fellow 
freshman from New Jersey (Mr. NOR-
CROSS). 
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