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Senate 
The Senate met at 9:30 a.m. and was 

called to order by the President pro 
tempore (Mr. HATCH). 

f 

PRAYER 

The Chaplain, Dr. Barry C. Black, of-
fered the following prayer: 

Let us pray. 
Answer us when we call, O God, and 

bless our Nation. 
May our lawmakers work to do Your 

will, remembering that You have set 
apart the Godly for yourself. Inspire 
our Senators to find refuge in You and 
to discover blessings and joy in Your 
favor. 

Lord, continue to supply our needs 
according to Your riches in glory, en-
couraging us to learn contentment by 
trusting the unfolding of Your loving 
providence. Keep us from stumbling or 
slipping as we find safety by walking 
with integrity. 

Eternal God, to Your precious Name 
we ascribe glory, majesty and might, 
dominion and power, now and always. 
Amen. 

f 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

The President pro tempore led the 
Pledge of Allegiance, as follows: 

I pledge allegiance to the Flag of the 
United States of America, and to the Repub-
lic for which it stands, one nation under God, 
indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 

f 

RECOGNITION OF THE MAJORITY 
LEADER 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 
PAUL). The majority leader is recog-
nized. 

f 

KENTUCKY FLOODING 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, this 
morning we are all thinking of the 
many Kentuckians who have been im-
pacted by severe flooding over the past 
couple of days. Eastern Kentucky has 

been especially hard hit. Governor 
Beshear has declared a state of emer-
gency, and the Kentucky delegation 
stands ready to assist in this effort. 

The tragic flooding has already 
claimed two lives in Johnson County. 
Six remain missing. Others were forced 
to watch as homes and cherished 
memories were swept away. We can 
only imagine what these Kentuckians 
and their families must be going 
through. 

This has been an especially trying 
task for our first responders as well. 
They have had to battle against debris 
and downed power lines. They have 
worked to rescue Kentuckians from 
trees. It hasn’t been easy, but it re-
minds us again of why we owe these 
men and women so very much. I join 
Kentuckians in thanking them for all 
they have done and all they continue 
to do. 

f 

NUCLEAR AGREEMENT WITH IRAN 
Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, on 

an entirely different matter, I said yes-
terday the Senate would thoroughly re-
view the White House deal with Iran. I 
said we would hold hearings and we 
would call witnesses and ultimately 
vote to approve or disapprove the deal 
in accordance with the Iran Nuclear 
Agreement Review Act. That is what 
we have long planned to do, and once 
the administration fully transmits the 
text, that is just what we will do. 

Senators are already taking a close 
look at what they have been able to get 
their hands on thus far, but the Senate 
eagerly awaits the full transmission of 
that text and the required certifi-
cations. We await the beginning of a 
comprehensive review process premised 
on a simple question: Can the agree-
ment meet its essential test of leaving 
our country and our allies safer? 

f 

EVERY CHILD ACHIEVES ACT 
Mr. MCCONNELL. Finally, Mr. Presi-

dent, turning to the business currently 

before the Senate, the bipartisan edu-
cation debate we are having in the new 
Senate is good for our country and it 
was long overdue. 

For too long, bureaucrats in Wash-
ington tried to dictate top-down, one- 
size-fits-all education policies to mil-
lions of students and families across 
our country. It was hurting our kids, 
and it needed to change. So a new Sen-
ate that is back to work for the Amer-
ican people decided to work together to 
do something about it. We thought it 
was past time to place more education 
decisionmaking power where it truly 
belongs—with parents, with teachers, 
with States, and with school boards, 
not with a distant Federal bureauc-
racy. 

The pundits said Washington could 
never address these challenges, but the 
bipartisan Every Child Achieves Act 
actually received unanimous support 
from every Democrat and every Repub-
lican in committee. Just think about 
that for a moment. It is an impressive 
achievement, and it wouldn’t have been 
possible without a functioning Senate 
and a lot of dedication and determina-
tion from the bill’s primary sponsors, 
the Republican Senator from Ten-
nessee and the Democratic Senator 
from Washington. 

This debate may be years overdue, 
but Republicans and Democrats are 
certainly having their voices heard 
today. They are working across the 
aisle, they are representing the views 
of their constituents, and they are of-
fering amendments. The new Senate 
has processed over two dozen amend-
ments to this bill already, and we have 
adopted quite a few of them. In fact, we 
have now taken more rollcall amend-
ment votes this year in the new Con-
gress than throughout the entirety of 
the last Congress combined. That is an 
achievement both parties can cele-
brate. It represents progress for our 
country. And this afternoon we have a 
chance to make more because, with co-
operation from our friends across the 
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aisle, we can continue to advance the 
Every Child Achieves Act later today 
and set up final passage soon. That 
would mean another bipartisan 
achievement for our country and a 
long-overdue win for our kids. 

f 

RECOGNITION OF THE MINORITY 
LEADER 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 
Democratic leader is recognized. 

f 

CLIMATE CHANGE 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, my heart 
goes out to the people in Eastern Ken-
tucky, with the devastating floods. The 
issue before our entire country is that 
we have storms like this appearing 
from nowhere, storms like we have 
never had before. I don’t know the his-
tory of Kentucky, but I have watched 
and been briefed on what is going on 
around the rest of the Nation, and 
these storms are coming all the time— 
untoward. 

It is too bad that my Republican col-
leagues have denied climate change. 
We have to do something, and we have 
to do something very soon. 

There was a meeting a few days ago 
at the White House where the Presi-
dent announced that with regard to cli-
mate change we have to do something 
now. He said that by the year 2100, sci-
entists say, the seas will have risen 16 
feet. What does that mean? It means 
that much of Florida will be under-
water. 

We have things happening that have 
never been recorded before. In the Sier-
ras, some bears are not hibernating. We 
have an average rainfall and snowpack 
in upper Colorado, and none of it gets 
into the river. So I would hope my 
friends would join with us in doing 
something positive with regard to cli-
mate change. 

f 

PUBLIC SAFETY AND THE 
HIGHWAY BILL 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, more than 
62 million vehicles were recalled last 
year in our country—twice the pre-
vious record. The number of safety 
complaints to the National Highway 
Traffic Safety Administration doubled. 
Over the past year, for example, faulty 
ignition switches led to the recall of 2.6 
million cars. At least 124 people died 
and almost 300 were injured by this ig-
nition switch problem, which did many 
different things, one of which was to 
stall a car in traffic and during the 
process disable the airbags. The manu-
facturer was aware of the defect for 
more than a decade and did nothing 
about it. Exploding airbags—another 
problem—claimed the lives of at least 8 
people and led to the recall of 34 mil-
lion vehicles—the largest recall of any 
consumer product in the United States 
ever. Once again, it appears the manu-
facturer knew of the defect years be-
fore notifying Federal regulators. 

Given the number of recalls, Con-
gress should be investing the resources 
to improve public safety and give regu-
lators the tools to keep us safe. But it 
appears Senate Republicans have 
learned nothing from the many recalls 
just this year. The Republican highway 
safety bill, which is being considered in 
the committee on commerce today, 
does not increase funding for Federal 
traffic programs. In fact, it cuts them 
back. Why? The bill does not provide 
any new resources to address the 
record level of safety recalls and con-
sumer complaints. Under the Repub-
lican bill that is being considered, 
automakers that cover up defects will 
continue to face the same very limited 
penalties. Their executives will be able 
to continue to escape accountability. 

But that isn’t all of it. The highway 
bill the Republicans are pushing for-
ward is loaded with harmful provisions 
that roll back efforts to strengthen 
public safety. The bill would allow 18- 
year-old young men and women—18 
years old—to drive commercial 18- 
wheelers across State lines. Think 
about that. Despite studies which show 
that these young drivers have a fatal 
crash rate almost 70 percent higher 
than older drivers, the Republican safe-
ty plan would allow these inexperi-
enced teenagers to drive the largest 
trucks that appear on the road. 

If this odyssey of the Republicans in 
the commerce committee is signed into 
law, it will lead to more crashes and, 
sadly, more injuries and more deaths. 

Every day, 30 people in our great 
country are killed by drunk drivers—30 
people killed by drunk drivers. I just 
learned a couple of days ago of a person 
who worked for me, who was a tremen-
dously great employee of the Senate— 
their brother-in-law was killed by a 
drunk driver. It is so sad that we are 
not doing more to not only stop drunk 
driving but to punish drunk drivers. 
The policy Republicans propose today 
hurts our efforts to combat drunk driv-
ing. 

Listen to this one. The Republicans’ 
bill would lessen incentives for States 
that develop programs to prevent peo-
ple who have been convicted of drunk 
driving from starting their cars if they 
have been drinking—for example, just a 
simple, inexpensive device on a car. If 
someone has been drinking too much, 
the car won’t start. But Republicans 
are going to take care of this and get 
rid of it. No longer will States have the 
ability to do that. The Federal Govern-
ment should not be involved in pro-
grams like that. 

The Republicans’ plan also under-
mines safety measures that protect 
passengers and trains and, of course, 
the safety of all of us because of the 
problems we have with freight trains. 
There is a program that was designed 
by science—it has been available for a 
long time—called positive train control 
which overrides operator error. A per-
fect example of this is what happened 
in Philadelphia. If that had been in ef-
fect, that accident would not have oc-

curred. But the Republicans fixed 
this—they are going to stop the pro-
gram for 3 years. 

Under the present law, these pro-
grams had to be implemented by the 
end of this year—not with the Repub-
licans in the commerce committee, 
which will be part of any highway bill 
we have. They will just stop it for 3 
years, and that will lead to more 
deaths, more injuries, and more terror. 

I can’t understand why the Repub-
licans would propose doing that—de-
laying the deadline for positive train 
control by more than 3 years. I said 3 
years, but it is actually more than 
that. There is no reason to roll back 
deadlines for important safety meas-
ures for our passenger trains. Is this 
the best Republicans can do? I ask 
that. 

For Americans who live near rail 
lines, trains are increasingly carrying 
more and more flammable materials— 
oil, ethanol, and other explosive prod-
ucts. In February of this year, a train 
carrying oil derailed in West Virginia, 
sending exploding fireballs into the air 
and causing large necessary evacu-
ations. 

This and other crashes led the De-
partment of Transportation to require 
the installation of new electronic 
brakes for any train moving flammable 
materials. Requiring better brakes 
when carrying these materials seems 
like a commonsense safety measure. 

What do the Republicans do? Their 
bill repeals an important freight rail 
provision, jeopardizing communities 
across the country with tragic spills. 
We don’t need more accidents. We need 
fewer accidents. We need to move for-
ward and to continue the minimal pro-
grams we have, not roll them back. It 
is clear the Republicans have not 
learned anything from the auto recalls 
or the train crashes. The Senate can do 
better than adopting the Republican’s 
attack on public safety. If the Repub-
licans choose to put those measures in 
the highway bill that I am told is com-
ing forward, it will not survive the 
Senate. We can’t have stuff like that. 
It would be just untoward and wrong. 

Mr. President, there is no one on the 
floor, and I ask that the Chair an-
nounce the business of the day. 

f 

RESERVATION OF LEADER TIME 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order, the leadership time 
is reserved. 

f 

EVERY CHILD ACHIEVES ACT OF 
2015 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order, the Senate will re-
sume consideration of S. 1177, which 
the clerk will report. 

The bill clerk read as follows: 
A bill (S. 1177) to reauthorize the Elemen-

tary and Secondary Education Act of 1965 to 
ensure that every child achieves. 

Pending: 
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Alexander/Murray amendment No. 2089, in 

the nature of a substitute. 
Murray (for Peters) amendment No. 2095 

(to amendment No. 2089), to allow local edu-
cational agencies to use parent and family 
engagement funds for financial literacy ac-
tivities. 

Murray (for Warren/Gardner) amendment 
No. 2120 (to amendment No. 2089), to amend 
section 1111(d) of the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act of 1965 regarding the 
cross-tabulation of student data. 

Alexander (for Kirk) amendment No. 2161 
(to amendment No. 2089), to ensure that 
States measure and report on indicators of 
student access to critical educational re-
sources and identify disparities in such re-
sources. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order, the time until 10:30 
a.m. will be equally divided in the 
usual form. 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, is the time 
under this quorum call we will be in 
equally divided? 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The time 
is not equally divided. 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, I ask unan-
imous consent that the time be equally 
divided. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. REID. I suggest the absence of a 
quorum. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 
clerk will call the roll. 

The bill clerk proceeded to call the 
roll. 

Mr. MERKLEY. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. COT-
TON). Without objection, it is so or-
dered. 

Mr. MERKLEY. Mr. President, I rise 
to address an amendment I am pro-
posing to the bill, the Every Child 
Achieves Act. I am not going to ask to 
call up the amendment at this time, 
but I certainly would like to do so at a 
later point in the day. I hope this 
amendment will be part of any effort to 
wrap-up debate on this bill because it 
addresses an important component 
that is being left out of discussion on 
the Every Child Achieves Act. 

The Every Child Achieves Act is the 
authorization act, but it leaves out the 
vision for school policy. This is a bipar-
tisan bill. It is a bill that would give a 
lot more flexibility to our States, and 
it has been an important effort to ad-
dress many shortcomings in the former 
act, the No Child Left Behind Act, that 
in fact left a lot of children behind. In 
my discussions with educators 
throughout the State of Oregon, with 
parents, administrators, and teachers, 
they found a great number of difficul-
ties and problems with an act that was 
undermining the success of our public 
schools, leaving a huge number of chil-
dren behind, and focusing on what 
these educators referred to as ‘‘the 
bubble’’—that is, those children who 
are close enough to the testing line to 
get them over the top, while decreasing 
attention paid to those children who 
could already meet the testing line or 
those they think were not able to get 

to that line. That is not a holistic, 
comprehensive education system ad-
dressing the needs of all our children. 
So I am delighted to see this reform on 
the floor of the Senate. The focus on 
assisting every child in achieving is ap-
propriate. 

But we cannot achieve a world-class 
education system that responds to a 
world knowledge economy, preparing 
our children to be fully successful 
members of that world knowledge 
economy, if we do not provide the re-
sources necessary for our schools to 
thrive. It strikes me as a real failure of 
our legislative process that a genera-
tion after I went through elementary 
and secondary education, we are a far 
richer nation, but our schools have far 
fewer resources. 

My children have been attending pub-
lic schools in the same blue-collar 
school district I grew up in. I have a 
firsthand view of the difference be-
tween what the school provided when I 
was there and what has been provided 
while my children are there. The short 
conclusion is that our classrooms are 
more crowded and our schools are un-
able to provide the same range of op-
tions that benefited my generation. 

How is it that we are a much richer 
nation, but we are undervaluing and 
underfunding our elementary and sec-
ondary education system in this Na-
tion? Well, we can tie that back to a 
lot that has transpired, including a 
huge growth in inequality in our Na-
tion. But here is the key point: While 
we sit here on the floor debating better 
education policy, shouldn’t we also be 
recognizing explicitly this huge failure 
to provide basic resources to the ele-
mentary and secondary education sys-
tem? 

The funding cuts that are currently 
anticipated under the sequester would 
bring Federal investments and pro-
grams under the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act to their lowest 
levels since fiscal year 2002. Let me re-
peat that: the lowest level since fiscal 
year 2002. Of the lowest achieving 5 per-
cent of schools that receive funds 
under part A of title I of such act, 
about two-thirds of students are not 
meeting their grade-level standards. It 
is certainly a more difficult task for 
teachers to enable students to meet 
those standards when our classrooms 
are more crowded. 

The proposed appropriations act cuts 
funding for part A of title I of the Ele-
mentary and Secondary Education Act 
of 1965 by $850 million as compared to 
the President’s budget and the Demo-
cratic funding alternative. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. All time 
for debate has expired. 

Mr. MERKLEY. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent to extend the time 
allotted to complete my statement. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. MERKLEY. Mr. President, re-
search shows that high-quality early 
education is critical to the educational 
development of every child. There, too, 

we are underfunding the effort. The 
proposed appropriations act provides 
no funding for preschool development 
grants and a cut of $750 million as com-
pared to the President’s budget and the 
Democratic alternative. 

Now, this is happening—this under-
funding of education—within the con-
struct known as the sequester. The se-
quester was partially alleviated 2 years 
ago by a budget deal known as Ryan- 
Murray. That Ryan-Murray agreement 
led to saying that according to the se-
quester principle defense spending and 
nondefense spending would be treated 
equally. If one is capped, the other is 
capped. If one is raised, the other is 
raised. 

That fundamental understanding led 
to an improvement over the last 2 
years. But that improvement is gone. 
So at the very moment, we are talking 
about better education policy, and we 
are talking about worse education 
funding. That is simply wrong—wrong 
for our children, wrong for the next 
generation and the success of America. 
So let’s embrace that second half of the 
conversation and through my amend-
ment—amendment No. 2203—call for an 
intense negotiation to occur, essen-
tially to restore appropriate funding on 
the nondefense programs. 

This is a rational counterpart to the 
debate over the bill that we have before 
us right now. It is certainly important 
for America to recognize that you can-
not, on the one hand, call for better 
education policy and on the other hand 
devastate the funding for early child-
hood education and devastate the fund-
ing for K–12 education and feel like you 
have done something to make Amer-
ican education work better, because 
you have not. 

If you have underfunded education, 
you have undervalued our children, and 
you have undermined the future suc-
cess of our Nation. I hope that amend-
ment No. 2203, which calls upon the 
House and Senate to come together and 
address this failure of funding, will be 
a significant part of our conversation 
as we work to wrap up debate on the 
Every Child Achieves Act. 

I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

proceeded to call the roll. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 

ask unanimous consent that the order 
for the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. SUL-
LIVAN). Without objection, it is so or-
dered. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Sen-
ator from Maine be allowed to speak 
for 5 minutes following my comments. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. For the informa-
tion of Senators, within a few minutes 
we hope to have a cloture vote. We are 
still working out an agreement, but we 
hope to have that done within a very 
few minutes and may begin to move on 
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that shortly after the Senator from 
Maine finishes his remarks. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Maine. 

Mr. KING. Mr. President, I ask unan-
imous consent to address the Senate as 
in morning business for 5 minutes. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

NUCLEAR AGREEMENT WITH IRAN 
Mr. KING. ‘‘Fellow-citizens, we can-

not escape history. We of this Congress 
and this administration, will be re-
membered in spite of ourselves. No per-
sonal significance, or insignificance, 
can spare one or another of us. The 
fiery trial through which we pass, will 
light us down, in honor or dishonor, to 
the latest generation.’’ That was Abra-
ham Lincoln in a message to Congress 
on December 1, 1862. I think his words 
echo today as we talk about the serious 
and solemn issues before us and the one 
that will be coming up within 60 days, 
the consideration of the agreement 
with Iran. 

We are embarked on a historic proc-
ess, a process that will result in one of 
the most important votes that any of 
us will ever take in this body, a vote 
that entails risks of war and peace, of 
life and death, of relationships in the 
Middle East and throughout the world. 

I have been thinking in the last 24 
hours about how to approach this deci-
sion, and I would like to share that 
today. This is a solemn responsibility. 
The first step for this Senator is to 
read the agreement word for word and 
to note in the margins the questions, 
data, and analysis that we think we 
need in order to make this decision. 
That is No. 1. 

No. 2 is to seek expertise, to reach 
outside of this body to people in the 
nuclear field—one literally needs to be 
a nuclear physicist to understand some 
parts of this agreement—to arms in-
spection people, to economists, to for-
eign policy experts. I hope and expect 
this will happen in hearings before the 
Foreign Relations Committee and 
other committees of this Senate, but it 
is also incumbent upon us as individ-
uals to reach out and to try to gain as 
much knowledge and expertise in the 
facts of this agreement as we possibly 
can. 

Then I think we need to debate—to 
really debate with the Senators here in 
the Chamber, face to face. Our legal 
system is based upon the principle of 
an adversarial system where truth 
emerges from the fire of argument. And 
I believe that is something we owe the 
American people, not the strange de-
bate we have where one person comes 
and speaks to an empty Chamber and 
then another person comes and speaks 
to an empty Chamber. I think this is 
an occasion where Senators should con-
front one another with their best argu-
ments, their best facts, and listen to 
one another and make their decisions 
based upon what they learn and what 
they hear. 

Of course, the context of the decision 
is important. We must consider the al-

ternatives. What happens if we don’t 
accept this agreement? What happens 
if we do? No agreement like this can be 
judged solely in isolation; it has to be 
viewed in terms of what are the alter-
natives. What if nothing happens? 
What does Iran do then? What are the 
relationships in the Middle East? What 
is Iran’s path to a bomb if this agree-
ment is not approved? 

Mr. President, I did not plan to come 
to the floor today, but I am here be-
cause I have been shocked and, frankly, 
surprised at the outpouring of reaction 
from people who haven’t read the 
agreement, who haven’t studied the 
implications, who haven’t gained the 
facts. To denounce an agreement or a 
deal before the ink is even dry strikes 
me as an abdication of our responsi-
bility. 

My message today is, let’s slow down 
and take a deep breath. Let’s listen to 
one another. Let’s gain the facts. 

I have not yet made my decision. And 
I commend that position to my col-
leagues. This is too important to be-
come just another political issue. Even 
though we are headed into a Presi-
dential year, even though there are 
partisan differences, even though there 
are differences with this President, this 
is a historic vote and it is a solemn re-
sponsibility. We owe our constituents, 
we owe the people of our States and 
America a close reading of the facts, a 
balanced weighing of the alternatives, 
and our best judgment. That is what 
the people of Maine expect of this Sen-
ator, and I believe that is what the peo-
ple of America expect of us. 

The Senate has an extraordinary op-
portunity to regain its place in this 
country as the world’s greatest delib-
erative body, and that means we have 
to deliberate and listen and learn the 
facts, and that is how we should ap-
proach this momentous decision. 

History will judge us. History will 
judge us not only on our ultimate deci-
sion but how we reached it, how we 
wrestled with the facts and the alter-
natives and the consequences, and how 
we made this decision that will have 
long-term implications for this coun-
try, for the Middle East, for our allies, 
and for the world. 

Mr. President, I have confidence in 
this institution. I have confidence that 
we can make this decision in a 
thoughtful, deliberative, and con-
sciously deliberate way to reach a con-
clusion that is in the best interests of 
the people of America. 

Thank you, Mr. President. 
I yield the floor. 
I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The legislative clerk proceeded to 

call the roll. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Madam President, 

I ask unanimous consent that the order 
for the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mrs. 
ERNST). Without objection, it is so or-
dered. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Madam President, 
I ask unanimous consent that, not-

withstanding rule XXII, there be 10 
minutes of debate equally divided be-
fore the vote to invoke cloture on the 
Alexander-Murray substitute amend-
ment. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Madam President, 
for the information of Senators, we 
have an agreement on the amendments 
to our legislation to fix No Child Left 
Behind. 

The agreement represents all of the 
amendments that we will be dealing 
with. The exact time of the final pas-
sage will be determined by the Repub-
lican and Democratic leaders. 

This is how we will proceed. First, we 
will propose and hopefully adopt by 
consent a managers’ package of 21 
amendments. Second, we will lock in 
an agreement by consent to vote on 24 
more amendments. That voting will 
begin this afternoon, perhaps, at 2:30 
p.m. or 3 p.m. There are slightly more 
Democratic amendments than Repub-
lican amendments in that group of 45 
amendments. 

Following the reading of that, Sen-
ator MURRAY and I will each have 3 or 
4 minutes of remarks that we would 
like to make, and then we will have a 
cloture vote, and that will be all we 
will do before lunch. 

Following lunch, as I said, at about 
2:30 p.m. or 3 p.m., we will move to 
vote. 

I am now going to move to the man-
agers’ package, a list of 21 amendments 
that have been cleared by both the Re-
publican and Democratic sides. 
AMENDMENTS NOS. 2111; 2141; 2145; 2149; 2150; 2151, 

AS MODIFIED; 2154; 2155; 2157; 2234; 2170; 2178; 2181; 
2185; 2195; 2216; 2199; 2201; 2225; 2224; AND 2227 TO 
AMENDMENT NO. 2089 
Madam President, I ask unanimous 

consent that the following amend-
ments be called up and agreed to en 
bloc: McCain-Reid No. 2111; Bennet- 
Ayotte No. 2141; Ayotte No. 2145; Udall 
No. 2149; Feinstein-Cornyn-Gardner No. 
2150; Carper-Ayotte No. 2151, as modi-
fied with the changes at the desk; 
King-Capito No. 2154; Thune No. 2155; 
Flake No. 2157; Lee No. 2234; Booker 
No. 2170; Coons-Reed-Blunt No. 2178; 
McCain No. 2181; Whitehouse No. 2185; 
Blunt-Cardin-Mikulski-Collins No. 
2195; Gillibrand No. 2216; Graham No. 
2199; Alexander No. 2201; Bennet No. 
2225; Booker No. 2224; and Cornyn No. 
2227. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there 
objection. 

Without objection, it is so ordered. 
The amendments (Nos. 2111; 2141; 

2145; 2149; 2150; 2151, as Modified; 2154; 
2155; 2157; 2234; 2170; 2178; 2181; 2185; 2195; 
2216; 2199; 2201; 2225; 2224; and 2227) pro-
posed and agreed to are as follows: 

AMENDMENT NO. 2111 
(Purpose: To express the sense of Congress 

that John Arthur ‘‘Jack’’ Johnson should 
receive a posthumous pardon for the ra-
cially-motivated conviction in 1913 that di-
minished the athletic, cultural, and histor-
ical significance of Jack Johnson and un-
duly tarnished his reputation) 
At the end of part B of title X, add the fol-

lowing: 
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CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE S5095 July 15, 2015 
SEC. lllll. POSTHUMOUS PARDON. 

(a) FINDINGS.—Congress finds the fol-
lowing: 

(1) John Arthur ‘‘Jack’’ Johnson was a 
flamboyant, defiant, and controversial figure 
in the history of the United States who chal-
lenged racial biases. 

(2) Jack Johnson was born in Galveston, 
Texas, in 1878 to parents who were former 
slaves. 

(3) Jack Johnson became a professional 
boxer and traveled throughout the United 
States, fighting White and African-American 
heavyweights. 

(4) After being denied (on purely racial 
grounds) the opportunity to fight 2 White 
champions, in 1908, Jack Johnson was grant-
ed an opportunity by an Australian promoter 
to fight the reigning White title-holder, 
Tommy Burns. 

(5) Jack Johnson defeated Tommy Burns to 
become the first African-American to hold 
the title of Heavyweight Champion of the 
World. 

(6) The victory by Jack Johnson over 
Tommy Burns prompted a search for a White 
boxer who could beat Jack Johnson, a re-
cruitment effort that was dubbed the search 
for the ‘‘great white hope’’. 

(7) In 1910, a White former champion named 
Jim Jeffries left retirement to fight Jack 
Johnson in Reno, Nevada. 

(8) Jim Jeffries lost to Jack Johnson in 
what was deemed the ‘‘Battle of the Cen-
tury’’. 

(9) The defeat of Jim Jeffries by Jack 
Johnson led to rioting, aggression against 
African-Americans, and the racially-moti-
vated murder of African-Americans through-
out the United States. 

(10) The relationships of Jack Johnson 
with White women compounded the resent-
ment felt toward him by many Whites. 

(11) Between 1901 and 1910, 754 African- 
Americans were lynched, some simply for 
being ‘‘too familiar’’ with White women. 

(12) In 1910, Congress passed the Act of 
June 25, 1910 (commonly known as the 
‘‘White Slave Traffic Act’’ or the ‘‘Mann 
Act’’) (18 U.S.C. 2421 et seq.), which outlawed 
the transportation of women in interstate or 
foreign commerce ‘‘for the purpose of pros-
titution or debauchery, or for any other im-
moral purpose’’. 

(13) In October 1912, Jack Johnson became 
involved with a White woman whose mother 
disapproved of their relationship and sought 
action from the Department of Justice, 
claiming that Jack Johnson had abducted 
her daughter. 

(14) Jack Johnson was arrested by Federal 
marshals on October 18, 1912, for trans-
porting the woman across State lines for an 
‘‘immoral purpose’’ in violation of the Mann 
Act. 

(15) The Mann Act charges against Jack 
Johnson were dropped when the woman re-
fused to cooperate with Federal authorities, 
and then married Jack Johnson. 

(16) Federal authorities persisted and sum-
moned a White woman named Belle 
Schreiber, who testified that Jack Johnson 
had transported her across States lines for 
the purpose of ‘‘prostitution and debauch-
ery’’. 

(17) In 1913, Jack Johnson was convicted of 
violating the Mann Act and sentenced to 1 
year and 1 day in Federal prison. 

(18) Jack Johnson fled the United States to 
Canada and various European and South 
American countries. 

(19) Jack Johnson lost the Heavyweight 
Championship title to Jess Willard in Cuba 
in 1915. 

(20) Jack Johnson returned to the United 
States in July 1920, surrendered to authori-
ties, and served nearly a year in the Federal 
penitentiary at Leavenworth, Kansas. 

(21) Jack Johnson subsequently fought in 
boxing matches, but never regained the 
Heavyweight Championship title. 

(22) Jack Johnson served the United States 
during World War II by encouraging citizens 
to buy war bonds and participating in exhi-
bition boxing matches to promote the war 
bond cause. 

(23) Jack Johnson died in an automobile 
accident in 1946. 

(24) In 1954, Jack Johnson was inducted 
into the Boxing Hall of Fame. 

(25) Senate Concurrent Resolution 29, 111th 
Congress, agreed to July 29, 2009, expressed 
the sense of the 111th Congress that Jack 
Johnson should receive a posthumous pardon 
for his racially-motivated 1913 conviction. 

(b) RECOMMENDATIONS.—It remains the 
sense of Congress that Jack Johnson should 
receive a posthumous pardon— 

(1) to expunge a racially-motivated abuse 
of the prosecutorial authority of the Federal 
Government from the annals of criminal jus-
tice in the United States; and 

(2) in recognition of the athletic and cul-
tural contributions of Jack Johnson to soci-
ety. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2141 

(Purpose: To provide for shared services 
strategies and models) 

On page 622, line 18, insert ‘‘such as 
through entities administering shared serv-
ices,’’ after ‘‘strategies,’’. 

On page 624, line 9, insert ‘‘which may in-
clude the use of shared services models’’ 
after ‘‘time in program’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2145 

(Purpose: To allow States to use State activ-
ity funds provided under part A of title IV 
of the Elementary and Secondary Edu-
cation Act of 1965 for certain evidence- 
based mental health awareness programs) 

On page 430, between lines 6 and 7, insert 
the following: 

‘‘(ix) designing and implementing evi-
dence-based mental health awareness train-
ing programs for the purposes of— 

‘‘(I) recognizing the signs and symptoms of 
mental illness; 

‘‘(II) providing education to school per-
sonnel regarding resources available in the 
community for students with mental ill-
nesses and other relevant resources relating 
to mental health; or 

‘‘(III) providing education to school per-
sonal regarding the safe de-escalation of cri-
sis situations involving a student with a 
mental illness; and 

AMENDMENT NO. 2149 

(Purpose: To allow the Bureau of Indian Edu-
cation to apply for certain competitive 
grants under the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act of 1965) 

On page 799, between lines 17 and 18, insert 
the following: 
SEC. 9114A. APPLICATION FOR COMPETITIVE 

GRANTS FROM THE BUREAU OF IN-
DIAN EDUCATION. 

Subpart 2 of part F of title IX (20 U.S.C. 
7901 et seq.), as amended by sections 4001(3) 
and 9114 and redesignated by section 9106(1), 
is further amended by adding at the end the 
following: 
‘‘SEC. 9539. APPLICATION FOR COMPETITIVE 

GRANTS FROM THE BUREAU OF IN-
DIAN EDUCATION. 

‘‘(a) IN GENERAL.—Notwithstanding any 
other provision of this Act and subject to 
subsection (b), the Bureau of Indian Edu-
cation may apply for, and carry out, any 
grant program awarded on a competitive 
basis under this Act, as appropriate, on be-
half of the schools and the Indian children 
that the Bureau serves, and shall not be sub-
ject to any provision of the program that re-

quires grant recipients to contribute funds 
toward the costs of the grant program. 

‘‘(b) LIMITATION.—In the case of any com-
petitive grant program described in sub-
section (a) that also provides a reservation of 
funds to the Bureau of Indian Education, the 
Bureau shall not, for any fiscal year, receive 
both a grant and a reservation under the 
competitive grant program.’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2150 
(Purpose: To allow eligible entities to use 

funds provided under part A of title III of 
the Elementary and Secondary Education 
Act of 1965 for bilingual paraprofessionals 
and linguistically responsive materials) 
On page 403, strike line 15 and insert the 

following: 
‘‘(B) intensified instruction, which may in-

clude linguistically responsive materials; 
and 

‘‘(C) bilingual paraprofessionals, which 
may include interpreters and translators. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2151, AS MODIFIED 
(Purpose: To amend part A of title II of the 

Elementary and Secondary Education Act 
of 1965 to improve preparation programs 
and strengthen support for principals and 
other school leaders) 
On page 287, between lines 8 and 9, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(J) A description of actions the State may 

take to improve preparation programs and 
strengthen support for principals and other 
school leaders based on the needs of the 
State, as identified by the State educational 
agency. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2154 
(Purpose: To authorize the Institute of Edu-

cation Sciences to conduct a study on stu-
dent access to digital learning resources 
outside of the school day) 
On page 264, between lines 11 and 12, insert 

the following: 
SEC. 1018. REPORT ON STUDENT HOME ACCESS 

TO DIGITAL LEARNING RESOURCES. 
(a) IN GENERAL.—Not later than 18 months 

after the date of enactment of this Act, the 
Director of the Institute of Education 
Sciences, in consultation with relevant Fed-
eral agencies, shall complete a national 
study on the educational trends and behav-
iors associated with access to digital learn-
ing resources outside of the classroom, which 
shall include analysis of extant data and new 
surveys about students and teachers that 
provide— 

(1) a description of the various locations 
from which students access the Internet and 
digital learning resources outside of the 
classroom, including through an after-school 
or summer program, a library, and at home; 

(2) a description of the various devices and 
technology through which students access 
the Internet and digital learning resources 
outside of the classroom, including through 
a computer or mobile device; 

(3) data associated with the number of stu-
dents who lack home Internet access, 
disaggregated by— 

(A) each of the categories of students, as 
defined in section 1111(b)(3)(A) of the Ele-
mentary and Secondary Education Act of 
1965; 

(B) homeless students and children or 
youth in foster care; and 

(C) students in geographically diverse 
areas, including urban, suburban, and rural 
areas; 

(4) data associated with the barriers to stu-
dents acquiring home Internet access; 

(5) data associated with the proportion of 
educators who assign homework or imple-
ment innovative learning models that re-
quire or are substantially augmented by a 
student having home Internet access and the 
frequency of the need for such access; 
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(6) a description of the learning behaviors 

associated with students who lack home 
Internet access, including— 

(A) student participation in the classroom, 
including the ability to complete homework 
and participate in innovative learning mod-
els; 

(B) student engagement, through such 
measures as attendance rates and chronic 
absenteeism; and 

(C) a student’s ability to apply for employ-
ment, postsecondary education, and finan-
cial aid programs; 

(7) an analysis of the how a student’s lack 
of home Internet access impacts the instruc-
tional practice of educators, including— 

(A) the extent to which educators alter in-
structional methods, resources, homework 
assignments, and curriculum in order to ac-
commodate differing levels of home Internet 
access; and 

(B) strategies employed by educators, 
school leaders, and administrators to address 
the differing levels of home Internet access 
among students; and 

(8) a description of the ways in which State 
educational agencies, local educational agen-
cies, schools, and other entities, including 
through partnerships, have developed effec-
tive means to provide students with Internet 
access outside of the school day. 

(b) PUBLIC DISSEMINATION.—The Director of 
the Institute of Education Sciences shall 
widely disseminate the findings of the study 
under this section— 

(1) in a timely fashion; 
(2) in a form that is understandable, easily 

accessible, and publicly available and usable, 
or adaptable for use in, the improvement of 
educational practice; 

(3) through electronic transfer and other 
means, such as posting, as available, to the 
website of the Institute of Education 
Sciences, or the Department of Education; 
and 

(4) to all State educational agencies and 
other recipients of funds under part D of 
title IV of the Elementary and Secondary 
Education Act of 1965. 

(c) DEFINITION OF DIGITAL LEARNING.—In 
this section, the term ‘‘digital learning’’— 

(1) has the meaning given the term in sec-
tion 5702 of the Elementary and Secondary 
Education Act of 1965; and 

(2) includes an educational practice that 
effectively uses technology to strengthen a 
student’s learning experience within and 
outside of the classroom and at home, which 
may include the use of digital learning con-
tent, video, software, and other resources 
that may be developed, as the Secretary of 
Education may determine. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2155 
(Purpose: To require a report on responses to 

Indian student suicides) 
At the end of title VII, insert the fol-

lowing: 
SEC. 7006. REPORT ON RESPONSES TO INDIAN 

STUDENT SUICIDES. 
(a) PREPARATION.— 
(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of Edu-

cation, in coordination with the Secretary of 
the Interior and the Secretary of Health and 
Human Services, shall prepare a report on ef-
forts to address outbreaks of suicides among 
elementary school and secondary school stu-
dents (referred to in this section as ‘‘student 
suicides’’) that occurred within 1 year prior 
to the date of enactment of this Act in In-
dian country (as defined in section 1151 of 
title 18, United States Code). 

(2) CONTENTS.—The report shall include in-
formation on— 

(A) the Federal response to the occurrence 
of high numbers of student suicides in Indian 
country (as so defined); 

(B) a list of Federal resources available to 
prevent and respond to outbreaks of student 

suicides, including the availability and use 
of tele-behavioral health care; 

(C) any barriers to timely implementation 
of programs or interagency collaboration re-
garding student suicides; 

(D) interagency collaboration efforts to 
streamline access to programs regarding stu-
dent suicides, including information on how 
the Department of Education, the Depart-
ment of the Interior, and the Department of 
Health and Human Services work together 
on administration of such programs; 

(E) recommendations to improve or con-
solidate resources or programs described in 
subparagraph (B) or (D); and 

(F) feedback from Indian tribes to the Fed-
eral response described in subparagraph (A). 

(b) SUBMISSION.—Not later than 90 days 
after the date of enactment of this Act, the 
Secretary of Education shall submit the re-
port described in subsection (a) to the appro-
priate committees of Congress. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2157 
(Purpose: To reserve funds for an evaluation 

of early learning alignment and improve-
ment grants) 
On page 615, between lines 22 and 23, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(3) RESERVATION FOR EVALUATION.—From 

the amounts appropriated under section 5903 
for a fiscal year, the Secretary shall reserve 
one-half of 1 percent to conduct, in consulta-
tion with the Secretary of Health and 
Human Services, an evaluation to determine 
whether grants under this part are— 

(A) improving efficiency in the use of Fed-
eral funds for early childhood education pro-
grams; 

(B) improving coordination across Federal 
early childhood education programs; and 

(C) increasing the availability of, and ac-
cess to, high-quality early childhood edu-
cation programs for eligible children. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2234 
(Purpose: To establish a rule of construction 

regarding travel to and from school) 
After section 9115, insert the following: 

SEC. 9116. RULE OF CONSTRUCTION REGARDING 
TRAVEL TO AND FROM SCHOOL. 

Subpart 2 of part F of title IX (20 U.S.C. 
7901 et seq.), as amended by sections, 9114 and 
9115, and redesignated by section 9601, is fur-
ther amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing: 
‘‘SEC. 9539A. RULE OF CONSTRUCTION REGARD-

ING TRAVEL TO AND FROM SCHOOL. 
‘‘(a) IN GENERAL.—Subject to subsection 

(b), nothing in this Act shall authorize the 
Secretary to, or shall be construed to— 

‘‘(1) prohibit a child from traveling to and 
from school on foot or by car, bus, or bike 
when the parents of the child have given per-
mission; or 

‘‘(2) expose parents to civil or criminal 
charges for allowing their child to respon-
sibly and safely travel to and from school by 
a means the parents believe is age appro-
priate. 

‘‘(b) NO PREEMPTION OF STATE OR LOCAL 
LAWS.—Notwithstanding subsection (a), 
nothing in this section shall be construed to 
preempt State or local laws.’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2170 
(Purpose: To amend the early learning align-

ment and improvement grant program 
under part I of title V of the Elementary 
and Secondary Education Act of 1965 to en-
sure that States support early childhood 
education programs that maintain discipli-
nary policies that do not include expulsion 
or suspension of participating children) 
On page 623, strike line 8 and insert the fol-

lowing: 
‘‘(14) a description of how the State will 

support, through the use of professional de-

velopment, early childhood education pro-
grams that maintain disciplinary policies 
that do not include expulsion or suspension 
of participating children, except as a last re-
sort in extraordinary circumstances where— 

‘‘(A) there is a determination of a serious 
safety threat; and 

‘‘(B) policies are in place to provide appro-
priate alternative early educational services 
to expelled or suspended children while they 
are out of school; and’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2178 
(Purpose: To encourage increasing the 

amount of funds available for parent and 
family engagement) 
On page 170, strike lines 20 through 25, and 

insert the following: 
‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—Each local educational 

agency shall reserve at least 1 percent of its 
allocation under subpart 2 to assist schools 
to carry out the activities described in this 
section, except that this subparagraph shall 
not apply if 1 percent of such agency’s allo-
cation under subpart 2 for the fiscal year for 
which the determination is made is $5,000 or 
less. Nothing in this subparagraph shall be 
construed to limit local educational agencies 
from reserving more than the 1 percent of its 
allocation under subpart 2 to assist schools 
to carry out activities described in this sec-
tion.’’; 

AMENDMENT NO. 2181 
(Purpose: To allow States to use funding 

under part A of title I of the Elementary 
and Secondary Education Act of 1965 to 
replicate and expand successful practices 
from high-performing public schools) 
On page 70, line 3, strike the period and in-

sert the following: ‘‘; and 
‘‘(iii) use funds under this part to support 

efforts to expand and replicate successful 
practices from high-performing charter 
schools, magnet schools, and traditional pub-
lic schools. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2185 
(Purpose: To support innovation schools) 
(The amendment is printed in the 

RECORD of July 9, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2195 
(Purpose: To amend section 1113(c) of the El-

ementary and Secondary Education Act of 
1965 to allow local educational agencies to 
address the needs of children in schools 
served by schoolwide programs by pro-
viding school-based mental health pro-
grams) 
On page 132, line 1, insert ‘‘school-based 

mental health programs,’’ after ‘‘coun-
seling,’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2216 
(Purpose: To require a report on 

cybersecurity education) 
On page 385, between lines 4 and 5, insert 

the following: 
‘‘SEC. 2508. REPORT ON CYBERSECURITY EDU-

CATION. 
‘‘Not later than June 1, 2016, the Secretary, 

acting through the Director of the Institute 
of Education Sciences, shall submit to the 
Committee on Armed Services and the Com-
mittee on Health, Education, Labor, and 
Pensions of the Senate and the Committee 
on Armed Services and the Committee on 
Education and the Workforce of the House of 
Representatives, a report describing whether 
secondary and postsecondary education pro-
grams are meeting the need of public and 
private sectors for cyberdefense. Such report 
shall include— 

‘‘(1) an assessment of the shortfalls in cur-
rent secondary and postsecondary education 
needed to develop cybersecurity profes-
sionals, and recommendations to address 
such shortfalls; 
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‘‘(2) an assessment of successful secondary 

and postsecondary programs that produce 
competent cybersecurity professionals; and 

‘‘(3) recommendations of subjects to be 
covered by elementary schools and sec-
ondary schools to better prepare students for 
postsecondary cybersecurity education.’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2199 
(Purpose: To include entrepreneurship as a 

local educational agency allowable use of 
funds under title II) 
On page 306, after line 23, insert the fol-

lowing: 
‘‘(V) providing educator training to in-

crease students’ entrepreneurship skills; and 
AMENDMENT NO. 2201 

(Purpose: To provide that State assessments 
not evaluate or assess personal or family 
beliefs and attitudes, or publicly disclose 
personally identifiable information) 
Beginning on page 37, strike line 24 and all 

that follows through page 38, line 4, and in-
sert the following: 

‘‘(iii) be used for purposes for which such 
assessments are valid and reliable, con-
sistent with relevant, nationally recognized 
professional and technical testing standards, 
objectively measure academic achievement, 
knowledge, and skills, and be tests that do 
not evaluate or assess personal or family be-
liefs and attitudes, or publicly disclose per-
sonally identifiable information; 

AMENDMENT NO. 2225 
(Purpose: To improve title I by including in-

formation about assessments in the cat-
egories of information that parents have a 
right to know about) 
On page 111, between lines 24 and 25, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(2) TESTING TRANSPARENCY.— 
‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—Subject to subparagraph 

(B), each local educational agency that re-
ceives funds under this part shall make wide-
ly available through public means (including 
by posting in a clear and easily accessible 
manner on the local educational agency’s 
website and, where practicable, on the 
website of each school served by the local 
educational agency) for each grade served by 
the local educational agency, information on 
each assessment required by the State to 
comply with section 1111, other assessments 
required by the State, and where such infor-
mation is available and feasible to report, 
assessments required districtwide by the 
local educational agency, including— 

‘‘(i) the subject matter assessed; 
‘‘(ii) the purpose for which the assessment 

is designed and used; 
‘‘(iii) the source of the requirement for the 

assessment; and 
‘‘(iv) where such information is available— 
‘‘(I) the amount of time students will spend 

taking the assessment, and the schedule and 
calendar for the assessment; and 

‘‘(II) the time and format for disseminating 
results. 

‘‘(B) LOCAL EDUCATIONAL AGENCY THAT DOES 
NOT OPERATE A WEBSITE.—In the case of a 
local educational agency that does not oper-
ate a website, such local educational agency 
shall determine how to make the informa-
tion described in subparagraph (A) widely 
available, such as through distribution of 
that information to the media, through pub-
lic agencies, or directly to parents. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2224 
(Purpose: To assess and improve educator 

support and working conditions) 
On page 306, after line 23, add the fol-

lowing: 
‘‘(V) regularly conducting, and publicly re-

porting the results of, an assessment and a 
plan to address such results, of educator sup-
port and working conditions that— 

‘‘(i) evaluates supports for teachers, lead-
ers, and other school personnel, such as— 

‘‘(I) teacher and principal perceptions of 
availability of high-quality professional de-
velopment and instructional materials; 

‘‘(II) timely availability of data on student 
academic achievement and growth; 

‘‘(III) the presence of high-quality instruc-
tional leadership; and 

‘‘(IV) opportunities for professional 
growth, such as career ladders and men-
toring and induction programs; 

‘‘(ii) evaluates working conditions for 
teachers, leaders and other school personnel, 
such as— 

‘‘(I) school safety and climate; 
‘‘(II) availability and use of common plan-

ning time and opportunities to collaborate; 
and 

‘‘(III) community engagement; and 
‘‘(iii) is developed with teachers, leaders, 

other school personnel, parents, students, 
and the community; and 

AMENDMENT NO. 2227 
(Purpose: To reauthorize the Education 

Flexibility Partnership Act of 1999) 
(The amendment is printed in the 

RECORD of July 13, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Madam President, 
I ask unanimous consent, notwith-
standing rule XXII, on behalf of myself 
and Senator MURRAY, that if cloture is 
invoked on the Alexander amendment 
No. 2089, the following amendments be 
made pending en bloc: Coons No. 2243; 
Cruz No. 2180; Heitkamp No. 2171; 
Hatch No. 2082; Warren No. 2106; Burr 
No. 2247, as modified with the changes 
at the desk; Murphy No. 2186; Brown 
No. 2100; Wicker No. 2144; Markey No. 
2176; Murphy No. 2241; Sanders No. 2177; 
Casey No. 2242; Schatz No. 2130; Nelson 
No. 2215, as modified with the changes 
at the desk; Manchin No. 2222; Booz-
man No. 2231; Baldwin No. 2188; Capito 
No. 2156; Thune No. 2232; King No. 2256; 
Schatz No. 2240; and Warren No. 2249. 

Following that, at a time to be deter-
mined by the majority leader in con-
sultation with the Democratic leader 
either today or tomorrow, the Senate 
vote in relation to the following 
amendments: Brown No. 2100; 
Heitkamp No. 2171, 60-vote threshold; 
Coons No. 2243, 60-vote threshold; Kirk 
No. 2161, 60-vote threshold; Burr No. 
2247, as modified with the changes at 
the desk; Hatch No. 2082; Warren No. 
2106; Wicker No. 2144, 60-vote threshold; 
Markey No. 2176, 60-vote threshold; 
Murphy No. 2241, 60-vote threshold; 
Sanders No. 2177, 60-vote threshold; 
Casey No. 2242, 60-vote threshold; Cruz 
No. 2180; Schatz No. 2130; Murphy No. 
2186; Nelson No. 2215, as modified with 
the changes at the desk; Manchin No. 
2222; Boozman No. 2231; Baldwin No. 
2188; Capito No. 2156; Thune No. 2232; 
King No. 2256; Schatz No. 2240; and 
Warren No. 2249, with no second-degree 
amendments in order to any of the 
amendments prior to the votes, that 
there be 2 minutes equally divided 
prior to each vote; and that all after 
the first vote in each series be 10 min-
utes in length; also that the Warren 
amendment No. 2120 be withdrawn and 
that the following amendments in this 
agreement be subject to a 60-affirma-

tive-vote threshold for adoption: Coons 
No. 2243, Heitkamp No. 2171, Kirk No. 
2161, Wicker No. 2144, Markey No. 2176, 
Murphy No. 2241, Sanders No. 2177, and 
Casey No. 2242. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there 
objection. 

Without objection, it is so ordered. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Madam President, 

in just a few minutes, after brief com-
ments by Senator MURRAY and me, we 
will proceed to a cloture vote and then 
our next votes will be at 2:30. 

I think, from the reading of the 
amendments, that the Senators can see 
that we have had a fair and open 
amendment process. Just to give you 
an example, in our committee consid-
eration to fix No Child Left Behind, we 
adopted 29 amendments, and the com-
mittee was pleased enough with the 
process that they reported the bill 
unanimously. 

The substitute amendment, one of 
the amendments I just listed, adopts 
the priorities of 52 Members into that 
substitute amendment. 

On the Senate floor already since last 
week, we have adopted 27 amendments, 
and I just read the two consent re-
quests. The manager’s package has 21 
amendments in it, and those have been 
adopted. Then there are the 21 more 
votes that we just secured approval to 
vote on either by voice or in fact. 

So the vote we are about to have is a 
vote on whether to end debate on our 
bill to fix No Child Left Behind. I think 
the question before the Senators is 
this: Do you think there has been a fair 
process? Do you think it is open 
enough? Do you think the bill is wor-
thy of having these votes and going to-
ward final passage? I hope every single 
Senator will agree that yes, it has 
been. 

This is the way the Senate is sup-
posed to work. Basically, we are con-
cluding the bill by a unanimous con-
sent agreement, which is to say that 
virtually every Senator who wants an 
amendment has had that amendment 
considered, and we are going to dispose 
of it one way or another. We are going 
to adopt it or vote on it, whatever the 
Senate likes. 

That is important for the country to 
see. This a bill that Newsweek maga-
zine said is the education bill everyone 
wants fixed. 

There is a remarkable consensus that 
we need to do it. After 7 years, this bill 
is overdue and a ‘‘yes’’ vote today on 
cloture says: We recognize that Gov-
ernors, teachers, school board mem-
bers, and school superintendents have 
united in a remarkable coalition to 
support the way we propose to fix it. 
So we have a consensus that it needs to 
be fixed, and we have a consensus on 
how to fix it. This is a vote about 
whether we are ready to do that—to do 
our job. 

I thank Senator MURRAY principally 
for her leadership in this respect, mak-
ing it possible to create this environ-
ment in which we have been able to 
have such a good process. 
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I thank the majority leader for put-

ting the bill on the floor and giving us 
a week of time—more than a week—to 
deal with it. 

I thank the majority whip for his ef-
forts, especially in helping to bring 
this to a conclusion. 

I thank the Democratic leader, Sen-
ator REID, as well as Senators SCHU-
MER, DURBIN and PATTY MURRAY, who 
is also part of that leadership, for cre-
ating the kind of working environment 
to give Senators on both sides of the 
aisle a chance to go home and say: We 
fixed No Child Left Behind. I had my 
say in it, and we are going to restore 
responsibility. We are going to keep 
the important measurements of stu-
dent achievement, but restore to the 
classroom teachers, the Governors, the 
legislatures, the school boards, and to 
the parents the responsibility for stu-
dent achievement. 

I thank the Chair, and I urge my col-
leagues to vote yes on cloture so we 
can move toward these remaining 21 
amendments on the bill. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Washington. 

Mrs. MURRAY. Madam President, I 
rise again to encourage all of our col-
leagues to support this vote to move us 
to a negotiated conclusion to this very 
important bill. 

I thank the senior Senator from Ten-
nessee, as well as the majority leader, 
for working with us to get this agree-
ment so we can continue moving for-
ward in a bipartisan way to get this 
done. 

Across the country, students, par-
ents, teachers, and communities are 
really counting on us to fix No Child 
Left Behind. I have been very pleased 
to work with Chairman ALEXANDER on 
this bipartisan bill called the Every 
Child Achieves Act. 

This bill will give our States more 
flexibility, but it will also include 
some Federal guardrails to make sure 
all of our students do have access to 
quality education. It passed through 
our committee unanimously and, for 
the past week or so, we have made good 
progress on the Senate floor. 

There is still some work to be done. 
There are a number of amendments 
that we will be voting on this after-
noon and into tomorrow. The senior 
Senator from Pennsylvania is offering 
a very important amendment I support 
to expand high-quality early childhood 
education. 

We have an amendment that we will 
be voting on to strengthen the Federal 
guardrails. It is the accountability 
amendment from Senators MURPHY, 
BOOKER, WARREN, and COONS to help 
make sure all of our kids, especially 
our most vulnerable students, have 
what they need. 

There are many more amendments, 
as you know, from Democrats and Re-
publicans, to finish this bill, but I urge 
our colleagues to vote yes on cloture. 
We are finishing this bill and working 
to make sure that we can fix a broken 
law. 

I will have more to say about the 
amendments as we go through the 
process. But at this moment, I urge all 
of our colleagues to support this vote, 
continue this bipartisan process, and 
let’s work to get this bill done. 

I yield the floor. 
I yield back the remainder of my 

time. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Madam President, 

I yield back the remainder of my time. 
CLOTURE MOTION 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Pursuant 
to rule XXII, the Chair lays before the 
Senate the pending cloture motion, 
which the clerk will state. 

The bill clerk read as follows: 
CLOTURE MOTION 

We, the undersigned Senators, in accord-
ance with the provisions of rule XXII of the 
Standing Rules of the Senate, do hereby 
move to bring to a close debate on the Alex-
ander amendment No. 2089 to S. 1177, an 
original bill to reauthorize the Elementary 
and Secondary Education Act of 1965 to en-
sure that every child achieves. 

Mitch McConnell, Orrin G. Hatch, Lamar 
Alexander, Cory Gardner, Steve 
Daines, Pat Roberts, Johnny Isakson, 
Susan M. Collins, Michael B. Enzi, 
Kelly Ayotte, John Cornyn, Lisa Mur-
kowski, Tim Scott, Richard Burr, 
Thom Tillis, Lindsey Graham, John 
Hoeven. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. By unan-
imous consent, the mandatory quorum 
call has been waived. 

The question is, Is it the sense of the 
Senate that debate on the Alexander 
amendment No. 2089, offered by the 
Senator from Tennessee, Mr. ALEX-
ANDER, to S. 1177, shall be brought to a 
close? 

The yeas and nays are mandatory 
under the rule. 

The clerk will call the roll. 
The bill clerk called the roll. 
Mr. CORNYN. The following Senator 

is necessarily absent: the Senator from 
South Carolina (Mr. GRAHAM). 

Mr. DURBIN. I announce that the 
Senator from Florida (Mr. NELSON) is 
necessarily absent. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 
TILLIS). Are there any other Senators 
in the Chamber desiring to vote? 

The yeas and nays resulted—yeas 86, 
nays 12, as follows: 

[Rollcall Vote No. 237 Leg.] 

YEAS—86 

Alexander 
Ayotte 
Baldwin 
Barrasso 
Bennet 
Blumenthal 
Booker 
Boozman 
Boxer 
Brown 
Burr 
Cantwell 
Capito 
Cardin 
Carper 
Casey 
Cassidy 
Coats 
Cochran 
Collins 
Coons 
Corker 
Cornyn 

Cotton 
Donnelly 
Durbin 
Enzi 
Ernst 
Feinstein 
Fischer 
Flake 
Franken 
Gardner 
Gillibrand 
Grassley 
Hatch 
Heinrich 
Heitkamp 
Heller 
Hirono 
Hoeven 
Inhofe 
Isakson 
Johnson 
Kaine 
King 

Kirk 
Klobuchar 
Lankford 
Leahy 
Manchin 
Markey 
McCain 
McCaskill 
McConnell 
Menendez 
Merkley 
Mikulski 
Murkowski 
Murphy 
Murray 
Perdue 
Peters 
Portman 
Reed 
Reid 
Roberts 
Rounds 
Sanders 

Schatz 
Schumer 
Scott 
Sessions 
Shaheen 
Stabenow 

Sullivan 
Tester 
Thune 
Tillis 
Toomey 
Udall 

Warner 
Warren 
Whitehouse 
Wicker 
Wyden 

NAYS—12 

Blunt 
Crapo 
Cruz 
Daines 

Lee 
Moran 
Paul 
Risch 

Rubio 
Sasse 
Shelby 
Vitter 

NOT VOTING—2 

Graham Nelson 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. On this 
vote, the yeas are 86, the nays are 12. 

Three-fifths of the Senators duly cho-
sen and sworn having voted in the af-
firmative, the motion is agreed to. 
AMENDMENTS NOS. 2243; 2180; 2171; 2082; 2106; 2247, 

AS MODIFIED; 2186; 2100; 2144; 2176; 2241; 2177; 2242; 
2130; 2215, AS MODIFIED; 2222; 2231; 2188; 2156; 2232; 
2256; 2240; 2249 TO AMENDMENT NO. 2089 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. Cloture 

having been invoked, under the pre-
vious order, the 23 amendments enu-
merated earlier are now pending en 
bloc. 

The amendments (Nos. 2243; 2180; 
2171; 2082; 2106; 2247, as modified; 2186; 
2100; 2144; 2176; 2241; 2177; 2242; 2130; 2215, 
as modified; 2222; 2231; 2188; 2156; 2232; 
2256; 2240; 2249) are proposed, as follows: 

AMENDMENT NO. 2243 
(Purpose: To authorize the establishment of 

American Dream Accounts) 
(The amendment is printed in the 

RECORD of July 14, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2180 
(Purpose: To provide for State-determined 

assessment and accountability systems, 
and for other purposes) 
On page 28, between lines 6 and 7, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(vi) include in the plan a description of 

assessments referred to in paragraph (2), or 
an accountability system referred to in para-
graph (3), of subsection (b), nor may the Sec-
retary require inclusion of a description of 
such assessments or system in a plan or ap-
plication, or use inclusion of such assess-
ments or system as a factor in awarding Fed-
eral funding, under any other provision of 
this Act; or 

On page 28, line 7, strike ‘‘(vi)’’ and insert 
‘‘(vii)’’. 

On page 36, strike line 18 and all that fol-
lows through line 25 on page 58, and insert 
the following: 

‘‘(2) ASSESSMENTS.—A State may include in 
the State plan a description of, and may im-
plement, a set of high-quality statewide aca-
demic assessments. 

‘‘(3) ACCOUNTABILITY.—A State may include 
in the State plan a description of, and may 
implement, an accountability system. 

On page 146, strike line 1 and all that fol-
lows through line 23, on page 166. 

On page 183, between lines 6 and 7, insert 
the following 
SEC. 1008A. STATE-DETERMINED ASSESSMENTS 

AND ACCOUNTABILITY. 
After section 1118, as redesignated by sec-

tion 1004(3), insert the following: 
‘‘SEC. 1119. STATE-DETERMINED ASSESSMENTS 

AND ACCOUNTABILITY. 
‘‘Notwithstanding any other provision of 

law, including any other provision of this 
Act, wherever in this Act a reference is made 
to assessments or accountability under this 
part, including a reference to a provision 
under paragraphs (2) or (3) of section 
1111(b)— 
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‘‘(1) in the case of a State that elects to 

implement assessments referred to in section 
1111(b)(2), a reference to assessments under 
this part shall be deemed to be a reference to 
those assessments and shall be carried out to 
the extent practicable based on the State-de-
termined assessments; 

‘‘(2) in the case of a State that elects to 
implement an accountability system re-
ferred to in section 1111(b)(3), a reference to 
accountability under this part shall be 
deemed to be a reference to accountability 
under that system, and shall be carried out 
to the extent practicable based on the State- 
determined accountability system; and 

‘‘(3) in the case of any State not described 
in paragraph (1) or (2), the reference shall 
have no effect.’’. 

On page 185, strike line 19 and all that fol-
lows through line 2 on page 228 and insert the 
following: 
SEC. 1012. REPEAL. 

Part B of title I (20 U.S.C. 6361 et seq.) is 
repealed. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2171 
(Purpose: To reinstate grants to improve the 

mental health of children) 
On page 492, after line 22, insert the fol-

lowing: 
SEC. 4006. GRANTS FOR THE INTEGRATION OF 

SCHOOLS AND MENTAL HEALTH SYS-
TEMS. 

Title IV (20 U.S.C. 7101 et seq.), as amended 
by sections 4001, 4004, and 4005, is further 
amended by adding at the end the following: 

‘‘PART E—GRANTS TO IMPROVE THE 
MENTAL HEALTH OF CHILDREN 

‘‘SEC. 4501. GRANTS FOR THE INTEGRATION OF 
SCHOOLS AND MENTAL HEALTH SYS-
TEMS. 

‘‘(a) AUTHORIZATION.—The Secretary is au-
thorized to award grants to, or enter into 
contracts or cooperative agreements with, 
State educational agencies, local edu-
cational agencies, Indian tribes or their trib-
al education agency, a school operated by 
the Bureau of Indian Education, or a Re-
gional Corporation (as defined in section 3 of 
the Alaska Native Claims Settlement Act (43 
U.S.C. 1602)) for the purpose of increasing 
student access to quality mental health care 
and support by developing innovative pro-
grams to link local school systems with local 
mental health systems, such as those under 
the Indian Health Service. 

‘‘(b) DURATION.—With respect to a grant, 
contract, or cooperative agreement awarded 
or entered into under this section, the period 
during which payments under such grant, 
contract or agreement are made to the re-
cipient may not exceed 5 years. 

‘‘(c) USE OF FUNDS.—An entity that re-
ceives a grant, contract, or cooperative 
agreement under this section shall use 
amounts made available through such grant, 
contract, or cooperative agreement for the 
following: 

‘‘(1) To enhance, improve, or develop col-
laborative efforts between school-based serv-
ice systems and mental health service sys-
tems to provide, enhance, or improve preven-
tion, diagnosis, and treatment services to 
students. 

‘‘(2) To enhance the availability of crisis 
intervention services and conflict resolution 
practices, such as those focused on decreas-
ing rates of bullying, teen dating violence, 
suicide, trauma, and human trafficking (de-
fined as an act or practice described in para-
graph (9) or (10) of section 103 of the Traf-
ficking Victims Protection Act of 2000 (22 
U.S.C. 7102)), as well as provide appropriate 
referrals for students potentially in need of 
mental health services, and ongoing mental 
health services. 

‘‘(3) To provide training and professional 
development for the school personnel and 

mental health professionals who will partici-
pate in the program carried out under this 
section. 

‘‘(4) To provide technical assistance and 
consultation to school systems and mental 
health agencies as well as to families partici-
pating in the program carried out under this 
section. 

‘‘(5) To provide linguistically appropriate 
and culturally competent services. 

‘‘(6) To evaluate the effectiveness of the 
program carried out under this section in in-
creasing student access to quality mental 
health services, and make recommendations 
to the Secretary about the sustainability of 
the program. 

‘‘(7) To engage and utilize expertise pro-
vided by institutions of higher education, 
such as a Tribal College or University, as de-
fined in section 316(b) of the Higher Edu-
cation Act of 1965. 

‘‘(d) APPLICATIONS.—To be eligible to re-
ceive a grant, contract, or cooperative agree-
ment under this section, an entity described 
in subsection (a) shall submit an application 
to the Secretary at such time, in such man-
ner, and containing such information as the 
Secretary may reasonably require, such as 
the following: 

‘‘(1) A description of the program to be 
funded under the grant, contract, or coopera-
tive agreement. 

‘‘(2) A description of how such program 
will increase access to quality mental health 
services for students. 

‘‘(3) A description of how the applicant will 
establish a crisis intervention program or 
conflict resolution practices, or both, that 
provide immediate mental health services to 
the school community as necessary. 

‘‘(4) An assurance that— 
‘‘(A) persons providing services under the 

grant, contract, or cooperative agreement 
are adequately trained to provide such serv-
ices; 

‘‘(B) the services will be provided in ac-
cordance with subsection (c); 

‘‘(C) teachers, administrators, parents or 
guardians, representatives of local Indian 
tribes, and other school personnel are aware 
of the program; and 

‘‘(D) parents or guardians of students par-
ticipating in services under this section will 
be engaged and involved in the design and 
implementation of the services. 

‘‘(5) An assurance that the applicant will 
support and integrate existing school-based 
services with the program in order to provide 
appropriate mental health services for stu-
dents. 

‘‘(6) An assurance that the applicant will 
establish a program that will support stu-
dents and the school in improving the school 
climate in order to support an environment 
conducive to learning. 

‘‘(e) INTERAGENCY AGREEMENTS.— 
‘‘(1) DESIGNATION OF LEAD AGENCY.—A re-

cipient of a grant, contract, or cooperative 
agreement under this section shall designate 
a lead agency to direct the establishment of 
an interagency agreement among local edu-
cational agencies, juvenile justice authori-
ties, mental health agencies, and other rel-
evant entities in the State, in collaboration 
with local entities, such as Indian tribes. 

‘‘(2) CONTENTS.—The interagency agree-
ment shall ensure the provision of the serv-
ices described in subsection (c), specifying 
with respect to each agency, authority, or 
entity— 

‘‘(A) the financial responsibility for the 
services; 

‘‘(B) the conditions and terms of responsi-
bility for the services, including quality, ac-
countability, and coordination of the serv-
ices; and 

‘‘(C) the conditions and terms of reim-
bursement among the agencies, authorities, 

or entities that are parties to the inter-
agency agreement, including procedures for 
dispute resolution. 

‘‘(f) EVALUATION.—The Secretary shall 
evaluate each program carried out under this 
section and shall disseminate the findings 
with respect to each such evaluation to ap-
propriate public, tribal, and private entities. 

‘‘(g) DISTRIBUTION OF AWARDS.—The Sec-
retary shall ensure that grants, contracts, 
and cooperative agreements awarded or en-
tered into under this section are equitably 
distributed among the geographical regions 
of the United States and among tribal, 
urban, suburban, and rural populations. 

‘‘(h) RULE OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in 
this section shall be construed— 

‘‘(1) to prohibit an entity involved with a 
program carried out under this section from 
reporting a crime that is committed by a 
student to appropriate authorities; or 

‘‘(2) to prevent State and tribal law en-
forcement and judicial authorities from ex-
ercising their responsibilities with regard to 
the application of Federal, tribal, and State 
law to crimes committed by a student. 

‘‘(i) SUPPLEMENT, NOT SUPPLANT.—Any 
services provided through programs carried 
out under this section shall supplement, and 
not supplant, existing mental health serv-
ices, including any services required to be 
provided under the Individuals with Disabil-
ities Education Act. 

‘‘(j) CONSULTATION WITH INDIAN TRIBES.—In 
carrying out subsection (a), the Secretary 
shall, in a timely manner, meaningfully con-
sult, engage, and cooperate with Indian 
tribes and their representatives to ensure no-
tice of eligibility. 

‘‘(k) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.— 
There are authorized to be appropriated to 
carry out this section such sums as may be 
necessary for fiscal years 2016 through 2021.’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2082 
(Purpose: To amend the Elementary and Sec-

ondary Education Act of 1965 relating to 
early learning) 
On page 627, line 8, strike ‘‘State.’’ and in-

sert ‘‘State, such as pay for success initia-
tives that promote coordination among ex-
isting programs and meet the purposes of 
this part.’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2106 
(Purpose: To amend title II of the Elemen-

tary and Secondary Education Act of 1965 
to include specialized instructional sup-
port personnel in the literacy development 
of children) 
On page 361, line 3, strike ‘‘school leaders, 

and’’ and insert ‘‘school leaders, specialized 
instructional support personnel (as appro-
priate), and’’. 

On page 362, line 19, insert ‘‘specialized in-
structional support personnel (as appro-
priate),’’ after ‘‘other school leaders,’’. 

On page 364, line 20, strike ‘‘and school per-
sonnel’’ and insert ‘‘school personnel, and 
specialized instructional support personnel 
(as appropriate)’’. 

On page 366, line 5, strike ‘‘and school per-
sonnel’’ and insert ‘‘specialized instructional 
support personnel (as appropriate), and 
school personnel’’. 

On page 367, line 2, insert ‘‘or specialized 
instructional support personnel’’ after ‘‘li-
brarians’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2247, AS MODIFIED 
(Purpose: To amend the allocation of funds 

under subpart 2 of part A of title I of the 
Elementary and Secondary Education Act 
of 1965) 
Strike sections 1009, 1010, and 1011 and in-

sert the following: 
SEC. 1009. GRANTS FOR THE OUTLYING AREAS 

AND THE SECRETARY OF THE INTE-
RIOR. 

Section 1121 (20 U.S.C. 6331) is amended— 
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(1) in subsection (a), in the matter pre-

ceding paragraph (1), by striking ‘‘and 
1125A(f)’’; and 

(2) in subsection (b)(3)(C)(ii), by striking 
‘‘challenging State academic content stand-
ards’’ and inserting ‘‘challenging State aca-
demic standards’’. 
SEC. 1010. ALLOCATIONS TO STATES. 

Section 1122 (20 U.S.C. 6332) is amended— 
(1) by striking subsection (a) and inserting 

the following: 
‘‘(a) ALLOCATION FORMULA.— 
‘‘(1) INITIAL ALLOCATION.—For each of fiscal 

years 2016 through 2021 (referred to in this 
subsection as the ‘current fiscal year’), the 
Secretary shall allocate $17,000,000,000 of the 
amount appropriated under section 1002(a) to 
carry out this part (or, if the total amount 
appropriated for this part is equal to or less 
than $17,000,000,000, all of such amount) in ac-
cordance with the following: 

‘‘(A) An amount equal to the amount made 
available to carry out section 1124 for fiscal 
year 2015 shall be allocated in accordance 
with section 1124. 

‘‘(B) An amount equal to the amount made 
available to carry out section 1124A for fiscal 
year 2015 shall be allocated in accordance 
with section 1124A. 

‘‘(C) An amount equal to 100 percent of the 
amount, if any, by which the amount made 
available under this paragraph for the cur-
rent fiscal year for which the determination 
is made exceeds the amount available to 
carry out sections 1124 and 1124A for fiscal 
year 2001 shall be allocated in accordance 
with section 1125 and 1125A. 

‘‘(2) ALLOCATIONS IN EXCESS OF 
$17,000,000,000.—For each of the current fiscal 
years for which the amounts appropriated 
under section 1002(a) to carry out this part 
exceed $17,000,000,000, an amount equal to 
such excess amount shall be allocated in ac-
cordance with section 1123.’’; 

(2) in subsection (b)— 
(A) in paragraph (1)— 
(i) by striking ‘‘under this subpart’’ and in-

serting ‘‘under subsection (a)(1) for sections 
1124, 1124A, 1125, and 1125A’’; and 

(ii) by striking ‘‘and 1125’’ and inserting 
‘‘1125, and 1125A’’; and 

(B) in paragraph (2)— 
(i) by inserting ‘‘under subsection (a)(1)’’ 

after ‘‘become available’’; and 
(ii) by striking ‘‘and 1125’’ and inserting 

‘‘1125, and 1125A’’; 
(3) in subsection (c)(1), by inserting ‘‘and to 

the extent amounts under subsection (a)(1) 
are available’’ after ‘‘For each fiscal year’’; 
and 

(4) in subsection (d)(1), by striking ‘‘under 
this subpart’’ and inserting ‘‘under sub-
section (a)(1) for sections 1124, 1124A, 1125, 
and 1125A’’. 
SEC. 1011. EQUITY GRANTS. 

Subpart 2 of part A of title I (20 U.S.C. 6331 
et se.) is amended by inserting after section 
1122 the following: 
‘‘SEC. 1123. EQUITY GRANTS. 

‘‘(a) AUTHORIZATION.—From funds appro-
priated under section 1002(a) for a fiscal year 
and available for allocation pursuant to sec-
tion 1122(a)(2), the Secretary is authorized to 
make grants to States, from allotments 
under subsection (b), to carry out the pro-
grams and activities of this part. 

‘‘(b) DISTRIBUTION BASED UPON CONCENTRA-
TIONS OF POVERTY.— 

‘‘(1) IN GENERAL.— 
‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in 

subparagraphs (B) and (C), funds appro-
priated pursuant to subsection (a) for a fiscal 
year shall be allotted to each State based 
upon the number of children counted under 
section 1124(c) in such State multiplied by 
the product of— 

‘‘(i) 40 percent of the average per-pupil ex-
penditure in the United States (other than 

the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico); multi-
plied by 

‘‘(ii) 1.30 minus such State’s equity factor 
described in paragraph (2). 

‘‘(B) PUERTO RICO.—For each fiscal year, 
the Secretary shall allot to the Common-
wealth of Puerto Rico an amount of the 
funds appropriated under subsection (a) that 
bears the same relation to the total amount 
of funds appropriated under such subsection 
as the amount that the Commonwealth of 
Puerto Rico received under this subpart for 
fiscal year 2015 bears to the total amount re-
ceived by all States for such fiscal year. 

‘‘(C) STATE MINIMUM.—Notwithstanding 
any other provision of this section except for 
subparagraph (B), from the total amount 
available for any fiscal year to carry out this 
section, each State shall be allotted at least 
the lesser of— 

‘‘(i) 0.35 percent of the total amount avail-
able to carry out this section for such fiscal 
year; or 

‘‘(ii) the average of— 
‘‘(I) 0.35 percent of such total amount for 

such fiscal year; and 
‘‘(II) 150 percent of the national average 

grant under this section per child described 
in section 1124(c), without application of a 
weighting factor, multiplied by the State’s 
total number of children described in section 
1124(c), without application of a weighting 
factor. 

‘‘(2) EQUITY FACTOR.— 
‘‘(A) DETERMINATION.— 
‘‘(i) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in 

subparagraph (B), the Secretary shall deter-
mine the equity factor under this section for 
each State in accordance with clause (ii). 

‘‘(ii) COMPUTATION.— 
‘‘(I) IN GENERAL.—For each State, the Sec-

retary shall compute a weighted coefficient 
of variation for the per-pupil expenditures of 
local educational agencies in accordance 
with subclauses (II), (III), and (IV). 

‘‘(II) VARIATION.—In computing coeffi-
cients of variation, the Secretary shall weigh 
the variation between per-pupil expenditures 
in each local educational agency and the av-
erage per-pupil expenditures in the State ac-
cording to the number of pupils served by 
the local educational agency. 

‘‘(III) NUMBER OF PUPILS.—In determining 
the number of pupils under this paragraph 
served by each local educational agency and 
in each State, the Secretary shall multiply 
the number of children counted under sec-
tion 1124(c) by a factor of 1.4. 

‘‘(IV) ENROLLMENT REQUIREMENT.—In com-
puting coefficients of variation, the Sec-
retary shall include only those local edu-
cational agencies with an enrollment of 
more than 200 students. 

‘‘(B) SPECIAL RULE.—The equity factor for 
a State that meets the disparity standard de-
scribed in section 222.162 of title 34, Code of 
Federal Regulations (as such section was in 
effect on the day preceding the date of enact-
ment of the No Child Left Behind Act of 2001) 
or a State with only one local educational 
agency shall be not greater than 0.10. 

‘‘(c) USE OF FUNDS; ELIGIBILITY OF LOCAL 
EDUCATIONAL AGENCIES.—All funds awarded 
to each State under this section shall be al-
located to local educational agencies under 
the following provisions: 

‘‘(1) DISTRIBUTION WITHIN LOCAL EDU-
CATIONAL AGENCIES.—Within local edu-
cational agencies, funds allocated under this 
section shall be distributed to schools on a 
basis consistent with section 1113, and may 
only be used to carry out activities under 
this part. 

‘‘(2) ELIGIBILITY FOR GRANT.—A local edu-
cational agency in a State is eligible to re-
ceive a grant under this section for any fis-
cal year if— 

‘‘(A) the number of children in the local 
educational agency counted under section 
1124(c), before application of the weighted 
child count described in subsection (d), is at 
least 10; and 

‘‘(B) if the number of children counted for 
grants under section 1124(c), before applica-
tion of the weighted child count described in 
subsection (d), is at least 5 percent of the 
total number of children aged 5 to 17 years, 
inclusive, in the school district of the local 
educational agency. 

‘‘(d) ALLOCATION OF FUNDS TO ELIGIBLE 
LOCAL EDUCATIONAL AGENCIES.— 

‘‘(1) IN GENERAL.—Funds received by States 
under this section for a fiscal year shall be 
allocated within States to eligible local edu-
cational agencies on the basis of weighted 
child counts calculated in accordance with 
paragraph (2), (3), or (4), as appropriate for 
each State. 

‘‘(2) STATES WITH AN EQUITY FACTOR LESS 
THAN .10.— 

‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—In States with an equity 
factor less than .10, the weighted child 
counts referred to in paragraph (1) for a fis-
cal year shall be the larger of the 2 amounts 
determined under subparagraphs (B) and (C). 

‘‘(B) BY PERCENTAGE OF CHILDREN.—The 
amount referred to in subparagraph (A) is de-
termined by adding— 

‘‘(i) the number of children determined 
under section 1124(c) for that local edu-
cational agency who constitute not more 
than 17.27 percent, inclusive, of the agency’s 
total population aged 5 to 17, inclusive, mul-
tiplied by 1.0; 

‘‘(ii) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 17.27 percent, but not more 
than 23.48 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 1.75; 

‘‘(iii) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 23.48 percent, but not more 
than 29.11 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 2.5; 

‘‘(iv) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 29.11 percent, but not more 
than 36.10 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 3.25; and 

‘‘(v) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 36.10 percent of such popu-
lation, multiplied by 4.0. 

‘‘(C) BY NUMBER OF CHILDREN.—The amount 
referred to in subparagraph (A) is determined 
by adding— 

‘‘(i) the number of children determined 
under section 1124(c) who constitute not 
more than 834, inclusive, of the agency’s 
total population aged 5 to 17, inclusive, mul-
tiplied by 1.0; 

‘‘(ii) the number of such children between 
835 and 2,629, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 1.5; 

‘‘(iii) the number of such children between 
2,630 and 7,668, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 2.0; and 

‘‘(iv)(I) in the case of an agency that is not 
a high poverty percentage local educational 
agency, the number of such children in ex-
cess of 7,668 in such population, multiplied 
by 2.0; or 

‘‘(II) in the case of a high poverty percent-
age local educational agency— 

‘‘(aa) the number of such children between 
7,669 and 26,412, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 2.5; and 

‘‘(bb) the number of such children in excess 
of 26,412 in such population, multiplied by 
3.0. 

‘‘(3) STATES WITH AN EQUITY FACTOR GREAT-
ER THAN OR EQUAL TO .10 AND LESS THAN .20.— 

‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—In States with an equity 
factor greater than or equal to .10 and less 
than .20, the weighted child counts referred 
to in paragraph (1) for a fiscal year shall be 
the larger of the 2 amounts determined 
under subparagraphs (B) and (C). 
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‘‘(B) BY PERCENTAGE OF CHILDREN.—The 

amount referred to in subparagraph (A) is de-
termined by adding— 

‘‘(i) the number of children determined 
under section 1124(c) for that local edu-
cational agency who constitute not more 
than 17.27 percent, inclusive, of the agency’s 
total population aged 5 to 17, inclusive, mul-
tiplied by 1.0; 

‘‘(ii) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 17.27 percent, but not more 
than 23.48 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 1.5; 

‘‘(iii) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 23.48 percent, but not more 
than 29.11 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 3.0; 

‘‘(iv) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 29.11 percent, but not more 
than 36.10 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 4.5; and 

‘‘(v) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 36.10 percent of such popu-
lation, multiplied by 6.0. 

‘‘(C) BY NUMBER OF CHILDREN.—The amount 
referred to in subparagraph (A) is determined 
by adding— 

‘‘(i) the number of children determined 
under section 1124(c) who constitute not 
more than 834, inclusive, of the agency’s 
total population aged 5 to 17, inclusive, mul-
tiplied by 1.0; 

‘‘(ii) the number of such children between 
835 and 2,629, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 1.5; 

‘‘(iii) the number of such children between 
2,630 and 7,668, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 2.25; and 

‘‘(iv)(I) in the case of an agency that is not 
a high poverty percentage local educational 
agency, the number of such children in ex-
cess of 7,668 in such population, multiplied 
by 2.25; or 

‘‘(II) in the case of a high poverty percent-
age local educational agency— 

‘‘(aa) the number of such children between 
7,669 and 26,412, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 3.375; and 

‘‘(bb) the number of such children in excess 
of 26,412 in such population, multiplied by 
4.5. 

‘‘(4) STATES WITH AN EQUITY FACTOR GREAT-
ER THAN OR EQUAL TO .20.— 

‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—In States with an equity 
factor greater than or equal to .20, the 
weighted child counts referred to in para-
graph (1) for a fiscal year shall be the larger 
of the 2 amounts determined under subpara-
graphs (B) and (C). 

‘‘(B) BY PERCENTAGE OF CHILDREN.—The 
amount referred to in subparagraph (A) is de-
termined by adding— 

‘‘(i) the number of children determined 
under section 1124(c) for that local edu-
cational agency who constitute not more 
than 17.27 percent, inclusive, of the agency’s 
total population aged 5 to 17, inclusive, mul-
tiplied by 1.0; 

‘‘(ii) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 17.27 percent, but not more 
than 23.48 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 2.0; 

‘‘(iii) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 23.48 percent, but not more 
than 29.11 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 4.0; 

‘‘(iv) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 29.11 percent, but not more 
than 36.10 percent, of such population, multi-
plied by 6.0; and 

‘‘(v) the number of such children who con-
stitute more than 36.10 percent of such popu-
lation, multiplied by 8.0. 

‘‘(C) BY NUMBER OF CHILDREN.—The amount 
referred to in subparagraph (A) is determined 
by adding— 

‘‘(i) the number of children determined 
under section 1124(c) who constitute not 

more than 834, inclusive, of the agency’s 
total population aged 5 to 17, inclusive, mul-
tiplied by 1.0; 

‘‘(ii) the number of such children between 
835 and 2,629, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 2.0; 

‘‘(iii) the number of such children between 
2,630 and 7,668, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 3.0; and 

‘‘(iv)(I) in the case of an agency that is not 
a high poverty percentage local educational 
agency, the number of such children in ex-
cess of 7,668 in such population, multiplied 
by 3.0; or 

‘‘(II) in the case of a high poverty percent-
age local educational agency— 

‘‘(aa) the number of such children between 
7,669 and 26,412, inclusive, in such population, 
multiplied by 4.5; and 

‘‘(bb) the number of such children in excess 
of 26,412 in such population, multiplied by 
6.0. 

‘‘(e) MAINTENANCE OF EFFORT.— 
‘‘(1) IN GENERAL.—A State is entitled to re-

ceive its full allotment of funds under this 
section for any fiscal year if the Secretary 
finds that the State’s fiscal effort per stu-
dent or the aggregate expenditures of the 
State with respect to the provision of free 
public education by the State for the pre-
ceding fiscal year was not less than 90 per-
cent of the fiscal effort or aggregate expendi-
tures for the second preceding fiscal year, 
subject to the requirements of paragraph (2). 

‘‘(2) REDUCTION IN CASE OF FAILURE TO 
MEET.— 

‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall re-
duce the amount of the allotment of funds 
under this section in any fiscal year in the 
exact proportion by which a State fails to 
meet the requirement of paragraph (1) by 
falling below 90 percent of both the fiscal ef-
fort per student and aggregate expenditures 
(using the measure most favorable to the 
State), if such State has also failed to meet 
such requirement (as determined using the 
measure most favorable to the State) for 1 or 
more of the 5 immediately preceding fiscal 
years. 

‘‘(B) SPECIAL RULE.—No such lesser amount 
shall be used for computing the effort re-
quired under paragraph (1) for subsequent 
years. 

‘‘(3) WAIVER.—The Secretary may waive 
the requirements of this subsection if the 
Secretary determines that a waiver would be 
equitable due to— 

‘‘(A) exceptional or uncontrollable cir-
cumstances, such as a natural disaster or a 
change in the organizational structure of the 
State; or 

‘‘(B) a precipitous decline in the financial 
resources of the State. 

‘‘(f) ADJUSTMENTS WHERE NECESSITATED BY 
APPROPRIATIONS.— 

‘‘(1) IN GENERAL.—If the sums available 
under this section for any fiscal year are in-
sufficient to pay the full amounts that all 
local educational agencies in States are eli-
gible to receive under this section for such 
year, the Secretary shall ratably reduce the 
allocations to such local educational agen-
cies, subject to paragraphs (2) and (3). 

‘‘(2) ADDITIONAL FUNDS.—If additional 
funds become available for making payments 
under this section for such fiscal year, allo-
cations that were reduced under paragraph 
(1) shall be increased on the same basis as 
they were reduced. 

‘‘(3) HOLD HARMLESS AMOUNTS.—Beginning 
with the second fiscal year for which 
amounts are appropriated to carry out this 
section, and if sufficient funds are available, 
the amount made available to each local 
educational agency under this section for a 
fiscal year shall be— 

‘‘(A) not less than 95 percent of the amount 
made available for the preceding fiscal year 

if the number of children counted under sec-
tion 1124(c) is equal to or more than 30 per-
cent of the total number of children aged 5 
to 17 years, inclusive, in the local edu-
cational agency; 

‘‘(B) not less than 90 percent of the amount 
made available for the preceding fiscal year 
if the percentage described in subparagraph 
(A) is less than 30 percent and equal to or 
more than 15 percent; and 

‘‘(C) not less than 85 percent of the amount 
made available for the preceding fiscal year 
if the percentage described in subparagraph 
(A) is less than 15 percent. 

‘‘(4) APPLICABILITY.—Notwithstanding any 
other provision of law, the Secretary shall 
not take into consideration the hold-harm-
less provisions of this subsection for any fis-
cal year for purposes of calculating State or 
local allocations for the fiscal year under 
any program administered by the Secretary 
other than a program authorized under this 
part. 

‘‘(g) DEFINITIONS.—In this section: 
‘‘(1) HIGH POVERTY PERCENTAGE LOCAL EDU-

CATIONAL AGENCY.—The term ‘high poverty 
percentage local educational agency’ means 
a local educational agency for which the 
number of children determined under sub-
section (b) for a fiscal year is 20 percent or 
more of the total population aged 5 to 17, in-
clusive, of the local educational agency for 
such fiscal year. 

‘‘(2) STATE.—The term ‘State’ means each 
of the 50 States, the District of Columbia, 
and the Commonwealth of Puerto Rico.’’. 

SEC. 1011A. ADEQUACY OF FUNDING RULE. 

Section 1125AA(b) (20 U.S.C. 6336(b)) is 
amended by striking ‘‘section 1122(a)’’ and 
inserting ‘‘section 1122(a)(1)’’. 

SEC. 1011B. EDUCATION FINANCE INCENTIVE 
GRANT PROGRAM. 

In section 1125A (20 U.S.C. 6337)— 
(1) in subsection (a), by striking ‘‘under 

subsection (f)’’ and inserting ‘‘under section 
1002(a) and made available under section 
1122(a)(1)’’; 

(2) in subsection (b), by striking ‘‘pursuant 
to subsection (f)’’ and inserting ‘‘made avail-
able for this section under section 
1122(a)(1)’’; 

(3) in subsection (c), by redesignating sub-
paragraphs (A) and (B) as paragraphs (1) and 
(2), respectively; 

(4) in subsection (d)(1)(A)(ii), by striking 
‘‘clause ‘‘(i)’’ and inserting ‘‘clause (i)’’; 

(5) by striking subsection (e) and inserting 
the following: 

‘‘(e) MAINTENANCE OF EFFORT.— 
‘‘(1) IN GENERAL.—A State is entitled to re-

ceive its full allotment of funds under this 
section for any fiscal year if the Secretary 
finds that the State’s fiscal effort per stu-
dent or the aggregate expenditures of the 
State with respect to the provision of free 
public education by the State for the pre-
ceding fiscal year was not less than 90 per-
cent of the fiscal effort or aggregate expendi-
tures for the second preceding fiscal year, 
subject to the requirements of paragraph (2). 

‘‘(2) REDUCTION IN CASE OF FAILURE TO 
MEET.— 

‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall re-
duce the amount of the allotment of funds 
under this section for any fiscal year in the 
exact proportion by which a State fails to 
meet the requirement of paragraph (1) by 
falling below 90 percent of both the fiscal ef-
fort per student and aggregate expenditures 
(using the measure most favorable to the 
State), if such State has also failed to meet 
such requirement (as determined using the 
measure most favorable to the State) for 1 or 
more of the 5 immediately preceding fiscal 
years. 
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‘‘(B) SPECIAL RULE.—No such lesser amount 

shall be used for computing the effort re-
quired under paragraph (1) for subsequent 
years. 

‘‘(3) WAIVER.—The Secretary may waive 
the requirements of this subsection if the 
Secretary determines that a waiver would be 
equitable due to— 

‘‘(A) exceptional or uncontrollable cir-
cumstances, such as a natural disaster or a 
change in the organizational structure of the 
State; or 

‘‘(B) a precipitous decline in the financial 
resources of the State.’’; 

(6) by striking subsection (f); 
(7) by redesignating subsection (g) as sub-

section (f); and 
(8) in subsection (f), as redesignated by 

paragraph (7)— 
(A) in paragraph (1), by striking ‘‘under 

this section’’ and inserting ‘‘to carry out this 
section’’; and 

(B) in subsection (f)(3), in the matter pre-
ceding subparagraph (A), by striking ‘‘shall 
be’’ and inserting ‘‘shall be—’’. 
SEC. 1011C. SPECIAL ALLOCATION PROCEDURES. 

Section 1126 (20 U.S.C. 6338) is amended by 
striking ‘‘sections 1124, 1124A, 1125, and 
1125A’’ each place the term appears and in-
serting ‘‘sections 1123, 1124, 1124A, 1125, and 
1125A’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2186 

(Purpose: To establish the Promise 
Neighborhoods program) 

(The amendment is printed in the 
RECORD of July 9, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2100 

(Purpose: To amend title V of the Elemen-
tary and Secondary Education Act of 1965 
to establish a full-service community 
schools grant program) 

(The amendment is printed in the 
RECORD of July 7, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2144 

(Purpose: To provide States and local edu-
cational agencies with resources on cli-
mate theory to promote improved science 
education) 

At the end of part B of title X, add the fol-
lowing: 
SEC. 10202. RESOURCES FOR IMPROVED SCIENCE 

EDUCATION. 

(a) IN GENERAL.—The Administrator of the 
Environmental Protection Agency and the 
Administrator of the National Oceanic and 
Atmospheric Administration shall provide 
States and local educational agencies with 
balanced, objective resources on climate the-
ory to promote improved science education 
for students in kindergarten through grade 
12, including materials regarding— 

(1) the natural causes and cycles of climate 
change; 

(2) the uncertainties inherent in climate 
modeling; and 

(3) the myriad factors that influence the 
climate of the Earth. 

(b) RESOURCES.—The resources provided 
under subsection (a) shall be— 

(1) in addition to any climate theory re-
sources the Administrator of the Environ-
mental Protection Agency or the Adminis-
trator of the National Oceanic and Atmos-
pheric Administration are providing to 
States or local educational agencies on the 
day before the date of enactment of this Act; 
and 

(2) made available to promote open class-
room discussion that builds student skills in 
scientific reasoning, critical thinking, and 
independent thought. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2176 

(Purpose: To establish a climate change 
education program) 

At the end of title V, add the following: 
SEC. 5011. CLIMATE CHANGE EDUCATION. 

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This section may be 
cited as the ‘‘Climate Change Education 
Act’’. 

(b) FINDINGS.—Congress finds that— 
(1) carbon pollution is accumulating in the 

atmosphere, causing global temperatures to 
rise at a rate that poses a significant threat 
to the economy and security of the United 
States, to public health and welfare, and to 
the global environment; 

(2) climate change is already impacting the 
United States with sea level rise, ocean 
acidification, and more frequent or intense 
extreme weather events such as heat waves, 
heavy rainfalls, droughts, floods, and 
wildfires; 

(3) the scientific evidence for human-in-
duced climate change is overwhelming and 
undeniable as demonstrated by statements 
from the National Academy of Sciences, the 
National Climate Assessment, and numerous 
other science professional organizations in 
the United States; 

(4) the United States has a responsibility 
to children and future generations of the 
United States to address the harmful effects 
of climate change; 

(5) providing clear information about cli-
mate change, in a variety of forms, can en-
courage individuals and communities to take 
action; 

(6) the actions of a single nation cannot 
solve the climate crisis, so solutions that ad-
dress both mitigation and adaptation must 
involve developed and developing nations 
around the world; 

(7) investing in the development of innova-
tive clean energy and energy efficiency tech-
nologies will— 

(A) enhance the global leadership and com-
petitiveness of the United States; and 

(B) create and sustain short and long term 
job growth; 

(8) implementation of measures that pro-
mote energy efficiency, conservation, and re-
newable energy will greatly reduce human 
impact on the environment; and 

(9) education about climate change is im-
portant to ensure the future generation of 
leaders is well-informed about the challenges 
facing our planet in order to make decisions 
based on science and fact. 

(c) AMENDMENT TO ESEA.—Title V of the 
Elementary and Secondary Education Act of 
1965 (20 U.S.C. 7201 et seq.), as amended by 
section 5010, is further amended by adding at 
the end the following: 

‘‘PART J—CLIMATE CHANGE EDUCATION 
‘‘SEC. 5911. CLIMATE CHANGE EDUCATION PRO-

GRAM. 
‘‘(a) PURPOSE.—The purpose of this section 

is to— 
‘‘(1) broaden the understanding of human 

induced climate change, possible long and 
short-term consequences, and potential solu-
tions; 

‘‘(2) provide learning opportunities in cli-
mate science education for all students 
through grade 12, including those of diverse 
cultural and linguistic backgrounds; 

‘‘(3) emphasize actionable information to 
help students understand how to utilize new 
technologies and programs related to energy 
conservation, clean energy, and carbon pol-
lution reduction; and 

‘‘(4) inform the public of impacts to human 
health and safety as a result of climate 
change. 

‘‘(b) GRANTS AUTHORIZED.—The Secretary, 
in consultation with the National Oceanic 
and Atmospheric Administration, the Envi-

ronmental Protection Agency, and the De-
partment of Energy, shall establish a com-
petitive grant program to provide grants to 
States to— 

‘‘(1) develop or improve climate science 
curriculum and supplementary educational 
materials for grades kindergarten through 
grade 12; 

‘‘(2) initiate, develop, expand, or imple-
ment statewide plans and programs for cli-
mate change education, including relevant 
teacher training and professional develop-
ment and multidisciplinary studies to ensure 
that students graduate from high school cli-
mate literate; or 

‘‘(3) create State green school building 
standards or policies. 

‘‘(c) APPLICATION.—A State desiring to re-
ceive a grant under this section shall submit 
an application to the Secretary at such time, 
in such manner, and accompanied by such in-
formation as the Secretary may reasonably 
require. 

‘‘(d) REPORT TO CONGRESS.—Not later than 
1 year after the date of enactment of this 
section, and annually thereafter, the Sec-
retary shall transmit to Congress a report 
that evaluates the scientific merits, edu-
cational effectiveness, and broader impacts 
of activities under this section. 

‘‘(e) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.— 
There are authorized to be appropriated to 
carry out this section such sums as may be 
necessary.’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2241 
(Purpose: To amend the accountability 

provisions) 
(The amendment is printed in the 

RECORD of July 14, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2177 
(Purpose: To provide for youth jobs, and for 

other purposes) 
(The amendment is printed in the 

RECORD of July 8, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2242 
(Purpose: To establish a Federal-State part-

nership to provide access to high-quality 
public prekindergarten programs from low- 
income and moderate-income families to 
ensure that they enter kindergarten pre-
pared for success, and for other purposes) 
(The amendment is printed in the 

RECORD of July 14, 2015, under ‘‘Text of 
Amendments.’’) 

AMENDMENT NO. 2130 
(Purpose: To amend title I to support 

assessments of school facilities) 
On page 69, between lines 16 and 17, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(N) if applicable, whether the State con-

ducts periodic assessments of the condition 
of elementary school and secondary school 
facilities in the State, which may include an 
assessment of the age of the facility and the 
state of repair of the facility; 

AMENDMENT NO. 2215, AS MODIFIED 
(Purpose: To include partnering with current 

and recently retired STEM professionals 
and tailoring educational resources to en-
gage students and teachers in STEM) 
Beginning on page 373, strike line 22 and 

all that follows through page 374, line 3, and 
insert the following: 
in the State; 

‘‘(C) information on student exposure to 
and retention in science, technology, engi-
neering, and mathematics fields, including 
among low-income and underrepresented 
groups, which may include results from a 
pre-existing analysis; and 

‘‘(D) an analysis of the quality of pre-serv-
ice preparation at all public institutions of 
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higher education (including alternative 
pathways to teacher licensure or certifi-
cation) for individuals preparing to teach 
science, technology, engineering, and mathe-
matics subjects in the State. 

On page 381, between lines 18 and 19, insert 
the following: 

‘‘(vi) partner with current or recently re-
tired science, technology, engineering, and 
mathematics professionals to engage stu-
dents and teachers in instruction in such 
subjects; 

‘‘(vii) tailor and integrate educational re-
sources developed by Federal agencies, as ap-
propriate, to improve student achievement 
in science, technology, engineering, and 
mathematics; 

AMENDMENT NO. 2222 

(Purpose: To amend the State plan require-
ments of section 1111 of the Elementary 
and Secondary Education Act of 1965 in 
order to support children facing substance 
abuse in the home) 

On page 69, between lines 16 and 17, insert 
the following: 

‘‘(N) if applicable, how the State edu-
cational agency will provide support to local 
educational agencies for the education of 
children facing substance abuse in the home, 
which may include how such agency will pro-
vide professional development, training, and 
technical assistance to local educational 
agencies, elementary schools, and secondary 
schools in communities with high rates of 
substance abuse; and’’. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2231 

(Purpose: To support professional develop-
ment to help students prepare for postsec-
ondary education and the workforce) 

On page 284, strike lines 4 through 8 and in-
sert the following: 

(xix) Supporting the efforts and profes-
sional development of teachers, principals, 
and other school leaders to integrate aca-
demic and career and technical education 
content into instructional practices, which 
may include— 

(I) integrating career and technical edu-
cation with advanced coursework, such as by 
allowing the acquisition of postsecondary 
credits, recognized postsecondary creden-
tials, and industry-based credentials, by stu-
dents while in high school; or 

(II) coordinating activities with employers 
and entities carrying out initiatives under 
other workforce development programs to 
identify State and regional workforce needs, 
such as through the development of State 
and local plans under title I of the Workforce 
Innovation and Opportunity Act (29 U.S.C. 
3111 et seq); 

On page 306, strike lines 18 through 23 and 
insert the following: 

(U) providing high-quality professional de-
velopment for teachers, principals, and other 
school leaders on effective strategies to inte-
grate rigorous academic content, career and 
technical education, and work-based learn-
ing, if appropriate, which may include pro-
viding common planning time, to help pre-
pare students for postsecondary education 
and the workforce without the need for re-
mediation; and 

AMENDMENT NO. 2188 

(Purpose: To ensure States will ensure the 
unique needs of students at all levels of 
schooling) 

On page 69, between lines 12 and 13, insert 
the following: 

‘‘(M) how the State will ensure the unique 
needs of students at all levels of schooling 
are met, particularly students in the middle 
grades and high school, including how the 
State will work with local educational agen-
cies to— 

‘‘(i) assist in the identification of middle 
grades and high school students who are at- 
risk of dropping out, such as through the 
continuous use of student data related to 
measures such as attendance, student sus-
pensions, course performance, and, postsec-
ondary credit accumulation that results in 
actionable steps to inform and differentiate 
instruction and support; 

‘‘(ii) ensure effective student transitions 
from elementary school to middle grades and 
middle grades to high school, such as by 
aligning curriculum and supports or imple-
menting personal academic plans to enable 
such students to stay on the path to gradua-
tion; 

‘‘(iii) ensure effective student transitions 
from high school to postsecondary edu-
cation, such as through the establishment of 
partnerships between local educational agen-
cies and institutions of higher education and 
providing students with choices for pathways 
to postsecondary education, which may in-
clude the integration of rigorous academics, 
career and technical education, and work- 
based learning; 

‘‘(iv) provide professional development to 
teachers, principals, other school leaders, 
and other school personnel in addressing the 
academic and developmental needs of such 
students; and 

‘‘(v) implement any other evidence-based 
strategies or activities that the State deter-
mines appropriate for addressing the unique 
needs of such students; 

On page 69, line 13, strike ‘‘(M)’’ and insert 
‘‘(N)’’. 

On page 69, line 17, strike ‘‘(N)’’ and insert 
‘‘(O)’’. 

On page 772, between lines 14 and 15, insert 
the following: 

‘‘(47) MIDDLE GRADES.—The term middle 
grades means any of grades 5 through 8.’’. 

At the end of the bill, add the following: 
SEC. 1020l. REPORT ON THE REDUCTION OF THE 

NUMBER AND PERCENTAGE OF STU-
DENTS WHO DROP OUT OF SCHOOL. 

Not later than 5 years after the date of en-
actment of this Act, the Director of the In-
stitute of Education Sciences shall evaluate 
the impact of section 1111(c)(1)(M) on reduc-
ing the number and percentage of students 
who drop out of school. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2156 
(Purpose: To amend the State report card 

under section 1111 of the Elementary and 
Secondary Education Act of 1965 to include 
the rates of enrollment in postsecondary 
education, and remediation rates, for high 
schools) 
On page 82, between lines 23 and 24, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(xviii) for each high school in the State, 

and beginning with the report card released 
in 2017, the cohort rate (in the aggregate, and 
disaggregated for each category of students 
defined in subsection (b)(3)(A), except that 
such disaggregation shall not be required in 
a case in which the number of students is in-
sufficient to yield statistically reliable infor-
mation or the results would reveal person-
ally identifiable information about an indi-
vidual student) at which students who grad-
uate from the high school enroll, for the first 
academic year that begins after the stu-
dents’ graduation— 

‘‘(I) in programs of public postsecondary 
education in the State; and 

‘‘(II) if data are available and to the extent 
practicable, in programs of private postsec-
ondary education in the State or programs of 
postsecondary education outside the State; 

‘‘(xix) if available and to the extent prac-
ticable, for each high school in the State and 
beginning with the report card released in 
2018, the remediation rate (in the aggregate, 
and disaggregated for each category of stu-

dents defined in subsection (b)(3)(A), except 
that such disaggregation shall not be re-
quired in a case in which the number of stu-
dents is insufficient to yield statistically re-
liable information or the results would re-
veal personally identifiable information 
about an individual student) for students 
who graduate from the high school at— 

‘‘(I) programs of postsecondary education 
in the State; and 

‘‘(II) programs of postsecondary education 
outside the State; 

AMENDMENT NO. 2232 
(Purpose: To allow extended services Project 

SERV grants under part A of title IV of the 
Elementary and Secondary Education Act 
of 1965 to be available for violence preven-
tion activities) 
On page 431, between lines 19 and 20, insert 

the following: 
‘‘(e) PROJECT SERV.— 
‘‘(1) ADDITIONAL USE OF FUNDS.—Funds 

available under subsection (a)(4) for extended 
services grants under the Project School 
Emergency Response to Violence program 
(referred to in this subsection as the ‘Project 
SERV program’) may be used by a local edu-
cational agency or institution of higher edu-
cation receiving such grant to initiate or 
strengthen violence prevention activities, as 
part of the activities designed to restore the 
learning environment that was disrupted by 
the violent or traumatic crisis in response to 
which the grant was awarded, and as pro-
vided in this subsection. 

‘‘(2) APPLICATION PROCESS.— 
‘‘(A) IN GENERAL.—A local educational 

agency or institution of higher education de-
siring to use a portion of extended services 
grant funds under the Project SERV pro-
gram to initiate or strengthen a violence 
prevention activity shall— 

‘‘(i) submit, in an application that meets 
all requirements of the Secretary for the 
Project SERV program, the information de-
scribed in subparagraph (B); or 

‘‘(ii) in the case of a local educational 
agency or institution of higher education 
that has already received an extended serv-
ices grant under the Project SERV program, 
submit an addition to the original applica-
tion that includes the information described 
in subparagraph (B). 

‘‘(B) APPLICATION REQUIREMENTS.—The in-
formation required under this subparagraph 
is the following: 

‘‘(i) A demonstration that there is a con-
tinued disruption or a substantial risk of dis-
ruption to the learning environment that 
would be addressed by such activity. 

‘‘(ii) An explanation of the proposed activ-
ity designed to restore and preserve the 
learning environment. 

‘‘(iii) A budget and budget narrative for 
the proposed activity. 

‘‘(3) AWARD BASIS.—Any award of funds 
under the Project SERV program for vio-
lence prevention activities under this sub-
section shall be subject to the discretion of 
the Secretary and the availability of funds. 

‘‘(4) PROHIBITED USE.—No funds provided to 
a local educational agency or institution of 
higher education under the Project SERV 
program for violence prevention activities 
may be used for construction, renovation, or 
repair of a facility or for the permanent in-
frastructure of the local educational agency 
or institution. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2256 
(Purpose: To amend the definitions of eligi-

ble technology and technology readiness 
survey and to provide a restriction on 
funds) 
Beginning on page 587, strike line 15 and 

all that follows through page 588, line 10, and 
insert the following: 
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‘‘(2) ELIGIBLE TECHNOLOGY.—The term ‘eli-

gible technology’ means modern computer, 
and communication technology software, 
services, or tools, including computer or mo-
bile devices, whether for use in school or at 
home, software applications, systems and 
platforms, digital learning content, and re-
lated services, supports, and strategies, 
which may include strategies to assist eligi-
ble children without adequate Internet ac-
cess at home to complete homework. 

‘‘(3) TECHNOLOGY READINESS SURVEY.—The 
term ‘technology readiness survey’ means a 
survey completed by a local educational 
agency that provides standardized informa-
tion on the quantity and types of technology 
infrastructure and access available to the 
students and in the community served by the 
local educational agency, including com-
puter devices, access to school libraries, 
Internet connectivity (including Internet ac-
cess outside of the school day), operating 
systems, related network infrastructure, 
data systems, educator professional learning 
needs and priorities, and data security. 

‘‘(4) UNIVERSAL DESIGN FOR LEARNING.—The 
term ‘universal design for learning’ has the 
meaning given the term in section 103 of the 
Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1003). 
‘‘SEC. 5702A. RESTRICTION. 

‘‘Funds awarded under this part shall not 
be used to address the networking needs of 
an entity that is eligible to receive support 
under the E-rate program. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2240 
(Purpose: To provide resources needed to 

study and review Native American lan-
guage medium schools and programs) 
At the end of the bill, add the following: 

SEC. 1020ll. REPORT ON NATIVE AMERICAN 
LANGUAGE MEDIUM EDUCATION. 

(a) PURPOSE.—The purpose of this section 
is to authorize a study to evaluate all levels 
of education being provided primarily 
through the medium of Native languages and 
to require a report of the findings, within the 
context of the findings, purposes, and provi-
sions of the Native American Languages Act 
(25 U.S.C. 2901), the findings, purposes, and 
provisions of the Elementary and Secondary 
Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 6301 et seq.), 
and other related laws. 

(b) STUDY AND REVIEW.—The Secretary of 
Education shall award grants to eligible en-
tities to study and review Native language 
medium schools and programs. 

(c) ELIGIBLE ENTITY DEFINED.—In this sec-
tion, the term ‘‘eligible entity’’ means a con-
sortium that— 

(1) includes not less than 3 units of an in-
stitution of higher education, such as a de-
partment, center, or college, that has signifi-
cant experience— 

(A) and expertise in Native American or 
Alaska Native languages, and Native lan-
guage medium education; and 

(B) in outreach and collaboration with Na-
tive communities; 

(2) has within its membership at least 10 
years of experience— 

(A) addressing a range of Native American 
or Alaska Native languages and indigenous 
language medium education issues through 
the lens of Native studies, linguistics, and 
education; and 

(B) working in close association with a va-
riety of schools and programs taught pre-
dominantly through the medium of a Native 
language; 

(3) includes for each of American Indians, 
Alaska Natives, and Native Hawaiians, at 
least 1 unit of an institution of higher edu-
cation that focuses on schools that serve 
such populations; and 

(4) includes Native American scholars and 
staff who are fluent in Native American lan-
guages. 

(d) APPLICATIONS.—An eligible entity that 
desires to receive a grant under this section 
shall submit an application to the Secretary 
of Education that— 

(1) identifies 1 unit in the consortium that 
is the lead unit of the consortium for the 
study, reporting, and funding purposes; 

(2) includes letters of verification of par-
ticipation from the top internal administra-
tors of each unit in the consortium; 

(3) includes a brief description of how the 
consortium meets the eligibility qualifica-
tions under subsection (c); 

(4) describes the work proposed to carry 
out the purpose of this section; and 

(5) provides other information as requested 
by the Secretary of Education. 

(e) SCOPE OF STUDY.—An eligible entity 
that receives a grant under this section shall 
use the grant funds to study and review Na-
tive American language medium schools and 
programs and evaluate the components, poli-
cies, and practices of successful Native lan-
guage medium schools and programs and 
how the students who enroll in them do over 
the long term, including— 

(1) the level of expertise in educational 
pedagogy, Native language fluency, and ex-
perience of the principal, teachers, para-
professionals, and other educational staff; 

(2) how such schools and programs are 
using Native languages to provide instruc-
tion in reading, language arts, mathematics, 
science, and, as applicable, other core aca-
demic subjects; 

(3) how such school and programs’ cur-
ricula incorporates the relevant Native cul-
ture of the students; 

(4) how such schools and programs assess 
the academic proficiency of the students, in-
cluding— 

(A) whether the school administers assess-
ments of language arts, mathematics, 
science, and other academic subjects in the 
Native language of instruction; 

(B) whether the school administers assess-
ments of language arts, mathematics, 
science, and other academic subjects in 
English; and 

(C) how the standards measured by the as-
sessments in the Native language of instruc-
tion and in English compare; 

(5) the academic, graduation rate, and 
other outcomes of students who have com-
pleted the highest grade taught primarily 
through such schools or programs, including, 
when available, college attendance rates 
compared with demographically similar stu-
dents who did not attend a school in which 
the language of instruction was a Native lan-
guage; and 

(6) other appropriate information con-
sistent with the purpose of this section. 

(f) OTHER ENTITIES.—An eligible entity 
may enter into a contract with another indi-
vidual, entity, or organization to assist in 
carrying out research necessary to fulfill the 
purpose of this section. 

(g) RECOMMENDATIONS.—Not later than 18 
months after the date of enactment of this 
Act, an eligible entity that receives a grant 
under this section shall— 

(1) develop a detailed statement of findings 
and conclusions regarding the study com-
pleted under subsection (e), including rec-
ommendations for such legislative and ad-
ministrative actions as the eligible entity 
considers to be appropriate; and 

(2) submit a report setting forth the find-
ings and conclusions, including recommenda-
tions, described in paragraph (1) to each of 
the following: 

(A) The Committee on Health, Education, 
Labor, and Pensions of the Senate. 

(B) The Committee on Education and the 
Workforce of the House of Representatives. 

(C) The Committee on Indian Affairs of the 
Senate. 

(D) The Subcommittee on Indian, Insular, 
and Alaska Native Affairs of the House of 
Representatives. 

(E) The Secretary of Education. 
(F) The Secretary of the Interior. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2249 
(Purpose: To amend section 1111(c) of the 

ESEA to require States to provide an as-
surance regarding cross-tabulation of stu-
dent data) 
On page 73, line 12, strike the period at the 

end and insert the following: ‘‘; and 
‘‘(N) the State educational agency will pro-

vide the information described in clauses (ii), 
(iii), and (iv) of subsection (d)(1)(C) to the 
public in an easily accessible and user- 
friendly manner that can be cross-tabulated 
by, at a minimum, each major racial and 
ethnic group, gender, English proficiency, 
and students with or without disabilities, 
which— 

‘‘(i) may be accomplished by including 
such information on the annual State report 
card described subsection (d)(1)(C)); and 

‘‘(ii) shall be presented in a manner that— 
‘‘(I) is first anonymized and does not reveal 

personally identifiable information about an 
individual student; 

‘‘(II) does not include a number of students 
in any category of students that is insuffi-
cient to yield statistically reliable informa-
tion or that would reveal personally identifi-
able information about an individual stu-
dent; and 

‘‘(III) is consistent with the requirements 
of section 444 of the General Education Pro-
visions Act (20 U.S.C. 1232g, commonly 
known as the ‘Family Educational Rights 
and Privacy Act of 1974’). 

‘‘(3) RULES OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in 
paragraph (2)(N) shall be construed to— 

‘‘(A) require groups of students obtained by 
any entity that cross-tabulates the informa-
tion provided under such paragraph to be 
considered categories of students under sub-
section (b)(3)(A) for the purposes of the State 
accountability system under subsection 
(b)(3); or 

‘‘(B) to prohibit States from publicly re-
porting data in a cross-tabulated manner, in 
order to meet the requirements of paragraph 
(2)(N). 

‘‘(4) TECHNICAL ASSISTANCE.—Upon request 
by a State educational agency, the Secretary 
shall provide technical assistance to such 
agency in order to meet the requirements of 
paragraph (2)(N). 

On page 189, after line 23, insert the fol-
lowing: 

‘‘(5) Designing the report cards and reports 
under section 1111(d) in an easily accessible, 
user-friendly manner that cross-tabulates 
student information by any category the 
State determines appropriate, as long as 
such cross-tabulation— 

‘‘(A) does not reveal personally identifiable 
information about an individual student; and 

‘‘(B) is derived from existing State and 
local reporting requirements and data 
sources. 

‘‘(b) RULE OF CONSTRUCTION.—Nothing in 
paragraph (5) shall be construed as author-
izing, requiring, or allowing any additional 
reporting requirements, data elements, or in-
formation to be reported to the Secretary 
not otherwise explicitly authorized under 
this Act. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2120 WITHDRAWN 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 

the previous order, the Warren amend-
ment No. 2120 is withdrawn. 

The Senator from Missouri. 
Mr. BLUNT. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent to address the Sen-
ate as in morning business. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 
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NUCLEAR AGREEMENT WITH IRAN 

Mr. BLUNT. Mr. President, needless 
to say, yesterday’s announcement 
about our ongoing stature and status 
with Iran is, in my view, a dangerous 
step forward in advancing not only the 
illicit nuclear program that they have 
had up until now but the clear nuclear 
weapons capability they would have 
under this agreement. 

I think the agreement confirms that 
the President was too willing to get a 
deal with Iran at any price. The con-
cessions made by the administration, 
based on the starting point of these 
discussions, I believe to be stunning. 
All we have to do is go back and review 
a little bit of recent history to see that 
today Iran’s advancement of insta-
bility, terrorism, and violence in the 
world continues unabated and not ham-
pered by the agreement that has just 
been announced. Tomorrow, we will see 
all of those things still continue 
unabated, and unfortunately they are 
much better positioned and much bet-
ter funded than they are right now. 

Supported by Iran, Assad in Syria 
has been massacring his own people, re-
sulting in the deaths of at least 191,000 
people in Syria. That is according to 
the U.N., and those numbers were re-
ported a year ago. Assad, by the way, 
stepped forward immediately to praise 
this agreement. 

Supported by Iran, Shiite militias 
are continuing to support Assad and 
promote division and violence through-
out the country of Iraq. Supported by 
Iran, Houthi rebels have seized key ter-
ritory in Yemen and continue to work 
to destabilize that country. Supported 
by Iran, Hezbollah in Lebanon wages 
terrorism and calls for the annihila-
tion. Supported by Iran, Palestinian 
terrorist groups in Gaza continue to 
lob mortars and rockets into Israel. 

Last April, Iran’s Islamic Revolu-
tionary Guard Corps Navy stopped a 
Marshall Islands-flagged ship as it 
tried to go into the Strait of Hormuz. 
This is at a time when Iran is trying to 
get major countries in the world to ne-
gotiate with them. 

Iran continues to hold hostages with-
out any reasonable way of defining hos-
tages and without any reasonable 
charge. They currently have three 
Americans held as hostages: Pastor 
Saeed Abedini, former U.S. Marine 
Amir Hekmati, and Washington Post 
journalist Jason Rezaian. They also re-
main totally uncooperative in helping 
to locate former FBI official Robert 
Levinson. When the Secretary of State 
was asked about why these people 
weren’t part of the negotiations, he 
said: Well, this was a negotiation about 
nuclear weapons but not about people 
unlawfully and wrongly detained. 

Well, it quickly became a negotiation 
about not just nuclear weapons but all 
kinds of other weapons that we have 
prevented the Iranians from having ac-
cess to in a worldwide marketplace. 
That was quickly added to the topic, 
but we couldn’t get three Americans 
released and find out more about one 
American than we know now. 

The concessions laid out by yester-
day’s announcement were also, I 

thought, pretty stunning. Concerning 
uranium enrichment, the Obama ad-
ministration said a year and a half ago 
Iran didn’t have the right to enrich. 

In November of 2013, the Secretary of 
State told ABC News: 

We do not recognize the right to enrich. It 
is clear . . . in the nonproliferation treaty, 
it’s very, very [clear] that there is no right 
to enrich. 

Under the agreement, Iran is allowed 
to continue to enrich. 

As far as inspections, the President 
said we would have to be able to verify 
Iran’s compliance or Iran’s cheating 
through anywhere, anytime inspec-
tions. It is widely understood that any 
good deal must allow inspections— 
trust but verify. The President may 
say that is in there, but it is clearly 
not in there. 

In fact, last April the President’s 
Deputy National Security Advisor 
proudly proclaimed that ‘‘under this 
deal’’ we ‘‘will have anywhere, anytime 
24/7 access’’ to Iran’s nuclear facilities. 
As it turns out under this deal, inspec-
tors will be forced to wait up to 24 days 
for access to suspicious sites once they 
ask for access to suspicious sites. That 
is a brand-new definition of ‘‘anywhere, 
anytime.’’ You can possibly have ac-
cess in 24 days, and obviously lots of 
things can and would change in 24 
days. 

Militarily, the President said we 
would disclose and define the possible 
military dimensions of the research 
and where Iran’s illegal nuclear pro-
gram was headed. The President said 
this information is critical to knowing 
what Iran’s true breakout potential 
and their true intentions would be. 
Under this agreement, however, the op-
tion of examining the possible military 
dimensions of Iran’s nuclear program is 
off the table. 

As far as sanctions, the administra-
tion said that removing all sanctions 
was a nonstarter until Iran dem-
onstrated that it is complying with the 
agreement. A little over a year ago, in 
March of 2014, Secretary Kerry said: 
‘‘Iran is not open for business until 
Iran is closed for nuclear bombs.’’ How-
ever, we know now that Iran will, in 
fact, be open for business much sooner 
than that. This deal will not only allow 
them to be open for business, but they 
will be rewarded with hundreds of mil-
lions of dollars’ worth of sanctions re-
lief and return of assets that didn’t 
have to be returned. And under this 
agreement all sanctions, even those re-
lated to arms, missiles, and prolifera-
tion, will be removed—not suspended. 
These will be removed. We have some 
of the most aggressive arms suppliers 
in the world, and Iran is now being 
given access to all kinds of arms that 
they couldn’t get legally or easily up 
until now. 

All economic and banking sections, 
as well as those imposed on transport, 
insurance, petrochemical industries, 
and valuable materials will be re-
moved. 

As far as dismantling, the President 
said Iran would have to dismantle its 
illegal nuclear program. In December 

of 2013, the chief negotiator, Wendy 
Sherman, told PBS that a final agree-
ment should include ‘‘a lot of disman-
tling of their infrastructure.’’ Yet 
under this deal we are seeing that 
Iran’s program will, in fact, almost all 
be preserved, not dismantled. 

The length of the agreement—the 
P5+1 initially stipulated that Iran 
must accept restrictions on its nuclear 
program for 20 years plus another 25 
years, and then later they said 20 years 
plus another 10 years, and finally their 
last offer was just 20 years, which in 
the end was reduced to 10 years. I think 
over the next 60 days, as people read 
the fine print of the agreement, they 
might find out that it is even less than 
10 years, but they certainly know now 
it is not 20 years plus 25 years. 

This is a bad deal for the United 
States and one that will embolden our 
enemies, jeopardize the security of our 
allies, and further lead our friends to 
not believe they can trust us and our 
enemies not to be afraid of us. In a dan-
gerous world, what worse place could 
we be in than that. 

The stated goal of the negotiations 
was to ensure that Iran never devel-
oped the capability of producing a nu-
clear weapon. Yet the President agreed 
to a deal that does just the opposite. 
By allowing Iran to become nuclear 
weapons capable and failing to provide 
for anytime, anywhere inspections, 
this deal gives Iran a free pass to cheat 
at its military sites with no access to 
U.S. inspectors. 

Meanwhile, just last week Iran con-
tinued its calls for the destruction of 
Israel. These are the people we are al-
lowing, through this process, to have 
access to more weapons and to become 
nuclear weapons capable. Just last 
week, Iran called, as it has for decades, 
for the destruction of Israel and ‘‘death 
to America.’’ In fact, Iran’s Supreme 
Leader stood by, calling for the need to 
fight the United States even if there is 
an agreement. I don’t know that we 
have ever before entered into an agree-
ment with another country that, while 
we are in the agreement, says: And by 
the way, no matter if there is an agree-
ment or not, we want to continue to 
see the United States as an enemy we 
need to fight. 

This deal undermines the security of 
our friends and allies. It legitimizes 
Iran’s unapologetic sponsorship of ter-
rorism throughout the Middle East. 

It is interesting what could be in-
cluded, by the way, and what couldn’t 
be included. 

Iran has repeatedly refused to abide 
by international agreements that re-
quire inspection of nuclear facilities, 
details of facility designs, acquisition 
and production of nuclear materials. 
What makes us think Iran is going to 
change that behavior now? The nego-
tiations themselves should lead us to 
believe the new Iran is still the old 
Iran. 

This is a bad deal. It is a deal that 
just hopes that in the next 8 or 10 years 
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the Iranian Government totally 
changes, the Iranian attitude totally 
changes, our relationship with them 
totally changes, and it just hopes that 
in the interim—during the time we 
have that hoped-for change—the Ira-
nians don’t cheat. This is a hope, not a 
strategy, and it is a hope, not a strat-
egy, wherein we would let the world be-
come much more destabilized as a re-
sult. 

After months of negotiations, Iran 
hasn’t released a single American pris-
oner, nor have they announced any in-
tentions to do so. 

The Iranians, the Russians, the Chi-
nese, the Syrians—or at least the Syr-
ians who are still controlled by Assad— 
may like this deal, but this is a bad 
deal for the United States of America, 
it is a bad deal for world stability, and 
it is a bad deal for our friends. 

Frankly, I think the law that Con-
gress passed that now gives the Con-
gress of the United States 60 days to 
look at it will turn out to be 60 days 
that the President himself is about to 
find out what is in the deal he and the 
administration signed. 

This is a serious matter for every 
Member of the Senate. 

I was asked earlier today: Are you 
going to lobby Members of the Senate 
as to how they should vote on this 
agreement when it comes up? 

I said: I am going to do everything I 
can to talk about the real short-
comings of this agreement, the desta-
bilizing effects of this agreement, but 
every Member of the Senate is going to 
have to answer for this agreement and 
this vote for a long time. 

Members of the Senate on their own 
are going to have to decide what side of 
this to wind up on. I predict that a ma-
jority—and maybe a substantial major-
ity—of the Senate will wind up under-
standing that this is a bad deal for 
America and a bad deal for the future 
of the world’s security. 

I yield the floor. 
I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

proceeded to call the roll. 
Mr. BENNET. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2241 
Mr. BENNET. Mr. President, as we 

wait for colleagues to arrive to the 
floor, I thought I would take a few 
minutes to speak a little bit about ac-
countability in this bill. 

As we know, the No Child Left Be-
hind legislation and now this new 
version of the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act require annual 
tests. They are not popular. 

I believe we are overtesting kids in 
this country. It is not the Federal re-
quirement that is causing that; it is 
the relationship of the Federal require-
ment to State and local tests that are 
administered, so that by the time we 

get to the classroom inhabited by one 
of my three daughters who go to Den-
ver’s public schools, for example, kids 
end up spending too much time being 
tested. Part of that is because we 
haven’t done a good job, I don’t think, 
of distinguishing between tests that 
are used for accountability purposes— 
how is the school doing growing kids— 
and tests that are used for teaching 
and learning purposes, which are as-
sessments that have to happen all the 
time during the school year. When I 
was in school, we called those quizzes, 
and we dreaded them, just as people 
dread them today. That was the way 
teachers were able to keep an eye on 
how students were doing in their class-
room throughout the year so they 
could course correct, so they could 
make changes based on the individual 
needs of the kids in their classroom. 

Teaching and learning and account-
ability aren’t the same things, and I 
think we put too much freight on some 
of these assessments. I hope what we 
are going to see as we come out of this 
new reauthorization is an under-
standing about the importance of the 
accountability—why we have it—and 
better implementation of tests at the 
State and local level. 

There is no reason for the Federal 
Government to be involved in edu-
cation, really—only 9 percent of what 
we spend is Federal money, and the 
rest of it is State and local money—ex-
cept for one reason. The civil rights 
imperative in this bill and that is at 
the heart of this bill has said to us that 
we just can’t look the other way when 
it comes to kids of color and kids liv-
ing in poverty in this country, which 
we did for decades—for decades—with-
out knowing where we were headed. 

The one great benefit of No Child 
Left Behind is that it required that 
data about kids living in poverty, kids 
of color, kids with special needs, and 
English language learners as well be 
published so we could see the huge gaps 
that exist all across this country in 
educational attainment. We can’t go 
backward on that. I agree that allow-
ing States to have more flexibility in 
the design of these systems is impor-
tant. It is an important step forward in 
this bill. 

As I mentioned yesterday, when I 
was the superintendent of the Denver 
Public Schools—the best job I ever had; 
I had that honor—I used to wonder all 
the time why people in Washington 
were so mean to our teachers and to 
our kids. I got here and I realized they 
weren’t mean, they just have abso-
lutely no idea what is going on in our 
schools and our classrooms. Where the 
Presiding Officer is right now, right 
here, in this place—and I mean this lit-
erally—is as far away as one can get 
from a school or a classroom in this 
country and still be in this universe. 
We are very distant. We may think we 
know what is going on there, but we 
don’t know. This institution doesn’t 
know. 

While I, as that superintendent, have 
developed a very strong view that I 

didn’t want to be told how we should do 
things by Washington, and I didn’t 
want Washington telling my teachers 
how to do things, our principals how to 
do things, kids and families how to do 
things, I think it is important and im-
perative that we have a national expec-
tation for what kids ought to be able to 
do at certain grade levels and that we 
have a national imperative around the 
achievement gap in this country. 

We also have a national imperative— 
people may not like to know this—to 
figure out how we are going to replace 
the 1.5 million teachers we are going to 
require in this country over the next 
several years. 

Those are all issues of national con-
cern, but our federalist system tells us 
there are certain responsibilities as-
sumed by the States and certain re-
sponsibilities assumed by the Federal 
Government, and we have gotten that 
twisted up when it comes to education. 
So I think that is an important step 
forward, that we are not going to be 
telling people how to do it, but we need 
to remind people that they need to do 
it. 

It is not OK that we live in a country 
where if you are unlucky enough to be 
born poor, your chances of getting a 
college degree or its equivalent are 
roughly 9 in 100. That is not OK. That 
is a matter of national concern. That is 
why the accountability provisions in 
this bill are so important. To be hon-
est, that is why the annual testing is so 
important, if it is done wisely and well 
and if the data is used in a thoughtful 
way to measure student growth. 

No Child Left Behind not only was a 
huge overreach by the Federal Govern-
ment, it also asked and answered the 
profoundly wrong question. It asked: 
How did this year’s group of fourth 
graders do compared to last year’s 
fourth graders? That is how we evalu-
ated schools, on that basis. That is 
crazy. They are not the same kids. The 
question we should be asking and the 
question we are asking now in many 
States and in many communities 
across the country is this: How did this 
group of sixth graders do compared to 
how they did as fifth graders compared 
to how they did as fourth graders and 
then compared to all the kids in the 
State—this is the way we do it in Colo-
rado—who had a statistically similar 
test history. That reveals a lot of infor-
mation. 

For No Child Left Behind, we used to 
have a matrix in Denver, and it was 
four squares, and in the upper right- 
hand corner was—well, there are two 
measures; one is growth and one is sta-
tus. How much did you grow this year? 
It would be like saying, how much 
weight did you gain or lose this year, 
versus status, which is, how much did 
you weigh? What is your achievement 
level? Those are two different ideas. 

In those four boxes I mentioned ear-
lier, in the upper right we had high 
growth, high status schools, and in this 
corner we had high status but low 
growth schools. Those are schools we 
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called excellent schools under No Child 
Left Behind. Those were blue ribbon 
schools even though kids were losing 
ground in those schools. They arguably 
shouldn’t have been because those 
schools didn’t have the struggles 
schools have with kids living in pov-
erty. Those were blue ribbon schools. 
Those are schools where we were tell-
ing moms and dads and kids that ev-
erything is fine, even though kids were 
losing ground when they showed up at 
the schoolhouse door. 

The reverse was also true. The re-
verse was also true because we were 
saying to schools that were below the 
threshold of high status—low status 
schools—that they were failing schools 
even though they might have been 
schools where what we were seeing was 
2 years of growth for kids who had 
started out way behind because they 
had come to kindergarten with that 
stubborn word gap, that 30 million 
word gap that kids have who are living 
in poverty and are showing up in kin-
dergarten. By the way, we are not 
doing anything, almost, as a country 
to deal with that problem. 

As I mentioned yesterday, we are 
having a debate in Washington about 
income redistribution sometimes. We 
have a discussion about what the Tax 
Code should be, and there are people 
here who believe that it shouldn’t do 
anything. That is a principled position, 
but if that is a person’s position, they 
better be working day and night to 
make sure every single kid in America 
has access to high-quality early child-
hood education. We better make sure 
every kid in America has access and a 
choice to go to a high-performing K–12 
school. And we better make sure we are 
doing everything we can to make it 
easier, not harder, to go to college to 
get a higher education degree because 
this unforgiving international economy 
is not going to change its mind about 
whether a high school degree is enough 
or dropping out of high school is 
enough. 

We need to be focused on education 
in this country. It is the single most 
important public good we provide do-
mestically. If a person asks me as a 
parent what I would take a risk on for 
my kids, the No. 1 thing I wouldn’t 
take a risk on is their education. That 
is how we ought to be feeling about all 
of the kids in the United States of 
America. We should stop treating 
America’s children as though they are 
someone else’s kids. They are not 
someone else’s kids; they are our kids. 
And if we extrapolate the academic 
outcomes that we are seeing in this 
country, the college graduation rates 
we are seeing, the high school gradua-
tion rates—if we extrapolate those 
against the changing demographics in 
the United States, we are not going to 
recognize ourselves in the 21st century. 

When we constrain a child, a human 
being, an American citizen to the mar-
gin of this economy or the margin of 
the democracy simply because they are 
born into poverty and we can’t do the 

work to provide a high-quality edu-
cation, that is all the evidence we need 
that we are treating people as though 
they are someone else’s kids. That is 
why, by the way, there is more we need 
to do on accountability. 

I feel as though we have made good 
progress with a lot of this bill, and I 
am extremely grateful for the leader-
ship of Chairman ALEXANDER from Ten-
nessee and the ranking member of the 
committee, Senator PATTY MURRAY, 
and I am pleased to see that the bill 
passed out of committee unanimously. 
Remember, ESEA is fundamentally a 
civil rights law. We should measure 
growth. We should identify the bottom 
5 percent of schools in this country. We 
need to ensure that subgroups and 
high-performing schools are not left 
behind. And that is the power of the 
data that is collected, and that is the 
power of what is called the 
disaggregation of that data so that we 
can see outcomes. 

I see my colleague from New Jersey 
is here. Through the Chair, I would ask 
if he wishes to speak, and if so, I will 
stop. I was filling time. I do want to 
talk about the comparability loophole, 
but I will come back to that and yield 
to my colleague from New Jersey. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from New Jersey. 

Mr. BOOKER. Mr. President, I am 
grateful to Senator BENNET. Senator 
BENNET and I met around education 
issues. Senator BENNET led the largest 
public school system in the State of 
Colorado. Senator BENNET has been in 
the weeds of education for years, if not 
decades. 

I am grateful that Senator BENNET 
began his remarks by saying all of the 
things that have been wrong with No 
Child Left Behind. That was a bad 
piece of legislation. We saw the aspects 
of it that were causing problems and 
that have created a bipartisan push to 
fix them. 

I want to give credit to Senator 
LAMAR ALEXANDER and Senator PATTY 
MURRAY for joining together and doing 
the things necessary to improve the 
bill. The culture of education has shift-
ed in this country, from high-stakes 
testing to looking at measures that 
made no sense to creating artificial 
deadlines that could not be met or even 
doing things that undermined the very 
goals and aspirations that we have for 
our country, which is to lead the globe 
in educational excellence. 

So, I am encouraged by Senator BEN-
NET and myself and the majority of 
this body who agree that this legisla-
tion needs to be changed. It is a left- 
right coalition that is encouraging to 
me. 

But I want to echo Senator BENNET’s 
concerns about a problem that is not 
being addressed—that as the pendulum 
swings away from the problems of No 
Child Left Behind, we not create new 
ones that cut against the very ideals 
with which this legislation was put in 
place by Lyndon Johnson. Lyndon 
Johnson said clearly that this was a 

bill to bridge the gap in this country 
between help and the helpless, for 
those children who are suffering on the 
educational margins of our society, 
drowning in the eddies of educational 
lack of opportunity, caught in the 
quicksand of poverty and race, and 
with challenges that undermine and 
contribute to the dysfunction and in-
equality in our Nation. This was to be 
the bridge. It is why this body acted 
under President Johnson. 

So now, Senator BENNET, I have a 
distressed heart, because what this 
amendment we are trying to put for-
ward does is to allow us to get to a 
point where we are now not even put-
ting a spotlight on where we are failing 
to live up to our values. This amend-
ment calls for us to at least acknowl-
edge that there are children in our 
country who are stuck in so-called 
dropout factories, children who are per-
petually underachieving, and schools 
that are failing the genius of our chil-
dren. What this amendment was seek-
ing to do was to say that we cannot ig-
nore our children, we cannot turn our 
backs on these children, we cannot 
turn over and say it doesn’t exist, be-
cause we do have a problem in our Na-
tion. What anguishes me about this 
problem is that the children we are 
turning our backs on and not focusing 
on are children that are poor and chil-
dren that are disproportionately mi-
nority. 

To paraphrase Martin Luther King, 
he said that what we will have to re-
pent for in this day and age is not the 
vitriolic words and actions of the bad 
people but the appalling silence and in-
action of the good people. 

I hear time and again that we love 
our children in America. Well, if we 
love them, we should do something 
about the challenges that are afflicting 
a small percentage of our kids who do 
not get the educational environment 
they deserve. This is a peculiar form of 
American insanity—insanity being de-
fined as doing the same thing over and 
over again and expecting different re-
sults. We are not going to change this 
problem of perpetual failure in too 
many of our schools that affect poor 
and minorities by not having some at-
tention to that problem. 

Let’s be clear. We have learned les-
sons. This amendment No. 2241, the 
ESEA accountability amendment, does 
not do the things that this body in its 
majority thinks should no longer be 
done by the Federal Government. 

Let me be clear. This amendment 
does not reinstate any type of adequate 
yearly progress, or AYP. In fact, the 
underlying bill is repealed. AYP is re-
pealed. It does not establish artificial 
deadlines such as No Child Left Behind 
did, saying that all children will be 
proficient by 2014. It does not establish 
Federal goals for our students. States 
will have the prerogative to set their 
own. It does not impose test-based ac-
countability on States. States must in-
clude a range of factors in their State- 
designed accountability systems. It 
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does not require schools to implement 
a one-size-fits-all intervention. Local 
districts will design the intervention 
for underperforming schools. 

This legislation is not prescriptive. 
This legislation is not Washington tell-
ing local districts what to do. This 
amendment does not design programs. 
It simply says that there must be a 
commitment made when there are 
these dropout factories and when there 
are these populations that are not 
being served to ensure that States 
identify certain low-performing schools 
so that students in these schools re-
ceive the support they need. 

It would require locally designed, 
evidence-based interventions to schools 
identified in the following categories: 
the lowest performing 5 percent of our 
schools; high schools where less than 
two-thirds of students graduate; and 
schools where subgroups, including 
low-income students, students of color, 
students with disabilities, and English 
learners miss State-established goals 
on multiple measures for 2 consecutive 
years. This amendment says that we 
cannot ignore those children whom we 
are failing to serve, and that we can’t 
turn our back on these kids. 

We salute this flag and say ‘‘liberty 
and justice for all.’’ Well, every issue 
that I hear discussed in this august 
body cannot be dealt with unless we 
deal with all children. The achieve-
ment gap in America will not be ad-
dressed unless we focus on all children. 
The poverty gap in America will not be 
addressed unless we focus on all chil-
dren. The opportunity gap in America 
will not be addressed unless we deal 
with all children. Issues that I am pas-
sionate about such as mass incarcer-
ation will not be addressed unless we 
focus on all children. And the competi-
tive economy—the productivity of our 
Nation—will not reach its full strength 
unless we focus on all children. 

So I am distressed today that this 
body will put into place a piece of edu-
cational legislation that ignores the 
very children to whom this original 
legislation was dedicated to serving 
years ago. We cannot be a great nation 
if we have parts of our country—be 
they neighborhoods or schools—that 
fail to experience what should be the 
bedrock of our country: equal oppor-
tunity, a great education, and the op-
portunity to succeed through one’s 
grit, sweat, and hard work. We don’t 
have that now. 

If we in this body create legislation 
that pours millions of dollars into the 
States and then say that if States 
choose to ignore these kids, if States 
choose to turn their backs on the chil-
dren who need them most, if States 
don’t even want to put forward an idea 
of how to address this persistent prob-
lem, and we are OK, then to me we 
belie the oath we took, the pledge we 
gave to bring justice to all children. 

We speak of accountability in this 
country. Well, we should be account-
able to the government dollars that we 
spend for America. We should be ac-
countable for the ideals of this Nation. 

So I hope I can get my colleagues to 
support this bill that Senator MURPHY 
and Senator BENNET are leading so 
well. I hope we can stand up in a chorus 
of conviction in this body, saying that 
every single child—no matter what sta-
tion in life, no matter how poor your 
parents are, no matter what your back-
ground, color, creed or religion—can 
have hope and opportunity in our pub-
lic schools. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Colorado. 

Mr. BENNET. Mr. President, I thank 
Senator BOOKER. 

I see the Senator from Pennsylvania 
is here. The Senator from Connecticut 
is here, and I want to thank him for his 
leadership and how he has stuck with 
it week after week after week. 

I want to say to my friend from New 
Jersey, through the Chair, how much I 
appreciate his words and his aspira-
tions for our country, because we are 
falling down on the job. 

We have issue after issue after issue 
that comes here to the Senate floor— 
sometimes resolved, sometimes not. 
Education almost never is in front of 
us. 

I sometimes hear people say this, and 
it rattles me when I hear them say it. 
Sometimes people say: MICHAEL, don’t 
you know that not everybody is going 
to go to college? Don’t you know that 
not everybody is going to go to college? 

That is OK with me as long as it is 
their decision that they are making 
and that they are an educated 12th 
grader but they are deciding not going 
to go to college. That is the decision 
they are making. 

But the reality is that it is not that 
we are sort of, kind of getting it right 
when it comes to kids in this country. 
Let’s do the math. If you are born poor 
in the United States, because of the 
way our K–12 system works in access to 
higher education, you stand a 9-in-100 
chance of getting a college degree—not 
an 80 percent chance, not a 75 percent 
chance, but 9 in 100. 

If we were poor kids in this place in-
stead of Senators, it would be those 
desks in the front row, the desks in the 
row behind them, and three desks in 
the next row. The entire rest of this 
Senate would be a sea of people with-
out a college degree. That is the condi-
tion for poor kids living in the United 
States of America. That is the cir-
cumstance they face. We have to start 
believing there are kids—they are not 
someone else’s kids. We learned for the 
first time a month ago—this is not a 
measure of poverty in the same sense 
that I was just using the word, but for 
the first time in this country’s history, 
over half our public school children are 
poor enough that they qualify for free 
and reduced lunch. 

We did not change the standard for 
free and reduced lunch. That is the ef-
fect of 20 years of an economy that is 
not driving middle-class wages up and 
the worst recession since the Great De-
pression. So at every level from the 
schoolhouse door to the floor of the 

Senate, this ought to be our No. 1 pri-
ority. Because as the Senator from 
New Jersey said, all the other stuff 
that we want to fix—he mentioned 
what we need to do with sentencing re-
form. 

Eighty-five percent of the people in 
our prisons are high school dropouts. 
That tells you something about what 
you might do to cure that problem. 
This ought to be our No. 1 issue. It 
ought to be our No. 1 here, and it ought 
to be our No. 1 issue at home. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from New Jersey. 
Mr. BOOKER. Before our leader on 

this amendment speaks, Senator MUR-
PHY, I do want to echo what Senator 
BENNET said. He has been leading this 
charge in a bipartisan manner, pulling 
people together trying to get this 
across. I just want to echo that last 
point that Senator BENNET made. We 
as a nation have this ideal that Amer-
ica is the best country if you are poor 
to be born into; that you can make it 
here. This is the country—Statue of 
Liberty, give us your tired, your hun-
gry, the wretched refuse of your teem-
ing shores. This is the country you can 
make it in. 

Well, unfortunately, in social mobil-
ity, which is a measurable index—the 
ability for somebody to make it out of 
poverty into the middle class—we have 
fallen. We have fallen on that list com-
pared to our peers from other nations. 
If you just have the simple goal of 
making it out of poverty, America is 
no longer the No. 1 country to do that. 

The principle reason for this is that 
the tried and true pathway to the mid-
dle class must be the schoolhouse door. 
That path must lead through edu-
cational systems. If our children don’t 
have that access or if we leave some 
children behind, we shut those doors to 
quality education. Then it is an affront 
to the very ideal of the American 
dream, and we are failing the purpose, 
the greatness, the glory that is Amer-
ica. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Pennsylvania. 
AMENDMENT NO. 2247, AS MODIFIED 

Mr. TOOMEY. Mr. President, I rise to 
speak on an amendment that is offered 
by the senior Senator from North Caro-
lina. It is an amendment that would 
change the formula for how title I 
funds are allocated among the States. 
So first by way of background, title I is 
the largest category of Federal finan-
cial assistance for K-through-12 edu-
cation. So we are talking about a large 
pot of money. This is the biggest single 
source of Federal funding for primary 
and secondary education. 

Under current law, the formula for 
how that money is allocated to the 
school districts is based on two things. 
It is based on the number of children 
who live in poverty in these respective 
districts, but it is also related to the 
average amount that the various 
States spend on education. So let me 
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be very clear. It is not a single, uni-
form amount per student. It was never 
meant to be. It still is not. 

There is a reason for that. The reason 
is it is meant—this correlation to not 
only the number of kids in poverty but 
also the amount of money States spend 
on education is designed that way in 
order to reflect the fact that there are 
different costs of living in different 
States. Nobody would dispute that, I 
don’t think. In some States, the real 
estate on which you build the school is 
more expensive. Some States have a 
higher general wage level, so teachers 
get paid more. States just have dif-
ferent expenses. 

In addition, there is an incentive ele-
ment. The incentive is, for States that 
are willing to commit more resources— 
that means taxing their residents more 
to fund education—then there is that 
little bit more that comes from the 
Federal Government. So this is a finite 
amount of money. What this amend-
ment goes to is the question of how 
does this get allocated? The amend-
ment originally offered by the senior 
Senator from North Carolina was very 
troubling to me because it would pro-
foundly change the formula effective 
immediately. This is a zero-sum game. 
So some States would win a lot, other 
States would lose a lot. Pennsylvania 
stood to lose a lot of funding under the 
formulation that was originally con-
structed for this amendment—the gist 
of it being to convert the funding to an 
almost uniform amount per student. 

I can assure you, I was hearing loudly 
and clearly from the folks who run es-
pecially the large school districts in 
Pennsylvania about how concerned 
they were because it was a multi-
million-dollar-per-year hit that they 
were going to take. I spoke with Dr. 
Hite, who is the superintendent of 
Philadelphia schools, and Dr. Lane 
from Pittsburgh school district, as 
they would have been hit the hardest 
in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. 

In total, had the original amendment 
become law, it would have cost Penn-
sylvania over $120 million per year. 
Every one of Pennsylvania’s 500 school 
districts, except one, would have lost 
money. So 499 school districts would 
have had to do with less and one would 
have had a little more. Many of them 
would have lost huge amounts of their 
funding. 

I first want to say I appreciate the 
fact that the Senator from North Caro-
lina and other Senators worked with 
my office and other offices across the 
aisle to take a different approach. So 
the original amendment is no longer 
under consideration. My understanding 
is the unanimous consent agreement 
which was struck earlier abandons that 
approach, but it does still have an ele-
ment of that direction that does con-
cern me. 

I want to touch on that. So here is 
my understanding: Under the form that 
the amendment now takes, and which 
we will be voting on maybe later today, 
the current levels of funding will con-

tinue under the current formula. In 
fact, that funding level, as it naturally 
tends to grow each year because the 
Federal Government increases funding 
in this—for a while, that growth will 
also occur according to the current for-
mulation. But at some point in the 
not-too-distant future, the total spend-
ing on title I funding will reach about 
$17 billion—now it is about 14.5. When 
it gets to $17 billion, from that point 
forward, prospectively, the increments 
each year will then be allocated ac-
cording to the new formula, which is, 
by the design, the same design as the 
original amendment, which is nearly 
uniform spending per child, dis-
regarding, in my view, the important 
consideration of the different costs of 
living in the various States. 

So this is a huge improvement, from 
my point of view, over what we were 
looking at before. Pennsylvania will 
not have a dime cut from its spending. 
The formula does not change next year 
or the year after. I am not sure exactly 
when we will reach that $17 billion fig-
ure. But at some point, if this amend-
ment passes, this reformulated amend-
ment from the senior Senator from 
North Carolina, if it does pass, then at 
some point we start to move incre-
mental funding into this sort of uni-
form formulation, rather than the cur-
rent formulation where we take into 
account the varying costs of education. 
So while this is a huge improvement 
over the original version of this amend-
ment, it is still something that I think 
is very problematic and so I will be 
voting no on this. 

I would just summarize by saying 
that I think the amendment is mis-
taken in two respects: One, it fun-
damentally fails to recognize the vary-
ing costs of living in varying States. 
That is a very big difference. Secondly, 
it penalizes those States that are will-
ing to ask their citizens to invest more 
in education by eliminating the cur-
rent mechanism. So I would urge my 
colleagues to vote no on that amend-
ment. 

I yield the floor. 
Mr. MURPHY. Mr. President, I thank 

my great friends Senator BOOKER and 
Senator BENNET for their passionate 
and moving remarks about the task 
ahead of us, to make sure that as we 
reauthorize No Child Left Behind, as 
we reorder our priorities, that we re-
member that this law is an education 
reform law, but it has to be a civil 
rights law as well. It has to make sure 
that in the best traditions of this coun-
try, we are requiring that every single 
child gets a quality education. 

I want to talk about my amendment 
that is cosponsored by Senators BOOK-
ER and WARREN, COONS, DURBIN, MIKUL-
SKI, and others. I want to start by tell-
ing a story that is, unfortunately, not 
unfamiliar in probably every corner of 
this country. I am going to talk about 
a 16-year-old African-American boy, an 
eighth grader in an urban middle 
school in Connecticut. I will call him 
James for today’s purposes. 

James had a habit of walking out of 
class in the middle of instruction. He 
walked out of class and he would wan-
der the hallways until he would even-
tually run into a teacher, an adminis-
trator, a school resource officer, who 
would haul him down to the principal’s 
office. His grandmother, who was his 
primary care giver, would get a phone 
call. She would come pick him up and 
then the suspension proceedings would 
start. 

James would get suspended for a few 
days. He would come back, and the 
whole cycle would play out again, such 
that by the middle of his first semester 
of his eighth grade year, he had been 
out of school—suspended—more days 
than he had been in school. One day he 
was so frustrated when an assistant 
principal stopped him, once again, as 
he was wandering the halls that he had 
an argument. He was a big kid for his 
age, but he was a total teddy bear. He 
never hurt anybody. But that day when 
he talked back to that assistant prin-
cipal, they called the police and James 
got arrested. Now he has a criminal 
record. But the reason he was walking 
out of class day after day, week after 
week, was pretty simple: James was an 
eighth grader who could not read—he 
could not read. He could barely read. 
So he had this toxic mixture of frustra-
tion and embarrassment every day that 
he sat in class such that it had no rel-
evance to him and he walked out. 

The worst of it is that the school 
knew he could not read because he had 
an identified learning disability. It was 
not a mystery. Yet James got pro-
moted year after year because it was 
easier to pass him along, easier to push 
him out, as the suspensions and even-
tual arrest were on their way to doing, 
rather than actually give James an 
education. Now, I only know this story 
because my wife, who was then a legal 
aid lawyer in Connecticut, represented 
James. His grandmother, who just 
wanted James to get a decent edu-
cation, would call my wife in tears 
every time James was found in the 
hallway and suspended again and 
again. 

My wife actually got the services 
James needed. But James’ story is not 
unique. Most kids do not have legal aid 
lawyers fighting on their behalf. Most 
kids in James’ situation have the deck 
stacked against them: disabled kids 
who are hard to teach, poor kids who 
are warehoused in failing schools, 
Black and Hispanic kids struggling to 
overcome generations of discrimina-
tion. 

They do not all have lawyers. They 
have us in the Congress. This place, 
Washington, DC, has had its finest mo-
ments when it stands up for edu-
cational civil rights: the idea that a 
child in this country should get a qual-
ity education no matter their race or 
their address or their disability. 
Whether we like it or not, there are 
these political pressures in America 
that cause minority kids and disabled 
kids and poor kids to get an education 
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that is not equal to that of their White 
or nondisabled or more affluent peers. 

The facts are just very stubborn. I 
can’t say them any better than Senator 
BENNET did earlier today. Today, half 
of African-American and Latino fourth 
grade students score below the basic 
level of reading that we expect of our 
students. Just one out of every seven 
African-American eighth grade stu-
dents scores at a basic proficiency level 
in math. Nationally, 70 percent of stu-
dents who attend high school with low 
graduation rates come from low-in-
come families. These statistics, they 
represent a stain on the conscience of 
our Nation. 

If this body wants to stay true to its 
history of standing up for educational 
civil rights, then we have to make a 
stand this week to make sure this 
Every Child Achieves Act ensures that 
minority and poor and disabled kids 
get a fair shot at a good education. 

Now, right now this bill does not 
meet this test. That is why the Na-
tion’s leading civil rights organiza-
tions, from the NAACP to La Raza, to 
the Urban League oppose this bill in its 
current form. It is why they have 
joined together with business groups 
who want to make sure our educational 
system stays competitive for everyone, 
to propose a fairly simple solution to a 
problem that is also fairly simple. 

So this bill requires that schools con-
tinue to assess student performance 
while getting rid of those annual high- 
stakes tests that were unquestionably 
bad for schools and for students. No 
Child Left Behind was a bad bill for my 
State and for the Nation. So I am glad 
Senators MURRAY and ALEXANDER have 
come together to create something bet-
ter for our kids. 

The bill requires that States track 
results by what we call subgroups: mi-
nority students, disabled students, 
poor students, and non-English-speak-
ing students. But the problem is that 
when the schools are failing or when 
minority or disabled students are fall-
ing way behind their peers, the bill 
doesn’t require or even ask States or 
school districts to do anything to fix 
it—nothing. As a civil rights matter, 
that is unacceptable. 

No Child Left Behind said a lot on 
this issue, and most of it wasn’t helpful 
or productive. NCLB made the meas-
urement of schools and subgroups a 
test and only a test. NCLB prescribed 
in a detailed way what schools had to 
do to turn around student outcomes, 
and NCLB punished schools that didn’t 
turn around those outcomes quickly 
enough. 

We have learned a lot from that 
backwards approach, from this ‘‘Wash-
ington knows best’’ attitude. That is 
why the amendment we are offering 
today takes a very different approach 
to accountability for vulnerable kids. 
Under our amendment, States are re-
quired to identify the bottom 5 percent 
of performing schools according to 
their measurement of performance; 
they have to identify the dropout fac-

tories—the high schools where fewer 
than two-thirds of the students are 
graduating; and then they have to 
identify, again according to their own 
measurement, schools where subgroups 
of students—low-income students, stu-
dents of color, students with disabil-
ities, English learners—aren’t meeting 
their own set of criteria. 

This amendment ensures that schools 
are identified based on a measurement 
that is set by the State, not by Wash-
ington, and it has to include multiple 
measures, not just test scores alone. 
Let me say that again. The measure-
ment is determined by the State, and it 
cannot be based on test scores alone. 

Then the amendment says that once 
you have identified those schools or 
those student groups who are in need of 
improvement according to your own 
measurements, then the State needs to 
come up with a plan to improve out-
comes. Period. Stop. Identify your 
achievement gaps according to your 
own comprehensive measurements and 
come up with a plan to fix the gaps. 
There is no federally dictated measure-
ment, no federally set intervention, no 
Federal penalty if you don’t succeed. 
Just identify your problems and come 
up with a plan to make the problems 
better. The accountability will then 
happen naturally, as students and par-
ents and community members have 
input into that plan and the ability to 
watch to see if it is working—local so-
lutions, local oversight, local account-
ability. 

In 2006, as a candidate for Congress, I 
excoriated No Child Left Behind wher-
ever I went. I come from a family of 
teachers, and I married a former teach-
er. Now I have two kids, one in the pub-
lic school system and one on his way 
there. And I watched firsthand as 
NCLB failed teachers, parents, and stu-
dents. 

But about a month or so after I was 
sworn in to the House of Representa-
tives in 2007, I received a visit from the 
Children’s Defense Fund. They had 
heard how vocal I was in my criticism 
of the law, and they just wanted me to 
know that not every State was like 
Connecticut. They told me stories of 
places where prior to NCLB kids with 
disabilities were sent for half a day of 
‘‘vocational training’’ with the janitor. 
Nothing was expected of those kids, 
and more often than not those kids 
lived up to the low expectations that 
were set for them. 

So maybe the only redeeming quality 
of No Child Left Behind was that it did 
expose these inexcusable gaps in per-
formance between disabled and non- 
disabled kids. It forced States to talk 
about why Black students year after 
year were 30 percent behind their 
White peer students in achievement 
tests. It caused embarrassment for 
school systems with schools where the 
majority of kids got so little out of 
school that they dropped out before 
graduation. And it put pressure on all 
of us to do better. 

This is an education bill, but it is not 
a worthwhile bill unless it is also a 

civil rights bill. Every single child, no 
matter their race or their geography, 
their income or their disability, de-
serves a first-rate education. 

I urge my colleagues to join me in 
supporting this vital amendment that 
continues our march away from the 
stringent, inflexible requirements of 
No Child Left Behind, while ensuring 
that all of our students receive the sup-
port they need to be successful. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 

SCOTT). The Senator from Pennsyl-
vania. 

Mr. CASEY. Mr. President, I rise 
today to talk about a couple aspects of 
the legislation. I will do it in summary 
form. I will submit a longer statement 
for the RECORD. 

First, I wish to say how much I ap-
preciate the work that has been done 
not only this week but over many 
weeks and months that led up to today. 
We were working a number of months 
ago on the Health, Education, Labor 
and Pensions Committee to get a bill 
out of the committee. After it was 
completed, of course it looked easy, 
but I know how hard Senator ALEX-
ANDER, the chairman of the committee, 
and Senator MURRAY, the ranking 
member, worked to reach this point. 
The vote that day was 22 to 0, and now 
we are considering the bill on the floor. 
So that is significant and noteworthy, 
especially in these times in the Senate. 

I just wanted to talk about a couple 
of aspects of this legislation. 

For far too long, States have had to 
deal with the uncertainty of Federal 
waivers. One aspect of the legislation 
we are focused on is that we need one 
law that provides States and districts 
with more flexibility. 

We hear all across the country—I cer-
tainly heard it in Pennsylvania—that 
among the concerns people had was a 
lack of flexibility, sometimes a one- 
size-fits-all regimen that came from 
Washington. So that flexibility is im-
portant. We also want to make sure we 
are recapturing the original intent of 
the Elementary and Secondary Edu-
cation Act—to protect our most vul-
nerable students. 

The bill acknowledges the anxiety 
students, parents, and teachers often 
feel about testing, but it also realizes 
and contemplates that we must at the 
same time have a way to determine 
what students are learning each year. 
So I am pleased to see that the legisla-
tion strikes the balance by maintain-
ing annual testing while taking signifi-
cant steps to reduce the high-stakes 
nature of the testing. 

So while there is more work to be 
done to ensure that all our children 
have access to high-quality early child-
hood education, I am encouraged that 
the bill builds on decades of research 
on early learning by requiring that 
States align their early learning guide-
lines with their kindergarten through 
12th grade standards. So this change 
will help educators from Head Start, 
childcare, and other early childhood 
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education programs in elementary 
schools work together so young chil-
dren have a successful continuity of 
learning over time that sets a strong 
foundation throughout the kinder-
garten through 12th grade years and 
beyond. That is something I pushed for 
over many years in the so-called Con-
tinuum of Learning Act, and I am 
pleased it has been included in the bill. 

Mr. President, I wish to move to two 
other topics. I know we may have lim-
ited time. The first is on the question 
of bullying, which we have begun to ad-
dress in the debates we have had lead-
ing up to this legislation. We had a 
vote yesterday on Senator FRANKEN’s 
Student Non-Discrimination Act. I sup-
ported that, and I commend him for his 
work, but even with that vote, we have 
a long way to go on this issue. 

Bullying, of course, is not what my 
generation understood it to be. It is a 
much worse problem today. It is more 
severe, it is more damaging, and it is 
destroying lives all across the country. 

More students than ever are not in 
school every day for one reason—bul-
lying, because of the impact bullying 
has on their lives. If a child is gay, les-
bian, bisexual, or transgender, they are 
often and disproportionately the vic-
tims of bullying. If a student has a dis-
ability, he or she is often the victim of 
bullying, and again it is dispropor-
tionate. So students are more likely to 
be bullied if they are disabled, if they 
have a disability, or if they are gay, 
lesbian, bisexual, or transgender. That 
is an abomination. That is an insult to 
our country. Unless we begin to do 
something about this, we will still see 
those numbers soaring. 

Bullying, of course, is the ultimate 
betrayal. It is a betrayal by adults 
with regard to children, and it is a be-
trayal of everything we claim to stand 
for in America because we say to our 
children, ‘‘If you go to school every day 
and study hard and go to class and do 
your homework and study hard for 
tests and quizzes, you will succeed,’’ 
but, of course, often children are be-
trayed because in between there, they 
are bullied. When they go home, they 
are bullied. When dinner is over at 
night, they are bullied. All throughout 
the night they are bullied often be-
cause of technology and because of vi-
cious students who go after one stu-
dent and use social media or other 
tools to harass and bully that person. 
We have to do something about this. 
We have to do more than just debate it 
and talk about it. We need to do some-
thing. 

I am hoping that some of the efforts 
I have undertaken in my legislation 
will be the subject of not just more de-
bate but more action, progress, and re-
sults when we get through the con-
ference committee because I think this 
overall legislation should reach the 
point of getting to conference. 

I am going to conclude because I see 
our chairman, who wants some time 
before we start. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. I am fine. 

Mr. CASEY. Thank you. 
I wish to give one example of a par-

ticular individual—a real-life example 
of what bullying means, and I will have 
some comments as well about pre-
kindergarten education. 

This is a real-life story. Brandon 
Bitner, 14 years old, of Mount Pleasant 
Mills, PA, walked 13 miles from his 
home on an early Friday morning in 
November of 2010 to a busy intersection 
and threw himself in front of an on-
coming tractor trailer after leaving a 
suicide note at his home. That is what 
happened to a 14-year-old Pennsylva-
nian. I cannot even imagine the horror 
of that, what led to that action he took 
when he took his own life. It is, unfor-
tunately, not an isolated example. 
There are too many of these today. 
There would be too many if there were 
one, but unfortunately there are many 
more than one. 

So there seems to be little doubt in 
our minds and certainly in the minds 
of those who knew Brandon why he did 
what he did on that day in November of 
2010. I am going to quote a friend, 
Takara Jo Folk. Here is what Takara 
said: ‘‘It was because of bullying.’’ 
That was written in a letter to the 
Daily Item, a newspaper in central 
Pennsylvania. 

Quoting again from that letter: 
‘‘It was not about race or gender, but they 

bullied him for his sexual preferences and 
the way he dressed. Which,’’ she said, ‘‘they 
wrongly accused him of.’’ 

Brandon’s suicide note reportedly ex-
plained that he was constantly bullied 
at Midwest High School in Middleburg, 
where he was a freshman. Bullies at 
that school allegedly called Brandon 
names—names which I will not repeat 
on the floor of the Senate. He stated in 
the note that a humiliating event in 
school this past week was the ‘‘straw 
that broke the camel’s back.’’ 

Brandon was an accomplished violin-
ist, having been a member of the Sus-
quehanna Youth Orchestra in 2009, the 
year before he took his own life. 

That story, unfortunately and trag-
ically, is emblematic of the problem. 
We read these stories all the time. 
They may not be every single day and 
in every single newspaper, but not 
more than a week can go by in the 
United States of America where you 
don’t read something like that. 

I have others I could read as well, but 
I think folks within the sound of my 
voice know this. We all know this. So 
what are we going to do about it? Well, 
we all have a role to play. Parents have 
to do a lot more. Parents haven’t done 
enough. Public officials haven’t done 
enough. Schools haven’t done enough. 
You could go down the list. At a min-
imum—and that is why I introduced 
legislation that we want to get back 
to; we want to be able to reach con-
sensus—at a minimum, we should say 
to school districts: Look, if you are 
getting Federal money and you don’t 
have a policy in place that deals with 
bullying and harassment and you don’t 
specifically define or list or enumerate 

what is unlawful conduct, what is pro-
hibited, then there should be a con-
sequence for that. You should have to 
prescribe what is wrong by way of a set 
of rules, a code of conduct. You should 
enforce it. And you should keep data. If 
we take those kinds of steps, at least 
we can say that in a school or a school 
district, there is a heightened con-
sciousness about this problem and that 
it is everybody’s problem. This isn’t 
just the problem of the person being 
bullied and the person engaging in bul-
lying; it is the problem of all of us, 
whether we are parents, taxpayers, 
public officials, or whatever. We all 
have an obligation. 

So I hope we can get back to this, in 
addition to continuing the good work 
Senator FRANKEN and others have 
started, because this is a betrayal. It is 
a betrayal of our children. And we are 
all diminished by our allowing this 
problem to persist. 

The only good news here—and it is 
significant—is that in a lot of places 
we have parents who are taking respon-
sibility, teachers, school administra-
tors, school board directors, and of 
course students themselves taking on 
the responsibility of making sure in 
their school there will be zero toler-
ance for bullying, the best that they 
can implement that kind of a policy. 
So we have students who are working 
with other students to resolve disputes, 
to help someone who might be a victim 
before something goes wrong and some-
one becomes a tragedy after being a 
victim of bullying. So we have a ways 
to go on this issue, and we have more 
to do. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2242 
Let me conclude with some thoughts 

about what we will likely be voting on 
tomorrow, which is prekindergarten 
education. It is a very rare vote on the 
floor of the Senate where the entire 
Senate will cast a vote on a very basic 
program—a program to make sure that 
if a State wants to join together in 
partnership with the Federal Govern-
ment to build upon, expand, enlarge, or 
even start from scratch an early learn-
ing, prekindergarten program for 4- 
year-olds, this legislation will give 
them that opportunity. This is paid 
for. We have an offset for the cost of it. 

This is the right thing to do for 3 
million American children, meaning 
that if this prekindergarten education 
program were enacted and if every 
State took advantage and implemented 
this program, 3 million children in the 
country would have prekindergarten 
education, 93,930 in Pennsylvania 
alone. The State of Texas, for example, 
upon passage of this kind of a program 
into law, will have the opportunity to 
have 300,000 children get the benefit of 
early learning. 

Let me say finally that this is not 
just any program; we want high-qual-
ity early learning. All the experts 
know, have known for years, and have 
told us for years what works. If there is 
a high-quality program, a child will 
learn more now and he or she will earn 
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more later. It is not just a rhyme, it is 
the truth. We have 50 years of data 
making that direct linkage between 
learning and earning, and all we need 
to do is give States the opportunity to 
work with us to develop a nationwide 
strategy so that the United States can 
say we are preparing not just our chil-
dren for that bright future we hope 
they have but that we are preparing 
our workforce and our economy. When 
you make that linkage between learn-
ing and earning, you are literally not 
just improving the life of that child, 
but you are improving our economic 
prosperity as well. I think our eco-
nomic destiny is tied to these kinds of 
strategies. 

So we have a long way to go to get 
there, but tomorrow we should have a 
vote, and I am looking forward to that. 

I also again commend Senators 
ALEXANDER and MURRAY for their work 
on the legislation overall. 

With that, I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Vermont. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Will the Senator 

yield for a moment? 
Mr. SANDERS. Of course. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, for 

Senators’ information, I will be talking 
to Senator MURRAY in the next few 
minutes, and there is a good possibility 
we will have votes beginning at about 3 
o’clock. But I will have more to report, 
hopefully, after the Senator from 
Vermont makes his remarks. 

I thank the Senator. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Vermont. 
AMENDMENT NO. 2177 

Mr. SANDERS. Mr. President, one of 
the amendments that will be offered is 
an amendment I have submitted re-
garding a major crisis in this country 
that we don’t talk about enough, and 
that is the frighteningly high rate of 
youth unemployment in America. 

I am delighted that the Elementary 
and Secondary Education Act is on the 
floor for debate today, and I thank 
Senator ALEXANDER and Senator MUR-
RAY for their hard and constructive 
work on this important piece of legisla-
tion. In my State of Vermont, we have 
held town meetings on No Child Left 
Behind, and the people of Vermont 
want to leave No Child Left Behind 
very far behind. They want to get rid of 
it. They feel it has not been productive 
for our kids, and I think that senti-
ment exists all over the country. If we 
go forward on this legislation, I think 
we will be taking a very important step 
forward for the children of America. 

When we talk about the needs of our 
young people, it is not just a dysfunc-
tional child care system we talk about 
and the need to make sure working 
families all over this country have 
good-quality, affordable childcare; it is 
not simply that college is increasingly 
unaffordable for millions of working- 
class families; it is not just that the 
United States, tragically and embar-
rassingly, has the highest rate by far of 
childhood poverty of any major indus-

trialized country on Earth. We talk 
about the future. We talk about family 
values. But the truth is that we have 
significantly ignored the needs of our 
children, and that is not what a great 
nation does—not a nation that looks 
forward to the future. 

This country has to come to grips 
with the reality that we have not just 
a high rate of youth unemployment but 
a tragically high rate of youth unem-
ployment in this country. This is an 
issue we don’t discuss. It is literally 
swept under the rug. We have to bring 
it out in the open, we have to discuss 
it, and we have to address this issue. 

Last month, the Economic Policy In-
stitute released a new study about the 
level of youth unemployment in this 
country. This study took a close look 
at census data on unemployment 
among young people between 17 and 20 
who are jobless, those who are working 
part time when they need a full-time 
job, and those who have given up look-
ing for work altogether. The results of 
this study should concern everybody in 
our country and every Member of the 
Congress. 

By the way, I have mentioned these 
facts in the past. PolitiFact, which 
seems to check every statement I 
make, checked it out, and they said 
these facts are basically accurate. 

Here is what the Economic Policy In-
stitute found. From April of 2014 to 
March of 2015, the average real unem-
ployment rate for young White high 
school graduates between the ages of 17 
and 20 was 33.8 percent. High school 
graduates, high school dropouts, White, 
17 to 20—33.8 percent. The jobless fig-
ures for Hispanic kids in the same age 
group was 36.1 percent. And incredibly, 
the average real unemployment rate 
for African-American high school grad-
uates was 51.3 percent. High school 
graduates or dropouts between the ages 
of 17 and 20, African American, over 50 
percent unemployed or underemployed. 

Today in America, over 5.5 million 
young people have either dropped out 
of high school or have graduated high 
school and do not have jobs. It is no 
great secret—not to any parent, not to 
any Member of the Senate—that when 
kids are not in school, when kids have 
no jobs, that is when kids get into 
trouble, when they get into drugs, 
when they get into self-destructive ac-
tivity. 

The result of kids not being in school 
and kids not having jobs is that trag-
ically, today, we in this country have 
more people in jail than any other 
country on Earth, including China—a 
Communist authoritarian country with 
a population four times our size. We 
have more people in jail than China 
does. Incredibly, over 3 percent of our 
country’s population is under some 
form of correctional control. 

According to the NAACP, from 1980 
to 2012, the number of people incarcer-
ated in America quadrupled—quad-
rupled—from roughly 500,000 to 2.2 mil-
lion people. 

A January 2014 study published in the 
journal Crime & Delinquency found 

that almost half of Black males in the 
United States are arrested by the age 
of 23. That is an unbelievable statistic 
and a tragic statistic. If this current 
trend continues, one in four Black 
males born today can expect to spend 
time in prison during his lifetime. 
What a tragedy this is. We cannot ig-
nore it. We have to deal with this re-
ality. 

But this crisis is not just a destruc-
tion of human life and of potential, it 
is also very costly to the taxpayers of 
our country. In America, we now spend 
nearly $200 billion on public safety, in-
cluding $70 billion on correctional fa-
cilities each and every year. 

It is beyond comprehension that we 
as a nation have not focused attention 
on the fact that millions of young peo-
ple are unable to find work and begin 
their careers in a productive economy. 
That is what young people want to do. 
They want to get out, they want to get 
a job, they want to earn some money, 
they want to become independent from 
their parents, and they want to begin a 
career ladder, but for millions of these 
young people, that is not taking place 
today. 

Let me be as clear as I can be. It 
makes a lot more sense for us to invest 
in jobs and education rather than in 
more and more incarceration and more 
and more jails. The time is long over-
due for us to start investing in our 
young people, to help them get the jobs 
they need, to help them get the edu-
cation they need. 

This is not only saving human life; it 
is saving dollars. It is a very expensive 
proposition to put people into jail. 
Many people who go to jail come out of 
jail and go back to jail. They don’t get 
jobs, and they don’t pay taxes. Their 
lives are destroyed. Their families’ 
lives are destroyed. It is high time we 
understood that. We have to invest in 
jobs, and we have to invest in edu-
cation—not more jails, not more incar-
ceration. 

I have offered an amendment that 
will be voted upon, either today or to-
morrow, that is pretty simple and pret-
ty straight forward. It says to us that 
now is the time to keep kids out of jail, 
to get them jobs, and to get them an 
education. This amendment would sim-
ply provide $5.5 billion in immediate 
funding to States and cities through-
out the country to create 1 million jobs 
for young Americans between the ages 
of 16 and 24. This amendment would 
also provide job opportunities for hun-
dreds of thousands of young adults. 

Frankly, this amendment doesn’t go 
far enough, but it is an important start 
in trying to save the lives of countless 
numbers of young people who, if we do 
not address their needs, are going to 
end up in jail or with destroyed lives. 

Specifically, under this amendment 
the U.S. Department of Labor would 
provide $4 billion in grants to States 
and local governments to provide sum-
mer and year-round employment op-
portunities for economically disadvan-
taged youth, with direct links to aca-
demic and occupational learning. This 
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amendment would also make sure that 
young Americans have access to trans-
portation and childcare services they 
may need in order to participate in job 
opportunities all over this country. 
This amendment would also provide 
$1.5 billion in competitive grants to 
local areas to provide work-based job 
training to low- and moderate-income 
youth and disadvantaged young adults. 

I hope very much we can have bipar-
tisan support for this amendment, be-
cause what we are talking about is not 
just saving countless numbers of lives 
and not just saving taxpayers a sub-
stantial sum of money. It is much more 
cost effective to invest in kids so they 
have productive lives rather than see-
ing them go into jail and into jail and 
into jail and see their families being 
destroyed. It is high time we addressed 
this issue. This amendment is an im-
portant first step. I look forward to 
seeing bipartisan support for it. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Pennsylvania. 
Mr. CASEY. I yield the floor. 
I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

proceeded to call the roll. 
Mr. CORNYN. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

NUCLEAR AGREEMENT WITH IRAN 
Mr. CORNYN. Mr. President, yester-

day President Obama announced a deal 
with Iran, one that will send billions of 
dollars to a regime with a long history 
of violently opposing the United States 
and its allies. 

I come to the floor to express again 
my deep skepticism about how the 
Obama administration has approached 
these talks and my great concerns 
about what has been revealed about the 
deal so far—recognizing that we should 
all, perhaps, reserve our judgment for 
the process that will unfold over the 
next couple of months, by which we 
will actually be able to read the text of 
the deal and then to show to the Amer-
ican people what it contains and ex-
press our concerns publicly and debate 
those. That is going to unfold over the 
next couple of months. 

But I think we can all agree that 
bringing Iran to the negotiating table 
and securing an agreement that pro-
hibits 100 percent of their ability to 
gain the capacity to create a nuclear 
weapon would be a tremendous legacy 
for any President to accomplish. 

Preventing Iran from becoming a nu-
clear power would have been a legacy 
item for President Obama or any Presi-
dent. But these negotiations have been 
particularly concerning because, in 
spite of the fact that the Iranian re-
gime has given us no reason to trust it, 
the President has been operating under 
the assumption that any deal is better 
than no deal. 

I am afraid the President has dem-
onstrated the old adage that if you 

want a deal bad enough, that is exactly 
what you are going to get—a bad deal. 

In so doing, the President has aban-
doned longstanding U.S. policy. Our 
policy has always been to prevent Iran 
from getting nuclear weapons. Instead, 
the administration has said: Well, it is 
OK. We will allow you a plan forward, 
and—in the words of Prime Minister 
Netanyahu—pave the way toward your 
acquisition of nuclear weapons. 

This is an outcome that is irrespon-
sible, unacceptable, and exceedingly 
dangerous. 

I found it interesting that during his 
announcement the President said U.S. 
engagement in Iran was built upon 
‘‘mutual interests and mutual re-
spect.’’ The theocratic Iranian regime 
is a government that just last week en-
couraged its citizens to shout slogans 
often heard on the streets of Tehran. 
‘‘Death to America,’’ they say. ‘‘Death 
to Israel.’’ I don’t see how the Presi-
dent can consider such actions a sign of 
‘‘mutual respect.’’ It is just the oppo-
site. 

But I should be fair to the President. 
He is of course not the only person who 
supports this deal. We hear that Rus-
sia’s President Vladimir Putin has en-
dorsed it. So has Syria’s President 
Bashar al-Assad, who called the agree-
ment a ‘‘major turning point.’’ Our en-
emies think this is a great deal, and 
they strongly support it. 

But I hope the administration is 
aware that the optimism they have 
surrounding Iran and this deal is not 
universal. Our staunchest ally in the 
Middle East, the nation of Israel, has 
stated its clear opposition yesterday. 

President Netanyahu, as he did in a 
joint session of Congress just a few 
short months ago, said in crystal clear 
language that this agreement rep-
resents a ‘‘historic mistake’’ for the 
world. That is likely because the Ira-
nian regime has regularly—even 
throughout the ongoing negotiations— 
called for the destruction of Israel. 

So while our enemies such as Bashar 
al-Assad of Syria called the deal a 
major turning point, our greatest ally 
called it a ‘‘historic mistake.’’ That 
should give all of us pause. What other 
warning signs do we need? Can a deal 
that is wholeheartedly endorsed by our 
adversaries and simultaneously dis-
dained by one of our closest allies pos-
sibly be in the best interest of the 
United States of America? I am inter-
ested in hearing the answer to that 
question during the course of our re-
view and debates because that is the 
question we will have the chance to an-
swer for ourselves at the end of this 
next 60-day period of time. 

Although I have seen several head-
lines talking about Republican opposi-
tion to the agreement, I would like to 
point out that there are a number of 
Democratic colleagues who have been 
quick to voice their concerns as well. 
This should not, and I pray will not, 
become a partisan disagreement. What 
we ought to be doing, in the best inter-
est of the United States of America and 

our national security and those of our 
allies, is getting to the bottom of this 
agreement, raising concerns, and ask-
ing questions. Perhaps the President 
would like for this to become a par-
tisan debate because then he wins, and 
in so doing America and our allies lose. 

Yesterday, the ranking member of 
the Senate Foreign Relations Com-
mittee said that ‘‘there is no trust 
when it comes to Iran.’’ That state-
ment was made by the distinguished 
Senator from Maryland, Mr. CARDIN. 
Similarly, another Democratic col-
league, the senior Senator from New 
Jersey and former chairman of the For-
eign Relations Committee, said that 
‘‘the deal doesn’t end Iran’s nuclear 
program,’’ but instead it ‘‘preserves 
it.’’ 

This deal cements many of the long-
standing concerns that I and many of 
my colleagues have had. Instead of rid-
ding the world of an Iranian nuclear 
weapon once and for all, this simply 
kicks the deal down the road—when, by 
the way, President Obama will no 
longer be in office—but it completely 
preserves the nuclear infrastructure re-
quired to create a nuclear weapon in as 
little as 1 year. We can’t afford to sit 
back, cross our fingers, and wait for 
the regime to resurrect its nuclear pro-
gram after their main obligations 
under the deal have expired. 

Let me just be clear. The American 
people are not so desperate to cut this 
deal with the Iranian regime, and I 
think they will be even less supportive 
than they have been so far once the de-
tails of this deal gets vetted. 

I wholeheartedly reject the sugges-
tion the President has made on numer-
ous occasions that there are two alter-
natives: There is this deal or there is 
war. That is ridiculous. That is a false 
choice. What it should be is a choice 
between this deal and something bet-
ter—something that actually denies 
Iran nuclear weapons and doesn’t un-
leash billions of dollars for them to 
fight their proxy war against the 
United States and our allies. 

Again, the No. 1 state sponsor of 
international terrorism is Iran, and we 
are going to unleash the sanctions on 
the oil that they will now be able to 
sell in global markets and reap wind-
fall profits perhaps, along with released 
funds that have been sequestered in 
American banks and other institutions, 
so they can now prop up their economy 
and again pay for the war they are 
fighting against Israel and the United 
States and other allies. 

The bipartisan sanctions regime that 
Congress has put in place over decades 
should not and cannot be undone 
through an Executive agreement be-
tween President Obama and the head of 
the world’s leader in state-sponsored 
terrorism. As elected representatives of 
the American people, we, all of us, in 
addition to the President, are com-
mitted to securing a good deal for the 
people who sent us here, and that 
means making sure Iran will never 
have the ability to build a nuclear 
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weapon, protecting our interests and 
our allies against a threatening re-
gional power and, first and foremost, 
ensuring that the American people are 
safer tomorrow than they were yester-
day. 

Now that the White House has sub-
mitted the first 109 pages of this deal 
to Congress, we are in the process of re-
viewing it, but there is more to come— 
classified annexes and all. I look for-
ward to reading this agreement word- 
for-word, understanding it better, and 
asking many of the similar-type ques-
tions which I posed here today, which 
need good and solid and reliability an-
swers. We can’t base this on a policy of 
hope or even trust in the rogue regime 
in Tehran. We need answers to these 
questions and, even more importantly, 
so do the American people. 

I yield the floor. 
I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

proceeded to call the roll. 
Mrs. MURRAY. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2241 
Mrs. MURRAY. Mr. President, our 

Nation has always held the ideal of 
providing education for all, but a half 
century ago we put that ideal into ac-
tion with the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act or ESEA. That 
law aimed to close education gaps be-
tween rich and poor, Black and White, 
kids from rural areas, and kids from 
big cities. 

Today, we are debating an amend-
ment to strengthen accountability in 
our bill to reauthorize ESEA to do even 
more by making sure schools are deliv-
ering on the promise of quality and 
equality to every student in America. 

Across the country, too many schools 
today have failed too many of our chil-
dren for too long, and that has to 
change. Now our bipartisan bill re-
moves the unrealistic goals and one- 
size-fits-all mandates of No Child Left 
Behind. But we can still have strong 
accountability without going back to 
those requirements. 

Senator MURPHY’s amendment, which 
we will be voting on shortly, will shine 
a light on the persistent inequality and 
achievement gap that still exists and 
do something about it, and it would en-
sure that we make sure children from 
low-income backgrounds, the kids of 
color, the students who are still learn-
ing English, and students with disabil-
ities have access to a high-quality edu-
cation. 

Under his amendment, States would 
identify the bottom 5 percent of 
schools, States would identify the high 
schools that are failing to graduate 
one-third or more of their students, 
and States would identify schools that 
have failed to help subgroups of stu-
dents make progress. 

Now, of course, accountability is 
about more than just identifying the 

schools and districts that need help. 
We have to make sure those schools get 
the resources they need. The Every 
Child Achieves Act allows districts to 
design interventions tailored to the in-
dividual needs of low-performing 
schools. This amendment doesn’t 
change that, but this amendment 
would give parents, teachers, and com-
munities important measures to hold 
schools accountable for delivering a 
quality education to every child. 

I will also note that in our bipartisan 
bill, we have done a lot to help the 
adults in this school get the support 
they need from professional develop-
ment to easing the burden on school 
administrators. I was very proud to 
work on all of those provisions. But 
this amendment isn’t about the adults. 
It is about the children in our schools. 
So I urge my colleagues to vote yes on 
the Murphy amendment so we can do 
even more to make sure all of our stu-
dents learn, no matter where they live 
or how they learn or how much money 
their parents make. 

Let’s fix No Child Left Behind. Let’s 
continue to improve this bill by 
strengthening accountability, and let’s 
reaffirm our Nation’s commitment to 
providing a quality education to every 
student in America. 

I thank the Presiding Officer, and I 
yield the floor. 

I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

proceeded to call the roll. 
Ms. HIRONO. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Ms. HIRONO. Mr. President, I rise to 
discuss the Every Child Achieves Act, 
S. 1177, which replaces the education 
law better known as No Child Left Be-
hind. I wish to thank the HELP Com-
mittee Chairman ALEXANDER and rank-
ing member PATTY MURRAY for their 
hard work on today’s bipartisan com-
promise bill. 

Today’s Every Child Achieves Act 
isn’t perfect, but it makes good 
progress. For years, I have heard from 
Hawaii’s teachers, parents, and admin-
istrators that No Child Left Behind, or 
NCLB, is broken. It is time to leave 
NCLB behind. 

I have been working to fix this bro-
ken law, first as a member of the House 
of Representatives’ Education and 
Labor Committee in 2007 and now as a 
Senator. I also began to work on edu-
cation reform when I was Lieutenant 
Governor of the State of Hawaii. 

I will start with one of the biggest 
problems with NCLB, which is the test-
ing requirements. I heard from teach-
ers in Hawaii loud and clear that NCLB 
brought us too much testing. Teachers 
and students in some schools spent so 
much time on testing and test prep 
that they didn’t have enough time for 
teaching and learning. 

Today’s bill includes Senator BALD-
WIN’s SMART Act legislation, which I 

cosponsored, to cut redundant State 
and local tests, and it also includes 
Senator BENNET’s amendment that sets 
a cap on the percent of time spent on 
testing. 

I also strongly support the early edu-
cation parts of this program as nego-
tiated by Senator MURRAY, herself a 
former preschool teacher. I urge my 
colleagues to expand on this work by 
also supporting the Strong Start for 
America’s Children amendment led by 
Senators CASEY, MURRAY, myself, and 
others. 

The Strong Start amendment would 
invest significant resources in high- 
quality preschool grant programs, 
which would serve some 16,000 Hawaii 
children in my State alone. It would 
expand early Head Start childcare 
partnerships, such as Hawaii’s Parents 
And Children Together and Kama’aina 
Kids, and would strengthen the Mater-
nal, Infant, and Early Childhood Home 
Visiting Program, supporting programs 
like the Hawaii Home Visiting Net-
work. 

Quality early education helps kids 
enter kindergarten ready to learn, a 
recipe for success in school and in life. 
Studies show that by age 3, there is a 
30-million word gap, basically a 2-to-1 
gap, between low-income children and 
their wealthier peers with regard to 
their language skills. Quality early 
education can help close this gap early. 
Kids then are more likely to succeed in 
school, avoid crime or teen pregnancy, 
graduate from high school and college, 
earn more income, pay more taxes, and 
need fewer public services. Why? 

First, they have the knowledge and 
skills necessary to succeed in a chang-
ing economy. Business and financial 
leaders in Hawaii—Hawaii’s Business 
Roundtable executive director Gary 
Kai is a huge supporter of quality early 
education, and former Federal Reserve 
Chair Ben Bernanke also agrees that 
early childhood education is a key in-
vestment in U.S. competitiveness. 

Second, military leaders have also 
stressed the importance of quality 
early education as a national security 
issue. The Department of Defense has 
estimated that 75 percent of Americans 
age 17 to 24 are ineligible for military 
service due to poor education, physical 
unfitness or criminal records. Hundreds 
of retired admirals and generals know 
that quality early learning can reverse 
this trend. 

Third, early education investments 
make financial sense for taxpayers. A 
study by the University of Hawaii and 
Good Beginnings Alliance estimated a 
return of more than $4 for every $1 in-
vested in early education. National 
studies are even higher. Some show a 
return as high as $17 for every $1 in-
vested in quality early education. That 
depends, of course, on the quality of 
the program and particularly if we tar-
get the highest need students. 

Finally, parents themselves are de-
manding quality, affordable preschool 
for their children. In April of this year, 
I visited Kauai Community College 

VerDate Sep 11 2014 01:42 Jul 16, 2015 Jkt 049060 PO 00000 Frm 00024 Fmt 0624 Sfmt 0634 E:\CR\FM\G15JY6.028 S15JYPT1rf
re

de
ric

k 
on

 D
S

K
6S

P
T

V
N

1P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 S
E

N
A

T
E



CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE S5115 July 15, 2015 
whose Early Childhood Development 
Center reopened after a few years of 
renovations. 

This center trains early childhood 
educators while providing high-quality 
early learning services to children of 
faculty, staff, and the community. 
Their lead teacher and coordinator, 
Gina Medrano, said, ‘‘So far, no one has 
cried since we opened. They only cry 
when it is time to go home.’’ That is 
evidence of how important early edu-
cation is to our kids themselves. 

Currently, the KCC Center can only 
serve 20 children. There are wait-lists 
for this program and for quality early 
learning programs in Kauai, all across 
Hawaii, and nationwide. We can and 
should do much better. 

The Strong Start for America’s chil-
dren amendment would help make 
early learning the national priority it 
deserves to be. The amendment would 
provide quality preschool to over 3 mil-
lion children nationwide. I urge my 
colleagues to vote yes on this amend-
ment when it comes to the floor. 

So many of us recognize that edu-
cation is a continuum which starts 
early and continues throughout life; 
therefore, coordination of effort is im-
portant. So I am pleased that this bill 
before us includes provisions to foster 
coordination between existing early 
childhood programs and their local ele-
mentary school. In 2011, Senator CASEY 
and I introduced the Continuum of 
Learning Act, and today’s bill on the 
floor includes many pieces from that 
legislation. 

On balance, the Every Child Achieves 
Act before us means good progress for 
our keiki—our children—and I hope we 
can continue moving forward and pass 
the bill before us in a bipartisan way. 

Our country is at its best when all 
students have access to high-quality 
education from birth to college and ca-
reer. Improving our education system 
through evidence-based reforms will 
help every child achieve so that our 
next generation can compete and lead 
in the 21st-century global economy. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 

PERDUE). The Senator from Tennessee. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, on 

behalf of Senator MURRAY from Wash-
ington and myself, I ask unanimous 
consent that at 3:15 p.m. today, the 
Senate vote on the following amend-
ments in the order listed: Markey 
amendment No. 2176, 60-vote threshold; 
Heitkamp amendment No. 2171, 60-vote 
threshold; Kirk amendment No. 2161, 
60-vote threshold; and Murphy amend-
ment No. 2241, 60-vote threshold. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there 
objection? 

Without objection, it is so ordered. 
AMENDMENT NO. 2144 WITHDRAWN 

Mr. ALEXANDER. I further ask 
unanimous consent that the Wicker 
amendment No. 2144 be withdrawn. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, amendment No. 2144 is with-
drawn. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. I suggest the ab-
sence of a quorum. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 
clerk will call the roll. 

The senior assistant legislative clerk 
proceeded to call the roll. 

Mr. MARKEY. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2176 
Mr. MARKEY. I ask unanimous con-

sent to speak for up to 2 minutes on my 
amendment. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. MARKEY. Mr. President, my 
amendment is very simple. It would 
create a competitive grant program to 
support the development and improve-
ment of educational materials and 
teacher training on climate change 
science and solutions. 

The scientific evidence of climate 
change is longstanding and wide-rang-
ing. The National Academy of Sciences 
and numerous science professional or-
ganizations all recognize the reality of 
climate change and the influence of 
human activities upon it. The children 
of our country deserve the best sci-
entific education they can get on this 
topic. They are the future leaders of 
our country and the world. They must 
be equipped for this generational chal-
lenge. 

This is without question one of the 
overarching issues of our 21st century. 
We must ensure that we provide the 
best science training available for this 
next generation—the green generation. 
They are going to have to confront this 
problem. They should have the best sci-
entific evidence available. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Tennessee. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Thank you, Mr. 
President. 

Mr. President, we will have a vote on 
the Markey amendment. I would urge a 
‘‘no’’ vote for the following reasons: If 
you love Washington getting involved 
in Common Core, you will love this 
amendment, because it gets the Fed-
eral Government involved in creating a 
curriculum for climate change in your 
local high schools and other schools. 

Based upon what we know about the 
U.S. Department of Education, as soon 
as we authorize this, it will begin to 
write regulations defining what we 
mean by climate change, and we would 
have to change textbooks in 100,000 
public schools every time we have a 
Presidential election. Just imagine 
what the curriculum on climate change 
would be if we shifted from President 
Obama to President Cruz and then 
back to President Sanders and then to 
President Trump. There would be a lot 
of wasted paper, writing and rewriting 
textbooks. 

The Every Child Achieves Act pro-
hibits officials of the Federal Govern-
ment from getting involved with the 
instructional material in classrooms. If 
we want to have better climate science, 
the appeal should not be to a national 
school board that gets Washington in-

volved in climate change. It should be 
to the local school board or the State 
school board. I say that as a Repub-
lican who believes that climate change 
is a problem and that human activity 
is a major contributor to that problem. 
But I do not want the Federal Govern-
ment involved in local high school and 
elementary school curricula for cli-
mate science or anything else. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Massachusetts. 
Mr. MARKEY. I ask for the yeas and 

nays. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there a 

sufficient second? 
There appears to be a sufficient sec-

ond. 
The question is on agreeing to the 

amendment. 
The clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

called the roll. 
Mr. CORNYN. The following Senators 

are necessarily absent: the Senator 
from Texas (Mr. CRUZ) and the Senator 
from South Carolina (Mr. GRAHAM). 

Mr. DURBIN. I announce that the 
Senator from Florida (Mr. NELSON) is 
necessarily absent. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Are there 
any other Senators in the Chamber de-
siring to vote? 

The result was announced—yeas 44, 
nays 53, as follows: 

[Rollcall Vote No. 238 Leg.] 
YEAS—44 

Ayotte 
Baldwin 
Bennet 
Blumenthal 
Booker 
Boxer 
Brown 
Cantwell 
Cardin 
Carper 
Casey 
Coons 
Donnelly 
Durbin 
Feinstein 

Franken 
Gillibrand 
Heinrich 
Hirono 
Kaine 
King 
Kirk 
Klobuchar 
Leahy 
Markey 
McCaskill 
Menendez 
Merkley 
Mikulski 
Murphy 

Murray 
Peters 
Reed 
Reid 
Sanders 
Schatz 
Schumer 
Shaheen 
Stabenow 
Udall 
Warner 
Warren 
Whitehouse 
Wyden 

NAYS—53 

Alexander 
Barrasso 
Blunt 
Boozman 
Burr 
Capito 
Cassidy 
Coats 
Cochran 
Collins 
Corker 
Cornyn 
Cotton 
Crapo 
Daines 
Enzi 
Ernst 
Fischer 

Flake 
Gardner 
Grassley 
Hatch 
Heitkamp 
Heller 
Hoeven 
Inhofe 
Isakson 
Johnson 
Lankford 
Lee 
Manchin 
McCain 
McConnell 
Moran 
Murkowski 
Paul 

Perdue 
Portman 
Risch 
Roberts 
Rounds 
Rubio 
Sasse 
Scott 
Sessions 
Shelby 
Sullivan 
Tester 
Thune 
Tillis 
Toomey 
Vitter 
Wicker 

NOT VOTING—3 

Cruz Graham Nelson 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order requiring 60 votes 
for the adoption of this amendment, 
the amendment is rejected. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2171 
Under the previous order, there will 

now be 2 minutes of debate equally di-
vided prior to a vote in relation to 
Heitkamp amendment No. 2171. 
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The Senator from North Dakota. 
Ms. HEITKAMP. Mr. President, I rise 

to urge my colleagues to support my 
amendment. As you have been talking 
to your school districts and as you 
have been talking to the school per-
sonnel, if they don’t mention the chal-
lenges they have dealing with children 
in their schools who need services be-
yond education services, who come un-
ready to learn because of behavior and 
mental health problems, we have a pro-
gram that has existed for a number of 
years. I understand it has been under-
utilized. But if there has ever been a 
time, as we talk about the behavior 
and mental health challenges that we 
have in our communities and in our 
schools, and if there has ever been a 
challenge for a grant program that de-
velops best practices, it is today. 

I urge my colleagues to support this 
amendment and integrate these behav-
ior and mental health programs into 
the schools and into the education sys-
tem so that we can better address the 
concerns, so that we can, in fact, begin 
to challenge our society to deal with 
these issues at the school level. 
Schools should not be in this alone. We 
need to integrate the behavioral health 
and mental health systems into our 
schools. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Tennessee. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
urge a ‘‘no’’ vote. Of course, we should 
help and care about the mental health 
of children, but the Federal Govern-
ment already funds at least 16 pro-
grams related to mental health. 

A new program isn’t needed, and the 
Department of Education is not the 
best suited agency to administer it. It 
ought to be in the Department of 
Health and Human Services. 

It is unnecessary. The district may 
use funds already under the education 
bill and other health programs for this 
purpose. 

One of the problems we have as a 
Congress is we have a good idea and we 
appropriate and create a new program 
without realizing there are already 16 
other programs there. We should stop 
that and focus our efforts on existing 
programs and giving States more flexi-
bility to use that money. 

I urge a ‘‘no’’ vote. 
Ms. HEITKAMP. Mr. President, do I 

have any time remaining? 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. All time 

has expired. 
The question is on agreeing to the 

amendment. 
Mr. DURBIN. I ask for the yeas and 

nays. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there a 

sufficient second? 
There appears to be a sufficient sec-

ond. 
The clerk will call the roll. 
The legislative clerk called the roll. 
Mr. CORNYN. The following Senators 

are necessarily absent: the Senator 
from Texas (Mr. CRUZ) and the Senator 
from South Carolina (Mr. GRAHAM). 

Mr. DURBIN. I announce that the 
Senator from Florida (Mr. NELSON) is 
necessarily absent. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 
GARDNER). Are there any other Sen-
ators in the Chamber desiring to vote? 

The result was announced—yeas 58, 
nays 39, as follows: 

[Rollcall Vote No. 239 Leg.] 
YEAS—58 

Ayotte 
Baldwin 
Bennet 
Blumenthal 
Booker 
Boxer 
Brown 
Cantwell 
Cardin 
Carper 
Casey 
Cassidy 
Collins 
Coons 
Daines 
Donnelly 
Durbin 
Ernst 
Feinstein 
Franken 

Gillibrand 
Heinrich 
Heitkamp 
Heller 
Hirono 
Hoeven 
Kaine 
King 
Kirk 
Klobuchar 
Leahy 
Manchin 
Markey 
McCaskill 
Menendez 
Merkley 
Mikulski 
Moran 
Murkowski 
Murphy 

Murray 
Peters 
Portman 
Reed 
Reid 
Sanders 
Schatz 
Schumer 
Shaheen 
Stabenow 
Sullivan 
Tester 
Thune 
Udall 
Warner 
Warren 
Whitehouse 
Wyden 

NAYS—39 

Alexander 
Barrasso 
Blunt 
Boozman 
Burr 
Capito 
Coats 
Cochran 
Corker 
Cornyn 
Cotton 
Crapo 
Enzi 

Fischer 
Flake 
Gardner 
Grassley 
Hatch 
Inhofe 
Isakson 
Johnson 
Lankford 
Lee 
McCain 
McConnell 
Paul 

Perdue 
Risch 
Roberts 
Rounds 
Rubio 
Sasse 
Scott 
Sessions 
Shelby 
Tillis 
Toomey 
Vitter 
Wicker 

NOT VOTING—3 

Cruz Graham Nelson 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order requiring 60 votes 
for the adoption of this amendment, 
the amendment is rejected. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2161 
Under the previous order, there will 

be 2 minutes of debate equally divided 
prior to a vote in relation to Kirk 
amendment No. 2161. 

The Senator from Rhode Island. 
Mr. REED. Mr. President, I urge all 

my colleagues to vote yes on the Kirk- 
Reed-Baldwin-Brown amendment. 

Essentially, in this legislation—and I 
commend the chairman and the rank-
ing member for all the work they have 
done—they have established lofty 
goals, but without adequate resources, 
all of our students cannot succeed. 
This amendment encourages the States 
to develop and report on measures of 
access to critical education resources; 
identify disparities in districts’ access 
to those resources; develop plans with 
school districts to address these dis-
parities; and include the Opportunity 
Dashboard of Core Resources on the 
State report card. 

Again, it is a very simple concept. 
Lofty goals without adequate resources 
will not give opportunities to Amer-
ican students. We hope this will help 
provide equitable access to critical re-
sources. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Tennessee. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
urge a ‘‘no’’ vote. This bipartisan bill 
on the floor is about reversing the 
trend toward a national school board. 

This amendment is about making the 
national school board bigger and more 
powerful. It would result in the Federal 
Government deciding for States which 
educational resources are critical. That 
would have the Federal Government 
deciding about licensing teachers, 
teachers’ salaries, library books, 
wellness programs, school facilities, 
and it would produce new lawsuits. 

We need to go in the other direction. 
We need to keep the measurements of 
how children are doing but restore to 
States and local school boards the re-
sponsibility for making these deci-
sions. 

I urge a ‘‘no’’ vote. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

question occurs on agreeing to amend-
ment No. 2161. 

Mr. ALEXANDER. I ask for the yeas 
and nays. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there a 
sufficient second? 

There appears to be a sufficient sec-
ond. 

The clerk will call the roll. 
The bill clerk called the roll. 
Mr. CORNYN. The following Senators 

are necessarily absent: the Senator 
from Texas (Mr. CRUZ) and the Senator 
from South Carolina (Mr. GRAHAM). 

Mr. DURBIN. I announce that the 
Senator from Connecticut (Mr. 
BLUMENTHAL) and the Senator from 
Florida (Mr. NELSON) are necessarily 
absent. 

I further announce that, if present 
and voting, the Senator from Con-
necticut (Mr. BLUMENTHAL) would have 
voted ‘‘yea.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Are there 
any other Senators in the Chamber de-
siring to vote? 

The result was announced—yeas 46, 
nays 50, as follows: 

[Rollcall Vote No. 240 Leg.] 

YEAS—46 

Baldwin 
Bennet 
Booker 
Boxer 
Brown 
Cantwell 
Cardin 
Carper 
Casey 
Coons 
Donnelly 
Durbin 
Feinstein 
Franken 
Gillibrand 
Hatch 

Heinrich 
Heitkamp 
Heller 
Hirono 
Kaine 
Kirk 
Klobuchar 
Leahy 
Markey 
McCaskill 
Menendez 
Merkley 
Mikulski 
Murkowski 
Murphy 
Murray 

Peters 
Portman 
Reed 
Reid 
Sanders 
Schatz 
Schumer 
Shaheen 
Stabenow 
Udall 
Warner 
Warren 
Whitehouse 
Wyden 

NAYS—50 

Alexander 
Ayotte 
Barrasso 
Blunt 
Boozman 
Burr 
Capito 
Cassidy 
Coats 
Cochran 
Collins 
Corker 
Cornyn 
Cotton 
Crapo 
Daines 
Enzi 

Ernst 
Fischer 
Flake 
Gardner 
Grassley 
Hoeven 
Inhofe 
Isakson 
Johnson 
King 
Lankford 
Lee 
Manchin 
McCain 
McConnell 
Moran 
Paul 

Perdue 
Risch 
Roberts 
Rounds 
Rubio 
Sasse 
Scott 
Sessions 
Shelby 
Sullivan 
Tester 
Thune 
Tillis 
Toomey 
Vitter 
Wicker 
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NOT VOTING—4 

Blumenthal 
Cruz 

Graham Nelson 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order requiring 60 votes 
for the adoption of this amendment, 
the amendment is rejected. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2241 
Under the previous order, there is 2 

minutes of debate equally divided prior 
to a vote on Murphy amendment No. 
2241. 

The Senator from Connecticut. 
Mr. MURPHY. Mr. President, argu-

ably the only good thing that the exist-
ing education law did was expose these 
unconscionable gaps in this country be-
tween the performance of minority 
kids and nonminority kids, between 
disabled kids and nondisabled kids. 

Frankly, this body is at its best when 
it says that, no matter your race, geog-
raphy, disability or income, you de-
serve access to a quality education. If 
we can’t guarantee that, then the ques-
tion is this: What good is a Federal 
education law in the first place? 

So this amendment learns from the 
mistakes of No Child Left Behind, and 
it simply says two things. States have 
to identify when they have these un-
justifiable yawning gaps between the 
performance of disabled kids or minor-
ity kids and the rest of the school, and 
then they have to come up with a plan 
through a community conversation as 
to how to fix that—period, stop. Iden-
tify your problem, your achievements. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The ma-
jority leader. 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, let 
me quickly say that this vote will be 
the last vote. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-
ator from Connecticut. 

Mr. MURPHY. All this amendment 
says is that just simply on a State by 
State basis, identify your achievement 
gap and then come up with a plan to fix 
it—no Federal intervention, no Federal 
prescription of how you fix the prob-
lem. 

It is a big, big problem in this coun-
try that has a very simple solution in 
this amendment, and it deserves our 
support. 

I yield back. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Tennessee. 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, 

yesterday the Senator from Montana, 
Mr. TESTER, came on the floor and said 
he supported this bill because it got rid 
of adequate yearly progress. This is 
adequate yearly progress through the 
back door. Instead of fixing No Child 
Left Behind, it keeps the worst parts of 
it and restores those kinds of parts 
with new mandates. 

If you don’t believe me, here is a let-
ter dated yesterday from the National 
Educational Association on behalf of 
its 3 million members: 

After 13 years of witnessing firsthand the 
negative consequences [of] No Child Left 
Behind’s one-size-fits-all approach to ac-
countability . . . our members strongly op-
pose more of the same. . . . we believe the 

Murphy amendment would continue the nar-
row and punitive focus of NCLB. 

Our members are deeply concerned the 
amendment would mark an entire school for 
intervention if a single subgroup misses 
goals for two consecutive years—precisely 
the approach that misidentified schools 
under the Adequate Yearly Progress (AYP) 
provision of [No Child Left Behind]. 

We are reversing the trend toward a 
national school board, not establishing 
more of a school board. Governors, 
teachers, school board members, and 
superintendents agree with that. 

I urge a ‘‘no’’ vote. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

question is on agreeing to the amend-
ment. 

Mrs. MURRAY. I ask for the yeas and 
nays. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Is there a 
sufficient second? 

There appears to be a sufficient sec-
ond. 

The clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

called the roll. 
Mr. CORNYN. The following Senators 

are necessarily absent: the Senator 
from Texas (Mr. CRUZ) and the Senator 
from South Carolina (Mr. GRAHAM). 

Mr. DURBIN. I announce that the 
Senator from Florida (Mr. NELSON) is 
necessarily absent. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 
PERDUE). Are there any other Senators 
in the Chamber desiring to vote? 

The result was announced—yeas 43, 
nays 54, as follows: 

[Rollcall Vote No. 241 Leg.] 
YEAS—43 

Baldwin 
Bennet 
Blumenthal 
Booker 
Boxer 
Brown 
Cantwell 
Cardin 
Carper 
Casey 
Coons 
Donnelly 
Durbin 
Feinstein 
Franken 

Gillibrand 
Heinrich 
Heitkamp 
Hirono 
Kaine 
Klobuchar 
Leahy 
Manchin 
Markey 
McCaskill 
Menendez 
Merkley 
Mikulski 
Murphy 
Murray 

Peters 
Portman 
Reed 
Reid 
Sanders 
Schatz 
Schumer 
Stabenow 
Udall 
Warner 
Warren 
Whitehouse 
Wyden 

NAYS—54 

Alexander 
Ayotte 
Barrasso 
Blunt 
Boozman 
Burr 
Capito 
Cassidy 
Coats 
Cochran 
Collins 
Corker 
Cornyn 
Cotton 
Crapo 
Daines 
Enzi 
Ernst 

Fischer 
Flake 
Gardner 
Grassley 
Hatch 
Heller 
Hoeven 
Inhofe 
Isakson 
Johnson 
King 
Kirk 
Lankford 
Lee 
McCain 
McConnell 
Moran 
Murkowski 

Paul 
Perdue 
Risch 
Roberts 
Rounds 
Rubio 
Sasse 
Scott 
Sessions 
Shaheen 
Shelby 
Sullivan 
Tester 
Thune 
Tillis 
Toomey 
Vitter 
Wicker 

NOT VOTING—3 

Cruz Graham Nelson 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Under 
the previous order requiring 60 votes 
for the adoption of this amendment, 
the amendment is rejected. 

The Senator from Ohio. 
AMENDMENT NO. 2247, AS MODIFIED 

Mr. PORTMAN. Mr. President, I rise 
to speak regarding the Burr amend-

ment, which has been offered to the un-
derlying education bill. This is an 
amendment that I understand has been 
modified recently, but it still has some 
of the flaws it has had all along; that 
is, it tells States that if they invest in 
their kids, they are penalized, which I 
think is the wrong message. I hope this 
amendment can be defeated on that 
basis alone. 

It also happens to be bad for some 
States because, for instance, in my 
home State of Ohio, we would lose an 
estimated $70 million because we do in-
vest in our children who are poor, who 
are vulnerable. Therefore, because of 
formula changes, we get less money in 
Ohio. 

I hope States that are affected one 
way or another, though, will look at 
this from a policy perspective and un-
derstand that certainly in this Federal 
K–12 education bill, we ought not to be 
telling the States, such as my home 
State of Ohio, that because they invest 
more in their kids, somehow they are 
penalized. 

I know the Burr amendment was 
changed to reach a different level be-
fore this formula change would occur. I 
think it is $17 billion; right now it is 
$14.4 billion. This means that this 
change will not occur for a few years, 
as I understand it, but the same prob-
lem remains. 

We hope this authorization will last 
through that period and we will not be 
back revisiting this on the floor of the 
Senate. Therefore, I urge my col-
leagues on both sides of the aisle—and 
I know there is opposition on both 
sides of the aisle to this amendment— 
to stand tall and to say let’s not tell 
the States that if they invest in kids 
who come from some of the lowest in-
come school jurisdictions in our coun-
try, that somehow they are going to be 
penalized under a new formula. 

This amendment is a mistake be-
cause it fails to take into account that 
the cost of education in different parts 
of the country differs, and again it pe-
nalizes States that invest more in edu-
cation. 

I urge my colleagues to vote no on 
the Burr amendment. 

I yield the floor. 
I suggest the absence of a quorum. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 

clerk will call the roll. 
The senior assistant legislative clerk 

proceeded to call the roll. 
Mrs. MURRAY. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent that the order for 
the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mrs. MURRAY. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent to speak for 3 min-
utes as in morning business. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

REMEMBERING DR. ELSON FLOYD 
Mrs. MURRAY. Mr. President, every 

once in a while you meet an individual 
who thinks bigger than themselves, 
rises above challenges with grace, is 
driven by a passion to better the world 
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around them and, most importantly, is 
a truly wonderful human being. I have 
come across many advocates and com-
munity leaders in my career, but Dr. 
Elson Floyd was exceptional. He was a 
giant in Washington State’s higher 
education community. He inspired 
countless students and teachers and 
many across the State as Washington 
State University’s president. I can only 
imagine what else he would have ac-
complished had his life not been cut 
painfully short. 

For 8 years, I have had the privilege 
to work with Dr. Floyd in his role as 
the beloved president of my alma 
mater, Washington State University. 
He was one of our Nation’s most suc-
cessful advocates for affordable and ac-
cessible higher education. I always ad-
mired his dedication to his students, 
his passion for education, and his de-
sire to make a great university even 
better. 

The last time I spoke with Dr. Floyd 
a few months ago, he spoke of the 
bright future of Washington State Uni-
versity and the innovative steps the in-
stitution was taking to provide high- 
quality education to its students. 

As we look back now on the life and 
legacy of Dr. Elson Floyd, we will re-
member how he led WSU through a try-
ing economic recession by tirelessly 
advocating for investments in higher 
education as a path to the middle class 
and how he doubled the enrollment of 
students of color. We will remember 
how he skillfully convinced our State 
legislature to allow the university to 
begin building the State’s second med-
ical school at Washington State Uni-
versity-Spokane. And, most impor-
tantly, we will remember how, through 
a warm handshake to visiting alumni 
or a comforting hug to a student, he al-
ways had a way of making those 
around him feel welcome. 

I hope to honor Dr. Floyd’s memory 
by striving every day to better our 
higher education system with the en-
thusiasm and the warmth he emanated 
as a tireless advocate for Washington 
State students. 

There is so much we can all learn 
from his work, and I know his legacy 
will continue to live on in Washington 
State and across the higher education 
community. 

Thank you, Mr. President. 
I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. LEE). 

The Senator from Oklahoma. 
Mr. INHOFE. Mr. President, I ask 

unanimous consent that I be recog-
nized for such time as I shall consume. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. INHOFE. I ask unanimous con-
sent that following my remarks, the 
junior Senator from Oklahoma, Mr. 
LANKFORD, be recognized. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

DRIVE ACT 
Mr. INHOFE. Mr. President, right 

now probably the most significant 
thing we will be facing as soon as we 

get through with the education bill 
that Senator LAMAR ALEXANDER has 
done such a great job on is the trans-
portation reauthorization bill. I found 
out the House just passed a few min-
utes ago a 5-month extension to the 
highway reauthorization bill. 

I would suggest to the people who 
may think there is some type of adver-
sarial relationship between our bill in 
the Senate and the House bill that 
there isn’t. We are working together 
and we both want to accomplish a long- 
term bill, and I anticipate that we will 
actually have passed in the next few 
days a long-term—maybe a 6-year— 
highway reauthorization bill, at which 
time we will go to conference with the 
House and it will be business as usual. 
I want to make sure, in case there is a 
fire looming out there, that we put it 
out early. 

Passing the long-term transportation 
bill has been my top priority since I re-
turned as chairman of the Environ-
ment and Public Works Committee. 
Ironically, the ranking member of that 
committee, Senator BOXER of Cali-
fornia, feels just as strongly that it is 
her top priority also. So I consider this 
to be the second most significant bill 
of the year, the first one being of 
course the Defense reauthorization, 
which we have already addressed here. 
But we felt strongly enough about this 
being a top priority that we had our 
first full committee hearing on the 
need to reauthorize what at that time 
was MAP–21. We had Anthony Foxx, 
the Secretary of Transportation, as 
well as a lot of government leaders so 
they could share the importance of an 
ongoing Federal and State partnership 
in building and maintaining a modern 
surface infrastructure system. 

Since that hearing, my committee 
has put forward a bold bipartisan solu-
tion called the DRIVE Act that will 
put our Nation on the path to having a 
world-class transportation system. I 
have often said there is no such thing 
as a Republican or a Democratic road 
or bridge. This is something that is bi-
partisan. By the way, I have to say 
when the DRIVE Act passed through 
my committee, it passed unani-
mously—every Democrat and every Re-
publican voted for the bill. 

The Transcontinental Railroad, I am 
proud to say, the Republicans have his-
torically been leading the way in trans-
portation going all the way back to the 
Lincoln days. We passed the Trans-
continental Railroad. The Panama 
Canal was done by Teddy Roosevelt. 

Of course, the Interstate Highway 
System was done by Eisenhower. Ei-
senhower said the transportation sys-
tem is a dynamic element in the very 
name we bear, United States. Without 
it, we would be a mere alliance of many 
separate parts. What he also said—let’s 
remember that Eisenhower was a 
President. He was a star. He was con-
cerned, and he started the first high-
way bill by addressing the problems of 
defense. The fact is that if you don’t 
have a highway system within the 

United States, you can’t adequately 
supply the necessary means to fight 
and win wars. So that was the very 
first motivation for it. In laying out 
the full interstate system, Eisenhower 
envisioned it to be the physical back-
bone of the economy, fueling the 
growth of our GDP, our cities, and the 
competitiveness of our exports. 

Now, this vision and certainty maxi-
mized the economic and mobility bene-
fits of the system. Businesses and indi-
viduals knew that if they could locate 
somewhere on a future interstate sys-
tem, they would be connected not just 
with the Nation but with the world. 

I am afraid this legacy system, which 
was built with a 50-year design life, is 
now more than 50 years old. So we are 
out of warranty now, and we need to 
address that. That is the sense of ur-
gency that we have. We are in serious 
danger of eroding a half century of in-
vestments without proper mainte-
nance, modernization, and reconstruc-
tion. We are on borrowed time with a 
system that is in full need of restora-
tion. 

Our national interstate system cur-
rently has a maintenance backlog of 
$185 billion. Now that national inter-
state system is actually 47,000 miles in 
length, and just to bring back the sys-
tem to the original 1956 design, it 
would be that expensive. 

Maintaining Eisenhower’s vision of 
economic opportunity and strength in 
defense requires a continued partner-
ship between the Federal Government 
and the States, which is the hallmark 
of the DRIVE Act. Yet due to 33 short- 
term passages since 2005, the highway 
construction now consists of mainte-
nance patchwork. 

This is what happened. We had a 
transportation reauthorization bill 
that was a 5-year bill. This was in 2005. 
I am very familiar with it. I was the 
author of the bill at that time. In 2005, 
we passed this long-term bill. Since 
that time, we have been unable to pass 
a long-term reauthorization bill. So we 
have been operating on extensions— 
short-term extensions. 

It is interesting that we are now 
looking at something that has both a 
liberal and a conservative perspective. 
The conservative position is a long- 
term bill because the only alternative 
is short-term extensions. Short-term 
extensions—I don’t think anyone has 
ever challenged this—costs about 30 
percent more because you can’t get big 
projects, which we are talking about in 
a minute. So we are now to the point 
where we are going to be able to do 
something with a long-term bill. 

Passing a long-term bill is crucial in 
many aspects of day-to-day life in 
America. More than 250 million vehi-
cles and 18 billion tons valued at $17 
trillion in goods traverse across the 
country every year. Yet every day 2,000 
miles of our highways slow below the 
posted speed limits because of the stop- 
and-go conditions of overcongestion. 

The National Highway System—this 
is kind of interesting. Not many people 

VerDate Sep 11 2014 01:42 Jul 16, 2015 Jkt 049060 PO 00000 Frm 00028 Fmt 0624 Sfmt 0634 E:\CR\FM\G15JY6.039 S15JYPT1rf
re

de
ric

k 
on

 D
S

K
6S

P
T

V
N

1P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 S
E

N
A

T
E



CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — SENATE S5119 July 15, 2015 
are aware of this. Our whole National 
Highway System is 5.5 percent of the 
total Nation’s roads, but it carries 55 
percent of all vehicles traveling and 97 
percent of the truck-borne freight. So 
5.5 percent of the Nation’s roads ac-
count for the transportation of 97 per-
cent of the freight crossing this coun-
try. This type of congestion has a huge 
negative impact on our businesses 
throughout America. 

Congress just passed a 2-month ex-
tension, and we now have a responsi-
bility to pass a long-term solution. As 
I mentioned, they did pass something 
over in the House that we are in agree-
ment that will get them to conference 
with us, and I think most of them are 
going to be—from the ones I talked to 
over there—very excited about the fact 
that we are going to have funding for a 
6-year bill. 

The highway trust fund needs $15 bil-
lion a year to maintain current spend-
ing. What we are saying there is, if you 
take proceeds of the gas tax that is out 
there in order to do what we are cur-
rently doing, it takes an additional $15 
billion each year just to do that, but 
we need to do more than just maintain 
the system. We need to improve it for 
the future of America’s growing econ-
omy. Fortunately, my committee just 
passed this bill unanimously with what 
we call the DRIVE Act. 

The DRIVE Act will put America 
back on the map as the best place to do 
business. The DRIVE Act has several 
key components to position America’s 
transportation system to support our 
growing economy. 

First of all, it prioritizes funding for 
core transportation formula programs 
to provide States and local govern-
ments with strong Federal partners. In 
other words, the States have needs. 
They articulate those needs to the Fed-
eral Government. The Federal Govern-
ment goes in and makes sure that is 
going to be a reality. Let’s keep in 
mind, there are some States—sug-
gesting Wyoming as an example—it 
would take three times as much money 
actually to take care of the roads in 
Wyoming than could be produced by 
the sparse population of that State. So 
that is one of the major initial reasons 
for the program. 

Secondly, it prioritizes the interstate 
system, the National Highway System, 
and the bridges at risk system. Well, as 
I said, the interstate system is 47,000 
miles, but the National Highway Sys-
tem is 220,000 miles, which does encom-
pass the 47,000 miles of the interstate 
system. 

Thirdly, it creates a new multibil-
lion-dollar-per-year freight program to 
help the States deliver projects that 
promote the safe, efficient, and reliable 
transportation of consumer goods and 
products across the United States. 

The fourth thing is—and this is 
something a lot of people are not aware 
of—a lot of people think that we in 
Washington have this infinite wisdom 
that we know what is best for the 
States. We don’t believe that. We be-

lieve the States should set their own 
priorities. In my State of Oklahoma, I 
don’t even get involved in what 
projects are going to be there. We have 
a State system, where the State does 
evaluate, and certainly they know 
more about our needs in Oklahoma 
than the Federal Government does. 
Don’t you agree? That is right. Well, 
that is where we are on that. We let the 
States determine what projects we are 
going to be doing. 

The fifth thing is to provide greater 
efficiency in the project delivery proc-
ess through reforms that put DOT in 
the driver’s seat during the NEPA 
process by requiring other agents to 
bring in their issues. Here is what hap-
pens. We have a lot of good rules in the 
NEPA Program, in the environmental 
programs, but there are some things 
where we feel that should not slow 
down the construction of roads, high-
ways, and bridges, both new bridges 
and repairs. To do that, we have to 
write that into the law, so that stream-
lines the system. If you have nothing 
but short-term extensions, that doesn’t 
happen. They don’t get streamlined. 

Let me compliment my partner in 
this, the ranking member Senator 
BOXER from California. It is inter-
esting. I am among one of the most 
conservative Members of the U.S. Sen-
ate. She is a very proud liberal. Yet we 
both agree on what our priorities 
should be, and that makes this process 
more important. She has been willing 
to do things she didn’t really want to 
do because it does short-circuit some of 
the NEPA requirements, and as a gen-
eral rule she would not want to do 
that. But this has been a give-and- 
take, and that is why we have a bill 
that passed our committee unani-
mously. 

The sixth or seventh thing is elimi-
nating duplicative reviews and expand-
ing categorical exclusions. To give an 
example of that, we have bridge 
projects that are given special consid-
erations with new exemptions from 
section 4(f), the historic property re-
views. Now, to be a historic property, 
it has to be over 50 years old. For them 
to continue to be able to do it, it takes 
these exemptions from what other his-
toric things have to go through be-
cause we are in the business of building 
bridges. 

Secondly, we have the Migratory 
Bird Treaty Act on the books, and it 
allows us to go ahead and start work-
ing on projects even though swallows 
nests—I know it sounds kind of insig-
nificant, but it is not, because swallows 
go in there, and while they are not pro-
tected or listed as an endangered spe-
cies, they still are protected by the Mi-
gratory Bird Treaty Act, and they have 
caused us to stop construction on 
many of the bridges around the coun-
try. 

This is kind of a brief overview of the 
bill. As the DRIVE Act progresses on 
the floor, I intend to address the sig-
nificance of each program in a lot more 
detail. Most importantly, the DRIVE 

Act sets up funding levels for the next 
6 years. This is at the very best what 
the Federal Government should provide 
so States and local officials in the con-
struction industry can gear up for 
large projects—the $500 million to $2 
billion projects. These are things you 
can’t do with extensions, but you can 
do with a bill such as the bill we have 
successfully passed. 

We have thousands of projects around 
the Nation that are currently in jeop-
ardy, and construction will come to a 
halt unless this legislation becomes a 
reality. 

As shown in this picture I have in the 
Chamber, this is the Brent Spence 
Bridge. This goes from Kentucky to 
Ohio. Right now it is in dire need. One 
can see actually the problems with this 
antiquated bridge. There are chunks of 
it dropping off into the river below and 
it has become very dangerous. 

We saw not long ago in another ad-
joining State what can happen if a 
bridge goes down. Here in DC we had 
the Memorial Bridge. It is literally 
crumbling. You can go right down and 
you can see the pieces of the bridge 
dropping into the Potomac River. It 
was built in 1932. It has only received 
patchwork ever since that time. It is 
estimated that nearly $250 million will 
be required to keep the bridge oper-
ational. That is not a new bridge. That 
is to make that into an operational 
bridge. 

You recognize this. You drive by it, 
many of you, every day. But you don’t 
see—you have to get down there and 
you can see concrete dropping into the 
Potomac. We have many more like 
this. What else do we have here? The 
Mobile River Bridge. This is in Ala-
bama. This is what it will look like 
later. That is not a current picture. 
This is what it is right now. 

These are the types of projects that 
we can do now which we could not do 
with just extensions, as we have been 
doing since 2009. I believe more than 
just a small part of the economic suc-
cess enjoyed by the United States over 
the past 50 years has been the inter-
state system started by President Ei-
senhower. But today we literally sit in 
a situation where we would have to do 
something to carry this forward. 

That is why Senator BOXER and I are 
bringing the DRIVE Act to the Senate 
floor. It will ensure that States have 
the tools and certainty to make the 
necessary new investments to rebuild 
Eisenhower’s vision, fight growing con-
gestion and maintain the mobility of 
goods and services across our country. 
So we are going to have this up. I think 
this will be on the floor, probably the 
next thing after we finish with the edu-
cation bill. 

Again, no one can argue that this is 
the second most significant bill that 
we address each year. We have not ad-
dressed this one in the right way since 
2005. So it is very significant. We are 
looking forward it to. Anyway, we are 
going to be coming forth with this, I’m 
going to be coming to the floor and 
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talking about it in a lot more detail. 
We have got to get the roads and the 
bridges taken care of. We intend to do 
it. The product to do that is the DRIVE 
Act. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Oklahoma. 
Mr. LANKFORD. Mr. President, in 

the 1960s the Johnson administration 
led Congress to start allotting a small 
amount of money—of Federal funding 
from the Federal taxpayers to target 
schools and reach out to the poorest of 
the poor in America and try to help 
beat back poverty. Five decades later, 
we have an education policy in Amer-
ica that reaches out to every single 
school district in America—millions of 
kids—that continues to fail them, to 
fail their parents, and that still has not 
solved the poverty issue. 

What we have is an ever-increasing 
Federal bureaucracy that has reached 
well beyond what it was designed for in 
the 1960s and, I would assure you, 
reaches well beyond what it was origi-
nally designed for—something that 
would help the poorest of the poor or 
take care of kids on military bases and 
those on Indian tribal lands. 

No Child Left Behind passed in 2001, 
authorizing education policy that was 
even more expansive. The goal was 
good—make sure that every child in 
America has the opportunity for suc-
cess, that every teacher has teaching 
qualifications, and that every school 
has accountability. It was approved 
through 2008, and it still continues 
today. 

Math, reading, and science are now 
measured in adequate yearly progress 
for each school, and it has become the 
slow-rolling disaster. The problem was 
the source and the goal. Parents, local 
districts, and States should set edu-
cation policy—I would think that is 
something we should agree on—not a 
massive, centralized, controlled bu-
reaucracy—the bureaucracy that is 
here, made up of a lot of nice folks who 
do care about kids; it is just that most 
of the folks who are here in this bu-
reaucracy dealing with education have 
never been to Oklahoma, and the folks 
in Oklahoma don’t know their names 
and don’t know why they are managing 
their district. 

The goal should be progress for each 
student, not each school, but the an-
nual yearly progress demanded by No 
Child Left Behind really managed the 
progress of the school, not the child. I 
can assure you that the parents at 
home are not trying to figure out if the 
school is better; they are trying to fig-
ure out if their child is better in a par-
ticular subject. 

Annual yearly progress and the Fed-
eral mandates have put my State in 
the untenable position of playing 
‘‘Mother, may I’’ with the Federal Gov-
ernment and asking for a waiver every 
single year and having the national 
education board determine what our 
schools in Oklahoma can and cannot 
do. That has to change. 

We want our students in Oklahoma 
to be college- and career-ready. We 
want accountability to the parents and 
the community. We want less burden 
on the educators who give their lives 
and their time to the task of helping 
parents and their children. We want 
that. As surprising as it may be to 
some in Washington, DC, we actually 
do care about our kids. We want the 
best for them. So we ask a simple 
thing. Allow Oklahomans to manage 
education for Oklahomans and just 
take this assumption: We do love our 
kids. We are going to work hard to 
make sure they are taken well care of. 

My mom was an educator for dec-
ades. She started teaching elementary 
school and then went into a library and 
was an elementary school librarian and 
then a high school librarian and then 
moved into the black hole of education 
that is the administration building 
downtown, where she worked in a 
burnt-out position in school adminis-
tration for a district for years. She is 
passionate about kids. She passed that 
on to me. 

I started out my first year in college 
as a business major. I thoroughly en-
joyed it for probably a week and then 
shifted the next year to secondary edu-
cation—the thing that I fought against 
because my mom was in education, so 
surely I should not do the same thing, 
but I loved being with students. I spent 
22 years of my life serving students 
after college. It is a passion in my fam-
ily. There are multiple educators in my 
family, both at the college level and in 
the schools. We believe in education. 

I will never forget the student teach-
ing time that I had in college, inter-
acting with those kids for the first 
time, stepping out of a college setting 
of being the student to now suddenly 
being the student teacher and having a 
classroom and understanding for the 
first time that it is my responsibility 
to help those parents educate their 
children; that I am not now the parent 
for this child—this child has a parent, 
and that parent has the responsibility 
to be able to raise their child well, but 
I have a responsibility to come along-
side that parent and help. Allow us to 
have that. 

This is what I want. I want greater 
flexibility for States. I want greater 
authority and responsibility to be 
placed on parents in education. The 
people in Oklahoma want the freedom 
to be able to make decisions about 
their own children, their own families. 
That is why I voted for the A PLUS 
Act. I tried to add that as an amend-
ment to this bill. STEVE DAINES from 
Montana and I and multiple others sup-
ported the ability for States to have 
even more control if they choose to, to 
have both the responsibility and the 
authority for all areas of all parts of 
education. We did not win that amend-
ment, but it was a blanket ‘‘We want 
everything to go back to the States if 
they choose to have it.’’ We will con-
tinue to have that fight in the days 
ahead. 

LAMAR ALEXANDER brought out an 
amendment that would have been great 
to have. It allowed parents to choose 
their school regardless of whether it is 
public or private. 

Education union leaders had kittens 
about that, saying: The public schools 
are getting better, and so we don’t 
want to take funds away from those 
public schools; we want to keep all of 
the funds in the public schools. 

The parents are saying: I understand 
that school is going to get better some-
day, but my child is there right now. 

Certain leaders in schools will say: 
We cannot have Federal funds moved 
to follow the child. 

I would say: Would you allow the par-
ent to help that child have the one shot 
they are going to get to get an edu-
cation and allow them to choose where 
they want to go? 

That is why I am also a supporter of 
things such as the DC opportunity 
scholarships that will allow children in 
Washington, DC, to be able to choose 
the school they attend. The President 
has fought adamantly against that. So 
have the education unions. Quite 
frankly, the parents here in DC want to 
have the option to send their child any-
where they choose to send them. 

I would like to see more reductions 
in duplication of education programs. 
There is real reduction in that in this 
particular bill, but I would like to see 
even more. We have education pro-
grams in the Departments of Defense 
and Ag and Health and Human Services 
and multiple other places scattered 
around the bureaucracy. We need to be 
able to shrink all of those different 
programs and to be able to make sure 
that we are not feeding the bureauc-
racy but that we are actually helping 
kids. 

I would actually like to see more in 
this bill dealing with options for those 
who are homeless. This bill helps us get 
a better count and better insight on 
the educational quality and the grad-
uation rate for homeless and foster 
children. But I would like to have 
greater flexibility built into this bill, 
which I did not get. I would like the 
parents and the people in the local dis-
trict to be able to have better decision-
making capability. 

What did I get? There are some 
things we won in this bill. There are no 
common core mandates. I can assure 
you, in my State of Oklahoma, most 
every person in my State stands and 
cheers when they find out one thing: 
that there are no common core man-
dates in this. There are no Federal 
tests at all. States—my State in par-
ticular—will have absolute control 
over standardized testing and the re-
sults of those tests and how they apply 
the information gained from those 
tests. The leaders in my State will 
manage that, control that, and make 
sure that is accurate for us. 

There are no Federal education 
standards. There is no Federal cur-
riculum. There are reductions in some 
of the education programs. I am glad to 
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see that, although, as I have already 
mentioned, I would like to see more of 
that. 

It breaks down some of the funding 
silos. Do you realize right now that if 
there is money available in one silo 
dealing with kitchens, for instance, 
and nutrition for school, they may 
allot Federal dollars and say, ‘‘You can 
have those Federal dollars if you want 
to buy a new oven.’’ But if a district 
says, ‘‘We don’t need more money for 
ovens; we need money for special edu-
cation,’’ the Federal Government cur-
rently says, ‘‘No, you can’t do that. 
You have to buy a new oven.’’ That is 
dumb. Why don’t we allow the districts 
to make that decision? This bill begins 
to break down some of those funding 
silos, and it gives them the oppor-
tunity to be able to make decisions on 
that. 

What I would like to see and what I 
did get was more local control of edu-
cation, dramatically increased local 
control, in fact, local authority and ad-
ditional local responsibility. That is 
the way it should be. INHOFE and I even 
had a bill on local school board flexi-
bility. We got good downpayment on 
that bill. There is more to go on that. 
We need to get a chance to see addi-
tional things, but those are things we 
were able to win. 

Can I tell you the one big thing we 
really won? It is that my State, after 
this bill passes—if we can get this bill 
done, my State will no longer have to 
crawl back to Washington, DC, every 
year and beg for a waiver in education 
to maintain the education funding— 
which, by the way, came out of our 
State. Literally, the Federal taxpayers 
pay in with their tax dollars, and the 
State of Oklahoma has to come crawl-
ing to Washington, DC, saying: Can I 
please have those dollars back to our 
State? Right now, we have to do that 
every year. 

My State actually lost Federal con-
trol because we chose not to do com-
mon core. The Department of Edu-
cation said: If you don’t do this, then 
you are going to lose your funding. For 
months we lost control of that funding, 
but that was our choice because we 
were setting our own standards. We 
have now won that waiver back. In 
fact, just a few weeks ago, that waiver 
was renewed again. 

I am already sick to death of our 
State having to come beg for the Fed-
eral dollars that we put into the sys-
tem and to get permission from some-
one in DC. This bill finally fixes that. 
Does it go as far as I want to go? No. 
I have been pretty clear about that. 
But it is the first step taking in our 
long journey towards taking us back in 
the direction where we need to be—our 
schools, our parents making decisions 
for our kids. 

Again, I remind you, Oklahoma par-
ents do love their kids, and Oklahoma 
legislators are doing a great job of try-
ing to turn some things around in a 
very hard situation. Let’s give them 
the ability to be able to do that. I en-

courage this body to pass this edu-
cation bill, and let’s get going again to-
wards educating our students and 
doing the right thing. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER. The Sen-

ator from Rhode Island. 
Mr. WHITEHOUSE. Mr. President, I 

ask unanimous consent to speak for up 
to 20 minutes as in morning business. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

CLIMATE CHANGE 
Mr. WHITEHOUSE. Mr. President, as 

folks around here know by now, I come 
to the floor once a week to say as 
clearly as I can that it is time to wake 
up to the mounting hazard of climate 
change. Today is the 106th consecutive 
time. 

Why do I do it? Why do I care so 
much? Because I know the harm we are 
causing through carbon pollution spells 
trouble for my home State of Rhode Is-
land. I see it already. We are the Ocean 
State. 

Here is a recent headline from the 
Washington Post: ‘‘Human impact on 
the oceans is growing—and climate 
change is the biggest culprit.’’ 

But I don’t have to read the Wash-
ington Post to know that. With the 
changes from carbon pollution, our 
Rhode Island fishermen see strange 
catches coming up in their nets. Our 
homeowners and business owners along 
the coast see rising sea levels, wors-
ening erosion, and extreme weather. It 
is no longer rare for extreme weather 
to claw people’s homes into the sea. 
Sandy took several. 

Rhode Islanders get all of this. But 
unless and until the men and women in 
this Chamber decide to heed the warn-
ings of all of our best scientists—not to 
mention America’s insurance compa-
nies, faith leaders, our military lead-
ers, virtually every big American com-
pany not associated with the fossil fuel 
industry, and, of course, the American 
public—Rhode Island and all States 
will continue to risk even worse ef-
fects. 

For the fossil fuel industry, we are 
the best Congress money can buy. For 
everyone else, we are a disaster. 

Last year I went to New Hampshire 
to talk with people about the changes 
they see there. I met climate scientist 
Dr. Cameron Wake of the University of 
New Hampshire. He showed me a de-
tailed analysis on climate change in 
New Hampshire—what scientists have 
already measured and what projections 
indicate the future may hold. We had a 
good talk and after my visit he ran for 
me a similar analysis of climate 
change in Rhode Island. 

This is what he found. This chart 
shows measurements of the average an-
nual maximum temperature for three 
weather-monitoring stations in Rhode 
Island. Block Island is in blue, King-
ston is in red, and Providence is in or-
ange. It measures the highest daily 
temperature for each day, averaged 
over the whole year from 1895 to 2012. 
Let me remind everyone that these are 

measurements. This is not theory. 
These are measurements. This is cli-
mate change on the march in Rhode Is-
land. What does it show? Warming. The 
trend is indisputable. 

Dr. Wake’s analysis shows that the 
average annual maximum temperature 
has increased at a rate of 3.6 Fahr-
enheit per century in Block Island, 2.8 
degrees per century in Kingston, and 
3.1 degrees per century in Providence. 

Dr. Wake then looked to the future of 
Rhode Island. This chart shows the 
same thing we were looking at on the 
last chart—the average annual max-
imum temperature. But while that one 
just looks backward, this one looks for-
ward. It shows two scenarios: business 
as usual in red or reduced carbon emis-
sions in blue. It shows us, in effect, the 
difference that cutting back on carbon 
pollution could make for future gen-
erations of Rhode Islanders. 

If we do nothing to curb our carbon 
pollution here, the annual average goes 
up toward 68 degrees, some years close 
to 70 degrees Fahrenheit by year’s end. 

Remember the last chart, which 
ended around here in 2010? The histor-
ical record there ended at around 60 de-
grees. Carry on this flood of carbon pol-
lution and here is where you end, 
around 8 degrees warmer on average. 

Between 1980 and 2010, the average 
annual maximum temperature of 
Washington, DC, was 68 degrees. That 
is the 8-degree difference. The dif-
ference that this flood of carbon pollu-
tion portends is Providence feeling like 
steamy, sweltering, Washington, DC. 
But if we take action to dial back our 
pollution, the warming is about half as 
much and less severe. 

This is not the only measure of what 
carbon pollution will bring to Rhode Is-
land. Winter temperatures going up 
mean fewer snow-covered days. Ex-
treme precipitation will likely in-
crease, and as the average annual max-
imum temperature increases, there 
will also be more very hot days in the 
summer. 

This chart shows the increase in the 
number of days with a maximum tem-
perature above 90 degrees Fahrenheit. 
Hot days such as that are common here 
in sweltering Washington, but histori-
cally Rhode Island might see maybe 
three 90-degree days a year. People 
come from all over to our cool, beau-
tiful shores to swim in our cool, beau-
tiful Atlantic. 

This chart shows that even in the 
best case, Rhode Island can expect to 
see 18 such sweltering 90-degree days 
per year and, in the worst case, that 
number could rise to over 50 90-degree 
days every year, with the mercury 
soaring over 95 degrees Fahrenheit for 
16 of those days. 

Well, if you want to sit inside watch-
ing TV, cranking up your air condi-
tioner, that may be fine, but Rhode Is-
landers like to go outside. We enjoy the 
beach, and we enjoy the bay. We are 
not looking forward to what these tem-
perature consequences mean for our 
health. 
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Earlier this year, the Rhode Island 

Department of Health produced an in- 
depth report on heat and health in 
Rhode Island, concluding this: ‘‘The de-
stabilizing effects of climate change on 
our environment are among the most 
significant potential health threats 
faced by individuals and Rhode Island 
communities today.’’ 

That is the official word of the Rhode 
Island Health Department. So don’t ex-
pect me to ignore this issue here be-
cause it is uncomfortable for someone. 
Rising temperatures and extreme heat 
cause serious human health effects, 
such as dehydration, heat exhaustion. 
Hospitalizations result and even death. 
The department of health projected 
that the calculated temperature in-
creases in Rhode Island will result in 
almost 400 additional emergency room 
visits in the year 2022 alone and nearly 
1,400 more in 2084. 

Researchers at the Harvard School of 
Public Health just published a study 
showing that death rates among sen-
iors in New England increased when 
summer temperatures rose signifi-
cantly. The risk, they believe, comes 
not only from the hotter temperatures 
but also from variability in tempera-
tures as climate change makes the 
weather weirder and more unpredict-
able. 

There is a documentary series, 
‘‘Years of Living Dangerously,’’ which 
looked at how this works, as has the 
Rhode Island Department of Health, 
working with Brown University. Both 
found that a pronounced increase in 
emergency room visits and deaths as 
temperatures rise was statistically re-
lated to heat. 

In many cases, it was not specifically 
indicated in the chart as related to 
heat. This suggests that heat-related 
deaths and illness may be under-
diagnosed if you just look at medical 
charts. So this is a significant health 
issue that we face. 

Then there are the storms. Climate 
change will increase the frequency and 
intensity of extreme weather events in 
Rhode Island, such as Hurricane Sandy, 
to the tune of $2 billion to $6 billion in 
Rhode Island, according to one report. 
In a State of 1 million people, that is a 
lot of damage. The heavy rains that 
brought on our floods in 2010 will be-
come more frequent as well. 

This is what our health director 
wrote: ‘‘In Rhode Island, where our 
economy, culture, and identity are all 
so closely tied to the ocean and to Nar-
ragansett Bay, the effects of climate 
change will be particularly acute.’’ 
Again, that is the official word of our 
health department. 

Climate change threatens our water 
systems as temperatures increase and 
as we see more intense rain events. 
Stormwater and sewer overflows can 
contaminate Rhode Island coastal 
waters. Warmer waters can foster bac-
terial growth that can be harmful. 
Swimming in or consuming polluted 
water obviously can cause illness. 

Then there is vibrio. The world-re-
nowned shellfish of Narragansett Bay 

are becoming susceptible to a group of 
marine bacteria known as vibrio. If 
vibrio gets into seafood, it can be very 
unpleasant. Symptoms can be espe-
cially severe in people with com-
promised immune systems. Rhode Is-
land health officials now have to work 
with the State’s shellfish industry, 
with the University of Rhode Island, 
and others to monitor water quality 
and shellfish growing and harvesting 
conditions to protect this important 
resource. 

These are just a few of the health 
threats laid out in the report. The de-
partment of health is just one of many 
agencies and organizations in our State 
that have had to put climate action 
and clean energy at the heart of their 
work as we in Congress pretend this 
problem does not exist. 

Dozens of the most dedicated and in-
novative minds in our State recently 
came to Washington for my sixth an-
nual Rhode Island Energy and Environ-
mental Leaders Day. Our attendees 
represent some of the best work being 
done in Rhode Island to stave off the 
devastating effects of climate change. 

Janet Coit, our director of environ-
mental management chairs the Execu-
tive Climate Change Coordinating 
Council, created by our Governor to co-
ordinate State agencies to address 
threats from climate change, threats 
to the State’s environment, the State’s 
economy, and the State’s people. 

The council was established by the 
Resilient Rhode Island Act, passed by 
our general assembly in 2014. That law 
also set specific greenhouse gas reduc-
tion targets and incorporates consider-
ation of climate change effects into the 
powers and duties of all State agencies. 
The bill’s author, Representative Art 
Handy, also came down and joined us 
for the Rhode Island Energy and Envi-
ronmental Leaders Day, along with his 
colleague Representative Carlos Tobon, 
a member of the Rhode Island House 
Committee on the Environment and 
Natural Resources. 

Dennis Nixon was there. He heads 
Rhode Island Sea Grant at the Univer-
sity of Rhode Island School of Oceanog-
raphy. Sea Grant works with the Rhode 
Island government agencies and coast-
al communities to support climate re-
siliency and to protect vibrant water-
fronts. 

Marion Gold, our commissioner of 
the office of energy resources, was 
there. She has advanced incentives for 
large and small renewable energy de-
velopment in our State, and she has 
helped Rhode Island become the third 
most energy-efficient State in the Na-
tion. 

Recently, we saw this report: ‘‘Study 
shows Northeast states benefit from 
carbon cap program.’’ We are a part of 
RGGI. Marion Gold helps supervise 
that. It has created jobs, it has saved 
money. It is proving that solving the 
carbon pollution problem is not actu-
ally a burden on the economy. It is a 
boost to the economy. 

One of the special breakout sessions 
at the Energy and Environmental 

Leaders Day focused on corporate sus-
tainability efforts to spur innovation, 
save money, and reduce emissions. 

Representatives from Microsoft, 
Mars—the company—FedEx, and 
Schneider Electric shared their sus-
tainability success stories. For these 
companies, efforts to improve energy 
efficiency and reduce carbon emissions 
are more than good intentions; they 
are good business. 

Another breakout session looked at 
faith perspectives on environmental 
stewardship. Rev. Anita Schell of 
Rhode Island Interfaith Power & Light 
came. She works with local faith-based 
institutions to raise awareness about 
climate change and about safeguarding 
the poor of the world, who are least re-
sponsible for and most vulnerable to 
climate change. As Pope Francis gives 
his voice to this moral calling, these 
faith perspectives were especially wel-
come. 

Dozens of other smart, hard-working 
Rhode Islanders attended—too many to 
mention them all. But I am always 
proud of the important work going on 
in Rhode Island to combat climate 
change. It is my inspiration to con-
tinue fighting for responsible action in 
Washington. 

As our senior Senator JACK REED told 
the group, ‘‘Rhode Island is one of the 
leaders in the country in smart policies 
. . . and it’s is the result of the cul-
mination of lots of individual activi-
ties.’’ 

Rhode Island gets it, and we are pull-
ing together in one direction. Our 
homes, our shores, and our way of life 
are at stake. We need every State in 
the Nation to join us to take this issue 
seriously, and we need every Senator 
to pay attention. It is truly time to 
wake up. 

I ask my colleagues here today, if 
this were you, if something this threat-
ening were happening to your State, 
would you really expect me to stand 
down because it was uncomfortable for 
big powerful industries and big aggres-
sive donors? You would not. You would 
go to war to protect Utah and to pro-
tect Iowa from a threat such as this. 

So forgive me if I am impatient, but 
this is serious in our Ocean State. If 
your department of health projected 
these kinds of threats for your home 
State people, you would be up in arms. 
So forgive me for being a little bit up 
in arms. 

I will close with this. Look at this 
picture. Do you know what that is? 
That is a picture of Pluto. That is a 
picture of the dwarf planet Pluto. Do 
you know how we got that? We got 
that off of NASA’s New Horizons space-
craft. It made it to Pluto after crossing 
the solar system for 91⁄2 years. It trav-
eled 3 billion miles from Earth and 
came within 8,000 miles of the surface 
of Pluto. It was traveling at more than 
31,000 miles per hour, and it took 3 
minutes to cross the face of Pluto, 
where it took innumerable images and 
samples for our scientists. 

Let me quote one of the lead sci-
entists, whose name is Bowman, who 
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managed 1 hour of sleep in her office 
Monday night. She said: 

I have to pinch myself. Look what we ac-
complished. It’s truly amazing humankind 
can go out and explore these worlds, and see 
Pluto revealed just before our eyes. It’s just 
fantastic. 

And it really is. These are American 
scientists who are able to run an Amer-
ican craft 3 billion miles to cross with-
in 8,000 miles of Pluto traveling 31,000 
miles an hour. When those scientists 
from NASA tell us that climate change 
is real, what do we have to say to 
them? We say that they are part of a 
hoax. 

Really? Is that going to be the posi-
tion of Members in this body—that the 
people driving a rover around on the 
surface of Mars and the people who 
flew this New Horizons craft by Pluto 
don’t know what they are talking 
about when they say that climate 
change is real? 

We have people trying to unfund 
their satellites so that we don’t have 
the information to prove what is hap-
pening on climate change. Is that re-
sponsible with respect to NASA? 

A day of reckoning is going to come 
on this, and we had better start getting 
this right. 

I yield the floor. 
The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 

PERDUE). The Senator from Iowa. 
Mr. GRASSLEY. Mr. President, in 

1965, Congress passed the original Ele-
mentary and Secondary Education Act 
as part of President Lyndon Johnson’s 
War on Poverty. The centerpiece of 
that law, then as now, is title I funding 
provided as a block grant to local 
school districts to serve children in 
poverty. 

The assumption in 1965 was that sim-
ply providing an infusion of Federal 
cash to schools with more disadvan-
taged children would correct edu-
cational inequities compared to more 
affluent schools. As it turned out, sim-
ply providing more money didn’t result 
in improved educational outcomes for 
disadvantaged children. 

So every time this law came back up 
for reauthorization, Congress added 
more stipulations on the use of the 
funds and additional programs that 
well-meaning Members of Congress 
hoped would help students. 

Meanwhile, Congress kept raising the 
level of funding. Over time, there 
began to be a bipartisan realization 
that all this funding and all these pro-
grams were not resulting in improved 
student achievement, so something 
needed to change. 

In this context, President Bush pro-
posed what became the No Child Left 
Behind Act. His original proposal 
promised to fundamentally change the 
old Washington-knows-best approach 
to improving teaching and learning. 

The theory was that we would cut 
the Federal strings that tied the hands 
of local administrators and teachers, 
allowing them to focus on teaching 
kids. In return, the law would require 
greater accountability in terms of stu-
dent achievement outcomes. 

However, the final compromise that 
passed Congress included a very de-
tailed one-size-fits-all assessment and 
accountability system, but not the de-
gree of local freedom that many had 
hoped for. 

In retrospect, I think most people be-
lieve the focus on achievement for all 
students was positive. But like with 
many Federal laws, how it worked in 
practice didn’t live up to the good in-
tentions. 

The reality is that the new federally 
mandated accountability system in-
cluded required interventions that 
were cooked up in Washington and de-
signed for big city failing school dis-
tricts. These were not a good fit for 
communities in Iowa and many other 
States. Moreover, they set a new prece-
dent for Federal intervention into how 
local schools are run. 

Secretary Duncan took this a step 
further through the Race to the Top 
program and his abuse of the Federal 
waiver authority by adding conditions 
found nowhere in law. He used these 
tools to coerce States into adopting his 
preferred policies. These included new, 
even more heavy-handed mandates re-
garding reorganizing local schools, spe-
cific methods for schools to evaluate 
their teachers, and most infamously, 
pushing States to adopt the common 
core standards. 

I believe these actions go well beyond 
any authority Congress gave the Sec-
retary of Education, and I told him so 
in a letter when he denied Iowa’s waiv-
er. This should be a warning to Con-
gress that if you give an inch, Federal 
officials might just take a mile. 

The high-stakes system in No Child 
Left Behind also created negative in-
centives for schools to focus on getting 
passing test scores rather than meeting 
the individual learning needs of each 
student. 

For instance, I have had a concern 
for a long time in how Federal edu-
cation policy affects gifted and tal-
ented students. The exclusive focus on 
bringing struggling students up to 
some minimum level means that we 
are setting our sights on mediocrity. 

Left out of this equation are gifted 
students, including those from dis-
advantaged backgrounds, who have 
enormous potential but need to be 
challenged to reach that potential. 

At the end of the day, the goal of 
making sure all students are receiving 
a quality education is a good one, but 
the record of Washington’s interven-
tion in this issue has not been a suc-
cess. It is time for Congress to take a 
step back and have a little humility. 
We don’t know what’s best for every 
child in every school. We can’t design a 
single national education system that 
can meet the individual needs of chil-
dren we will never meet. 

Our Founding Fathers designed a fed-
eral system of government for a rea-
son. The principle of federalism is that 
decisions should be made at the level of 
government as close as practicable to 
the people those decisions impact. 

When it comes to education, no one 
has a greater stake in educational deci-
sions, or knows better what is right for 
a specific child, then that child’s par-
ents. As a result, parents should have 
maximum control over their child’s 
education. When governments make 
decisions that impact education, it 
should be at a level of government as 
close as possible to the parents and 
children who are affected. 

The Every Child Achieves Act is a 
step in that direction. It eliminates the 
very specific mandates on States re-
quiring that they evaluate schools 
based on test scores and apply federally 
designed interventions. States will be 
free to design their own assessment 
and accountability systems. 

The bill retains the requirement that 
States test annually in grades 3–8, 
which I understand was necessary to 
get a bipartisan agreement. However, 
States will have wide discretion in how 
they design their assessments. And, the 
elimination of the federally mandated 
school interventions that raise the 
stakes on the test results will reduce 
teaching to the test. 

This bill also consolidates Federal 
funding in a way that provides more 
latitude to local school districts to bet-
ter meet their individual needs, al-
though less so than in the House- 
passed bill. By contrast, the Obama ad-
ministration’s blueprint for reauthor-
izing the Elementary and Secondary 
Education Act called for replacing the 
current set of Federal mandates with a 
new set of Federal mandates. What the 
President proposes would include even 
more intrusive, mandatory Federal 
interventions for certain schools. 

It also proposed a series of new Fed-
eral competitive grants with broad pur-
poses, which puts smaller rural schools 
at a disadvantage and gives the Sec-
retary of Education an inappropriate 
degree of control over which schools 
get funding for which purposes. More-
over, the President’s blueprint pro-
poses tying Federal education funds to 
the adoption of State content stand-
ards that are ‘‘college and career 
ready,’’ which is code for common core. 

In short, the Obama blueprint would 
have essentially ratified this adminis-
tration’s heavy-handed intrusions into 
how and what students are taught and 
enabled further Federal overreach. 

The Every Child Achieves Act rep-
resents a rejection of that approach 
and an admission that the model of 
Federal control of local schools has not 
worked. As a result, President Obama 
has said he cannot support the bill as it 
stands unless it adds back more power 
for the Secretary. That position flies in 
the face of what I hear from Iowa edu-
cators and parents. 

In fact, this bill quite intentionally 
tightens up some of the language in 
current law to prevent future over-
reach by the Secretary of Education. 
For instance, the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act has always re-
quired States to develop a State plan 
to show how it will comply with the 
law in order to get Federal funding. 
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Under current law, the Secretary of 

Education is charged with approving 
the plan unless it does not meet the re-
quirements of the law. That should be 
sufficient to tell the Secretary that he 
must approve a plan so long as it com-
plies with the law. 

However, given the current Sec-
retary’s track record, the language in 
this bill is more explicit. It requires 
the Secretary to deem a State plan ap-
proved within 90 days of its submission 
unless he can provide a detailed de-
scription of the specific requirements 
in law that the State did not comply 
with. It then lists three pages of ex-
plicit limitations on the Secretary’s 
authority describing what he cannot 
consider in evaluating a State plan. 
That is then followed by a rule reem-
phasizing that the Secretary cannot re-
quire anything at all from States be-
yond what is in the law. 

This bill also voids any conditions at-
tached to waivers already granted by 
the Secretary of Education and pro-
hibits the attaching of any new ones in 
the future. 

I am also glad that this bill includes 
very comprehensive language I worked 
on with Senator ROBERTS to explicitly 
shut off all the avenues this adminis-
tration has used to coerce States to 
adopt the common core standards. This 
will free States to adopt whatever con-
tent standards they choose based on 
the input from their citizens without 
Federal coercion or fear of Federal re-
percussions. 

Too often, Congress passes vague 
laws that delegate excessive discretion 
to Federal agencies to fill in the 
blanks. This bill is an improvement 
over the standard practice. It makes 
congressional intent more clear and 
fills in many gaps to ensure that the 
Department implements the law as in-
tended rather than based on the whims 
of the Secretary. 

Some bipartisan compromise is nec-
essary for any bill to pass the Senate, 
and like any compromise, most people 
can find some things they don’t like in 
this bill. Some Senators feel this bill 
goes too far in reducing the Federal 
role in education and some Senators 
feel it doesn’t go far enough. I am one 
of those Senators who would prefer to 
see a maximum degree of State and 
local control and I voted for amend-
ments to that effect. 

However, the Every Child Achieves 
Act is a step in the direction of reduc-
ing Federal control on local schools so 
teachers can teach and parents know 
who to hold accountable for decisions 
that affect their children. Given the 
current mess with an unworkable law 
on the books, many States ceding con-
trol over major policies to Washington 
in return for a waiver, and an unprece-
dented degree of Federal intervention 
into what happens in neighborhood 
schools, it is overdue for Congress to 
act. Local schools can do more when 
Washington does less. Let’s give them 
that chance. 

I yield the floor. 

EDUCATION 
Mrs. FEINSTEIN. Mr. President, I 

wish to talk about our education sys-
tem—why it is not working and what 
we can do to fix it. 

Ensuring every child in this country 
gets a high-quality education is crit-
ical to our country’s future. Education 
remains the primary tool to obtaining 
a good-paying job and building a mid-
dle-class life. But too many children 
are not getting the education they 
need to succeed in the 21st century 
workforce. 

Nearly 20 percent of students don’t 
graduate from high school. For His-
panic and African-American students, 
the dropout rate is nearly 25 and 30 per-
cent, respectively. 

Hundreds of thousands of high-skilled 
jobs remain unfilled, and too many 
Americans find themselves stuck in 
low-wage jobs that can’t support their 
families. Simply put, our education 
system is failing our children. 

There are a number of reasons for 
this. Our education system is one-size- 
fits-all. Teachers are forced to teach to 
the test and our schools are not 
equipped with support services to ad-
dress the many issues that prevent 
children from learning. 

In my view, the main reason we are 
falling short is that our education sys-
tem is one-size-fits-all, which doesn’t 
work in education. Students learn dif-
ferently. Some flourish in large set-
tings and others in small settings with 
more teacher attention. 

Students have varied needs based on 
where they live. Do they live in a rural 
area, suburb or city? What is their eco-
nomic status? Is their family living in 
poverty? How is their home life? Are 
they raised in a single parent house-
hold? What are their individual inter-
ests? Do they like art and music? Or 
are they more interested in science and 
technology? 

A child who comes from an affluent 
home in the suburbs learns differently 
from a child living in poverty in a city. 
Both children can learn—if the right 
approach for each child is taken. We 
need to give States and local school 
districts more flexibility to do what is 
right for their students. 

Teaching to the test is another prob-
lem that plagues our education system. 
When the emphasis is placed on memo-
rization rather than comprehension, or 
answering essay questions with a for-
mula rather than reasoning and crit-
ical thinking, students are not actively 
engaged in learning. 

Students fail to gain the comprehen-
sion and critical thinking skills needed 
in college and to be successful in the 
workplace. That is a big reason why up 
to 60 percent of students who enroll in 
college need to take remedial English 
and math classes. Schools need to be 
places where children learn, not where 
children memorize. 

A child’s life outside of school has a 
tremendous effect on his or her ability 
to succeed in school. Does a child get 
enough to eat at home? Are a child’s 

parents working multiple jobs to pay 
the bills? Is there violence in the 
home? Is a child homeless? 

Our schools are not equipped with 
the support services they need, such as 
mental health professionals and basic 
health care services that help to ad-
dress the issues that prevent children 
from learning. 

The good news is that we have solu-
tions to these problems. They are in 
place, and they need to be implemented 
on a larger scale. 

During the 2013–2014 school year, 
California implemented its local con-
trol funding formula, which targets 
State funding for poor students, stu-
dents of color, students with disabil-
ities, foster youth, and English learn-
ers. 

Under this new formula, local dis-
tricts can use that funding to teach 
these students in the way that best 
works for them. It has made a dif-
ference. For example, San Diego Uni-
fied School District plans to reduce 
class sizes from a 25-to-1 to a 22-to-1 
student teacher ratio in 29 of the most 
disadvantaged schools. 

The district also plans to look at re-
source equity and provide expanded ac-
cess to counseling services and addi-
tional services for English learners and 
students with disabilities. 

We also need to expand charter 
schools and provide continued support 
to existing, high-quality charter 
schools. Charter schools tailor instruc-
tion to each student and are not bound 
by traditional school district require-
ments. 

Every child deserves a quality edu-
cation, and many children who strug-
gle in underperforming schools go on to 
flourish in charter schools. Here are 
just a couple of examples from Cali-
fornia: 

Nolan from East Los Angeles was 
reading below grade level when he en-
rolled in a charter school. Within 6 
months, he had advanced two grade 
levels. 

Trina, a seventh grader in the Bay 
area, stated: 

I think KIPP teachers are extremely im-
portant because they teach us everything we 
need to know to reach our goal of climbing 
the mountain to college. I can remember 
back to my very first day as a KIPPster. We 
learned that we would need to ‘‘work hard’’ 
and ‘‘be nice.’’ Working hard meant that in 
our English classes we would be reading and 
writing every day. When I came to KIPP, I 
found out that I was at a second grade read-
ing level in the fifth grade! I was shocked, so 
I worked hard and got to the sixth grade 
reading level by the end of the year. 

Parents desperately want opportuni-
ties for their children, and unfortu-
nately the demand for charter schools 
remains much higher than the supply. 
Currently in California, approximately 
150,000 students are on waiting lists. We 
need to continue to invest in the ex-
pansion and development of charter 
schools so more children receive the 
education they deserve now. 

Providing support services to at-risk 
students has also proven to be success-
ful. If students are less worried about 
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meeting their basic needs and every-
thing that goes on in their lives out-
side of school, they can learn. 

The Monarch School for homeless 
students in San Diego is a great exam-
ple of this. It provides food, clothing, 
counseling, health care, and transpor-
tation to its students. And more than 
90 percent of graduates go to college or 
pursue vocational training. We need to 
fund these kinds of support services in 
schools where children need them the 
most. We know that they work. 

Education remains the great equal-
izer in this country, but we have failed 
in giving all of our children access to 
the quality education they deserve. By 
directing extra resources where they 
are needed most and giving schools the 
ability to do what is right for their stu-
dents, we can turn things around—for 
our children and our country. 

Mr. GRASSLEY. I suggest the ab-
sence of a quorum. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 
clerk will call the roll. 

The bill clerk proceeded to call the 
roll. 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the order 
for the quorum call be rescinded. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that at 10:45 
a.m. tomorrow, Thursday, July 16, the 
Senate vote on the following amend-
ments in the order listed: Cruz amend-
ment No. 2180; Sanders amendment No. 
2177; Coons amendment No. 2243; Burr 
amendment No. 2247, as modified; 
Brown amendment No. 2100; Casey 
amendment No. 2242; Hatch amend-
ment No. 2082; Warren amendment No. 
2106; Schatz amendment No. 2130; Mur-
phy amendment No. 2186; Nelson 
amendment No. 2215, as modified; 
Manchin amendment No. 2222; Booz-
man amendment No. 2231; Baldwin 
amendment No. 2188; Capito amend-
ment No. 2156; Thune amendment No. 
2232; King amendment No. 2256; Schatz 
amendment No. 2240; and Warren 
amendment No. 2249. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

f 

MORNING BUSINESS 

REMEMBERING JIM GASTON 

∑ Mr. BOOZMAN. Mr. President, today 
I recognize the life and legacy of Ar-
kansas outdoorsman, tourism advo-
cate, and business owner Jim Gaston. 

Jim spent his life as a champion of 
the Arkansas outdoors—sharing his 
passion of Mother Nature’s landscape, 
wildlife and recreation, and helped 
paved the path for the Arkansas tour-
ism industry. 

Jim inherited the family business, 
Gaston’s White River Resort, in his 
early 20s when his dad passed away. He 
saved the property from foreclosure 
and turned the six cottages and six 
boats into the premier destination for 

anglers and tourists that it is known as 
today. Under Jim’s leadership, the re-
sort grew into a 400-acre property with 
79 cottages along 2 miles of river front-
age in addition to a restaurant, con-
ference center and other amenities. 

As a regular fixture on the White 
River for more than seven decades, he 
saw a lot of improvements, often be-
cause of his own contributions. His ad-
vocacy of minimum flow helped pro-
vide a steady stream of water in the 
river and create the habitat trout need 
to survive—boosting Arkansas’s trout 
fishing and tourism industry. 

Jim was a strong voice for Arkansas 
tourism locally, regionally, and state-
wide. He was a lifetime member of the 
Arkansas Department of Parks and 
Tourism Commission. He served in nu-
merous leadership positions to promote 
tourism throughout the State includ-
ing president of the Arkansas Tourism 
Development Foundation and Arkansas 
Hospitality Association. In 2010, Jim 
Gaston was named the Arkansas Busi-
ness Executive of the Year and will be 
awarded the Legacy Award at this 
year’s Arkansas Game & Fish Founda-
tion Outdoor Hall of Fame Awards. 

Jim truly transformed Arkansas. His 
contribution is commemorated in the 
James A. Gaston Visitor Center, a 
multi-million dollar facility that 
teaches about the rivers he loved his 
entire life. 

My thoughts and prayers go out to 
Jim’s wife Jill and the entire Gaston 
family. I humbly offer my appreciation 
and gratitude for his contributions to 
the State of Arkansas, his friendship, 
and many great memories that I will 
cherish forever.∑ 

f 

RECOGNIZING ARKANSAS FARM 
BUREAU FARM FAMILIES 

∑ Mr. COTTON. Mr. President, I would 
like to recognize six Arkansas families 
who recently were named finalists for 
the Arkansas Farm Bureau Farm Fam-
ily of the Year. Their hard work, dedi-
cation, and passion have been instru-
mental not only in the success of their 
individual farms but our State’s agri-
culture industry as a whole, the largest 
industry in Arkansas. 

The Arkansas Farm Family of the 
Year program is the longest running 
program of its kind in the country. 
Each year a panel of judges selects 
families who demonstrate outstanding 
efforts in production, conservation of 
energy and resources, and leadership in 
agricultural and family affairs. This 
year’s finalists are John and Mikki 
Hamilton of Searcy, Allen and Melissa 
Glidewell of St. Joe, the Wildy Family 
Farms in Manila, Brent and Ronda 
Butler of Siloam Springs, the Fueller 
family of Poplar Grove, Phil and Lesia 
Hamaker of Junction City, Billy and 
Charlotte Wilchman of Cleveland, and 
Roy and Carolyn Ham of Arkadelphia. 

These eight families farm a wide va-
riety of crops, including cotton, corn, 
soybeans, tomatoes, strawberries, pea-
nuts, rice, poultry, and cattle. Growing 

up on our family farm in Dardanelle, I 
learned it takes the whole family to 
make a farm successful. I want to 
thank not only these couples but also 
their children for the sacrifices they 
have made and the importance they 
place on the agriculture industry in 
the community and State. Congratula-
tions on this well-deserved recogni-
tion.∑ 

f 

REMEMBERING DARYLE 
HOLLOWAY 

∑ Mr. VITTER. Mr. President, I wish to 
honor the memory of Officer Daryle 
Holloway, a 22-year veteran of the New 
Orleans Police Department who was 
killed in the line of duty Saturday, 
June 20, 2015. 

In 1992, Officer Holloway joined the 
New Orleans Police Department after 
graduating from St. Augustine High 
School. Throughout his career, he 
asked to remain a patrol officer in 
order to better interact with the resi-
dents of district 5 of New Orleans. 
Known for his sunny disposition, sin-
cerity, and good nature, Officer Hollo-
way truly cared about the neighbor-
hoods he protected. 

Following the levee breaches after 
Hurricane Katrina, Officer Holloway 
remained in the city providing security 
at Charity Hospital. Later he per-
formed water rescue missions, bravely 
rescuing numerous people trapped in 
their homes or on their rooftops. 

Besides his duty as a police officer, 
Officer Holloway remained an ardent 
supporter of his high school alma 
mater, St. Augustine, where he volun-
teered as a mentor to troubled students 
and continued to be a valuable part of 
the all-boys Catholic high school. 

For the past 22 years, Officer Hollo-
way served the citizens of New Orleans, 
LA, with his professionalism, skill, en-
thusiasm, and leadership. He selflessly 
served his community as a guardian, 
mentor, and father of three children, 
Kalia, Cydni, and Dillion. It is with a 
heavy heart that I honor the esteemed 
life and career of Officer Daryle Hollo-
way. I thank him for his years of serv-
ice to our State and country and pray 
for his family and friends.∑ 

f 

MESSAGES FROM THE PRESIDENT 

Messages from the President of the 
United States were communicated to 
the Senate by Mr. Pate, one of his sec-
retaries. 

f 

EXECUTIVE MESSAGES REFERRED 

As in executive session the Presiding 
Officer laid before the Senate messages 
from the President of the United 
States submitting nominations which 
were referred to the Committee on 
Armed Services. 

(The messages received today are 
printed at the end of the Senate pro-
ceedings.) 
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MESSAGE FROM THE HOUSE 

At 1:28 p.m., a message from the 
House of Representatives, delivered by 
Mr. Novotny, one of its reading clerks, 
announced that the House has passed 
the following bills, in which it requests 
the concurrence of the Senate: 

H.R. 251. An act to transfer the position of 
Special Assistant for Veterans Affairs in the 
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment to the Office of the Secretary, and for 
other purposes. 

H.R. 432. An act to amend the Investment 
Advisers Act of 1940 to prevent duplicative 
regulation of advisers of small business in-
vestment companies. 

H.R. 1047. An act to authorize private non-
profit organizations to administer perma-
nent housing rental assistance provided 
through the Continuum of Care Program 
under the McKinney-Vento Homeless Assist-
ance Act, and for other purposes. 

H.R. 1334. An act to amend the Securities 
and Exchange Act of 1934 to make the share-
holder threshold for registration of savings 
and loan holding companies the same as for 
bank holding companies. 

H.R. 1408. An act to require certain Federal 
banking agencies to conduct a study of the 
appropriate capital requirements for mort-
gage servicing assets for banking institu-
tions, and for other purposes. 

H.R. 1723. An act to direct the Securities 
and Exchange Commission to revise Form S– 
1 so as to permit smaller reporting compa-
nies to use forward incorporation by ref-
erence for such form. 

H.R. 1847. An act to amend the Securities 
and Exchange Act of 1934 and the Commodity 
Exchange Act to repeal the indemnification 
requirements for regulatory authorities to 
obtain access to swap data required to be 
provided by swaps entities under such Acts. 

H.R. 2064. An act to amend certain provi-
sions of the securities laws relating to the 
treatment of emerging growth companies. 

H.R. 2482. An act to amend the Low-Income 
Housing Preservation and Resident Home-
ownership Act of 1990. 

H.R. 2997. An act to authorize the Sec-
retary of Housing and Urban Development to 
carry out a demonstration program to enter 
into budget-neutral, performance-based con-
tracts for energy and water conservation im-
provements for multifamily residential 
units. 

f 

MEASURES REFERRED 

The following bills were read the first 
and the second times by unanimous 
consent, and referred as indicated: 

H.R. 251. An act to transfer the position of 
Special Assistant for Veterans Affairs in the 
Department of Housing and Urban Develop-
ment to the Office of the Secretary, and for 
other purposes; to the Committee on Bank-
ing, Housing, and Urban Affairs. 

H.R. 432. An act to amend the Investment 
Advisers Act of 1940 to prevent duplicative 
regulation of advisers of small business in-
vestment companies; to the Committee on 
Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs. 

H.R. 1047. An act to authorize private non-
profit organizations to administer perma-
nent housing rental assistance provided 
through the Continuum of Care Program 
under the McKinney-Vento Homeless Assist-
ance Act, and for other purposes; to the 
Committee on Banking, Housing, and Urban 
Affairs. 

H.R. 1334. An act to amend the Securities 
Exchange Act of 1934 to make the share-
holder threshold for registration of savings 
and loan holding companies the same as for 

bank holding companies; to the Committee 
on Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs. 

H.R. 1408. An act to require certain Federal 
banking agencies to conduct a study of the 
appropriate capital requirements for mort-
gage servicing assets for banking institu-
tions, and for other purposes; to the Com-
mittee on Banking, Housing, and Urban Af-
fairs. 

H.R. 1723. An act to direct the Securities 
and Exchange Commission to revise Form S– 
1 so as to permit smaller reporting compa-
nies to use forward incorporation by ref-
erence for such form; to the Committee on 
Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs. 

H.R. 1847. An act to amend the Securities 
Exchange Act of 1934 and the Commodity Ex-
change Act to repeal the indemnification re-
quirements for regulatory authorities to ob-
tain access to swap data required to be pro-
vided by swaps entities under such Acts; to 
the Committee on Agriculture, Nutrition, 
and Forestry. 

H.R. 2064. An act to amend certain provi-
sions of the securities laws relating to the 
treatment of emerging growth companies; to 
the Committee on Banking, Housing, and 
Urban Affairs. 

H.R. 2482. An act to amend the Low-Income 
Housing Preservation and Resident Home-
ownership Act of 1990; to the Committee on 
Banking, Housing, and Urban Affairs. 

H.R. 2997. An act to authorize the Sec-
retary of Housing and Urban Development to 
carry out a demonstration program to enter 
into budget-neutral, performance-based con-
tracts for energy and water conservation im-
provements for multifamily residential 
units; to the Committee on Banking, Hous-
ing, and Urban Affairs. 

f 

EXECUTIVE AND OTHER 
COMMUNICATIONS 

The following communications were 
laid before the Senate, together with 
accompanying papers, reports, and doc-
uments, and were referred as indicated: 

EC–2251. A communication from the Con-
gressional Review Coordinator, Animal and 
Plant Health Inspection Service, Department 
of Agriculture, transmitting, pursuant to 
law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Viruses, 
Serums, Toxins, and Analogous Products; 
Single Label Claim for Veterinary Biological 
Products’’ ((RIN0579–AD64) (Docket No. 
APHIS–2011–0049)) received in the Office of 
the President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; 
to the Committee on Agriculture, Nutrition, 
and Forestry. 

EC–2252. A communication from the Sec-
retary of Defense, transmitting a report on 
the approved retirement of Rear Admiral Mi-
chael H. Miller, United States Navy, and his 
advancement to the grade of vice admiral on 
the retired list; to the Committee on Armed 
Services. 

EC–2253. A communication from the Acting 
Under Secretary of Defense (Personnel and 
Readiness), transmitting the report of an of-
ficer authorized to wear the insignia of the 
grade of major general in accordance with 
title 10, United States Code, section 777; to 
the Committee on Armed Services. 

EC–2254. A communication from the Acting 
Under Secretary of Defense (Personnel and 
Readiness), transmitting the report of twen-
ty-two (22) officers authorized to wear the in-
signia of the grade of brigadier general in ac-
cordance with title 10, United States Code, 
section 777; to the Committee on Armed 
Services. 

EC–2255. A communication from the Sec-
retary of the Army, transmitting, pursuant 
to law, a report entitled ‘‘Notification to 
Congress on the Permanent Reduction of Siz-

able Numbers of Members of the Armed 
Forces’’; to the Committee on Armed Serv-
ices. 

EC–2256. A communication from the Sec-
retary, Office of FOIA Services, Securities 
and Exchange Commission, transmitting, 
pursuant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Freedom of Information Act Regulations: 
Fee Schedule, Addition of Appeals Time 
Frame, and Miscellaneous Administrative 
Changes’’ (RIN3235–AL58) received during ad-
journment of the Senate in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 10, 2015; to 
the Committee on Banking, Housing, and 
Urban Affairs. 

EC–2257. A communication from the Direc-
tor of the Regulatory Management Division, 
Environmental Protection Agency, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule en-
titled ‘‘Protection of Stratospheric Ozone: 
Change of Listing Status for Certain Sub-
stitutes under the Significant New Alter-
natives Policy Program’’ ((RIN2060–AS18) 
(FRL No. 9926–55–OAR)) received during ad-
journment of the Senate in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 10, 2015; to 
the Committee on Environment and Public 
Works. 

EC–2258. A communication from the Direc-
tor of the Regulatory Management Division, 
Environmental Protection Agency, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule en-
titled ‘‘Determinations of Attainment of the 
1997 Annual Fine Particulate Matter Stand-
ard for the Libby, Montana Nonattainment 
Area’’ (FRL No. 9930–47–Region 8) received 
during adjournment of the Senate in the Of-
fice of the President of the Senate on July 
10, 2015; to the Committee on Environment 
and Public Works. 

EC–2259. A communication from the Direc-
tor of the Regulatory Management Division, 
Environmental Protection Agency, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule en-
titled ‘‘Approval of Air Quality Implementa-
tion Plans; Indiana; Lead Rule Revisions’’ 
(FRL No. 9930–41–Region 5) received during 
adjournment of the Senate in the Office of 
the President of the Senate on July 10, 2015; 
to the Committee on Environment and Pub-
lic Works. 

EC–2260. A communication from the Direc-
tor of the Regulatory Management Division, 
Environmental Protection Agency, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule en-
titled ‘‘Approval and Promulgation of Imple-
mentation Plans; Texas; Revisions to the 
New Source Review State Implementation 
Plan; Flexible Permit Program’’ (FRL No. 
9930–44–Region 6) received during adjourn-
ment of the Senate in the Office of the Presi-
dent of the Senate on July 10, 2015; to the 
Committee on Environment and Public 
Works. 

EC–2261. A communication from the Direc-
tor of the Regulatory Management Division, 
Environmental Protection Agency, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule en-
titled ‘‘Approval and Promulgation of Imple-
mentation Plans and Designation of Areas 
for Quality Planning Purposes; Tennessee; 
Redesignation of the Knoxville 2008 8-Hour 
Ozone Nonattainment Area to Attainment’’ 
(FRL No. 9930–49–Region 4) received during 
adjournment of the Senate in the Office of 
the President of the Senate on July 10, 2015; 
to the Committee on Environment and Pub-
lic Works. 

EC–2262. A communication from the Sec-
retary of Health and Human Services, trans-
mitting, pursuant to law, a report entitled 
‘‘2014 Actuarial Report on the Financial Out-
look for Medicaid’’; to the Committee on Fi-
nance. 

EC–2263. A communication from the Assist-
ant Secretary for Legislation, Department of 
Health and Human Services, transmitting, 
pursuant to law, a financial report for fiscal 
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year 2014 relative to the Biosimilar User Fee 
Act of 2012; to the Committee on Health, 
Education, Labor, and Pensions. 

EC–2264. A communication from the Assist-
ant Secretary, Employee Benefits Security 
Administration, Department of Labor, trans-
mitting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule 
entitled ‘‘Coverage of Certain Preventive 
Services Under the Affordable Care Act’’ 
(RIN1210–AB67) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Health, Education, Labor, 
and Pensions. 

EC–2265. A communication from the Direc-
tor of Regulations and Policy Management 
Staff, Food and Drug Administration, De-
partment of Health and Human Services, 
transmitting, pursuant to law, the report of 
a rule entitled ‘‘Permanent Discontinuance 
or Interruption in Manufacturing of Certain 
Drug or Biological Products’’ ((RIN0910– 
AG88) (Docket No. FDA–2011–N–0898)) re-
ceived during adjournment of the Senate in 
the Office of the President of the Senate on 
July 10, 2015; to the Committee on Health, 
Education, Labor, and Pensions. 

EC–2266. A communication from the Assist-
ant Secretary for Legislation, Department of 
Health and Human Services, transmitting, 
pursuant to law, a report entitled ‘‘National 
Plan to Address Alzheimer’s Disease: 2015 
Update’’; to the Committee on Health, Edu-
cation, Labor, and Pensions. 

EC–2267. A communication from the Assist-
ant Secretary for Legislation, Department of 
Health and Human Services, transmitting, 
pursuant to law, a report entitled ‘‘Annual 
Report to Congress on the Prevention and 
Reduction of Underage Drinking’’; to the 
Committee on Health, Education, Labor, and 
Pensions. 

EC–2268. A communication from the Chair-
man of the Council of the District of Colum-
bia, transmitting, pursuant to law, a report 
on D.C. Act 21–97, ‘‘Heat Wave Safety Tem-
porary Amendment Act of 2015’’; to the Com-
mittee on Homeland Security and Govern-
mental Affairs. 

EC–2269. A communication from the Chair-
man of the Council of the District of Colum-
bia, transmitting, pursuant to law, a report 
on D.C. Act 21–98, ‘‘TOPA Bona Fide Offer of 
Sale Clarification Temporary Amendment 
Act of 2015’’; to the Committee on Homeland 
Security and Governmental Affairs. 

EC–2270. A communication from the Direc-
tor, Planning and Policy Analysis, Office of 
Personnel Management, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Federal Employees Health Benefits Pro-
gram: FEHB Plan Performance Assessment 
System’’ (RIN3206–AN13) received in the Of-
fice of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Homeland Se-
curity and Governmental Affairs. 

EC–2271. A communication from the Direc-
tor, Retirement Services, Office of Personnel 
Management, transmitting, pursuant to law, 
the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Federal Em-
ployees’ Retirement System; Present Value 
Conversion Factors for Spouses of Deceased 
Separated Employees’’ (RIN3206–AN16) re-
ceived in the Office of the President of the 
Senate on July 13, 2015; to the Committee on 
Homeland Security and Governmental Af-
fairs. 

EC–2272. A communication from the Assist-
ant Attorney General, Office of Legislative 
Affairs, Department of Justice, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, a report relative to 
the implementation of the recommendations 
of the 9/11 Commission for the period from 
October 1, 2014, through March 31, 2015; to 
the Committee on the Judiciary. 

EC–2273. A communication from the Assist-
ant Attorney General, Office of Legislative 
Affairs, Department of Justice, transmit-
ting, pursuant to law, an annual report on 

the Department’s activities during calendar 
year 2013 relative to prison rape abatement; 
to the Committee on the Judiciary. 

EC–2274. A communication from the Man-
agement and Program Analyst, Federal 
Aviation Administration, Department of 
Transportation, transmitting, pursuant to 
law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Amend-
ment of Class D Airspace; Baltimore, Martin 
State Airport, MD’’ ((RIN2120–AA66) (Docket 
No. FAA–2015–0793)) received during adjourn-
ment of the Senate in the Office of the Presi-
dent of the Senate on July 10, 2015; to the 
Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2275. A communication from the Man-
agement and Program Analyst, Federal 
Aviation Administration, Department of 
Transportation, transmitting, pursuant to 
law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Amend-
ment of Class E Airspace; Cloverdale, CA’’ 
((RIN2120–AA66) (Docket No. FAA–2014–0457)) 
received during adjournment of the Senate 
in the Office of the President of the Senate 
on July 10, 2015; to the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2276. A communication from the Man-
agement and Program Analyst, Federal 
Aviation Administration, Department of 
Transportation, transmitting, pursuant to 
law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Amend-
ment of Class E Airspace; Highmore, SD’’ 
((RIN2120–AA66) (Docket No. FAA–2014–0723)) 
received during adjournment of the Senate 
in the Office of the President of the Senate 
on July 10, 2015; to the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2277. A communication from the Para-
legal Specialist, Federal Aviation Adminis-
tration, Department of Transportation, 
transmitting, pursuant to law, the report of 
a rule entitled ‘‘Airworthiness Directives; 
Airbus Helicopters Deutschland GmbH (Pre-
viously Eurocopter Deutschland GmbH) (Air-
bus Helicopters)’’ ((RIN2120–AA64) (Docket 
No. FAA–2014–0577)) received during adjourn-
ment of the Senate in the Office of the Presi-
dent of the Senate on July 10, 2015; to the 
Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2278. A communication from the Para-
legal Specialist, Federal Aviation Adminis-
tration, Department of Transportation, 
transmitting, pursuant to law, the report of 
a rule entitled ‘‘Airworthiness Directives; 
The Boeing Company Airplanes’’ ((RIN2120– 
AA64) (Docket No. FAA–2014–0426)) received 
during adjournment of the Senate in the Of-
fice of the President of the Senate on July 
10, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2279. A communication from the Para-
legal Specialist, Federal Aviation Adminis-
tration, Department of Transportation, 
transmitting, pursuant to law, the report of 
a rule entitled ‘‘Airworthiness Directives; 
Fokker Services B.V. Airplanes’’ ((RIN2120– 
AA64) (Docket No. FAA–2014–0492)) received 
during adjournment of the Senate in the Of-
fice of the President of the Senate on July 
10, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2280. A communication from the Para-
legal Specialist, Federal Aviation Adminis-
tration, Department of Transportation, 
transmitting, pursuant to law, the report of 
a rule entitled ‘‘Airworthiness Directives; 
Honeywell International Inc. Turboprop En-
gines’’ ((RIN2120–AA64) (Docket No. FAA– 
2006–23706)) received during adjournment of 
the Senate in the Office of the President of 
the Senate on July 10, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2281. A communication from the Para-
legal Specialist, Federal Aviation Adminis-
tration, Department of Transportation, 
transmitting, pursuant to law, the report of 

a rule entitled ‘‘Airworthiness Directives; 
Pratt and Whitney Division Turbofan En-
gines’’ ((RIN2120–AA64) (Docket No. FAA– 
2015–0266)) received during adjournment of 
the Senate in the Office of the President of 
the Senate on July 10, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2282. A communication from the Regu-
latory Ombudsman, Federal Motor Carrier 
Safety Administration, Department of 
Transportation, transmitting, pursuant to 
law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Incorpora-
tion by Reference; North American Standard 
Out-of-Service Criteria; Hazardous Materials 
Safety Permits’’ (RIN2126–AB78) received 
during adjournment of the Senate in the Of-
fice of the President of the Senate on July 
10, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2283. A communication from the Divi-
sion Chief of Regulatory Development, Fed-
eral Motor Carrier Safety Administration, 
Department of Transportation, transmitting, 
pursuant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Rulemaking Procedures—Federal Motor 
Carrier Safety Regulations; Treatment of 
Confidential Business Information’’ 
(RIN2126–AB79) received during adjournment 
of the Senate in the Office of the President 
of the Senate on July 10, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2284. A communication from the Pro-
gram Analyst, Office of Managing Director, 
Federal Communications Commission, trans-
mitting, pursuant to law, the report of a rule 
entitled ‘‘Assessment and Collection of Reg-
ulatory Fees for Fiscal Years 2014 and 2015; 
and Amendment of Part 1 of the Commis-
sion’s Rules’’ ((MD Docket No. 15–121; MD 
Docket No. 14–92) (FCC 15–59)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2285. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Oil Exploration Staging Area 
in Dutch Harbor, AK’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0246)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2286. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zones; Marine Events held in the 
Sector Long Island Sound Captain of the 
Port Zone’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0438)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2287. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; 520 Bridge Construction, Lake 
Washington; Seattle, WA’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0570)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2288. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Underwater Vessel Testing, 
San Francisco Bay, San Francisco, CA’’ 
((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015– 
0422)) received in the Office of the President 
of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2289. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
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of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Spe-
cial Local Regulations for Marine Events, 
Manasquan River, Seaside Park, New Jer-
sey’’ ((RIN1625–AA08) (Docket No. USCG– 
2015–0328)) received in the Office of the Presi-
dent of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the 
Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2290. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Spe-
cial Local Regulation; L’HERMIONE Parade, 
Upper New York Bay and Lower Hudson 
River, New York, NY’’ ((RIN1625–AA08) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0457)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2291. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Erie Boom on the Bay Fire-
works Display; Presque Isle Bay, Erie, PA’’ 
((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015– 
0506)) received in the Office of the President 
of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2292. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Bay Village Independence Day 
Celebration Fireworks Display; Lake Erie, 
Bay Village, OH’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket 
No. USCG–2015–0500)) received in the Office of 
the President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; 
to the Committee on Commerce, Science, 
and Transportation. 

EC–2293. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Independence Day Celebration 
Fireworks Display; Lake Ontario, Oswego, 
NY’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG– 
2015–0503)) received in the Office of the Presi-
dent of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the 
Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2294. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Alexandria Bay Chamber of 
Commerce Fireworks Display; Saint Law-
rence River, Heart Island, Alexandria Bay, 
NY’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG– 
2015–0504)) received in the Office of the Presi-
dent of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the 
Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2295. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Three Rivers Regatta/Three 
River Regatta and Fireworks, Ohio River, 
mile 0.5 to mile 0.5 on the Allegheny River 
and mile 0.5 on the Monongahela River; 
Pittsburgh, PA’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket 
No. USCG–2015–0436)) received in the Office of 
the President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; 
to the Committee on Commerce, Science, 
and Transportation. 

EC–2296. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Chesapeake Bay; Cape 
Charles, VA’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0048)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2297. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zones; Fourth of July Fireworks 
Displays, Murrells Inlet and North Myrtle 
Beach, SC’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0529)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2298. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Ohio River between mile 618.5 
and mile 619.5; Louisville, KY’’ ((RIN1625– 
AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015–0198)) received 
in the Office of the President of the Senate 
on July 13, 2015; to the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2299. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone, Fourth of July fireworks, 
Lake Winnebago; Menasha, Wisconsin’’ 
((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015– 
0532)) received in the Office of the President 
of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2300. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Ohio River between mile 603.4 
and 605.4; Louisville, KY’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0505)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2301. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Black River Kayak-a-thon; 
Black River, Lorain, OH’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0496)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2302. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone for Fireworks Display, Chesa-
peake Bay, Prospect Bay; Queen Anne’s 
County, MD’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0279)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2303. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zones, St. Petersburg Captain of the 
Port Zone’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2014–0764)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2304. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Fireworks Display, Columbia 
River, Cathlamet, WA’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0358)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2305. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Drawbridge Operation Regulation; Niantic 

River, Niantic, CT’’ ((RIN1625–AA09) (Docket 
No. USCG–2015–0218)) received in the Office of 
the President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; 
to the Committee on Commerce, Science, 
and Transportation. 

EC–2306. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Drawbridge Operation Regulation; Grand 
River, Grand Haven, MI’’ ((RIN1625–AA09) 
(Docket No. USCG–2015–0373)) received in the 
Office of the President of the Senate on July 
13, 2015; to the Committee on Commerce, 
Science, and Transportation. 

EC–2307. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone, Indian River Bay; Millsboro, 
Delaware’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0317)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2308. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone for Fireworks Display, Pa-
tapsco River, Inner Harbor; Baltimore, MD’’ 
((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015– 
0315)) received in the Office of the President 
of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2309. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Salvage and Recovery of CSS 
Georgia and Recovery and Transit of 
Unexploded Ordnance, Savannah River, Sa-
vannah, GA’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0434)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2310. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Spe-
cial Local Regulations; Grand National Drag 
Boat Races, Atlantic Intracoastal Waterway; 
Bucksport, SC’’ ((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. 
USCG–2015–0340)) received in the Office of the 
President of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

EC–2311. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled ‘‘Spe-
cial Local Regulations for Marine Events, 
Atlantic Ocean; Atlantic City, New Jersey’’ 
((RIN1625–AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015– 
0329)) received in the Office of the President 
of the Senate on July 13, 2015; to the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and Transpor-
tation. 

EC–2312. A communication from the Attor-
ney-Advisor, U.S. Coast Guard, Department 
of Homeland Security, transmitting, pursu-
ant to law, the report of a rule entitled 
‘‘Safety Zone; Bridgefest Regatta Fireworks, 
Portage Canal, Hancock, MI’’ ((RIN1625– 
AA00) (Docket No. USCG–2015–0531)) received 
in the Office of the President of the Senate 
on July 13, 2015; to the Committee on Com-
merce, Science, and Transportation. 

f 

REPORTS OF COMMITTEES 
The following reports of committees 

were submitted: 
By Mr. INHOFE, from the Committee on 

Environment and Public Works, with amend-
ments: 
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S. 1647. A bill to amend title 23, United 

States Code, to authorize funds for Federal- 
aid highways and highway safety construc-
tion programs, and for other purposes (Rept. 
No. 114–80). 

By Mr. COCHRAN, from the Committee on 
Appropriations: 

Special Report entitled ‘‘Further Revised 
Allocation to Subcommittees of Budget To-
tals from the Concurrent Resolution for Fis-
cal Year 2016’’ (Rept. No. 114–81). 

f 

INTRODUCTION OF BILLS AND 
JOINT RESOLUTIONS 

The following bills and joint resolu-
tions were introduced, read the first 
and second times by unanimous con-
sent, and referred as indicated: 

By Mr. SCHATZ (for himself, Mrs. 
GILLIBRAND, Ms. WARREN, Mr. WHITE-
HOUSE, Mr. MARKEY, Mrs. SHAHEEN, 
Mr. BROWN, Mr. MERKLEY, Mr. 
WYDEN, Ms. KLOBUCHAR, Mr. PETERS, 
Mr. UDALL, Ms. CANTWELL, Mr. BEN-
NET, Ms. BALDWIN, Ms. HIRONO, Mr. 
SCHUMER, Mr. HEINRICH, Mrs. BOXER, 
Mrs. FEINSTEIN, Mr. MURPHY, Mr. 
FRANKEN, and Mr. BOOKER): 

S. 1766. A bill to direct the Secretary of De-
fense to review the discharge characteriza-
tion of former members of the Armed Forces 
who were discharged by reason of the sexual 
orientation of the member, and for other 
purposes; to the Committee on Armed Serv-
ices. 

By Mr. ISAKSON (for himself, Mr. 
CASEY, and Mr. ROBERTS): 

S. 1767. A bill to amend the Federal Food, 
Drug, and Cosmetic Act with respect to com-
bination products, and for other purposes; to 
the Committee on Health, Education, Labor, 
and Pensions. 

By Mr. ROBERTS (for himself and Mr. 
MORAN): 

S. 1768. A bill to authorize States to en-
force safety requirements related to 
wellbores at interstate storage facilities; to 
the Committee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation. 

By Mr. DAINES (for himself and Mr. 
ALEXANDER): 

S. 1769. A bill to amend the African Ele-
phant Conservation Act to conserve ele-
phants while appropriately regulating ivory 
in the United States; to the Committee on 
Environment and Public Works. 

By Mr. CASEY (for himself, Mr. 
INHOFE, Mr. PETERS, and Mr. VITTER): 

S. 1770. A bill to provide for evidence-based 
and promising practices related to juvenile 
delinquency and criminal street gang activ-
ity prevention and intervention to help build 
individual, family, and community strength 
and resiliency to ensure that youth lead pro-
ductive, safe, healthy, gang-free, and law- 
abiding lives; to the Committee on the Judi-
ciary. 

By Mr. DAINES (for himself, Mr. 
THUNE, and Mr. CRAPO): 

S. 1771. A bill to amend the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 to exempt Indian tribal 
governments and other tribal entities from 
the employer health coverage mandate; to 
the Committee on Finance. 

By Ms. WARREN (for herself, Mrs. 
MURRAY, Mr. MURPHY, Ms. BALDWIN, 
Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mr. BROWN, Mr. 
DURBIN, Mr. FRANKEN, Mrs. GILLI-
BRAND, Mr. LEAHY, Mr. MARKEY, Mr. 
MERKLEY, Ms. MIKULSKI, Mr. SAND-
ERS, Mr. SCHUMER, Mr. WHITEHOUSE, 
Mr. WYDEN, and Ms. HIRONO): 

S. 1772. A bill to permit employees to re-
quest changes to their work schedules with-
out fear of retaliation and to ensure that em-

ployers consider these requests, and to re-
quire employers to provide more predictable 
and stable schedules for employees in certain 
occupations with evidence of unpredictable 
and unstable scheduling practices that nega-
tively affect employees, and for other pur-
poses; to the Committee on Health, Edu-
cation, Labor, and Pensions. 

By Mr. BROWN (for himself, Mr. 
MERKLEY, Mr. BLUMENTHAL, Mr. DUR-
BIN, and Mr. FRANKEN): 

S. 1773. A bill to amend title 11, United 
States Code, to require creditors to inform 
consumer reporting agencies that certain 
debts have been discharged in bankruptcy 
cases; to the Committee on the Judiciary. 

By Mr. BLUMENTHAL (for himself, 
Mr. SCHUMER, Mr. NELSON, Mrs. 
GILLIBRAND, Ms. WARREN, Mr. 
MENENDEZ, Mr. BOOKER, Mr. REID, 
Mr. MURPHY, Mr. SANDERS, Mr. HEIN-
RICH, and Ms. HIRONO): 

S. 1774. A bill to amend title 11 of the 
United States Code to treat Puerto Rico as a 
State for purposes of chapter 9 of such title 
relating to the adjustment of debts of mu-
nicipalities; to the Committee on the Judici-
ary. 

By Mr. MURPHY (for himself, Ms. COL-
LINS, and Mr. BLUMENTHAL): 

S. 1775. A bill to direct the Secretary of 
Homeland Security to accept additional doc-
umentation when considering the applica-
tion for veterans status of an individual who 
performed service as a coastwise merchant 
seaman during World War II, and for other 
purposes; to the Committee on Veterans’ Af-
fairs. 

By Mr. BARRASSO (for himself and 
Mr. CRAPO): 

S. 1776. A bill to enhance tribal road safe-
ty, and for other purposes; to the Committee 
on Indian Affairs. 

By Mr. RISCH (for himself and Mr. 
CRAPO): 

S. 1777. A bill to amend the Wild and Sce-
nic Rivers Act to authorize the Secretary of 
Agriculture to maintain or replace certain 
facilities and structures for commercial 
recreation services at Smith Gulch in Idaho, 
and for other purposes; to the Committee on 
Energy and Natural Resources. 

By Ms. HIRONO (for herself and Mrs. 
ERNST): 

S. 1778. A bill to amend title XVIII of the 
Social Security Act to permit certain Medi-
care providers licensed in a State to provide 
telemedicine services to certain Medicare 
beneficiaries in a different State; to the 
Committee on Finance. 

By Ms. BALDWIN (for herself, Mr. 
SCHATZ, and Ms. WARREN): 

S. 1779. A bill to prevent conflicts of inter-
est that stem from executive Government 
employees receiving bonuses or other com-
pensation arrangements from nongovern-
ment sources, from the revolving door that 
raises concerns about the independence of fi-
nancial services regulators, and from the re-
volving door that casts aspersions over the 
awarding of Government contracts and other 
financial benefits; to the Committee on 
Homeland Security and Governmental Af-
fairs. 

By Mr. HEINRICH (for himself and Mr. 
FLAKE): 

S. 1780. A bill to amend the Omnibus Pub-
lic Land Management Act of 2009 to promote 
watershed health, and for other purposes; to 
the Committee on Energy and Natural Re-
sources. 

By Mr. HATCH: 
S. 1781. A bill to amend title 23, United 

States Code, to modify a provision relating 
to the obligation and release of funds; to the 
Committee on Environment and Public 
Works. 

By Mr. HATCH: 
S. 1782. A bill to permit a State transpor-

tation department to approve a justification 
report for a project to build or modify a free-
way-to-crossroad interchange on the Inter-
state Highway System within a transpor-
tation management area in such State; to 
the Committee on Environment and Public 
Works. 

By Mr. HATCH: 
S. 1783. A bill to amend the Omnibus Pub-

lic Land Management Act of 2009 to clarify a 
provision relating to the designation of a 
northern transportation route in Washington 
County, Utah; to the Committee on Energy 
and Natural Resources. 

By Mr. RUBIO (for himself and Mr. 
COTTON): 

S.J. Res. 19. A joint resolution to express 
the disfavor of Congress regarding the pro-
posed agreement for cooperation between the 
United States and the People’s Republic of 
China transmitted to the Congress by the 
President on April 21, 2015, pursuant to the 
Atomic Energy Act of 1954; to the Committee 
on Foreign Relations. 

f 

ADDITIONAL COSPONSORS 

S. 192 
At the request of Mr. ALEXANDER, the 

names of the Senator from Hawaii (Ms. 
HIRONO) and the Senator from Oregon 
(Mr. WYDEN) were added as cosponsors 
of S. 192, a bill to reauthorize the Older 
Americans Act of 1965, and for other 
purposes. 

S. 210 
At the request of Mr. CASEY, the 

name of the Senator from Washington 
(Ms. CANTWELL) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 210, a bill to amend the Inter-
nal Revenue Code of 1986 to allow a 
credit against income tax for amounts 
paid by a spouse of a member of the 
Armed Forces for a new State license 
or certification required by reason of a 
permanent change in the duty station 
of such member to another State. 

S. 314 
At the request of Mr. GRASSLEY, the 

name of the Senator from Hawaii (Ms. 
HIRONO) was added as a cosponsor of S. 
314, a bill to amend title XVIII of the 
Social Security Act to provide for cov-
erage under the Medicare program of 
pharmacist services. 

S. 574 
At the request of Mr. BOOKER, the 

name of the Senator from Minnesota 
(Ms. KLOBUCHAR) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 574, a bill to amend the 
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to allow 
employers a credit against income tax 
for employees who participate in quali-
fied apprenticeship programs. 

S. 586 
At the request of Mrs. SHAHEEN, the 

name of the Senator from Virginia (Mr. 
KAINE) was added as a cosponsor of S. 
586, a bill to amend the Public Health 
Service Act to foster more effective 
implementation and coordination of 
clinical care for people with pre-diabe-
tes, diabetes, and the chronic diseases 
and conditions that result from diabe-
tes. 

S. 621 
At the request of Mrs. FEINSTEIN, the 

name of the Senator from New Jersey 
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(Mr. BOOKER) was added as a cosponsor 
of S. 621, a bill to amend the Federal 
Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act to en-
sure the safety and effectiveness of 
medically important antimicrobials 
approved for use in the prevention and 
control of animal diseases, in order to 
minimize the development of anti-
biotic-resistant bacteria. 

S. 637 
At the request of Mr. CRAPO, the 

names of the Senator from Missouri 
(Mr. BLUNT) and the Senator from Ne-
vada (Mr. HELLER) were added as co-
sponsors of S. 637, a bill to amend the 
Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to extend 
and modify the railroad track mainte-
nance credit. 

S. 804 
At the request of Ms. COLLINS, the 

name of the Senator from Colorado 
(Mr. BENNET) was added as a cosponsor 
of S. 804, a bill to amend title XVIII of 
the Social Security Act to specify cov-
erage of continuous glucose monitoring 
devices, and for other purposes. 

S. 849 
At the request of Mr. ISAKSON, the 

name of the Senator from California 
(Mrs. FEINSTEIN) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 849, a bill to amend the 
Public Health Service Act to provide 
for systematic data collection and 
analysis and epidemiological research 
regarding Multiple Sclerosis (MS), Par-
kinson’s disease, and other neuro-
logical diseases. 

S. 928 
At the request of Mrs. GILLIBRAND, 

the name of the Senator from Hawaii 
(Ms. HIRONO) was added as a cosponsor 
of S. 928, a bill to reauthorize the 
World Trade Center Health Program 
and the September 11th Victim Com-
pensation Fund of 2001, and for other 
purposes. 

S. 1004 
At the request of Mr. KIRK, the name 

of the Senator from Michigan (Ms. 
STABENOW) was added as a cosponsor of 
S. 1004, a bill to amend title 36, United 
States Code, to encourage the nation-
wide observance of two minutes of si-
lence each Veterans Day. 

S. 1020 
At the request of Mr. VITTER, the 

name of the Senator from Missouri 
(Mr. BLUNT) was added as a cosponsor 
of S. 1020, a bill to amend title XVIII of 
the Social Security Act to ensure the 
continued access of Medicare bene-
ficiaries to diagnostic imaging serv-
ices, and for other purposes. 

S. 1135 
At the request of Mrs. MCCASKILL, 

the name of the Senator from Mis-
sissippi (Mr. WICKER) was added as a 
cosponsor of S. 1135, a bill to amend 
title XVIII of the Social Security Act 
to provide for fairness in hospital pay-
ments under the Medicare program. 

S. 1205 
At the request of Mr. MERKLEY, the 

name of the Senator from Oregon (Mr. 
WYDEN) was added as a cosponsor of S. 
1205, a bill to designate the same indi-

vidual serving as the Chief Nurse Offi-
cer of the Public Health Service as the 
National Nurse for Public Health. 

S. 1246 
At the request of Ms. STABENOW, the 

name of the Senator from Delaware 
(Mr. CARPER) was added as a cosponsor 
of S. 1246, a bill to amend the Internal 
Revenue Code of 1986 to revise the defi-
nition of municipal solid waste for pur-
poses of the renewable electricity pro-
duction credit. 

S. 1383 
At the request of Mr. PERDUE, the 

name of the Senator from Alaska (Mr. 
SULLIVAN) was added as a cosponsor of 
S. 1383, a bill to amend the Consumer 
Financial Protection Act of 2010 to sub-
ject the Bureau of Consumer Financial 
Protection to the regular appropria-
tions process, and for other purposes. 

S. 1390 
At the request of Mr. GARDNER, the 

name of the Senator from Minnesota 
(Ms. KLOBUCHAR) was added as a co-
sponsor of S. 1390, a bill to help provide 
relief to State education budgets dur-
ing a recovering economy, to help ful-
fill the Federal mandate to provide 
higher educational opportunities for 
Native American Indians, and for other 
purposes. 

S. 1458 
At the request of Mr. COATS, the 

name of the Senator from Arkansas 
(Mr. BOOZMAN) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 1458, a bill to amend the Sur-
face Mining Control and Reclamation 
Act of 1977 to ensure scientific trans-
parency in the development of environ-
mental regulations and for other pur-
poses. 

S. 1584 
At the request of Mr. CASSIDY, the 

name of the Senator from Oklahoma 
(Mr. LANKFORD) was added as a cospon-
sor of S. 1584, a bill to repeal the re-
newable fuel standard. 

S. 1617 
At the request of Mr. RUBIO, the 

names of the Senator from Utah (Mr. 
HATCH) and the Senator from Arkansas 
(Mr. BOOZMAN) were added as cospon-
sors of S. 1617, a bill to prevent 
Hizballah and associated entities from 
gaining access to international finan-
cial and other institutions, and for 
other purposes. 

S. 1651 
At the request of Mr. BROWN, the 

names of the Senator from California 
(Mrs. BOXER) and the Senator from 
Connecticut (Mr. MURPHY) were added 
as cosponsors of S. 1651, a bill to amend 
title II of the Social Security Act to re-
peal the Government pension offset and 
windfall elimination provisions. 

S. 1676 
At the request of Mr. TESTER, the 

name of the Senator from Illinois (Mr. 
DURBIN) was added as a cosponsor of S. 
1676, a bill to increase the number of 
graduate medical education positions 
treating veterans, to improve the com-
pensation of health care providers, 
medical directors, and directors of Vet-

erans Integrated Service Networks of 
the Department of Veterans Affairs, 
and for other purposes. 

S. 1691 
At the request of Mr. BARRASSO, the 

name of the Senator from Utah (Mr. 
HATCH) was added as a cosponsor of S. 
1691, a bill to expedite and prioritize 
forest management activities to 
achieve ecosystem restoration objec-
tives, and for other purposes. 

S. 1762 
At the request of Mr. CRUZ, the name 

of the Senator from Georgia (Mr. 
PERDUE) was added as a cosponsor of S. 
1762, a bill to amend the Immigration 
and Nationality Act to increase the 
penalties applicable to aliens who un-
lawfully reenter the United States 
after being removed. 

S. RES. 222 
At the request of Mr. LEAHY, the 

names of the Senator from Ohio (Mr. 
BROWN), the Senator from New Hamp-
shire (Mrs. SHAHEEN), the Senator from 
Minnesota (Ms. KLOBUCHAR), the Sen-
ator from Illinois (Mr. DURBIN), the 
Senator from Pennsylvania (Mr. 
CASEY) and the Senator from Con-
necticut (Mr. BLUMENTHAL) were added 
as cosponsors of S. Res. 222, a resolu-
tion expressing the sense of the Senate 
that the Federation Internationale de 
Football Association should imme-
diately eliminate gender pay inequity 
and treat all athletes with the same re-
spect and dignity. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2188 
At the request of Ms. BALDWIN, the 

name of the Senator from Oregon (Mr. 
WYDEN) was added as a cosponsor of 
amendment No. 2188 proposed to S. 
1177, an original bill to reauthorize the 
Elementary and Secondary Education 
Act of 1965 to ensure that every child 
achieves. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2215 
At the request of Mr. PETERS, his 

name was added as a cosponsor of 
amendment No. 2215 proposed to S. 
1177, an original bill to reauthorize the 
Elementary and Secondary Education 
Act of 1965 to ensure that every child 
achieves. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2240 
At the request of Mr. SCHATZ, the 

name of the Senator from Alaska (Mr. 
SULLIVAN) was added as a cosponsor of 
amendment No. 2240 proposed to S. 
1177, an original bill to reauthorize the 
Elementary and Secondary Education 
Act of 1965 to ensure that every child 
achieves. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2241 
At the request of Mr. MURPHY, the 

names of the Senator from Maryland 
(Ms. MIKULSKI) and the Senator from 
California (Mrs. FEINSTEIN) were added 
as cosponsors of amendment No. 2241 
proposed to S. 1177, an original bill to 
reauthorize the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act of 1965 to ensure 
that every child achieves. 

AMENDMENT NO. 2243 
At the request of Mr. COONS, the 

name of the Senator from New York 
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(Mrs. GILLIBRAND) was added as a co-
sponsor of amendment No. 2243 pro-
posed to S. 1177, an original bill to re-
authorize the Elementary and Sec-
ondary Education Act of 1965 to ensure 
that every child achieves. 

f 

STATEMENTS ON INTRODUCED 
BILLS AND JOINT RESOLUTIONS 

By Mr. BARRASSO (for himself 
and Mr. CRAPO): 

S. 1776. A bill to enhance tribal road 
safety, and for other purposes; to the 
Committee on Indian Affairs. 

Mr. BARRASSO. Mr. President, I rise 
today to speak about legislation I in-
troduced that will improve safety on 
roads across Indian Country. Roads and 
bridges in Indian Country are in des-
perate need of improvement. 

According to the Bureau of Indian 
Affairs, only 17 percent of the roads are 
considered to be in acceptable condi-
tion. The remainder are considered to 
be in poor and unacceptable condition 
and many are simply unpaved. Accord-
ing to the National Congress of Amer-
ican Indians, ‘‘These roads are among 
the most underdeveloped and unsafe 
road networks in the Nation, even 
though they are the primary means of 
access’’ throughout these tribal com-
munities. The Centers for Disease Con-
trol lists motor vehicle crashes as the 
leading cause of death for Native 
American children. Meanwhile, Indian 
infants, under the age of 1 year old, are 
eight times more likely to die in a ve-
hicle-related crash than other children. 

That is why I am introducing the 
Tribal Infrastructure and Roads En-
hancement and Safety Act, or TIRES 
Act for short. The TIRES Act supports 
increasing the safety of roads through-
out Indian Country by: streamlining 
the process to start and complete safe-
ty projects, increasing available fund-
ing for tribal road programs, and rein-
stating the tribal facility bridge pro-
gram. This legislation will reduce the 
administrative fees that the Bureau of 
Indian Affairs charges tribes for road 
work and will speed up the time such 
projects take to get approved. 

The TIRES Act also commissions two 
important road safety studies. In one 
study, the Department of Interior, in 
consultation with the Department of 
Transportation and other relevant Fed-
eral agencies, will examine the quality 
of transportation safety data collected. 
Such a study can benefit tribes by find-
ing ways to prevent future car crashes 
and recover damages caused by motor-
ists on roads on Indian reservations. 
The second study will examine and 
identify ways to improve safety on all 
public roads on Indian reservations. 

The number of lives lost on roads in 
Indian Country is far too high. Some-
thing needs to be done and this bill is 
a good first step towards improving 
safety on the roads in tribal commu-
nities. 

AMENDMENTS SUBMITTED AND 
PROPOSED 

SA 2256. Mr. KING (for himself and Mrs. 
CAPITO) submitted an amendment intended 
to be proposed to amendment SA 2089 sub-
mitted by Mr. ALEXANDER (for himself and 
Mrs. MURRAY) to the bill S. 1177, to reauthor-
ize the Elementary and Secondary Education 
Act of 1965 to ensure that every child 
achieves. 

f 

TEXT OF AMENDMENTS 

SA 2256. Mr. KING (for himself and 
Mrs. CAPITO) submitted an amendment 
intended to be proposed to amendment 
SA 2089 submitted by Mr. ALEXANDER 
(for himself and Mrs. MURRAY) to the 
bill S. 1177, to reauthorize the Elemen-
tary and Secondary Education Act of 
1965 to ensure that every child 
achieves; as follows: 

Beginning on page 587, strike line 15 and 
all that follows through page 588, line 10, and 
insert the following: 

‘‘(2) ELIGIBLE TECHNOLOGY.—The term ‘eli-
gible technology’ means modern computer, 
and communication technology software, 
services, or tools, including computer or mo-
bile devices, whether for use in school or at 
home, software applications, systems and 
platforms, digital learning content, and re-
lated services, supports, and strategies, 
which may include strategies to assist eligi-
ble children without adequate Internet ac-
cess at home to complete homework. 

‘‘(3) TECHNOLOGY READINESS SURVEY.—The 
term ‘technology readiness survey’ means a 
survey completed by a local educational 
agency that provides standardized informa-
tion on the quantity and types of technology 
infrastructure and access available to the 
students and in the community served by the 
local educational agency, including com-
puter devices, access to school libraries, 
Internet connectivity (including Internet ac-
cess outside of the school day), operating 
systems, related network infrastructure, 
data systems, educator professional learning 
needs and priorities, and data security. 

‘‘(4) UNIVERSAL DESIGN FOR LEARNING.—The 
term ‘universal design for learning’ has the 
meaning given the term in section 103 of the 
Higher Education Act of 1965 (20 U.S.C. 1003). 
‘‘SEC. 5702A. RESTRICTION. 

‘‘Funds awarded under this part shall not 
be used to address the networking needs of 
an entity that is eligible to receive support 
under the E-rate program. 

f 

AUTHORITY FOR COMMITTEES TO 
MEET 

COMMITTEE ON BANKING, HOUSING, AND URBAN 
AFFAIRS 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Banking, Housing, and 
Urban Affairs be authorized to meet 
during the session of the Senate on 
July 15 at 10 a.m. to conduct a hearing 
entitled ‘‘The Consumer Financial Pro-
tection Bureau’s Semi-Annual Report 
to Congress.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND 
TRANSPORTATION 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation be authorized to meet 

during the session of the Senate on 
July 15, 2015, at 2:30 p.m., in room SR– 
253 of the Russell Senate Office Build-
ing to conduct a Subcommittee hearing 
entitled ‘‘Examining the Governance 
and Integrity of International Soccer.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON COMMERCE, SCIENCE, AND 
TRANSPORTATION 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Commerce, Science, and 
Transportation be authorized to meet 
during the session of the Senate on 
July 15, 2015, at 4:45 p.m., in room SR– 
253 of the Russell Senate Office Build-
ing. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON ENVIRONMENT AND PUBLIC 
WORKS 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Environment and Public 
Works be authorized to meet during 
the session of the Senate on July 15, 
2015, at 9:30 a.m., in room SD–406 of the 
Dirksen Senate Office Building, to con-
duct a hearing entitled ‘‘Nomination 
hearing for Kristen Kulinowski to be a 
Member of the Chemical Safety Board 
and Greg Nadeau to be Administrator 
of the Federal Highways Administra-
tion.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON FOREIGN RELATIONS 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 

ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Foreign Relations Sub-
committee on Western Hemisphere be 
authorized to meet during the session 
of the Senate on July 15, 2015, at 2:30 
p.m., to conduct a hearing entitled 
‘‘Overview of U.S. Policy Towards 
Haiti Prior to the Elections.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON FOREIGN RELATIONS 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 

ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Foreign Relations be author-
ized to meet during the session of the 
Senate on July 15, 2015, at 3:30 p.m., to 
conduct a hearing entitled ‘‘Nomina-
tions.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON HOMELAND SECURITY AND 
GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Homeland Security and Gov-
ernmental Affairs be authorized to 
meet during the session of the Senate 
on July 15, 2015, at 10 a.m. to conduct 
a hearing entitled ‘‘Securing the Bor-
der: Understanding Threats and Strate-
gies for the Maritime Border.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

COMMITTEE ON INDIAN AFFAIRS 
Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 

ask unanimous consent that the Com-
mittee on Indian Affairs be authorized 
to meet during the session of the Sen-
ate on July 15, 2015, in room SD–628 of 
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the Dirksen Senate Office Building, at 
2:15 p.m., to conduct a hearing entitled 
‘‘Juvenile Justice in Indian Country: 
Challenges and Promising Strategies.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

SPECIAL COMMITTEE ON AGING 

Mr. ALEXANDER. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that the Spe-
cial Committee on Aging be authorized 
to meet during the session of the Sen-
ate on July 15, 2015, at 2:15 p.m., in 
room SDG–50 of the Dirksen Senate Of-
fice Building, to conduct a hearing en-
titled ‘‘Diabetes Research: Improving 
Lives on the Path to a Cure.’’ 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

f 

PRIVILEGES OF THE FLOOR 

Mr. MURPHY. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent that Russell Arm-
strong, a fellow in my office, be grant-
ed floor privileges for the rest of the 
month. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

Mr. CASEY. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent that a member of 
my staff, Joseph Hill, be granted floor 
access for the remainder of the debate 
on the Every Child Achieves Act. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

f 

ORDERS FOR THURSDAY, JULY 16, 
2015 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, I 
ask unanimous consent that when the 
Senate completes its business today, it 
adjourn until 9:30 a.m. tomorrow, 
Thursday, July 16; that following the 
prayer and pledge, the morning hour be 
deemed expired, the Journal of pro-
ceedings be approved to date, and the 
time for the two leaders be reserved for 
their use later in the day; that fol-
lowing leader remarks, the Senate re-
sume consideration of S. 1177; finally, 
that all time during the adjournment 
of the Senate count postcloture on the 
substitute amendment No. 2089. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

f 

ADJOURNMENT UNTIL 9:30 A.M. 
TOMORROW 

Mr. MCCONNELL. Mr. President, if 
there is no further business to come be-
fore the Senate, I ask unanimous con-
sent that it stand adjourned under the 
previous order. 

There being no objection, the Senate, 
at 6:22 p.m., adjourned until Thursday, 
July 16, 2015, at 9:30 a.m. 

NOMINATIONS 

Executive nominations received by 
the Senate: 

IN THE AIR FORCE 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE UNITED STATES AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE 
AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 
601: 

To be general 

LT. GEN. CARLTON D. EVERHART II 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE RESERVE OF THE AIR FORCE TO THE GRADE INDI-
CATED UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 12203: 

To be brigadier general 

COL. ALLAN L. SWARTZMILLER 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
AS THE CHIEF OF CHAPLAINS, UNITED STATES AIR 
FORCE, AND APPOINTMENT IN THE UNITED STATES AIR 
FORCE TO THE GRADE INDICATED UNDER TITLE 10, 
U.S.C., SECTION 8039: 

To be major general 

COL. DONDI E. COSTIN 

IN THE ARMY 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE UNITED STATES ARMY TO THE GRADE INDICATED 
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND 
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601: 

To be lieutenant general 

MAJ. GEN. STEPHEN R. LYONS 

THE FOLLOWING ARMY NATIONAL GUARD OF THE 
UNITED STATES OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT IN THE RE-
SERVE OF THE ARMY TO THE GRADE INDICATED UNDER 
TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTIONS 12203 AND 12211: 

To be major general 

BRIG. GEN. MATTHEW T. QUINN 

IN THE NAVY 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED 
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND 
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601: 

To be vice admiral 

REAR ADM. JOHN C. AQUILINO 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED 
WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPORTANCE AND 
RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 601: 

To be vice admiral 

VICE ADM. ROBERT L. THOMAS, JR. 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE UNITED STATES NAVY TO THE GRADE INDICATED 
UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 624: 

To be rear admiral 

REAR ADM. (LH) DAVID F. STEINDL 

IN THE MARINE CORPS 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
AS COMMANDANT OF THE MARINE CORPS AND APPOINT-
MENT IN THE UNITED STATES MARINE CORPS TO THE 
GRADE INDICATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF 
IMPORTANCE AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, 
U.S.C., SECTIONS 601 AND 5043: 

To be general 

LT. GEN. ROBERT B. NELLER 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
IN THE UNITED STATES MARINE CORPS TO THE GRADE 
INDICATED WHILE ASSIGNED TO A POSITION OF IMPOR-
TANCE AND RESPONSIBILITY UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., 
SECTION 601: 

To be lieutenant general 

MAJ. GEN. LAWRENCE D. NICHOLSON 

IN THE AIR FORCE 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED INDIVIDUAL FOR APPOINT-
MENT TO THE GRADE INDICATED IN THE REGULAR AIR 
FORCE UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTION 531: 

To be major 

JOSE M. GOYOS 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED AIR NATIONAL GUARD OF THE 
UNITED STATES OFFICERS FOR APPOINTMENT TO THE 
GRADE INDICATED IN THE RESERVE OF THE AIR FORCE 
UNDER TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTIONS 12203 AND 12212: 

To be colonel 

ALLEN KIPP ALBRIGHT 
ANNMARIE K. ANTHONY 
RUSTY LYNN BALLARD 
MICHAEL H. BARTEN 
BRIAN THOMAS BELL 
JOSEPH ELLIOTT BENSON, JR. 
KEVIN JAY BLASER 
PETER M. BOONE 
ALLAN R. CECIL 
WESLEY JAMES CLARE 
EVA MARIE LUHM CLEET 
JOHN D. CONAWAY 
SCOTT A. CONIGLIO 
TRAVIS J. CRAWMER 
JAMES H. CULP 
BUEL JAY DICKSON 
MARK PATRICK DONAHUE 
MICHAEL T. DOTSON 
DAVID L. EADDY 
GLENN H. EVENSON 
CRAIG J. FERY 
BRIAN SCOTT FILLER 
SHAWN P. FITZGERALD 
LEE T. FURCHES 
RUSSELL BENTLEY GABY 
CHRISTOPHER LAWRENCE GNAGI 
JOHN C. GREENAN 
MICHAEL S. GRIESBAUM 
DARREN J. GUTTMANN 
JOHN FRANCIS HALL 
MARTIN LEE HARTLEY, JR. 
JEFFREY LEWIS HEDGES 
JOSHUA LANGSTON HENDRIX 
KENNETH R. HEUTMAKER 
BRADLEY W. HILBERT 
SCOTT A. HOWARD 
CHRISTOPHER WILLIAM HURLEY 
CHRIS JAMES IODER 
THOMAS PATRICK JACKSON 
TOMMY FORREST JAMES, JR. 
DAVID B. JOHNSON 
GREGORY ALLAN JOHNSON 
GARY D. JONES 
DAVID WILLIAM KAISER 
ANDREW J. LEE 
CONSTANTINE ANDREW LEON 
DARRIN BLANE LETSINGER 
MAKI T. LIVESAY 
MARTIN D. LOUIE 
MARK LAWRENCE MANOR 
TIMOTHY DOUGLAS MARTENSON 
MICHAEL PATRICK MCDERMOTT 
DAVID C. MCPHETRES 
DANIEL S. MCSEVENEY 
MARK L. MILLER 
ROBERT K. MITCHELL 
MARK W. MITCHUM 
STEPHEN A. MIZAK 
GARY S. MONROE 
GERALD S. NALL 
ORLANDO E. NEGRON 
KYLE J. NOEL 
JENIFER E. PARDY 
MICHAEL CHRISTOPHER PARRINELLO 
JONI MARIE PENTIFALLO 
MATTHEW J. PETERSON 
DANIEL J. POTAS 
TROY E. POU 
MACK H. PRAYTOR 
ALVIN LYNN PUNT 
JOHN V. C. RAMOS 
MICHAEL LEWIS REICHARD 
ADAM THOMAS RICE 
JOHN W. ROGERS 
RAUL ROSARIO 
VINCENT VITUS SANTANGELO 
CHARLES A. SCHAAN 
ERIC A. SCHADLER 
KEVIN E. SCHNELL 
EILEEN E. SCUTT 
GARY DEAN SMITH 
THOMAS CHRISTIAN SODEMAN 
JON DOUGLAS STONE 
TIMOTHY DAVID STUMBAUGH 
DANIEL M. SUTCH 
JONATHAN RONALD THORPE 
JONATHAN LEVIN VINSON 
BRADLEY DAVID WATERS 
MICHAEL GARY WATSON 
WILLIAM LEE WHEELER 
BRADLEY DUNCAN WHITE 

IN THE ARMY 

THE FOLLOWING NAMED OFFICER FOR APPOINTMENT 
AS PERMANENT PROFESSOR AT THE UNITED STATES 
MILITARY ACADEMY IN THE GRADE INDICATED UNDER 
TITLE 10, U.S.C., SECTIONS 4333(B) AND 4336(A): 

To be colonel 

MARK R. READ 
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