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Consider this advice from an edi-

torial that appeared in Bloomberg last 
month: 

Tactics aside, it would be far better to win 
this fight fairly. The pact is not a treaty: A 
future President and Congress might over-
turn it, arguing that it was sealed without 
proper consideration. And history often 
looks with disgust at causes built on fear, es-
pecially if they go awry. 

This is an important moment for the 
Democratic Party, but more impor-
tantly it is an important moment for 
our country. Let’s stand up for the peo-
ple we represent. Let’s allow them to 
vote on what is one of the most con-
sequential foreign policy issues of our 
age. 

f 

RECOGNITION OF THE MINORITY 
LEADER 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. The 
Democratic leader is recognized. 

f 

NUCLEAR AGREEMENT WITH IRAN 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, my friend 
the Republican leader, among other 
things, said he wanted an intellectual 
argument. The outline he just gave has 
nothing to do with intellectual credi-
bility. 

The agreement that was finalized 
last week dealt with one subject and 
one subject only: whether Iran should 
have a nuclear weapon, and that an-
swer was resoundingly no. That is what 
it was all about. All the other rhetoric 
my Republican friend talked about is 
not in keeping with what the agree-
ment is all about. He tried to make the 
agreement that was finalized into 
something it isn’t. I would suggest in 
the future, realistically, the Repub-
lican leader should be factual on what 
the agreement is between Iran and 
China, Russia, Great Britain, Germany, 
France, and the United States because 
what he just outlined has nothing to do 
with what the actual facts are. 
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GOVERNMENT FUNDING 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, it comes as 
no surprise to anyone watching the 
Senate that the Republican leader and 
I disagree on many things, but I was 
very glad to hear the Republican leader 
say last week that he believes any gov-
ernment funding bill must be clean and 
that using the appropriations process 
as a vehicle to attack women’s health 
is, as he said, ‘‘an exercise in futility.’’ 

I am sure not everyone on his side of 
the aisle agrees with him, but there is 
no doubt it is the right thing to do. I 
agree that any budget deal must be 
clean; that is, no riders—nothing with 
Planned Parenthood, nothing with re-
pealing what the Environmental Pro-
tection Agency has done, no repealing 
what the Dodd-Frank bill put into ef-
fect to stop us from having another 
Wall Street meltdown, no riders deal-
ing with immigration—just a clean 
continuing resolution for a short pe-
riod of time to allow us to do a more 

full and more complete deal in the very 
near future. 

I agree any budget bill must be clean. 
I say that again. I am glad to see the 
Republican leader coming around to 
that. Democrats will not support a con-
tinuing resolution that has all these 
riders on it and especially a Planned 
Parenthood rider that was talked 
about so much in the House. 

I read in the paper today that there 
are 32 Republicans in the House who 
have signed a letter to the Speaker 
saying they are not going to vote for 
anything unless it defunds Planned 
Parenthood. That is a nonstarter and 
the Republican leader rightly has ac-
knowledged that. I am glad the Repub-
lican leader wants a clean continuing 
resolution instead of one that attacks 
women’s health. 

I am disappointed by his refusal at 
this stage to negotiate with the White 
House or any Democrats in the House 
or in the Senate dealing with the budg-
et. We have a looming government 
shutdown. It is right before our eyes. 
The Republican leader has already 
wasted far too much time dithering 
and doing nothing on that. We know 
from experience 2 years ago that the 
Republicans actually did shut down the 
government for almost 3 weeks. For 
months, we have overheard them call-
ing for bipartisan budget negotiations. 
We have 9 session days left before the 
government shuts down. Now is the 
time to sit down—Democrats, Repub-
licans, getting the White House in-
volved—and negotiate a bipartisan 
funding measure for the rest of the 
year, but by the look of this week’s 
schedule, the Republican leader doesn’t 
seem to be in any hurry to avoid a 
shutdown. That is truly unfortunate. 

The Republican leader has not sched-
uled any budget votes today. Instead, 
the Senate will waste precious time on 
another failed vote. And then what 
comes next? What is the Republican 
leader’s plan for the rest of the week? 
Political show votes on abortion that 
have nothing to do with keeping the 
Federal Government open. There is no 
reason why we can’t pass a bipartisan 
funding measure as soon as possible— 
this week, even. But that depends on 
the Republican leader’s willingness to 
sit down and negotiate, and sooner 
rather than later. Then, Congress can 
move on to our next budget priority: 
reversing sequestration and its harmful 
cuts. 
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HISPANIC HERITAGE MONTH 

Mr. REID. Mr. President, today, Sep-
tember 15, marks the beginning of His-
panic Heritage Month, a celebration 
that dates back to 1968. 

This month also includes the anni-
versary of independence for many 
Latin American countries. Hispanic 
Heritage Month is an opportunity for 
us as a nation to recognize, celebrate, 
and honor the history, culture, and 
contributions of America’s Latino com-
munity. 

We see those contributions in all fac-
ets of our society, from the battlefields 
to the boardrooms and from the class-
rooms to the halls of government. 
Every segment of American life has 
been enriched by Latinos and their 
proud culture. Without the contribu-
tions made by generations of Latinos, 
Nevada and the United States would 
not be what we are today. 

In Nevada, Hispanic influence and 
history is everywhere. Consider the 
name of my State and the name of our 
most famous city. ‘‘Nevada’’ means 
snow covered. ‘‘Las Vegas’’ means the 
meadows. Las Vegas, one of the most 
famous cities in the world, has a His-
panic name. Today, more than one- 
quarter of Nevada’s population is His-
panic. 

Nationally, Latino Americans num-
ber nearly 60 million and are expected 
to make up to 60 percent of the popu-
lation growth in coming decades. 
America’s future depends on a strong 
and prosperous Hispanic population. 

That is why Democrats have fought 
hard for policies to protect Hispanic 
families and strengthen Hispanic com-
munities. We passed the Affordable 
Care Act, which allows millions of 
Latinos to have access to affordable 
health care. Because of the Affordable 
Care Act, 4.2 million previously unin-
sured Latinos now have health insur-
ance. An estimated 8.8 million Latinos 
are newly covered for expanded preven-
tive services, with no cost-sharing, in-
cluding mammograms, colonoscopy 
screenings, and immunization vaccines 
under the Affordable Care Act. 

Democrats also passed the bipartisan 
comprehensive immigration reform bill 
out of the Senate a couple years ago. 
That legislation, which House Repub-
licans refused to consider, even though 
it would have passed overwhelmingly— 
all Democrats would have voted for it 
and enough Republicans would have 
voted for it to be an overwhelming vic-
tory—but it didn’t happen. The Repub-
licans refused to consider something 
that protected families, reduced the 
deficit, and strengthened our national 
security. 

We also supported President Obama’s 
Executive actions, which, as we speak, 
are protecting immigrant families 
from the threat of deportation and tak-
ing criminals off the streets. Mean-
while, Republicans are doing every-
thing in their power to undermine His-
panic families. A person need only 
watch 5 minutes of a Republican Presi-
dential debate to see how Republicans 
really feel about America’s Latino 
communities. Republicans are clam-
oring to amend the Constitution to re-
peal birthright citizenship. Repub-
licans want to roll back President 
Obama’s Executive actions that are 
keeping families together and pre-
venting DREAMers from being de-
ported. 

Republicans are constantly attacking 
the Affordable Care Act, which has cov-
ered 4.2 million previously uninsured 
Latinos with health insurance. Repub-
licans refuse to boost the minimum 
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