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are contradictory to the fundamental 
principles of academic freedom and the 
free exchange of ideas that they claim 
to promote. 

While the supporters of this boycott 
claim to be standing up for the rights 
of Palestinians, what they are actually 
doing is presenting a one-sided and in-
accurate representation of reality in 
Israel and ignoring Palestinian vio-
lence. The simple truth is that, 
throughout history, Israel has made 
numerous concessions in the pursuit of 
peace while seeking only the right to 
exist. 

Anthropology teaches respect for cul-
tural differences, but it is clear that 
some in academia didn’t learn that les-
son. Let’s hope a majority of the mem-
bers of the American Anthropological 
Association take time to understand 
the implications of this shameful reso-
lution and vote ‘‘no’’ when it is put to 
a vote before the organization’s full 
membership in April. 

f 

EVERY STUDENT SUCCEEDS ACT 
(Ms. LORETTA SANCHEZ of Cali-

fornia asked and was given permission 
to address the House for 1 minute and 
to revise and extend her remarks.) 

Ms. LORETTA SANCHEZ of Cali-
fornia. Mr. Speaker, I stand here today 
to praise the passage of the Every Stu-
dent Succeeds Act, a landmark piece of 
bipartisan legislation that fixes the 
outdated policies of No Child Left Be-
hind. 

This legislation takes into consider-
ation the collective criticisms of teach-
ers and students and parents and, well, 
everybody really involved with edu-
cation. 

The Every Student Succeeds Act ben-
efits low-income students, minority 
students, and English language bar-
riers to learners by requiring schools 
to include student data about these 
groups into their accountability proc-
ess. 

High-stakes testing will no longer 
monopolize our class time. Schools will 
now have the flexibility to pilot inno-
vative testing measures, allowing more 
time for learning in the classroom. 

I was also proud that both Chambers 
included final language, which I sup-
ported, to include statistics for home-
less students so that we can identify 
and aid some of our most needy stu-
dents. Every child has a right to a 
quality education. I am so happy we 
were able to pass this act. 

f 

FAIRNESS FOR ALL AMERICANS 
(Ms. ROS-LEHTINEN asked and was 

given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Ms. ROS-LEHTINEN. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to speak about fairness and 
liberty, two deeply held values that de-
fine us as Americans. I am proud that 
our great Nation is moving toward a 
more inclusive society. 

In a historic ruling this past summer, 
the Supreme Court of the United 

States determined that our Constitu-
tion guarantees marriage equality. 
That ruling is a reflection of human 
rights. It is also an economic and com-
passionate issue which, as Republicans, 
we should embrace. 

Not sacrificing our values is what the 
GOP stands for, limited government 
that respects individual liberty. But 
even with marriage equality, everyday 
LGBT Americans still lack basic legal 
protections. All Americans deserve 
equal protection and equal rights under 
the law. 

As a founding member of the Con-
gressional LGBT Equality Caucus, I 
will continue to work to ensure that 
the principles of respect, fairness, and 
justice are enjoyed by all, no matter 
their sexual orientation or their gender 
identity. 

f 

VIOLATION OF UNITED NATIONS 
SANCTIONS BY IRAN 

(Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, recent Iranian ballistic 
missile tests in direct violation of 
sanctions by the United Nations show 
that this regime cannot be trusted. 

This week a panel of experts from the 
United Nations confirmed that the 
tests in October and November violated 
sanctions placed on Iran in June of 
2010. 

The tests also stand in stark contrast 
to the Joint Comprehensive Plan of Ac-
tion, the agreement unveiled by Presi-
dent Barack Obama, which is intended 
to curb the Iranian nuclear program. 

This is a plan which would roll back 
sanctions against the regime at a time 
when the United Nations Security 
Council is considering new sanctions 
due to these missile tests. 

The idea that we should reward Iran 
by removing economic sanctions, pro-
viding billions to a regime that has 
long been the leading state sponsor of 
terrorism, is dangerous. 

Past performance is a good indica-
tion of future actions. Iran has a dec-
ades-long history of misrepresentation 
to the global community, especially in 
regards to its nuclear program. 

I urge the President to abandon the 
Joint Comprehensive Plan of Action in 
order to make sure not $1 flows into 
the coffers of this terrorist regime. 

f 

HONORING OUR MEN AND WOMEN 
IN UNIFORM 

(Mr. BRAT asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. BRAT. Mr. Speaker, I am proud 
of the two Virginia National Guard- 
based aviation units who will be de-
ploying to Kuwait. According to an an-
nouncement made December 4, 2015, by 
Major General Timothy P. Williams, 
the Adjutant General of Virginia, ap-
proximately 40 of our brave U.S. sol-

diers assigned to Company A, 2nd Bat-
talion, 224th Aviation Regiment, and 
Detachment 2, Company B, 777th Avia-
tion Support Battalion, are scheduled 
to begin serving on Federal Active 
Duty in early June 2016. 

I am especially proud of my former 
intern and Virginia native, Specialist 
Jack Neblett. Jack has served in the 
Virginia National Guard for 4 years. 
Jack will be leaving his family and 
friends for at least 1 year while on 
tour. 

When interviewed about the deploy-
ment, Jack said: ‘‘I think it’s most im-
portant to recognize we’re on a mission 
to defend the Constitution of the 
United States. We’re all family, and I 
have great friends here. They’re all 
professionals, and they love doing what 
they do.’’ 

I am truly grateful and proud of our 
men and women in uniform. They cou-
rageously defend our Nation and pre-
serve our freedom, and they will con-
tinue to do so. We must remember 
daily the sacrifices our military serv-
icemembers make to protect our free-
dom. Our Nation must keep its com-
mitments to those who sacrifice to 
keep us free. 

f 

b 1445 

E-FREE ACT 

(Mr. FITZPATRICK asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise to tell the story of Lisa Conti of 
Pennsylvania, who is one of tens of 
thousands of women who has been af-
fected negatively by the permanent 
sterilization device known as Essure. 

In 2010, 10 months after the birth of 
her son, Lisa underwent the Essure 
procedure. Her doctor said it was a per-
fectly safe, nonsurgical procedure with 
no downtime—the perfect option for a 
single mother, he said. Unfortunately, 
like so many others, following the fail-
ure of the device, Lisa now lives with 
chronic pain, multiple surgeries, and 
depression. What was supposed to be a 
simple procedure has cost her several 
jobs, time with her children, and years 
of her life. 

I rise as a voice for the Essure Sisters 
in order to tell this Chamber that their 
stories are real, that their pain is real, 
and that their fight is real. Mr. Speak-
er, my bill, the E-Free Act, can halt 
this tragedy by removing this dan-
gerous device from the market. Too 
many women have been harmed. 

I urge my colleagues to join this 
fight because stories like Lisa’s are too 
important to ignore. 

f 

PROTECTING AMERICA 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under 
the Speaker’s announced policy of Jan-
uary 6, 2015, the gentleman from Ne-
braska (Mr. FORTENBERRY) is recog-
nized for 60 minutes as the designee of 
the majority leader. 
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