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My resolution seeks to create a Victims of 

Terror Protection Fund for the protection of the 
Chibok girls when they return home as well as 
provision of much needed support for them 
and other displaced refugees, migrants and 
victims of Boko Haram’s terror in the region. 

The Chibok girls have the fundamental 
human right to freedom of movement, to edu-
cation and to the full realization of their human 
potential. 

Last week, in our celebrations of the United 
Nations Human Rights Day, the global com-
munity rededicated itself to the key Inter-
national Covenants on Human Rights: the 
International Covenant on Economic, Social 
and Cultural Rights and the International Cov-
enant on Civil and Political Rights, Covenants 
that serve as the bedrock of the International 
Bill of Rights: protecting the rights of all 
human beings. 

Indeed, we must continue to always fight for 
the freedoms of the least among us whether 
those for whom we fight are out of sight such 
as the kidnapped teenage girls from a board-
ing school in Chibok or educated medical doc-
tors fleeing violent extremism in Syria. 

The bottom line is that our obligations in the 
human family must revolve around and be 
grounded in our conviction and commitment to 
the rights to freedom of movement, freedom of 
speech, freedom of worship, freedom from 
want, and the freedom from fear or terrorism, 
among others. 

We must remain steadfast in guaranteeing 
these fundamental freedoms and protect the 
human rights of all to achieve peace and pros-
perity in our world. 

When they were kidnapped, the Chibok girls 
were 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16 and 17 year olds 
who are now turning 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17 
and 18—living out the formative years of their 
lives in captivity in the claws of thugs. 

Our silence is a waste of time and this is 
why we must keep speaking, keep tweeting, 
keep seeking to recover our daughters. 

This cannot be the fate or the end of the 
story of their lives. 

We must not and cannot forget Blessing 
Abana, Deborah Abari, Rebecca Mallum, 
Naomi Luka, Esther Markus, Zara Ishaku, 
Ruth Joshua, Grace Paul, Rebecca Luka and 
the others. 

Chibok girls, daughters of the world, this 
holiday season, you remain in our thoughts 
and prayers. 

Notwithstanding your captivity, let me as-
sure you that your spirits, souls and bodies 
are sacred to us, no matter what attacks the 
enemies of peace may have perpetrated upon 
you. 

Like your sister from Pakistan, Malala, who 
was shot in the head for seeking her edu-
cation and who continues to fight for your re-
covery, your best days are ahead because we 
know that when you girls thrive our world 
thrives. 

This is why we are counting on you to keep 
holding on and be assured that help is on the 
way. 

RECOGNIZING CAREPAYMENT AND 
BEACON HEALTH SYSTEM 

HON. JACKIE WALORSKI 
OF INDIANA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mrs. WALORSKI. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to acknowledge Beacon Health System in my 
district for their collaboration with 
CarePayment. 

Beacon Health System continues to look for 
new, innovative ways to care for their patients. 

They have partnered with CarePayment to 
provide a financing service that allows patients 
to spread out the payment of medical bills. 

Oftentimes, patients face sticker shock 
when they discover what their out-of-pocket 
medical expenses will ultimately cost. 

Some plans with high-deductibles force pa-
tients to pay $6,000 for an individual plan, or 
$12,000 for a family plan before their health 
insurance kicks in to cover medical bills. 

In order to provide more financial relief to 
patients in my district, Beacon Health and 
CarePayment are now providing a patient- 
friendly, financing program. 

Everyone is eligible, regardless of income or 
employment status, and participating in this 
program has no impact on the patient’s credit 
score. 

The constituents I serve are concerned with 
rising medical costs. 

In fact, many of them face difficult decisions 
when it comes to prioritizing their healthcare. 

I am grateful for partnerships like the one 
between Beacon Health and CarePayment for 
providing patient driven solutions to Hoosiers. 

I will keep working on bipartisan reforms to 
move in this direction. 

f 

PHYSICIAN OF THE YEAR 

HON. PETE OLSON 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mr. OLSON. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
congratulate Dr. Ed Uthman for being named 
OakBend Medical Center’s 2015 Physician of 
the Year. 

Dr. Uthman has a long and distinguished 
career with OakBend Medical Center, serving 
as its Laboratory Medical Director since 1990. 
During his 25 years with the hospital, he’s 
helped countless patients and continues to 
lead his colleagues with distinction. Dr. 
Uthman was also named to OakBend Medical 
Center’s board of directors. Thank you for tak-
ing such great care of our community. 

On behalf of the Twenty-Second Congres-
sional District of Texas, congratulations again 
to Dr. Ed Uthman for being named OakBend 
Medical Center’s 2015 Physician of the Year. 

f 

IN HONOR OF DAN COX’S SERVICE 
TO OUR COMMUNITY 

HON. KEVIN BRADY 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mr. BRADY of Texas. Mr. Speaker, citizens 
in Montgomery County are blessed with 

school districts that provide a world-class edu-
cation and community organizations with a 
mission to serve. 

Without individuals like Dan Cox, neither 
would be as successful. Throughout his time 
in Montgomery County and the Greater Hous-
ton Area, Dan has used his talents to serve 
others. 

Dan, who earned a bachelor’s degree in 
mechanical engineering and a master’s de-
gree in business administration from The Uni-
versity of Texas in Austin, spent the first six 
years of his career as an accountant and con-
sultant. 

He entered private industry in 1979 and co- 
founded a cardiovascular medical device com-
pany in 1984. 

Dan’s professional endeavors took a back 
seat to his increasing community involvement 
which began with his service on the board of 
directors for the Houston division of the Amer-
ican Heart Association in the 1980s. 

Dan then served as co-chair for both the 
Conroe ISD Strategic Planning Task Force 
and two Conroe ISD Facilities Planning Com-
mittees for the 1994 and 1998 bond referen-
dums. 

Following his service on the board of direc-
tors of the Arthritis Foundation and the sale of 
his company in 1999, Dan held several execu-
tive and consulting positions in addition to 
serving as chairman of The Woodlands United 
Methodist Church Building Committee. 

In 2003, Dan was named Chief Financial 
Officer of Conroe ISD. During his time with the 
school district, Dan contributed to three suc-
cessful bond referendums as well as the ac-
quisition of numerous financial accolades for 
the district including the Platinum Leadership 
Circle Awards for financial transparency and 
five-star FAST ratings for high academic 
standards and efficient spending in public edu-
cation issued by the Texas Comptroller of 
Public Accounts. 

Dan is a current member and past president 
of the Rotary Club of The Woodlands as well 
as Paul Harris Fellow. 

Dan Cox’s dedication to his community and 
service to others stand as an example and in-
spiration to all. While he will be missed at 
Conroe ISD, I can’t imagine Dan will ever stop 
looking for a way to serve. 

f 

HONORING NAAKH VYSOKY 

HON. MICHAEL E. CAPUANO 
OF MASSACHUSETTS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mr. CAPUANO. Mr. Speaker, I would like to 
take a moment to recognize one of the most 
distinguished constituents in my district, Naakh 
Vysoky, who will turn ninety-five on January 3, 
2016. Quite simply Mr. Vysoky is a man who 
overcame some of life’s greatest obstacles to 
become a champion within the field of medi-
cine and a respected leader amongst the Rus-
sian Jewish Community. 

Naakh Vysoky was born in 1921, in 
Kishinev, Moldavia, when it was still a part of 
Romania. In 1940, during an invasion by the 
U.S.S.R., the Soviets considered his family 
‘‘rich’’ and took almost everything they owned. 
Hardship and tragedy again struck Naakh’s 
family in 1941 when Nazi Germany invaded 
Romania. Naakh witnessed the death of his 
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mother, sister, brother-in-law and a young 
nephew. To compound matters further, he 
also lost all contact with his father. 

Forced to make an almost impossible 
choice, Naakh escaped Nazi persecution by 
fleeing to the Soviet Union. He was imme-
diately sent to a Siberian concentration camp. 
After several years in this camp—and having 
witnessed countless deaths of his friends al-
most on a daily basis—he was given an option 
to stay there or join the Soviet Army to fight 
the Nazis. He chose to fight and was wounded 
shortly after. While in the hospital during his 
recovery, Naakh was recruited and trained to 
become a medical professional. He spent the 
rest of the war working at that hospital and 
helping countless wounded soldiers and civil-
ians. 

After the war, Naakh embarked upon an ex-
tensive search for his father and found him in 
1948 in the City of Chernowetz. Although the 
city had been part of Romania, it was then 
part of the western Ukraine inside the Soviet 
Union. When the U.S.S.R. closed their bor-
ders, Naakh’s hopes of emigrating were 
dashed. However, he was able to find a good 
hospital job and a place to live in Storoshinetz, 
one of Chernowetz’s suburbs. While there, 
Naakh was recognized as a talented medical 
professional who championed efforts to pro-
vide the best quality of care for countless peo-
ple. In 1952, he married his wife Klara, who 
was a school teacher. Two years later, his 
daughter Faina was born. His wife Klara be-
came one of the most respected teachers in 
the region due to her strong advocacy for edu-
cation and her devotion to her students. 

During his time in Storoshinetz, Naakh be-
came increasingly alarmed and appalled at the 
rampant anti-Semitism that existed under the 
oppressive Soviet regime. In 1972, due to the 
international movement against Soviet anti- 
Semitism, the possibility of immigration be-
came real. However, that same year, Faina 
was accepted into medical school in 
Chernowetz. Naakh decided to stay so Faina 
could attain her medical degree. Once that 
was achieved, Naakh and his family applied 
for permission to leave the Soviet Union within 
a month of Faina’s graduation and wedding, 
and, in October of 1979, left the Soviet Union 
for New York in the United States. 

Upon their arrival in New York, Naakh’s 
grandson Gregory was born. Naakh and Klara 
dedicated their lives to taking care of Gregory 
and making sure Faina had every opportunity 
to study and become a physician in America. 
It was a very special day for the family when 
Faina passed her qualifying exam for a foreign 
medical graduate degree in September 1980, 
less than a year after their arrival. With great 
pride, Naakh and Klara watched their daugh-
ter, now Faina Shtern, become the first Rus-
sian-born physician to be appointed by the 
Massachusetts General Hospital, Harvard 
Medical School in 1984, and then recognized 
as a leader in the field of Radiology, when she 
became Chief of the Diagnostic Imaging Re-
search Branch of the National Cancer Institute 
in 1990. 

A year later, in 1985, Naakh and Klara fol-
lowed Faina to Boston, where they had helped 
countless members of the Russian Jewish 
Community (RJC) in Brighton and Allston and 
championed their causes. Several years later, 
Naakh was elected a leader of the RJC grass 
roots movement. He has been serving in that 
capacity ever since and has received wide 

recognition for his leadership and accomplish-
ments. A number of elected officials, including 
former Massachusetts Governor Deval Patrick 
and the current Governor Charlie Baker; mem-
bers of the Massachusetts Congressional Del-
egation, members of the Massachusetts State 
Legislature, former Boston mayor Thomas 
Menino, and the current mayor of Boston, the 
Honorable Marty Walsh; and the Boston City 
Council, have all risen to acknowledge Naakh 
for his service to the Commonwealth and the 
Russian Jewish Community. 

With all this in mind, I want to acknowledge 
and sincerely thank Naakh Vysoky for his 
many contributions and wish him a very happy 
birthday and pray that he has many more to 
come. 

f 

IN HONOR OF FATHER PAUL 
WYNANTS 

HON. GERALD E. CONNOLLY 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mr. CONNOLLY. Mr. Speaker, I rise to ex-
press my respect and admiration for Father 
Paul Wynants. Father Wynants has been a 
true spiritual leader, providing guidance and 
comfort to thousands since first being or-
dained 64 years ago. 

Father Paul G. Wynants was born on Au-
gust 2, 1925, in Heverlee, Belgium. He en-
tered the Missionhurst Congregation of the Im-
maculate Heart of Mary in 1944 and was or-
dained on July 29, 1951. He departed for his 
mission assignments in the United States in 
1953. 

Father Wynants served as assistant pastor 
at Christ the King Church in Norfolk from 
1954–55; professor at Maryhill Seminary in 
Pinesville, LA., from 1955–58; assistant pastor 
at St. Dominic Parish in Columbus, Ohio, from 
1958–59; and assistant pastor at St. Patrick 
Church in Detroit, Mich., from 1959–62. In 
1964, Father Wynants was appointed spiritual 
director and rector for the Missionhurst Semi-
nary in Washington, DC. 

In 1975, he was assigned as director of vo-
cations for the U.S. Province. Residing at 
Missionhurst in Arlington, he also served as 
rector there until 1981. Under his guidance, 
Missionhurst evolved into the Missionhurst 
Mission Center, where he served as coordi-
nator until 1982. 

Father Wynants served as the Catholic 
chaplain at Fairfax Hospital from 1982–2005, 
and priest at St. Ambrose Church in Annan-
dale, VA. During those years, Father Wynants 
was always available to provide for the spir-
itual needs of the ill and their families. Regard-
less of the time of day, or the treacherous 
weather, he would unfailingly travel to the hos-
pital and provide comfort and support to those 
in grief. 

On September 12, 1991, Father Wynants 
proudly served as Chaplain for a day in the 
United States Senate. Senator Max Baucus 
sponsored him for this honor, and he was in-
troduced by Senator Robert Byrd. Father 
Wynants never forgot this honor. Sometime 
later, a staff member in Senator Baucus’ office 
became seriously ill and was recuperating at 
Fairfax Hospital when Father Wynants walked 
into her room announcing that the DCCC had 
sent him to check in on her. This brightened 

her day and she would talk about his act of 
kindness for long afterwards. 

In 1992, Father Wynants took up residence 
at Mount Tabor Community in Vienna, a 
house of prayer and a Christian community 
established in 1975 by Missionhurst Father Ar-
thur Verstraete. With the help of Father 
Wynants, Mount Tabor has continued to grow 
with an ever-increasing number of members, 
retreatants, and activities. 

Sadly, Father Wynants is gravely ill. Family 
members have travelled to the United States 
from Belgium to be with him during this time. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask that my colleagues join 
me in a prayer for Father Wynants and his 
family, and in celebration of his life of dedica-
tion to his Church, his faith, his family, and our 
community. 

f 

HONORING KEARNEY HIGH SCHOOL 
FOOTBALL TEAM 

HON. SAM GRAVES 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mr. GRAVES of Missouri. Mr. Speaker, I 
proudly pause to recognize the Kearney High 
School football team. This is a group of very 
special young men who have exemplified the 
finest qualities of teamwork, devotion and 
sportsmanship by taking an active part in the 
classroom and on the field. These Bulldogs re-
lentlessly pursued their goal and were re-
warded with their fourth state football title in 
school history. 

The Kearney Bulldogs defeated Webb City 
17–14 in the Missouri Class Four Champion-
ship. Junior Ethan Luft managed to recover a 
last second fumble on the goal line to secure 
the victory. The work and effort these young 
men have persevered through over the years 
has not only earned them numerous honors 
on and off the field, but also the respect of 
their families, classmates, and community. 

Mr. Speaker, I proudly ask you to join me in 
commending the Kearney High School football 
team for their accomplishments on the field 
and for their efforts put forth in achieving the 
highest distinction of Missouri Class Four state 
champions. 

f 

RECOGNIZING THE ACHIEVEMENTS 
OF LINDA STONE 

HON. ADAM SMITH 
OF WASHINGTON 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Friday, December 18, 2015 

Mr. SMITH of Washington. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise to honor and congratulate Linda Stone— 
a longtime anti-hunger advocate in Seattle— 
on her retirement. 

For the last 30 years, Linda has been a 
prominent leader in the fight to end hunger. 
She is known throughout the region for her 
tenure as the Food Policy Director for the Chil-
dren’s Alliance, a public-policy organization 
that advocates for the needs of children. Her 
history also includes service as the Director of 
the Governor’s Task Force on Hunger and as 
the founder of the Washington Food Policy 
Action Center. 

Linda served as the driving force behind a 
strategic plan to end childhood hunger in 

VerDate Sep 11 2014 06:27 Dec 19, 2015 Jkt 059060 PO 00000 Frm 00016 Fmt 0626 Sfmt 9920 E:\CR\FM\A18DE8.032 E18DEPT1sm
ar

tin
ez

 o
n 

D
S

K
4T

P
T

V
N

1P
R

O
D

 w
ith

 R
E

M
A

R
K

S


		Superintendent of Documents
	2017-08-23T16:59:09-0400
	US GPO, Washington, DC 20401
	Superintendent of Documents
	GPO attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by GPO




