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fulfill our responsibility to that middle 
class by doing what they will pay us to 
do on April 15: just do our jobs and pass 
a budget that invests in their growth, 
in their families, in their children, and, 
as I opened, invests in our troops, our 
national security, and makes sure that 
every veteran in America is taken care 
of. Those are the priorities we have in 
our budgets. 

f 

RECESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 12(a) of rule I, the Chair 
declares the House in recess until noon 
today. 

Accordingly (at 10 o’clock and 34 
minutes a.m.), the House stood in re-
cess. 

f 

b 1200 

AFTER RECESS 

The recess having expired, the House 
was called to order by the Speaker at 
noon. 

f 

PRAYER 

Reverend Stephen Thomlison, St. 
Stephen’s Catholic Church, Exeter, Ne-
braska, offered the following prayer: 

Good and gracious God, we come be-
fore You filled with gratitude for the 
many blessings You have bestowed 
upon us. Humbly, we ask for Your for-
giveness for when we have chosen the 
wrong path. 

We beseech Your mercy, O Lord, 
upon our Nation. Rain down from heav-
en Your holy fire—not a fire of wrath 
or destruction, but a fire of love, a fire 
of mercy, and a fire of wisdom so that 
we may love as You love. 

Pour into this Chamber today a spir-
it of civility, a freshness of renewal, 
and a bountiful grace of new ideas. 

Bless these legislators, their fami-
lies, their staff, and abundantly bless 
all those they represent. May the work 
of this Chamber be guided by Your di-
vine hand. 

Hear us, O Lord, for I ask this in the 
name and through the merits of Jesus 
Christ, Thy Son and our Savior. 

Amen. 
f 

THE JOURNAL 

The SPEAKER. The Chair has exam-
ined the Journal of the last day’s pro-
ceedings and announces to the House 
his approval thereof. 

Pursuant to clause 1, rule I, the Jour-
nal stands approved. 

f 

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 

The SPEAKER. Will the gentle-
woman from California (Ms. HAHN) 
come forward and lead the House in the 
Pledge of Allegiance. 

Ms. HAHN led the Pledge of Alle-
giance as follows: 

I pledge allegiance to the Flag of the 
United States of America, and to the Repub-

lic for which it stands, one nation under God, 
indivisible, with liberty and justice for all. 

f 

WELCOMING REVEREND STEPHEN 
THOMLISON 

The SPEAKER. Without objection, 
the gentleman from Nebraska (Mr. 
SMITH) is recognized for 1 minute. 

There was no objection. 
Mr. SMITH of Nebraska. Mr. Speak-

er, I rise to welcome Father Steve 
Thomlison, and thank him for serving 
as our guest chaplain today. 

Father Thomlison serves as chaplain 
for both the Nebraska Army National 
Guard and the Nebraska State Patrol, 
actually, as well as the FBI, providing 
support to hundreds of our servicemen 
and -women, first responders, law en-
forcement, and their families. 

Ordained in the Catholic Diocese of 
Lincoln, Father Thomlison pastors the 
parish of St. Stephen’s Church in Exe-
ter, Nebraska, and the mission parish 
of St. Wenceslaus Church in Milligan, 
Nebraska. 

He did not enter the priesthood right 
away, but by his mid-thirties, a rest-
less heart and a renewed focus on pray-
er led him to the seminary. He was or-
dained a priest at age 41. 

It is also important to note Father 
Thomlison is a proud Cornhusker, hav-
ing attended the University of Ne-
braska-Lincoln. 

It is my honor to welcome Father 
Thomlison to the United States House 
of Representatives. 

f 

ANNOUNCEMENT BY THE SPEAKER 

The SPEAKER. The Chair will enter-
tain up to 15 further requests for 1- 
minute speeches on each side of the 
aisle. 

f 

BALD EAGLE AREA SCHOOL DIS-
TRICT WINS NUTRITION HABIT 
CHALLENGE 

(Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise to commend several 
school districts in the Pennsylvania 
Fifth Congressional District for their 
work in helping promote healthy life-
styles for their students, staff, and 
residents. 

In 2015, more than 2,200 people par-
ticipated in the Nutrition Habit Chal-
lenge, which was established 3 years 
ago by One on One Fitness, a local fit-
ness consulting company, in order to 
inspire people across the county to 
make better choices for their diet and 
exercise habits. 

Each year, the winning school dis-
trict is picked based on the number of 
successful participants divided by the 
district’s total number of students. 
Those who participate must commit to 
changing a nutritional behavior over 
the course of 1 month. 

This year, the Bald Eagle Area 
School District, my alma mater, won 

$500 through the competition. District 
officials say families participating in 
the challenge cut soda from their diets 
and increased consumption of water, 
while others packed salad for lunch in-
stead of opting for fast food. 

I commend the students, the staff, 
and residents of all Centre County’s 
school districts for participating in 
this unique challenge. 

f 

HONORING THE MEMORY OF BILL 
ROSENDAHL 

(Ms. HAHN asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Ms. HAHN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to honor the memory of my dear friend 
and former Los Angeles City Council-
man Bill Rosendahl, who lost his battle 
with cancer on March 30. 

In 2005, Bill became the first openly 
gay man to be elected to the Los Ange-
les City Council. I remember how brave 
he was in the face of adversity. He be-
came a fearless supporter of the Los 
Angeles LGBT community, and he left 
behind a legacy of fighting for HIV and 
AIDS research and an end to discrimi-
nation. 

Bill was one of the most selfless and 
kindhearted individuals I have ever 
known. That heart made him an in-
credible advocate and a beloved cham-
pion for the people he represented. 

I visited Bill recently in hospice and 
had a chance to hold his hand and tell 
him stories about when we served to-
gether on the city council in Los Ange-
les. 

I will never forget his joyfulness, his 
gregarious laugh that never failed to 
put a smile on my face. I have cher-
ished his friendship, and I will miss 
him dearly. 

May he rest in peace. 
f 

MAIN STREET JOBS AND 
OPPORTUNITY ACT 

(Mr. WALBERG asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. WALBERG. Mr. Speaker, talk to 
any small-business owner, and they 
will tell you how challenging it is to 
operate in this environment: heavy-
handed regulations, confusing paper-
work requirements, a complex and un-
fair Tax Code. I hear it all the time as 
I travel Michigan’s Seventh District, 
hold listening sessions, and tour local 
shops and manufacturing facilities. 
That is why I am introducing the Main 
Street Jobs and Opportunity Act. 

To grow a healthy economy, we need 
to foster policies that help small busi-
nesses do what they do best: bring their 
products to market and hire new work-
ers in the community. 

It is time for Big Government to stop 
squeezing the small family farmer in 
Jackson County, the local diner in 
Eaton County, and the manufacturer in 
Monroe County. Instead of building up 
Washington or Wall Street, let’s focus 
on helping Main Street. 
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HONORING THE 65TH INFANTRY 

REGIMENT 

(Mr. HIGGINS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. HIGGINS. Mr. Speaker, I rise in 
honor of the 65th Infantry Regiment, a 
segregated Puerto Rican unit known as 
the Borinqueneers. 

The regiment was created in 1917, and 
it remained segregated throughout 
World Wars I and II and most of the 
Korean war, even after President Tru-
man ordered the desegregation of the 
Armed Forces. These soldiers sacrificed 
everything for a country that had not 
yet embraced the rights of Hispanic 
Americans—a shame for our country, 
but a show of incredible loyalty and 
service by those who served. 

Today, the House and Senate leaders 
will present a Congressional Gold 
Medal in honor of the 65th Infantry 
Regiment. In attendance will be Cas 
Rodriguez, Sr., chairman of the His-
panic Heritage Council of Western New 
York. 

I thank Cas and the others who 
worked so hard to make sure that 
Americans will never forget the service 
of the 65th Infantry Regiment. 

f 

CONGRESS NEEDS TO DO ITS JOB 
AND PASS A BUDGET 

(Mr. KILDEE asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. KILDEE. Mr. Speaker, by law, 
Congress must enact a budget resolu-
tion by April 15. That is Friday. Yet, 
after months of promising to return to 
so-called regular order, Speaker RYAN 
has failed to bring a budget to the floor 
of this House for us to act upon. 

I don’t know about you, but my con-
stituents, the people I work for, are 
tired of a do-nothing Congress. 

The Republican majority has failed 
to pass a budget resolution. We need a 
resolution that supports working fami-
lies, a budget that supports growing 
the economy in this country. But in-
stead of that, the Republicans have de-
cided not to pass a budget at all. 

Under this Republican majority, 
rather than working with those of us 
on this side of the aisle and finding 
some common ground around a budget 
resolution, the majority has been held 
hostage to the most extreme voices 
within their conference—the Tea Party 
members. And because they want to 
cut Medicare, change it in ways that I 
think would be destructive to our econ-
omy, they can’t bring a budget to the 
floor of the House of Representatives. 

We need to do our job. 

f 

LEAD CONTAMINATION IN 
GALESBURG, ILLINOIS 

(Mrs. BUSTOS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mrs. BUSTOS. Mr. Speaker, I stand 
here as a Member of Congress; but 

years before that, I was a mother and a 
grandmother, and I still am. It is from 
all of these perspectives that I am 
deeply disturbed by recent tests in 
Galesburg, Illinois, that show a high 
contamination of lead. Even more 
alarming is that 5 percent of our chil-
dren tested have elevated levels in 
their small bodies. 

If this happened to one of my kids, I 
can tell you I would ask for immediate 
answers and immediate action; and 
these families and these children de-
serve no less. 

Last Friday, I met with Galesburg 
city officials, and I urged them to 
apply for the low-interest Federal 
loans to replace the lead pipes that go 
to 4,700 homes in Galesburg. In addi-
tion to that, I support legislation that 
would call for improved reporting, test-
ing, and monitoring of lead levels. 

As a Congresswoman, as a mom, as a 
grandma, I say to all responsible here: 
It is time. It is past time. No more ex-
cuses. No more delays. We need a long- 
term solution to a long-term problem. 

f 

CONGRATULATING UNIVERSITY OF 
NORTH DAKOTA MEN’S HOCKEY 
TEAM ON EIGHTH NCAA CHAM-
PIONSHIP WIN 
(Mr. CRAMER asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. CRAMER. Mr. Speaker, the Uni-
versity of North Dakota is the State’s 
largest and oldest university, with 
nearly 15,000 students, 225 fields of 
study, 3,000 courses, and 84 graduate 
education programs. UND has a reputa-
tion for research and scholarship in the 
health sciences, in energy and the envi-
ronment, in aerospace and entrepre-
neurship—oh, yeah, and in hockey. 

In fact, Mr. Speaker, last Saturday, 
in Tampa, Florida, the University of 
North Dakota men’s hockey team won 
its eighth NCAA Championship by de-
feating Quinnipiac five goals to one. 
UND hockey is legendary in the NCAA, 
with 22 Frozen Four appearances to go 
along with their eight national cham-
pionships. 

Congratulations to Coach Brad 
Berry, to President Ed Schafer, the en-
tire team—outstanding team—of stu-
dent athletes and, of course, the incom-
ing president and former Member of 
the House of Representatives, Mark 
Kennedy—for whom my advice would 
be, ‘‘Don’t screw this thing up’’—and 
the entire UND family on their latest 
accomplishments. 

Thank you for a great season and for 
your tremendous example of excel-
lence. As you raise another NCAA 
championship trophy, you also raise 
the bar for all of those who follow. 
That is a really good thing. 

f 

TEAM 26’S FOURTH ANNUAL RIDE 
ON WASHINGTON 

(Ms. ESTY asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. ESTY. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to thank Team 26, some of whom are 
here in the gallery with us today, for 
their courageous efforts to continue 
the call for this House and this body to 
take responsible action to end the 
scourge of gun violence in this country. 

This courageous group of riders, 26 
men and women, mothers and fathers, 
high school students and veterans, rode 
to Washington to renew the call for all 
victims of gun violence. This is their 
fourth year. 

This year, they bring with them peti-
tions signed by nearly 40,000 Americans 
demanding that we in Congress do our 
job by ensuring that all our students 
are safe and that we allow our college 
campuses to be gun-free zones. It is my 
privilege to present this petition to the 
entire House and to thank Team 26 for 
their courageous efforts and for their 
relentless efforts to make sure that we 
in Congress do our job. 

Team 26 rides to bring a message of 
hope and peace and love. It is time for 
this House to respond to their call for 
action with action of our own. 

f 

b 1215 

RECOGNIZING VETERANS LEGAL 
INSTITUTE 

(Ms. LORETTA SANCHEZ of Cali-
fornia asked and was given permission 
to address the House for 1 minute and 
to revise and extend her remarks.) 

Ms. LORETTA SANCHEZ of Cali-
fornia. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize Veterans Legal Institute, an or-
ganization that resides right in the 
middle of my district serving our vet-
erans in Orange County, California, 
since 2014. 

It is a nonprofit organization and 
provides pro bono legal assistance to 
our veterans on a myriad of issues, for 
example, on some of the education 
issues going on using their GI Bill and 
housing—because we have so many of 
our veterans, as you know, that are 
homeless—with respect to health care, 
getting into those VA hospitals and to 
the agencies, and, of course, with re-
spect to employment. 

The organization’s ongoing efforts 
have become an important factor in 
helping us to bring veterans along and 
to ensure that they are an integral part 
of our community. 

Veterans Legal Institute is com-
mitted to providing our everyday he-
roes with the resources and the support 
that they deserve, and I believe that we 
must do our part by supporting organi-
zations such as Veterans Legal Insti-
tute so that they can effectively serve 
this community. 

f 

HAWAII STATE TEACHER OF THE 
YEAR 

(Mr. TAKAI asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. TAKAI. Mr. Speaker, today I rise 
to recognize a woman of extraordinary 
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