
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — HOUSEH4668 July 12, 2016 
We must address the senseless violence 
and injustice afflicting our Nation with 
‘‘the fierce urgency of now,’’ to quote 
the Reverend Dr. Martin Luther King, 
Jr. Our call to action is made more 
painful and more real with each pass-
ing day. 

Mr. Speaker, bring a vote to the floor 
on commonsense, universal background 
check legislation that will keep guns 
out of the hands of terrorists, crimi-
nals, domestic abusers, and the dan-
gerously mentally ill. 

f 

GUN BILL 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Florida (Mr. CURBELO) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. CURBELO of Florida. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise in support of the bipartisan 
legislation I have recently filed to keep 
guns out of the hands of terrorists. 

H.R. 5576, the Terrorist Firearms Pre-
vention Act of 2016, is similar to the bi-
partisan agreement championed by 
Senator SUSAN COLLINS, and would 
deny the sale of firearms to individuals 
on the no fly and selectee lists, while 
ensuring due process is protected for 
law-abiding gun owners. 

It was recently announced the House 
is unlikely to consider any legislation 
this week pertaining to terrorist access 
to firearms, and for this, I am truly 
disappointed. 

Mr. Speaker, it is time to do some-
thing, and this commonsense, bipar-
tisan legislation is a step in the right 
direction. I will continue to work with 
Members on both sides of the aisle to 
strike a bipartisan compromise that 
will protect law-abiding citizens’ con-
stitutional rights, while denying the 
sale of guns to terrorists. 

RECOGNIZING NORBERTO ORELLANA 
Mr. CURBELO of Florida. Mr. Speak-

er, I rise to recognize Mr. Norberto 
Orellana, an incredible young man 
who, despite facing health challenges 
and long-term homelessness, recently 
graduated from the School for Ad-
vanced Studies at the Miami-Dade Col-
lege Homestead campus with a near 
perfect GPA, a full ride to college, and 
a dream to go to medical school. 

Mr. Orellana has already confronted 
more hardships in his young life than 
many of us will encounter in our life-
times, but he does so with a positive 
attitude that inspires all of us. 

Mr. Orellana was born with cerebral 
palsy, a permanent movement disorder 
caused by abnormal development in the 
part of the brain that controls balance 
and posture. 
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By the time he was 5, he had under-
gone three major surgeries to correct a 
club foot, lengthen his muscles, and re-
shape his bones. 

He and his family also battled home-
lessness, moving from shelter to shel-
ter. However, he never allowed his cir-
cumstances to dictate his attitude or 
detract from his belief in his own po-
tential. He used his time spent in hos-

pitals to fuel his burning desire to be-
come a pediatric orthopedic surgeon. 

It is an honor for me to recognize Mr. 
Norberto Orellana on the occasion of 
his graduation. I cannot wait to see 
what the future holds for such a bright 
young mind. 

COMPREHENSIVE STRATEGY TO DESTROY ISIL 

Mr. CURBELO of Florida. Mr. Speak-
er, the attacks in Orlando, San 
Bernardino, and across Europe are a 
horrific reminder that the war on ter-
ror continues, and that radical extre-
mism from groups like ISIL remains a 
danger to all freedom-loving people. It 
is critical that a plan is in place to de-
stroy this enemy before the United 
States and our allies face more sense-
less violence from cowardly terrorists. 

For these reasons, I have cosponsored 
Representative KINZINGER’s bill, H.R. 
4869, the Comprehensive Strategy to 
Destroy ISIL Act of 2016. This legisla-
tion directs the Secretaries of State 
and Defense to submit a joint report to 
Congress on the strategy to destroy 
ISIL and its affiliates. 

It is imperative the U.S. and our al-
lies defeat these radical terrorists on 
their home turf, and this legislation 
will require a plan from the adminis-
tration to do just that. I look forward 
to working with my colleagues on both 
sides of the aisle to pass this critical 
bill. 

CONGRATULATING TWO FLORIDA KEYS 
COMMUNITY COLLEGE STUDENT-TEAMS 

Mr. CURBELO of Florida. Mr. Speak-
er, I rise today to recognize two Flor-
ida Keys Community College student- 
teams who won five medals, two of 
them gold, at the annual NASA Engi-
neering Challenges at the Kennedy 
Space Center in Florida. 

This yearly competition is geared to-
wards encouraging students to pursue 
STEM-related fields. The TechKeys 
and RocketTrees worked together to 
take home the gold in the high-altitude 
balloon experiment. 

FKCC is one of only three colleges in 
Florida to receive a $134,000 grant from 
the Florida Space Grant Consortium to 
support the program for 2 years. This 
grant also provides scholarships to 
each participating student. Each of 
these students is also now eligible for 
an internship at NASA as long as they 
remain enrolled in a Florida college. 

Congratulations to the students and 
their professor, Dawn Ellis, on this 
prestigious accomplishment. I am 
proud that they are bringing awareness 
to the importance of science, tech-
nology, engineering, and math. 

f 

OUR NATION IS TIRED OF GUN 
VIOLENCE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentlewoman from 
Illinois (Ms. SCHAKOWSKY) for 5 min-
utes. 

Ms. SCHAKOWSKY. Mr. Speaker, our 
Nation is grieving. We are tired. We are 
tired of the violence that too often 
unsettles our communities. 

What a week we had last week. We 
were horrified by the deaths of Lorne 
Ahrens, Michael Smith, Michael Krol, 
Patrick Zamarripa, and Brent Thomp-
son—five officers murdered by a sniper 
in Dallas while they were on duty. 

We saw very troubling videos of 
Philando Castile and Alton Sterling 
being shot. 

Today we also mark the 1-month an-
niversary of the shooting at the Pulse 
nightclub in Orlando, a hateful act on 
the LGBT community that took the 
lives of 49 people. This shooting shook 
the country, as have the many mass 
shootings that have preceded it. 

As we still process these deaths, 
daily violence continues in commu-
nities around the country. Over the 
weekend, the total number of shootings 
in Chicago, where I come from, this 
year exceeded 2,100. Over 300 people in 
Chicago have now died from gun vio-
lence in 2016. 

I have received hundreds and hun-
dreds of letters from constituents of all 
ages concerned about the effect of gun 
violence in our communities and in 
their communities. 

Yesterday I received a letter from a 
young constituent, an 8-year-old 
named Kaline. She wrote: ‘‘I read the 
Sun-Times every day like my dad. I 
read and still think about the story of 
Tyshawn Lee. It’s just hitting my mind 
all the time because it’s not fair. It 
makes me cry.’’ 

Tyshawn Lee was a 9-year-old boy in 
Chicago deliberately assassinated, shot 
multiple times in the head. 

Kaline continues: ‘‘I hope people can 
make better decisions about what to do 
with guns. I hope people stop fighting 
about whether we should do gun con-
trol because I worry more people and 
kids like Tyshawn will be killed.’’ 

We can’t accept violence as normal. 
This is not the country Kaline should 
have to grow up in. And how do you ex-
plain to an 8-year old that in America, 
with 91 people dying from gun violence 
every single day, we have taken no 
meaningful action? 

We take action all the time to pro-
tect our kids from threats to their 
safety. We have regulations in place on 
teddy bears and pacifiers, to protect 
children’s health and safety, but noth-
ing for guns. 

Guns are specifically exempted from 
regulation by the Consumer Product 
Safety Commission, the agency 
charged with protecting consumers 
from unreasonable risk or injury or 
death. Gun manufacturers are pro-
tected from liability for damage caused 
by their weapons. The Centers for Dis-
ease Control is actually prohibited, in 
law, from studying the public health 
risk of guns. 

Robert, a 91-year-old and a veteran of 
World War II from my district wrote: 
‘‘You know better than I do the vast 
array of efforts to protect the Amer-
ican people from the recklessness and 
avarice in the marketplace, yet Con-
gress has failed the people in the mat-
ter of gun control . . . Today the 
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