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ensuring the success of our community’s agri-
culture industry. Therefore, it is fitting and 
proper that we honor her here today. 
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RECOGNIZING THE LIFE AND 
SACRIFICE OF LORNE AHRENS 

HON. EDDIE BERNICE JOHNSON 
OF TEXAS 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, July 14, 2016 

Ms. EDDIE BERNICE JOHNSON of Texas. 
Mr. Speaker, today I want to recognize the life 
and sacrifice of a selfless public servant, Sen-
ior Corporal Lorne Ahrens. On July 7th, 2016, 
Lorne Ahrens was one of five Dallas officers 
fatally shot during a protest in downtown Dal-
las. The shooting was a calculated and sense-
less act of violence intended to tear our com-
munity apart. But the resilience of Lorne 
Ahrens’ loved-ones will hold this community 
together. And they find their inspiration in the 
memory of the man they loved. 

Lorne Ahrens was a Senior Corporal in the 
Dallas Police Department, where he served for 
fourteen years. He worked for a time in the 
dangerous and unpredictable job of serving 
warrants, where a simple knock on the door 
could escalate into a life-threatening situation. 

Before moving to the Dallas area, Ahrens 
served in the Los Angeles Sheriff’s Depart-
ment for eleven years. For part of that time, 
he was a law enforcement technician, 
inputting and dispatching calls to the station, a 
demanding job that required fast thinking and 
professional calm. Colleagues in the Los An-
geles Sheriff’s Department remember Ahrens 
as a professional who supported his team-
mates, and as a joyous personality to work 
with. 

The Los Angeles area was his home. He 
even played semi-professional football there. 
Ahrens moved to the Dallas area because he 
married Katrina Ahrens, a Texas girl and a fel-
low police officer. They moved to Texas to-
gether to start their beautiful family, which now 
includes a ten year old daughter and eight 
year old son. 

Lorne Ahrens was a big man. He stood at 
6′5′′ and weighed 350 pounds. Yet, anyone 
who saw him interact with his family knew the 
biggest thing about him was his heart. He 
loved to roll on the floor with his kids, making 
sure they had as much fun as possible when 
they were with their Dad. In fact, when he was 
not taking them fishing or to the movies, he 
often went to his daughter’s school to talk 
about policing and safety. 

Mr. Speaker, we lost a truly honorable pub-
lic servant, friend, and father when Lorne 
Ahrens’ life was taken. Today, I would like to 
thank him for his bravery and sacrifice, send 
my love to his family, and honor him in Con-
gress. 
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PERSONAL EXPLANATION 

HON. DANIEL WEBSTER 
OF FLORIDA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, July 14, 2016 

Mr. WEBSTER of Florida. Mr. Speaker, on 
roll call no. 404, on July 12, 2016, I was un-
avoidably detained off of the House floor. 

Therefore, I was unable to cast my vote on 
the motion to adjourn. 

Had I been present, I would have voted 
‘‘no.’’ 
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MAJOR GENERAL ALLEN E. 
BREWER 

HON. TRENT KELLY 
OF MISSISSIPPI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, July 14, 2016 

Mr. KELLY of Mississippi. Mr. Speaker, I 
rise today to recognize Major General Allen E. 
Brewer, the retiring Assistant Adjutant General 
of the Mississippi Army National Guard. 
Through General Brewer’s role as Assistant 
Adjutant General, he is responsible for devel-
oping and implementing all programs and poli-
cies impacting the Mississippi Army National 
Guard, which consists of nearly 10,000 citizen 
soldiers. 

General Brewer was commissioned as a 
Second Lieutenant, Field Artillery, on July 16, 
1979, through the Officer Candidate School, 
Mississippi Military Academy. He has served 
in command and staff positions at every level, 
including: Company A, 2d Battalion, 20th Spe-
cial Forces Group; Battalion Commander, 2d 
Battalion, 20th Special Forces Group; Com-
mander, 154th Regional Training Institute; 
Deputy Commander, 155th Armored Brigade 
Combat Team in Kalsu, Iraq from April 2005 
to March 2006; and Commander, Special Op-
erations Detachment—South, in Afghanistan 
from November 2011 to March 2012. 

I was privileged to serve with Major General 
Brewer during our combat tour in Iraq in 2005. 
As Deputy Commander of the 155th Brigade 
Combat Team, Colonel Brewer was a trusted 
and respected member of the Brigade Leader-
ship Team. His calm and confident demeanor 
earned him the respect and admiration of 
leaders and soldiers in the Dixie Thunder Bri-
gade. 

Major General Brewer has continued to use 
his effective leadership style to inspire and 
lead the soldiers of the Mississippi Army Na-
tional Guard. He is a mentor and leader to a 
generation of soldiers in the Mississippi Army 
National Guard. 

As Major General Brewer retires from his 
military career, I wish him the best in his fu-
ture endeavors. I am confident Major General 
Brewer will continue to be a leader in the fu-
ture. I am privileged to have been able to work 
with Major General Brewer and call him a 
friend and mentor. 
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TRIBUTE TO REV. DR. HARRY L. 
SEAWRIGHT 

HON. CHRIS VAN HOLLEN 
OF MARYLAND 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, July 14, 2016 

Mr. VAN HOLLEN. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to celebrate the election of Reverend Dr. 
Harry L. Seawright as Bishop of the African 
Methodist Episcopal Church. Rev. Seawright 
is the longtime pastor of the Union Bethel 
A.M.E. Church in Brandywine, Maryland. 

A fourth-generation A.M.E., Rev. 
Seawright’s first pastoral appointment was 

with the Payne Memorial A.M.E. Church in 
Jessup, Maryland, followed by service to the 
Hemingway Temple A.M.E. Church in Wash-
ington, D.C. In 1986, Rev. Seawright assumed 
his position at Union Bethel A.M.E. Church, 
which he has served longer than any other 
pastor in the congregation’s history. 

During his three decades of service, Union 
Bethel has expanded dramatically and has a 
significant presence in the community. In addi-
tion to serving as Union Bethel’s pastor, Rev. 
Seawright is the author of several books, in-
cluding More Than Bricks and Mortar: Building 
a Church without Losing Your Mind, and Don’t 
Faint: Help for Hurting Pastors and their Fami-
lies. He earned his Bachelor’s degree from 
Benedict College in Columbia, South Carolina 
and his Master and Doctor of Ministry degrees 
from the Howard University School of Divinity. 

Rev. Seawright has long been deeply in-
volved in the community. In addition to serving 
as a spiritual leader, he is an entrepreneur, 
community leader, world traveler, author and 
family man. I ask my colleagues to join me in 
expressing to him our congratulations on his 
election to this distinguished position and our 
gratitude for all he has done to touch the lives 
of others. 
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HONORING THE LIFE AND LEGACY 
OF LEONARD SUGGS 

HON. RICHARD HUDSON 
OF NORTH CAROLINA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, July 14, 2016 

Mr. HUDSON. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor the life and legacy of my friend and a 
true American patriot, Mr. Leonard Suggs. 

Born in Cumberland County in 1945, Leon-
ard never met a stranger. Everyone that ever 
has the pleasure of meeting him is left with a 
smile on their face. Leonard’s warm person-
ality lights up any room and his infectious 
humor often leaves everyone in stitches. Un-
commonly kind, Leonard measures his suc-
cess in life not by career accomplishments, of 
which there are many, but rather by the lives 
he touches and his connections with friends, 
neighbors, and especially the soldiers sta-
tioned at Ft. Bragg. 

Throughout his lifetime, Leonard Suggs has 
constantly devoted his time in the service of 
others and he does everything he can to make 
the world a better place. By staying actively in-
volved in the Fayetteville community, Leonard 
has created a legacy for which we all are 
grateful. As an unrelenting supporter of our 
men and women in uniform, Leonard has 
served as Bragg Special Activities Committee 
Secretary Treasurer for nearly 30 years. I am 
convinced you will never find a more patriotic 
American who is so committed to helping our 
soldiers and their families. 

Leonard Suggs was recently diagnosed with 
a terminal form of cancer and has elected to 
stop receiving treatment in preparation to 
leave this Earth in peace. Our thoughts and 
prayers are with the entire Suggs family as we 
celebrate and honor this remarkable man. It is 
my hope that Leonard lives out the remainder 
of his days in the comfort of the Lord knowing 
that while his time on Earth may be nearing 
an end, his legacy will live on in the hearts 
and minds of all of those he touched. 

I will personally always cherish the time I 
have spent with Leonard at Ft. Bragg and vis-
iting our men and women in uniform around 
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