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House of Representatives 
The House met at 10 a.m. and was 

called to order by the Speaker pro tem-
pore (Mr. FLEISCHMANN). 

f 

DESIGNATION OF SPEAKER PRO 
TEMPORE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore laid be-
fore the House the following commu-
nication from the Speaker: 

WASHINGTON, DC, 
September 8, 2016. 

I hereby appoint the Honorable CHARLES J. 
FLEISCHMANN to act as Speaker pro tempore 
on this day. 

PAUL D. RYAN, 
Speaker of the House of Representatives. 

f 

MORNING-HOUR DEBATE 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to the order of the House of Janu-
ary 5, 2016, the Chair will now recog-
nize Members from lists submitted by 
the majority and minority leaders for 
morning-hour debate. 

The Chair will alternate recognition 
between the parties, with each party 
limited to 1 hour and each Member 
other than the majority and minority 
leaders and the minority whip limited 
to 5 minutes, but in no event shall de-
bate continue beyond 11:50 a.m. 

f 

PAUSE AND REFLECT 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
New Jersey (Mr. LANCE) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. LANCE. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today as we approach the somber anni-
versary of the attacks of September 11, 
2001, to honor the memory of the inno-
cent people who perished on that ter-
rible day and extend our continued 
prayers and sympathy to their loved 
ones. 

For 15 years, I have stood at 
firehouses and schools, churches and 
veterans halls, and heard the stories of 
bravery and heroism from that morn-

ing that forever changed America. New 
Jersey lost more than 700 residents in 
the attacks, 81 of them from commu-
nities I represent here in Congress. 

Each personal story is remarkable in 
its own way, offering a different mem-
ory or perspective on the events of Sep-
tember 11. In hearing stories from that 
day, Americans relive that morning, 
recalling where they were when they 
heard the news of the planes that 
struck the World Trade Center, the 
sickening realization that our Nation 
was under attack, and the tremendous 
heroism and self-sacrifice of so many 
in New York, at the Pentagon, and on 
a plane over Shanksville, Pennsyl-
vania. 

Many of these stories are not new but 
need to be retold as a younger genera-
tion comes of age, that their neigh-
bors—innocent people in their commu-
nities—were targeted in an act of war 
upon this Nation, and from such hei-
nous acts came brave first responders, 
courageously initiating rescues, know-
ing their lives were in great danger, 
friends and coworkers helping each 
other to safety, and many young Amer-
icans who then answered a call to serv-
ice to protect and defend the United 
States. 

It is our duty to instill in the genera-
tions that follow respect and honor for 
the lives lost that terrible day and the 
lives lost in defense of our Nation in 
the years that have followed. It is our 
duty here in Congress to protect this 
Nation, to provide for the common de-
fense, and vividly to recall the pain of 
a wounded Nation so that we be aware 
always of what it takes to keep this 
Nation safe and free. 

The lives lost in the ensuing battles 
abroad have continued to try the foun-
dation of our will. We have proven 
steadfast in the commitment to our 
values. Our freedom and liberty have 
been protected by brave men and 
women who selflessly answered the call 
of service by volunteering for military 
service. 

No matter the challenges we face, we 
must remember that our Nation is 
truly blessed. I ask all Americans 
today to pause and reflect on the trag-
edy of September 11, 2001. Please pray 
for the victims and honor their mem-
ory. Please pay tribute to the men and 
women who serve and defend us today 
against the dangers we still face. May 
God bless them, and may God continue 
to bless the United States of America. 

f 

CROWN POINT, INDIANA, GUN 
SHOW 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The 
Chair recognizes the gentleman from 
Illinois (Mr. QUIGLEY) for 5 minutes. 

Mr. QUIGLEY. Mr. Speaker, ‘‘Gun to 
the right, no gun to the left’’ was the 
greeting I heard as I entered the Indus-
trial Arts Building in Crown Point, In-
diana. On this particular sunny Sunday 
afternoon in July, the enormous build-
ing was playing host to the Central In-
diana Gun and Knife Show. 

The building, which sits on the Lake 
County Fairgrounds, plays host to gar-
den shows, home improvement and 
craft vendors; but on this date, the 90- 
year-old brick building was featuring 
products that were of an altogether dif-
ferent nature. 

As they enter the gun show, visitors 
carrying weapons had to demonstrate 
to security that their guns were not 
loaded, while those not carrying could 
enter without screening. I paid my $5 
entry and was asked if I resided in Indi-
ana. Being an Illinois resident, I an-
swered no and received a hand stamp 
depicting me as out of State. 

At first glance, I saw kids hanging 
around vendors, munching on hot dogs. 
There were several hundred people in 
attendance by lunchtime, mostly 
White, middle-aged men, but a few 
women as well. Judging by the license 
plates in the parking lot, there were a 
healthy number of gun enthusiasts 
from my home State of Illinois in at-
tendance. 
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