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level of pre-hospital care in the State. Under 
his guidance, Empress has been recognized 
as the leader in the ambulance industry with 
over 400 EMS professionals on staff and a 
fleet of over 90 vehicles. Mike was asked to 
serve on the Saint Joseph’s Medical Center’s 
Board of Directors in 2005, and his extensive 
knowledge of the healthcare industry, espe-
cially in the field of emergency services has 
been a tremendous asset to Saint Joseph’s 
Medical Center for the many years he has 
served as a member of its Board of Trustees. 

Mike also finds many ways to give back to 
the community that has afforded him so much. 
In addition to volunteering his time to Saint Jo-
seph’s Medical Center’s Board of Trustees, 
where he is part of the Executive Committee, 
he is also on the Board of the Yonkers Police 
Athletic League and the Yonkers Chamber of 
Commerce. 

But Mike’s great love is always family. He 
has been married to his high school sweet-
heart, Bobbi, for over 27 years. Together they 
have raised five wonderful and accomplished 
children. Danielle, the head athletic trainer for 
Mercy College, Hayle, a full-time performer for 
Disney World FL, Michael, a recent college 
graduate who now works at Empress, and 
Jack and Lyndsey, a junior and sophomore re-
spectively at Pleasantville High School. 

This year, St. Joseph’s Medical Center is 
honoring Mike at their annual Autumn in New 
York Ball. He is incredible deserving of this 
great honor. Congratulations to Mike and his 
family. 
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21ST CENTURY CURES ACT 

HON. MICHAEL G. FITZPATRICK 
OF PENNSYLVANIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, I do sup-
port many of the measures in the 21st Century 
Cures Act. It will increase choice, access, and 
quality in health care for all Americans by ac-
celerating the discovery and development of 
new treatments for patients. The bill ensures 
our nation’s standing as the biomedical inno-
vation capital of the world. It provides funding 
at the National Institutes for Health to support 
cancer research and make progress in pre-
vention, screening, treatment, and care. 

The 21st Century Cures act will establish a 
data collection system to track the incidence 
and prevalence of neurological conditions, 
which includes MS. This new data system 
could one day lead to a cure for debilitating 
diseases, which have aspects we currently do 
not understand. 

I wish this bill contained the ‘‘Right-to-Try,’’ 
which would give my constituents Matt Bellina 
and Frank Mongiello, both diagnosed with 
ALS, access to experimental and clinical stage 
treatments to improve their quality of life. 

But this bill does emphasize rare disease 
research and provides funding which will have 
a meaningful impact on those afflicted with 
rare diseases like ALS, Alzheimer’s, Parkin-
son’s, Duchenne muscular dystrophy, and 
mitochondrial disease. As a member of the 
Mitochondrial Disease Caucus and Rare Dis-
ease Caucus, I know this bill will have a big 
impact for those like Liz Kennerley, who has 
been a passionate advocate for all those suf-
fering from mitochondrial disease and other 
rare diseases. 

By establishing new review pathways at the 
FDA, 21st Century Cures will advance new 
drug therapies for patients with rare, serious, 
or life-threatening disease. It gives my young 
constituents living with Duchenne’s, like Jake 
Wesley, a chance to live a longer, better life. 

The 21st Century Cures helps individuals 
and families in mental health crisis. It will 
serve to increase access to trained profes-
sionals, improves communications between 
doctors and families while ensuring that fed-
eral funds are applied to programs that work, 
supporting organizations in Bucks County like 
the Lenape Valley Foundation and the Na-
tional Alliance on Mental Illness. Enhancing 
crisis response, promoting early intervention, 
and integrating mental health, substance use 
and primary care will go a long way in helping 
the one in five individuals who have a mental 
health condition so they can live well and 
thrive. 

The bill will grant funds to states to supple-
ment opioid abuse prevention and treatment 
activities, such as improving prescription drug 
monitoring programs. 

Mr. Speaker, while this bill accelerates the 
development of life-saving devices and thera-
pies, the 21st Century Cures Act fails to pro-
tect patients against dangerous medical de-
vices. For the past two years, I’ve sought 
medical device reform in Congress. I sought to 
raise awareness and advance legislation that 
protected patients and altered FDA processes 
and procedures to allow for maximum innova-
tion and maximum safety. Congress ignored 
the victims affected by faulty, dangerous med-
ical devices and what is more disappointing 
we were denied a hearing. 

I support the measures in the 21st Century 
Cures Act, but I am concerned that it fails to 
provide adequate medical device protections 
for patients. There are two amendments miss-
ing to the 21st Century Cures Act: the Medical 
Device Guardians Act and Ariel Grace’s Law. 
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CONGRATULATIONS RICK 
ZIEGENFUSS FOR RECEIVING 
THE 2016 MISSOURIAN AWARD 
DEVELOPER OF THE YEAR 

HON. BILLY LONG 
OF MISSOURI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Mr. LONG. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to rec-
ognize and congratulate Rick Ziegenfuss, for 
receiving the 2016 Missourian Award. Rick is 
the city administrator for Hollister, Missouri. 
The Missourian Award recognizes native Mis-
sourians for their outstanding accomplish-
ments in business, civic, arts or politics. 

It is important that we strive to better the 
community we live in and it is apparent that 
Mr. Ziegenfuss from Missouri’s 7th Congres-
sional District has continually done that. 

The Missourian Award, created by local 
Springfield business and community leader 
Ralph Slavens and his late wife Corrine, is a 
prestigious award that acknowledges the most 
accomplished citizens of Missouri and to re-
ceive the award one must have been born in 
the state of Missouri. 

I am proud of the initiative that Mr. 
Ziegenfuss has taken to make the great state 
of Missouri the best it can be. I urge my col-
leagues to join me in congratulating him on 
this tremendous honor. 

HONORING RICHARD H. GREIF, MD 

HON. ELIOT L. ENGEL 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Mr. ENGEL. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor a distinguished member of the commu-
nity whose work at St. Joseph’s Medical Cen-
ter has been of great service to countless 
Westchester residents, Dr. Richard H. Greif. 

Dr. Greif was born in New York City and 
grew up in Morristown, New Jersey. After high 
school, he attended Cornell University, major-
ing in biology. He then went on to medical 
school at New York Medical College where he 
was inducted into Alpha Omega Alpha—the 
Medical Honor Society—and graduated in 
1975. After medical school he completed an 
Internal Medical Residency at Metropolitan 
Hospital and a Cardiovascular Disease Fellow-
ship at St. Vincent’s Medical Center in New 
York City. 

Dr. Greif joined the Saint Joseph’s Medical 
Staff in 1981. He is currently President of the 
Medical Board and has been serving as the 
Co-Director of Cardiology since 2013. He has 
been a member of the Saint Joseph’s Medical 
Board and Chairman of the Quality and Per-
formance Improvement Committee for over 30 
years. He has been an Assistant Professor at 
New York Medical College since 1981; Ad-
junct Professor at Manhattan College since 
the late 1980’s and is a Fellow of the Amer-
ican College of Cardiology. 

Dr. Greif has supervised the Medical Cen-
ter’s Family Medicine Resident ICU and Cardi-
ology rotations since 1981 and precepted New 
York Medical College students from 1983 to 
2015. In the field of research he was the co- 
investigator in the landmark multi-center TIMI 
2B trial testing thrombolytic therapy for acute 
myocardial infarction. He has been listed 
many times among ‘‘Best Doctors in West-
chester’’ by Westchester Magazine and recog-
nized by Castle Connolly as a ‘‘Top Doctor’’ in 
the New York Metro Area from 2006 to 2016. 

Of course, Dr. Greif’s true passion is his 
family. He resides in Westchester with his wife 
Victoria. They have three children; Arel, Dylan 
and Shana. Arel works in New York City in the 
media industry, Dylan is a graphic designer 
working and living in Brooklyn and Shana is a 
second year Internal Medicine Resident in Los 
Angeles. All three children did volunteer work 
at Saint Joseph’s. 

This year, St. Joseph’s Medical Center is 
honoring Dr. Richard Greif at their annual Au-
tumn in New York Ball. I want to take the op-
portunity to congratulate him on this wonderful 
honor, and thank him for all of his amazing 
work in the community. He is most deserving 
of this incredible recognition. 

f 

HONORING THE LIFE OF JOHN J. 
AREIAS 

HON. JIM COSTA 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Mr. COSTA. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor the life and achievements of John J. 
Areias, who recently passed away this week 
at age 96. Mr. Areias was an exceptional fa-
ther, grandfather, husband, dairyman, and 
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friend, whose depth of commitment to improv-
ing the San Joaquin Valley can be matched 
only by his depth of commitment to those he 
loved. 

Born on April 21st, 1921 to Jesse Areias 
and Genevieve Silva Areias, John J. Areias 
was a first generation Portuguese-American 
from Volta, California. His family moved from 
Portugal’s Azore Islands to California to begin 
a dairy, and to support a family. John’s father 
put $10 down on 640 acres of land in western 
Merced County, where John spent much of his 
youth learning how to be a dairyman along-
side his eight siblings. He was the valedic-
torian of Volta elementary, and moved on to 
graduate from Los Banos high school in 1940. 

John had an insatiable hunger for commu-
nity involvement, which began with his high 
school’s student government, and the Future 
Farmers of America. His leadership position in 
the FFA granted him many opportunities early 
on, one of which called on him to present cat-
tle at the California State Fair. This is also 
where he would meet the love of his life, 
Mary, whom he married shortly thereafter. 
John and his brother Jesse then moved on to 
begin their own dairy, which quickly became 
the first grade A dairy in the Los Banos Dairy-
men’s Association. Eventually their dairy be-
came one of the biggest and most successful 
in California, but they never lost sight of the 
role family should play in their business. 
John’s children played the same part that he 
did when he was younger, lending a hand in 
day to day dairy operations to support the 
family business. 

John was also very politically connected 
with Central California Democratic circles. He 
served as Chairman of the Merced County 
Democratic Central Committee and had been 
a delegate to the Democratic National Con-
vention in 1960, where John F. Kennedy 
earned the nomination of his party as can-
didate for President of the United States. John 
was also a devout Catholic, serving as the 
Grand Knight for the Knights of Columbus. 

John is survived by his four children, 
Marcia, Lucia, Kathleen, and Rusty, all of 
whom left John immensely proud of their suc-
cess. He is also succeeded by his five grand-
children, Eva, Nina, Bianca, Alexis, and Aus-
tin. 

Mr. Speaker, I rise to commemorate John 
Areias Sr.’s life for his outstanding character 
as an entrepreneur, public servant, family 
man, and friend. His life is a testament to the 
power of the American dream, and the joy that 
can accompany it. He was a powerful role 
model for the people of the Central Valley, 
and will be deeply missed by everyone that 
had the pleasure of knowing him. I join John’s 
family in honoring his life, and love for our 
community. 

f 

HONORING THE CONNECTICUT 
MENTAL HEALTH CENTER ON 
THE OCCASION OF THEIR 50TH 
ANNIVERSARY 

HON. ROSA L. DeLAURO 
OF CALIFORNIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Ms. DELAURO. Mr. Speaker, it is with my 
sincere thanks and appreciation that I rise 
today to join the many who have gathered to 

mark the 50th Anniversary of the Connecticut 
Mental Health Center—a remarkable mile-
stone for this exceptional institution. 

In 1963, President John F. Kennedy signed 
into law the Community Mental Health Act, a 
pioneering piece of legislation that sought to 
transform the way in which we, as a society, 
approached mental health treatment. It was 
from this legislation that the Connecticut Men-
tal Health Center, a unique partnership be-
tween the State of Connecticut and Yale Uni-
versity, was inspired and conceived. Opening 
its doors in 1966, CMHC has been an invalu-
able resource to our community for half a cen-
tury, not only as a service provider but as a 
leader in research, education, and community. 

Each year, more than five thousand of our 
most vulnerable citizens count on the Center 
for comprehensive clinical, addiction, and re-
habilitative services. For fifty years, the Con-
necticut Mental Health Center has been trans-
forming the lives of those with mental illness 
and addiction issues by providing a safe 
space where they can find the services they 
need to live, work, learn, and participate fully 
in their community. 

Their outreach programs for the homeless, 
those who are at serious risk for mental ill-
ness, or involved with the criminal justice sys-
tem have helped to ensure that those most at 
risk are able to find the care they need. 
CMHC’s community education programs have 
helped community leaders better understand 
mental illness and addiction and their profes-
sional education programs have trained hun-
dreds in Psychiatry, Neuropharmacology, Psy-
chology, Psychiatric Nursing, as well as Pas-
toral and Social Work. In addition, CMHC is a 
national leader in cutting-edge research and 
innovation. 

CMHC’s mission statement concludes with a 
message to which they have strived for fifty 
years: ‘‘Continued success means trans-
forming our systems of care to be suitable to 
the new environment, while preserving our 
fundamental commitment to excellent culturally 
sensitive, clinical, rehabilitative, and preventa-
tive services, linked to nationally recognized 
research and educational programs.’’ It is their 
dedication to continually ensuring that the care 
they are providing is meeting the changing 
needs of their clients and community that has 
been their greatest gift. 

I have had the privilege to work with the 
Connecticut Mental Health Center on a variety 
of issues over my tenure in Congress and 
have always been in awe of the outstanding 
work that they do. Today, as administrators, 
staff, supporters, and community leaders gath-
er to mark this golden milestone, I am hon-
ored to extend my heartfelt congratulations to 
the Connecticut Mental Health Center on their 
50th Anniversary. I have no doubt that they 
will continue their invaluable work for many 
more years to come. 

f 

TRIBUTE TO PAUL E. SCHICKLER 

HON. DAVID YOUNG 
OF IOWA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Mr. YOUNG of Iowa. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize Paul E. Schickler, Presi-
dent of DuPont Pioneer, ahead of his retire-
ment on January 1, 2017. Paul began his ten-

ure with Pioneer as an accountant back in 
1974. His 42 years of dedicated service has 
produced enduring success, and with his lead-
ership, the company has experienced some of 
its most prosperous and successful years of 
operation. 

Paul joined Pioneer after receiving an un-
dergraduate degree from Drake University. He 
displayed a tireless work ethic as he pursued 
his MBA while working full-time at Pioneer. It 
was apparent from the start that he was des-
tined for excellence within the company. 
Throughout his years at Pioneer, Paul has 
served in a number of roles, including: Con-
troller; Vice President of Human Resources, 
Learning and Development, Communications 
and Real Estate Management; Vice President, 
Director, Latin America Operations, later ex-
panding to include Mexico and Africa; Vice 
President, International Operations; Agriculture 
and Nutrition Business Development Director; 
and finally, in 2007, DuPont Vice President 
and the 11th President of Pioneer. 

Paul’s commitment to global agriculture and 
the fight against world hunger goes even be-
yond his work at Pioneer. He and his wife 
Claudia have used their own personal success 
to benefit the World Food Prize, donating re-
sources to expand the foundation’s Global 
Youth Institute to every Iowa high school. For 
the last several years Paul has shared his vi-
sion for global agriculture with the delegation 
of youth in attendance of the World Food 
Prize Week. 

Mr. Speaker, I applaud and congratulate 
Paul on his upcoming retirement. He will now 
be able to spend his well-deserved time off 
sharing his love of golfing and skiing with his 
daughters, their husbands, and six grand-
children. It is with great honor that I recognize 
him today. I ask that my colleagues in the 
United States House of Representatives join 
me in recognizing Paul’s accomplishments 
and service and in wishing him and his family 
nothing but the best. 

f 

CHARITY DOES NOT COME FROM 
GOVERNMENT AGENCIES 

HON. JOHN J. DUNCAN, JR. 
OF TENNESSEE 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, November 30, 2016 

Mr. DUNCAN of Tennessee. Mr. Speaker, 
the best, most effective charity does not come 
from government agencies, which mainly help 
those who work for the agencies. The best, 
kindest charity comes from one individual 
helping another. I often tell young people to try 
to pull themselves away from their very addict-
ive screens (computer, iPads, television) and 
go out and help a live human being. Their 
lives will mean more if they do. That is why I 
was so impressed by Bob Hunt’s column in 
the November 25 Knoxville News-Sentinel by 
the work started by Christine Maentz, and car-
ried on now by her, her husband Scott, and 
others helping feed Knoxville’s homeless. I 
would like to call this column to the attention 
of my colleagues and other readers. 

DROPS OF CHARITY BETTER THAN DROUGHT 
(By Bob Hunt) 

‘‘In the first centuries of Christianity, the 
hungry were fed at a personal sacrifice, the 
naked were clothed at a personal sacrifice, 
the homeless were sheltered at a personal 
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