AUTHENTICATED
U.S. GOVERNMENT
INFORMATION

GPO

11

115TH CONGRESS
18T SESSION S. 1 1 44

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to encourage business creation
by allowing faster recovery of start-up and organizational expenses, to
simplify accounting methods for small businesses, to expand expensing
and provide accelerated cost recovery to encourage investment in new
plants and equipment, and for other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

May 17, 2017
Mr. THuNE (for himself and Mr. ROBERTS) introduced the following bill;
which was read twice and referred to the Committee on Finance

A BILL

To amend the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 to encourage
business creation by allowing faster recovery of start-
up and organizational expenses, to simplify accounting
methods for small businesses, to expand expensing and
provide accelerated cost recovery to encourage investment

in new plants and equipment, and for other purposes.

1 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tiwves of the United States of America in Congress assembled,



[E—

S O o0 9 N U BB W

2
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; AMENDMENT OF 1986 CODE;

TABLE OF CONTENTS.

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the
“Investment in New Ventures and KEconomic Success
Today Act of 2017 or the “INVEST Act of 20177,

(b) AMENDMENT OF 1986 CODE.—Except as other-
wise expressly provided, whenever in this Act an amend-
ment or repeal i1s expressed in terms of an amendment
to, or repeal of, a section or other provision, the reference
shall be considered to be made to a section or other provi-
sion of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986.

(¢) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—
See. 1. Short title; amendment of 1986 Code; table of contents.

TITLE I—START-UP AND ORGANIZATIONAL BUSINESS EXPENSES

See. 101. Unification and expansion of deduction for start-up and organiza-
tional expenditures.

TITLE II—ACCOUNTING METHODS

See. 201. Modifications of gross receipts test for use of cash method of account-
ing by corporations and partnerships.

See. 202. Clarification of inventory accounting rules for small businesses.

See. 203. Modification of rules for capitalization and inclusion in inventory
costs of certain expenses.

Sec. 204. Increase in gross receipts test for construction contract exception to
percentage of completion method.

TITLE HI—MODIFICATIONS OF EXPENSING AND COST RECOVERY
RULES

Subtitle A—Expensing Rules
See. 301. Modifications of rules for expensing depreciable business assets.
Subtitle B—Cost Recovery Rules

See. 311. 50-pereent expensing made permanent.

See. 312. Modifications of treatment of certain farm property.

See. 313. Secretarial requirement to reexamine economice depreciation for class-
es of depreciable property.

oS 1144 IS



O o0 9 N U B WD =

—
N = O

13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

Q
(3}

See. 314. Modifications to depreciation limitations on luxury automobiles and
personal use property.
See. 315. Reduction in amortization period for intangibles.

TITLE I—START-UP AND ORGA-
NIZATIONAL BUSINESS EX-
PENSES

SEC. 101. UNIFICATION AND EXPANSION OF DEDUCTION
FOR START-UP AND ORGANIZATIONAL EX-
PENDITURES.

(a) UNIFICATION.—

(1) IN GENERAL.—Subsection (a) of section
195 is amended by inserting “and organizational”
after “start-up”.

Sub-

(2)  ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES.
section (¢) of section 195 is amended by adding at
the end the following new paragraph:

“(3) ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES.—The

term ‘organizational expenditures’ means any ex-

penditure which:
“(A) 1s incident to the creation of a cor-

poration or a partnership,
“(B) is chargeable to capital account, and
“(C) is of a character which, if expended
incident to the creation of a corporation or a
partnership having an ascertainable life, would

be amortizable over such life.”.

oS 1144 IS



O© o0 2 O WD A W N e

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O W BN WD = ©

4
(3) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
195(b)(1) i1s amended by inserting ‘“‘or organiza-
tional”” after “‘start-up’ each place it appears.

(b) DOLLAR AMOUNTS AND AMORTIZATION PE-

RIOD.—

(1) DOLLAR AMOUNTS.

(A) INCREASE.—Clause (11) of section
195(b)(1)(A) 1s amended—

(1) by striking “$5,000” and inserting

“$50,000”, and

(1) by striking “$50,000” and insert-
ing “$100,000",

(B) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—Para-
oraph (3) of section 195(b) is amended to read
as follows:

“(3) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In the
case of any taxable year beginning after December
31, 2018, the $50,000 and $100,000 amounts in
paragraph (1)(A)(11) shall each be increased by an
amount equal to—

“(A) such dollar amount, multiplied by

“(B) the cost-of-living adjustment deter-
mined under section 1(f)(3) for the calendar

yvear in which the taxable year begins, by sub-

oS 1144 IS



O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

| \O JEE \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

5

stituting ‘calendar year 2017 for ‘calendar year

1992 in subparagraph (B) thereof.

If any amount as increased under the preceding sen-
tence is not a multiple of $1,000, such amount shall
be rounded to the nearest multiple of $1,000.”.

(2)  AMORTIZATION  PERIOD.—Subparagraph
(B) of section 195(b)(1) is amended by striking
“180-month period” and inserting “120-month pe-
riod”.

(3) ALLOCATION OF LIMIT TO INITIAL START-

UP AND ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES.—Section
195(b) is amended—
(A) by striking “If”” in paragraph (1) and
inserting “Subject to paragraph (4), if”’, and
(B) by adding at the end the following new
paragraph:
“(4) SPECIAL RULES FOR AGGREGATION OF
INITIAL EXPENDITURES OF CORPORATIONS AND

PARTNERSIHIPS.

For purposes of paragraph (1), if,
at the time a corporation or partnership first begins
the active conduct of one or more trades or busi-
nesses, a taxpayer has both start-up expenditures
with respect to such trades or businesses and organi-

zational expenditures with respect to such entity—

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

[\© TN NG TN N T NG N NG I NS B S e e T e e T e T e e T
L A W NN = DO O XN R W NN~ O

6

“(A) any election under paragraph (1)
shall cover both such start-up and organiza-
tional expenditures,

“(B) the amount of the deduction under
paragraph (1)(A) with respect to all such start-
up and organizational expenditures shall not ex-
ceed the limitation under clause (i1) of para-
oraph (1)(A), and

“(C) the amount of such start-up and or-
canizational expenditures remaining after such
deduction shall be amortized under paragraph
(1)(B).”.

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(1)(A) Part VIII of subchapter B of chapter 1
1s amended by striking section 248.

(B) Section 56(g)(4)(D)(i1) is amended by
striking “Sections 173 and 248" and inserting “‘Sec-
tion 173",

(C) Section 170(b)(2)(D)(i1) is amended by
striking “‘(except section 248)”.

(D) Section 312(n)(3) is amended by striking
“Sections 173 and 248" and inserting “Sections 173
and 1957,

(E) Section 535(b)(3) is amended by striking

“(except section 248)”.

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B e ) W ) TR ~S O T NO R e

7
(F) Section 545(b)(3) is amended by striking
“(except section 248)”.
(G) Section 834(c)(7) is amended by striking
“(except section 248)".
(H) Section 852(b)(2)(C) is amended by strik-
ing “‘(except section 248)".
(I) Section 857(b)(2)(A) is amended by striking
“(except section 248)”.
(JJ) Section 1363(b)(3) is amended by striking
“section 248”7 and inserting ‘“‘section 1957,
(K) Section 1375(b)(1)(B)(i) is amended by
striking “‘(other than the deduction allowed by sec-
tion 248, relating to organization expenditures)”.
(L) The table of sections for part VIII of sub-
chapter B of chapter 1 is amended by striking the
item relating to section 248.
(2)(A) Section 709 1s amended to read as fol-
lows:
“SEC. 709. TREATMENT OF SYNDICATION FEES.

“No deduction shall be allowed under this chapter to
a partnership or to any partner of the partnership for any
amounts paid or incurred to promote the sale of (or to
sell) an interest in the partnership.”.

(B) The item relating to section 709 in the

table of sections for part I of subchapter K of chap-

oS 1144 IS



8
ter 1 is amended by striking “ORGANIZATION

[E—

AND”.

(d) CLERICAL AMENDMENTS.

(1) The heading of section 195 is amended by
striking “EXPENDITURES’ and inserting “AND
ORGANIZATIONAL EXPENDITURES’ .

(2) The item relating to section 195 in the table

of contents of part VI of subchapter B of chapter 1

O o0 9 AN U B~ W

1s amended to read as follows:

“See. 195. Start-up and organizational expenditures.”.
10 (e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
I1 this section shall apply to elections which first take effect

12 for taxable years beginning after December 31, 2017.

13 TITLE II—ACCOUNTING
14 METHODS

15 SEC. 201. MODIFICATIONS OF GROSS RECEIPTS TEST FOR

16 USE OF CASH METHOD OF ACCOUNTING BY
17 CORPORATIONS AND PARTNERSHIPS.

18 (a) MODIFICATIONS OF GROSS RECEIPTS TEST.—

19 (1) IN GENERAL.—So much of section 448(c)
20 as precedes paragraph (2) is amended to read as fol-
21 lows:

22 “(¢) GROSS RECEIPTS TEST.—

23 “(1) IN GENERAL.—A corporation or partner-
24 ship meets the gross receipts test of this subsection
25 for any taxable year if the average annual gross re-

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

|\ JEE O R NS R NS N O R T T T S S S S S e
A W O = O O 0NN N N R WD = O

9

ceipts of such entity for the 3-taxable-year period
ending with the taxable year which precedes such
taxable year does not exceed the applicable dollar
limit.”.

(2) APPLICABLE DOLLAR LIMIT.—Subsection
(¢) of section 448 is amended by adding at the end
the following new paragraph:

“(4) APPLICABLE DOLLAR LIMIT.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The applicable dollar
limit is $15,000,000.

“(B) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION.—In
the case of any taxable year beginning after De-
cember 31, 2018, the $15,000,000 amount
under subparagraph (A) shall be increased by
an amount equal to—

“(i) such dollar amount, multiplied by
“(i1) the cost-of-living adjustment de-
termined under section 1(f)(3) for the cal-
endar year in which the taxable year be-

eins, by substituting ‘calendar year 2017

for ‘calendar year 1992’ in subparagraph

(B) thereof.

If any amount as increased under the preceding

sentence 1s not a multiple of $1,000, such

oS 1144 IS



O© o0 3 O WD A W N e

| \O I \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

10

amount shall be rounded to the nearest multiple
of $1,000.”.

(3) CHANGE IN METHOD OF ACCOUNTING.—

Paragraph (7) of section 448(d) is amended—

(A) by striking “In the case of”’ and all
that follows up to subparagraph (A) and insert-
ing: “If a taxpayer changes its method of ac-
counting because the taxpayer is prohibited
from using the cash receipts and disbursement
method of accounting by reason of subsection
(a) or is no longer prohibited from using such
method by reason of such subsection—"", and

(B) by inserting “and” at the end of sub-
paragraph (A), by striking ““, and”’at the end of
subparagraph (B) and inserting a period, and

by striking subparagraph (C).

(4) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.
(A) Paragraph (3) of section 448(b) is
amended to read as follows:

“(3) ENTITIES SATISFYING GROSS RECEIPTS

TEST.—Paragraphs (1) and (2) of subsection (a)
shall not apply to any corporation or partnership for
any taxable year if such entity meets the gross re-

ceipts test of subsection (¢) for the taxable year.”.

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N B W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e D e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O W BN~ WD = ©

11
(B) Clause (111) of section 172(b)(1)(E) 1s
amended by inserting “, applied by substituting
‘$5,000,000” for ‘the applicable dollar limit’ in
paragraph (1) thereof,” after “section 448(c)”.
(b) APPLICATION OF MODIFICATIONS TO FARMING

CORPORATIONS.

(1) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section
447(d) 1s amended to read as follows:

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A corporation meets the re-
quirements of this subsection for any taxable year
with respect to its gross receipts if the corporation
meets the gross receipts test of section 448(c¢) for
the taxable year.”.

(2) FAMILY CORPORATIONS.

Paragraph (2) of
section 447(d) i1s amended—

(A) by striking subparagraph (A) and in-
serting the following:

“(A) IN GENERAL.—In the case of a fam-
ily corporation, in applying section 448(¢) for
purposes of paragraph (1)—

“(1) paragraph (1) of section 448(c)
shall be applied by substituting the appli-
cable family corporation limit for the appli-

cable dollar limit, and

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

O TN NG I N T NG I NG R NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ N N O N N = = N e RN - BN B e ) W ) B ~SU O I NO S e

12
“(11) the rules of subparagraph (B)
shall apply in computing gross receipts.”,
(B) Clause (i) of section 447(d)(2)(B) 1s
amended by striking “‘the last sentence of para-
oraph (1)” and inserting ‘‘paragraph (2) of sec-
tion 448(c)”’, and
(C) by adding at the end the following new
subparagraph:
“(D) APPLICABLE FAMILY CORPORATION
LIMIT.—
“(1) IN GENERAL.—The applicable
family corporation limit is $25,000,000.
“(11) ADJUSTMENT FOR INFLATION,—
In the case of any taxable year beginning
after December 31, 2018, the $25,000,000
amount under clause (1) shall be increased
by an amount equal to—
“(I) such dollar amount, multi-
plied by
“(IT) the cost-of-living adjust-
ment determined under section 1(f)(3)
for the calendar year in which the tax-
able year begins, by substituting ‘cal-
endar year 2017 for ‘calendar year

1992’ in subparagraph (B) thereof.

oS 1144 IS



13

1 If any amount as increased under the pre-
2 ceding sentence is mnot a multiple of
3 $1,000, such amount shall be rounded to
4 the nearest multiple of $1,000.”.

5 (3) CHANGE IN METHOD OF ACCOUNTING.—
6 Section 447(f) is amended—

7 (A) by striking “In the case of”” and all
8 that follows up to paragraph (1) and inserting:
9 “If a taxpayer changes its method of account-
10 ing because the taxpayer is required to use an
11 accrual method of accounting by reason of sub-
12 section (a) or is no longer required to use such
13 method by reason of such subsection—"", and

14 (B) by striking paragraph (2) and insert-
15 ng:

16 “(2) such change shall be treated as initiated
17 by the taxpayer, and”.

18 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
19 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after

20 December 31, 2017.

21 SEC. 202. CLARIFICATION OF INVENTORY ACCOUNTING

22 RULES FOR SMALL BUSINESSES.

23 (a) CLARIFICATION OF INVENTORY RULES.

24 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 471 is amended by
25 redesignating subsection (¢) as subsection (d) and by

oS 1144 IS



1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

To USE INVENTORIES.

14

inserting after subsection (b) the following new sub-
section:

“(¢) SMALL BUSINESS TAXPAYERS NOT REQUIRED

“(1) IN GENERAL.—A qualified taxpayer shall
not be required to use mmventories under this section
for a taxable year.

“(2) TREATMENT OF TAXPAYERS NOT USING

INVENTORIES.—A qualified taxpayer who is not re-
quired under this subsection to use inventories with
respect to any property for a taxable year beginning
after December 31, 2017, may treat such property
as an incidental material or supply for such taxable
year.

“(3) QUALIFIED TAXPAYER.—For purposes of
this subsection, the term ‘qualified taxpayer’ means,
with respect to any taxable year, a taxpayer who
meets the gross receipts test of section 448(c¢) for
the taxable year. Such term shall not include a tax
shelter prohibited from using the cash receipts and
disbursements method of accounting under section
448(a)(3).

“(4) COORDINATION WITH SECTION 481.—If a
taxpayer changes its method of accounting because

the taxpayer is not required to use inventories by

oS 1144 IS



15

1 reason of paragraph (1) or is required to use inven-
2 tories because such paragraph no longer applies to
3 the taxpayer

4 “(A) such change shall be treated as initi-
5 ated by the taxpayer, and

6 “(B) such change shall be treated as made
7 with the consent of the Secretary.”.

8 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Subsection (¢)
9 of section 263A is amended by adding at the end the
10 following new paragraph:
11 “(8) EXCLUSION FROM INVENTORY RULES.
12 Nothing in this section shall require the use of in-
13 ventories for any taxable year by a qualified tax-
14 payer (within the meaning of section 471(¢)(3)) who
15 18 not required to use inventories under section 471
16 for such taxable year.”.
17 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

18 this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
19 December 31, 2017.

20 SEC. 203. MODIFICATION OF RULES FOR CAPITALIZATION

21 AND INCLUSION IN INVENTORY COSTS OF
22 CERTAIN EXPENSES.
23 (a) GROSS RECEIPTS EXCEPTION TO APPLY TO

24 PROPERTY PRODUCED BY THE TAXPAYER.—Section

oS 1144 IS



16

I 263A(b) 1s amended by striking all that follows paragraph

2 (1) and inserting the following new paragraphs:

3 “(2) PROPERTY ACQUIRED FOR RESALE.—Real
4 or personal property described i section 1221(a)(1)
5 which is acquired by the taxpayer for resale.

6 “(3) EXCEPTION FOR SMALL BUSINESSES.

7 This section shall not apply to any property pro-
8 duced or acquired by the taxpayer during any tax-
9 able year if the taxpayer is a qualified taxpayer (as
10 defined in section 471(¢)(3)) for the taxable year.

11 “(4) FiLMms, SOUND RECORDINGS, BOOKS,
12 ETC.—For purposes of this subsection, the term
13 ‘tangible personal property’ shall include a film,
14 sound recording, video tape, book, or similar prop-
15 erty.

16 “(5) COORDINATION WITH SECTION 481.—If a
17 taxpayer changes its method of accounting because
18 this section does not apply to the taxpayer by reason
19 of the exception under paragraph (3) or this section
20 applies to the taxpayer because such exception no
21 longer applies to the taxpayer—
22 “(A) such change shall be treated as initi-
23 ated by the taxpayer, and

24 “(B) such change shall be treated as made
25 with the consent of the Secretary.”.

oS 1144 IS



17

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2017,

SEC. 204. INCREASE IN GROSS RECEIPTS TEST FOR CON-

STRUCTION CONTRACT EXCEPTION TO PER-
CENTAGE OF COMPLETION METHOD.
(a) INCREASE.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Clause (i1) of section
460(e)(1)(B) 1s amended to read as follows:
“(11) who meets the gross receipts test
of section 448(c¢) for the taxable year in
which such contract is entered into.”.
(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(A) Paragraph (2) of section 460(e) is
amended to read as follows:
“(2) ADDITIONAL RULES FOR DETERMINING

GROSS  RECEIPTS.

For purposes of paragraph
(1)(B)(ii), the Secretary shall prescribe regulations
which provide attribution rules similar to section
448(¢) and which take into account gross receipts of
taxpayers who engage in construction contracts
through partnerships, joint ventures, and corpora-
tions and which would otherwise not be taken into

account under such section.”.

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N B W =

[\ I \© R \O I O R N e e e e e e T e e
W = O O 0N N RN = O

18

(B) Section 460(e) is amended by striking
paragraph (3) and by redesignating paragraphs
(4) through (6) as paragraphs (3) through (5),
respectively.

(C) The last sentence of section H6(a)(3) 1s
amended by striking “‘section 460(e)(6)” and
inserting ‘“‘section 460(e)(5)”.

(b) COORDINATION WITH SECTION 481.—Section
460(e), as amended by subsection (a), is amended by add-
ing at the end the following:

“(6) COORDINATION WITH SECTION 481.—If a
taxpayer changes its method of accounting because
subsections (a), (b), and (¢) (1) and (2) do not apply
by reason of the exception under paragraph (1)(B)
or such subsections apply to the taxpayer because

such exception no longer applies to the taxpayer

“(A) such change shall be treated as initi-
ated by the taxpayer,

“(B) such change shall be treated as made
with the consent of the Secretary, and

“(C) such change shall be permitted only
on a cut-off basis and no adjustments under

section 481(a) shall be made.” .

oS 1144 IS



19

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by

this section shall apply to contracts entered into after De-

cember 31, 2017, in taxable years ending after such date.

TITLE III—MODIFICATIONS OF
EXPENSING AND COST RE-
COVERY RULES
Subtitle A—Expensing Rules

SEC. 301. MODIFICATIONS OF RULES FOR EXPENSING DE-

PRECIABLE BUSINESS ASSETS.

(a) INCREASE IN LLIMITATION.—

by st

(1) DOLLAR LIMITATION.—Section 179(b)(1)
riking “$500,000” and inserting “$2,000,000”.

(2)  REDUCTION 1IN  LIMITATION.—Section

179(b)(2) is amended by striking “$2,000,000” and

inserting “$3,000,000".

oS 1144 IS

(3) INFLATION ADJUSTMENTS.

(A) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (A) of
section 179(b)(6) 1s amended—
(i) by striking “2015” and inserting
“2018”, and
(ii) by striking “calendar year 2014
in clause (i1) and inserting ‘“‘calendar year
20177,

(B) SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES.—Section

179(b)(6) is amended—



20
21
22
23
24
25

20
(i) by striking “paragraphs (1) and
(2)” in subparagraph (A) and inserting
“paragraphs (1), (2), and (5)(A)”, and
(i1) by inserting “(($100 in the case of
any increase in the amount under para-
oraph (5)(A))” after “$10,000” in sub-
paragraph (B).
(b) SECTION 179 PROPERTY TO INCLUDE QUALI-
FIED REAL PROPERTY.—
(1) IN GENERAL.—Subparagraph (B) of section
179(d)(1) 1s amended to read as follows:
“(B) which is—
“(1) section 1245 property (as defined
in section 1245(a)(3)), or
“(i1) qualified real property (as de-
fined in subsection (f)), and”.
(2) QUALIFIED REAL PROPERTY DEFINED.—
Section 179(f) 1s amended to read as follows:
“(f) QUALIFIED REAL PROPERTY.—For purposes of
this subsection, the term ‘qualified real property’ means—
“(1) any qualified improvement property de-
scribed in section 168(k)(3), and
“(2) any of the following improvements to non-
residential real property placed in service after the

date such property was first placed in service:

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NG N NG I N6 B S e T e e T e T e e T
b A W D= O 0 NN NN B, WD = O

21
“(A) Roofs.
“(B) Heating, ventilation, and air-condi-
tioning property.
“(C) Fire protection and alarm systems.
“(D) Security systems.”.

(¢) REPEAL OF EXCLUSION FOR CERTAIN PRrROP-
ERTY.—The last sentence of section 179(d)(1) 1s amended
by inserting ‘‘(other than paragraph (2) thereof)” after
“section H0(b)”.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to property placed in service in
taxable years beginning after December 31, 2017.

Subtitle B—Cost Recovery Rules
SEC. 311. 50-PERCENT EXPENSING MADE PERMANENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 168(k)(2) 1s amended to
read as follows:

“(2) QUALIFIED PROPERTY.—For purposes of
this subsection—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—The term ‘qualified

property’ means property-

“(1)(I) to which this section applies

which has a recovery period of 20 years or
less,

“(II) which is computer software (as

defined in section 167(f)(1)(B)) for which

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N Bk W =

O TN NG I N TR NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O T NO S e

22

a deduction 1is allowable under section
167(a) without regard to this subsection,

“(IIT) which is water utility property,
or

“(IV) which is qualified improvement
property, and

“(i1) the original use of which com-
mences with the taxpayer.

“(B) EXCEPTION FOR ALTERNATIVE DE-

PRECIATION PROPERTY.—The term ‘qualified

property’ shall not include any property to

which the alternative depreciation system under

subsection (g) applies, determined—

oS 1144 IS

“(1) without regard to paragraph (7)
of subsection (g) (relating to election to
have system apply), and

“(1) after application of section
280F(b) (relating to listed property with
limited business use).

“(C)) SPECIAL RULES.

“(1)  SALE-LEASEBACKS.

For pur-
poses of clause (i1) and subparagraph
(A)(i1), if property is—

“(I) originally placed in service

by a person, and



O o0 N N W B W =

| \O JEE \© R \O B \O R O R e e e e e T e e e e
A LW O = O VOV 0 N O B R WD = O

oS 1144 IS

23
“(IT) sold and leased back by

such person within 3 months after the
date such property was originally
placed in service,
such property shall be treated as originally
placed in service not earlier than the date
on which such property is used under the
leaseback referred to in subclause (II).
“(i1) SYNDICATION.—For purposes of
subparagraph (A)(i1), if—

“(I) property is originally placed
in service by the lessor of such prop-
erty,

“(IT) such property is sold by
such lessor or any subsequent pur-
chaser within 3 months after the date
such property was originally placed in
service (or, in the case of multiple
units of property subject to the same
lease, within 3 months after the date
the final unit i1s placed in service, so
long as the period between the time
the first unit is placed in service and

the time the last unit is placed n



O o0 N N W BB W

O TN NG N N TR NG I NG I NS B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG O N N = = N R - BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

24

service does not exceed 12 months),
and
“(III) the user of such property
after the last sale during such 3-
month period remains the same as
when such property was originally
placed in service,
such property shall be treated as originally
placed in service not earlier than the date
of such last sale.

“(D)  COORDINATION  WITH  SECTION

280F.—For purposes of section 280F—

oS 1144 IS

“(1) AUTOMOBILES.—In the case of a

passenger automobile (as defined in section
280K (d)(5)) which is qualified property,
the Secretary shall increase the limitation
under section 280F(a)(1)(A)(1) to an
amount equal to the lesser of—
“(I) 50 percent of the adjusted
basis of such automobile, or
“(I) $25,000.
“(11) LISTED PROPERTY.—The deduc-
tion allowable under paragraph (1) shall be
taken into account in computing any re-

capture amount under section 280F(b)(2).



O o0 N N B W=

| \O I \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e
A W D= O O 0NN N N R WD = O

25
“(11) INFLATION ADJUSTMENT.—In
the case of any taxable year beginning in
a calendar year after 2018, the $25,000
amount in clause (i) shall be increased by
an amount equal to—
“(I) such dollar amount, multi-
plied by
“(IT) the automobile price infla-
tion adjustment determined under sec-
tion 280K\(d)(7)(B)(i) for the calendar
year in which such taxable year begins
by substituting ‘20177 for ‘1987 in
subelause (II) thereof.
If any increase under the preceding sen-
tence is not a multiple of $100, such in-
crease shall be rounded to the nearest mul-
tiple of $100.

“(E) DEDUCTION ALLOWED IN COMPUTING

MINIMUM TAX.—For purposes of determining

alternative minimum taxable income under sec-

tion 55, the deduction under section 167 for

qualified property shall be determined without

regard to any adjustment under section 56.”.

(b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG N NG R e T e e T e T e T T =
L R W NN = O VO X NN N R W NN~ O

26
(1) AMENDMENTS RELATED TO 50-PERCENT
EXPENSING.—

(A) Each of the following provisions are
amended by striking “(2)(F)” each place it ap-
pears and inserting “(2)(D)”:

(i) Subparagraphs (A)(i), (B)(i), and

(D)(@1)(I) of section 168(k)(4).

(11) Section 168(k)(7).
(B) Section 168(k)(5) 1s amended—
(1) in subparagraph (A)—
(I) by striking “before January
1, 2020”7, and
(IT) by striking ‘“before such
date”’,
(i1) in subparagraph (B)(ii)—
(I) by inserting “crop or” after
“will have more than one”, and
(IT) by inserting “a marketable
crop or yield of”” after “begins bear-
ng”,
(iii) by striking “(2)(G)” in subpara-
eraph (E) and inserting “(2)(E)”, and
(iv) by striking subparagraph (F').
(C) Section 168(k), as amended by sub-

paragraphs (A)(i1) and (D), is amended by

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N D Bk W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV o0 NN O W BN~ WD = ©

27
striking paragraph (6) and by redesignating
paragraph (7) as paragraph (6).

(D) Section 168(k)(7), as in effect before
the amendments made by subparagraphs (A)(i1)
and (C), is amended by striking ‘“‘paragraphs
(1) and (2)(F)” and inserting ‘“‘paragraphs (1),
(2)(F), and (4)”.

(E) Section 168(k) is amended by striking
“ACQUIRED AFTER DECEMBER 31, 2007, AND
BEFORE JANUARY 1, 2020” in the heading
thereof.

(F) Subsections (e)(7)(B), (k)(4),
D(3)(A), (m)(2)(B)(1), and (n)(2)(B)(i) of see-
tion 168 are each amended by striking ‘‘bonus
depreciation” each place it appears in the text
and headings thereof and inserting ““50-percent
expensing’’.

(2) OTHER CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

(A) Section 168(1)(3)(B) is amended by
striking “subsection (k)(2)(D)” and inserting
“subsection (k)(2)(B)”.

(B) Section 168(1)(4) is amended by strik-
ing “‘subsection (k)(2)(E)” and inserting ‘‘sub-

section (k)(2)(C)”.

oS 1144 IS



28

1 (C) Section 168(1)(5) is amended by strik-
2 ing “‘subsection (k)(2)(G)” and inserting ‘‘sub-
3 section (k)(2)(E)”.
4 (D) Section 460(¢)(6)(B) is amended by
5 striking “which—"" and all that follows and in-
6 serting “‘which has a recovery period of 7 years
7 or less.”.
8 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATES.
9 (1) IN GENERAL.—The amendments made by
10 this section shall apply to property placed in service
11 after December 31, 2017, in taxable years ending
12 after such date.
13 (2) CERTAIN TECHNICAL CORRECTIONS.
14 (A) The amendments made by subsection
15 (b)(1)(B)(ii) shall apply to specified plants
16 planted or grafted after December 31, 2015.
17 (B) The amendment made by subsection
18 (b)(1)(D) shall apply to property placed in serv-
19 ice after December 31, 2015, in taxable years
20 ending after such date.
21 SEC. 312. MODIFICATIONS OF TREATMENT OF CERTAIN
22 FARM PROPERTY.
23 (a) TREATMENT OF CERTAIN FARM PROPERTY AS 5-

24 YEAR PROPERTY.—Clause (vii) of section 168(e)(3)(B) 1s

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N W B W =

O TN NG TN N T NG N NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ T NG O N N e = N e R < BN B o) W ) B ~S O I NO I e

29

amended by striking “after December 31, 2008, and which

is placed in service before January 1, 20107,

(b) REPEAL OF REQUIRED USE OF 150-PERCENT
DECLINING BALANCE METHOD.—Section 168(b)(2) 1s
amended by striking subparagraph (B) and by redesig-
nating subparagraphs (C) and (D) as subparagraphs (B)
and (C), respectively.

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section shall apply to property placed in service after
December 31, 2017, in taxable years ending after such
date.

SEC. 313. SECRETARIAL REQUIREMENT TO REEXAMINE
ECONOMIC DEPRECIATION FOR CLASSES OF
DEPRECIABLE PROPERTY.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (1) of section 168(i)
1s amended to read as follows:

“(1) CLASS LIFE.—

“(A) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in
this section, the term ‘class life” means the class
life (if any) which would be applicable with re-
spect to any property as of January 1, 1986,
under subsection (m) of section 167 (deter-
mined without regard to paragraph (4) and as
if the taxpayer had made an election under

such subsection). The reference in this para-

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N D Bk W =

[\© TN NG I N T NG I NG I NG B N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG N N N = = NN - BN B o) W ) B ~S O B NO R e

30

oraph to subsection (m) of section 167 shall be
treated as a reference to such subsection as in
effect on the day before the date of the enact-
ment of the Revenue Reconciliation Act of
1990.

“(B) SECRETARIAL AUTHORITY TO MODIFY
REV. PROC. 87-56.—

“(1) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary,
through the Office of Tax Analysis and in
consultation with the Bureau of Economic
Analysis of the Department of Commerce,
shall conduct an on-going study to—

“(I) determine, and develop a
schedule of, the economic depreciation
of the major categories of depreciable
property (other than specified prop-
erty) to  approximate  constant
straight-line depreciation, and

“(IT) develop recommendations
regarding the proper economic depre-
clation for specified property.

“(11) REPORT.—Not later than De-
cember 31, 2020, and not less frequently
than every 5 years after such date, the

Secretary shall submit to the Committee

oS 1144 IS



O o0 N N Bk W

[\ I \© R \O I O N N e e e e e e T e e
W N = O O 0 N RN = O

31
on Finance of the Senate and to the Com-
mittee on Ways and Means of the House
of Representatives—
“(I) any schedule developed
under clause (1)(I), and
“(IT) any recommendations devel-
oped under clause (1)(II).
“(in) EFFECTIVE DATE OF SCHED-

ULES.

Any schedule developed under
clause (1)(I) and submitted to Congress
under clause (i1) shall take effect with re-
spect to property placed in service on or
after first day of the first calendar year be-
einning at least 1 year after the date such
schedule is submitted.

“(C) TREATMENT UNDER CONGRESSIONAL

REVIEW ACT.—For purposes of applying chap-

ter 8 of title 5, United States Code, any sched-

ule developed and submitted under subpara-

eraph (B) shall be treated as a major rule.

“(D) SPECIFIED PROPERTY.—For pur-
I

poses of subparagraph (B), the term ‘specified

property’ means—

oS 1144 IS



32

“(1) any property which is classified
under subsection (e)(3) (other than sub-
paragraph (C)(v) thereof), or

“(i1) any nonresidential real property,
residential rental property, railroad grad-
ing or tunnel bore, or water utility prop-
erty.”.

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendment made by
this section shall take effect on the date of the enactment
of this Act.

SEC. 314. MODIFICATIONS TO DEPRECIATION LIMITATIONS
ON LUXURY AUTOMOBILES AND PERSONAL

USE PROPERTY.

(a) LUXURY AUTOMOBILES.

(1) IN GENERAL.—280F(a)(1)(A) 1s amended—

(A) by striking “$2,560” in clause (i) and
inserting “$10,000”,

(B) by striking “$4,100” in clause (ii) and
inserting “$16,000”,

(C) by striking “$2,450” in clause (iii) and
inserting “$9,600”, and

(D) by striking “$1,475” in clause (iv) and
inserting “$5,760".

(2) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—

oS 1144 IS



33

1 (A) Clause (i1) of section 280K (a)(1)(B) is
2 amended by striking “$1,475” in the text and
3 heading and inserting “$5,760".

4 (B) Paragraph (7) of section 280F(d) is
5 amended—

6 (i) by striking “1988” in subpara-
7 eraph (A) and inserting “2018”, and

8 (i1) by striking “1987” in subpara-
9 oraph (B)(i)(II) and inserting “2017".

10 (b) REMOVAL OF COMPUTER KEQUIPMENT FROM
11 LISTED PROPERTY.—

12 (1) IN GENERAL.—Section 280F(d)(4)(A) 1s
13 amended by inserting “and” at the end of clause
14 (i11) and by striking clause (iv).

15 (2) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
16 280F(d)(4) is amended by striking subparagraph
17 (B) and by redesignating subparagraph (C) as sub-
18 paragraph (B).

19 (¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

20 this section shall apply to property placed in service after
21 December 31, 2017, in taxable years ending after such

22 date.

oS 1144 IS



O o0 9 N D kA WD =

[\ TN NG I N T NG I NG I N B N e T e e T e e e
LN A W D= O O NN NN Bl W DY = O

34
SEC. 315. REDUCTION IN AMORTIZATION PERIOD FOR IN-
TANGIBLES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 197(a) is amended by
adding at the end the following new sentence: “In the case
of such an intangible acquired after the date of the enact-
ment of the INVEST Act of 2017, the preceding sentence
shall be applied by substituting ‘10-year period’ for ‘15-
year period’.”.

(b) APPLICATION OF ANTI-CHURNING RULES.—Sec-

tion 197(f)(9) is amended by adding at the end the fol-
lowing:
“(G)  APPLICATION TO INVEST ACT

CHANGES.

If subparagraph (A) or (F) would
apply to any section 197 intangible if—
“(1) ‘the date of the enactment of the
INVEST Act of 2017 were substituted for
‘the date of the enactment of this section’
each place it appears in each such sub-
paragraph, and
“(1) ‘May 17, 2017 were substituted
for ‘July 25, 19917 each place it appears in
subparagraph (A),
then the last sentence of subsection (a) (relat-
g to 10-year amortization) shall not apply to

the transferee of such intangible.”.

oS 1144 IS



(e I =) N, S VS N O]

35

(¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENT.—Section
197(e)(4)(D)(1) is amended by inserting “(10 years in the
case of a right acquired after the date of the enactment
of the INVEST Act of 2017)” after 15 years”.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by
this section apply to acquisitions after the date of the en-
actment of this Act in taxable years ending after such

date.

oS 1144 IS




<<
  /ASCII85EncodePages false
  /AllowTransparency false
  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true
  /AutoRotatePages /None
  /Binding /Left
  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)
  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)
  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error
  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4
  /CompressObjects /Off
  /CompressPages true
  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true
  /PassThroughJPEGImages true
  /CreateJobTicket false
  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default
  /DetectBlends true
  /DetectCurves 0.0000
  /ColorConversionStrategy /LeaveColorUnchanged
  /DoThumbnails false
  /EmbedAllFonts true
  /EmbedOpenType false
  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true
  /EmbedJobOptions true
  /DSCReportingLevel 0
  /EmitDSCWarnings false
  /EndPage -1
  /ImageMemory 1048576
  /LockDistillerParams true
  /MaxSubsetPct 100
  /Optimize false
  /OPM 1
  /ParseDSCComments true
  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true
  /PreserveCopyPage true
  /PreserveDICMYKValues true
  /PreserveEPSInfo true
  /PreserveFlatness true
  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false
  /PreserveOPIComments true
  /PreserveOverprintSettings true
  /StartPage 1
  /SubsetFonts false
  /TransferFunctionInfo /Preserve
  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve
  /UsePrologue true
  /ColorSettingsFile ()
  /AlwaysEmbed [ true
  ]
  /NeverEmbed [ true
  ]
  /AntiAliasColorImages false
  /CropColorImages true
  /ColorImageMinResolution 300
  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleColorImages false
  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /ColorImageResolution 300
  /ColorImageDepth 8
  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1
  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeColorImages true
  /ColorImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterColorImages false
  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /ColorACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /ColorImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasGrayImages false
  /CropGrayImages true
  /GrayImageMinResolution 300
  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleGrayImages false
  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /GrayImageResolution 300
  /GrayImageDepth 8
  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2
  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeGrayImages true
  /GrayImageFilter /FlateEncode
  /AutoFilterGrayImages false
  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG
  /GrayACSImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /GrayImageDict <<
    /QFactor 0.15
    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<
    /TileWidth 256
    /TileHeight 256
    /Quality 30
  >>
  /AntiAliasMonoImages false
  /CropMonoImages true
  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200
  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK
  /DownsampleMonoImages false
  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic
  /MonoImageResolution 1200
  /MonoImageDepth -1
  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000
  /EncodeMonoImages true
  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode
  /MonoImageDict <<
    /K -1
  >>
  /AllowPSXObjects false
  /CheckCompliance [
    /None
  ]
  /PDFX1aCheck true
  /PDFX3Check false
  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly true
  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError false
  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true
  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
    0.00000
  ]
  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)
  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier (CGATS TR 001)
  /PDFXOutputCondition ()
  /PDFXRegistryName (http://www.color.org)
  /PDFXTrapped /False

  /CreateJDFFile false
  /Description <<

    /BGR <>
    /CHS <>
    /CHT <>
    /CZE <>
    /DAN <>
    /DEU <>
    /ESP <>
    /ETI <>
    /FRA <>
    /GRE <>

    /HRV <>
    /HUN <>
    /ITA (Utilizzare queste impostazioni per creare documenti Adobe PDF che devono essere conformi o verificati in base a PDF/X-1a:2001, uno standard ISO per lo scambio di contenuto grafico. Per ulteriori informazioni sulla creazione di documenti PDF compatibili con PDF/X-1a, consultare la Guida dell'utente di Acrobat. I documenti PDF creati possono essere aperti con Acrobat e Adobe Reader 4.0 e versioni successive.)
    /JPN <>
    /KOR <>
    /LTH <>
    /LVI <>
    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die moeten worden gecontroleerd of moeten voldoen aan PDF/X-1a:2001, een ISO-standaard voor het uitwisselen van grafische gegevens. Raadpleeg de gebruikershandleiding van Acrobat voor meer informatie over het maken van PDF-documenten die compatibel zijn met PDF/X-1a. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 4.0 en hoger.)
    /NOR <>
    /POL <>
    /PTB <>
    /RUM <>
    /RUS <>
    /SKY <>
    /SLV <>
    /SUO <>
    /SVE <>
    /TUR <>
    /UKR <>
    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents that are to be checked or must conform to PDF/X-1a:2001, an ISO standard for graphic content exchange.  For more information on creating PDF/X-1a compliant PDF documents, please refer to the Acrobat User Guide.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 4.0 and later.)
  >>
  /Namespace [
    (Adobe)
    (Common)
    (1.0)
  ]
  /OtherNamespaces [
    <<
      /AsReaderSpreads false
      /CropImagesToFrames true
      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue
      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false
      /IncludeGuidesGrids false
      /IncludeNonPrinting false
      /IncludeSlug false
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (InDesign)
        (4.0)
      ]
      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false
      /OmitPlacedEPS false
      /OmitPlacedPDF false
      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy
    >>
    <<
      /AddBleedMarks false
      /AddColorBars false
      /AddCropMarks false
      /AddPageInfo false
      /AddRegMarks false
      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK
      /DestinationProfileName ()
      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /Downsample16BitImages true
      /FlattenerPreset <<
        /PresetSelector /HighResolution
      >>
      /FormElements false
      /GenerateStructure false
      /IncludeBookmarks false
      /IncludeHyperlinks false
      /IncludeInteractive false
      /IncludeLayers false
      /IncludeProfiles false
      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings
      /Namespace [
        (Adobe)
        (CreativeSuite)
        (2.0)
      ]
      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK
      /PreserveEditing true
      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged
      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile
      /UseDocumentBleed false
    >>
  ]
>> setdistillerparams
<<
  /HWResolution [2400 2400]
  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]
>> setpagedevice


		Superintendent of Documents
	2023-01-04T09:48:07-0500
	Government Publishing Office, Washington, DC 20401
	Government Publishing Office
	Government Publishing Office attests that this document has not been altered since it was disseminated by Government Publishing Office




