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HONORING 50 YEARS OF EDU-

CATION BY HERKIMER COMMU-
NITY COLLEGE 

HON. ELISE M. STEFANIK 
OF NEW YORK 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, March 1, 2017 

Ms. STEFANIK. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
honor and recognize the 50th Anniversary of 
Herkimer Community College in Herkimer, 
New York. 

The college opened its doors in 1967 for 
over 200 enrolled students, becoming the 29th 
community college in New York State. Since 
then, Herkimer Community College has pro-
vided over 20,000 alumni with an opportunity 
to succeed, while also offering immense eco-
nomic and social benefits to the community it 
has called home for half a century. 

By incentivizing academic, athletic and 
extra-curricular achievement, Herkimer Com-
munity College has helped its students to pur-
sue their goals in exciting and varied careers. 
The school’s success is a testament to its 
hardworking staff and to the importance of an 
accessible education. 

Congratulations to Herkimer Community 
College as it celebrates its 50th Anniversary. 
I want to thank its staff for their vital work and 
wish them continued success in the future. 
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TRIBUTE TO CHINA WONG 

HON. DAVID YOUNG 
OF IOWA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, March 1, 2017 

Mr. YOUNG of Iowa. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize and congratulate China 
Wong for being named a 2017 Forty Under 40 
honoree by the award-winning central Iowa 
publication, Business Record. 

Since 2000, Business Record has under-
taken an exhaustive annual review to identify 
a standout group of young leaders in the 
Greater Des Moines Area that are making an 
impact in their communities and their careers. 
Each year, forty up-and-coming community 
and business leaders under 40 years of age 
are selected for this prestigious honor based 
on a combined criteria of community involve-
ment and success in their chosen career field. 
The 2017 class of Forty Under 40 honorees 
will join an impressive roster of 680 past busi-
ness leaders and growing. 

After graduating from Iowa State University, 
China followed her entrepreneurial passions 
and opened Salon Spa W in Des Moines in 
2005. Since then, the company has grown 
from three to 32 full time employees, and has 
been recognized as one of the Top 100 Sa-
lons in the U.S. by Elle Magazine, a Top 200 
Salon in the U.S. by Salon Today Magazine 
for seven consecutive years, and was nomi-
nated for the prestigious North American Hair-
styling Awards in 2014 and 2016. Outside of 
work, her endeavors focus on 
environmentalism, entrepreneurship for 
women and minorities, and helping the home-
less. 

Mr. Speaker, it is a profound honor to rep-
resent leaders like China in the United States 
Congress and it is with great pride that I rec-
ognize her today for utilizing her talents to bet-

ter both her community and the great state of 
Iowa. I ask that my colleagues in the United 
States House of Representatives join me in 
congratulating China on receiving this es-
teemed designation, thanking those at Busi-
ness Record for their great work, and wishing 
each member of the 2017 Forty Under 40 
class a long and successful career. 
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IN RECOGNITION OF THE LIFE OF 
THE HONORABLE MICHELE 
MCQUIGG 

HON. BARBARA COMSTOCK 
OF VIRGINIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Wednesday, March 1, 2017 

Mrs. COMSTOCK. Mr. Speaker, I rise to 
honor the life of my constituent and friend, the 
Honorable Michele McQuigg, who passed 
away on February 15, 2017 at the age of 69. 
Throughout her life, Ms. McQuigg was a re-
spected leader in the community and served 
as a dedicated public servant for over thirty 
years. She was not just a great representative 
for the Commonwealth but also a genuine per-
son who brought honor and integrity to every-
thing she did. Her deep passion for service to 
Prince William County and Manassas along 
with her exemplary demeanor and attitude will 
certainly be missed. 

Ms. McQuigg began her career in Virginia 
politics in 1983 when she ran for Prince Wil-
liam Clerk of the Circuit Court. In 1992 she 
was elected as the Occoquan District Rep-
resentative on the Prince William County 
Board of Supervisors, where she served until 
1998. During those years, she garnered an 
even greater interest in serving Prince William, 
and she decided to run for the Virginia House 
of Delegates in the 51st District. After her suc-
cessful election, she went on to serve in Vir-
ginia state house for 9 years where she 
worked tirelessly to strengthen small busi-
nesses, enhance community life, and increase 
public safety. 

From 2008 until her recent passing, Ms. 
McQuigg served as the Prince William County 
Clerk of the Court. Among her more impres-
sive actions taken in this role was a project 
that focused on making court documents and 
case pleadings available online, for which she 
scanned 1.3 million pages of legal pro-
ceedings. Through a paid subscription service 
lawyers can now access a vast number of 
documents online, saving them both time and 
money. It is projects like this that truly distin-
guish Ms. McQuigg from other public servants 
and portray how dedicated, intelligent, and for-
ward-thinking she was. 

In addition to her illustrious career as a pub-
lic servant, Ms. McQuigg worked with various 
groups and organizations in different capac-
ities, including the Virginia Railway Express 
(VRE) Operations Board, Lake Ridge- 
Occoquan-Coles Civic Association, Prince Wil-
liam Republican Committee, Board of Visitors 
for George Mason University, Occoquan Land-
ing Community Association Board of Directors, 
READ Community Literacy Council (Co- 
Founder), and the Prince William Association 
of REALTORs. 

Ms. McQuigg was someone who we all as-
pire to exemplify. She will be remembered for 
her truly kind heart, her dedication to our great 
Commonwealth, and for her friendship to 

many. She is survived by her husband Clancy 
McQuigg; her sister Suzanne Berge; her 
daughters Heather Lukes and Katie Schnei-
der; and her five grandchildren Robert Schnei-
der, Colleen Schneider, Emily Schneider, 
Shelby Lukes and Luke Schneider. 

Mr. Speaker, I ask you to join me and 
countless others as we recognize the many 
contributions of the Honorable Michele 
McQuigg. The impact she has had on the 
Commonwealth of Virginia and to our country 
will never be forgotten, and I wish her family 
the best. 
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INTRODUCTION OF THE 
WASHINGTON, D.C. ADMISSION ACT 

HON. ELEANOR HOLMES NORTON 
OF THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Wednesday, March 1, 2017 

Ms. NORTON. Mr. Speaker, I rise today to 
introduce the Washington, D.C. Admission Act 
with 115 original cosponsors, a record num-
ber. This is the most important bill I introduce 
each Congress, and it is especially meaningful 
this time in light of the historic results of the 
District of Columbia’s statehood referendum 
last November. District voters overwhelmingly 
voted in favor of the referendum, which ad-
vises the D.C. Council to petition Congress for 
statehood. Residents are more energized than 
ever before to continue this momentum for 
statehood, equality, and self-determination. 
District residents have always been citizens of 
the United States but remain the only federal 
income taxpaying Americans who do not have 
full and equal citizenship rights. The denial of 
local control of local matters and of equal rep-
resentation in the Congress of the United 
States can be remedied only by statehood. 

Therefore, I am introducing the Washington, 
D.C. Admission Act to create a state from es-
sentially the eight home-town wards of the 
District of Columbia. This 51st state, of 
course, would have no jurisdiction over the 
federal territory or enclave that now consists 
of the Washington that Members of Congress 
and visitors associate with the capital of our 
country. The U.S. Capitol Complex, the prin-
cipal federal monuments, federal buildings and 
grounds, the National Mall, the White House, 
and other federal property here would remain 
under federal jurisdiction. Our bill provides that 
the State of Washington, D.C. would be equal 
to the other fifty states in all respects, as is al-
ways required, and that the residents of 
Washington, D.C. would have all the rights of 
citizenship as taxpaying American citizens, in-
cluding two senators and, initially, one House 
member. The District of Columbia recognizes 
that it can enter the Union only on an equal 
basis and is prepared to do so. 

A substantially similar version of the Wash-
ington DC. Admission Act was the first bill I in-
troduced after I was first sworn in as a Mem-
ber of Congress in the 102nd Congress in 
1991. Our first try for statehood received sig-
nificant support in the House. In 1993, we got 
the first and only vote on statehood for the 
District, with nearly 60 percent of Democrats 
and one Republican voting for the bill. The 
Senate held a hearing on various approaches 
to representation, but the committee of juris-
diction did not proceed further. In the 113th 
Congress, our statehood bill got unprece-
dented momentum with the Senate’s first-ever 
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