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Mr. DEFAZIO changed his vote from 
‘‘yea’’ to ‘‘nay.’’ 

Ms. ESTY and Mr. RYAN of Ohio 
changed their vote from ‘‘nay’’ to 
‘‘yea.’’ 

So the bill was passed. 
The result of the vote was announced 

as above recorded. 
A motion to reconsider was laid on 

the table. 
f 

REMOVAL OF NAME OF MEMBER 
AS COSPONSOR OF H.J. RES. 50 
Mr. DUNCAN of South Carolina. Mr. 

Speaker, I ask unanimous consent to 
have my name removed as a cosponsor 
of H.J. Res. 50. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Is there 
objection to the request of the gen-
tleman from South Carolina? 

There was no objection. 
f 

EQUAL PAY DAY 
(Ms. MCSALLY asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. MCSALLY. Mr. Speaker, since 
the passage of the Equal Pay Act in 
1963, it has been illegal for an employer 
to pay a woman less than a man for the 
same work. But the unfortunate re-
ality is that today, over 50 years later, 
women are still making less than men, 
and that is unacceptable. 

Labor Department statistics cite, 
when comparing median salaries for all 
annual full-time jobs, women are mak-
ing 81 cents on the dollar compared to 
men. Some of this is from blatant bias 
and discrimination, which is illegal 
and unacceptable. But most of the pay 
gap comes from factors like women 
going into lower-paying career fields; 
seeking flexibility since they are still 
primary caregivers for children and, in-
creasingly, parents; or not being able 
to afford child care. 

Here in the House, I am working on 
putting forward ideas and solutions to 
empower women to close this pay gap. 
Last year I joined my colleagues to 
create and lead a Working Group on 
Women in the 21st century workforce. 
It is examining the challenges women 
still face and working to expand equal 
opportunity and improve outcomes for 
all women. 

Mr. Speaker, I have been fighting for 
women my whole life. I know we still 
have work to do, and I am committed 
to making equal opportunity for 
women a reality. After all, this is 
America and we pick the best man for 
the job, even if she is a woman, and 
that means making sure she is getting 
paid what she deserves. 

f 

b 1700 

CONGRATULATING TEXAS WES-
LEYAN MEN’S BASKETBALL 
TEAM 
(Mr. VEASEY asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. VEASEY. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to congratulate my alma mater, 
Texas Wesleyan University. On March 
21, 2017, Texas Wesleyan’s men’s bas-
ketball team brought home their sec-
ond NAIA title to Fort Worth, Texas. 
From the start, Texas Wesleyan Rams 
were up against a tough fight as they 
faced off with Life University in the 
championship match. 

Thanks to the Ram’s MVP, Dion Rog-
ers, who scored 28 points in the final 
match, and with another 21 points 
scored by Ryan Harris, the Rams were 
led to victory. 

But the road to the championship 
wasn’t easy. The Rams showed true 
perseverance, heart, and dedication to 
win 5 games in 6 days against the 
toughest competition in the Nation. 

Congratulations to the Rams, the 
coaching staff, parents, families, and 
the city of Fort Worth for this hard 
fought victory. 

Go Rams. 
Mr. Speaker, the Rams were not the 

only team making Fort Worth proud. 
Just 9 days later, Texas Christian Uni-
versity across town also won a cham-
pionship, and my colleague, KAY 
GRANGER, who represents west Fort 
Worth, is here to tell that story. 

f 

CONGRATULATING TEXAS CHRIS-
TIAN UNIVERSITY’S MEN’S BAS-
KETBALL TEAM 
(Ms. GRANGER asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Ms. GRANGER. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to congratulate the Texas Chris-
tian University’s men’s basketball 
team on their National Invitational 
Tournament championship. 

After a 12-win season last year, the 
Horned Frogs showed the grit and te-
nacity my hometown of Fort Worth is 
known for. They finished the season 
with 24 wins. 

With their win over the Georgia Tech 
Yellow Jackets in the title game last 
week, the Horned Frogs capped off a 
memorable and historic comeback sea-
son. In fact, this 2017 NIT title is Texas 
Christian University’s first postseason 
championship in school history. 

I want to recognize the TCU players 
and coaches for a job well done. Go 
Frogs. 

f 

EQUAL PAY DAY 
(Mr. ESPAILLAT asked and was 

given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. ESPAILLAT. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
to recognize Equal Pay Day. The year 
is 2017, and women, especially women 
of color, still earn significantly less 
than their male counterparts. 

Pay inequality disproportionately 
impacts women of color. For example, 
White women earn 80 cents to every 
dollar that her White male counterpart 
makes, African-American women earn 
an average of 63 cents per every dollar, 
and Latina women on average earn 54 
cents for every dollar. 

This may seem like mere pennies on 
the dollar, but, over a lifetime, this 
translates to an estimated loss of al-
most $700,000 for a high school graduate 
and $1.2 million for a college graduate. 
$1.2 million—can you imagine what 
these earnings mean to working fami-
lies of today? That is health insurance, 
retirement savings, and food on the 
table. Unequal pay for equal work just 
doesn’t add up. It is morally and math-
ematically wrong. 

Pay inequality is not only a women’s 
issue, but a family issue. To my male 
colleagues, I ask: In 2017, do you not 
believe in strong women? In 2017, do 
you not believe in equality? 

f 

NATIONAL PET ADOPTION DAY 
(Mr. WILLIAMS asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. WILLIAMS. Mr. Speaker, today I 
rise to talk about H. Res. 133, a bill I 
introduced with my friend and Texas 
colleague, Congressman MARC VEASEY. 

This resolution expresses support for 
the designation of April 11 as National 
Pet Adoption Day and the month of 
April as National Pet Adoption Month. 
Simply, we are aiming to highlight the 
importance of pet adoption. 

Mr. Speaker, each year, 2.7 million 
adoptable dogs and cats are euthanized 
in the United States. As a rancher and 
lifelong animal lover, this is heart-
breaking. 

The Humane Society of the United 
States, ASPCA, Animal Welfare Insti-
tute, and local shelters such as PAWS 
Shelter of Central Texas have endorsed 
this resolution. 

Mr. Speaker, we request that the 
President issue a proclamation calling 
upon the people of the United States to 
observe April 11 as National Pet Adop-
tion Day and the month of April as Na-
tional Pet Adoption Month. 

More than 60 Members of Congress 
have signed on to our bipartisan reso-
lution, and I encourage others to do so. 
For those who may be watching this 
back home, call your Representative in 
Washington and have them support 
this bill. 

In God We Trust. 
f 

EQUAL PAY DAY 
(Mr. PANETTA asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. PANETTA. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to recognize Equal Pay Day. 
This day marks how far into this year 
that a woman must work to earn what 
a man earned up to December 31 of last 
year. 

In the United States, a woman is paid 
20 percent less than her male counter-
part. In California, a woman earns 86 
percent of what men earn. Pay dispari-
ties in California are even more stark 
for women of color. Latinas make just 
56 percent of what a man makes. 

In order to continue to close the pay 
gap, Congress must pass the Paycheck 
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