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immigration. So we have a 50,000 slot. 
If we eliminated that stupid lottery 
that we don’t even decide who is com-
ing in, that it is left up to chance, well, 
we eliminate that, and then we set up 
a special fund. And the fund is a dedi-
cated fund that whoever puts in $1 mil-
lion into that dedicated fund will do so 
in exchange for immediate residency 
and U.S. citizenship within 2 years. 
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In other words, foreign people who 

are successful in whatever they have 
done in order to accumulate wealth, 
and we are not going to bring in crimi-
nals, it is going to be vetted just like 
every other legal immigrant will be 
vetted to make sure they are not 
criminals or terrorists or anything, but 
people who are overseas who would 
love to become U.S. citizens, that they 
will be given guaranteed U.S. citizen-
ship within 2 years. 

Now, that would mean $1 million per 
person, and perhaps we might want to 
say that individuals could bring in 
their immediate family, minors, for 
$500,000. But whatever that is, the rev-
enue raised from this program could be 
put into that special account managed 
by the Secretary of Homeland Security 
for the purpose of carrying out border 
security and immigration enforcement 
activities. 

In other words, the President of the 
United States does not have to have 
the burden of raising taxes in order to 
pay for that Southern border wall. He 
does not have to pass it off on further 
generations by increasing the debt by 
that level. 

We have a method in this to bring in 
a better quality of people who we need 
coming into our country rather than 
selecting at random and paying for a 
wall that will reestablish the security 
of the people of this country and will 
go a long way to establish a mindset 
around the world that no longer are 
our borders open. No longer, whoever 
can get over here, are we going to take 
in and then give them free education 
and free health care and let them com-
mit crimes and not even be kicked out 
of the country for it. No. Those days 
are over, and this wall will symbolize 
that. 

What I have suggested, having these 
foreign wealthy people pay for that 
wall, makes it a real possibility. If peo-
ple would be interested in talking to 
their Member of Congress, they can 
call or write, but they should call and 
say the idea of letting rich foreigners 
build that wall is the answer. Let’s get 
going on it. Let’s not wait for 5 years. 
Build the wall and let the others pay 
for it. That is a plan that will work. 

I would like to also discuss another 
issue that I have been involved in. But 
let me just note that, on the tax bill, I 
have also asked for an amendment that 
would increase the well-being. And, 
how do you say, right now our wealth 
is becoming so centralized in just a few 
hands. 

What we have now in the United 
States is a vision that the poor are get-

ting poorer and the rich are getting 
richer. There is a problem with this 
concentration of wealth. 

Now, the reason we have that con-
centration of wealth is because there 
are a few people in our country that 
own capital, own the companies that 
produce the wealth. And over the 
years, that has been focused on fewer 
and fewer hands, and the working peo-
ple are being shut out of a system that 
is something that they are essential 
players in. 

So with that said, I am certainly not 
against profit motive and I am cer-
tainly not against competition. I am 
certainly for the private sector and not 
for big bureaucracy. But if we just 
passed an incentive into our system, 
that incentive would be this: I am pro-
posing that when an employer provides 
stock for his employees, it has to be an 
equal distribution to all the employees. 
Those employees don’t have to pay in-
come tax on it. And if those employees 
keep that stock for over 10 years, the 
employees don’t have to pay capital 
gains tax on it. 

So what we have got—if a company is 
successful and we have got a large in-
crease in the value of that company, it 
is being shared with the workers in the 
company. It is not being held up in the 
one percent of the elite management. 
What we need to do is to make sure 
that we deal with this concentration of 
wealth because the American people, 
that is what it was all about. It wasn’t 
about having some elite. That was 
what the Homestead Act was all about 
that helped my grandparents. We need 
a Homestead Act for people who are 
working in the various industries in 
our country. And tweaking the system 
with a little tax incentive like I am 
talking about, this would be an ESOP, 
which are already in existence but have 
very complicated structure associated 
with them, an expensive structure as-
sociated with them, that this would be 
like ESOPs on steroids. We will have 
working people thinking in terms of 
partnership with their employer in-
stead of being on an adversarial rela-
tionship. People with startup compa-
nies will be able to get the top-quality 
people knowing if their company is 
successful, the capital gains tax will be 
zero for them who came onboard early 
on. 

This is another proposal that I am 
making, and I would hope that people 
will look at that again and ask their 
Congressman to consider Congressman 
ROHRABACHER’s Employee Ownership 
Bill, Expanding Employee Ownership. 

Finally, I would like to talk about 
one last issue that is something that is 
very controversial, I know, and I have 
never stepped away from being con-
troversial. But what we have got here 
today is a major change in public atti-
tude towards something that has been 
wrong for a long time but the public 
was not aware of it. 

I would hope that we do not pass up 
the chance again of legalizing the med-
ical use of marijuana. And the fact is, 

44 States have taken many restrictions 
off the use of medical marijuana. 

I have legislation that says respect 
State marijuana laws. This should be 
left up to the States. This should be 
left up to the people who decide for 
themselves whether or not they believe 
medical marijuana should be available 
to seniors, to veterans, and to other 
people. And we should stop paying 
money to the drug cartels by making 
sure that this medicine that we now 
know is possible with marijuana that 
we don’t want to have the source being 
the drug cartels around the world. 

So I would ask my colleagues to join 
me in supporting the medical mari-
juana initiative, what I have, which 
says we will respect medical marijuana 
laws and the United States. 

I would hope that my colleagues get 
the message. These are four very im-
portant issues. These are issues I spent 
a lot of time on, but I am doing that 
because I understand these are funda-
mental. We have to start doing more. If 
we are going to drain the swamp, as 
the President says, we have got to be 
working on the fundamentals that are 
wrong with the system rather than just 
trying to create some image of 
progress and image of activity here. 

We can do it. We have got good lead-
ership here in the House. We have got 
a willingness to cooperate with the 
other side of the aisle. We have got a 
President who wants to work with us. 
Congress is here. We are in action, and 
we have got some great new creative 
ideas. Now the American people are 
welcome to participate. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield back the balance 
of my time. 

f 

RECESS 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Pursu-
ant to clause 12(a) of rule I, the Chair 
declares the House in recess subject to 
the call of the Chair. 

Accordingly (at 6 o’clock and 22 min-
utes p.m.), the House stood in recess. 

f 
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AFTER RECESS 

The recess having expired, the House 
was called to order by the Speaker pro 
tempore (Mr. YOUNG of Iowa) at 11 
o’clock and 31 minutes p.m. 

f 

ADJOURNMENT 

Mr. MCHENRY. Mr. Speaker, I move 
that the House do now adjourn. 

The motion was agreed to; accord-
ingly (at 11 o’clock and 32 minutes 
p.m.), under its previous order, the 
House adjourned until tomorrow, 
Thursday, April 27, 2017, at 10 a.m. for 
morning-hour debate. 

f 

EXECUTIVE COMMUNICATIONS, 
ETC. 

Under clause 2 of rule XIV, executive 
communications were taken from the 
Speaker’s table and referred as follows: 
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