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invaded for the West to take their 
chunk of Poland’s freedom. 

Years later, we won the Cold War, 
and Poland joined NATO. But Poland 
has never been truly free because Mr. 
Putin—mother Russia—has controlled 
Poland’s energy. Mr. Putin has pun-
ished Poland in their desire to be free 
by slowing natural gas exports in a 
cold, Polish winter that became much 
colder. 

Uncle Sam is about to put the Rus-
sian bear on permanent hibernation by 
exporting American liquid freedom. 
Our liquified natural gas will leave 
Sabine Pass in June heading to Poland. 

The Russian bear is on the run. Let 
American liquid freedom reign. 
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DISTRICT SCHOOL 
ACCOMPLISHMENTS 

(Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute.) 

Mrs. WATSON COLEMAN. Mr. 
Speaker, I rise today to recognize the 
talent and hard work of the youth in 
New Jersey’s 12th District. 

This past weekend, a group of East 
Brunswick High School students were 
recognized as the best team from the 
Northeast in the We the People com-
petition. Competing against more than 
1,200 students, this team demonstrated 
knowledge of constitutional principles 
in both historical and contemporary 
contexts. 

This weekend, students from John 
Witherspoon Middle School of Prince-
ton and West Windsor-Plainsboro 
South High School will come to Wash-
ington to compete in the final round of 
the 2017 National Science Bowl. 

To all of these students: The guid-
ance of your teachers, Alan Brodman, 
Bill Merritt, and Sunila Sharma, and 
your hard work is evident, and New 
Jersey’s 12th District is very proud of 
you. 

It is an honor to represent a district 
that continues to emphasize the impor-
tance of STEM and civic education, 
and encourage our Nation’s youth to 
thrive. 
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FIRST 100 DAYS OF PRESIDENT 
TRUMP’S ADMINISTRATION 

(Mr. BIGGS asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. BIGGS. Mr. Speaker, I rise today 
to mark the first 100 days of President 
Donald Trump’s administration. 

In his first 100 days, President Trump 
has enacted more pieces of legislation 
than any other President since Tru-
man, facilitated the earliest Supreme 
Court confirmation since 1881, elimi-
nated many onerous regulations to re-
store economic optimism and oppor-
tunity, protected the sanctity of life, 
and driven illegal border crossings to a 
17-year low. His accomplishments are 
truly remarkable. 

I have appreciated President Trump’s 
willingness to listen and work with 

Congress on major pieces of legislation. 
His effort to work with Congress is a 
breath of fresh air. 

President Trump made several prom-
ises to the American people, and I am 
encouraged by his efforts to fulfill 
them. Mr. Speaker, the American peo-
ple are watching—they are watching 
both the President and those of us in 
Congress. They will not accept broken 
promises or half-hearted measures. 
They want results. I look forward to 
working alongside President Trump to 
keep our promises. 
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PRESIDENT TRUMP’S PROMISE TO 
DRAIN THE SWAMP 

(Mrs. DEMINGS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mrs. DEMINGS. Mr. Speaker, the 
President made big promises on the 
campaign trail to drain the swamp. He 
promised that his Washington would 
look different. Well, it does look dif-
ferent, but not in the way he promised. 

Instead of ethics reform, his adminis-
tration rolled back ethics provisions 
that prevented officials from serving in 
Federal agencies that they lobbied in 
the last 2 years. 

He promised to tackle campaign fi-
nance, saying that he wouldn’t accept 
campaign donations from special inter-
est groups. Instead, he has invited the 
special interests into his Cabinet, ap-
pointing them into the highest posi-
tion. 

He promised he would ask Congress 
to pass campaign finance reform that 
prevents registered foreign lobbyists 
from raising money in American poli-
tics. Instead, it turns out that some of 
his closest confidants and former cam-
paign advisers have made millions lob-
bying foreign governments. 

He promised he would release his own 
tax returns, but has not. The American 
people have no way of knowing how he 
or his family businesses stand to ben-
efit from these tax cuts. 

Mr. Speaker, this is not draining the 
swamp. Everyone is accountable, espe-
cially those in the highest levels of our 
government. 
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CONGRATULATING DARLENE 
JOHNSON 

(Ms. HERRERA BEUTLER asked and 
was given permission to address the 
House for 1 minute.) 

Ms. HERRERA BEUTLER. Mr. 
Speaker, I rise today to congratulate 
Darlene Johnson of Woodland, Wash-
ington, on being nominated for two 
Women in Transport Awards of 2017 by 
Transport News International. She was 
given these well-deserved awards for 
Best Woman-Owned Land Logistics 
Company in the Pacific Northwest, and 
Most Inspirational Woman in Land 
Transport in the Northwestern U.S. 

Throughout her distinguished career, 
Darlene has done everything in her 
power to serve her community. She 
currently sits on the Woodland Cham-

ber of Commerce Board of Directors 
where she advocates for stronger envi-
ronment for businesses in southwest 
Washington. Darlene’s tenacity and 
dedication motivate and inspire those 
around her, me included. 

Not only does she advocate for local 
businesses, but she is a local 
businessowner herself. Darlene, along 
with her husband, Jim, operate Wood-
land Truck Line, Inc. It is fitting that 
she is receiving this award for success-
fully running a business in an industry 
that is commonly thought to be male 
dominated. Those who know Darlene, 
like I do, know that if Darlene were to 
start a business in any other industry, 
she would go over, under, or right 
through any obstacles in her way. 

Darlene’s service to our community 
does not go unnoticed. There is not an 
issue affecting the Woodland commu-
nity with which she is not actively in-
volved. She currently is deserving of 
this prestigious award on behalf of 
southwest Washington. I congratulate 
her and wish her the best in her future 
endeavors and continued success in 
transportation. 
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LET’S START FOCUSING ON MAIN 
STREET AND AMERICAN WORKERS 

(Mr. BRENDAN F. BOYLE of Penn-
sylvania asked and was given permis-
sion to address the House for 1 minute.) 

Mr. BRENDAN F. BOYLE of Pennsyl-
vania. Mr. Speaker, President Trump 
campaigned throughout this country, 
including my home State of Pennsyl-
vania, as a great populist, as a cham-
pion of the working class. 

Mr. Speaker, I want to thank Presi-
dent Trump and his administration for 
revealing their true intentions yester-
day when they revealed their Wall 
Street written and designed tax plan— 
a giveaway for millionaires and billion-
aires. And not one thing—not one—for 
99.9 percent of the working American 
people. 

Mr. Speaker, we do need tax reform, 
and you would see broad bipartisan 
support for that. But it has to be real. 
It has to be paid for. And it must in-
clude relief for those three-quarters of 
the American people who pay more in 
payroll taxes than they ever do in indi-
vidual income taxes. 

Enough of focusing on Wall Street 
and the corporate income tax rate, and 
let’s start focusing on Main Street and 
American workers. 
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HEALTHCARE DEBATE IN OUR 
NATION 

(Mr. ROTHFUS asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. ROTHFUS. Mr. Speaker, as 
President Trump and Republicans in 
Congress work toward finally deliv-
ering the American people relief from 
ObamaCare, it is important to remem-
ber how we got here and why we find 
ourselves in this position today. 
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