
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD — HOUSE H4417 May 22, 2017 
6,000 participants in Miami-Dade Coun-
ty, 3,000 in St. Petersburg, and 2,000 in 
Jacksonville school districts. 

The program’s goal is to mentor mi-
nority boys beginning in elementary 
school, middle school, and high school, 
all the while guiding them along a 
carefully charted path to manhood and 
sending them to college. 

Madam Speaker, in this season of 
youth violence, during which boys get 
entangled in the school-to-prison pipe-
line, we are proud of the project and 
the tens of thousands of boys it has 
helped to become successful, contrib-
uting men in society. For example, 
Barry Jenkins, director of the Oscar- 
winning film ‘‘Moonlight,’’ is a 1998 
graduate of the program. 

I look forward to welcoming these 
young men here tomorrow and hope 
you will get a chance to meet them, 
also. If you do, give them a hug and 
tell them that you love them. 

f 

ALS AWARENESS MONTH 

(Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania 
asked and was given permission to ad-
dress the House for 1 minute and to re-
vise and extend his remarks.) 

Mr. THOMPSON of Pennsylvania. 
Madam Speaker, May is ALS Aware-
ness Month. It is a time many lend 
their voices to the fight against ALS 
and help raise awareness about this 
devastating disease. 

ALS is often referred to as Lou 
Gehrig’s disease, after the baseball 
great was diagnosed with the progres-
sive neurodegenerative disease that af-
fects the nerve cells in the brain and 
spinal cord. 

Recently, I had the honor of meeting 
with people from Pennsylvania to talk 
about ALS, including Michael Bond, 
who has ALS, and his wife and care-
taker, Karen Bond, both of Edinboro, 
Pennsylvania; and Jayne Cawthorne of 
Centre County, Pennsylvania, who is a 
long-time advocate for the ALS Asso-
ciation. Jayne and her daughter have 
been visiting with me since I was first 
elected to Congress, and their advocacy 
continues to build hope while their as-
sociation aggressively searches for new 
treatments and cures. 

I urge my colleagues to support H.R. 
1361, which would ensure access to 
complex rehabilitation technology 
such as power wheelchairs and their 
components and accessories. When you 
have lost the ability to walk, move 
your hands, or hold your head up, these 
technologies are critical. 

f 

NATIONAL MARITIME DAY 

(Ms. BARRAGÁN asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
her remarks.) 

Ms. BARRAGÁN. Madam Speaker, I 
rise today to recognize National Mari-
time Day. 

Since America’s founding, our men 
and women who serve as mariners have 
dedicated themselves to protecting our 

economy and our interests at home and 
abroad. Whether it be through ensuring 
the delivery of goods, supporting us 
during times of peace, or standing up 
during times of war, the maritime in-
dustry has held strong. 

The Port of Los Angeles, which I am 
proud to represent, has made countless 
contributions not only to California 
but to every other congressional dis-
trict. 

As a member of the Committee on 
Homeland Security, I work to ensure 
the safety and security of the Port of 
Los Angeles so that it can continue to 
serve as America’s port. Along with the 
Port of Long Beach, the ports employ 
twice as many men and women as the 
Hollywood entertainment industry. 

Today, I am proud to honor those 
men and women who serve and have 
served as U.S. merchant mariners. I 
ask that we continue to support the 
maritime industry today, and every 
day. 

f 

SUPPORT OUR VETERANS 
(Mr. BERGMAN asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. BERGMAN. Madam Speaker, I 
rise in support of H.R. 2288, the Vet-
erans Appeals Improvement and Mod-
ernization Act of 2017, a bill that ad-
dresses the Department of Veterans Af-
fairs’ broken appeals process. 

As of April 1, 2017, the number of 
pending appeals for disability com-
pensation with the VA has reached 
470,000. That is more than a 20 percent 
increase since fiscal year 2015. At cur-
rent funding levels and using its cur-
rent operational structure, the Depart-
ment of Veterans Affairs estimates 
that it will take at least 5 years to ad-
dress the backlog of appeals claims. 

That is unsatisfactory. We can do 
better. We must do better. Our vet-
erans deserve better. They have risked 
their lives to protect the freedoms we 
hold so dear, and it is up to us to make 
sure they receive the benefits they 
have earned and deserve. 

H.R. 2288 modernizes the appeals 
process to efficiently and effectively 
resolve backlogged claims and prevent 
this kind of backlog from happening in 
the future. This bipartisan piece of leg-
islation takes a giant leap toward a 
more efficient Department of Veterans 
Affairs, and I strongly urge my col-
leagues to support it. 

f 

SABOTAGE X 2 
(Mr. SOTO asked and was given per-

mission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. SOTO. Madam Speaker, sabo-
tage. 

A plot is afoot in Washington. It is 
time to sound the alarms. It is time to 
let the people know. It is time to ride 
like Paul Revere across our Nation and 
awaken Americans to this sinister 
scheme. 

President Trump is sabotaging the 
Affordable Care Act. Trump has threat-

ened to cut subsidies to millions of 
Americans, creating more uncertainty 
today by stalling in court. He has re-
fused to fund the high-risk corridors, 
causing insurance companies to flee 
States like Iowa and Kentucky. He has 
cut the public notices to keep those in 
need of healthcare in the dark. He has 
cut the signup period in half to prevent 
more Americans from signing up. 

Is sabotage destroying the healthcare 
market worth it? Is robbing millions of 
Americans of healthcare coverage 
worth it? Is that the price Trump is 
willing to pay for repeal? To give tax 
cuts to billionaires? 

Mr. Trump, ObamaCare works. If you 
break it, you own it. When you sabo-
tage healthcare for millions of Ameri-
cans, you are responsible. And the peo-
ple ought to know. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Mem-
bers are reminded to direct their re-
marks to the Chair. 

f 

MILITARY APPRECIATION MONTH 

(Mr. ARRINGTON asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. ARRINGTON. Madam Speaker, if 
history has taught us anything over 
the years, it is that freedom is not free. 
It comes at a great price. 

It is easy to take for granted the 
freedoms we enjoy, but this Military 
Appreciation Month I pray that we all 
reflect upon the sacrifices the men and 
women of our Armed Forces have made 
for our liberty and our security. 

Specifically, I am reminded today of 
the 5,100 dedicated men and women 
serving at Dyess Air Force Base, home 
of the 7th Bomb Wing and the 317th 
Airlift Group, and the 40,000 veterans in 
my district in west Texas. 

It is with them in mind, Madam 
Speaker, that I would like to express 
my gratitude for those who have 
served, my sorrow for those who did 
not make it back home, and my condo-
lences to those who have lost someone 
dear in service to our great country. 
Let us never forget them. Let us al-
ways remind our children and grand-
children of the sacrifices of those who 
gave up their today so that we can 
have our tomorrow. 

God bless our men and women in uni-
form. And God bless these United 
States of America. 

f 

WORLD AT A CROSSROADS 

(Ms. PLASKETT asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend her re-
marks.) 

Ms. PLASKETT. Madam Speaker, as 
I stand here, our world stands at a 
crossroads. As I stand here, 20 million 
stand at risk of starvation at the hands 
of what has the potential to become 
the worst humanitarian crisis since 
World War II: famine in South Sudan 
and impending famine in northeast Ni-
geria, Somalia, and Yemen. Additional 
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