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RECOGNIZING BRIAN C. COOPER 

ON HIS RETIREMENT 
Mr. WOMACK asked and was given 

permission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. WOMACK. Mr. Speaker, I rise 
today to pay tribute to Brian C. Coo-
per, who is retiring from the Office of 
the Parliamentarian after 35 years on 
Capitol Hill. 

Brian is a native of Baltimore, Mary-
land, and a graduate of Frederick 
Douglass High School and the Commu-
nity College of Baltimore County, 
where he received his degree in com-
mercial and graphic arts. 

Brian began his Capitol Hill career in 
September of 1992, when he was hired 
in the stockroom of the Longworth 
Building, working in publication and 
distribution services. 

Throughout the eighties and early 
nineties, Brian held a variety of posi-
tions on Capitol Hill, including roles on 
the Small Business Committee and the 
Government Operations Sub-
committee. Through this experience, 
Brian learned the intricacies of the leg-
islative process and the inner-workings 
of House operations, skills that would 
serve him well when, in 1995, he was 
hired as an Assistant Clerk to the Par-
liamentarian. 

Brian would spend the next 22 years 
in the House Parliamentarian’s Office 
and became Chief Clerk to the Parlia-
mentarian in 2009. For over two dec-
ades, Brian has been a fixture at the 
House rostrum, dutifully assisting the 
presiding officer in timekeeping, recog-
nizing Members on the floor, and pre-
paring and reviewing reams of legisla-
tive paperwork for the House. 

Brian has prepared the House Cham-
bers for both visiting dignitaries and 
State of the Union addresses alike, and 
everything in between. If that wasn’t 
enough, Brian also created the first 
computer network for the Parliamen-
tarian. 

An accomplished artist, Brian re-
mains active in artistic endeavors, 
which run the gamut from pencil draw-
ings, watercolors, and oils, to photog-
raphy and architectural design. His re-
tirement will offer new opportunities 
to continue these pursuits. A devoted 
Orioles fan, it is my hope that Brian 
will spend some of his well-earned free 
time at Camden Yards. 

A consummate professional, Brian 
has spent his career on Capitol Hill 
committed to assisting with an orderly 
and accurate legislative process, ob-
served in a fair and nonpartisan man-
ner. He is a quintessential legislative 
resource for this entire body, and I am 
certain the House of Representatives 
has known few individuals more dedi-
cated to its proper functioning and leg-
acy than Brian Cooper. 

On behalf of everyone affiliated with 
this, the people’s House, including my 
colleagues gathered in front of me here 
as I speak, Brian, we are happy to cele-
brate this important milestone in your 
life, and we thank you for your dedi-

cated service to the House and to 
America. 

f 

MINORITY BUSINESS 
DEVELOPMENT AGENCY 

(Mr. MCNERNEY asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute and to revise and extend 
his remarks.) 

Mr. MCNERNEY. Mr. Speaker, the 
President’s fiscal year 2018 budget calls 
for the elimination of the Minority 
Business Development Agency. This is 
shameful and counterproductive to the 
progress that minority-owned firms 
have achieved. 

I led on this issue by sending two bi-
partisan letters to the House Appro-
priations Committee, joined by over 70 
Members, advocating for Congress to 
fund the MBDA at fiscal 2017 levels, 
and recommending that the MBDA pro-
vide annual policy reports to Congress. 

The agency has one of the highest re-
turns on investment in the Federal 
Government, helping minority-owned 
firms secure $40 billion in contracts 
and capital over the last 10 years. The 
8 million minority businesses in the 
United States contribute $1.4 trillion in 
economic output to the economy. My 
home State of California leads the Na-
tion with 1.6 million minority-owned 
firms, which represents 45 percent of 
all businesses in my State. 

Mr. Speaker, I urge my colleagues to 
continue funding the Minority Busi-
ness Development Agency so that we 
can continue to see this progress in our 
economic growth and for the commu-
nities of our Nation. 

f 

NATIONAL MISSING CHILDREN’S 
DAY 

(Mr. BIGGS asked and was given per-
mission to address the House for 1 
minute and to revise and extend his re-
marks.) 

Mr. BIGGS. Mr. Speaker, today is 
National Missing Children’s Day. This 
day of recognition was started by 
President Reagan in 1983 to raise 
awareness of the threat of child abduc-
tion, and reminds us today that we 
still have work to do. 

Following the tragic murder of 9- 
year-old Amber Hagerman in 1996, Con-
gress authorized the AMBER Alert sys-
tem to create a coordinated alert sys-
tem to assist law enforcement in find-
ing abducted children in the important 
first hours after an abduction. Since its 
inception, more than 800 children have 
been recovered through the use of the 
AMBER Alert system. 

However, the original legislation did 
not include Indian Tribes as eligible 
users of the program, and we saw the 
tragic effects of this exclusion when 11- 
year-old Ashlynne Mike was abducted 
and murdered on the Navajo Nation. 

For this reason, I have introduced 
the AMBER Alert in Indian Country 
Act. This act will include our 567 Fed-
erally recognized tribes as partners in 
the AMBER Alert Program to ensure 

that everyone is able to utilize this im-
portant tool. My bill is a bipartisan ef-
fort and it is endorsed by criminal jus-
tice, child safety groups, and Indian 
Tribes around the country. 

Mr. Speaker, the AMBER Alert has 
helped many families experience the 
joy of being reunited with an abducted 
child. It is time we extend this alert to 
Indian Country so that no child is out-
side the jurisdiction of this vital pro-
gram. 

I urge my colleagues to support this 
legislation so we can continue to pro-
tect our children. 

f 

AMERICA NEEDS A RAISE 

(Mr. ELLISON asked and was given 
permission to address the House for 1 
minute.) 

Mr. ELLISON. Mr. Speaker, America 
needs a raise. 

It has been years since we have in-
creased the Federal minimum wage, 
which is an abysmal $7.25. All over this 
country, we see ballot measures pass-
ing in red States and blue State in-
creasing the minimum wage, like Alas-
ka and Arkansas. We have seen the 
minimum wage go up in New Jersey 
and all over the country. While people 
in Congress may not realize that Amer-
ica needs a raise, people across the 
United States do. 

Today I am going to participate in a 
press conference to say that we are 
going to propose a bill to raise the min-
imum to $15 an hour and index it. This 
is a simple recognition that if you 
work full time, you shouldn’t live in 
poverty. If you work full time, you 
shouldn’t have to rely on food stamps, 
you shouldn’t have to rely on housing 
assistance, and you shouldn’t have to 
rely on medical assistance. 

I believe in those programs and I sup-
port them, but if you work hard every 
day, you shouldn’t have to rely on gov-
ernment assistance just to put food on 
the table. 

Mr. Speaker, two-thirds of the people 
who benefit from an increase in the 
minimum wage are women. This is a 
gender issue. This is a general inequal-
ity problem. 

We have to fight. America needs a 
raise, Mr. Speaker. Let’s do it. 

f 

b 1200 

REMEMBERING DR. AMY REED 

(Mr. FITZPATRICK asked and was 
given permission to address the House 
for 1 minute.) 

Mr. FITZPATRICK. Mr. Speaker, it 
is with a heavy heart that we say good- 
bye to Dr. Amy Reed, a recognized phy-
sician, exemplary mother and wife, and 
dedicated patient advocate. 

Dr. Reed didn’t ask for the situation 
she found herself in following a proce-
dure in 2013, but it was immediately 
evident to anyone that met her—and 
her family—that she was going to be a 
fighter, not only for herself but for oth-
ers. 
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