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Democrats and Republicans may not 

always agree on the best way to bal-
ance the budget, but we all care about 
our country and our children, and both 
are at risk unless we rein in our 
unsustainable deficits and debt. 

In 45 of the last 50 years, the Federal 
Government spent more than it re-
ceived. The Federal debt has ballooned 
to over $14 trillion. That is 77 percent 
of GDP, a figure that is expected to 
reach 150 percent in 30 years if we do 
not change course. 

Just as every family is expected to 
balance their budget, so, too, should 
the Federal Government. This is about 
taking responsibility and making 
tough decisions, exactly what our con-
stituents elected us to do. 

A balanced budget amendment will 
compel Congress to walk the walk, not 
just talk the talk, when it comes to 
being responsible stewards of taxpayer 
dollars. I hope my colleagues on both 
sides of aisle will support this bill. 

f 

ISSUES OF THE DAY 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. Under 
the Speaker’s announced policy of Jan-
uary 3, 2017, the gentleman from Iowa 
(Mr. KING) is recognized for 60 minutes 
as the designee of the majority leader. 

Mr. KING of Iowa. Mr. Speaker, it is 
my honor and privilege to address you 
here on the floor of the United States 
House of Representatives and have an 
opportunity, in this great deliberative 
body, to bring up the subject matters 
of my choice, and the purpose is to in-
form you and the American people. 

Before I go into the topics that I am 
prepared to speak of, I yield to the gen-
tleman from Pennsylvania (Mr. 
ROTHFUS). 

MEANINGFUL ACCOMPLISHMENTS OF THE 115TH 
CONGRESS 

Mr. ROTHFUS. Mr. Speaker, I thank 
the gentleman for kindly yielding and 
allowing me to take a few minutes to 
have a little bit of reflection with the 
American people as we head into the 
Fourth of July weekend. 

Mr. Speaker, despite widespread cyn-
icism from Washington elites and those 
in the media, the 115th Congress and 
President Trump have taken meaning-
ful action over the past 6 months to 
improve the lives of hardworking 
Americans. 

According to a recent analysis, this 
Congress has been the most productive 
in the modern era. By June 8, we had 
passed 158 bills, compared to the 60 
bills by the 103rd Congress under Bill 
Clinton, 67 bills by the 107th Congress 
under President Bush, and 131 bills by 
the 111th Congress under President 
Obama. 

President Trump has signed 39 bills 
into law, including 14 bills passed 
under the Congressional Review Act, 
stopping harmful regulations handed 
down by the previous administration. 
According to one analysis, repealing 
these rules could save the economy 
millions of hours of paperwork, nearly 
$4 billion in regulatory costs to the 

Federal agencies, and an astounding 
$35 billion in regulatory costs for the 
private sector. 

We sent to the President, and he 
signed, legislation to bring account-
ability to the Veterans Administra-
tion. And the House has acted to stop 
ObamaCare’s job and freedom-crushing 
mandates, and acted to put a critical 
safety net program on a sustainable 
path. 

The House also voted to repeal and 
replace Washington’s Financial Con-
trol Law, Dodd-Frank, to get capital 
flowing to our small businesses and to 
improve choices for consumers. 

The past 6 months have been a strong 
start, and I look forward to the House 
continuing its work to advance impor-
tant goals of strengthening our econ-
omy and creating jobs. 

CELEBRATING OUR NATION’S BIRTHDAY 
Mr. ROTHFUS. Mr. Speaker, every 

year at this time, our Nation cele-
brates our birthday. It is the perfect 
time to reflect on the founding of our 
country and the principles that made 
our Nation exceptional. 

b 1800 

At the height of the Cold War with 
the Soviet Union, President Kennedy, 
in his inaugural address, reflected on 
our founding principles. 

JFK said: ‘‘And yet the same revolu-
tionary beliefs for which our forebears 
fought are still at issue around the 
globe—the belief that the rights of man 
come not from the generosity of the 
State, but from the hand of God.’’ 

President Kennedy understood the 
words of our Declaration of Independ-
ence: ‘‘We hold these truths to be self- 
evident, that all men are created equal, 
that they are endowed by their Creator 
with certain unalienable rights, that 
among these are life, liberty, and the 
pursuit of happiness.’’ 

A little more than 100 years before 
President Kennedy’s inauguration, our 
16th President, Abraham Lincoln, de-
fended the Declaration and taught all 
those around him, as well as future 
generations, how to revere and em-
brace unwaveringly the sacred and 
transcendent truths expressed in this 
monumental document. 

Lincoln said in 1858: ‘‘Now, my coun-
trymen, if you have been taught doc-
trines conflicting with the great land-
marks of the Declaration of Independ-
ence, if you have listened to sugges-
tions which would take away from its 
grandeur, and mutilate the fair sym-
metry of its proportions; if you have 
been inclined to believe that all men 
are not created equal in those inalien-
able rights enumerated by our chart of 
liberty, let me entreat you to come 
back. Think nothing of me, take no 
thought for the political fate of any 
man whomsoever, but come back to the 
truths that are in the Declaration of 
Independence. You may do anything 
with me you choose, if you will but 
heed these sacred principles.’’ 

Today, Mr. Speaker, let us recommit 
to the principles set forth in our Dec-

laration, that all are endowed by your 
Creator with certain unalienable 
rights, among them the right to life, 
liberty, and the pursuit of happiness. 
And let those who have admired the 
leaders of our country who have re-
asserted these principles, from Lincoln 
to Kennedy, join together and continue 
to fight for the protection of these 
God-given rights, especially the first 
right, ‘‘the right to life.’’ 

Mr. Speaker, I thank you for allow-
ing me this opportunity to speak. I 
thank the gentleman from Iowa for 
having extended to me this oppor-
tunity to share these thoughts with the 
American people. 

Mr. KING of Iowa. I thank the gen-
tleman from Pennsylvania for his pres-
entation in bringing this topic together 
in a way that he has. And in his meth-
od of addressing the Declaration of 
Independence on the right to life, lib-
erty, and the pursuit of happiness, I 
would expound on that as well. 

Life is the most paramount. It is a 
priority right, and our Founding Fa-
thers knew what they were doing. They 
set up life as the first priority, liberty 
as the second priority, and the third 
priority was the pursuit of happiness. 

Mr. Speaker, I will start from the 
bottom because, of the three, I think it 
deserves the most explanation. That 
pursuit of happiness is often viewed as 
maybe a fun tailgate party or a bliss of 
some kind or maybe a barbecue out-
doors with the family, the things that 
we love. That is the enjoyment of our 
life. 

The pursuit of happiness, as it was 
understood by our Founding Fathers, 
came from the Greek word 
‘‘eudaimonia.’’ And that is spelled, E- 
U-D-A-I-M-O-N-I-A. And under the 
Greek word ‘‘eudaimonia,’’ it means 
developing the whole human being. 
And it is not just the mental well- 
being, but it is developing the intellec-
tual human being, the physical human 
being, the knowledge base that is 
there, and the spirit within us, and our 
theology and our souls—the whole 
package of what we are as human 
beings, developing that to the max-
imum, these God-given gifts, devel-
oping them for his glorification, and 
that is the concept of the pursuit of 
happiness that our Founding Fathers 
understood. 

So the principle is that we have a 
right to pursue happiness, developing 
our whole human being, which includes 
the human enjoyment that we think of 
when we say pursuit of happiness. 

But no one in their pursuit of happi-
ness can trample on someone else’s lib-
erty because liberties are God-given. 
And the liberties that we have cannot 
be subordinate to the pursuit of happi-
ness, but they are subordinate to the 
life of others because life is the most 
sacred. 

Human life is sacred in all of its 
forms. It is the number one paramount 
right. So the protection of human life 
is the principle and is the highest pri-
ority in the Declaration of Independ-
ence. 
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And the liberties that we have—free-

dom of speech, religion, the press, the 
right to keep and bear arms, a jury of 
our peers, no double jeopardy, the 
whole list in the Bill of Rights—those 
are God-given liberties, as conceived by 
our Founding Fathers and enshrined in 
the Bill of Rights, and, of course, in 
our Constitution. 

The rights that we have cannot be 
trampled upon or subordinated to 
someone else’s pursuit of happiness. 
Life, liberty, the pursuit of happiness, 
a well-thought-out, prioritized list in 
our Declaration that gives us the inspi-
ration that was the foundation for our 
Constitution and the principles of our 
lives in America today. 

So I thank the gentleman from Penn-
sylvania for his explanation of this and 
for giving me an opportunity to flesh 
this out a little bit in the concepts of 
life, liberty, and the pursuit of happi-
ness. 

But the segue that he has served up 
to me is this: that our debates today 
here in this Congress on the immigra-
tion bills that have now just passed the 
Congress have been focused on the 
right to life—the right to life versus 
the criminals that took the liberty to 
take them. They have violated the very 
foundations of our Declaration, and, of 
course, they violated our laws in a 
number of ways. 

But I think, especially, of the onset 
of this discussion, and I think of Sarah 
Root. And her legislation that is 
Sarah’s Law was introduced by me in 
this Congress. I have a copy of this bill 
today. We introduced it last year also, 
but in this Congress, it became H.R. 
174, and it came about, and then we in-
corporated it into the broader bill 
today that we call the sanctuary cities 
legislation, Mr. Speaker. 

Sarah Root had just graduated from 
Bellevue University in Omaha. Her 
hometown is Modale, Iowa. She had 
just finished her graduation the day be-
fore with a perfect 4.0 grade point aver-
age, and her major was in criminal in-
vestigation. She would, today, be in-
vestigating criminals if it hadn’t been 
for the criminal that killed her the day 
after she graduated. 

And the individual who is responsible 
here, Eswin Mejia, who ran her over, 
ran into her vehicle on the streets with 
triple the blood alcohol content that is 
legal. Eswin Mejia was on a first-name 
basis with at least two of his immigra-
tion attorneys. When he was taken into 
custody, interestingly, as bad as the 
accident was, Sarah was rendered un-
recognizable and she was on life sup-
port for a little while while the parents 
were deciding what decision to make. 

And she was also an organ donor. 
Sarah saved six. And many days I wear 
this bracelet that says, ‘‘Sarah Root 
saved six.’’ And this bracelet hangs on 
the antlers in my man cave. And when 
I walk down there in the morning, I 
often say a prayer for all of those 
bracelets that are hung on the antlers 
in my man cave that represent those 
individuals whose lives have been lost 

at the hands of criminal aliens who 
were unlawfully present in the United 
States and perpetrated violence 
against generally American citizens 
but others that are generally those 
that are at least lawfully present in 
America. 

Sarah Root was one of those victims, 
a stellar young lady with a 4.0 grade 
point average and a fresh diploma from 
Bellevue University; her whole life and 
a world ahead of her, and run down on 
the streets. 

Her father came to testify here in the 
Judiciary Committee in Congress, and 
he said: ‘‘The judge bailed Eswin Mejia, 
this perpetrator, out of jail for less 
money than it cost to marry my 
daughter, and he was back home in his 
home country before we could bury my 
daughter.’’ 

Those were some of the most power-
ful and moving and memorable words 
that I have heard in my time here in 
Congress. We think Eswin Mejia went 
back to Honduras, his home country. 
He had been incarcerated before. He 
had been encountered by law enforce-
ment before, and they turned him loose 
on the streets. 

This happens again and again in 
America every day, local law enforce-
ment picking up people that are unlaw-
fully present in America, violating our 
immigration laws. The law requires 
that they be placed into removal pro-
ceedings. That is the law, but they turn 
them loose anyway and turn them out 
on the streets because we have sanc-
tuary cities and sanctuary cities poli-
cies. Some local jurisdictions that 
don’t have a written policy, but they 
just simply—it is a practice that they 
have evolved into accepting. 

So when I say every one of the Amer-
icans who died at the hands of someone 
who is unlawfully present in America, 
illegal aliens, generally speaking, 
every one of those are a preventable 
death. If we enforced the law, they 
wouldn’t have been in America in the 
first place to commit the crimes they 
committed against our American citi-
zens, our innocent people like Sarah 
Root, this beautiful young lady with a 
perfect grade point average, the world 
ahead of her, a happy, joyful young 
lady that, today, would be living, lov-
ing, laughing, and learning and con-
tributing to our society. But she is in 
her grave today because Eswin Mejia 
got triple drunk, was unlawfully in the 
United States, and ran her car down 
and killed her on the streets and ab-
sconded for a $5,000 bond. 

What we did with Sarah’s Law—this 
is H.R. 174, the original language—and 
I wanted to assure the family of Sarah 
Root that this language is incorporated 
into the bill we passed today. It is in-
corporated into sanctuary cities legis-
lation that we passed today. And what 
it does is it prohibits the judge from re-
leasing an illegal alien on bond if they 
have been charged with or subject to a 
homicide or a crime where there is se-
rious bodily injury. 

Once this issue came up in Omaha, 
Nebraska, and the public knew about 

this, we tried to unseat the judge that 
released this criminal that may have 
done damage again. But the judge that 
had let him out on $5,000 had a similar 
case. The next time, the bond went way 
up into six or even seven figures. So I 
think he got the message, but the pub-
lic got the message, too. 

And I don’t know whether he will be 
able to hold his seat or not, but we 
have got to bring the right things. We 
have got to put the fixes in place. You 
would think we would have a judge 
that would understand this, yet, some-
how in the political culture of Amer-
ica, we are watching criminal aliens be 
turned loose on the streets over and 
over again. 

I recall, Mr. Speaker, sitting in on 
immigration hearings in the Judiciary 
Committee. This is over a number of 
years now, and I suppose there are a 
couple of people in this Congress that 
have sat through more, not many. The 
witnesses would be—every week or so 
we would have a hearing and there 
would be witnesses that would testify 
about how many people died in the Ari-
zona desert trying to sneak into Amer-
ica. And that number would be 200 in a 
year, 250 in a year, maybe the next 
year it went to 300. I remember that 
number going to 400 or more who died 
in the Arizona desert on the way into 
trying to sneak into America. 

Finally, with this parade of witnesses 
that were experts on why we ought to 
open the border so they didn’t have a 
difficult time getting into America— 
that is the lunacy that we have heard 
in the debate today over on this side of 
the floor, from my view, Mr. Speaker. 

I began to ask the witnesses this 
question: You are an expert on immi-
gration and you have come to testify 
on how many didn’t make it through 
the desert. Could you tell me how 
many Americans died at the hands of 
those who did make it through the 
desert? 

And I would ask the witnesses—gen-
erally four witnesses—and they would 
go down the line: I don’t know the an-
swer; I don’t know the answer; I don’t 
know the answer. 

And that went on for a while. 
And the fourth witness in one of 

those days was a former INS agent, Mi-
chael Cutler. And we are just a few 
years after September 11, 2001, when I 
asked him this question: How many 
Americans died at the hands of those 
who made it through the desert? 

Which is the phrase to imply how 
many Americans died at the hands of 
those who were unlawfully present in 
America. 

And Michael Cutler’s answer was: I 
don’t know the answer to that, but I 
can tell you it is in multiples of the 
victims of September 11. 

Now, think of that. Three thousand 
Americans were killed that day. Mul-
tiples of that would be at least 6,000. If 
he is right—and he is confident he is 
right, and now I am confident he was 
right—that started me thinking. 
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So shortly after that, I commissioned 
a GAO study. That GAO study dug 
down deeply into the records that we 
had access to. 

It is hard to get this Congress to 
compare apples to apples, so I began to 
ask the questions: Of the people in the 
prisons of America, what are they in 
prison for? How many of them are 
criminal aliens? 

We did a report on that. They sliced 
and diced it and narrowed it down. It 
never actually became apples to apples, 
but it did come down to this substan-
tial number that has been supported a 
couple of other times in other studies, 
in one subsequent that I had done in 
2011. The number is very close to 28 
percent of the inmates in our Federal 
penitentiaries are criminal aliens—28 
percent. 

So it is reasonable to do a calcula-
tion and an extrapolation off of this, if 
28 percent of these inmates are crimi-
nal aliens, what percentage of the mur-
ders are they committing? What per-
centage of the rapes are they commit-
ting? What percentage of the violent 
crimes are they committing? Or are 
they in jail for just simply violating a 
law of immigration? You will find out 
very few are in prison for violation of 
immigration law. 

They are the reflection on criminal 
aliens. They are similar, a very simi-
lar, if not identical, proportion of the 
crimes that are committed by others. 

So when you put that on there and 
hit the calculator—I am not going to 
speak those numbers into the RECORD 
here, Mr. Speaker, because it is shock-
ing and stunning how many Americans 
have lost their lives at the hands of 
people who shouldn’t have been here in 
the first place—Sarah Root included, 
Kate Steinle included, and many more. 

A few days after Sarah Root was 
killed, I sent out a tweet that just said: 
Sarah Root would be alive living and 
loving life if the President had not vio-
lated his oath and ordered ICE to stand 
down. 

That is what happened during the 8- 
year period of time President Obama 
asserted that he had this thing called 
prosecutorial discretion. Now, that is 
something that is established in law, at 
least in precedent, but it has to be done 
on an individual basis, and he delivered 
it in a blanket basis. Janet Napolitano 
delivered the document. I questioned 
her on it in the committee. 

They decided that prosecutorial dis-
cretion can be defined. They created 
four categories of people and essen-
tially granted amnesty to all of them 
and turned them loose. They turned 
criminals loose on the streets in Amer-
ica—36,007 of them in one bunch. Some 
of them were murderers out on to the 
streets of America. 

You can see what happens to the 
crime in this country. If you are im-
porting people from the most violent 
countries in the world, and when they 
are encountered by law enforcement 
turning them loose, or if they are 

picked up for a taillight or speeding or 
getting in a fight or shoplifting, what-
ever the case may be, failure to signal, 
running a stoplight, they are picked up 
for that. 

When local law enforcement encoun-
ters them, they look at their identi-
fication. They ask them a few ques-
tions. It isn’t hard to figure out wheth-
er they are legal or not. Some are good 
enough liars. But any time that law en-
forcement encounters people unlaw-
fully present in America, they are to 
put them in removal proceedings, and 
ICE is to do it. Yet thousands have 
been turned loose on the streets. 

At least 300 cities in America have 
established sanctuary policies that 
they turn them loose. Some of the cit-
ies have passed policies that refuse to 
allow their law enforcement to even 
gather information or accept informa-
tion on illegal aliens that they encoun-
ter. 

So, for example, this is how bad it is 
even in a place like Iowa. One of my 
staff people who was involved in a car 
accident that was caused by an illegal 
alien who had no license and had no in-
surance but he did have an illegal job 
in the town where he caused the acci-
dent crashed into my staff and wrecked 
my staff’s car. 

So when I got the phone call on that, 
I turned to my then-chief of staff who 
is a lights-outs, University of Chicago 
School of Law lawyer. I said: I want 
you to go to this town and stay there 
until you can get this resolved. And I 
want to find out: What can we get ac-
complished to enforce the law? 

This was our opportunity to learn if 
a Member of Congress’ staff can be run 
into by an illegal alien without a driv-
er’s license and without insurance with 
an illegal job in town and owning a car, 
and I have a topnotch lawyer chief of 
staff to go up there and communicate 
with law enforcement to try to bring 
the law enforcement in place so we 
could at least deport the guy. 

After 3 or 4 days up there and a num-
ber of phone calls from me down here, 
I finally got the message back that fi-
nally convinced me we couldn’t crack 
through the code of local law enforce-
ment to be able to deport the indi-
vidual who was clearly illegal. He was 
unlawfully working—no driver’s license 
and no insurance. 

The practice of simply staying out of 
immigration law because they were 
local law enforcement and didn’t want 
to touch it was so ingrained that we 
could not move the bubble off the cen-
ter. 

Finally, I said: Okay, we have got 
other people to take care of. We are not 
going to get this solved, so let’s turn 
our focus back to other things. 

That is so very frustrating. I tell 
this, Mr. Speaker, to let the world 
know the frustration of families who 
had a loved one who was killed by 
illegals and watched them turned loose 
on the streets, and then have them ab-
scond and go back to their home coun-
try or go back into the shadows and 
hide. 

That is the thing that happened with 
Sarah Root. Today, we did honor to her 
and her life by passing Sarah’s Law as 
part of the sanctuary city law. How ut-
terly appropriate to bring a ban on 
sanctuary cities, to pass it off the floor 
of the House, and wrapped up in the 
same bill is Sarah’s Law to respect her; 
her life; the sacrifice of her life; the 
sacrifice of her mother, Michelle; her 
father, Scott; and her only sibling, her 
brother, Scotty, who carries the whole 
load now for the next generation—all 
of that. 

Finally, Congress did some justice for 
Sarah Root. It is only a small piece of 
justice. It is the least we can do, but it 
is the right thing for us to do. What her 
family wants is that no other families 
have to suffer like they have suffered. 

This is the story of Sarah Root whose 
name was elevated on the national 
stage by President Trump. As much as 
I push things out of this Congress, I 
don’t come close to having as big a 
megaphone as Donald Trump. So I 
want to thank the President of the 
United States for picking up the case 
of Sarah Root when he came to Iowa to 
campaign for the nomination of the 
Presidency of the United States. 

When he began to make his immigra-
tion cases and lay out the platform for 
his immigration policy, I noticed that 
it mirrored mine very closely. I men-
tioned to him one day: Mr. President, I 
have market tested your immigration 
policy for 14 years in Iowa. It shouldn’t 
have been a surprise that they under-
stand these issues. They support the 
rule of law, they support securing the 
border, they support building a wall, 
and they support banning sanctuary 
cities. That is not just Iowa values, 
that is at least heart of the heartland 
values. 

Those are American values—Amer-
ican values that want to live in a coun-
try that has the rule of law, a country 
where our children can be safe, and 
where they can play in the streets and 
they don’t have to be looking over the 
shoulder; or a mother or a father 
doesn’t have to keep them indoors be-
cause the streets are too dangerous. 

This morning, we have heard from 
Jamiel Shaw who has been in to this 
Congress and testified before my com-
mittee maybe as far as back as 8 or 9 
years ago. He is from Los Angeles. His 
son, who was a star football player, 
Jazz Shaw, was shot down and killed by 
an illegal alien gang member who went 
on the hunt that day with an assign-
ment, as I understood it, to go shoot a 
Black person. 

Jazz Shaw was murdered on the 
streets close enough to his father, 
Jamiel’s, house that his father said 
this morning on FOX News that he 
could hear the gun shots. He went out 
there to see his son laying on the 
street in the blood pooling in the 
street. A ghastly murder for the sake 
of what? A gang challenge and a race 
label. 

That would not be the case if that 
murderer had been deported back to his 
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country. It would not be the case if he 
came back in and we picked him up a 
second time. 

Under Kate’s Law, the killer of 
Jamiel Shaw’s son would not have been 
in America if we had had Kate’s Law 
and had enforced Kate’s Law because 
he had been encountered before and 
had been deported. 

This is the evil murderer, Juan Fran-
cisco Lopez-Sanchez. This is the beau-
tiful young lady, 32 years old, Kate 
Steinle, who was down on the wharf in 
San Francisco with her father enjoying 
a day and was simply shot down and 
killed for no reason and at random by 
this individual who had been five times 
deported and convicted of something 
like seven different felonies in this 
country. 

Under Kate’s Law, that jacks that 
penalty up. He would have been locked 
up for a good, long time if that law had 
been in place, or the sanctuary city 
legislation we passed today outlawing 
sanctuary cities. They would be turn-
ing over these kinds of criminals to 
ICE where they would get their just 
sentence in Federal penitentiary and 
then be deported. 

But even though we have these laws 
now passed, and if the Senate takes 
them up and passes them into law, the 
President will sign them. We are con-
fident of that. He asked that these bills 
be brought before the House of Rep-
resentatives as soon as possible. Of 
course, that was today. So if these acts 
that we passed today become law, then 
many Americans will be saved from the 
kind of carnage that we have heard 
about in case after case. 

When I saw the story come through 
of Kate Steinle, I looked at that. It was 
the most tragic story. Here is a clip of 
what I sent out that day. This is July 
3, 2015. It is a picture of Kate Steinle. 
The message in the tweet is: A 100 per-
cent preventable crime—dated July 3, 
as I said, 2015—100 percent preventable 
crime. Just enforce the law. This will 
make you cry, too, and it happens 
every day. Every day in America, there 
are Americans that die at the hand of 
illegal aliens. 

I recall the case in Cottonwood, Min-
nesota, where an illegal alien who had 
been encountered by law enforcement 
before and turned back on the streets 
of our country who didn’t have a driv-
er’s license, didn’t have insurance, and 
should have been deported at least once 
and probably more times than that ran 
a school bus off the road in southwest 
Minnesota. 

Four kids in that school bus were 
killed. Two of them were siblings. 
Three families lost children in that bus 
accident where the bus was run off the 
road by the illegal criminal alien. 

The dialogue that came from the 
left—the people that we heard debate 
over here today and voted against 
every one of these bills—was: this 
doesn’t have anything to do with ille-
gal immigration. It has got nothing to 
do with that. It is just the happen-
stance of life. In every society, there 

are car accidents, there are murders, 
there are rapes, there is assault, there 
is battery, and there is grand theft. 

Every society has that to some de-
gree, but every single victim of a 
criminal alien that is in deportable 
category is a preventable crime. I have 
made that case over and over again for 
years, Mr. Speaker. But I made the 
point. They will say that it was just an 
accident, it was happenstance, and it 
has nothing to do with immigration. 

My district director looked at me. He 
is a mild-mannered, soft-spoken, and 
judicious kind of a person. He said: If 
they believe that, if they say that, 
then you say to them: then you go up 
there to Cottonwood, Minnesota, and 
tell their parents that their children 
would still be dead if we had deported 
the illegal that ran the bus off the 
road. 

That hits home to me, too, Mr. 
Speaker. It rings so true. Any family 
that is suffering the loss of a loved 
one—the Steinle family, the Root fam-
ily, and so many other families, the 
families in Cottonwood, Minnesota, the 
families in Omaha, and the families 
around in my district—those families 
know that if he had enforced the law 
then their child or their husband would 
still be alive. 

So as part of the sanctuary city leg-
islation that we moved through here 
today, and as in Kate’s Law just 
passed—I need to make sure that I 
state that—and in Sarah’s, they would 
both be alive today living, loving, 
laughing, learning, contributing to our 
society, sharing joy, and giving joy. 

There is another case that I have just 
picked up. A teen charged in an Iowa 
woman’s death may have fled the coun-
try. Authorities say a teenager who 
was at the wheel of a car that was in-
volved in a crash in Omaha last month 
that killed an Iowa woman—that is 
Sarah—has missed a court hearing and 
may have fled the country. 

Well, that is a little memo that says: 
He absconded, we think, to Honduras. 
He may be living in the shadows. 

Here is another story, and that is ad-
dressed, Mr. Speaker, by legislation 
that was brought by ANDY BIGGS of Ar-
izona. I thank him for advancing this 
legislation, also. 

This is the story of Grant Ronnebeck. 
He was 21 years old. He was gunned 
down in January of 2015, while working 
at a QuickTrip in Mesa, Arizona. The 
man charged with killing him, 
Apolinar Altamirano, was 29 years old, 
in the country illegally, and had been 
released by Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement even though he had pre-
viously been convicted of a felony bur-
glary charge. 

Now, why are we turning people loose 
in the streets of America to walk the 
streets again when they were deport-
able before they committed the felony 
burglary charge, convicted of a felony 
burglary charge, and then turn them 
loose again? Does the judge decide that 
somehow he has a right to be in Amer-
ica? That is a clear deportation re-
quirement. 

I recall when we had John Ashcroft 
as the Attorney General. He testified 
before the committee that when they 
released criminal aliens on to the 
streets without bond with a date set for 
a hearing, 84 percent of them didn’t 
show up. 

b 1830 

And that was before President Obama 
sent the message that it didn’t matter. 
Those numbers have gone up, not 
down. 

Here is another one. This was just an-
other ghastly, tragic story that hap-
pened in Omaha. Louise Sollowin died 
in July of 2013. Three days after the at-
tack in her home, according to Omaha 
police, an officer sent to the south 
Omaha house Sollowin had lived in for 
71 years found her body covered in 
blood in her bedroom about 9 a.m. 

The officer said Sergio Martinez- 
Perez, 19—I am going to skip some of 
this, because it is too nasty to put into 
the CONGRESSIONAL RECORD—was 
passed out there, having raped the 93- 
year-old woman. Authorities believed 
that Martinez-Perez entered the home 
through an unlocked door. He, too, was 
an illegal alien who had been encoun-
tered by law enforcement and was re-
leased and went out to rape and mur-
der. 

So when the President said that we 
have people who do these things among 
those who have come from some of 
those countries, that is clearly true. A 
lot of good people also, but we need to 
have the rule of law. We need to en-
force the rule of law. 

And when they are coming from 
these other countries that have corrup-
tion but don’t have the benefit of the 
rule of law and the respect for the law 
that we have, they are importing those 
low standards in here. 

We must sustain the rule of law, re-
store the respect for the rule of law. If 
we do that, we will sustain ourselves as 
a First World country. If we fail to do 
so, if we lose the rule of law, then we 
will devolve into a Third World coun-
try eventually. The core of this from 
the beginning for me, Mr. Speaker, has 
always been to restore the respect for 
the rule of law. 

Ronald Reagan signed the amnesty 
act in 1986. I give him credit for at 
least naming it—calling it what it was, 
an amnesty act. It was a reward for law 
breakers. The cabinet around him en-
couraged him to sign the amnesty act. 

Me, you know, I kicked my filing 
cabinet the day I heard on the news 
that he had signed it, and I kicked a 
dent in it because—well, out of frustra-
tion was why. 

But I believe Ronald Reagan would 
see with clarity that you can’t reward 
law breakers and think that somehow 
you are going to be able to put that be-
hind you and that the law will be en-
forced and respected from that point 
forward. 

There were to be a million people 
that received amnesty in 1986. Ronald 
Reagan signed the amnesty act, and it 
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became 3 million people because they 
probably counted a little wrong, and 
there was a lot of fraud, a lot of people 
who presented themselves and alleged 
that they were to be included. This was 
a faster track to citizenship for them. 

Three million people received am-
nesty in 1986, and I said then that none 
of them should have, that they should 
not be rewarded for breaking the law. 
Yet they got their amnesty. 

The signature that Ronald Reagan 
put on that amnesty legislation was 
supposed to be in exchange for enforce-
ment of the law, but the law didn’t get 
enforced. The amnesty was delivered 
triple what was expected. And I knew 
then that we would have a long, hard 
slog restoring the respect for the rule 
of law, but I have set about doing that 
since that period of time. 

More than 30 years later, we are here 
on the floor strengthening the rule of 
law after all this time, after the am-
nesty that has been advocated by oth-
ers. 

Each decade we seem to have to have 
a battle. They want to come with what 
they now call comprehensive immigra-
tion reform. Just about anybody in 
America knows if you say ‘‘comprehen-
sive immigration reform,’’ you really 
mean amnesty. 

I say to them: Just be honest. If you 
think amnesty is a good idea, why do 
you say all those three words when you 
can say ‘‘amnesty’’ and be honest? Peo-
ple know what you mean. If the public 
is ready for amnesty, then you can pass 
it. If we are not, you can’t. 

The American people understand this 
intuitively, that we have got to stop 
the law-breaking and that we cannot 
be rewarding those who break the law. 

Now, there are those who think that 
we should somehow find a path of am-
nesty for those individuals identified 
unconstitutionally by Barack Obama 
in his DACA program—Deferred Action 
for Childhood Arrivals. They aren’t all 
innocent little waifs who have been 
brought in by their mother against 
their will, as many would say. Instead, 
many of them are prime gang-age re-
cruitment, young men. 

I have gone down there and watched 
that flow of epic humanity coming out 
of Central America, coming through 
Mexico, some from Mexico—a dimin-
ishing number from Mexico—coming 
into the United States. The numbers 
we looked at were 81 percent male. And 
if they are under 18, they are coming 
on their own—if they are 14, 15, 16 or 17 
years old. And they don’t always tell 
you the truth either, Mr. Speaker. 

So this large group of people are 
prime gang-age recruitment youth. 
And these youth are coming from some 
of the most violent countries in the 
world. And 11 of the 13 most violent 
countries in the world are south of the 
Rio Grande, and one of those countries 
is not Mexico. So when they come into 
America, they bring with them the vio-
lence and the culture that is part of it, 
and we can expect our crime rates to 
go up. 

The people from the inner cities, who 
generally sit over on that side of this 
Congress, want to get them out of 
places like El Salvador and Guatemala 
and put them into the inner cities, in 
places like east St. Louis and Detroit 
and Newark, and a number of other cit-
ies where the violent crime rate is very 
high, to get them away from the vio-
lence that is part of their neighbor-
hood. I would submit, Mr. Speaker, 
that we may be putting them into 
neighborhoods that are more dangerous 
than the countries that they come 
from, but we don’t log those crime sta-
tistics very clearly because it is so sen-
sitive to the people in the inner city, 
they don’t want to talk about it. 

So crime has been pervasive in these 
countries. They are sending young men 
especially that are prime gang-age re-
cruitment. They are being recruited to 
MS–13. Judge Jeanine Pirro said the 
other day that 30 percent of them be-
come MS–13 members. 

Mr. Speaker, let me inquire, if I 
could, the amount of time I have re-
maining. 

The SPEAKER pro tempore. The gen-
tleman has 20 minutes remaining. 

Mr. KING of Iowa. Mr. Speaker, I ap-
preciate that response. 

I wanted to roll through what our 
sanctuary cities legislation does that 
we just passed today, and it goes a 
pretty good, long, comprehensive way. 

I pointed out that I brought the first 
sanctuary cities legislation into this 
Congress that I could find a record of. 
It was in 2005 when I brought an 
amendment through the Homeland Se-
curity appropriations to cut all funding 
to sanctuary cities. 2005. And then 
along the way, each opportunity that 
was there, I brought an amendment to 
cut off funding to sanctuary cities. 
Most of the time it was in the Judici-
ary, the justice appropriations bill. 
And I see a number of them here scat-
tered in my memo that I asked staff to 
put together. 

So as far back as 12 years ago, I have 
been working to end Federal funding 
going to sanctuary cities that defy 
local law enforcement. And we have 
gotten resistance from the other side of 
the aisle consistently. Barack Obama 
was never going to sign anything like 
that, but I kept beating the drum every 
year to cut off funding to sanctuary 
cities. 

Finally, I introduced the legislation 
on sanctuary cities in 2015, and then 
again at the beginning of this Con-
gress. And Chairman BOB GOODLATTE 
was gracious enough to pull that to-
gether so we could bring it to the floor 
today. And we have had a lot of co-
operation from many others on this. 

I see the first date I introduced the 
sanctuary cities legislation as a stand-
alone bill was November 4 of 2015, and 
here we are today finally passing it. 

I thought I had been at it for a long 
time, Mr. Speaker, and it added up to 
12 years that I have been actively en-
gaged, at least—maybe 14—until I 
talked to Congressman LOU BARLETTA 

from Hazleton, Pennsylvania, who, as a 
mayor in 1999, began to raise the issue 
and made it a national issue. He was 
selected to this Congress. He has been 
at it 18 years. Others have been at this 
a long time, too. 

So many of us are grateful today 
that the sanctuary cities language has 
passed and that Sarah’s Law, Kate’s 
Law, all of that that I was able to in-
troduce into this Congress has passed 
out of the House of Representatives 
and messaged to the Senate. And I 
hope the Senate picks it up. 

The sanctuary cities language does 
this: 

It bans their policies, for starters, 
Mr. Speaker. 

It blocks the Department of Justice 
grants to the sanctuary cities that defy 
Federal law and refuse to cooperate 
with Federal law enforcement on im-
migration. And those grants would be 
generally grants that have to do with 
law enforcement that would be effected 
by DOJ. 

It allows the Department of Home-
land Security to refuse warrants from 
the sanctuary cities. The sanctuary 
cities might serve a warrant to some-
one in custody, and DHS can say: We 
are not going to hand this person over 
to you because we are pretty confident 
you are just going to turn them loose 
on the streets. 

So that piece in there is a protection 
that keeps some from being released. 

And then it requires ICE to take cus-
tody of these criminal aliens within 48 
hours of the notice that comes from 
the State or local government that 
would have them picked up. 

It also establishes a good faith provi-
sion that holds local government harm-
less for honoring ICE detainers. 

Now, that is something that was un-
dermined on February 25 of 2015 by 
then-Acting Director of ICE, Dan 
Ragsdale, who sent a letter out that 
just simply advised local law enforce-
ment that an ICE detainer is a sugges-
tion, not an order. 

Well, the law and the rule says that 
it is an order, not a suggestion. This 
statute clarifies it and firms it up with 
respect to detainers. 

And then if a local jurisdiction is 
sued by, say, the ACLU, as they are 
wont to do, it gives them a protection, 
and it lets the Department of Justice 
and the Federal Government substitute 
itself for local government, and it 
holds local government harmless when 
it comes to the case of ICE detainers. 

Here is a very powerful piece, Mr. 
Speaker, and it is this: the sanctuary 
cities legislation passed today, H.R. 
3003, provides a cause of action against 
any jurisdiction that releases an alien 
who subsequently commits a felony. 

Now, that is a powerful provision, 
and it is something that moves me in 
my heart. As a former crime victim, it 
occurred to me when they announced 
the name of the case that I wasn’t in-
volved in that equation at all even 
though it nearly destroyed my busi-
ness, and I began to think about how 
this is. 
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Our criminal law comes from old 

England. And in old England, if you 
committed a crime—the king owned 
everything. If you killed one of his serf, 
you killed the king’s serf. That was the 
murder that took place. If you shot a 
deer, you shot the king’s deer. If you 
stole something, it was a violation 
against the crown. 

And we transferred the criminal law 
into America, and the State has re-
placed the crown. So when you commit 
a crime, that crime is committed 
against the State as if you had killed 
one of the king’s deer, but it doesn’t 
consider the victim hardly at all. We 
are doing a little better in recent 
years, but this allows the crime vic-
tims to have a recourse, Mr. Speaker. 
And I think we will hear a lot about 
this provision in the sanctuary cities 
law as this moves over to the Senate. 

I think we made a lot of progress 
today. It has been a good day to do 
honor to the lives of Sarah Root, a 
beautiful young lady whose mother is 
here in this Capital City today and 
speaking and testifying and doing radio 
and meetings. 

And one day I hope we hunt down 
Eswin Mejia, the killer of this beau-
tiful young woman. And one day I hope 
we have the relationship with his home 
country where they will hunt him down 
and extradite him to the United States 
of America. That is, of course, a law we 
need to have in a civilized world. 

And Kate Steinle, I thank not only 
Matt Salmon for bringing this forward, 
but Bill O’Reilly and the President of 
the United States. 

Something this President has done is 
he asked the family members of the 
victims of criminal aliens in America 
to step up on the stage with him 
around the campaign trail over and 
over again. One would think that they 
were props for a campaign. That kind 
of criticism flowed out. But here is 
what he has really done: he illuminated 
the pain that they went through over 
and over again. When he came back to 
Iowa on a ‘‘thank you’’ tour, he had 
some of the crime victims there. He 
brought them up on the stage. You can 
tell by the look in his eye that they 
moved him. 

He has said the thing that moved him 
the most in the entire campaign were 
the families who had an illegal kill 
their daughter, their son, their family 
member. That moved him the most. He 
has done honor to that. 

He has asked that we bring this legis-
lation to the floor. We have done so. 
We have passed it out of the House. 

And the President, yesterday, met 
with a dozen or so of these families at 
the White House. He will continue to 
push this legislation till it becomes 
law. And I expect at the bill signing 
ceremony, these families will be in-
vited back to the White House and they 
will get a closure on the pain that they 
are going through this day. 

Mr. Speaker, I yield back the balance 
of my time. 

b 1845 

HONORING WILBERT AUSTIN 

The SPEAKER pro tempore (Mr. 
JOHNSON of Louisiana). Under the 
Speaker’s announced policy of January 
3, 2017, the gentleman from Texas (Mr. 
FLORES) is recognized for the remain-
der of the hour as the designee of the 
majority leader. 

Mr. FLORES. Mr. Speaker, today, I 
rise to honor Reverend Wilbert Austin 
of Waco, Texas, who passed away on 
June 19, 2017. 

Wilbert grew up poor in a small 
shack in the southern part of Waco in 
a racially segregated area called 
Sandtown. His father was a day laborer 
who picked cotton for a living, while 
his mother was a laundress and cafe 
worker. Wilbert used to play by the old 
rendering plant that was next to the 
cemetery in Sandtown. 

Even in their poverty, Wilbert’s par-
ents were able to raise five children. 
His meager upbringing is something 
that would shape him for the rest of his 
life and molded him into a great serv-
ant. 

During his life, Wilbert worked many 
jobs, including working for a glass bot-
tle manufacturer, Owens-Illinois, and 
as a leader of the local chapter of the 
NAACP. During his time at the 
NAACP, he was known for advocating 
for civil rights in Waco. Always seek-
ing to make Waco a better place, he 
would often make sure that children 
and families had a safe area to play and 
enjoy by keeping out drug dealers, 
doing so on a face-to-face basis, if need-
ed. 

Wilbert was a passionate advocate for 
his Christian faith and decided to share 
his faith in the pulpit. He became a 
pastor of Moody’s Peaceful Rest Bap-
tist Church, where he would serve for 
38 years. He was known to his con-
gregation and around Waco as someone 
with a servant’s heart. Wilbert would 
mow lawns for the elderly and collect 
gift cards at Christmas to distribute to 
needy families. 

In 1974, Wilbert led an effort to 
change local city government, and that 
made him an important part of Waco’s 
history. 

In the 1950s, the city had adopted an 
at-large district after an African- 
American individual nearly won a city 
council seat. As a result of his tireless 
and dedicated efforts, Waco dropped 
the at-large system and divided its city 
into five districts, with each district 
having a single elected representative. 
His perseverance changed the at-large 
system because it did not fairly rep-
resent the electoral choices of the Afri-
can-American areas of Waco. 

Though he never believed he would 
run for city council, Wilbert’s desire to 
serve eventually led him to campaign 
for a seat. Wilbert showed great perse-
verance as he ran for city council five 
times, ultimately winning a seat in 
2006. 

He went on to serve as the council-
man for District One for 11 years before 

having to step down earlier this year 
due to declining health. Today’s Waco 
is a diverse and inclusive city because 
of his community service. 

Wilbert was also a devoted and loving 
husband to his late wife of 50 years, 
Annie Pearl Austin, who passed away 
from breast cancer in 2012. Annie was 
supportive of her husband’s efforts to 
help Waco and would often tell her 
children: ‘‘No matter what or why he’s 
out in the public, always love your dad 
and support him.’’ They were blessed 
with 5 children, and they were the 
grandparents to 10 grandchildren. 

During the last years of his life, 
Wilbert fought a battle with cancer 
that he ultimately lost. Throughout 
his battle, he never lost sight of where 
he was going. In a farewell address at 
his retirement party, Wilbert stated: 
‘‘I’m all packed up. When you hear of 
my passing, don’t grieve for me. I’m 
just another soldier going home to be 
with the Lord.’’ 

Mr. Speaker, Wilbert Austin worked 
tirelessly to better our central Texas 
community and did so by serving his 
congregation, his community, reducing 
crime, and serving in elected office. 

He is loved by our community and 
certainly left an enduring impression 
on the greater Waco area. He will for-
ever be remembered as a community 
leader, pastor, civil rights activist, 
servant, husband, father, grandfather, 
and friend. 

My wife, Gina, and I offer our deepest 
and heartfelt condolences to the Austin 
family. We also lift up the family and 
friends of Wilbert in our prayers. 

I have requested that a United States 
flag be flown over the United States 
Capitol to honor the life and legacy of 
Reverend Wilbert Austin. 

As I close today, I urge all Americans 
to continue praying for our country 
during these difficult times, for our 
military men and women who protect 
us from external threats, and for our 
first responders who protect us here at 
home. 

HONORING GENERAL JOE HANOVER 
Mr. FLORES. Mr. Speaker, I rise 

today to honor General Joe Hanover of 
Woodway, Texas, who passed away on 
May 22, 2017. 

Joe was born in McGregor, Texas, on 
February 10, 1918. He grew up in a farm-
ing community and attended grade 
school in Wheelock before graduating 
from Franklin High School in 1938. 

Wheelock was a special place to Joe 
because it is where he met the love of 
his life, Lucille, in the first grade. 

During his high school years in 
Franklin, Joe became interested in en-
gineering, an interest that would guide 
much of the rest of his life. Upon grad-
uation from high school, Joe went to 
Texas A&M University in College Sta-
tion, where he would go on to earn a 
bachelor of civil engineering degree in 
1940. In 1941, he married Lucille and 
started his engineering career by work-
ing for the Texas Highway Department 
in Hearne. 

World War II interrupted Joe’s early 
career and family life, as he was called 
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