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the 23rd Judicial District, which includes Roa-
noke, Roanoke County, and Salem. He served 
on the bench for more than a decade before 
retiring in 1996. 

Like many that he met over the years, we 
will remember Judge Apostolou as a fine man 
and a very fair judge. We thank him for his 
service to our country in the United States 
Army and to the Roanoke community in the 
courtroom. We offer our condolences to his 
wife of 43 years, Brenda, as well as their chil-
dren, Cynthia, Laura, and Jay, and four grand-
children. Our prayers are with the Apostolou 
family as they mourn this loss. May God give 
them comfort and peace. 
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RECOGNIZING THE LIFE OF CIVIL-
IAN CONTRACTOR CARL T. CAR-
ROLL 

HON. TRENT KELLY 
OF MISSISSIPPI 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Thursday, September 7, 2017 

Mr. KELLY of Mississippi. Mr. Speaker, 
today I rise in memory of fallen civilian con-
tractor Carl T. Carroll who gave his life while 
in service to our great nation on August 20, 
2005, during Operation Iraqi Freedom. Mr. 
Carroll died from injuries he suffered during a 
roadside attack in Iraq. Mr. Carroll was in Iraq 
for six months working for the Titan Corpora-
tion, where he was the Kalsu Site Manager 
with the linguist operation. Through his obit-
uary, Mr. Carroll, a U.S. Army Veteran, was 
remembered by his colleagues at Titan as a 
man of conviction, character, and integrity. 

Mr. Carroll retired in 2000 from Fort 
Indiantown Gap, Pennsylvania as a helicopter 
pilot instructor, earning the rank of Chief War-
rant Officer 4. He worked as a helicopter pilot 
for Geisinger Medical Center, Danville until he 
joined the Titan Corporation. 

Mr. Carroll was a member of the 
Williamstown United Methodist Church, life 
member of the American Legion, and a life 
member of the National Rifle Association 
(NRA). He also served as a volunteer with the 
Williamstown Ambulance Association in 
Williamstown, Pennsylvania. 

The Dimon Funeral Home’s online condo-
lences page included a comment from a 
former coworker. ‘‘I was impressed with Carl 
as a true gentleman the very first time we 
met,’’ Robert Humphries wrote. ‘‘Even for 
those of us who knew Carl for only a short 
time, his passing leaves us all at a loss.’’ Mr. 
Carroll was also remembered in a post written 
by a fellow veteran. ‘‘I knew Carl for a short 
time as we served together at the Eastern 
Army National Guard Training site,’’ retired 
Master Sergeant (MSG) Robert Humphries 
wrote. ‘‘I knew him to be a man of strong 
moral conviction and dedication to not only 
duty, but to his fellow man.’’ 

Mr. Carroll was buried with full military hon-
ors at Williamstown Methodist Cemetery in 
Williamstown, Pennsylvania. 

Mr. Carroll is survived by his wife, Karen L. 
Hay Carroll; his daughter, Brandy M. Carroll- 
Duncannon; his two sons, Jason Carroll, and 
Justin R. Welker; and his brothers, David Car-
roll and Brian Carroll. 

Mr. Carroll’s service to our country will al-
ways be remembered. 

IN HONOR OF TOM WAGNER, SU-
PERVISOR OF THE WHITE MOUN-
TAIN NATIONAL FOREST 
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OF NEW HAMPSHIRE 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
Thursday, September 7, 2017 

Ms. KUSTER of New Hampshire. Mr. 
Speaker, I rise today to honor Tom Wagner as 
he retires after 15 years supervising the White 
Mountain National Forest and nearly four dec-
ades with the United States Forest Service. 
We are grateful for his dedication to protecting 
one of New Hampshire’s most prized assets: 
the White Mountains. Through his excellent 
stewardship of over three-quarters of a million 
acres that comprise the forest, he has ensured 
that all will continue to be able to enjoy this 
national treasure. In so doing, he also im-
proved the lives of thousands in the Granite 
State who rely on the White Mountains for 
both their livelihoods and recreation. 

I want to applaud Tom for his leadership 
and advocacy. Dunng his tenure, Tom 
oversaw the acquisition of 15,000 acres to the 
White Mountain National Forest and brought 
numerous stakeholders together to update the 
long-term strategic plan for the forest. He has 
been an invaluable resource, and his contin-
uous commitment to New Hampshire’s iconic 
and precious environment is truly inspiring. 

On behalf of my constituents in New Hamp-
shire’s Second Congressional District, I thank 
Tom for his many years of dedicated service 
to the Granite State. His achievements will 
continue to benefit our state and its incredible 
natural landscape. I am honored to recognize 
and congratulate Tom on his retirement and 
wish him the best of luck in the years ahead. 
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Mr. KELLY of Mississippi. Mr. Speaker, 
today I rise in memory of fallen Mississippi 
soldier Army Specialist (SPC) Joshua Isaac 
Bunch who gave his life while in service to our 
great nation on August 6, 2004, during Oper-
ation Iraqi Freedom. SPC Bunch was killed 
when Iraqi insurgents firing small arms and 
rocket-propelled grenades ambushed the 
Humvee he was riding in near Baghdad. SPC 
Bunch was assigned to the 91st Engineer Bat-
talion, 1st Cavalry Division, Fort Hood, Texas. 

SPC Bunch, the son of Bill and Karen 
Bunch, grew up in Hattiesburg, Mississippi. He 
graduated from North Forrest High School in 
1999. He decided to join the U.S. Army in 
2001. He was deployed to Iraq in 2004. Mrs. 
Bunch said her son wanted to serve in the 
Army because he wanted to do his part. ‘‘I’m 
very proud,’’ Mrs Bunch said. ‘‘I’m proud he 
did what was in his heart to do.’’ Mr. Bunch 
said his son was a genuine person who was 
known for his kindness. ‘‘He had a good per-
sonality,’’ Mr. Bunch said. ‘‘He would do any-
thing for you.’’ 

At the time of SPC Bunch’s death, Johnny 
Dupree was the mayor of Hattiesburg. Accord-

ing to the Associated Press, when he learned 
of the soldier’s death, he ordered flags low-
ered to half staff at city buildings. Mayor 
Dupree also called for a day of mourning. 

James Moore, a Hattiesburg businessman, 
asked the community to pay their respects by 
lining the streets from Moore Funeral Home to 
Highland Cemetery, the final resting place for 
SPC Bunch. 

SPC Bunch’s family was presented with his 
awards which include the Purple Heart and 
the Bronze Star. Members of the American 
Legion Post No. 24 presented the family with 
a Gold Star Banner which signifies the death 
of a family member who is killed in action. 

SPC Bunch is survived by his parents, Bill 
and Karen Bunch; his sister, Michelle Cardin; 
his brother-in-law, Bobby; his nieces, Bella 
and Jacey Bain; and his nephew, Joey Lee. 

SPC Bunch paid the ultimate sacrifice to 
protect the freedoms we all enjoy. 
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Mr. MICHAEL F. DOYLE of Pennsylvania. 
Mr. Speaker, I rise today to praise the heroism 
of six local law enforcement officers, who self-
lessly risked life and limb to protect their fellow 
citizens. 

On Monday, June 22, 2015, a number of 
Pittsburgh police officers were dispatched on a 
call for shots fired shortly after 10 a.m. near 
the intersection of Knox Avenue and Orchard 
Place in the City of Pittsburgh’s Knoxville 
neighborhood. 

As the units were responding, calls came in 
reporting that this was an ‘‘active shooter’’ in-
cident and the suspect was firing an AR–15- 
style semi-automatic rifle. The suspect moved 
around the neighborhood, shooting a male taxi 
driver on Rentz Way, firing shots at vehicles 
and into occupied homes near a children’s day 
care facility, and carjacking a white Buick from 
Rochelle Street. As the reports continued to 
come in, all available units responded to the 
area in search of the suspect, with reports that 
the suspect had driven towards Brownsville 
Road. 

Sergeant Kevin Faulds of the Allegheny 
County Sheriffs Office responded to the call 
for all available units. Turning onto Brownsville 
Road from Knox Avenue, he spotted the Buick 
on Brownsville Road and did a u-turn to pur-
sue. As he made the u-turn, the suspect 
stopped his vehicle and fired his assault rifle 
from within the car, striking Sergeant Faulds’ 
vehicle multiple times. Sergeant Faulds took 
cover and radioed in his situation. When the 
suspect began driving again, Sergeant Faulds 
again followed him. The suspect again 
stopped his vehicle and started shooting. One 
round went through the top of the windshield 
on the passenger side of the cruiser. The car’s 
visor and windshield frame deflected the bullet 
down and towards Sergeant Faulds, ripping 
through the headrest of his seat inches from 
his head and shattering the back window. Ser-
geant Faulds maneuvered his patrol car be-
hind a bus for protection. When the suspect 
stopped shooting and drove away, Sergeant 
Faulds pulled out and followed the suspect at 
a distance of 50 to 100 feet, all the while con-
tinuing to call in information on the suspect’s 
location and his own. 
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