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on less than 5 percent of the leases in 
Alaska’s National Petroleum Reserve. 
On top of that, oil supplies are cur-
rently at historic highs, so high that 
we lifted a 40-year ban on oil exports 
last year, and gas prices remained at 
long-term lows. 

Today the United States is the 
world’s largest producer of oil and nat-
ural gas. We are importing less oil than 
we have at any point in almost three 
decades. In addition to the high oil sup-
plies, industry has shown little interest 
in drilling in the Arctic Refuge. In Sep-
tember 2015, after spending approxi-
mately $7 billion to drill and explore 
the region, Shell gave up on drilling in 
the Arctic region’s Chukchi Sea due to 
the poor results and the high costs. En-
ergy analysts predict very little inter-
est in drilling in the Refuge for the 
foreseeable future. 

So before we move ahead with leasing 
this area for oil and mineral explo-
ration, we need to take a careful look 
at what we would be losing. The Arctic 
Refuge is one of America’s last pris-
tine, untouched wilderness places, and 
I think we should preserve it for future 
generations. 

The Refuge is home to more than 200 
wildlife species, including polar bears, 
musk ox, and caribou. The porcupine 
caribou herd travels to the coastal 
plain each summer to give birth to 
their young. The Refuge is the most 
important land denning site for a sig-
nificant population of polar bears. 
Birds from all 50 States and 6 con-
tinents migrate to the Refuge for nest-
ing and staging. Alaskan Native people 
still rely on the wildlife for basic suste-
nance and as a basis of their cultures. 

In 2003, I had the opportunity to trav-
el to the Arctic Wildlife Refuge and see 
firsthand the pristine wilderness. While 
I was there, I also had an opportunity 
to view areas that had been drilled for 
oil and gas. As you looked to the west, 
you could see a stark difference in the 
State lands that had been drilled for oil 
and gas and the Arctic National Wild-
life Refuge that had not been drilled. It 
was easy to tell the two apart because 
the scars that were left on that State 
land that had been drilled were still 
there many years later. They didn’t 
gingerly step in and drill and leave. 
They cut scars across that land that 
will be there forever. 

There is no question that the impact 
drilling would have on the Arctic 
would be devastating and irreversible, 
and although oil and gas resources can 
be develop safely, we all know that 
leaks and spills happen. The resulting 
environmental damage can change the 
landscape forever. 

The Arctic Refuge represents our Na-
tion’s finest example of intact, natu-
rally functioning Arctic and subarctic 
ecosystems. Nowhere else in North 
America do we see such a broad spec-
trum of diverse habitats occurring 
within one area. We must protect it for 
future generations. We have a responsi-
bility to protect this area for our chil-
dren and grandchildren. Any attempt 

to move forward a budget reconcili-
ation containing leases in the Arctic is 
a move in the wrong direction. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER (Mr. 
PERDUE). The Senator from Colorado. 

Mr. GARDNER. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent that following lead-
er remarks on October 19, it be in order 
to call up the following amendments; 
that the time until 11:45 a.m. be for de-
bate on the amendments, equally di-
vided between the managers or their 
designees; that at 11:45 a.m., the Sen-
ate vote in relation to the amendments 
in the order listed, with no second-de-
gree amendments in order prior to the 
votes: Wyden No. 1302, Capito No. 1393, 
and Cantwell No. 1141; further, that fol-
lowing the disposition of the Cantwell 
amendment, Senator WARNER’s amend-
ment No. 1138 be called up and the time 
until 2 p.m. be equally divided between 
the managers or their designees; and 
that at 2 p.m., the Senate vote in rela-
tion to the Warner amendment, with 
no second-degree amendments in order 
prior to the vote. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

f 

MORNING BUSINESS 

Mr. GARDNER. Mr. President, I ask 
unanimous consent that the Senate be 
in a period of morning business, with 
Senators permitted to speak therein 
for up to 10 minutes each. 

The PRESIDING OFFICER. Without 
objection, it is so ordered. 

(At the request of Mr. SCHUMER, the 
following statement was ordered to be 
printed in the RECORD.) 
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VOTE EXPLANATION 

∑ Mr. MENENDEZ. Mr. President, I 
was unavailable for rollcall vote No. 
220, on Hatch amendment No. 1144. Had 
I been present, I would have voted yea. 

Mr. President, I was unavailable for 
rollcall vote No. 221, on Sanders 
amendment No. 1119. Had I been 
present, I would have voted yea. 

Mr. President, I was unavailable for 
rollcall vote No. 222, on Nelson amend-
ment No. 1150. Had I been present, I 
would have voted yea. 

Mr. President, I was unavailable for 
rollcall vote No. 223, on Heller amend-
ment No. 1146. Had I been present, I 
would have voted yea. 

Mr. President, I was unavailable for 
rollcall vote No. 224, on Sanders 
amendment No. 1120. Had I been 
present, I would have voted yea.∑ 
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TRIBUTE TO HERSHEL ‘‘WOODY’’ 
WILLIAMS 

Mr. MANCHIN. Mr. President, I 
would like to take a moment to cele-
brate the christening of the USNS 
Hershel ‘‘Woody’’ Williams, T–ESB 4. 
This expeditionary sea base ship, the 
second of its kind, is named in honor of 
Medal of Honor recipient and West Vir-
ginia icon, Chief Warrant Officer 
Hershel ‘‘Woody’’ Williams, retired. 

Woody Williams was born on a dairy 
farm in 1923 in Quiet Dell, WV. He en-
listed in the U.S. Marine Corps and 
served as a demolition sergeant in the 
Battle of Iwo Jima with the 21st Ma-
rines, 3d Marine Division. As a result of 
Woody’s valiant service, he was award-
ed the Congressional Medal of Honor 
from President Truman on October 5, 
1945. Today, at 94 years old, he is the 
last living Medal of Honor recipient 
from the Battle of Iwo Jima. 

What sets Woody apart from so many 
others who also honorably served is 
that his brave service on the battlefield 
was bookended by compassionate serv-
ice to members of our Armed Forces 
and their families. Before entering the 
Corps, Woody had the painstaking task 
of delivering Western Union telegrams 
to Gold Star West Virginia families 
who lost loved ones early in the war. 
After he served 20 years in the Marine 
Corps and Marine Corps Reserves, he 
spent 33 years as a veterans service 
representative in the Department of 
Veterans Affairs and is still serving on 
the Governor’s military advisory board 
in the State of West Virginia. He is a 
fierce advocate for all veterans of all 
eras. 

On January 14, 2016, during a cere-
mony in Charleston, WV, Secretary of 
the Navy Ray Mabus announced that 
the expeditionary sea base ship 4 (T– 
ESB 4) would be named the USNS 
Hershel ‘‘Woody’’ Williams. On Satur-
day, October 21, Woody will be joined 
by his family, five of his fellow Medal 
of Honor recipients, fellow World War 
II veterans, and four of the five living 
USS Arizona survivors from Pearl Har-
bor for the joyous occasion of the 
christening. I look forward to the great 
honor of joining these heroes at the 
event in San Diego this weekend. 

Perhaps in no other time in our re-
cent history has it been more vital to 
remember and emulate the heroism, 
perseverance, and patriotism of those 
who belong to the Greatest Generation. 
Woody is the embodiment of the best of 
his generation. Through the chris-
tening of a ship that bears his name, 
we are both honoring his great service 
and lifting up a role model to inspire 
all West Virginians and Americans 
alike. 

I would like to salute Chief Warrant 
Officer 4 Hershel ‘‘Woody’’ Williams. I 
also want to thank him for his great 
service to this great Nation and the 
great State of West Virginia, for show-
ing us the power of patriotism, free-
dom, and family. 
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ADDITIONAL STATEMENTS 

REMEMBERING DON CARANO 

∑ Mr. HELLER. Mr. President, today I 
wish to memorialize Don Carano, one 
of northern Nevada’s most influential 
figures, a great business leader, and a 
man I am privileged to have called a 
friend. Don recently passed away 
peacefully at the age of 85. 
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